

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
EASTERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK**

In re:	Chapter 11
SEASONS CORPORATE LLC, <i>et al.</i> ,	Case No.: 18-45284 (NHL)
Debtors. ¹	Jointly Administered

**NOTICE OF FEE AND EXPENSE STATEMENT
OF ZEICHNER ELLMAN & KRAUSE LLP FOR THE PERIOD
SEPTEMBER 1, 2019 THROUGH NOVEMBER 30, 2019**

1. In accordance with the *Order Pursuant to Sections 105(a) and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code Establishing Procedures for Monthly Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals* entered on November 30, 2018 (Docket No. 217) (the “Interim Compensation Order”), Zeichner Ellman & Krause LLP (“ZEK”), counsel to Seasons Corporate LLC *et al.*, (collectively the “Debtors”), hereby submits its Monthly Fee and Expense Statement (the “Statement”) for the period from September 1, 2019 through November 30, 2019 (the “Statement Period”), for fees in the total sum of \$46,384.50, and reimbursement of expenses of \$-0-.

ITEMIZATION OF SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED

2. The total amounts sought for fees for professional services rendered and reimbursement of expenses incurred for the Statement Period are as follows:

¹ The Debtors in these Chapter 11 cases, together with the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers, are as follows: Blue Gold Equities LLC (7766), Central Avenue Market LLC (7961), Amsterdam Avenue Market LLC (7988), Wilmot Road Market LLC (8020), Seasons Express Inwood LLC (1703), Seasons Lakewood LLC (0295), Seasons Maryland LLC (1895), Seasons Clifton LLC (3331), Seasons Cleveland LLC (7367), Lawrence Supermarket LLC (8258), Upper West Side Supermarket LLC (8895), Seasons Property Management LLC (2672) and Seasons Corporate LLC (2266) (collectively the “Debtors”).

Fees	\$46,384.50
Disbursements	\$-0-
Total	\$46,384.50

3. A complete schedule of the time logs maintained by ZEK's attorneys who rendered services to the Debtors in connection with these Chapter 11 cases during the Statement Period, including the hourly rate, title, and fees earned, is attached hereto as Exhibit "A". A total of 111 hours was expended in connection with this matter during the Statement Period. The blended hourly billing rate during the Statement Period was \$417.88.

NOTICE AND OBJECTION PROCEDURES

4. In accordance with the Interim Compensation Order, notice of this Statement has been served upon the following parties (collectively, the "Notice Parties"): (i) counsel to the Committee of Unsecured Creditors; (ii) counsel to the DIP Lender, and (ii) the U.S. Trustee.

5. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, any objections to this Statement must be served upon the Notice Parties and ZEK, no later than fifteen (15) days from the date hereof, or, January 6, 2020 at 5:00 p.m. prevailing Eastern Time (the "Objection Deadline"), setting forth the nature of the objection and the specific amount of fees or expenses at issue.

6. If no objections to the Statement are received on or before the Objection Deadline, the Debtors, pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, will be authorized to pay ZEK, on an interim basis, the sum of \$37,107.60, consisting of 80% of ZEK's fees for the Statement Period.

8. To the extent an objection to the Statement is received on or before the Objection Deadline, the Debtors will withhold payment of that portion of the Statement to which the objection is directed and will promptly pay the remainder of the fees and disbursements in the percentages set forth above. To the extent such objection is not resolved, it shall be preserved and scheduled for consideration at the next interim fee application hearing.

Dated: December 20, 2019
New York, New York

ZEICHNER ELLMAN & KRAUSE LLP

/s/ Nathan Schwed _____

Nathan Schwed
Peter Janovsky
Robert Guttmann
1211 Avenue of the Americas
New York, New York 10036
Telephone: (212) 2230400
Facsimile: (212) 753-0396

*Counsel to the Debtors and
Debtors in Possession*

EXHIBIT A

ZEICHNER ELLMAN & KRAUSE LLP

1211 AVENUE OF THE AMERICAS
NEW YORK, NEW YORK 10036
(212) 223-0400

Seasons Corporate LLC

September 30, 2019
ID: 012161.00001
Bill#: 252850

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

RE: Chapter 11 Filing

Date	Description of Services	ID	Hours
09/03/19	Review Edelschick email regarding reconciliation and Coca Cola deposit;	NS	.10
09/03/19	Telephone conference with Getzler regarding reconciliation, accountant and open issues;	NS	.10
09/03/19	Consider need for revisions to CR retention letter and email Getzler regarding same;	NS	.20
09/04/19	Draft provision for confidentiality agreement dealing with possibility of denial of motion for seal and email Novick regarding same;	NS	.20
09/04/19	Telephone conference with Botwonick regarding retention of accountant;	NS	.10
09/04/19	Consider Novick email regarding definition of terms and prepare response;	NS	.10
09/04/19	Review revised CR retention agreement and exchange emails with Getzler regarding same;	NS	.10

ZEICHNER ELLMAN & KRAUSE LLP
Seasons Corporate LLC
Page 2

September 30, 2019
ID: 012161.00001
Bill#: 252850

09/04/19	Consider Kohn email regarding default notice and discuss strategy with Getzler;	NS	.40
09/04/19	Telephone conference with S. Kohn regarding reconciliation issues and form 8584;	NS	.30
09/04/19	Draft response email to Kohn and forward to Getzler;	NS	.30
09/04/19	Telephone conference with R Wolf regarding tax accountant retention;	NS	.10
09/04/19	Conference with R. Guttman regarding preparation of application and affidavit for CR retention;	NS	.10
09/04/19	Exchange emails with Novick regarding process for motion to seal;	NS	.10
09/04/19	Draft retention application for Cohn Reznick;	RG	2.50
09/05/19	Telephone conference with Kohn regarding agreement regarding reconciliation and Form 8584;	NS	.20
09/05/19	Review Botwonik email regarding deadline for K-1s and status of accountant retention;	NS	.10
09/06/19	Review and revise declaration, application and order regarding CohnReznick retention;	NS	.70
09/06/19	Telephone conference with Newman regarding retention application;	NS	.10
09/06/19	Email Newman regarding retention application;	NS	.10
09/06/19	Review email exchanges regarding Public Service Trucks invoices;	NS	.10
09/06/19	Review Steelwagon email regarding settlement;	NS	.10
09/06/19	Review C Gupta email regarding US Trustee fee issue;	NS	.10

ZEICHNER ELLMAN & KRAUSE LLP
Seasons Corporate LLC
Page 3

September 30, 2019
ID: 012161.00001
Bill#: 252850

09/06/19	Review Weil email regarding items needed for July and August MORs;	NS	.10
09/09/19	Review Novick edits to confidentiality agreement;	NS	.10
09/09/19	Review Newman email regarding needs creditor list;	NS	.10
09/09/19	Review draft agreement regarding reconciliation and form 8594, and consider issues regarding same;	NS	.30
09/09/19	Email Nash regarding confidentiality agreement with Supersol;	NS	.10
09/09/19	Review Kohn email regarding agreement;	NS	.10
09/09/19	Email Nash regarding SSNS agreement;	NS	.10
09/09/19	Telephone conference with Kohn regarding agreement provisions;	NS	.20
09/09/19	Exchange emails with Weil regarding IOLA report;	NS	.10
09/09/19	Review email exchange with Oni regarding creditor list and email Newman regarding list;	NS	.10
09/09/19	Review Weil email regarding comments to SSNS agreement and draft response;	NS	.30
09/09/19	Attention to assembly and delivery of information to CohnReznick to assist them with respect to conflict check;	RG	1.20
09/10/19	Telephone conference with Novick regarding document production;	NS	.20
09/10/19	Email follow ups to Nash regarding SSNS agreement;	NS	.10
09/11/19	Telephone conference with Nash regarding Committee's position on SSNS agreement and confidentiality stipulation with Supersol;	NS	.20

ZEICHNER ELLMAN & KRAUSE LLP
Seasons Corporate LLC
Page 4

September 30, 2019
ID: 012161.00001
Bill#: 252850

09/11/19	Exchange emails with Spielman regarding CohnReznick retention motion;	NS	.10
09/11/19	Exchange emails with Kohn regarding status of agreement;	NS	.10
09/11/19	Telephone conference with Nash regarding agreement with SSNS;	NS	.10
09/11/19	Review Krimsky email regarding relief from stay for PI action;	NS	.10
09/11/19	Exchange emails with Krimsky regarding stipulation for relief from stay;	NS	.10
09/11/19	Review Newman email regarding will provide additional language for retention motion;	NS	.10
09/12/19	Review Newman email regarding additional language for CR declaration and Getzler response;	NS	.10
09/12/19	Revise CR declaration;	NS	.10
09/12/19	Email R Wolf regarding CR retention motion;	NS	.10
09/12/19	Exchange emails with Novick regarding waiting for committee's response on stipulation;	NS	.10
09/12/19	Review Newman email regarding additional edits to declaration, consider alternative language, draft revised provision, and email Newman regarding proposed new provision;	NS	.40
09/12/19	Telephone conference with Newman regarding need to revise declaration;	NS	.30
09/12/19	Revise declaration and email Newman regarding same;	NS	.30
09/12/19	Exchange emails with C Gupta regarding attempts to resolve fee issue with US Trustee;	NS	.10

ZEICHNER ELLMAN & KRAUSE LLP
Seasons Corporate LLC
Page 5

September 30, 2019
ID: 012161.00001
Bill#: 252850

09/12/19	Email R Wolf regarding revised declaration and revised motion;	NS	.10
09/12/19	Review APA regarding parties' obligations and rights regarding disagreement regarding form to be filed by purchaser and draft email to Kohn regarding same;	NS	.60
09/12/19	Review Krinsky email regarding proposed stipulation to file with Court;	NS	.20
09/12/19	Review C Gupta email regarding her discussion with R Wolf regarding US Trustee fees;	NS	.10
09/12/19	Review Kohn email response and consider reply;	NS	.20
09/12/19	Review Weil email regarding his discussion with Baum regarding SSNS settlement computations;	NS	.10
09/13/19	Exchange emails with Ackerman regarding his firm's fee statement;	NS	.10
09/13/19	Attention to inquiry regarding Ackerman statements and need for revised reports;	NS	.10
09/16/19	Email Nash regarding CohnReznick motion;	NS	.10
09/16/19	Exchange emails with Klestadt regarding status of accountant retention;	NS	.10
09/16/19	Review email exchanges between Ackerman and R. Guttman regarding Ackerman statement issues;	NS	.10
09/16/19	Review email exchanges between Gupta and R. Guttman regarding GH submissions and need for revisions;	NS	.10
09/16/19	Attention to filing of Ackerman Firm fee statement;	RG	.30
09/16/19	Review, transmit revised fee Statement from Getzler Henrich;	RG	.40

ZEICHNER ELLMAN & KRAUSE LLP
 Seasons Corporate LLC
 Page 6

September 30, 2019
 ID: 012161.00001
 Bill#: 252850

09/17/19	Review Weil email exchanges with Simpson and Robbins regarding key man insurance;	NS	.10
09/17/19	Telephone conference with Wolf and several email exchanges with Wolf regarding accountant's retention;	NS	.20
09/17/19	Exchange emails with Spielman regarding status of CR retention;	NS	.10
09/17/19	Exchange multiple emails with Getzler and Weil regarding delay regarding CR retention and getting CR to proceed prior to approval;	NS	.20
09/17/19	Telephone conference with Klestadt regarding dealing with delay in retention of accountant;	NS	.10
09/17/19	Exchange emails with Krimsky regarding waiting on CC approval of stipulation;	NS	.10
09/17/19	Exchange emails with Spielman regarding status of K-1s;	NS	.10
09/17/19	Exchange emails with Nash regarding CC approval of confidentiality stipulation, SSNS agreement and stipulation for stay relief;	NS	.10
09/18/19	Review email exchange between Weil and CR regarding working on returns;	NS	.10
09/18/19	Emails to Klestadt and Spielman regarding CR starting to work;	NS	.10
09/18/19	Attention to July and August fee statements;	NS	.30
09/18/19	Email Novick regarding confidentiality agreement;	ů Ě	.10
09/18/19	Telephone conference with J Baum regarding status of review of reconciliation and pending issues;	NS	.20
09/18/19	Email Nash regarding agreement with SSNS;	NS	.10

ZEICHNER ELLMAN & KRAUSE LLP
Seasons Corporate LLC
Page 7

September 30, 2019
ID: 012161.00001
Bill#: 252850

09/18/19	Telephone conference with Kohn regarding status regarding reconciliation agreement and returns;	NS	.10
09/19/19	Review, edit and finalize fee statement and arrange filing;	NS	.30
09/19/19	Attention to e-filing ZEK's fee notice;	MA	.20
09/20/19	Exchange emails with Krimsky regarding need for revision to Tamir stipulation;	NS	.10
09/20/19	Revise Tamir stipulation;	NS	.20
09/20/19	Exchange emails with Krimsky regarding finalizing and filing stipulation;	NS	.10
09/20/19	Consider several email exchanges regarding Baldor Foods PACA claim;	NS	.10
09/20/19	Review multiple email exchanges bet Weil and Simpson regarding D&O;	NS	.10
09/23/19	Review email chain from Klestadt regarding Klein estate tax basis for tax return;	NS	.10
09/23/19	Telephone conference with Weil regarding status of accountant work;	NS	.10
09/23/19	Email B Newman regarding need to deal with Klein estate and other investors;	NS	.10
09/23/19	Review several emails regarding Baldor post-petition claims;	NS	.10
09/23/19	Exchange emails with Newman regarding form needed for disclosure to investors;	NS	.10
09/23/19	Review L Retagliatta email regarding missing MORs and inquire regarding same;	NS	.20

ZEICHNER ELLMAN & KRAUSE LLP
Seasons Corporate LLC
Page 8

September 30, 2019
ID: 012161.00001
Bill#: 252850

09/23/19	Email L Retagliatta regarding reason for delay and schedule for filing of MORs;	NS	.10
09/23/19	Review/consider Weil email regarding Schreiber inquiries for information needed for tax returns;	NS	.10
09/23/19	Attention to inquiry regarding documents and information needed by Schreiber;	NS	.20
09/24/19	Review FreshPro PACA motion and email Nash regarding same;	NS	.20
09/24/19	Telephone conference with Nash regarding need to deal with FreshPro motion;	NS	.10
09/25/19	Review J Getzler email regarding information sought by CR and consider Schreiber and Weil emails regarding same;	NS	.20
09/25/19	Review multiple email exchanges among counsel regarding APAs and agreements for 12/17/18 closing and for subsequent sales of Clifton and Baltimore;	NS	.40
09/25/19	Call from Bert Weil regarding documents needed for tax finalization;	RG	.30
09/26/19	Telephone conference with Newman regarding providing information to investors;	NS	.20
09/26/19	Attention to assembly of documents requested by Schreiber and multiple email exchanges with Schreiber regarding same;	NS	.80
09/26/19	Email exchange with Newman regarding meeting with investors;	NS	.10
09/26/19	Review Schlabig email regarding form 1065 issues for Klein estate and email Newman regarding same;	NS	.10

ZEICHNER ELLMAN & KRAUSE LLP
 Seasons Corporate LLC
 Page 9

September 30, 2019
 ID: 012161.00001
 Bill#: 252850

09/26/19	Exchange emails with Newman and Schreiber regarding delivery of form to investors;	NS	.10
09/26/19	Telephone conference with M Inglis regarding status of open matters and possibility of interim distribution;	NS	.30
09/26/19	Telephone conference with J Getzler regarding discussion with Schreiber;	NS	.10
09/26/19	Attention to multiple email exchanges with and among Newman, Schreiber, Spielman, Weil and Getzler regarding dealing with Klein issue and release agreement required by CR;	NS	.40
09/26/19	Attention to revised Getzler Henrich fee statement for April 2019;	RG	.50
09/27/19	Review multiple email exchanges among CR and representatives of investors;	NS	.10
09/27/19	Exchange emails with Schreiber regarding consideration for Clifton store sale and regarding surrender of NY store;	NS	.10

TOTAL FEES **15,008.00**

Billing Rate Summary

ID	Name	Rate	Hours
NS	Nathan Schwed	745.00	17.00
RG	Robert Guttmann	440.00	5.20
MA	Michael Antonivich	275.00	.20

TOTAL FEES PLUS EXPENSES **\$ 15,008.00**

ZEICHNER ELLMAN & KRAUSE LLP

1211 AVENUE OF THE AMERICAS

NEW YORK, NEW YORK 10036

(212) 223-0400

Seasons Corporate LLC

October 31, 2019

ID: 012161.00001

Bill#: 252851

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

RE: Chapter 11 Filing

Date	Description of Services	ID	Hours
10/02/19	Attention to filing of July MOR and email R Wolf regarding same;	NS	.10
10/02/19	Review Pilevsky email regarding payment of sales taxes;	NS	.10
10/02/19	Exchange emails with Weil regarding payment of sales taxes;	NS	.10
10/03/19	Review Kearnl email regarding PACA inquiry and email Nash regarding same;	NS	.10
10/03/19	Exchange emails with Weil regarding Kearnl inquiry regarding Blue Wolf and PACA debt;	NS	.10
10/03/19	Review Schreiber email seeking information regarding capital accounts;	NS	.10
10/04/19	Review Weil email regarding SSNS settlement agreement and IOLA update;	NS	.10
10/04/19	Review Ackerman email regarding Blue Wolf connection to PACA license;	NS	.10

ZEICHNER ELLMAN & KRAUSE LLP
Seasons Corporate LLC
Page 2

October 31, 2019
ID: 012161.00001
Bill#: 252851

10/04/19	Telephone conference with Kohn regarding open issues for settlement agreement;	NS	.40
10/07/19	Telephone conference with Kearnl regarding background of entities and status of business;	NS	.40
10/07/19	Review Kearnl email regarding information request;	NS	.10
10/07/19	Exchange emails with Weil regarding Nathel payment;	NS	.10
10/07/19	Review Weil email regarding discussion with Schreiber regarding status and timing for K-1's;	NS	.10
10/07/19	Review Rettagliatta email regarding information for MORs;	NS	.10
10/07/19	Review Weil email regarding response to US Trustee inquiry;	NS	.10
10/07/19	Attention to finalizing ZEK fee statement;	NS	.10
10/07/19	Email Kearnl regarding corporate offices and purchaser;	NS	.10
10/07/19	Exchange emails with Kohn regarding agreement;	NS	.10
10/08/19	Review email exchange regarding accountant's need for info regarding recourse of liability and telephone conference with Schreiber regarding same;	NS	.40
10/08/19	Several telephone conferences with Z Bloom regarding information required by accountants;	NS	.20
10/08/19	Review Jin motion for relief from stay;	NS	.10
10/08/19	Review Schreiber email requesting info from accountants;	NS	.10
10/08/19	Consider Schreiber email regarding nature of guaranties by Bloom and Gold, review guaranties and respond;	NS	.20

ZEICHNER ELLMAN & KRAUSE LLP
Seasons Corporate LLC
Page 3

October 31, 2019
ID: 012161.00001
Bill#: 252851

10/08/19	Review Weil email regarding discussion with Schreiber regarding status and timing of K-1s;	NS	.10
10/10/19	Review email exchanges regarding accountants' need for contact information for investors and telephone conference with Z Bloom regarding same;	NS	.20
10/10/19	Email Schreiber regarding need for K-1 list;	NS	.10
10/10/19	Review M Angell email regarding production of Supersol documents;	NS	.10
10/10/19	Telephone conference with R Wolf regarding accountants' retention and adjournment of status conference;	NS	.10
10/10/19	Review Schreiber email regarding issuance of K-1s and status of discussions regarding Klein estate;	NS	.10
10/10/19	Review R Wolf edits to proposed retention CR order;	NS	.10
10/10/19	Attention to filing of amended fee statement for Getzler Henrich, communicate with US Trustee regarding same;	RG	.50
10/11/19	Exchange emails with court regarding adjournment of status conference;	NS	.10
10/11/19	Review reconciliation agreement from SSNS, consider necessary revisions and email SSNS counsel regarding same;	NS	.30
10/11/19	Attention to letter to court regarding adjourned hearing;	NS	.10
10/11/19	Review claims status;	RG	.40
10/16/19	Review email exchange with Edelschick regarding collection notice;	NS	.10
10/16/19	Exchange emails with Getzler regarding status of CR retention motion;	NS	.10

ZEICHNER ELLMAN & KRAUSE LLP
Seasons Corporate LLC
Page 4

October 31, 2019
ID: 012161.00001
Bill#: 252851

10/17/19	Arrange filing of August MOR and email US Trustee regarding same;	NS	.10
10/17/19	Review Weil email regarding discussion with collection agent regarding open invoice;	NS	.10
10/17/19	Consider email exchange with US Trustee regarding issues with GH fee statements;	NS	.10
10/17/19	Attention to review and e-filing monthly report;	MA	.20
10/17/19	Communicate with US Trustee regarding fee statement;	RG	.10
10/22/19	Review Kearl email regarding unpaid PACA claims and email Nash regarding same;	NS	.10
10/24/19	Consider Weil email regarding SSNS auto accident in Feb 2019 and issues with insurance company and telephone conference with Weil regarding options and strategy regarding same;	NS	.30
10/25/19	Consider N Schreiber and B Weil emails regarding tax returns and telephone conference with B Weil regarding same;	NS	.40
10/25/19	Exchange emails with Schreiber regarding response to Weil inquiries regarding tax return;	NS	.10
10/25/19	Review Weil email to SSNS regarding steps for dealing with accident;	NS	.10
10/28/19	Exchange emails with R Wolf regarding CohnResnick retention application;	NS	.10
10/28/19	Revisions to CR application;	NS	.20
10/29/19	Attention to finalizing and filing CohnReznick application;	NS	.20
10/29/19	Exchange emails with R Wolf regarding retention motion;	NS	.10

ZEICHNER ELLMAN & KRAUSE LLP
 Seasons Corporate LLC
 Page 5

October 31, 2019
 ID: 012161.00001
 Bill#: 252851

10/29/19	Review court email regarding need to edit order regarding stay relief;	NS	.10
10/29/19	Review motion to appoint accountant;	MA	.30
10/30/19	Preliminary review of Supersol documents;	NS	5.50
10/30/19	Exchange email with Krimsky regarding resubmission of proposed order;	NS	.10
10/31/19	Conference with Nash regarding dealing with PACA inspector;	NS	.20
10/31/19	Email Kearns regarding PACA claims;	NS	.10
10/31/19	Review SSNS email regarding accident issue was resolved;	NS	.10

TOTAL FEES**10,188.00****Billing Rate Summary**

ID	Name	Rate	Hours
NS	Nathan Schwed	745.00	12.90
RG	Robert Guttman	440.00	1.00
MA	Michael Antonivich	275.00	.50

TOTAL FEES PLUS EXPENSES**\$ 10,188.00**

ZEICHNER ELLMAN & KRAUSE LLP

1211 AVENUE OF THE AMERICAS

NEW YORK, NEW YORK 10036

(212) 223-0400

Seasons Corporate LLC

November 30, 2019

ID: 012161.00001

Bill#: 252852

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

RE: Chapter 11 Filing

Date	Description of Services	ID	Hours
11/01/19	Attention to arranging review of Supersol production;	NS	.20
11/01/19	Exchange emails with Schreiber regarding status of retention;	NS	.10
11/01/19	Email chambers regarding Reznick retention order;	NS	.10
11/04/19	Attention to Rubin fee statement;	NS	.10
11/04/19	Review Weil email regarding his discussion with Schreiber regarding tax return completion and billing issues;	NS	.10
11/04/19	Review Weil email regarding status of SSNS settlement;	NS	.10
11/05/19	Review GH fee statement, arrange filing and email Getzler regarding filing;	NS	.10
11/05/19	Review Weil email regarding September MOR, arrange filing and email US Trustee regarding same;	NS	.20
11/05/19	Review monthly operating report and e-filed same;	MA	.20

ZEICHNER ELLMAN & KRAUSE LLP
Seasons Corporate LLC
Page 2

November 30, 2019
ID: 012161.00001
Bill#: 252852

11/05/19	Analysis of document production;	KH	5.50
11/06/19	Analysis of document production;	KH	1.40
11/07/19	Review email regarding entry of Tamaz stipulation and order;	NS	.10
11/07/19	Telephone conference with Weil regarding status of agreement and CohnReznick retention;	NS	.20
11/07/19	Exchange emails with Kohn regarding need to finalize agreement;	NS	.10
11/07/19	Several telephone conferences with Kohn regarding revisions to agreement;	NS	.30
11/07/19	Review Weil email inquiry regarding PACA reserve;	NS	.10
11/07/19	Analysis of document production;	KH	6.40
11/08/19	Review Edelschick email regarding wrongly deposited customer check and consider strategy for dealing with same;	NS	.20
11/08/19	Review Weil email regarding suggestion for dealing with mistaken deposit and consider response;	NS	.20
11/08/19	Analysis of document production;	KH	5.00
11/11/19	Review email exchanges between Schreiber, Bloom and Spielman regarding tax returns;	NS	.10
11/11/19	Exchange emails with R Wolf regarding status conference;	NS	.10
11/11/19	Review CR retention order and email Schreiber regarding same;	NS	.10
11/11/19	Email chambers regarding conference;	NS	.10

ZEICHNER ELLMAN & KRAUSE LLP
Seasons Corporate LLC
Page 3

November 30, 2019
ID: 012161.00001
Bill#: 252852

11/11/19	Review email exchange between Weil and Schreiber regarding delivery of returns to shareholders;	NS	.10
11/11/19	Analysis of document production;	KH	4.40
11/12/19	Analysis of document production;	KH	5.40
11/13/19	Review revised letter agreement with SSNS and email Kohn regarding same;	NS	.10
11/13/19	Analysis of document production;	KH	5.70
11/14/19	Exchange emails with Weil regarding dealing with SSNS checks received by Debtor;	NS	.10
11/14/19	Analysis of document production;	KH	7.00
11/18/19	Review Weil email regarding his discussion with Schreiber regarding 2018 tax returns;	NS	.10
11/18/19	Exchange several emails with B Weil regarding PACA escrow and inquire regarding same;	NS	.20
11/18/19	Exchange emails with Weil regarding payment of Omni invoices;	NS	.10
11/18/19	Exchange emails with Gupta regarding fees for Oct MOR;	NS	.10
11/18/19	Email chambers regarding 12/3 conference;	NS	.10
11/18/19	Review Spielman email regarding info regarding K-1's;	NS	.10
11/18/19	Email Kohn regarding need to finalize agreement;	NS	.10
11/18/19	Telephone conference with Nash regarding pending PACA motion;	NS	.10
11/18/19	Several email exchanges with chambers regarding status conference and motion;	NS	.10

ZEICHNER ELLMAN & KRAUSE LLP
Seasons Corporate LLC
Page 4

November 30, 2019
ID: 012161.00001
Bill#: 252852

11/18/19	Attention to letter to court regarding adjournment;	NS	.10
11/18/19	Review revised SSNS letter agreement and email to Getzler/Weil;	NS	.20
11/18/19	Review of letter to adjourn conference and e-filed same;	MA	.20
11/18/19	Analysis of relevant documents;	KH	7.00
11/19/19	Attention to October IOLA report for accountant;	NS	.10
11/19/19	Consider B Weil emails regarding SSNS side letter;	NS	.10
11/19/19	Telephone conference with Weil regarding issues regarding SSNS agreement and strategy for resolving same;	NS	.40
11/19/19	Review Weil email regarding process for resolving Coca Cola deposit issue;	NS	.10
11/19/19	Analysis of relevant documents;	KH	1.00
11/19/19	Analysis of relevant documents;	KH	1.90
11/20/19	Analysis of relevant documents;	KH	4.90
11/21/19	Email Pilevsky regarding Debtors' payment of sales taxes;	NS	.10
11/21/19	Analysis of relevant documents;	KH	.80
11/24/19	Attention to October MOR and email US Trustee regarding same;	NS	.10
11/25/19	Redacted bank statement and e-filed monthly operating report;	MA	.20
11/26/19	Review Weil email regarding status of Liberty Coke discussions;	NS	.10

ZEICHNER ELLMAN & KRAUSE LLP
 Seasons Corporate LLC
 Page 5

November 30, 2019
 ID: 012161.00001
 Bill#: 252852

11/26/19	Review email exchange between Weil and Schreiber regarding finalizing returns;	NS	.10
11/26/19	Analysis of relevant documents;	KH	6.50
11/27/19	Analysis of relevant documents;	KH	5.40
TOTAL FEES			21,188.50

Billing Rate Summary

ID	Name	Rate	Hours
NS	Nathan Schwed	745.00	5.30
MA	Michael Antonivich	275.00	.60
KH	Kakai Hwang	250.00	68.30

TOTAL FEES PLUS EXPENSES \$ **21,188.50**