
 
 
 

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE 

 
 
In re: 
 
BOY SCOUTS OF AMERICA AND 
DELAWARE BSA, LLC,1 
 

Debtors. 
 

 Chapter 11 
 
Case No. 20-10343 (LSS) 
 
(Jointly Administered) 

 
Objection Deadline:   
April 11, 2022 at 4:00 p.m. (ET) 

 
SUMMARY COVER SHEET OF TWENTY-FOURTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF 
OGLETREE, DEAKINS, NASH, SMOAK & STEWART, P.C. FOR ALLOWANCE OF 

COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD  
FEBRUARY 1, 2022 TO AND INCLUDING FEBRUARY 28, 2022 

 
 
Name of Applicant: 

  
OGLETREE, DEAKINS, NASH, SMOAK & 
STEWART, P.C. 
 

Authorized to Provide Professional Services 
to: 

Debtors and Debtors in Possession 
 

Date of Retention: 
 
Period for Which Compensation and  
Reimbursement Are Requested: 
 

February 18, 2020 
 
February 1, 2022 – February 28, 2022 
 

Amount of Compensation Requested: 
 
Amount of Compensation Incurred for Im-
migration matters 
 
Amount of Expenses Incurred for Immigra-
tion matters 

$157,056.40 (80% of $196,320.50)2 
 
$2,350.00 
 
 
$16.54 
 

 
1  The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, together with the last four digits of each Debtor’s federal tax identification 

number, are as follows:  Boy Scouts of America (6300) and Delaware BSA, LLC (4311).  The Debtors’ mailing 
address is 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving, Texas 75038. 

2    The amount of compensation and fees requested does not include fees and expenses to be paid directly to Ogletree 
Deakins by one or more insurance carriers in certain non-abuse claims or cases.  While Ogletree Deakins reserves 
the right to seek future payment from the Debtors for such claims and cases, at this time Ogletree Deakins is not 
seeking payment from the Debtors on these claims and cases.  Ogletree is not seeking payment of the flat fee work 
for immigration matters in this fee application, including the $16.54 in expenses and the $2,350.00 in fees associated 
with the immigration work.  The Debtors anticipate expanding the scope of Ogletree’s representation to include the 
flat fee immigration work.  Ogletree reserves the right to seek payment of the flat fee work. 
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ii 
 
 

 
Amount of Expense Reimbursement Re-
quested 
  

 
 
$7,134.24 

  
This is a(n):   monthly  x interim  final application   
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PRIOR MONTHLY APPLICATIONS FILED 

Date Filed Period 
Covered 

Requested 
Fees/Expenses 

Approved 
Fees/Expenses3 

4/29/20;  
D.I. 512 

2/18/20 -3/31/20 $393,030.80/$1,923.42 $387,179.80/$1,923.42 

5/28/20; 
D.I. 717 

4/12020 -4/30/20 $146,042.10/$128.96 $140,191.10/$128.96 

6/18/20;  
D.I. 867 

5/1/20-5/31/20 $128,646.50/$128.96 $122,795.50/$627.81 

7/22/20;  
D.I. 1037 

6/1/20-6/30/20 
 

$133,225.40/$81.19 $127,374.40/$81.91 

8/21/20;  
D.I. 1137 

7/1/20-7/31/20 $136,930.85/$81.19 $131,079.85/$81.91 

10/1/20;  
D.I. 1392 

8/1/20-8/31/20 $129,960.70/$100.31 $127,488.52/$100.31 

11/3/20;  
D.I. 1625 

9/1/20-9/30/20 $109,548.70/$81.19 $107,071.54/$81.91 
 

12/3/20;  
D.I. 1781 

10/1/20-10/31/20 $135,773.15/$81.19 $133,295.99/$81.91 

1/14/21; 
 D.I. 1947 

11/1/20-11/2/20 $148,984.60/$28,415.43 $119,187.68/$28,415.43 

2/17/21;  
D.I. 2236 

12/1/20-12/31/20 $163,709.55/$81.19 $130,967.64/$81.19 
 

3/15/21;  
D.I. 2368 

1/1/21-1/31/21 $149,323.00/$103.54 $119,458.40/$10,354.00 

3/17/21; 
 D.I. 2405 

2/1/21-2/28/21 $124,866.50/$2,041.19  $99,893.20/$2,041.19 

5/17/21 
 D.I. 4262 

3/1/21-3/31/21 $145,503.50/$92.43 $116,402.80/$92.43 

6/30/21  
D.I. 5455 

4/1/21-4/31/21 $106,048.50/$133.21 $84,838.80/$133.21 

7/27/21 
 D.I. 5793 

5/1/21-5/31/21 $118,452.50/$89.69 $94,762.00/$89.69 

11/17/21 
D.I. 7299 

6/1/21-6/30/21 $149,525.50/$8,547.54 $119,620.40/$8,547.54 

12/9/21 
D.I. 7650 

7/1/21-7/31/21 $152,766.50/$8,547.54 $122,213.20/$5,597.58 

12/10/21 
D.I. 7686 

8/1/21-8/31/21 $140,860.50/$1,287.45 $112,688.40/$1,287.45 

12/21/21 
D.I. 7909 

9/1/21-9/30/21 $107,426.50/$2,167.69 $85,941.20/$2,167.69 

12/23/21 
D.I. 7939 

10/1/21-10/31/21 $158,540.00/$5,548.50 $126,832/$5,548.59 

12/29/21 
D.I. 8037 

11/1/21-11/30/21 
 

$200,853.00/$9,639.96 $160,684.80/$9,691.96 

2/16/22 
D.I. 8857 

12/1/21-12/31/21 $179,762.50/$14,240.45 $135,622.00/$11,790.45 

2/22/22 
D.I. 8920 

1/31/2022-1/31/22 $199,520.50/$7,150.78 $143,810.00/$5,783.96 

 
3   Reflects total amount approved following the agreed-to reductions set forth in the Fee Examiner’s Final Fee 

Report. 

Case 20-10343-LSS    Doc 9505    Filed 03/28/22    Page 3 of 12



iv 
 
 

COMPENSATION AND HOURS BY PROFESSIONAL4 
(Abuse Specific Attorneys) 

 
Name Position 

Area of Expertise 

Year of Admission 
/ Years of Experience 

Hourly 
Rate 

Total 
Hours 

Total Compensation 

Bruce Griggs Shareholder 1989/32 $640.00 28.4 $18,176.00 
Bruce Hearey Shareholder 1975/47 $565.00 1.6 $904.00 
Gavin Martinson Shareholder 2005/16 $440.00 0.9 $396.00 
Ron Chapman Shareholder 1995/26 $650.00 0.9 $585.00 
Michael McKnight Shareholder 2007/15 $415.00 10.3 $4,274.50 
Steven Pockrass Shareholder 1995/27 $490.00 0.4 $196.00 
Sean Manning Of Counsel 2001/20 $425.00 142.1 $63,234.50 
Jefferson Whisenant Associate 2016/6 $345.00 27.8 $9,591.00 
Gardella, Alexandria Associate 2020/2 $240.00 0.6 $189.00 
Jonathon Metcalfe Litigation Support N/A $280.00 0.7 $196.00 
April Steffen Paralegal N/A $250.00 85.9 $21,045.50 
Cynthia Williamson Paralegal N/A $220.00 74.8 $16,456.00 
Kelci Davis Paralegal N/A $190.00 153.7 $29,203.00 
Katie Murray Paralegal N/A $150.00 44.7 $6,705.00 
Michelle McCall Paralegal N/A $255.00 106.2 $26,019.00 
Total      679 $197,170.505 

 

  

 
4  Effective February 1, 2022, Ogletree, Deakins, Nash, Smoak & Stewart, P.C. has implemented firm-wide rate 

increases. These rate increases are consistent with the Engagement Letter, which provides that the rates included 
therein are adjusted from time to time. 

 
5  This amount does not include the flat fee of $2,350.00 associated with the immigration work.  This amount does 

not reflect the reduction of $3,200.00 for non-working travel time in accordance with Local Rules 2016-2(d)(ix). 
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COMPENSATION AND EXPENSES BY PROJECT CATEGORY 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
6  Ogletree charged the Debtors for only 50% of non-working travel time (as detailed in Exhibit D) in compliance 

with Local Rule 2016-2(d)(ix). 

Task Description Total Hours Total Compensation 
 

Litigation/Claims 656.9  $187,926.50  

Retention Issues 12.1  $2,844.00  

Non-working Travel 10  $3,200.006  

Non-Abuse Claim Litigation (Immigration Work) 4  $2,350.00  

TOTAL 683 $196,320.50 
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EXPENSES BY CATEGORY 

Category Amount 

Legal Support Services $5,518.65 

Delivery Services/Messenger $1,585.79 

Copying $1.80 

Court Fees $28.00 

Other (Immigration related) $16.54 

Grand Total  $7,150.78  
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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE 

 
 
In re: 
 
BOY SCOUTS OF AMERICA AND 
DELAWARE BSA, LLC,1 
 

Debtors. 
 

 Chapter 11 
 
Case No. 20-10343 (LSS) 
 
(Jointly Administered) 

 
Objection Deadline:   
April 11, 2022 at 4:00 p.m. (ET) 

 
TWENTY-FOURTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF OGLETREE, 

DEAKINS, NASH, SMOAK & STEWART, P.C. FOR ALLOWANCE OF 
COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR THE 

PERIOD FROM FEBRUARY 1, 2022 TO AND INCLUDING FEBRUARY 28, 2022 
 

Ogletree, Deakins, Nash, Smoak & Stewart, P.C. (“Ogletree Deakins”), special litigation 

counsel for the Boy Scouts of America and Delaware BSA, LLC, the non-profit corporations that 

are debtors and debtors in possession (together, the “Debtors”) in the above-captioned chapter 11 

cases, hereby submits this twenty-fourth monthly application (this “Application”) requesting pay-

ment in the aggregate amount of $164,207.18, which is equal to (a) 80% of the $196,320.50 of 

total compensation earned by Ogletree Deakins for its services to the Debtors during the period 

from February 1, 2022 to and including February 28, 2022 (the “Fee Period”) and (b) 100% of the 

$7,150.78 of necessary expenses incurred by Ogletree Deakins during the Fee Period in connection 

with its services to the Debtors.2  In support of this Application, Ogletree Deakins respectfully 

represents as follows: 

 
1  The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, together with the last four digits of each Debtor’s federal tax identification 

number, are as follows:  Boy Scouts of America (6300) and Delaware BSA, LLC (4311).  The Debtors’ mailing 
address is 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving, Texas 75038. 

2  The amount of compensation and fees requested does not include fees and expenses to be paid directly to Ogletree 
Deakins by one or more insurance carriers in certain non-abuse claims or cases.  While Ogletree Deakins reserves 
the right to seek future payment from the Debtors for such claims and cases, at this time Ogletree Deakins is not 
seeking payment from the Debtors on these claims and cases.  The amount requested includes certain flat fees 
and expenses associated with the immigration work. 
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JURISDICTION AND VENUE 

1. The United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware (the 

“Court”) has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1334 and the Amended Standing 

Order of Reference from the United States District Court for the District of Delaware,  

dated February 29, 2012.  This matter is a core proceeding within the meaning of 28 U.S.C. § 

157(b) (2).  Venue is proper in this district pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409. 

2. The statutory and other bases for the relief requested herein are sections 330 

and 331 of chapter 11 of title 11 of the United States Code, 11 U.S.C. §§ 101–1532 (the “Bank-

ruptcy Code”), rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the “Bankruptcy Rules”), 

rule 2016-2 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure of the United States Bank-

ruptcy Court for the District of Delaware (the “Local Rules”), and the Order (I) Approving Proce-

dures for (A) Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals 

and (B) Expense Reimbursement for Official Committee Members and (II) Granting Related Relief  

[Docket No. 341] (the “Compensation Procedures Order”). 

BACKGROUND 
 

3. On February 18, 2020 (the “Petition Date”), each of the Debtors filed a vol-

untary petition with the Court for relief under chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code.  The Debtors 

continue to operate and maintain their non-profit organization and manage their properties as debt-

ors in possession pursuant to sections 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code.  On February 19, 

2020, the Court entered an order [Docket No. 61] authorizing the joint administration and proce-

dural consolidation of the chapter 11 cases pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 1015(b). 
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4. The Debtors retained Ogletree Deakins as their special litigation counsel, 

nunc pro tunc to the Petition Date, pursuant to the Order Authorizing the Retention and Employ-

ment of Ogletree, Deakins, Nash, Smoak & Stewart, P.C. as Special Litigation Counsel for the 

Debtors and Debtors in Possession, Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date [Docket No. 364] (the 

“Retention Order”).  The Retention Order authorizes the Debtors to compensate and reimburse 

Ogletree Deakins in accordance with the terms and conditions set forth in the Debtors’ application 

to retain Ogletree Deakins, subject to Ogletree Deakins’ application to the Court. 

5. On April 6, 2020, the Court entered the Compensation Procedures Order.  

The Compensation Procedures Order provides, among other things, that each professional shall be 

entitled, on or as soon as practicable after the fifteenth (15th) day of each month following the 

month for which compensation and/or expense reimbursement is sought, to file and serve an ap-

plication for interim allowance of compensation earned and reimbursement of expenses incurred 

during the preceding month (each a “Monthly Fee Application”).  Parties shall have fourteen (14) 

days after service of a Monthly Fee Application to file an objection to the compensation or ex-

penses that are the subject thereof (the “Objection Deadline”).  Upon the expiration of the Objec-

tion Deadline, the applicant may file a certificate of no objection (a “CNO”) with the Court with 

respect to the unopposed portion of the fees and/or expenses requested in the applicable Monthly 

Fee Application.  After the filing of a CNO, the Debtors are authorized and directed to pay the 

applicant an amount equal to 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses requested in the applicable 

Monthly Fee Application not subject to an objection. 

RELIEF REQUESTED 
 

6. By this Application, in accordance with the Compensation Procedures  

Order, Ogletree Deakins requests payment in the aggregate amount of $164,207.18, which is equal 
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to (a) 80% of the $196,320.50 of total compensation earned by Ogletree Deakins during the Fee 

Period for its services to the Debtors and (b) 100% of the $7,150.78 of necessary expenses incurred 

by Ogletree Deakins during the Fee Period in connection with its services to the Debtors. 

SUMMARY OF SERVICES RENDERED 

7. Attached hereto as Exhibit A is a detailed statement of the time expended 

and compensation earned by Ogletree Deakins during the Fee Period with respect to Phase 1 tasks 

(Litigation/Claims).  Attached hereto as Exhibit B is a detailed statement of the time expended 

and compensation earned by Ogletree Deakins during the Fee Period with respect to Phase 2 tasks 

(Retention Issues).  Attached hereto as Exhibit C is a detailed statement of the time expended and 

compensation  earned by Ogletree Deakins during the Fee Period with respect to Phase 5 tasks 

(Non-Abuse Claim Litigation/Immigration). Ogletree Deakins’ professionals expended a total of 

6833. hours in connection with these chapter 11 cases during the Fee Period.  All services for which 

Ogletree Deakins is requesting compensation were performed for or on behalf of the Debtors.  The 

services rendered by Ogletree Deakins during the Fee Period are categorized as set forth in Exhibit 

A and in the summary cover sheets prefixed to this Application.  The professionals who provided 

services to the Debtors during the Fee Period are also identified in Exhibit A and in the summary 

cover sheets.  

ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES 
 

8. Ogletree Deakins also incurred certain necessary expenses during the Fee 

Period for which it is entitled to reimbursement under the terms of its retention.  As set forth in 

greater detail in the detailed statements attached hereto as Exhibits A, B and C, and the expense 

 
3  Of which 4 are related to immigration work and 10 are related to non-working travel.  Ogletree charged the 

Debtors for only 50% of non-working travel time in compliance with Local Rule 2016-2(d)(ix).  Fees associated 
with non-working travel time are detailed in Exhibit D.  
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summary attached hereto as Exhibit E, Ogletree Deakins’ total expenses incurred during the Fee 

Period are $7,150.78. 

VALUATION OF SERVICES 
 

9. The hourly rates reflected on Exhibit A are Ogletree Deakins’ customary 

hourly rates for work of this character.  The reasonable value of the services rendered by Ogletree 

Deakins for the Fee Period as to the Debtors in these chapter 11 cases is $199,520.50. 

10. In accordance with section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, the fees requested 

are reasonable in light of factors including, among other things, (a) the complexity of these chapter 

11 cases, (b) the time expended, (c) the nature and extent of the services rendered, (d) the value of 

such services, and (e) the costs of comparable services other than in a case under this title.   

11. Although Ogletree Deakins has made every effort to include all fees and 

expenses incurred during the Fee Period in this Application, some fees and expenses might have 

been omitted from this Application due to delays caused by accounting and processing during the 

Fee Period.  Ogletree Deakins reserves the right to submit further applications to the Court for 

allowance of such fees and expenses not included herein. Subsequent fee applications will be filed 

in accordance with the requirements of the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local 

Rules, and the Compensation Procedures Order. 

CERTIFICATION OF COMPLIANCE 
 

12. The undersigned has reviewed the requirements of Local Rule 2016-2 and 

certifies that, to the best of his knowledge, information and belief, this Application complies with 

that rule. 
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WHEREFORE, Ogletree Deakins requests payment in the aggregate amount of 

(a) $157,056.40, which is 80% of the $196,320.50 of total compensation earned by Ogletree Dea-

kins during the Fee Period for its services to the Debtors, and (b) 100% of the $7,150.78 of neces-

sary expenses incurred by Ogletree Deakins during the Fee Period in connection with its services 

to the Debtors, for a total interim award of $164,207.18. 

 

Dated: March 28, 2022 
Austin, Texas 

Ogletree, Deakins, Nash, Smoak & Stewart, P.C.   

/s/ Bruce A. Griggs    
Bruce A. Griggs 
Shareholder 
301 Congress Avenue, Suite 1150 
Austin, Texas 78701 
Phone: (512) 344-4700 
Email: bruce.griggs@ogletreedeakins.com 
 

  
SPECIAL LITIGATION COUNSEL TO THE 
DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION 
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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE 

 
In re  
 
Boy Scouts of America, et al., 
 

Debtors.1 
 

 
Chapter 11 
 
Case No. 20-10343 (LSS)  
 
Jointly Administered 
 
Objection Deadline: 
April 11, 2022 at 4:00 p.m. (ET) 

 
NOTICE OF TWENTY-FOURTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF OGLETREE, 

DEAKINS, NASH, SMOAK & STEWART, P.C. FOR ALLOWANCE OF 
COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR THE 

PERIOD FROM FEBRUARY 1, 2022 TO AND INCLUDING FEBRUARY 28, 2022 
 

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that today, Ogletree, Deakins, Nash, Smoak & Stewart, 
P.C., as special litigation counsel to the Debtors in the above-captioned cases, filed the attached 
Twenty-Fourth Monthly Application of Ogletree, Deakins, Nash, Smoak & Stewart, P.C. 
for Allowance of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period from 
February 1, 2022 to and Including February 28, 2022 (the “Application”).   
 

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that objections, if any, to the Application, 
must be: (a) filed with the Clerk of the Bankruptcy Court, 824 North Market Street, 3rd Floor, 
Wilmington, Delaware 19801, by April 11, 2022 at 4:00 p.m. (Eastern Time) (the “Objection 
Deadline”); and (b) served so as to be received on or before the Objection Deadline by: 

i. the Applicant:  Ogletree, Deakins, Nash, Smoak & Stewart, P.C., 301 
Congress Avenue, Suite 1150, Austin, Texas 78701, Attn: Bruce A. 
Griggs, bruce.griggs@ogletreedeakins.com;  

ii. the Debtors:  Boy Scouts of America, 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving, 
Texas 75038, Attn: Steven P. McGowan, steve.mcgowan@scouting.org; 

iii. counsel to the Debtors:  White & Case LLP, 111 South Wacker Drive, 
Chicago, Illinois 60606, Attn: Matthew E. Linder, 
mlinder@whitecase.com; 

iv. co-counsel to the Debtors:  Morris, Nichols, Arsht & Tunnell LLP, 1201 
N. Market Street, 16th Floor, Wilmington, Delaware 19801, Attn: Derek C. 

 
1  The Debtors in these cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor’s federal EIN, are as 

follows: Boy Scouts of America (6300) and Delaware BSA, LLC (4311).  The Debtors’ mailing 
address is 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving, Texas 75038. 
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Abbott, dabbott@morrisnichols.com; 

v. the Office of the United States Trustee:  J. Caleb Boggs Federal Building, 
Room 2207, 844 N. King Street, Wilmington, Delaware 19801, Attn: 
David Buchbinder, david.l.buchbinder@usdoj.gov and Hannah M. 
McCollum, hannah.mccollum@usdoj.gov; 

vi. counsel to the UCC:  Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP, 1177 Avenue 
of the Americas, New York, New York 10036, Attn: Rachael Ringer, 
rringer@kramerlevin.com and Megan M. Wasson, mwasson@ 
kramerlevin.com; 

vii. counsel to the Tort Claimants’ Committee:  Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones 
LLP, 10100 Santa Monica Boulevard, 13th Floor, Los Angeles, California 
90067, Attn: Richard M. Pachulski, rpachulski@pszjlaw.com;  

viii. counsel to the Future Claimants’ Representative:  Young Conaway 
Stargatt & Taylor, LLP, Rodney Square, 1000 North King Street, 
Wilmington, Delaware 19801, Attn: Robert S. Brady, rbrady@ycst.com 
and Edwin J. Harron, eharron@ycst.com; 

ix. counsel to the Ad Hoc Committee of Local Councils:  Wachtell, Lipton, 
Rosen & Katz, 51 West 52nd Street, New York, New York 10019, Attn: 
Richard G. Mason, rgmason@wlrk.com and Joseph C. Celentino, 
jccenlentino@wlrk.com; 

x. counsel to JPMorgan Chase Bank, National Association:  Norton Rose 
Fulbright US LLP, 2200 Ross Avenue, Dallas, Texas 75201-7932, Attn: 
Louis R. Strubeck, louis.strubeck@nortonrosefullbright.com and Kristian 
W. Gluck, kristian.gluck@nortonrosefullbright.com; 

xi. counsel to the County Commission of Fayette County (West Virginia):  
Steptoe & Johnson PLLC, Chase Tower – 8th Floor, 707 Virginia Street 
East, Charleston, West Virginia 25301, Attn: John Stump; and 

xii. Rucki Fee Review, LLC:  1111 Windon Drive, Wilmington, Delaware 
19803, Attn:  Justin Rucki, justinrucki@ruckifeereview.com. 

A HEARING ON THE APPLICATION, IF NECESSARY, WILL BE HELD AT 
THE CONVENIENCE OF THE COURT AND NOTICE OF ANY SUCH HEARING WILL BE 
GIVEN ONLY TO THE OBJECTING PARTY OR PARTIES. 

IF YOU FAIL TO RESPOND IN ACCORDANCE WITH THIS NOTICE, THE 
COURT MAY GRANT THE RELIEF REQUESTED BY THE APPLICATION WITHOUT 
FURTHER NOTICE OR HEARING. 
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Dated:  March 28, 2022 
Wilmington, Delaware 

 

MORRIS, NICHOLS, ARSHT & TUNNELL LLP  
 
/s/ Tori L. Remington   
Derek C. Abbott (No. 3376) 
Andrew R. Remming (No. 5120) 
Paige N. Topper (No. 6470) 
Tori L. Remington (No. 6901) 
1201 North Market Street, 16th Floor 
Wilmington, Delaware 19801 
Telephone:  (302) 658-9200 
Email:  dabbott@morrisnichols.com 

 aremming@morrisnichols.com 
 ptopper@morrisnichols.com 

             tremington@morrisnichols.com 
 
– and – 
 
WHITE & CASE LLP 
Jessica C. Lauria (admitted pro hac vice) 
1221 Avenue of the Americas 
New York, New York 10020 
Telephone:  (212) 819-8200 
Email:  jessica.lauria@whitecase.com 
 
– and – 
 
WHITE & CASE LLP 
Michael C. Andolina (admitted pro hac vice) 
Matthew E. Linder (admitted pro hac vice) 
Laura E. Baccash (admitted pro hac vice) 
Blair M. Warner (admitted pro hac vice) 
111 South Wacker Drive 
Chicago, Illinois 60606 
Telephone:  (312) 881-5400 
Email: mandolina@whitecase.com 
            mlinder@whitecase.com 

             laura.baccash@whitecase.com 
  blair.warner@whitecase.com 
 
Attorneys for the Debtors and Debtors in Possession 
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Phase 1 Fees and Expense Itemization 
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www.ogletreedeakins.com 

Atlanta ▪ Austin ▪ Berlin (Germany) ▪ Birmingham ▪ Boston ▪ Charleston ▪ Charlotte ▪ Chicago ▪ Cleveland ▪ Columbia ▪ Dallas ▪ Denver ▪ Detroit Metro ▪ Greenville ▪ Houston
Indianapolis ▪ Jackson ▪ Kansas City ▪ Las Vegas ▪ London (England) ▪ Los Angeles ▪ Memphis ▪ Mexico City (Mexico) ▪ Miami ▪ Milwaukee ▪ Minneapolis ▪ Montréal (Canada) ▪ Morristown
Nashville ▪ New Orleans ▪ New York City ▪ Oklahoma City ▪ Orange County ▪ Paris (France) ▪ Philadelphia ▪ Phoenix ▪ Pittsburgh ▪ Portland, ME ▪ Portland, OR ▪ Raleigh
Richmond ▪ St. Louis ▪ St. Thomas ▪ Sacramento ▪ San Antonio ▪ San Diego ▪ San Francisco ▪ Seattle ▪ Stamford ▪ Tampa ▪ Toronto (Canada) ▪ Torrance ▪ Tucson ▪ Washington

Robyn Jungers
The Boy Scouts of America 
Legal Department
1325 West Walnut Hill Lane
P.O. Box 152079
Irving, TX  75015-2049

PERSONAL AND CONFIDENTIAL
Bill #  90627368
Client.Matter #  047657.000013
RISKONNECT

Re: BSA General Defense - Bankruptcy (Billiable)

For professional services rendered through February 28, 2022, in connection with the above-referenced 
matter as outlined on the attached detailed billing sheets:

Fees .............................................................................................................................................$186,749.50
Expenses..........................................................................................................................................$7,134.24

Total Due This Bill......................................................................................................................$193,883.74

Fees Expenses
Year-To-Date $(136,547.50) $8,875.24
Life-To-Date $3,390,070.00 $43,127.06
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Robyn Jungers 
The Boy Scouts of America 
Legal Department
1325 West Walnut Hill Lane
P.O. Box 152079
Irving, TX  75015-2049

Re: BSA General Defense - Bankruptcy (Billiable)

For professional services rendered through February 28, 2022

Date Initials Stage Description Hours Amount
02/01/22 BAG PHASE1 Review and respond to email from 

Oregon defense counsel regarding 
acceptance of service.

0.10 64.00

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange between BSA and 
Tuscarora Council in North Carolina 
regarding information the council is 
seeking related to pending stays of 
litigation and the ongoing bankruptcy 
case.

0.20 89.00

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Oregon defense 
counsel regarding the BSA 
bankruptcy counsel position on 
acceptance of service for Oregon 
cases.

0.20 89.00

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Receive and review multiple emails 
from the Tuscarora Council in North 
Carolina regarding several cases 
served on the council.

0.20 89.00

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Receive and review multiple emails 
from the Mecklenburg County Council  
in North Carolina regarding several 
cases served on the council.

0.10 44.50

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Receive and review email from the 
Central North Carolina Council 
regarding service of process in the 
Carl Banks case.

0.10 44.50

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Missouri defense counsel 
with a copy of the Joint Status Report 
filed by Travelers Insurance in the 
J.F.H. case.

0.10 44.50

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from counsel for the Central 0.10 44.50
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Date Initials Stage Description Hours Amount
North Carolina Council advising of 
their review of the court filing system 
related to new cases still pending 
service of process on the council.

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Daniel Boone Council 
advising of service of process in the 
Thomas Pleis case.

0.10 44.50

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Begin drafting the Amended Consent 
Order Schedules for filing in the BSA 
bankruptcy case.

1.30 578.50

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the Mount Baker 
Council regarding handling of their 
three new lawsuits.

0.10 44.50

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Cape Fear Council 
advising of service of process in three 
new cases.

0.10 44.50

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Email discussion with White and 
Case regarding the coverage of 
Diocese defendants with the BSA 
stay of litigation along with named 
Churches.

0.30 133.50

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Oregon defense counsel 
advising of a Court Order for status 
conference on March 29, 2022.

0.10 44.50

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with North Carolina 
defense counsel and counsel for the 
Servant Episcopal Church in North 
Carolina regarding the current stay of 
litigation and pending hearing 
matters.

0.30 133.50

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with BSA regarding a 
new North Carolina case naming the 
North Florida Council and need to 
reach out to the counsel for the 
Diocese of St. Augustine.

0.20 89.00

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to counsel for the Diocese of 
St. Augustine in Florida regarding the 
B.A. Brault case.

0.30 133.50

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Telephone call and follow-up email 
from New Jersey defense counsel 
advising that their North Carolina 
office if representing the Moose 

0.20 89.00
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Date Initials Stage Description Hours Amount
Lodge defendants in a BS abuse 
case and seeking a waiver of conflict.

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to BSA regarding the conflict 
with the North Carolina office of our 
New Jersey defense counsel and to 
seek a waiver of the same.

0.20 89.00

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Review information regarding the 
status of the BSA plan vote and 
ability for voters to change their vote 
until the February 22nd hearing and 
email same to the BSA.

0.20 89.00

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from BSA approving of the 
conflicts waiver for New York/New 
Jersey defense counsel's North 
Carolina office representing the 
Moose Lodge defendants in a BSA 
abuse case and forward said 
approval to defense counsel.

0.20 89.00

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Additional email exchange with White 
and Case regarding the Catholic 
Church defendants in BSA abuse 
lawsuits and frequency of naming 
Diocese and Archdiocese entities.

0.20 89.00

02/01/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with New Jersey 
defense counsel regarding the 
second dismissal of the Garden State 
and Cradle of Liberty Councils in the 
A.D. case.

0.20 89.00

02/01/22 MM PHASE1 Review and respond to email from 
Joe Hammon, attorney for Church of 
the Servant Episcopal Church in WH 
v. Cape Fear Council case pending in 
NC regarding impact of stay.

0.20 83.00

02/01/22 MM PHASE1 Telephone conference with Warren 
Lesane, executive of the Presbyterian 
Church Mid-Atlantic Synod, regarding 
impact of notice filing on Synod 
parties named in NC lawsuits.

0.40 166.00

02/01/22 AS PHASE1 Continue entering newly received 
claims in Riskconnect.

2.20 539.00

02/01/22 MM PHASE1 Draft, review and revise multiple 
Notices of Entry of Sixth Stipulation 
for various county cases.

8.10 1,984.50
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Date Initials Stage Description Hours Amount
02/01/22 CW PHASE1 Add claims to RiskConnect database. 2.20 484.00

02/01/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchange with Lynn 
Richardson regarding Ogletree 
timekeepers.

0.10 19.00

02/01/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchange with Vanessa Savoy 
regarding month-end reporting and 
changes to Riskonnect.

0.10 19.00

02/01/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchange with Jennifer Nichols 
regarding lawsuit filed by Stanford 
Walker.

0.10 19.00

02/01/22 KAD PHASE1 Conference call with Katie Murray 
regarding claims to enter in 
Riskonnect and strategy going 
forward.

0.50 95.00

02/01/22 KAD PHASE1 Calculate the total number of lawsuits 
entered in Riskonnect and not yet 
entered, and the number of lawsuits 
that allege abuse in the last 5 years.

2.30 437.00

02/01/22 KAD PHASE1 Prepare claim data for meeting with 
client.

1.40 266.00

02/01/22 KAD PHASE1 Search and identify lawsuits already 
entered in Riskonnect and enter new 
lawsuits.

3.60 684.00

02/01/22 KJM PHASE1 Teleconference with K. Davis 
regarding claims to be entered into 
Riskonnect, claims that are missing 
from Riskonnect and strategy going 
forward.

0.50 75.00

02/02/22 BAG PHASE1 Prepare for/attend meeting at BSA 
legal to discuss status of claims and 
on-going processes and procedures 
for claims handling and data entry.

2.50 1,600.00

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Telephone call with counsel for Good 
Shepherd Church in North Carolina 
regarding service of process in a new 
case against them and the filing of 
the BSA Sixth Notice and follow-up 
email with a copy of the Compliant.

0.30 133.50

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the Old North 
State Council in North Carolina 
regarding service of process in 24 

0.20 89.00

Case 20-10343-LSS    Doc 9505-2    Filed 03/28/22    Page 6 of 76



Page 6
03/08/22

Bill No. 90627368
047657.000013-BAG

Date Initials Stage Description Hours Amount
new lawsuits.

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the Piedmont 
Council in North Carolina regarding 
Ogletree continuing to file Sixth 
Notices in their cases and sending 
them copies of the same.

0.20 89.00

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to North Carolina defense 
counsel requesting they send 
confirmation of filings to the Piedmont 
Council.

0.10 44.50

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Telephone call and follow-up email to 
counsel for the St. Augustine Diocese 
in Florida regarding two new BSA 
cases filed against them in North 
Carolina and to provide copies of the 
Original Consent Order, Sixth 
Extension of the Consent Order, and 
Notice of Consent Order filed in North 
Carolina.

0.30 133.50

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Cradle of Liberty 
Council in Pennsylvania advising of 
service of process in 6 new cases.

0.10 44.50

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Servant 
Episcopal Church in New Jersey 
regarding follow-up request for 
conference call to discuss the BSA 
bankruptcy case and stay over the 
church.

0.20 89.00

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from White and Case with 5 
new lawsuits served on them from 
plaintiffs in the bankruptcy case for 
confirming same have been added to 
the Consent Order Schedule 
Amendment.

0.10 44.50

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Review information related to 
yesterday's BSA bankruptcy case 
hearing related to discovery involving 
the Catholic Diocese Committee and 
forward same to the BSA.

0.20 89.00

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Tuscarora Council 
regarding service of process in the 
Michael Pleasant case.

0.10 44.50

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Council 0.20 89.00
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Date Initials Stage Description Hours Amount
President for the Tuscarora Council 
regarding filings of Sixth Notices for 
their cases.

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to North Carolina defense 
counsel with the request by the 
Tuscarora Council for copies of 
Complaints in their cases.

0.10 44.50

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Attend meeting with BSA at the BSA 
National Headquarters regarding 
processes and procedures for BSA 
lawsuits and claims and analysis of 
streamlining and completing the 
same for all pending BSA abuse 
matters.

2.40 1,068.00

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with White and Case 
regarding the request by BSA for 
them to reach out to the plaintiffs 
counsel in the abuse lawsuits to 
obtain lists of their clients who filed 
lawsuits along with proof of claim 
information.

0.30 133.50

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Further email exchange with BSA and 
White and Case regarding the 
planning to obtain proof of claims for 
all filed lawsuits.

0.30 133.50

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Occoneechee Council 
advising of service of process in a 
multi-plaintiff lawsuit.

0.10 44.50

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from BSA with information 
related to the Chris Rodda-Walker 
case in Washington State.

0.10 44.50

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from BSA requesting Ogletree 
reach out to the attorney for the Boys 
and Girls Home regarding a North 
Carolina lawsuit.

0.10 44.50

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the Daniel 
Boone Council regarding the Etowah 
Lions Club filing of a Motion for 
Extension of Time to Answer the 
lawsuit pending against them.

0.20 89.00

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Chief Seattle Council 
advising of service of process in the 
Rodda-Walker case.

0.10 44.50
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Date Initials Stage Description Hours Amount
02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the Jersey 

Shore Council regarding a request to 
reach out to the VFW of Ocean City, 
New Jersey regarding their requests 
for information related to the BSA 
stay of litigation.

0.10 44.50

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the Pee Dee 
Area Council in South Carolina 
regarding service of process in a 
North Carolina case.

0.20 89.00

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Second email exchange with 
Occoneechee Council regarding 
service of process in the Jason Ingani 
case.

0.10 44.50

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from White and Case advising 
of service of process in several North 
Carolina lawsuits through the 
bankruptcy process.

0.10 44.50

02/02/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from White and Case advising 
of service of process in two New York 
lawsuits through the bankruptcy 
process.

0.10 44.50

02/02/22 MM PHASE1 Prepare, review and revise multiple 
Notices of Entry of Sixth Stipulation 
for various county cases.

5.00 1,225.00

02/02/22 KAD PHASE1 Zoom meeting with Anna Kutz, Lynn 
Richradson, Heidi Steppe and 
Jennifer Nichols regarding work flow 
for new claims and entering claim 
data in Riskonnect.

1.50 285.00

02/02/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchange with Maz Mazurchick 
regarding billing information needed 
for lawsuits assigned to Melick and 
Porter.

0.10 19.00

02/02/22 KAD PHASE1 Search and identify lawsuits already 
entered in Riskonnect and enter new 
lawsuits.

5.60 1,064.00

02/02/22 KAD PHASE1 Conference call with Bruce Griggs 
and Katie Murray regarding status of 
entering claims in Riskonnect.

0.30 57.00

02/02/22 KJM PHASE1 Attend meeting at BSA legal to 
discuss status of claims and on-going 

1.50 225.00
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Date Initials Stage Description Hours Amount
processes and procedures for claims 
handling and data entry.

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Review J.P. 1134 case in New jersey 
and respond to the requests for 
information by the defendant VFW 
Post 6650.

0.30 133.50

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Garden State Council 
advising of two new lawsuits served 
last week.

0.20 89.00

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Emails from the Piedmont Council 
advising of 7 more new lawsuits 
served on the council.

0.10 44.50

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with New Jersey 
defense counsel regarding deficiency 
notices entered by the court in 5 BSA 
cases and potential plan for 
remedying the same.

0.20 89.00

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with New Jersey 
defense counsel regarding Consent 
Orders of Dismissal proposed by the 
Catholic Archdiocese of Newark in 
two multiple plaintiff cases.

0.20 89.00

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Review Consent Orders of Dismissal 
proposed by the Catholic 
Archdiocese of Newark in two 
multiple plaintiff cases to approve of 
the same.

0.10 44.50

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Review Jack Morris case in North 
Carolina and respond to the requests 
for information by the defendant Boys 
and Girls Home.

0.30 133.50

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Review Etowah Lion's Club Motion 
for Extension of Time to Respond to 
the Plaintiff's Complaint in the J.M.M. 
case and email counsel for the Club 
regarding the BSA stay of litigation.

0.20 89.00

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Continue drafting Amended Consent 
Order Schedule 1 (Unredacted) by 
adding all new New Jersey lawsuits 
since the last Amended filing.

4.40 1,958.00

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Blue Ridge Council 
advising of service of process in the 

0.10 44.50
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Justin Calixte.

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the counsel for the West 
Market Street United Methodist 
Church in Greensboro, North 
Carolina to advise of service of 
process in the Paul Jones case.

0.10 44.50

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Indian Waters Council 
in South Carolina advising of service 
of process in the Michael Draft 
lawsuit filed in North Carolina.

0.10 44.50

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the North Florida Council 
advising of service of process in the 
Parra and Brault cases in North 
Carolina and add details of the same 
to the North Carolina Litigation 
Tracking Spreadsheet.

0.20 89.00

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Mecklenburg Council 
advising of service of process in the 
Roger Green case.

0.10 44.50

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Tidewater Council 
advising of service of process in the 
Michael Katz case.

0.10 44.50

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Boys and Girls Club of 
North Carolina with a copy of the 
Complaint in the Jack Morris case.

0.10 44.50

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the insurer fir the Warsaw 
Presbyterian Church in North 
Carolina with notice of service of 
process in the H.S. case.

0.10 44.50

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Garden State Council 
advising of service of process in 2 
new lawsuits today.

0.10 44.50

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Buckskin Council in 
West Virginia regarding a new lawsuit 
served on the council for Jonathan 
Moore filed in North Carolina.

0.10 44.50

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from BSA with additional 
information related to the Jonathan 
Moore case in North Carolina.

0.10 44.50

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Cape Fear Council in 
North Carolina with an Affidavit of 
Service from Plaintiff and review the 

0.10 44.50
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Date Initials Stage Description Hours Amount
same.

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with New Jersey 
defense counsel regarding the 
Consent Order Discontinuing Action 
filed by the Archdiocese of 
Philadelphia and review the same.

0.20 89.00

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Review and update the New Jersey 
Litigation Tracking Spreadsheet and 
Amended Consent Order Schedule 1 
with information from the Kevin Dunn, 
et al. and Kyle Higgins, et al. served 
today on the Garden State Council.

0.30 133.50

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from counsel for the VFW Post 
#6650 in New Jersey requesting a 
copy of the filed Sixth Notice in their 
case.

0.10 44.50

02/03/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for the 
Holy Trinity Lutheran Church in North 
Carolina regarding the BSA stay of 
litigation and anticipated dismissal 
and discharge of the chartered 
partners.

0.20 89.00

02/03/22 MM PHASE1 Review and respond to email from 
Marcus Carpenter, counsel for Holy 
Trinity Lutheran Church, regarding 
impact of notice of stay and next 
steps.

0.30 124.50

02/03/22 AS PHASE1 Continue entering newly received 
claims in Riskconnect.

5.00 1,225.00

02/03/22 MM PHASE1 Prepare, review and revise multiple 
Notices of Entry of Sixth Stipulation 
for various county cases.

6.00 1,470.00

02/03/22 CW PHASE1 Continue to add claims to 
RiskConnect database.

4.00 880.00

02/03/22 KAD PHASE1 Review work flow process chart and 
email from Anna Kutz regarding 
same.

0.20 38.00

02/03/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchange with Nicole 
Liberatore regarding lawsuits 
assigned to Melick & Porter.

0.10 19.00

02/03/22 KAD PHASE1 Search and identify lawsuits already 
entered in Riskonnect and enter new 

6.10 1,159.00
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lawsuits.

02/03/22 KJM PHASE1 Manage, file and rename over 200 
complaints received in the month of 
January.

2.00 300.00

02/04/22 SEM PHASE1 Email discussion with BSA regarding 
keeping North Carolina local councils 
notified of Sixth Notice filings in their 
cases.

0.30 133.50

02/04/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for the 
First Presbyterian Church in Clinton, 
South Carolina regarding the BSA 
stay of litigation and anticipated 
bankruptcy timeline.

0.20 89.00

02/04/22 SEM PHASE1 Review information from yesterday's 
BSA bankruptcy hearing related to 
the Catholic Church Committee 
discovery requests and provide same 
to the BSA.

0.20 89.00

02/04/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with insurer for the 
Warsaw Presbyterian Church in North 
Carolina regarding further notice of 
service.

0.20 89.00

02/04/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the Daniel 
Boone Council regarding additional 
correspondence with the counsel for 
the Etowah Lions Club.

0.20 89.00

02/04/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Occoneechee Council 
advising of Court Order received in 
the Woodrow Sandlin case extending 
the time for the United Methodist 
Church defendants to respond to the 
lawsuit and review same.

0.20 89.00

02/04/22 SEM PHASE1 Continue drafting the unredacted 
Amended Consent Order Schedule 1 
by adding all new North Carolina 
cases.

2.80 1,246.00

02/04/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with BSA and Bruce 
Griggs regarding the potential 
settlement discovery sought by the 
Catholic Church Committee in the 
BSA Bankruptcy case.

0.30 133.50

02/04/22 SEM PHASE1 Telephone call with representative of 0.20 89.00
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Bush Creek Baptist Church in North 
Carolina regarding the BSA stay of 
litigation and bankruptcy details.

02/04/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the Daniel 
Boone Council in North Carolina with 
an Affidavit of Service filed in the Blu 
Bryan, et al. case and review the 
same.

0.20 89.00

02/04/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Mecklenburg County 
Council advising of service of process 
in 7 new cases.

0.10 44.50

02/04/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the counsel for First 
Presbyterian Church in Clinton, South 
Carolina seeking copies of the Sixth 
Notice filed in their cases.

0.10 44.50

02/04/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from New Jersey defense 
counsel regarding the plaintiff in the 
Jane Doe (JS) case dismissing the 
Evangelical Lutheran Church 
defendant and review Stipulation and 
letter to the Court regarding the 
same.

0.20 89.00

02/04/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for the 
Etowah Lions Club regarding their 
request for copies of the Consent 
Order, Sixth Extension and Notice 
being filed in the J.M.M. case.

0.20 89.00

02/04/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to BSA advising of the ongoing 
requests from local councils for proof 
of the stay of litigation and that 
Ogletree will file notices of the same 
for them.

0.10 44.50

02/04/22 MM PHASE1 Telephone call with Damon Gray, 
attorney for United Way Worldwide, 
regarding impact of notice of filing.

0.30 124.50

02/04/22 MM PHASE1 Prepare, review and revise multiple 
Notices of Entry of Sixth Stipulation 
for various county cases.

7.60 1,862.00

02/04/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchange with Nicole 
Liberatore regarding lawsuits 
assigned to Melick & Porter.

0.10 19.00

02/04/22 KAD PHASE1 Enter new claims in Riskonnect,. 6.70 1,273.00
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02/04/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchanges with Jennifer 

Nichols and Anna Kutz regarding MI 
Contact Report in Riskonnect.

0.30 57.00

02/06/22 MM PHASE1 Prepare email update to Piedmont 
Council regarding status of notice 
filings.

0.40 166.00

02/07/22 BAG PHASE1 Begin review of claims and cases 
filed since February 1 to assess 
status and tasks to be completed.

2.50 1,600.00

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with BSA, North 
Carolina defense counsel and 
Piedmont Council regarding the 
status report and filings for all their 
pending matters.

0.20 89.00

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with BSA regarding 
depositions of plaintiff attorneys in the 
BSA bankruptcy case and the 
possibility of obtaining copies of 
transcripts from the same.

0.20 89.00

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Email discussion with White and 
Case regarding search for lawsuits 
filed against certain Non-Debtor 
Related Entities.

0.30 133.50

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Review all filed BSA abuse lawsuits 
and search for lawsuits filed against 
certain Non-Debtor Related Entities 
for White and Case.

0.20 89.00

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Extended discussion with White and 
Case regarding research on filed BSA 
lawsuits and cases against specific 
Non-Debtor Related Parties.

0.60 267.00

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Extended discussion with White and 
Case regarding the Jane Doe v. 
Town of Trumbull case in 
Connecticut, the true chartered 
partner, and Plaintiff's Objection to 
the Confirmation of the BSA Plan of 
Reorganization filed in the 
Bankruptcy case.

0.40 178.00

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Review the Plaintiff, Jane Doe's 
Objection to the Confirmation of the 
BSA Plan of Reorganization filed in 
the Bankruptcy case related to her 

0.30 133.50
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claims against the Town of Trumbull.

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to Connecticut defense counsel 
seeking a current status of the Jane 
Doe v. Town of Trumbull case.

0.10 44.50

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Research case documents in the 
Jane Doe v. Town of Trumbull case 
related to identification of actual 
chartered partner of the plaintiff's 
Explorer Post and send same to 
White and Case.

0.20 89.00

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the counsel for 
the Old North State Council regarding 
additional information related to the 
cases pending against their counsel.

0.20 89.00

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for 
Avondale Presbyterian Church in 
North Carolina to discuss adding their 
case to the Amended Consent Order 
Schedules and to provide BSA 
coverage counsel information.

0.30 133.50

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with New Jersey 
defense counsel regarding the 
Motions to Dismiss and court orders 
in the K.J. and J.K. cases and need 
to file the Sixth Notice in the K.J. 
case.

0.20 89.00

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Review the pleadings and court 
orders related to the School Board's 
Motions to Dismiss in the J.K. and 
K.J. cases in New Jersey.

0.20 89.00

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to White and Case seeking 
advice to share with Local Councils 
and Chartered Partners about next 
steps in the bankruptcy case if the 
plan is not approved.

0.20 89.00

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Missouri 
defense counsel regarding an audit 
letter received on behalf of the Ozark 
Trails Council.

0.20 89.00

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the Central 
Florida Council regarding the Sixth 
Notice filing in the Pleis case in North 
Carolina.

0.20 89.00
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02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Complete drafting the Amended 

Consent Order Schedule 1 
(unredacted) by adding new North 
Carolina lawsuits.

2.50 1,112.50

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Mecklenburg County 
Council advising of service of process 
in two new cases.

0.10 44.50

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Receive and review multiple emails 
from the Old Hickory Council 
regarding service of process in 6 new 
lawsuits.

0.20 89.00

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Central North Carolina 
Council advising of service of process 
in the multi-plaintiff David Clapp case.

0.10 44.50

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Occoneechee Council 
advising of service of process in 2 
new cases.

0.10 44.50

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Connecticut defense 
counsel with current status report in 
the Jane Doe v. Town of Trumbull 
case.

0.10 44.50

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Telephone call with counsel for 
Lutheran Church defendants in North 
Carolina to discuss the BSA stay of 
litigation and anticipated plan.

0.20 89.00

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Telephone call and follow-up email 
with chartered organization 
representative for the Lion's Club in 
North Carolina regarding service of 
process, Sixth Notice filing and stay 
of litigation matters.

0.30 133.50

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Draft Amended Consent Order 
Schedule 1 (redacted).

1.50 667.50

02/07/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the Piedmont 
Council, BSA and North Carolina 
defense counsel regarding pending 
lawsuits against the council and 
action on the same.

0.40 178.00

02/07/22 MM PHASE1 Email correspondence with Connie 
Bowes, president of Piedmont 
Council, and Sean Manning regarding 
status and implications of notice 

0.50 207.50
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filings; review status of filings to 
answer questions raised by Mr. 
Bowes.

02/07/22 AS PHASE1 Continue entering newly received 
claims in Riskconnect.

3.90 955.50

02/07/22 MM PHASE1 Review and revise multiple Notices of 
Entry of Sixth Stipulation for various 
county cases.

1.50 367.50

02/07/22 KAD PHASE1 Search for and identify claims in 
Riskonnect and enter new claims in 
same.

7.80 1,482.00

02/07/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchanges with Sean Manning 
and Krista McDonald regarding 
schedule 1.

0.10 19.00

02/07/22 KJM PHASE1 Upload over 300 complaints to OD's 
ShareFile site for White and Case 
review in connection with the 
upcoming Amended Schedule One 
filing.

1.50 225.00

02/07/22 KJM PHASE1 Compile over 1k complaints and store 
in idrive to ensure claim entry in 
Riskonnect.

1.80 270.00

02/08/22 BAG PHASE1 Continue review of new claims and 
cases filed since February 1.

1.50 960.00

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with New Hope 
Presbyterian Church in North 
Carolina regarding lawsuits served on 
the Church and the BSA process of 
handling the same.

0.20 89.00

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Old North State 
Council advising of service of process 
in a John Doe case.

0.10 44.50

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Receive and review duplicate service 
of process on the Northern New 
Jersey Council for the multiple 
plaintiff Higgins and Dunn cases.

0.20 89.00

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to New Jersey defense counsel 
with assignment of Higgins and Dunn 
multi-plaintiff cases.

0.10 44.50

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with White and Case 
regarding the potential next steps in 

0.20 89.00

Case 20-10343-LSS    Doc 9505-2    Filed 03/28/22    Page 18 of 76



Page 18
03/08/22

Bill No. 90627368
047657.000013-BAG

Date Initials Stage Description Hours Amount
the BSA bankruptcy process.

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to BSA with information 
obtained from White and Case 
regarding next steps in the 
bankruptcy case.

0.10 44.50

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from New Jersey defense 
counsel with Court entered Consent 
Order Discontinuing the Action as to 
the Archdiocese of Philadelphia and 
review same.

0.10 44.50

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Daniel Boone 
Council regarding receipt of Affidavits 
of service in the Clapp, et al case and 
purpose for Plaintiff naming every 
local council in North Carolina.

0.20 89.00

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the attorney for 
the Central North Carolina Council 
regarding an analysis of pending BSA 
abuse claims and plaintiff counsel 
pleading issues.

0.20 89.00

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with BSA and North 
Carolina defense counsel regarding 
collection of Sixth Notices filed on 
behalf of the Palmetto Council for 
providing the same.

0.30 133.50

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Review Stephen Martin lawsuit 
served on the Palmeto Council and 
add details of the same to the North 
Carolina Litigation Tracking 
Spreadsheet.

0.20 89.00

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Assign the B.A. Brault case to North 
Carolina defense counsel.

0.10 44.50

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Draft Amended Consent Order 
Schedule 2 for filing in the BSA 
bankruptcy case.

3.00 1,335.00

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Telephone call with BSA to discuss 
issues facing North Carolina local 
councils and to strategise and 
develop a plan to provide timely 
notices of Sixth Notice filings.

0.40 178.00

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Detailed email to North Carolina 
defense counsel to discuss the 

0.30 133.50
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analysis and strategy of providing 
filed Sixth Notices to North Carolina 
local councils.

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from New Jersey defense 
counsel with brief report on today's 
hearing on the Westfield Board of 
Education’s Motion to Dismiss and 
the Plaintiff’s Cross-Motion to Stay 
the case.

0.10 44.50

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Email discussion with the BSA 
National Service Territory 15 Director 
and BSA regarding a request for 
information to be presented to the 
Scout Executives at an upcoming 
ZOOM Call related to the ongoing 
service of lawsuits in North Carolina.

0.30 133.50

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Georgia 
defense counsel regarding 
information to present to the court 
about the continued stay of litigation 
at the upcoming status conference on 
all pending Hall County BSA cases.

0.20 89.00

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Telephone call and follow-up email 
exchange with the Chartered 
Organization Representative for the 
St. Andrews Presbyterian Church in 
North Carolina regarding the BSA 
stay of litigation and bankruptcy plan.

0.30 133.50

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Draft Amended OMNI Service List for 
service of the Amended Consent 
Order Schedules.

2.30 1,023.50

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Cape Fear Council 
advising of service of process in 6 
new lawsuits today.

0.10 44.50

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from North Carolina defense 
counsel with Palmetto Council 
Notices.

0.10 44.50

02/08/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to Palmetto Council in North 
Carolina with Sixth Notices for their 
cases.

0.20 89.00

02/08/22 MM PHASE1 Telephone calls with Brian Beverly 
regarding status of NC cases filed 
against Disciples of Christ body and 

0.30 124.50
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impact of notice filings.

02/08/22 MM PHASE1 Confer with Sean Manning regarding 
strategy for getting notice filings to 
local councils.

0.30 124.50

02/08/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting Notices of Sixth Stipulation in 
matters of Calixte.

0.60 207.00

02/08/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting Notices of Sixth Stipulation in 
matters of Does 1-30 (Wake Co. 21-
CVS-17145).

0.60 207.00

02/08/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting Notices of Sixth Stipulation in 
matters of Martin.

0.60 207.00

02/08/22 AS PHASE1 Continue entering newly received 
claims in Riskconnect.

3.40 833.00

02/08/22 MM PHASE1 Review, revise, and prepare multiple 
Notices of Entry of Sixth Stipulation 
for various county cases.

7.80 1,911.00

02/08/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchange with Anna Kutz and 
Lynn Richardson regarding account 
privileges in Riskonnect.

0.10 19.00

02/08/22 KAD PHASE1 Search for and compile billing 
information for Melick and Porter and 
prepare report of same.

5.20 988.00

02/08/22 KAD PHASE1 Search for and identify claims not in 
Riskonnect and then enter same.

2.20 418.00

02/08/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchange with Michael 
Mazurczak regarding billing 
information needed for claims 
assigned to Melick and Porter.

0.10 19.00

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with New Jersey 
defense counsel  regarding the court 
order denying the School Board's 
Motion to Dismiss and continuing the 
BSA stay of litigation in the K.J. case.

0.20 89.00

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for 
Trinity Presbytery in North Carolina 
regarding the applicability of the BSA 
stay of litigation to the Presbytery.

0.20 89.00

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Jersey Shore Council 
advising of service of process in the 
multi-plaintiff Higgins and Dunn 

0.10 44.50
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cases.

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with White and Case 
regarding their inquiry about abuse 
lawsuits that name officers and 
directors of the BSA.

0.20 89.00

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with White and Case 
regarding their inquiry about BSA 
insurance coverage for LFL and 
sponsoring organizations.

0.20 89.00

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Email discussion with North Carolina 
defense counsel to strategise 
regarding the best method for 
keeping North Carolina local councils 
notified of Sixth Notice filings.

0.40 178.00

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Review notice from Wood County 
Court in Ohio of filing of a new John 
Doe lawsuit.

0.10 44.50

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Review and update the New Jersey, 
New York and North Carolina 
Litigation Tracking Spreadsheets with 
all new lawsuits received over the last 
week.

3.00 1,335.00

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with North Carolina 
defense counsel regarding a 
response to plaintiffs' counsel about 
service of process on certain local 
councils for certain filed lawsuits.

0.20 89.00

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Review North Carolina Litigation 
Tracking Spreadsheet to confirm 
service of process in certain cases for 
response to plaintiffs' counsel 
regarding the same.

0.10 44.50

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the LDS Church 
lawyers regarding service of process 
in the Goodrich case in North 
Carolina and Sixth Notice filing 
process.

0.20 89.00

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Old Hickory Council 
advising of service of process in the 
R.D.C. case.

0.10 44.50

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from North Carolina defense 
counsel to report on plaintiff's counsel 

0.10 44.50
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response to our inability to accept 
service in new lawsuits.

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from New Jersey defense 
counsel with Order dismissing the 
J.F. Complaint and review same.

0.20 89.00

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Collect Sixth Notices filing North 
Carolina for Heart of New England 
Council and email same to the 
council.

0.20 89.00

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Crossroads of the 
West Council with Orders received 
from the Court extending the stay of 
litigation in two of the Arizona cases 
filed against them.

0.10 44.50

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Tuscarora Council 
with 5 new Complaints served on the 
council.

0.10 44.50

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with New Jersey 
defense counsel regarding the United 
Methodist Church Motion to change 
the Track Assignment of the Higgins, 
et al case and review same.

0.20 89.00

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Old North Council 
advising of service of process in four 
more new cases.

0.10 44.50

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Missouri 
defense counsel regarding the draft 
Status Report ordered by the Court 
and review and approve of the same.

0.30 133.50

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Chartered 
Organization Representative for the 
defendant church in the William 
McCleary case in North Carolina 
regarding their request for a copy of 
the Plaintiff's BSA proof of claim.

0.20 89.00

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for 
several North Carolina churches 
regarding the BSA bankruptcy case, 
stay of litigation and related 
information pertaining to the defense 
of the chartered partner churches.

0.20 89.00

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to Erie Shores Council in Ohio 0.20 89.00
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to advise of a new case being filed on 
behalf of a John Doe plaintiff and 
request for same to be sent to 
Ogletree and BSA as soon as served.

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Review additional case for adding to 
the Consent Order Schedules from 
Washington State add same to the 
Amended Schedules and 
communicate with White and Case 
regarding the same.

0.40 178.00

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from White and Case with 
lawsuits served on them from 
plaintiffs to confirm same are on the 
Amended Consent Order Schedules 
and review same.

0.50 222.50

02/09/22 SEM PHASE1 Review additional new lawsuits 
served on North Carolina councils 
and revise the North Carolina 
Litigation Tracking Spreadsheet to 
add details of the same and assign to 
defense counsel.

0.80 356.00

02/09/22 MM PHASE1 Email correspondence with Piedmont 
Council President Connie Bowes 
regarding handling of duplicative 
findings.

0.30 124.50

02/09/22 MM PHASE1 Telephone call and email 
correspondence with Amanda Mingo, 
attorney for John Doe Plaintiffs in 
Mecklenburg County, NC cases.

0.40 166.00

02/09/22 MM PHASE1 Confer with Jefferson Whisenant and 
Michelle McCall regarding strategy for 
handling additional filing and 
providing notices to NC council 
defendants.

0.30 124.50

02/09/22 MM PHASE1 Telephone call with Joe Bell, attorney 
for First Baptist Church of Rocky 
Mount, NC regarding plan for filing of 
notice of stay and impact of same.

0.30 124.50

02/09/22 MM PHASE1 Email correspondence with Sean 
Manning regarding same.

0.20 83.00

02/09/22 AS PHASE1 Continue entering newly received 
claims in Riskconnect.

3.40 833.00
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02/09/22 MM PHASE1 Review, revise, and prepare multiple 

Notices of Entry of Sixth Stipulation 
for various county cases.

4.30 1,053.50

02/09/22 CW PHASE1 Input claims and lawsuits into 
RiskConnect database.

5.30 1,166.00

02/09/22 KAD PHASE1 Conference call with Anna Kutz 
regarding entering claims in 
Riskonnect.

0.50 95.00

02/09/22 KAD PHASE1 Search for and compile billing 
information for Melick and Porter and 
prepare report of same.

6.40 1,216.00

02/09/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchanges with Anna Kutz 
regarding entering claims in 
Riskonnet.

0.20 38.00

02/09/22 KJM PHASE1 Create quick claim in Riskonnect for 
lawsuit filed by V.P. in New York.

0.60 90.00

02/09/22 KJM PHASE1 Create quick claim in Riskonnect for 
lawsuit filed by
A.G. in New York.

0.60 90.00

02/09/22 KJM PHASE1 Create quick claim in Riskonnect for 
lawsuit filed by D.R. in New York.

0.50 75.00

02/09/22 KJM PHASE1 Create quick claim in Riskonnect for 
lawsuit filed by

 in New York.

0.40 60.00

02/09/22 KJM PHASE1 Update E. White and F. Helm in 
Riskonnect with defense attorney 
information.

0.20 30.00

02/10/22 BAG PHASE1 Exchange email with Anna Kutz 
regarding overall status.

0.20 128.00

02/10/22 BAG PHASE1 Review mediators report and term 
sheet.

0.50 320.00

02/10/22 BAG PHASE1 Conference call with Haynes and 
Boone and S. Manning to discuss 
status and next steps.

0.70 448.00

02/10/22 BAG PHASE1 Follow up call with the Earnest Martin 
to discuss trial preparation and trial 
testimony.

0.30 192.00

02/10/22 BAG PHASE1 Telephone conference with Anna 
Kutz regarding overall status.

0.30 192.00

REDACTEDREDACTED
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02/10/22 BAG PHASE1 Review term sheet, revise TDPS, in 

related documents received from 
Adrian Azar.

1.00 640.00

02/10/22 BAG PHASE1 Prepare for trial preparation meeting 
with Haynes Boone on February 11.

1.50 960.00

02/10/22 BGH PHASE1 Review several emails from Sean 
Manning and Research regarding 
new Wood County complaint.

0.60 339.00

02/10/22 BGH PHASE1 Research regarding perpetrator and 
background of new Wood County 
complaint, lawyers, and Judge.

0.30 169.50

02/10/22 BGH PHASE1 Email to Alex Gardella regarding 
notice of appearance.

0.20 113.00

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Review information from yesterday's 
agreement between the BSA and the 
(formerly) opposing abuse survivor's 
group and send same to the BSA.

0.30 133.50

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the VFW Post 
450 Commander in New Jersey 
regarding the current stay of litigation 
and his request to be kept informed of 
changes to the status of the same.

0.20 89.00

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to Ohio defense counsel 
seeking a copy of the new John Doe 
Complaint and information about the 
plaintiff's counsel.

0.10 44.50

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Multiple email exchanges with Ohio 
defense counsel to obtain a copy of 
the Complaint and information 
regarding the new John Doe case, 
perpetrator, plaintiff's counsel and 
judge.

0.50 222.50

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Research the OMNI BSA Proof of 
Claim database in an attempt to 
locate a proof of claim for the new 
Ohio John Doe.

0.20 89.00

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Multiple email exchanges with BSA 
and the Erie Shores Council in Ohio 
regarding the new John Doe lawsuit, 
information obtained related to the 
same and to request Post 717 rosters 
from the council.

0.40 178.00
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02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to Ohio defense counsel 

directing them to file the Sixth Notice 
in the new John Doe case on behalf 
of the Local Council and Chartered 
Partners.

0.10 44.50

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to the Erie Shores Council in 
Ohio advising them of the BSA stay 
of litigation and that the Sixth Notice 
will be filed on their behalf.

0.10 44.50

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Conference call with Haynes and 
Boone to discuss new agreement 
with the TCC, additional bankruptcy 
case developments and new actions 
needed as a result of the same.

0.80 356.00

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Review the newly filed Mediator's 
Report and TCC Term Sheet per the 
request of Haynes and Boone.

1.00 445.00

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Attend conference with BSA 
Relationship Attorney for Wilson Elser 
law firm regarding a status update on 
all the cases they are handling across 
the United States and to provide 
insight into the current bankruptcy 
position and continued stay of 
litigation.

1.00 445.00

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Idaho defense 
counsel regarding the status report 
required in the Does v. Mountain 
West Council case.

0.20 89.00

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Crossroads of the West 
Council with Court Minute Entries 
requiring Plaintiff to file follow-up 
status reports and forward same to 
Arizona defense counsel.

0.20 89.00

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with New Jersey 
defense counsel regarding the United 
Methodist Church filing of 
Certification in Support of Change of 
Track Assignment in the G.N., et al 
case and review same.

0.20 89.00

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Cape Fear Council 
advising of service of process in the 
Jack Morris case.

0.10 44.50
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02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with New Jersey 

defense counsel regarding the United 
Methodist Church Motion to Intervene 
and Stay in the G.N., et al case and 
review same.

0.20 89.00

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with New Jersey 
defense counsel regarding the United 
Methodist Church filing of Motion to 
Intervene and Stay in the Kyle 
Higgins, et al case and review same.

0.20 89.00

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Abused in Scouting 
plaintiffs' counsel with 20 New York 
BSA abuse Complaints.

0.20 89.00

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Emails from Haynes and Boone with 
Revised TCC Settlement Term Sheet 
and Supporting Documents, Revised 
Trust Distribution Procedures, and 
Certain Insurer's Objections of 
Debtors' Chapter 11 Plan.

0.20 89.00

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Erie Shores Council with 
Post rosters related to the new John 
Doe case and review the same.

0.20 89.00

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to BSA and Erie Shores 
Council advising that the identity of 
the John Doe Plaintiff.

0.10 44.50

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Erie Shore 
Council regarding perpetrator in the 
John Doe case not appearing on the 
provided rosters and request for 
additional years of rosters.

0.20 89.00

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Haynes and Boone 
regarding tomorrow's bankruptcy 
hearing and potential for the February 
22nd hearing to be moved.

0.10 44.50

02/10/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Abused in Scouting 
plaintiffs' counsel with 20 New Jersey 
BSA abuse Complaints.

0.20 89.00

02/10/22 AG PHASE1 Prepare notice of appearance (Wood 
County Case No. 2022CV0043).

0.20 63.00

02/10/22 AS PHASE1 Continue entering newly received 
claims in Riskconnect.

5.50 1,347.50

02/10/22 MM PHASE1 Review and revise multiple Notices of 3.30 808.50
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Entry of Sixth Stipulation for various 
county cases.

02/10/22 CW PHASE1 Input new claims/lawsuits into 
RiskConnect database.

6.80 1,496.00

02/10/22 KAD PHASE1 Conference call with April Steffen and 
Cynthia Williamson.

0.70 133.00

02/10/22 KAD PHASE1 Search for and compile billing 
information for Melick and Porter and 
prepare report of same.

3.30 627.00

02/10/22 KAD PHASE1 Search for and identify claims not in 
Riskonnect and enter same.

4.10 779.00

02/10/22 KJM PHASE1 Create quick claim in Riskonnect for 
lawsuit filed by D.L. in New York.

0.40 60.00

02/10/22 KJM PHASE1 Create quick claim in Riskonnect for 
lawsuit filed by MDG-16 Doe.

0.50 75.00

02/10/22 KJM PHASE1 Download complaints filed from the 
NYSCEF website that have not been 
assigned to outside counsel and 
update spreadsheet regarding same..

2.10 315.00

02/11/22 BAG PHASE1 Attend trial preparation meeting with 
Haynes Boone.

4.00 2,560.00

02/11/22 BGH PHASE1 Work on conflicts check. 0.20 113.00

02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Greater New 
York Councils regarding a Notice of 
Default filed in Alejandro Velazquez 
case.

0.20 89.00

02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Review New York Litigation Tracking 
Spreadsheet for Alejandro Velazquez 
case and email defense counsel 
regarding the Default Notice.

0.20 89.00

02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Review additional information related 
to the changes to the BSA plan of 
reorganization and provide same to 
BSA.

0.20 89.00

02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for 
various Presbyterian churches in 
North Carolina regarding the request 
for copies of Sixth Notices filed in 
cases affecting those churches.

0.20 89.00
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02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Receive and review an Order 

reinstating and staying the  
 Roe case in New Jersey 

received from the Jersey Shore 
Council.

0.20 89.00

02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with New York 
defense counsel regarding the 
existence of multiple lawsuits naming 

 a plaintiff, filing 
the Sixth Notice today and requesting 
plaintiff withdraw the Motion for 
Default.

0.20 89.00

02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Idaho defense 
counsel regarding the Status Report 
being filed today and review of the 
same.

0.20 89.00

02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Tuscarora Council 
advising of service of process in a 
new anonymous plaintiff lawsuit.

0.10 44.50

02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Chattahoochee 
Council in Georgia regarding service 
pf process in the  case 
filed in North Carolina, BSA stay of 
litigation and Ogletree handling of the 
case.

0.20 89.00

02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Email form the Occoneechee Council 
advising service of process in two 
new anonymous plaintiff lawsuits.

0.10 44.50

02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Washington, 
D.C. defense counsel regarding 
information to provide the court in 
ordered status reports being filed next 
week.

0.20 89.00

02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from New York defense 
counsel with correspondence from 
plaintiff's counsel in the  

 regarding their agreement 
to withdraw the Motion for Default 
upon the filing of the Sixth Notice.

0.10 44.50

02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Erie Shores Council in 
Ohio with additional Post 717 rosters 
and review the same.

0.20 89.00

02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for the 0.20 89.00

REDACTED

REDACTEDREDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED
REDACTEDREDACTED
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Winston-Salem/Forsyth County Board 
of Education to advise that no 
consent of the parties is necessary 
for entry of the BSA stay of Litigation.

02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Idaho defense 
counsel regarding approval of their 
draft Status Report and review the 
same.

0.20 89.00

02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from counsel for Carolina Pines 
Baptist Church in North Carolina 
seeking written confirmation that the 
BSA stay of litigation applies to the 
Church.

0.10 44.50

02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Palmetto Council 
advising of service of process in the 
John Doe 1-33 case.

0.10 44.50

02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Old North State 
Council advising of service of process 
in the John Doe 1-33 case.

0.10 44.50

02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the counsel for 
the Western North Carolina 
Conference, United Methodist Church 
regarding a request for updates on 
the filing of Sixth Notices in all their 
affected cases.

0.20 89.00

02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Attend BSA bankruptcy hearing 
regarding the newly revised BSA Plan 
of Reorganization and Trust 
Distribution Procedures.

3.00 1,335.00

02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Attend meeting at Haynes and Boone 
to discuss the changes to the BSA 
Plan of Reorganization, Trust 
Distribution Procedures and impact 
on Ogletree and trial testimony of 
Bruce Griggs.

2.50 1,112.50

02/11/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with White and Case 
regarding the need to file the Sixth 
Notice in a non-BSA case for 
Scouting related abuse on behalf of 
the Brewster Elks Lodge in New York 
and forward same to New York 
defense counsel.

0.30 133.50

02/11/22 MM PHASE1 Telephone and email correspondence 0.50 207.50
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with Pam Keenan, attorney for 
chartered parties in six NC cases, 
regarding struts and impact of notice 
findings.

02/11/22 MM PHASE1 Telephone call with attorney Don 
Prentiss, attorney for chartered 
parties in NC cases, regarding status 
of notice filings and impact of same.

0.30 124.50

02/11/22 MM PHASE1 Email to Michelle McCall regarding 
request for notices and status of 
mailing in specific cases.

0.10 41.50

02/11/22 CW PHASE1 Add claims/new lawsuits to 
RiskConnect database.

4.50 990.00

02/11/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchange with Kayron Headley 
regarding Bradford Alexander lawsuit.

0.10 19.00

02/11/22 KAD PHASE1 Search for and compile billing 
information for Melick and Porter and 
prepare report of same.

3.60 684.00

02/11/22 KAD PHASE1 Search for and identify claims not in 
Riskonnect and enter same.

4.40 836.00

02/11/22 KJM PHASE1 Attend trial prep meeting at Haynes 
Boone.

4.00 600.00

02/13/22 MM PHASE1 Email correspondence with Greg 
Huffman, attorney for United 
Methodist Confernce defendants in 
NC cases, regarding status of notice 
filings in cases involving these 
defendants.

0.10 41.50

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of Doe 
(Swain County 21-cvs-283).

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of Does 1-3 
(Wake County 21-cvs-500095).

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of
Does 1-46 (Wake County 21-cvs-
500094).

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of

0.20 69.00
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Does 1-6 (Wake County 21-cvs-
500092).

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of
Banks.

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of
Does 1-41 (Pasquotank County 21-
cvs-863).

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of Beam.

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of Doe 
(Pasquotank County 21-cvs-871).

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of B.K.

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of Doe 
(Bumcombe County 21-cvs-5085).

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of Carson.

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of Does 1-
30 (Buncombe County 21-cvs-5054).

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of Doe 
(Buncombe County 21-cvs-5094).

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of Doe 
(New Hanover County 21-cvs-4709).

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of Adams.

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of Alley.

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of Alcon.

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of Does 1-
41 (Guilford County 21-cvs-10037).

0.20 69.00
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02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 

Sixth Stipulation in matter of Does 1-
21 (Stanly County 21-cvs-973).

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of Does 1-
23 (New Hanover County 21-cvs-
4768).

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of Does 1-3 
(Stanly County 21-cvs-975).

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of Doe 
(Stanly County 21-cvs-970).

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of Does 1-6 
(Guilford County 21-cvs-10023).

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of Does 1-2 
(Guilford County 21-cvs-10040).

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of Does 1-4 
(Stanly County 21-cvs-978).

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of Does 1-2 
(Guilford County 21-cvs-10021).

0.20 69.00

02/13/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising Notices of 
Sixth Stipulation in matter of Wagner.

0.20 69.00

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from North Carolina defense 
counsel regarding four cases with 
missing Complaints and review North 
Carolina Litigation Tracking 
Spreadsheet for information related 
tot he same.

0.30 133.50

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from North Carolina defense 
counsel requesting a list of contact 
details for all North Carolina local 
councils for serving Sixth Notice 
filings and request same form the 
BSA.

0.20 89.00

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Occoneechee Council 
advising of service of process in the 

0.10 44.50
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John Doe 1-33 case.

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Old North State 
Council regarding requests for 
information received from the Green 
Street Baptist Church and need to 
respond to the same.

0.20 89.00

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for the 
Pines Baptist Church in North 
Carolina regarding request to reach 
out to the Reverend regarding the 
BSA stay of litigation.

0.20 89.00

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Review information related to Friday's 
BSA bankruptcy hearing and send 
same to the BSA.

0.20 89.00

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Extensive email to counsel for the 
Green Street Baptist Church in North 
Carolina to respond to their inquires 
about the BSA stay of litigation and 
litigation process.

0.50 222.50

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Occoneechee Council 
with Affidavits of Service received for 
cases served on the council.

0.10 44.50

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Old Hickory Council 
advising of service of process in the 
John Doe 1-33 case.

0.10 44.50

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Multiple emails and discussion with 
the East Carolina Council regarding 
25 new lawsuits served on the East 
Carolina Council last week.

0.30 133.50

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Old Hickory 
Council regarding the plaintiffs' use of 
pseudonyms and finding real 
identities.

0.20 89.00

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to Washington State defense 
counsel with assignment of Chris 
Rodda-Walker case against the Chief 
Seattle Council.

0.10 44.50

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Revise and update the North Carolina 
Litigation Tracking Spreadsheet with 
numerous new lawsuits served on 
North Carolina local councils.

1.50 667.50

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Central North Carolina 0.10 44.50
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Council advising of service of process 
in 6 more new lawsuits.

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Additional email exchange with 
counsel for Green Street Baptist 
Church to respond to additional 
questions and to provide the Original 
Consent Order, Order Extending the 
Stay and exemplar of the Sixth Notice 
being filed in North Carolina.

0.30 133.50

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from BSA to Haynes and 
Boone following up on advice to 
provide chartered partners with 
questions about applicability of 
Bankruptcy Plan changes.

0.10 44.50

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from C.N.A. Insurance with 
coverage letters for 16 cases 
tendered by the BSA.

0.10 44.50

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Watts Street 
Baptist Church in North Carolina 
regarding the affect on the Church 
from the recent BSA Plan change.

0.20 89.00

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the Gulf Stream 
Council regarding service of process 
in the John Doe 1-33 and Ogletree 
handling of the pending abuse 
litigation.

0.20 89.00

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Mecklenburg County 
Council advising of 8 new lawsuits 
served on the council.

0.10 44.50

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Tuscarora Council 
advising of service of process in the 
John Does 1-33 case.

0.10 44.50

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with White and Case 
regarding their request for missing 
Complaints related to the Amended 
Consent Order Schedules.

0.20 89.00

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Central North Carolina 
Council advising of service of process 
in the John Doe 1-33 case.

0.10 44.50

02/14/22 SEM PHASE1 Review information related to the 
BSA Insurer objection to the number 
of pending abuse claims and forward 

0.20 89.00
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same to the BSA.

02/14/22 MM PHASE1 Telephone with Hill Allen, attorney for 
plaintiffs in awake County cases 
involving multiple local counsels, 
regarding impact of notice of stay and 
experience with avoiding 
administrative court sessions.

0.30 124.50

02/14/22 MM PHASE1 Email correspondence with Lisa 
Garrison regarding Waldroup v. 
Green Street Baptist Church 
regarding plan for notice filings.

0.20 83.00

02/14/22 MM PHASE1 Review chart of United Methodist 
Church cases and email 
correspondence with Michelle McCall 
regarding information to provide to 
church attorneys regarding same.

0.20 83.00

02/14/22 AS PHASE1 Continue entering newly received 
claims in Riskconnect.

5.80 1,421.00

02/14/22 MM PHASE1 Review and revise multiple Notices of 
Entry of Sixth Stipulation for various 
county cases.

3.20 784.00

02/14/22 CW PHASE1 Enter claims into RiskConnect 
database.

6.00 1,320.00

02/14/22 KAD PHASE1 Search for and compile billing 
information for Melick and Porter and 
prepare report of same.

2.70 513.00

02/14/22 KAD PHASE1 Search for and identify claims not in 
Riskonnect and enter same.

4.10 779.00

02/14/22 KAD PHASE1 Analyze claims and AP records 
created in the last 7 days report.

0.70 133.00

02/14/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchange with Michael 
Mazurczak regarding billing 
information for claims assigned to 
Melick & Porter.

0.10 19.00

02/14/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchange with Anna Kutz 
regarding billing process for claims 
assigned to Wiggin and Dana.

0.10 19.00

02/14/22 KJM PHASE1 Compile over 70 complaints in 
connection with the amended 
schedule one filing.

3.30 495.00
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02/14/22 KJM PHASE1 Continue to search and compile over 

70 complaints in connection with the 
amended schedule one filing.

2.80 420.00

02/15/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Daniel Boone 
Council regarding several new 
pleadings received yesterday.

0.20 89.00

02/15/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with New Jersey 
defense counsel regarding questions 
raised by counsel for the Benevolent 
& Protective Order of Elks of the 
U.S.A. and response to the same.

0.20 89.00

02/15/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with  New Jersey 
defense counsel regarding the 
Roman Catholic Archdiocese of 
Newark's Third-Party Complaint 
being filed in the DeGennaro case.

0.20 89.00

02/15/22 SEM PHASE1 Research, collect and produce 
missing Complaints related to the 
Amended Consent Order Schedules 
for White and Case.

2.00 890.00

02/15/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Piedmont 
Council and North Carolina defense 
counsel regarding service of process 
in the John Does 1-33 case and other 
pending Sixth Notice filings.

0.20 89.00

02/15/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the South 
Florida Council regarding service of 
process in the John Doe 1-33 case 
filed in North Carolina and Ogletree 
handling of the same.

0.20 89.00

02/15/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the Indian 
Waters Council in South Carolina 
regarding service of process in the 
Michael Draft case filed in North 
Carolina and Ogletree handling of the 
same.

0.20 89.00

02/15/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Washington State defense 
counsel regarding the filed Sixth 
Notice in the new Rodda-Walker 
case.

0.10 44.50

02/15/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Cape Fear Council 
advising of service of process in 7 
new lawsuits.

0.10 44.50
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02/15/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Occoneechee Council 

advising of receipt of a Motion for 
Extension of Time to Answer filed on 
behalf of the United Methodist 
Church.

0.10 44.50

02/15/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Georgia 
defense counsel regarding an update 
on the BSA Bankruptcy hearing date 
for their upcoming court ordered 
status report.

0.20 89.00

02/15/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the Northern 
New Jersey Council regarding the 
Plaintiff's transfer of venue for the 
John ES Roe case.

0.20 89.00

02/15/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Georgia defense counsel 
with update from the Court Status 
Conference today and to alert to the 
next scheduled Status Conference.

0.10 44.50

02/15/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with New Jersey 
defense counsel regarding another 
Consent Order to Stay another 
Presbyterian Church related lawsuit 
and review said Order.

0.30 133.50

02/15/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the Erie Shores 
Council regarding service of process 
in the new John Doe case and to 
review what was purported to be a 
Subpoena served in the case.

0.30 133.50

02/15/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Occoneechee Council 
advising of service of process in a JA 
Doe case.

0.10 44.50

02/15/22 SEM PHASE1 Revise New York and New Jersey 
Litigation Tracking Spreadsheet to 
include recently received lawsuits.

0.20 89.00

02/15/22 SEM PHASE1 Revise North Carolina Litigation 
Tracking Spreadsheet by adding 
more new lawsuits received over the 
last two weeks.

0.60 267.00

02/15/22 MM PHASE1 Review email correspondence from 
Connie Bowes regarding new Wake 
County, NC case involving multiple 
council defendants and email to Mr. 
Bowes regarding discussion with 

0.20 83.00
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plaintiff’s counsel in case.

02/15/22 MM PHASE1 Telephone calls with Bo Walker, 
attorney for individual Methodist 
Churches, regarding plans for notice 
filings and next steps.

0.30 124.50

02/15/22 MM PHASE1 Email correspondence with Joe 
Hammon regarding status of notice 
filings in JB v. Occoneechee Council 
cases filed in Wake County, NC.

0.20 83.00

02/15/22 AS PHASE1 Continue entering newly received 
claims in Riskconnect.

7.60 1,862.00

02/15/22 MM PHASE1 Review and revise multiple Notices of 
Entry of Sixth Stipulation for various 
county cases.

4.60 1,127.00

02/15/22 CW PHASE1 Enter claims into RiskConnect 
database.

6.00 1,320.00

02/15/22 KAD PHASE1 Review Epic invoice and submit same 
for processing.

0.20 38.00

02/15/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchange with Anna Kutz 
regarding status of entering claims in 
Riskonnet.

0.10 19.00

02/15/22 KAD PHASE1 Analyze multiple reports in 
Riskonnect and calculate the total 
number of claims entered in the last 7 
days and number of claims left to be 
entered.

0.70 133.00

02/15/22 KAD PHASE1 Search for and identify claims not in 
Riskonnect and enter same.

6.70 1,273.00

02/16/22 BGH PHASE1 Review Alex Gardella email regarding 
notice of stay.

0.10 56.50

02/16/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the Dan Beard 
Council in Ohio regarding service of 
process in the John Doe 1-33 case 
filed in North Carolina and Ogletree's 
handling of the same.

0.20 89.00

02/16/22 SEM PHASE1 Review correspondence between 
counsel for the South Tampa 
Fellowship Church regarding service 
of process in the John Doe 1-33 case 
and request for BSA handling of the 
same.

0.20 89.00
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02/16/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with BSA regarding 

the response to counsel for the South 
Tampa Fellowship Church regarding 
the BSA bankruptcy case and 
Ogletree handling of the stay f 
litigation.

0.20 89.00

02/16/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for the 
Dan Beard Council regarding 
coverage for the Archdiocese of 
Cincinnati with the BSA stay of 
litigation.

0.20 89.00

02/16/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for the 
LDS Church seeking confirmation of 
Sixth Notice filings in 7 LDS Church 
related cases in Oregon, New Jersey 
and North Carolina.

0.20 89.00

02/16/22 SEM PHASE1 Review LDS Church cases and seek 
confirmation from local defense 
counsel of the Sixth Notice filing in 
the same.

1.00 445.00

02/16/22 SEM PHASE1 Telephone call and email exchange 
with Greater Saint Paul Missionary 
Baptist Church regarding the BSA 
stay of litigation and Ogletree 
handling the Bernard Hedgepeth 
case.

0.40 178.00

02/16/22 SEM PHASE1 Emails from Oregon, New Jersey and 
North Carolina defense counsel 
regarding confirmation of BSA Sixth 
Notice filings in LDS cases and 
forward same to LDS Church 
counsel.

0.30 133.50

02/16/22 SEM PHASE1 Draft extensive email to counsel for 
the South Tampa Fellowship Church 
regarding the John Doe 1-33 lawsuit 
against them, the BSA bankruptcy 
case and Ogletree handling of the 
stay of litigation process.

0.50 222.50

02/16/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with BSA regarding 
information being sent to counsel for 
the South Tampa Fellowship Church 
and send same.

0.20 89.00

02/16/22 SEM PHASE1 Revise North Carolina Litigation 
Tracking Spreadsheet with details of 

2.20 979.00
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new lawsuits served on councils over 
the last week and assign same to 
defense counsel.

02/16/22 SEM PHASE1 Telephone conference with New 
Jersey defense counsel to discuss 
issues with New Jersey courts and 
strategy for responding to the same.

0.20 89.00

02/16/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for the 
Old North State Council regarding the 
request from the Counsel for 
Emerywood Baptist Church for a copy 
of the filed Sixth Notice and forward 
said request to North Carolina 
defense counsel.

0.20 89.00

02/16/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with White and Case 
regarding additional Complaints 
missing from Amended Consent 
Order Schedule update, locate and 
forward the same.

0.60 267.00

02/16/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with White and Case 
regarding North Carolina cases that 
were added to the Amended Consent 
Order Schedules without Complaints 
and request for search of the same.

0.20 89.00

02/16/22 SEM PHASE1 Research Complaints received since 
the last Amended Consent Order 
Schedule filing to locate additional 
Complaints for attaching to the new 
Schedule amendment.

0.60 267.00

02/16/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with BSA internally 
and including Ogletree regarding 
direction to local councils about the 
notification and handling of new 
abuse lawsuits.

0.30 133.50

02/16/22 SEM PHASE1 Email discussion with BSA regarding 
the Darrell White case filed only 
against the BSA in Ohio.

0.30 133.50

02/16/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Mount Baker Council 
in Washington State regarding 
service pf process in the new David 
Erdman case.

0.10 44.50

02/16/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for the 
Episcopal Church regarding service 

0.20 89.00
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of process and request for Sixth 
Notice filing in the  
case in North Carolina.

02/16/22 MM PHASE1 Follow up telephone call and email 
correspondence with Bo Walker 
regarding representation of multiple 
individual Methodist Churches and 
status and effect of filed notices and 
timeline for next events.

0.40 166.00

02/16/22 MM PHASE1 Review and respond to email from 
Eric Stevens, chancellor for NC 
Conference if the United Methodist 
Church, regarding status of notices in 
multiple pending cases.

0.30 124.50

02/16/22 AS PHASE1 Continue entering newly received 
claims in Riskconnect.

3.50 857.50

02/16/22 MM PHASE1 Review and revise multiple Notices of 
Entry of Sixth Stipulation for various 
county cases.

7.90 1,935.50

02/16/22 CW PHASE1 Enter claims into RiskConnect 
database.

3.00 660.00

02/16/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchange with Jennifer Nichols 
regarding Pieri lawsuit.

0.10 19.00

02/16/22 KAD PHASE1 Search for and identify claims not in 
Riskonnect and enter same.

7.80 1,482.00

02/17/22 BGH PHASE1 Review Alex Gardella email regarding 
stay being filed.

0.10 56.50

02/17/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for the 
Archdiocese of Cincinnati regarding 
service of process and filing the Sixth 
Notice in the John Doe 1-33 case 
filed in North Carolina.

0.20 89.00

02/17/22 SEM PHASE1 Review the 214 page Darrell White 
Complaint and related pleadings filed 
in Ohio and provide a brief response 
to the BSA regarding the same.

2.00 890.00

02/17/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Tuscarora 
Council regarding receipt of 6 
Affidavits of Service and handling of 
the same.

0.20 89.00

02/17/22 SEM PHASE1 Research OMNI Proof of Claim 0.40 178.00

REDACTEDREDACTED
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database to obtain claim forms filed 
by Darrell White.

02/17/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to White and Case discussing 
the Darrell White lawsuit in Ohio and 
potential for handling the same.

0.50 222.50

02/17/22 SEM PHASE1 Review new David Erdman case in 
Washington State and report details 
of the same to BSA and assign case 
to defense counsel for Sixth Notice 
filing.

0.40 178.00

02/17/22 SEM PHASE1 Search for and review BSA proof of 
claim for David Erdman in 
Washington and add additional 
information to the report to BSA and 
Washington defense counsel.

0.20 89.00

02/17/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with BSA regarding 
locating and providing the BSA Proof 
of Claim for David Erdman in 
Washington State.

0.20 89.00

02/17/22 SEM PHASE1 Review new Complaints received 
from New York councils and add 
same tot he New York Litigation 
Tracking Spreadsheet and assign 
same to defense counsel.

0.30 133.50

02/17/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the counsel for St. Paul’s 
Lutheran Church in Pennsylvania 
seeking confirmation of the filing of 
the Sixth Notice in the D.H. 960 case 
and forward same to New Jersey 
defense counsel.

0.20 89.00

02/17/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the Daniel 
Boone Council regarding the JA-341 
Doe case and how it has been filed 
against the wrong council.

0.20 89.00

02/17/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from New Jersey defense 
counsel with Sixth Notice and Order 
of Dismissal filed in the D.H. 960 
case in New Jersey and forward 
same to the attorney for St. Paul’s 
Lutheran Church.

0.20 89.00

02/17/22 SEM PHASE1 Review new North Carolina 
Complaints served on local councils 
this week and add revise the North 

2.40 1,068.00
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Carolina Litigation Tracking 
Spreadsheet with details of the same.

02/17/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from White and Case with an 
update on the status of the A.P. v. 
Our Lady of Lourdes Parish et al. 
case in New Jersey now that the case 
and parties are on the Consent Order 
Schedules.

0.10 44.50

02/17/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with New Jersey 
defense counsel regarding several 
filings in cases there and review of 
the same.

0.30 133.50

02/17/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to counsel for the Presbyterian 
Church in the New Jersey JMEMEC 
case regarding the BSA stay of 
litigation and applicability to their 
Answer and Cross-Claim with a 
request for withdraw of the same.

0.40 178.00

02/17/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to White and Case regarding 
the dismissal issue in the M.D. case 
in New Jersey and seek confirmation 
the matter is covered by the Sixth 
Notice and Consent Order 
Schedules.

0.20 89.00

02/17/22 SEM PHASE1 Follow-up email exchange with 
counsel for the Presbyterian Church 
in New Jersey regarding action in the 
JMEMEC case.

0.20 89.00

02/17/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for the 
Grove Park Baptist Church in North 
Carolina regarding the filing of the 
BSA stay of litigation and handling of 
the matter.

0.20 89.00

02/17/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with White and Case 
in follow-up regarding further action 
on the New Jersey Court Order 
entered in the M.D. case with 
dismissal.

0.20 89.00

02/17/22 MM PHASE1 Review and respond to email from 
Steve Epstein, attorney for NC 
Catholic entities, regarding status of 
notices in cases involving Catholic 
Church.

0.30 124.50
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02/17/22 AG PHASE1 Prepare notice of bankruptcy stay 

(Wood County, OH).
0.30 94.50

02/17/22 AS PHASE1 Continue entering newly received 
claims in Riskconnect.

3.70 906.50

02/17/22 MM PHASE1 Review and revise multiple Notices of 
Entry of Sixth Stipulation for various 
county cases.

7.80 1,911.00

02/17/22 CW PHASE1 Enter claims into RiskConnect 
database.

5.50 1,210.00

02/17/22 KAD PHASE1 Search for and identify claims not in 
Riskonnect and enter same.

8.30 1,577.00

02/17/22 KJM PHASE1 Compile NC complaints recently 
received.

1.50 225.00

02/18/22 BAG PHASE1 Exchange email with Adrian Azer 
regarding document production and 
attention to same.

0.20 128.00

02/18/22 SEM PHASE1 Review John ES Roe Complaint, add 
details to the New Jersey Litigation 
Tracking Spreadsheet and assign 
case to New Jersey defense counsel.

0.30 133.50

02/18/22 SEM PHASE1 Review list of cases received from the 
Greater New York Council to 
determine if same have been 
processed and added to the New 
York and New Jersey  Litigation 
Tracking Spreadsheets and assign 
those that are not to New York and 
New Jersey defense counsel.

0.80 356.00

02/18/22 SEM PHASE1 Telephone call from BSA requesting 
attendance at today's BSA 
bankruptcy hearing to assist in taking 
notes as to anticipated court rulings 
and deadlines.

0.10 44.50

02/18/22 SEM PHASE1 Attend BSA bankruptcy hearing to 
assist in taking notes as to 
anticipated court rulings and 
deadlines and other matters as 
requested by BSA.

2.80 1,246.00

02/18/22 SEM PHASE1 Prepare notes from BSA bankruptcy 
hearing and email same to the BSA 
per their request.

0.50 222.50
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02/18/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Longhouse Council in 

New York with BSA bankruptcy court 
pleadings received by the council.

0.10 44.50

02/18/22 SEM PHASE1 Telephone call with attorney for the 
Longhouse Council regarding abuse 
litigation pleadings, service of 
process and notifications of 
documents received by the council.

0.20 89.00

02/18/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Old North State 
Council regarding receipt of 
numerous inquires from chartered 
partners about service of process in 
BSA abuse cases and information 
and documents they can share 
regarding the same.

0.20 89.00

02/18/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with New Jersey 
defense counsel regarding the 
dismissal of the S.H. case against the 
Greater New York Councils and note 
same on the New Jersey Litigation 
Tracking Spreadsheet.

0.20 89.00

02/18/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for the 
Avondale Presbyterian Church in 
North Carolina regarding the status of 
the Sixth Notice filed in their case and 
forward request for status of the 
same to defense counsel.

0.20 89.00

02/18/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from North Carolina defense 
counsel with information related to 
the Sixth Notice filing in the Avondale 
Presbyterian Church case and 
forward same to the counsel for the 
Church with additional information 
regarding the next Amended Consent 
Order Schedules.

0.20 89.00

02/18/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for the 
South Tampa Fellowship Church to 
respond to several new inquiries for 
records, defense, and information.

0.20 89.00

02/18/22 SEM PHASE1 Review cases found filed in New York 
without service of process or attorney 
assignments, add same to the New 
York Litigation Tracking Spreadsheet 
and assign to defense counsel.

1.50 667.50

Case 20-10343-LSS    Doc 9505-2    Filed 03/28/22    Page 47 of 76



Page 47
03/08/22

Bill No. 90627368
047657.000013-BAG

Date Initials Stage Description Hours Amount
02/18/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting and revising Notice of Sixth 

Stipulation in matter of Brock, Gary.
0.20 69.00

02/18/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting and revising Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Does 1-41 
(Wayne County 21-CVS-2191).

0.20 69.00

02/18/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting and revising Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Gray.

0.20 69.00

02/18/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting and revising Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Does 1-2 
(Wayne County 21-CVS-2208).

0.20 69.00

02/18/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting and revising Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Bryan.

0.20 69.00

02/18/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting and revising Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Anthony.

0.20 69.00

02/18/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting and revising Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Black.

0.20 69.00

02/18/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting and revising Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Cox, Frank.

0.20 69.00

02/18/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting and revising Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Does 1-2 
(Lenoir County 21-CVS-1038).

0.20 69.00

02/18/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting and revising Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of  Evans, 
William.

0.20 69.00

02/18/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting and revising Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Asbell, Rick.

0.20 69.00

02/18/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting and revising Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Jones, Atlas.

0.20 69.00

02/18/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting and revising Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Deaton, 
Rodney.

0.20 69.00

02/18/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting and revising Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Franklin, 
Timothy.

0.20 69.00

02/18/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting and revising Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Gaston, 
Andre.

0.20 69.00

02/18/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting and revising Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Knight, 

0.20 69.00
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Douglas.

02/18/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting and revising Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Morrow, Larry.

0.20 69.00

02/18/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting and revising Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Sherrill, John.

0.20 69.00

02/18/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting and revising Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Doe (Lenoir 
County 21-CVS-1078).

0.20 69.00

02/18/22 JW PHASE1 Drafting and revising Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Does 1-5 
(Lenoir County 21-CVS-1083).

0.20 69.00

02/18/22 AS PHASE1 Continue entering newly received 
claims in Riskconnect.

2.90 710.50

02/18/22 CW PHASE1 Enter claims into RiskConnect 
database.

6.00 1,320.00

02/18/22 KAD PHASE1 Search for and identify claims not in 
Riskonnect and enter same.

8.50 1,615.00

02/18/22 KJM PHASE1 Continue compiling complaints 
recently received.

1.50 225.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Carson, 
Anthony.

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Draft Notice of Sixth Stipulation in 
matter of Clark, James.

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Draft Notice of Sixth Stipulation in 
matter of Roe, John (Lenoir County 
21-CVS-1044).

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Draft Notice of Sixth Stipulation in 
matter of Beasley, Kenneth.

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Roberson, 
Jerry.

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Delapp, 
Michael.

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Doe, John 
(Forsyth County 21-CVS-6281).

0.20 69.00
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02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 

Stipulation in matter of Spooner, 
Russell.

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Does 1-2 
(Forsyth County 21-CVS-6365).

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Boaz, 
Raymond.

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Does 1-34 
(Forsyth County 21-CVS-6362).

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Adams, Boyd.

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Dockins, 
James.

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Doe (Forsyth 
County 21-CVS-6373).

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Heitman.

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Bryant, 
Christopher.

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of King, Amar.

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Doe (Forsyth 
County 21-CVS-6412).

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Cheek, Kevin.

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Draft, Michael.

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Fair, Eric.

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Gwyn, Jose.

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 0.20 69.00
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Stipulation in matter of Honeycutt, 
William.

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Price, Dwight.

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Crawford, 
Dave.

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Myers, Jr., 
William F.

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of C.R. (Gaston 
County 21-CVS-5078).

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Pleis, 
Thomas.

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Hutchinson, 
Gerald.

0.20 69.00

02/20/22 JW PHASE1 Revise and finalize Notice of Sixth 
Stipulation in matter of Brinn, James.

0.20 69.00

02/21/22 SEM PHASE1 Review information about the Two 
Million Dollar settlement reached with 
Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones 
regarding their email violation related 
to the BSA Plan vote and send same 
to BSA.

0.20 89.00

02/21/22 SEM PHASE1 Review information regarding a Scout 
Leader in Illinois being arrested for 
sexting a Scout and provide said 
information to the BSA.

0.20 89.00

02/21/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for the 
First Presbyterian Church of 
Greensboro in North Carolina 
regarding confirmation of the BSA 
stay of litigation.

0.20 89.00

02/21/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Haynes and 
Boone regarding need to confer with 
White and Case, BSA and team 
regarding massive document 
production to the BSA Bankruptcy 

0.20 89.00
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Trust.

02/21/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Cape Fear Council 
advising of service of process in the 

 case.

0.10 44.50

02/21/22 SEM PHASE1 Revise North Carolina Litigation 
Tracking Spreadsheet to include 

 case and assign same 
to defense counsel.

0.20 89.00

02/21/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the Cape Fear 
Council and BSA regarding plaintiffs 
filing and serving Affidavits of Service 
in North Carolina case.

0.20 89.00

02/21/22 MM PHASE1 Telephone call with Jimmy Adams, 
attorney for NC State Baptist 
Convention, regarding plan for filing 
notices of stay and impact of same.

0.30 124.50

02/21/22 MM PHASE1 Review and respond to email from 
Henry Jones, counsel for Hayes 
Barton Methodist Church, regarding 
notice of stay filing and impact on 
deadline to answer.

0.30 124.50

02/21/22 MM PHASE1 Review and revise multiple Notices of 
Entry of Sixth Stipulation for various 
county cases.

5.90 1,445.50

02/21/22 CW PHASE1 Enter claims into RiskConnect 
database.

6.50 1,430.00

02/21/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchange with Jennifer Nichols 
regarding complaint filed by Charles 
Swanson.

0.10 19.00

02/21/22 KAD PHASE1 Search for and identify claims not in 
Riskonnect and enter same.

6.80 1,292.00

02/21/22 KJM PHASE1 Continue saving and compiling 
recently received complaints filed in 
NC.

2.20 330.00

02/22/22 BAG PHASE1 Prepare for/attend telephone 
conference with BSA Legal and 
Haynes Boone to discuss document 
collection project and requirements.

0.80 512.00

02/22/22 BAG PHASE1 Telephone conference with Adrian 
Azer regarding trial preparation.

0.20 128.00

REDACTED

REDACTED
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02/22/22 BGH PHASE1 Review Alex Gardella update to Gary 

Harden regarding stay.
0.10 56.50

02/22/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from BSA to Haynes and 
Boone regarding correspondence 
from the insurance carrier for the 
French Creek Council and review 
said correspondence.

0.20 89.00

02/22/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from counsel for the St. 
Andrews Presbyterian Church in 
Winston-Salem, North Carolina 
seeking a status update on the Sixth 
Notice filing in their lawsuit and 
forward same to North Carolina 
defense counsel.

0.20 89.00

02/22/22 SEM PHASE1 Further email exchange with Haynes 
and Boone regarding process for 
local councils to notify individual 
insurance carriers.

0.20 89.00

02/22/22 SEM PHASE1 Draft Audit Request Letter for Ozark 
Trails Council in Nebraska and email 
same to the council.

0.80 356.00

02/22/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from North Carolina defense 
counsel with status of Sixth Notice 
filing in the St. Andrews Presbyterian 
Church case and forward information 
about the same to counsel for the 
church.

0.20 89.00

02/22/22 SEM PHASE1 Review recently identified New York 
BSA abuse Complaints and confirm 
same are on the Litigation Tracking 
Spreadsheet, the Consent Order 
Schedules and have been assigned 
to defense counsel for the Sixth 
Notice filing.

1.00 445.00

02/22/22 SEM PHASE1 Conference with Haynes and Boone, 
White and Case, and BSA regarding 
required production of documents to 
the BSA Bankruptcy Trustee on or 
before the effective date of the 
affirmation order, logistics of the 
production, parameters and privilege 
of the same.

1.30 578.50

02/22/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Arizona defense counsel 
with Sixth Notice and proposed Order 

0.10 44.50
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in the John Doe PA 8 case.

02/22/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with upstate New 
York defense counsel regarding 
acceptance and billing for the recent 
John Doe case assigned to them.

0.20 89.00

02/22/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Crossroads of the 
West Council with several Minute 
Orders related to case status 
conference settings in Arizona abuse 
cases and briefly review the same.

0.20 89.00

02/22/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Occoneechee Council 
with several pleadings received 
today.

0.10 44.50

02/22/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Suffolk County 
Council requesting Ogletree to reach 
out to the chartered organization 
representative of St. Patrick’s Church 
and respond to the same.

0.30 133.50

02/22/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with New York 
defense counsel regarding a second 
case filing for plaintiff Jorge Fuentes 
and need to reach out to plaintiff's 
counsel about dismissing one.

0.20 89.00

02/22/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for the 
Avondale Presbyterian Church in 
North Carolina regarding status of the 
Sixth Notice filing for the Church.

0.20 89.00

02/22/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with BSA regarding 
information to provide chartered 
organizations with inquiries regarding 
news they may need to pay into the 
BSA bankruptcy settlement to get 
released.

0.20 89.00

02/22/22 SEM PHASE1 Review language from Supplemental 
Disclosure Regarding Plan 
Modifications and Summary of 
Chartered Organizations Options 
under the Debtors' Modified Chapter 
11 Plan of Reorganization, Opt-Out 
Election Procedures for Participating 
Chartered Organizations for providing 
same to inquiring chartered 
organizations.

0.20 89.00
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02/22/22 SEM PHASE1 Research OMNI BSA Bankruptcy 

Document database for the Modified 
plan pleadings and provide same to 
BSA.

0.30 133.50

02/22/22 SEM PHASE1 Continue reviewing recently identified 
New York BSA abuse Complaints, 
confirm same are on the Litigation 
Tracking Spreadsheet, have been 
added to the Consent Order 
Schedules and assigned to defense 
counsel.

1.90 845.50

02/22/22 MM PHASE1 Review status of NC cases involving 
Southern Baptist Convention and 
related entities.

0.10 41.50

02/22/22 MM PHASE1 Review and respond to email from 
Pam Keenan regarding status of 
notice filings on behalf of various 
chartered parties in NC represented 
by Ms. Keenan.

0.20 83.00

02/22/22 MM PHASE1 Prepare email to Jim Adams 
regarding same.

0.10 41.50

02/22/22 AG PHASE1 Email with Gary Harden and Ed 
Caldwell regarding the filing of the 
bankruptcy stay (Wood County, OH).

0.10 31.50

02/22/22 AS PHASE1 Continue entering newly received 
claims in Riskconnect.

9.00 2,205.00

02/22/22 MM PHASE1 Review and revise multiple Notices of 
Entry of Sixth Stipulation for various 
county cases.

7.30 1,788.50

02/22/22 CW PHASE1 Enter claims into RiskConnect 
database.

4.00 880.00

02/22/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchanges with Anna Kutz and 
Sean Manning regarding report of 
claims filed against the Ozark Trail 
Council.

0.20 38.00

02/22/22 KAD PHASE1 Analyze report of claims filed against 
the Ozark Trails council.

0.20 38.00

02/22/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchanges with Heidi Steppe 
regarding BSA internal file 
production.

0.20 38.00

02/22/22 KAD PHASE1 Search for and identify claims not in 6.40 1,216.00
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Riskonnect and enter same.

02/22/22 KJM PHASE1 Compile and manage recently 
incoming NC complaints in 
preparation for next amended 
schedule one filing.

2.50 375.00

02/22/22 KJM PHASE1 Send email with attachment to Mike 
Kenny at Wiggin & Dana regarding 
duplicate lawsuit filed in New York 
(J.Funtes).

0.10 15.00

02/22/22 KJM PHASE1 Search the NYSCEF for complaints 
against BSA that show no attorney on 
record and proof of service filed.

0.50 75.00

02/23/22 SEM PHASE1 Follow-up email exchange with 
chartered organization representative 
for St. Patrick's Church in Bay Shore, 
New York regarding BSA bankruptcy 
notifications.

0.20 89.00

02/23/22 SEM PHASE1 Review recently identified North 
Carolina BSA abuse Complaints, 
confirm same are on the Litigation 
Tracking Spreadsheet, have been 
added to the Consent Order 
Schedules and assigned to defense 
counsel.

1.20 534.00

02/23/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Jersey Shore 
Council and BSA regarding the court 
dismissing another lawsuit in New 
Jersey and the similarly related 
issues dealing with New Jersey 
courts.

0.30 133.50

02/23/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Old North State 
Council advising of a Motion for 
Extension of Time filed in a North 
Carolina BSA abuse case involving 
the YMCA.

0.10 44.50

02/23/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for the 
Avondale Presbyterian Church in 
North Carolina regarding 
correspondence with plaintiff's 
counsel about the BSA stay of 
litigation and forthcoming Sixth Notice 
filing.

0.20 89.00

02/23/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Mecklenburg County 0.10 44.50
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Council regarding service of process 
in two new cases.

02/23/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Washington, 
D.C. defense counsel regarding an 
update to the status report to the 
court in their cases.

0.20 89.00

02/23/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from New Jersey plaintiff's 
counsel seeking information about a 
few pending BSA lawsuits there.

0.10 44.50

02/23/22 SEM PHASE1 Telephone call to New Jersey 
plaintiffs counsel in response to his 
request for information related to BSA 
lawsuits filed there and follow-up 
email regarding the same.

0.30 133.50

02/23/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to counsel for the YMCA in 
North Carolina regarding the filing of 
a Motion for Extension of Time to File 
an Answer in the Yarborough case.

0.30 133.50

02/23/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with White and Case 
regarding their request for information 
about any lawsuits that name certain 
BSA related entities and affiliates.

0.20 89.00

02/23/22 SEM PHASE1 Research filed BSA lawsuit 
information to locate any cases 
naming certain BSA related entities 
and affiliates.

0.40 178.00

02/23/22 SEM PHASE1 Review Eric Frid case and add details 
to the North Carolina Litigation 
Tracking Spreadsheet and assign to 
defense counsel.

0.20 89.00

02/23/22 SEM PHASE1 Draft SERV answer in the Jane Doe2 
case.

3.80 1,691.00

02/23/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Illinois defense 
counsel regarding information to 
share with the court at the upcoming 
status conference.

0.20 89.00

02/23/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Counsel for 
Emerywood Baptist Church regarding 
the status of the filing of the Sixth 
Notice in their case in North Carolina.

0.20 89.00

02/23/22 MM PHASE1 Confer with Jefferson Whisenant and 
Michelle McCall regarding status of 

0.30 124.50
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notice filings and strategy and 
timeline for completing remaining 
notice filings.

02/23/22 MM PHASE1 Telephone call with Steve Williamson 
of Van Winkle law firm regarding 
notice filings on behalf of Black 
Mountain Home for Children and First 
Baptist Church Asheville and impact 
of same.

0.20 83.00

02/23/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and finalizing Notice of 
Sixth Stipulation in Whitaker matter.

0.20 69.00

02/23/22 AS PHASE1 Continue entering newly received 
claims in Riskconnect.

8.80 2,156.00

02/23/22 MM PHASE1 Review and revise multiple Notices of 
Entry of Sixth Stipulation for various 
county cases.

6.20 1,519.00

02/23/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchange with Jennifer Nichols 
regarding Charles Swanson lawsuit.

0.10 19.00

02/23/22 KAD PHASE1 Search for and identify claims not in 
Riskonnect and enter same.

7.50 1,425.00

02/23/22 KJM PHASE1 Compile NC complaints received and 
file in perpetration for next schedule 
one filing.

0.70 105.00

02/23/22 KJM PHASE1 Research NYSCEF for complaints 
with proof of service on file that have 
not been assigned to outside counsel 
and attention to same.

2.50 375.00

02/24/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for the 
National Council of Young Men’s 
Christian Associations of the United 
States of America in North Carolina 
regarding the entities covered by the 
BSA stay of litigation and cases 
naming individual defendants.

0.30 133.50

02/24/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Hawaii defense 
counsel regarding information to 
share with the court in a court 
ordered status report due March 1, 
2022.

0.20 89.00

02/24/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the counsel for 
the South Tampa Fellowship Church 
regarding additional matters involving 

0.20 89.00
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a potential defense for the Church 
and request for filed North Carolina 
Sixth Notice.

02/24/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Greater 
Alabama Council regarding second 
service of process in the R.L.S. case 
filed in North Carolina.

0.20 89.00

02/24/22 SEM PHASE1 Review information regarding the 
objection to the BSA Plan being filed 
by counsel for the Guam plaintiffs and 
forward same to the BSA.

0.20 89.00

02/24/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with North Carolina 
defense counsel and counsel for the 
United Way regarding a request for 
update on the BSA bankruptcy case 
and continued stay of litigation.

0.40 178.00

02/24/22 SEM PHASE1 Review additionally located New York 
lawsuits to determine if same have 
been  served, assigned, had the Sixth 
Notice filed, and added to the 
Consent Order Schedules.

3.00 1,335.00

02/24/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for New 
Jersey chartered partner church 
regarding an update on the 
bankruptcy court hearing and 
continued stay of litigation.

0.20 89.00

02/24/22 SEM PHASE1 Email discussion with White and 
Case regarding new cases received 
from the Diocese of Paterson in New 
Jersey and need to make sure same 
are added to this round of Consent 
Order Schedules.

0.30 133.50

02/24/22 MM PHASE1 Email correspondence with Bernhard 
Tisdale, attorney for NC YMCA 
entities, regarding application of stay 
to individually named defendants and 
experience with having plaintiff’s 
counsel agree to stay entire case 
based on bankruptcy court orders.

0.20 83.00

02/24/22 MM PHASE1 Review requests for status of notice 
filings by counsel for chartered 
partners and communications with 
Michelle McCall and Sean Manning 
regarding same.

0.30 124.50
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02/24/22 AS PHASE1 Continue entering newly received 

claims in Riskconnect.
4.20 1,029.00

02/24/22 MM PHASE1 Review and revise multiple Notices of 
Entry of Sixth Stipulation for various 
county cases.

7.20 1,764.00

02/24/22 CW PHASE1 Input claims into RiskConnect 
database.

4.50 990.00

02/24/22 KAD PHASE1 Search for and identify claims not in 
Riskonnect and enter same.

8.00 1,520.00

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Review information from the BSA 
bankruptcy hearing yesterday 
regarding the inability to agree on a 
Trustee and forward same to BSA.

0.20 89.00

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from counsel for the St. 
Andrews Presbyterian Church in 
North Carolina requesting a status 
report on the Sixth Notice filing and 
forward said request to defense 
counsel.

0.20 89.00

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from White and Case with 
Complaints related to Diocese of 
Paterson cases being added to the 
Amended Consent Order Schedules.

0.10 44.50

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Review Complaints related to 
Diocese of Paterson cases being 
added to the Amended Consent 
Order Schedules and confirm same 
are identified on the New Jersey 
Litigation Tracking Spreadsheet and 
have been assigned to defense 
counsel for the Sixth Notice filing.

0.50 222.50

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from North Carolina defense 
counsel with proof of filing of the Sixth 
Notice on behalf of the St. Andrews 
Presbyterian Church and forward 
same to counsel for the Church.

0.20 89.00

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the Central 
North Carolina Council regarding 
additional pleadings received in their 
cases and the handling of the same.

0.20 89.00

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Telephone call with chartered 
organization representative for the 

0.40 178.00
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South Raleigh Civitan Club regarding 
Sixth Notice filing for the Club, review 
Complaint and service of process 
information related to the lawsuit and 
email defense counsel regarding the 
same.

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email discussion with Iowa defense 
counsel regarding the Federal Court 
order for BSA bankruptcy case status 
report and information to provide in 
the same.

0.40 178.00

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Research BSA Bankruptcy Case 
Docket for an Order regarding the 
Omnibus Hearing being set for March 
16, 2022 and send same to Iowa 
defense counsel.

0.30 133.50

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Central North 
Carolina Council regarding obtaining 
status for all their pending lawsuits 
with the aid of North Carolina defense 
counsel.

0.20 89.00

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Three emails from Central North 
Carolina Council advising of service 
pf process in three new lawsuits.

0.30 133.50

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from North Carolina plaintiff's 
counsel with Complaints and 
Affidavits of Service for five new 
cases in North Carolina.

0.10 44.50

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from North Carolina defense 
counsel with Sixth Notice being filed 
for the South Raleigh Civitan Club 
and forward same to Club with 
explanation of filing process.

0.20 89.00

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with White and Case 
regarding a number of Pingry School 
cases and need to review same for 
Scouting Related connections, 
addition to the Consent Order 
Schedules, New Jersey Litigation 
Tracking Spreadsheet and 
assignment to defense counsel for 
filing the Sixth Notice.

0.20 89.00

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Old North State 
Council regarding service of process 

0.20 89.00
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in three new cases and procedure for 
giving notice of new lawsuits per the 
BSA direction.

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with New Jersey 
defense counsel regarding the court's 
request for BSA bankruptcy pleadings 
to confirm entity and chapter of 
bankruptcy.

0.20 89.00

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Emails to lawyers and chartered 
organization representative for the 
Carolina Pines Baptist Church in 
North Carolina advising of filing the 
Sixth Notice in their lawsuit.

0.20 89.00

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with council for the 
Central North Carolina Council 
regarding information related to the 
counsel for Mount Moriah Evangelical 
Lutheran Church.

0.20 89.00

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for 
Carolina Pines Baptist Church in 
follow-up regarding future notices 
related to their case.

0.20 89.00

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Multiple emails form North Carolina 
defense counsel to all North Carolina 
local councils with filed Sixth Notices 
in their cases.

0.20 89.00

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Revise North Carolina Litigation 
Tracking Spreadsheet with details 
from the William McCleary lawsuit 
assigned to defense counsel today.

0.20 89.00

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Tuscarora Council 
with an Affidavit of Service filed in the 
David Clapp case received by the 
council.

0.10 44.50

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Occoneechee Council 
advising of service of process in the 
James Spell case.

0.10 44.50

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Review five New Jersey Complaints 
received from plaintiff's counsel 
Parker Waichman to confirm same 
are accounted for on the New Jersey 
Litigation Tracking Spreadsheet, the 
Consent Order Schedules and 

0.50 222.50
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assigned to defense counsel for Sixth 
Notice filing.

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for 
Community Presbyterian Church in 
Chester, New Jersey regarding the 
recent bankruptcy plan changes and 
impact on them as a pre-1970 
chartered partner.

0.20 89.00

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Washington, D.C. defense 
counsel advising of the court's order 
for the next status conference in their 
cases.

0.10 44.50

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Old Hickory Council 
advising of service of process in the 
John Doe 2 case.

0.10 44.50

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Review chart of all cases filed against 
the Diocese of Paterson in New 
Jersey received from counsel for the 
Diocese, and compare to the 
Ogletree Litigation Tracking 
Spreadsheet to confirm all have been 
accounted for and assigned to 
defense counsel for Sixth Notice 
filings.

0.40 178.00

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with East Carolina 
Council regarding email of filed Sixth 
Notices received from North Carolina 
defense counsel and purpose of the 
same.

0.20 89.00

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with New Jersey 
defense counsel regarding a court 
order for hearing in the Jane Doe (JS) 
v. Cradle of Liberty and Evangelical 
Lutheran Church case regarding the 
plaintiff's Motion to Reconsider 
dismissal and to provide a current 
status update on the BSA bankruptcy 
case.

0.20 89.00

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to Ogletree I.T. Department to 
discuss required Ogletree document 
production to the BSA Bankruptcy 
Trustee and process for managing 
the same.

0.30 133.50

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with White and Case 0.20 89.00
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regarding analysis of certain Pingry 
School cases and determination of 
same being unrelated to Scouting.

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Extended discussion with White and 
Case and brief review of New Jersey 
plaintiff Complaints related to the 
Pingry School and whether the claims 
relate to previously filed BSA abuse 
claims such that the Sixth Notice 
should be filed in these cases.

0.40 178.00

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email discussion with Morris, Nichols, 
counsel for the ad hoc Committee of 
Councils and council for the Patriots' 
Path Council regarding the response 
to the Frank Schwindler matter in the 
bankruptcy court.

0.30 133.50

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Review Schwindler BSA response 
pleadings.

0.20 89.00

02/25/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to counsel for the Patriots' Path 
Council with contact information and 
details of the BSA response to the 
Schwindler matter.

0.10 44.50

02/25/22 MM PHASE1 Emails with Michelle McCall and 
Brian Beverly, attorney for chartered 
party, in Gamble v. Occoneechee 
Council case pending in Wake 
County, NC.

0.20 83.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of McCleary.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Ledbetter, 
Brian.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Allen, David.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Clapp, David.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Gregory, 
Jeffrey.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Parra, Brian.

0.20 69.00
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02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 

stipulation in matter of JH.
0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Williamson, 
William.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Bethea, 
Marcus.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Carver, 
Darrell.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Duhart, 
Robert.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Houck, 
Manuel.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Kay, Timothy.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Lockleyar-
Owens, Mark.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Mizelle, Scott.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Hodge, John.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Haynes, Brian.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Ingani, Jason.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Ingani, John.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Lyman, Paul.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Roe, John KB.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Talley, Guy.

0.20 69.00
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02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 

stipulation in matter of Arant, 
Douglas.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Morris, Jack.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Collins, Bobby.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Doe, John 
(Gaston County 21-CVS-5015).

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Green, Roger.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Roe, John MZ.

0.20 69.00

02/25/22 AS PHASE1 Continue entering newly received 
claims in Riskconnect.

9.10 2,229.50

02/25/22 MM PHASE1 Review and revise multiple Notices of 
Entry of Sixth Stipulation for various 
county cases.

8.00 1,960.00

02/25/22 CW PHASE1 Enter claims into RiskConnect. 6.00 1,320.00

02/25/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchanges with Guy Cook, 
Abigail Akers and Sean Manning 
regarding the status of the bankruptcy 
case.

0.20 38.00

02/25/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchange with Kris Terry 
regarding McGarty claim.

0.10 19.00

02/25/22 KAD PHASE1 Search for and identify claims not in 
Riskonnect and enter same.

7.30 1,387.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Byrd, Chris.

0.20 69.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Does 1-10, 
John (Guilford County 21-CVS-
10064).

0.20 69.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Goodrich, 
Paul.

0.20 69.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Smith, 

0.20 69.00
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Bradley.

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Spaller, 
Robert.

0.20 69.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Montjoy, 
Darryl.

0.20 69.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Myers, Virgil.

0.20 69.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Oakley II, 
James.

0.20 69.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Ramsey, 
Travis.

0.20 69.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Siebrandt, 
Jonathan.

0.20 69.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Stutts, Robert.

0.20 69.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Underwood, 
Matt.

0.20 69.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Waldroup, 
Ronnie.

0.20 69.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Wolford, 
Raymond.

0.20 69.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Yarborough, 
Jason.

0.20 69.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of White, Robert.

0.20 69.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Katz, Michael.

0.20 69.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Moore, 
Jonathan.

0.20 69.00
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Date Initials Stage Description Hours Amount
02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 

stipulation in matter of Brault, BA.
0.20 69.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Cotter, 
Joseph.

0.20 69.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Elmore, 
Bobby.

0.20 69.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of KW.

0.20 69.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Mack, Joseph.

0.20 69.00

02/27/22 JW PHASE1 Reviewing and revising notice of sixth 
stipulation in matter of Mitchell, 
Timothy.

0.20 69.00

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Telephone call with New Jersey 
defense counsel regarding contact by 
counsel for the Patriots' Path Council 
regarding the response to the Frank 
Schwindler Subpoena matter in the 
bankruptcy case.

0.10 44.50

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Extended email discussion with 
Morris, Nichols regarding the Motion 
to Modify Stay filed by the plaintiff in 
the Brian E. Killion v. Jersey Shore 
Council case and need for additional 
information regarding the underlying 
matter.

0.40 178.00

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Review bankruptcy response 
pleadings drafted by Morris, Nichols 
related to the Brian E. Killion v. 
Jersey Shore Council Motion to Lift 
Stay matter.

0.20 89.00

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Research OMNI Proof of Claim 
database for Brian Killion and send 
same to Morris Nichols with additional 
state court pleadings and dismissal.

0.30 133.50

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for the 
Mecklenburg County Council and 
North Carolina defense counsel 
regarding an error on the Sixth Notice 
in the Keyonce Glenn case and 

0.30 133.50
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Date Initials Stage Description Hours Amount
correcting the same.

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Grand Canyon 
Council with several Arizona state 
court filings for review and comment.

0.10 44.50

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Review information from Friday's 
objection to the BSA revised Plan by 
the U.S. Trustee and provide same to 
the BSA.

0.20 89.00

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Review pleadings received from the 
Grand Canyon Council in Arizona and 
advise counsel on the same.

0.20 89.00

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Review information from Ogletree I.T. 
department related to prior BSA 
bankruptcy discovery productions in 
preparation for upcoming production 
to the U.S. Trustee.

0.20 89.00

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Review Pingry School Complaints 
received from White and Case and 
confirm same are on the New Jersey 
Litigation Tracking Spreadsheet and 
assigned to local defense counsel.

0.40 178.00

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to White and Case regarding 
the New Jersey filing procedures for 
the Pingry School cases and request 
for additional Complaints where the 
stay is required.

0.10 44.50

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with counsel for the 
First Baptist Church in Clinton, North 
Carolina regarding receipt of their 
cases and review the North Carolina 
Litigation Tracking Spreadsheet for 
the same.

0.20 89.00

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Review with BSA and Ogletree Team 
regarding BSA internal file file and 
Ogletree case file productions to the 
U.S. Trustee in the BSA Bankruptcy 
case.

0.30 133.50

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from the Piedmont Council with 
update request on the status of their 
pending lawsuits.

0.10 44.50

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Telephone call to counsel for Grave 
Memorial Presbyterian Church in 

0.10 44.50
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Date Initials Stage Description Hours Amount
North Carolina regarding the BSA 
Stay of Litigation coverage of the 
church.

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Follow-up email to counsel for the 
Grave Memorial Presbyterian Church 
regarding the current status of the 
BSA bankruptcy stay and projected 
case disposition.

0.20 89.00

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Daniel Boone Council with 
Motion for Extension of Time to 
Answer field for the North Carolina 
Conference, Southeastern 
Jurisdiction of the United Methodist 
Church and ensure the case has 
been assigned for Sixth Notice filing.

0.20 89.00

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Email to counsel for the North 
Carolina Conference, Southeastern 
Jurisdiction of the United Methodist 
Church regarding their Motion for 
Extension to Answer in the James 
Clark case and the BSA stay of 
litigation.

0.30 133.50

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with the Old North 
State Council regarding the Travis 
Ramsey case and need to provide 
information to the counsel for the 
Prospect United Methodist Church 
regarding the BSA stay of litigation 
and check the North Carolina 
Litigation Tracking Spreadsheet.

0.20 89.00

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Morris Nichols 
regarding revisions to the BSA 
Response in the Brian Killion case 
and review same.

0.20 89.00

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with Morris Nichols 
regarding revisions to the BSA 
Response in the Frank Schwindler 
case and review same.

0.20 89.00

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Review new cases served on North 
Carolina councils, add details from 
the same to the North Carolina 
Litigation Tracking Spreadsheet and 
assign same to defense counsel.

1.00 445.00

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with New York 0.20 89.00
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defense counsel regarding a 
chartered organization wit questions 
about the BSA bankruptcy opt out 
deadline.

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Review additional Pingry Complaints 
received from White and Case, 
ensure same are identified on the 
Consent Order Schedules, add 
details of the same to the New Jersey 
Litigation Tracking Spreadsheet and 
assign to defense counsel.

0.60 267.00

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Review Complaints received from 
New York plaintiff's counsel and 
confirm same are identified on the 
New York Litigation Tracking 
Spreadsheet, the Consent Order 
Schedules, and assigned to defense 
counsel for Sixth Notice filing.

0.50 222.50

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Review list of Complaints to confirm 
same have been assigned to New 
York defense counsel, are identified 
on the Consent Order Schedules and 
have sixth Notices filed.

0.50 222.50

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Email from Tuscarora Council 
advising of service of process in the 
Doug Inscoe case.

0.10 44.50

02/28/22 SEM PHASE1 Email exchange with White and Case 
regarding Learning for Life entities 
covered by the Old Republic 
Insurance policies.

0.20 89.00

02/28/22 MM PHASE1 Review stipulation between plaintiffs 
and chartered parties regarding 
answer deadline to determine impact 
on case and email to Michelle McCall 
and Sean Manning regarding same.

0.20 83.00

02/28/22 MM PHASE1 Telephone with Bruce Stanley, 
president of Methodist Home for 
Children, regarding impact of notice 
filing and next steps for chartered 
parties.

0.30 124.50

02/28/22 JM PHASE1 Plan and prepare for supplemental 
production of responsive Ogletree 
documents to bankruptcy trustee.

0.70 196.00
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02/28/22 AS PHASE1 Continue entering newly received 

claims in Riskconnect.
7.90 1,935.50

02/28/22 MM PHASE1 Review and revise multiple Notices of 
Entry of Sixth Stipulation for various 
county cases.

4.50 1,102.50

02/28/22 CW PHASE1 Input claims into RiskConnect 
database.

4.50 990.00

02/28/22 KAD PHASE1 Conference call with Heidi Steppe 
and Jennifer Nichols regarding BSA 
internal file production.

0.40 76.00

02/28/22 KAD PHASE1 Email exchange with Heidi Steppe 
regarding BSA internal file 
production.

0.20 38.00

02/28/22 KAD PHASE1 Analyze and manipulate report from 
BSA of all internal files to produce in 
preparation of sending same to Epic.

1.20 228.00

02/28/22 KAD PHASE1 Search for and identify claims not in 
Riskonnect and enter same.

6.80 1,292.00

02/28/22 KJM PHASE1 Analyze spreadsheet to confirm 
number of complaints at the time of 
Bankruptcy filing per S. Manning 
request.

0.50 75.00

Total Services: 654.70 186,749.50

Timekeeper Summary
Timekeeper Title Rate Hours Amount
Bruce A. Griggs Shareholder 640.00 16.30 10,432.00
Bruce G. Hearey Shareholder 565.00 1.60 904.00
Michael McKnight Shareholder 415.00 10.30 4,274.50
Alexandria Gardella Associate 315.00 0.60 189.00
Jefferson P. Whisenant Associate 345.00 27.80 9,591.00
Sean E. Manning Of Counsel 445.00 142.10 63,234.50
Kelci A. Davis Paralegal 190.00 153.70 29,203.00
Cynthia Williamson Paralegal 220.00 74.80 16,456.00
Michelle McCall Paralegal 245.00 106.20 26,019.00
April Steffen Paralegal 245.00 85.90 21,045.50
Jonathon Metcalfe Litigation Support Case 

Manager
280.00 0.70 196.00

Katie J. Murray Other 150.00 34.70 5,205.00

Expenses
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Description Amount
Copies 18.00 @ 0.10 ea. 1.80
Express Delivery/Postage 94.00 @ 16.76 ea. 1,575.69
Postage 1.00 @ 10.10 ea. 10.10
Electronic Discovery Management Services provided by Managed Services Vendor. 
Processing, Hosting, Review, or Production of Client's electronic records forJanuary 
2022.

5,275.09

VENDOR: Epiq eDiscovery Solutions, Inc.- AZ INVOICE#: 90611582 DATE: 2/8/2022
Epiq eDiscovery Solutions, Inc.- AZ - E-discovery user fees - on 01/01/22

243.56

VENDOR: U. S. Bank INVOICE#: 4993390102151508 DATE: 2/15/2022
Linda Garramone - Filing Fees - Filing fee for filing Notice of Appearance in Wood 
County on 02/10/22

28.00

Total Expenses 7,134.24

TOTAL FEES $186,749.50
TOTAL EXPENSES $7,134.24

TOTAL THIS BILL $193,883.74
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DO NOT SUBMIT TO CLIENT
UNLESS EXPRESSLY

REQUESTED BY CLIENT

March 8, 2022

OGLETREE, DEAKINS, NASH,
SMOAK & STEWART, P.C.

Attorneys at Law
Administrative Office
50 International Drive
Patewood IV, Suite 200
Greenville, SC  29615
Telephone:  (864) 241-1801
Facsimile:    (864) 241-1908
www.ogletreedeakins.com 

Atlanta ▪ Austin ▪ Berlin (Germany) ▪ Birmingham ▪ Boston ▪ Charleston ▪ Charlotte ▪ Chicago ▪ Cleveland ▪ Columbia ▪ Dallas ▪ Denver ▪ Detroit Metro ▪ Greenville ▪ Houston
Indianapolis ▪ Jackson ▪ Kansas City ▪ Las Vegas ▪ London (England) ▪ Los Angeles ▪ Memphis ▪ Mexico City (Mexico) ▪ Miami ▪ Milwaukee ▪ Minneapolis ▪ Montréal (Canada) ▪ Morristown
Nashville ▪ New Orleans ▪ New York City ▪ Oklahoma City ▪ Orange County ▪ Paris (France) ▪ Philadelphia ▪ Phoenix ▪ Pittsburgh ▪ Portland, ME ▪ Portland, OR ▪ Raleigh
Richmond ▪ St. Louis ▪ St. Thomas ▪ Sacramento ▪ San Antonio ▪ San Diego ▪ San Francisco ▪ Seattle ▪ Stamford ▪ Tampa ▪ Toronto (Canada) ▪ Torrance ▪ Tucson ▪ Washington

Elizabeth Ramirez-Washka
Boy Scouts of America, The - DIP
1325 West Walnut Hill Lane
P.O. Box 152079
Irving, TX  75015-2079

PERSONAL AND CONFIDENTIAL
Bill #  90627371
Client.Matter #  083331.000000
RISKONNECT

Re: Boy Scouts of America, The - General Advice

For professional services rendered through February 28, 2022, in connection with the above-referenced 
matter as outlined on the attached detailed billing sheets:

Fees .................................................................................................................................................$1,177.00
Expenses.................................................................................................................................................$0.00

Total Due This Bill..........................................................................................................................$1,177.00

Fees Expenses
Year-To-Date $17,001.50 $0.00
Life-To-Date $317,083.50 $55.70
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Elizabeth Ramirez-Washka 
Boy Scouts of America, The - DIP
1325 West Walnut Hill Lane
P.O. Box 152079
Irving, TX  75015-2079

Re: Boy Scouts of America, The - General Advice

For professional services rendered through February 28, 2022

Date Initials Stage Description Hours Amount
02/08/22 RWC PHASE1 Multiple emails from and to Elizabeth 

Washka regarding independent 
contractor agreement.

0.20 130.00

02/08/22 RWC PHASE1 Prepare independent contractor 
agreement.

0.70 455.00

02/14/22 GSM PHASE1 Draft monthly status chart with 
updates on all pending matters.

0.50 220.00

02/15/22 GSM PHASE1 Exchange multiple emails with 
Elizabeth Washka regarding strategy 
pertaining to following up with the 
EEOC regarding old pending 
charges.

0.40 176.00

02/17/22 SFP PHASE1 Analyze e-mail from Bill Davis 
regarding seasonal amusement and 
recreational establishment analysis 
during the pandemic, pull resource 
materials, and draft and send 
response to Mr. Davis and Elizabeth 
Washka forwarding resource 
materials and discussing same.

0.40 196.00

Total Services: 2.20 1,177.00

Timekeeper Summary
Timekeeper Title Rate Hours Amount
Gavin S. Martinson Shareholder 440.00 0.90 396.00
Ron Chapman, Jr. Shareholder 650.00 0.90 585.00
Steven F. Pockrass Shareholder 490.00 0.40 196.00
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TOTAL FEES $1,177.00
TOTAL EXPENSES $0.00

TOTAL THIS BILL $1,177.00
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FILE COPY ONLY – BILL
SUBMITTED ELECTRONICALLY

DO NOT SUBMIT TO CLIENT
UNLESS EXPRESSLY

REQUESTED BY CLIENT

March 8, 2022

OGLETREE, DEAKINS, NASH,
SMOAK & STEWART, P.C.

Attorneys at Law
Administrative Office
50 International Drive
Patewood IV, Suite 200
Greenville, SC  29615
Telephone:  (864) 241-1801
Facsimile:    (864) 241-1908
www.ogletreedeakins.com 

Atlanta ▪ Austin ▪ Berlin (Germany) ▪ Birmingham ▪ Boston ▪ Charleston ▪ Charlotte ▪ Chicago ▪ Cleveland ▪ Columbia ▪ Dallas ▪ Denver ▪ Detroit Metro ▪ Greenville ▪ Houston
Indianapolis ▪ Jackson ▪ Kansas City ▪ Las Vegas ▪ London (England) ▪ Los Angeles ▪ Memphis ▪ Mexico City (Mexico) ▪ Miami ▪ Milwaukee ▪ Minneapolis ▪ Montréal (Canada) ▪ Morristown
Nashville ▪ New Orleans ▪ New York City ▪ Oklahoma City ▪ Orange County ▪ Paris (France) ▪ Philadelphia ▪ Phoenix ▪ Pittsburgh ▪ Portland, ME ▪ Portland, OR ▪ Raleigh
Richmond ▪ St. Louis ▪ St. Thomas ▪ Sacramento ▪ San Antonio ▪ San Diego ▪ San Francisco ▪ Seattle ▪ Stamford ▪ Tampa ▪ Toronto (Canada) ▪ Torrance ▪ Tucson ▪ Washington

Robyn Jungers
The Boy Scouts of America 
Legal Department
1325 West Walnut Hill Lane
P.O. Box 152079
Irving, TX  75015-2049

PERSONAL AND CONFIDENTIAL
Bill #  90627370
Client.Matter #  047657.000013

Re: BSA General Defense - Bankruptcy (Billiable)

For professional services rendered through February 28, 2022, in connection with the above-referenced 
matter as outlined on the attached detailed billing sheets:

Fees .................................................................................................................................................$2,844.00
Expenses.................................................................................................................................................$0.00

Total Due This Bill..........................................................................................................................$2,844.00

Fees Expenses
Year-To-Date $(320,453.00) $1,741.00
Life-To-Date $3,206,164.50 $35,992.82
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Robyn Jungers 
The Boy Scouts of America 
Legal Department
1325 West Walnut Hill Lane
P.O. Box 152079
Irving, TX  75015-2049

Re: BSA General Defense - Bankruptcy (Billiable)

For professional services rendered through February 28, 2022

Date Initials Stage Description Hours Amount
02/03/22 BAG PHASE2 Review and respond to email from 

Tori Remington regarding fee issues.
0.20 128.00

02/04/22 KJM PHASE2 Work on OD's 22nd monthly fee 
application, exhibits and materials.

1.00 150.00

02/05/22 KJM PHASE2 Work on OD's 22nd monthly fee 
application, exhibits and materials.

1.50 225.00

02/05/22 KJM PHASE2 Redact monthly fee statements in 
connection with OD's 22nd monthly 
fee app.

0.50 75.00

02/07/22 BAG PHASE2 Work on/complete 7th interim fee 
application.

0.50 320.00

02/07/22 KJM PHASE2 Email to Bruce Griggs regarding OD's 
22nd monthly fee application.

0.10 15.00

02/07/22 KJM PHASE2 Send email with attachment to Paige 
Topper and Tori Remington at Morris 
Nichols regarding OD's seventh 
interim application.

0.10 15.00

02/09/22 KJM PHASE2 Analyze seventh interim fee 
application calculations to confirm 
compensation requested across 
multiple charts within the application 
and respond to Tori Remington at 
Morris Nichols regarding same.

1.00 150.00

02/09/22 KJM PHASE2 Review email from received from Tori 
Remington at Morris Nichols 
regarding seventh interim application 
concerns regarding compensation 
requested on various charts.

0.10 15.00

02/10/22 BAG PHASE2 Review/complete 22nd monthly fee 1.00 640.00
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Date Initials Stage Description Hours Amount
application including review of all 
redacted invoices.

02/10/22 KJM PHASE2 Send email with attachment to Tori 
Remington and Paige Topper at 
Morris Nichols regarding OD's 22nd 
monthly fee application.

0.10 15.00

02/10/22 KJM PHASE2 Review email received from B.Griggs 
regarding 22nd monthly fee 
application and attention to same.

0.10 15.00

02/10/22 KJM PHASE2 Send email with attachment to Paige 
Topper and Tori Remington at Morris 
Nichols regarding 22nd monthly fee 
application.

0.10 15.00

02/14/22 KJM PHASE2 Teleconference with Tori Remington 
and Paige Topper regarding seventh 
interim application.

0.30 45.00

02/14/22 KJM PHASE2 Email with draft attachment to T. 
Remington at Morris Nichols 
regarding seventh interim application.

0.10 15.00

02/14/22 KJM PHASE2 Review and respond to email from 
Tori Remington regarding filing of 
seventh interim application.

0.10 15.00

02/16/22 KJM PHASE2 Prepare 23rd monthly fee application 
materials and exhibits.

1.50 225.00

02/16/22 KJM PHASE2 Email to B. Griggs regarding attorney 
rates in connection with monthly fee 
application.

0.10 15.00

02/16/22 KJM PHASE2 Revise 22nd monthly application to 
reflect previously approved fee and 
expenses.

0.10 15.00

02/16/22 KJM PHASE2 Email exchange with T. Remington 
regarding 22nd monthly fee app 
revisions.

0.10 15.00

02/16/22 KJM PHASE2 Continue to edit 23rd monthly fee 
application materials and exhibits.

0.30 45.00

02/16/22 KJM PHASE2 Review and redact fee statements in 
connection with OD 23rd monthly fee 
application.

0.50 75.00

02/16/22 KJM PHASE2 Send email with attachment to B. 
Griggs regarding 23rd monthly fee 

0.10 15.00
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Date Initials Stage Description Hours Amount
application.

02/21/22 BAG PHASE2 Review revised 23rd fee application 
received from Tori Remington at 
Morris, Nichols and attention to same.

0.30 192.00

02/21/22 KJM PHASE2 Review email attachment regarding 
23rd fee application from T. 
Remington and respond regarding 
same.

0.20 30.00

02/22/22 KJM PHASE2 Search Omni court docket for file 
stamped 23rd monthly application.

0.10 15.00

02/28/22 BAG PHASE2 Review email exchange with Tori 
Remington regarding 8th Interim Fee 
Application.

0.10 64.00

02/28/22 KJM PHASE2 Begin work on eighth interim 
application, exhibits and materials.

0.80 120.00

02/28/22 KJM PHASE2 Begin work on eighth interim 
application, exhibits and materials.

1.00 150.00

02/28/22 KJM PHASE2 Send email communication to Tori 
Remington at Morris Nichols with 
question concerning reduced CNO 
amounts in connection with the eighth 
interim application.

0.10 15.00

Total Services: 12.10 2,844.00

Timekeeper Summary
Timekeeper Title Rate Hours Amount
Bruce A. Griggs Shareholder 640.00 2.10 1,344.00
Katie J. Murray Other 150.00 10.00 1,500.00

TOTAL FEES $2,844.00
TOTAL EXPENSES $0.00

TOTAL THIS BILL $2,844.00
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Submit Via E-Mail Only –
Do Not Send Hard Copy

March 4, 2022

OGLETREE, DEAKINS, NASH,
SMOAK & STEWART, P.C.

Attorneys at Law
Administrative Office
50 International Drive
Patewood IV, Suite 200
Greenville, SC  29615
Telephone:  (864) 241-1801
Facsimile:    (864) 241-1908
www.ogletreedeakins.com 

Atlanta ▪ Austin ▪ Berlin (Germany) ▪ Birmingham ▪ Boston ▪ Charleston ▪ Charlotte ▪ Chicago ▪ Cleveland ▪ Columbia ▪ Dallas ▪ Denver ▪ Detroit Metro ▪ Greenville ▪ Houston
Indianapolis ▪ Jackson ▪ Kansas City ▪ Las Vegas ▪ London (England) ▪ Los Angeles ▪ Memphis ▪ Mexico City (Mexico) ▪ Miami ▪ Milwaukee ▪ Minneapolis ▪ Montréal (Canada) ▪ Morristown
Nashville ▪ New Orleans ▪ New York City ▪ Oklahoma City ▪ Orange County ▪ Paris (France) ▪ Philadelphia ▪ Phoenix ▪ Pittsburgh ▪ Portland, ME ▪ Portland, OR ▪ Raleigh
Richmond ▪ St. Louis ▪ St. Thomas ▪ Sacramento ▪ San Antonio ▪ San Diego ▪ San Francisco ▪ Seattle ▪ Stamford ▪ Tampa ▪ Toronto (Canada) ▪ Torrance ▪ Tucson ▪ Washington

Kenneth Ceaser
Boy Scouts of America, The - DIP
1325 West Walnut Hill Lane
P.O. Box 152079
Irving, TX  75015-2079
Kenneth.Ceaser@scouting.org

PERSONAL AND CONFIDENTIAL
Bill #  90625653
Client.Matter #  083331.000028

Re: CRUZ VAZQUEZ, Koh Kulkan Daniel

For professional services rendered through February 28, 2022, in connection with the above-referenced 
matter as outlined on the attached detailed billing sheets:

Flat Rate Legal Fee.............................................................................................................................$500.00
Associated Expenses ..............................................................................................................................$0.00

Total Due This Bill.............................................................................................................................$500.00
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Kenneth Ceaser 
Boy Scouts of America, The - DIP
1325 West Walnut Hill Lane
P.O. Box 152079
Irving, TX  75015-2079
Kenneth.Ceaser@scouting.org

Re: CRUZ VAZQUEZ, Koh Kulkan Daniel

For professional services rendered through February 28, 2022

02/23/22 Prepare Premium Processing for Nonimmigrant Petition 500.00
Total Fees $500.00

TOTAL FEES $500.00
TOTAL EXPENSES $0.00

TOTAL THIS BILL $500.00
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Submit Via E-Mail Only –
Do Not Send Hard Copy

March 4, 2022

OGLETREE, DEAKINS, NASH,
SMOAK & STEWART, P.C.

Attorneys at Law
Administrative Office
50 International Drive
Patewood IV, Suite 200
Greenville, SC  29615
Telephone:  (864) 241-1801
Facsimile:    (864) 241-1908
www.ogletreedeakins.com 

Atlanta ▪ Austin ▪ Berlin (Germany) ▪ Birmingham ▪ Boston ▪ Charleston ▪ Charlotte ▪ Chicago ▪ Cleveland ▪ Columbia ▪ Dallas ▪ Denver ▪ Detroit Metro ▪ Greenville ▪ Houston
Indianapolis ▪ Jackson ▪ Kansas City ▪ Las Vegas ▪ London (England) ▪ Los Angeles ▪ Memphis ▪ Mexico City (Mexico) ▪ Miami ▪ Milwaukee ▪ Minneapolis ▪ Montréal (Canada) ▪ Morristown
Nashville ▪ New Orleans ▪ New York City ▪ Oklahoma City ▪ Orange County ▪ Paris (France) ▪ Philadelphia ▪ Phoenix ▪ Pittsburgh ▪ Portland, ME ▪ Portland, OR ▪ Raleigh
Richmond ▪ St. Louis ▪ St. Thomas ▪ Sacramento ▪ San Antonio ▪ San Diego ▪ San Francisco ▪ Seattle ▪ Stamford ▪ Tampa ▪ Toronto (Canada) ▪ Torrance ▪ Tucson ▪ Washington

Kenneth Ceaser
Boy Scouts of America, The - DIP
1325 West Walnut Hill Lane
P.O. Box 152079
Irving, TX  75015-2079
Kenneth.Ceaser@scouting.org

PERSONAL AND CONFIDENTIAL
Bill #  90625651
Client.Matter #  083331.000025

Re: SAYAPANENI, Bhavya

For professional services rendered through February 28, 2022, in connection with the above-referenced 
matter as outlined on the attached detailed billing sheets:

Flat Rate Legal Fee..........................................................................................................................$1,850.00
Associated Expenses ..............................................................................................................................$0.00

Total Due This Bill..........................................................................................................................$1,850.00

Case 20-10343-LSS    Doc 9505-4    Filed 03/28/22    Page 4 of 7



Page 2
03/04/22

Bill No. 90625651
083331.000025-LNG

Kenneth Ceaser 
Boy Scouts of America, The - DIP
1325 West Walnut Hill Lane
P.O. Box 152079
Irving, TX  75015-2079
Kenneth.Ceaser@scouting.org

Re: SAYAPANENI, Bhavya

For professional services rendered through February 28, 2022

02/28/22 Prepare H-1B Extension Petition 1,850.00
Total Fees $1,850.00

TOTAL FEES $1,850.00
TOTAL EXPENSES $0.00

TOTAL THIS BILL $1,850.00

Case 20-10343-LSS    Doc 9505-4    Filed 03/28/22    Page 5 of 7



Submit Via E-Mail Only –
Do Not Send Hard Copy

March 4, 2022

OGLETREE, DEAKINS, NASH,
SMOAK & STEWART, P.C.

Attorneys at Law
Administrative Office
50 International Drive
Patewood IV, Suite 200
Greenville, SC  29615
Telephone:  (864) 241-1801
Facsimile:    (864) 241-1908
www.ogletreedeakins.com 

Atlanta ▪ Austin ▪ Berlin (Germany) ▪ Birmingham ▪ Boston ▪ Charleston ▪ Charlotte ▪ Chicago ▪ Cleveland ▪ Columbia ▪ Dallas ▪ Denver ▪ Detroit Metro ▪ Greenville ▪ Houston
Indianapolis ▪ Jackson ▪ Kansas City ▪ Las Vegas ▪ London (England) ▪ Los Angeles ▪ Memphis ▪ Mexico City (Mexico) ▪ Miami ▪ Milwaukee ▪ Minneapolis ▪ Montréal (Canada) ▪ Morristown
Nashville ▪ New Orleans ▪ New York City ▪ Oklahoma City ▪ Orange County ▪ Paris (France) ▪ Philadelphia ▪ Phoenix ▪ Pittsburgh ▪ Portland, ME ▪ Portland, OR ▪ Raleigh
Richmond ▪ St. Louis ▪ St. Thomas ▪ Sacramento ▪ San Antonio ▪ San Diego ▪ San Francisco ▪ Seattle ▪ Stamford ▪ Tampa ▪ Toronto (Canada) ▪ Torrance ▪ Tucson ▪ Washington

Kenneth Ceaser
Boy Scouts of America, The - DIP
1325 West Walnut Hill Lane
P.O. Box 152079
Irving, TX  75015-2079
Kenneth.Ceaser@scouting.org

PERSONAL AND CONFIDENTIAL
Bill #  90625652
Client.Matter #  083331.000026

Re: KOTHAPALLI, Arun Kumar

For professional services rendered through February 28, 2022, in connection with the above-referenced 
matter as outlined on the attached detailed billing sheets:

Flat Rate Legal Fee.................................................................................................................................$0.00
Associated Expenses ............................................................................................................................$16.54

Total Due This Bill...............................................................................................................................$16.54

Case 20-10343-LSS    Doc 9505-4    Filed 03/28/22    Page 6 of 7
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Bill No. 90625652
083331.000026-LNG

Kenneth Ceaser 
Boy Scouts of America, The - DIP
1325 West Walnut Hill Lane
P.O. Box 152079
Irving, TX  75015-2079
Kenneth.Ceaser@scouting.org

Re: KOTHAPALLI, Arun Kumar

For professional services rendered through February 28, 2022

Expenses
Description Amount
Express Delivery/Postage 1.00 @ 16.54 ea. 16.54

Total Expenses 16.54

TOTAL FEES $0.00
TOTAL EXPENSES $16.54

TOTAL THIS BILL $16.54
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Exhibit D 
 

Phase 4 Fees: Non-Working Travel 
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FILE COPY ONLY – BILL
SUBMITTED ELECTRONICALLY

DO NOT SUBMIT TO CLIENT
UNLESS EXPRESSLY

REQUESTED BY CLIENT

March 8, 2022

OGLETREE, DEAKINS, NASH,
SMOAK & STEWART, P.C.

Attorneys at Law
Administrative Office
50 International Drive
Patewood IV, Suite 200
Greenville, SC  29615
Telephone:  (864) 241-1801
Facsimile:    (864) 241-1908
www.ogletreedeakins.com 

Atlanta ▪ Austin ▪ Berlin (Germany) ▪ Birmingham ▪ Boston ▪ Charleston ▪ Charlotte ▪ Chicago ▪ Cleveland ▪ Columbia ▪ Dallas ▪ Denver ▪ Detroit Metro ▪ Greenville ▪ Houston
Indianapolis ▪ Jackson ▪ Kansas City ▪ Las Vegas ▪ London (England) ▪ Los Angeles ▪ Memphis ▪ Mexico City (Mexico) ▪ Miami ▪ Milwaukee ▪ Minneapolis ▪ Montréal (Canada) ▪ Morristown
Nashville ▪ New Orleans ▪ New York City ▪ Oklahoma City ▪ Orange County ▪ Paris (France) ▪ Philadelphia ▪ Phoenix ▪ Pittsburgh ▪ Portland, ME ▪ Portland, OR ▪ Raleigh
Richmond ▪ St. Louis ▪ St. Thomas ▪ Sacramento ▪ San Antonio ▪ San Diego ▪ San Francisco ▪ Seattle ▪ Stamford ▪ Tampa ▪ Toronto (Canada) ▪ Torrance ▪ Tucson ▪ Washington

Robyn Jungers
The Boy Scouts of America 
Legal Department
1325 West Walnut Hill Lane
P.O. Box 152079
Irving, TX  75015-2049

PERSONAL AND CONFIDENTIAL
Bill #  90627369
Client.Matter #  047657.000013

Re: BSA General Defense - Bankruptcy (Billiable)

For professional services rendered through February 28, 2022, in connection with the above-referenced 
matter as outlined on the attached detailed billing sheets:

Fees .................................................................................................................................................$6,400.00
Expenses.................................................................................................................................................$0.00

Total Due This Bill..........................................................................................................................$6,400.00

Fees Expenses
Year-To-Date $(316,897.00) $1,741.00
Life-To-Date $3,209,720.50 $35,992.82
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Bill No. 90627369
047657.000013-BAG

Robyn Jungers 
The Boy Scouts of America 
Legal Department
1325 West Walnut Hill Lane
P.O. Box 152079
Irving, TX  75015-2049

Re: BSA General Defense - Bankruptcy (Billiable)

For professional services rendered through February 28, 2022

Date Initials Stage Description Hours Amount
02/01/22 BAG PHASE4 Travel to Dallas for meeting with BSA 

Legal on February 2.
2.50 1,600.00

02/02/22 BAG PHASE4 Return travel to Austin following 
meeting at BSA.

2.50 1,600.00

02/11/22 BAG PHASE4 Travel to Dallas for trial preparation 
meeting with Haynes Boone.

2.50 1,600.00

02/11/22 BAG PHASE4 Return travel to Austin following 
meeting with Haynes Boone.

2.50 1,600.00

Total Services: 10.00 6,400.00

Timekeeper Summary
Timekeeper Title Rate Hours Amount
Bruce A. Griggs Shareholder 640.00 10.00 6,400.00

TOTAL FEES $6,400.00
TOTAL EXPENSES $0.00

TOTAL THIS BILL $6,400.00
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Exhibit E 
 

Expense Summary 
 

Category  Amount  

Legal Support Services  $5,518.65  

Delivery Services/Messenger  $1,585.79  

Copying   $1.80  

Court Fees  $28.00  

Other (Immigration related) $16.54 

Grand Total $7,150.78 
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