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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

Chapter 11
In re:
Case No. 20-10343 (LSS)
BOY SCOUTS OF AMERICA AND
DELAWARE BSA, LLC,' (Jointly Administered)

Debtors. Objection Deadline:
May 10, 2022 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

SUMMARY COVER SHEET OF TWENTY-FOURTH MONTHLY
APPLICATION OF BATES WHITE, LLC FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION
AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD FROM
FEBRUARY 1. 2022 TO AND INCLUDING FEBRUARY 28, 2022

Name of Applicant: Bates White, LLC

Authorized to Provide Professional Services to: Debtors and Debtors in Possession

Date of Retention: February 18, 2020 (order entered April 7,
2020)

Period for Which Compensation and

Reimbursement Are Requested: February 1, 2022 — February 28, 2022

Amount of Compensation Requested: $443.682.00 (80% of $554.602.50)

Amount of Expense Reimbursement Requested: ~ $549.88

This is a(n): monthly X interim final application

' The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, together with the last four digits of each Debtor’s federal tax identification

number, are as follows: Boy Scouts of America (6300) and Delaware BSA, LLC (4311). The Debtors’ mailing
address is 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving, Texas 75038.



Case 20-10343-LSS Doc 9736 Filed 04/26/22 Page 2 of 12

PRIOR MONTHLY APPLICATIONS FILED

Requested Approved Outstanding
Date
5;1;?; CI:Sei:gd Fees Expenses Fees Expenses Fees Expenses
No.
DI | 3aip0 | SIES8LSO | S0 | sisLonao |0 50 50
]5)/.11:5/626()2; 3%2/20_ $61,177.50 80 $48,942.00 30 $0 80
Dlen | Saime | SIE300 | S0 | siaosea | so 50 50
Dioe | agmo | Sse0 | so | saasseo | so 50 50
Di'tir | im0 | S0dss00 | so | 563040 | 50 50 50
19)/.11%%/123(25 3%2/36 $29,180.50 80 $23,344.40 30 $5.836.10 80
11)9;.2?/52705; gggz/(z)(; $129,653.50 80 $103,722.80 $0 $25,930.70 80
11)2.;??/72704; igg/lz/(z)(; $220,117.00 80 $176,093.60 $0 $44,023.40 80
D Tocs | 113090 | SH9663200 | S50 | $9173040 | S50 | 89793260 | 50
ZD/.21_2/22215;1 gg/lz/go_ $862,287.50 $530 $689,830.00 $530 $172,457.50 $0
]3)/.11.1/22316;0 }g/lz/él_ $682,772.50 $530 $546,218.00 $530 $136,554.50 $0
4D/‘1;V22610;5 gggzél— $619,785.50 $549.88 | $495,828.40 | $549.88 $123,957.10 $0
]6)/‘11{2511;79 gg/lz/él_ $736,096.50 $549.88 | $588,877.20 | $549.88 $147,219.30 $0
gﬁ?22427 jggz/éf $646,783.00 $549.88 | $517,426.40 | $549.88 $129,356.60 $0
]7)/.11_6/52611;3 zg/lz/;f $563.,350.00 $549.88 | $450,680.00 | $549.88 $112,670.00 $0
]9)/.21{2611;57 2;;{)2/;1— $529.,478.00 $549.88 | $423,582.40 | $549.88 $105,895.60 $0
]1)(?;.1/62416;5 Zg/lz/;f $451,958.00 $549.88 | $361,566.40 | $549.88 $90,391.60 $0

il
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Requested Approved Outstanding

Date

Filed; Period

Docket | Covered Fees Expenses Fees Expenses Fees Expenses

No.
12/13/21; | 8/1/21 —
D.L 7689 | 8/31/21 $432,620.50 | $2,393.35 | $346,096.40 | $2,393.35 $86,524.10 $0
12/14/21; | 9/1/21 —
D.L 7752 | 9/30/21 $307,050.50 | $1,111.79 | $245,640.40 | $1,111.79 | $307,050.50 | $1,111.79
1/7/22; 10/1/21 -
DI 8195 | 10/31/21 $375,682.50 $549.88 $300,546.00 $549.88 $375,682.50 $549.88
2/14/22; | 11/1/21 -
D.I 8808 | 11/30/21 $515,512.50 $549.88 $412,410.00 $549.88 $515,512.50 $549.88
3/7/22; 12/1/21 -
DI.9195 | 123121 | $1:039436.50 | S0 | $831,549.20 |  $0.00 | $207,887.30 $0
4/8/22; 1/1/22 -
DI.9618 | 1/31/22 $881,708.00 $537.85 $705,366.40 $537.85 $705,366.40 $537.85

il
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COMPENSATION AND HOURS BY PROFESSIONAL

Year of
Name Position Admission Hourly Total Total
Area of Expertise / Years of Rate Hours? Compensation
Experience

Bates, Charles Partner $1,300.00 154.3 $200,590.00
Brown, Jeffrey Partner $825.00 13.9 $11,467.50
Evans, Andrew Partner $825.00 74.8 $61,710.00
Filipi, Ales Partner $925.00 48.0 $44,400.00
Murray, Makeda Principal $635.00 99.7 $63,309.50
Reppert, Wesley Principal $700.00 77.8 $54,460.00
Saleeby, George Senior Consultant $450.00 3.1 $1,271.00
Xu, Alicia Senior Economist $545.00 26.7 $14,551.50
Dhuri, Yash Consultant I1 $390.00 48.1 $18,759.00
Farrell, Emma Consultant II $390.00 93.8 $36,582.00
Wang, Derrick Consultant 11 $390.00 121.8 $47,502.00

Total 762.0 $554,602.50

2 Bates White would have charged the Debtors for 50% of non-working travel time in compliance with Local Rule

2016-2(d)(viii), but no such charges were incurred in this time period. Such reductions are reflected in the figures
in this column.

v
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COMPENSATION AND EXPENSES BY PROJECT CATEGORY

Task Description Total Hours Total Compensation
Analysis 500.2 $380,090.00
Communication with Counsel 27.3 $24,419.50
Data Gathering & Processing 96.9 $43,082.00
Deposition Preparation 36.0 $21,964.50
Fee Request Preparation 41.5 $26,352.50
Project Management 31.1 $23,683.00
Report Preparation 27.9 $34,312.50
Testimony 1.1 $698.50
TOTAL 762.0 $554,602.50
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EXPENSES BY CATEGORY
Category Amount

Copying $0.00
Court Fees $0.00
Delivery Services/Messenger $0.00
Legal Support Services $0.00
Meals (in office work meetings with client, counsel, advisors and Bates White, $0.00
LLC team)

Out of Town Travel (includes lodging, air, ground transportation and meals) $0.00
On-line Research (Westlaw, Lexis, Pacer and related services) $0.00
Telephone (includes non-local calls) $0.00
Transcripts (includes trial and deposition transcripts) $0.00
Secure data hosting site fees (ShareFile) $549.88
TOTAL: $549.88

Vi
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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

Chapter 11
In re:
Case No. 20-10343 (LSS)
BOY SCOUTS OF AMERICA AND
DELAWARE BSA, LLC,' (Jointly Administered)

Debtors. Objection Deadline:
May 10, 2022 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

TWENTY-FOURTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF BATES WHITE, LLC FOR
ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR
THE PERIOD FROM FEBRUARY 1, 2022 TO AND INCLUDING FEBRUARY 28, 2022

Bates White, LLC (“Bates White”), abuse claims consultant and advisor for the Boy Scouts
of America and Delaware BSA, LLC, the non-profit corporations that are debtors and debtors in
possession (together, the “Debtors™) in the above-captioned chapter 11 cases, hereby submits this
twenty-fourth monthly application (this “Application”) requesting payment in the aggregate
amount of $444,231.88, which is equal to (a) 80% ($443,682.00) of the $554,602.50 of total
compensation earned by Bates White for its services to the Debtors during the period from
February 1, 2022 to and including February 28, 2022 (the “Fee Period”) and (b) 100% of the
$549.88 of necessary expenses incurred by Bates White during the Fee Period in connection with
its services to the Debtors. In support of this Application, Bates White respectfully represents as
follows:

JURISDICTION AND VENUE

1. The United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware (the “Court”) has

jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1334 and the Amended Standing Order of

' The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, together with the last four digits of each Debtor’s federal tax identification

number, are as follows: Boy Scouts of America (6300) and Delaware BSA, LLC (4311). The Debtors’ mailing
address is 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving, Texas 75038.



Case 20-10343-LSS Doc 9736 Filed 04/26/22 Page 8 of 12

Reference from the United States District Court for the District of Delaware, dated February 29,
2012. This matter is a core proceeding within the meaning of 28 U.S.C. § 157(b)(2). Venue is
proper in this district pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.

2. The statutory and other bases for the relief requested herein are sections 330 and
331 of chapter 11 of'title 11 of the United States Code, 11 U.S.C. §§ 101-1532 (the “Bankruptcy

Code”), rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the “Bankruptcy Rules™), rule

2016-2 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure of the United States Bankruptcy
Court for the District of Delaware (the “Local Rules”), and the Order (I) Approving Procedures
for (A) Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals and (B)
Expense Reimbursement for Olfficial Committee Members and (Il) Granting Related Relief

[Docket No. 341] (the “Compensation Procedures Order”).

BACKGROUND

3. The Debtors commenced these cases on February 18, 2020 (the “Petition Date™),
and they continue to operate their non-profit organization and manage their properties as debtors
in possession pursuant to sections 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code. These chapter 11
cases are being jointly administered for procedural purposes only pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule
1015(b) and Local Rule 1015-1.

4. On March 5, 2020, the United States Trustee for the District of Delaware appointed
an official committee of tort claimants and an official committee of unsecured creditors pursuant
to section 1102 of the Bankruptcy Code.

5. On April 24, 2020, the Court appointed James L. Patton, Jr. as the representative of

future abuse claimants pursuant to sections 105(a) and 1109(b) of the Bankruptcy Code.
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6. The Court has authorized the Debtors to retain and employ Bates White as their
abuse claims consultant and advisor, nunc pro tunc to the Petition Date, pursuant to the Order
Authorizing the Retention and Employment of Bates White, LLC Abuse Claims Consultant for the
Debtors and Debtors in Possession, Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date [Docket No. 207] (the

“Retention Order”). The Retention Order authorizes the Debtors to compensate and reimburse

Bates White in accordance with the terms and conditions set forth in the Debtors’ application to
retain Bates White, subject to Bates White’s application to the Court.

7. On April 6, 2020, the Court entered the Compensation Procedures Order. The
Compensation Procedures Order provides, among other things, that each professional shall be
entitled, on or as soon as practicable after the fifteenth (15th) day of each month following the
month for which compensation and/or expense reimbursement is sought, to file and serve an
application for interim allowance of compensation earned and reimbursement of expenses incurred

during the preceding month (each a “Monthly Fee Application). Parties shall have fourteen (14)

days after service of a Monthly Fee Application to file an objection to the compensation or

expenses that are the subject thereof (the “Objection Deadline”). Upon the expiration of the

Objection Deadline, the applicant may file a certificate of no objection (a “CNO”) with the Court
with respect to the unopposed portion of the fees and/or expenses requested in the applicable
Monthly Fee Application. After the filing of a CNO, the Debtors are authorized and directed to
pay the applicant an amount equal to 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses requested in the
applicable Monthly Fee Application not subject to an objection.

RELIEF REQUESTED

8. By this Application, in accordance with the Compensation Procedures Order, Bates

White requests payment in the aggregate amount of $444,231.88, which is equal
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to (a) 80% (i.e., $443,682.00) of the $554,602.50 of total compensation earned by Bates White
during the Fee Period for its services to the Debtors and (b) 100% of the $549.88 of necessary
expenses incurred by Bates White during the Fee Period in connection with its services to the
Debtors.

SUMMARY OF SERVICES RENDERED

0. Attached hereto as Exhibit A is a detailed statement of the time expended and
compensation earned by Bates White during the Fee Period. Bates White’s professionals expended
a total of 762.0 hours in connection with these chapter 11 cases during the Fee Period. All services
for which Bates White is requesting compensation were performed for or on behalf of the Debtors.
The services rendered by Bates White during the Fee Period are categorized as set forth in
Exhibit A and in the summary cover sheets prefixed to this Application. The professionals who
provided services to the Debtors during the Fee Period are also identified in Exhibit A and in the
summary cover sheets.

ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES

10.  Bates White also incurred certain necessary expenses during the Fee Period for
which it is entitled to reimbursement under the terms of its retention. As set forth in greater detail
in the summary attached hereto as Exhibit B, Bates White’s total expenses incurred during the
Fee Period are $549.88.

VALUATION OF SERVICES

11. The hourly rates reflected on Exhibit A are Bates White’s customary hourly rates
for work of this character. The reasonable value of the services rendered by Bates White for the
Fee Period as abuse claims consultant and advisor to the Debtors in these chapter 11 cases is

$554,602.50.
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12. In accordance with section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, the fees requested are
reasonable in light of factors including, among other things, (a) the complexity of these chapter 11
cases, (b) the time expended, (c) the nature and extent of the services rendered, (d) the value of
such services, and (e) the costs of comparable services other than in a case under this title.

13. Although Bates White has made every effort to include all fees and expenses
incurred during the Fee Period in this Application, some fees and expenses might have been
omitted from this Application due to delays caused by accounting and processing during the Fee
Period. Bates White reserves the right to submit further applications to the Court for allowance of
such fees and expenses not included herein. Subsequent fee applications will be filed in
accordance with the requirements of the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Rules,
and the Compensation Procedures Order.

CERTIFICATION OF COMPLIANCE

14. The undersigned has reviewed the requirements of Local Rule 2016-2 and certifies

that, to the best of his knowledge, information and belief, this Application complies with that rule.

[Remainder of Page Intentionally Left Blank]
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WHEREFORE, Bates White requests payment in the aggregate amount of $444,231.88,

which is equal to (a) 80% (i.e., $443,682.00) of the $554,602.50 of total compensation earned by

Bates White during the Fee Period for its services to the Debtors and (b) 100% of the $549.88 of

necessary expenses incurred by Bates White during the Fee Period in connection with its services

to the Debtors.

Dated: April 26, 2022
Wilmington, Delaware

BATES WHITE, LLC

/s/ Andrew R. Evans

Andrew R. Evans

Partner

2001 K Street NW,

North Building, Suite 500

Washington, DC 20006

Telephone: 202-354-1187

Email: andrew.evans@bateswhite.com

ABUSE CLAIMS CONSULTANT AND
ADVISOR TO THE DEBTORS AND
DEBTORS IN POSSESSION
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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

Inre Chapter 11

BOY SCOUTS OF AMERICA AND | Case No.20-10343 (LSS)
DELAWARE BSA, LLC,'
Jointly Administered
Debtors.
Objection Deadline:

May 10, 2022 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

NOTICE OF TWENTY-FOURTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF BATES
WHITE, LLC FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION AND
REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD FROM
FEBRUARY 1., 2022 TO AND INCLUDING FEBRUARY 28, 2022

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that today, Bates White, LLC (“Bates White”) as
attorneys to the Debtors in the above-captioned cases, filed the attached Twenty-Fourth
Monthly Application of Bates White, LLC for Allowance of Compensation and
Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period from February 1, 2022 to and Including
February 28, 2022 (the “Application”™).

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that objections, if any, to the Application,
must be: (a) filed with the Clerk of the Bankruptcy Court, 824 North Market Street, 3™ Floor,
Wilmington, Delaware 19801, by May 10, 2022 at 4:00 p.m. (ET) (the “Objection Deadline™);
and (b) served so as to be received on or before the Objection Deadline by:

1. the Applicant: Bates White, LLC, 2001 K Street NW, North Building,
Suite 500, Washington, DC 20006, Attn: Andrew R. Evans,
andrew.evans@bateswhite.com;

1. the Debtors: Boy Scouts of America, 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving,
Texas 75038, Attn: Steven P. McGowan, steve.mcgowan@scouting.org;

1ii. counsel to the Debtors: White & Case LLP, 111 South Wacker Drive,
Chicago, Ilinois 60606, Attn: Matthew E. Linder,
mlinder@whitecase.com;

1v. co-counsel to the Debtors: Morris, Nichols, Arsht & Tunnell LLP, 1201
N. Market Street, 16" Floor, Wilmington, Delaware 19801, Attn: Derek C.

' The Debtors in these cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor’s federal EIN, are as

follows: Boy Scouts of America (6300) and Delaware BSA, LLC (4311). The Debtors’ mailing
address is 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving, Texas 75038.
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Abbott, dabbott@morrisnichols.com;

V. the Office of the United States Trustee: J. Caleb Boggs Federal Building,
Room 2207, 844 N. King Street, Wilmington, Delaware 19801, Attn:
David Buchbinder, david.l.buchbinder@usdoj.gov and Hannah M.
McCollum, hannah.mccollum@usdoj.gov;

Vi. counsel to the UCC: Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP, 1177 Avenue
of the Americas, New York, New York 10036, Attn: Rachael Ringer,
rringer@kramerlevin.com and Megan M. Wasson, mwasson@
kramerlevin.com;

vii. counsel to the Tort Claimants’ Committee: Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones
LLP, 10100 Santa Monica Boulevard, 13th Floor, Los Angeles, California
90067, Attn: Richard M. Pachulski, rpachulski@pszjlaw.com;

Vviil. counsel to the Future Claimants’ Representative: Young Conaway
Stargatt & Taylor, LLP, Rodney Square, 1000 North King Street,
Wilmington, Delaware 19801, Attn: Robert S. Brady, rbrady@ycst.com
and Edwin J. Harron, eharron@ycst.com;

IX. counsel to the Ad Hoc Committee of Local Councils: Wachtell, Lipton,
Rosen & Katz, 51 West 52nd Street, New York, New York 10019, Attn:
Richard G. Mason, rgmason@wlrk.com and Joseph C. Celentino,
jecenlentino@wlrk.com;

X. counsel to JPMorgan Chase Bank, National Association: Norton Rose
Fulbright US LLP, 2200 Ross Avenue, Dallas, Texas 75201-7932, Attn:
Louis R. Strubeck, louis.strubeck@nortonrosefullbright.com and Kristian
W. Gluck, kristian.gluck@nortonrosefullbright.com;

XI. counsel to the County Commission of Fayette County (West Virginia):
Steptoe & Johnson PLLC, Chase Tower — 8th Floor, 707 Virginia Street
East, Charleston, West Virginia 25301, Attn: John Stump; and

Xii. Rucki Fee Review, LLC: 1111 Windon Drive, Wilmington, Delaware
19803, Attn: Justin Rucki, justinrucki@ruckifeereview.com.

A HEARING ON THE APPLICATION, IF NECESSARY, WILL BE HELD AT
THE CONVENIENCE OF THE COURT AND NOTICE OF ANY SUCH HEARING WILL BE
GIVEN ONLY TO THE OBJECTING PARTY OR PARTIES.

IF YOU FAIL TO RESPOND IN ACCORDANCE WITH THIS NOTICE, THE
COURT MAY GRANT THE RELIEF REQUESTED BY THE APPLICATION WITHOUT
FURTHER NOTICE OR HEARING.
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Dated: April 26, 2022 MORRIS, NICHOLS, ARSHT & TUNNELL LLP
Wilmington, Delaware

/s/ Tori L. Remington

Derek C. Abbott (No. 3376)

Andrew R. Remming (No. 5120)

Paige N. Topper (No. 6470)

Tori L. Remington (No. 6901)

1201 North Market Street, 16th Floor

P.O. Box 1347

Wilmington, Delaware 19899-1347

Telephone: (302) 658-9200

Email: dabbott@morrisnichols.com
aremming@morrisnichols.com
ptopper@morrisnichols.com
tremington@morrisnichols.com

—and —

WHITE & CASE LLP

Jessica C. Lauria (admitted pro hac vice)
1221 Avenue of the Americas

New York, New York 10020

Telephone: (212) 819-8200

Email: jessica.lauria@whitecase.com

—and —

WHITE & CASE LLP

Michael C. Andolina (admitted pro hac vice)

Matthew E. Linder (admitted pro hac vice)

Laura E. Baccash (admitted pro hac vice)

Blair M. Warner (admitted pro hac vice)

111 South Wacker Drive

Chicago, Illinois 60606

Telephone: (312) 881-5400

Email: mandolina@whitecase.com
mlinder@whitecase.com
laura.baccash@whitecase.com
blair.warner@whitecase.com

ATTORNEYS FOR THE DEBTORS AND DEBTORS
IN POSSESSION


mailto:ptopper@morrisnichols.com

Date
incurred

Employee
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Exhibit A

Summary of Services

Category

Bill rate

Professional
fees

2/1/2022 Bates, Charles 2.5 | Analysis Work on analysis of Claro reports $1,300.00 $3,250.00

2/1/2022 Bates, Charles 0.5 | Project Management Outline work plan for supplemental report analyses $1,300.00 $650.00

2/1/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.5 | Analysis Review plan for hearing testimony and prep materials for $825.00 $412.50
McNally dep

2/1/2022 Evans, Andrew 2.3 | Analysis Working session with Gorsich; Shepherd; Filipi on $825.00 $1,897.50
McNally depo prep

2/1/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.4 | Analysis Work on supporting analysis for McNally dep prep $825.00 $330.00

2/1/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Analysis Review additional analysis on TCJC and Methodist claims $825.00 $165.00

2/1/2022 Filipi, Ales 1.5 | Deposition Preparation Prepared McNally deposition topics $925.00 $1,387.50

2/1/2022 Filipi, Ales 2.3 | Analysis Working session with Gorsich; Shepherd; Evans on $925.00 $2,127.50
McNally depo prep

2/1/2022 Filipi, Ales 0.6 | Deposition Preparation Worked on McNally deposition topics $925.00 $555.00

2/1/2022 Reppert, Wesley 0.8 | Analysis Preparing arguments for McNally depo $700.00 $560.00

2/1/2022 Reppert, Wesley 2.0 | Analysis Preparing claims list for Zuckerman firm at request of $700.00 $1,400.00
counsel

2/1/2022 Murray, Makeda 0.5 | Analysis Review updates on outstanding analyses and provide $635.00 $317.50
direction to team via email

2/1/2022 Murray, Makeda 1.9 | Deposition Preparation Review Murray affirmative report $635.00 $1,206.50

2/1/2022 Farrell, Emma 2.6 | Deposition Preparation Compile notes for expert deposition preparation, contd. $390.00 $1,014.00

2/1/2022 Farrell, Emma 1.9 | Analysis Generate tabulations of CO claim distributions per counsel $390.00 $741.00
request

2/1/2022 Saleeby, George 0.3 | Data Gathering & Processing | Complete ShareFile requests for counsel $410.00 $123.00

2/1/2022 Dhuri, Yash 0.2 | Data Gathering & Processing | Downloading and saving additional claimant letters $390.00 $78.00

2/1/2022 Dhuri, Yash 0.5 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review of wealth data analysis work and summary $390.00 $195.00

2/1/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.6 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review Bates' rough deposition transcript $390.00 $624.00

2/1/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.2 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review Dubin and McNally expert reports for deposition $390.00 $468.00
preparation

2/1/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.9 | Analysis QC claim count tabulations for key Chartered $390.00 $351.00
Organizations

2/2/2022 Bates, Charles 0.3 | Analysis Working session with Evans; Murray; Reppert on case and $1,300.00 $390.00
analysis next steps

2/2/2022 Bates, Charles 1.5 | Communication with Call re: expert depositions with Evans (left early), Reppert, $1,300.00 $1,950.00

Counsel Wang, Filipi, Shepherd, Kurtz, and Gorsich

2/2/2022 | Bates, Charles 3.7 | Analysis Work on liability analysis $1,300.00 $4,810.00

2/2/2022 Brown, Jeffrey 0.2 | Analysis Outline adjustments to Census wealth data analysis $825.00 $165.00

2/2/2022 Brown, Jeffrey 0.8 | Analysis Analyze Census wealth data by age and education $825.00 $660.00

2/2/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Analysis Review update on status of McNally dep prep supporting $825.00 $165.00
analyses

2/2/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.3 | Analysis Working session with Bates; Murray; Reppert on next $825.00 $247.50
steps

2/2/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.8 | Communication with Working session on McNally dep prep with Shepherd; $825.00 $660.00

Counsel Kurtz; Gorsich; Bates; Reppert; Filipi; Wang -- only on for

part time

2/2/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Project Management BSA weekly team meeting- Dhuri, Evans, Farrell, Murray, $825.00 $165.00
Shipp

2/2/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.6 | Analysis QC supporting data analysis for historical resolutions and $825.00 $495.00
POC demographics

2/2/2022 Filipi, Ales 0.8 | Analysis Worked on responses to W&C requests $925.00 $740.00
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Date . Professional
incurred Employee Hours Category Notes Bill rate P
2/2/2022 Filipi, Ales 1.5 | Communication with Call with White & Case regarding expert depositions with $925.00 $1,387.50

Counsel Bates, Reppert, Wang, Shepherd, Kurtz, Gorsich and
Evans (left early)
2/2/2022 Filipi, Ales 0.2 | Deposition Preparation QCed calculations of frequency adjustments for McNally $925.00 $185.00
deposition
2/2/2022 Filipi, Ales 1.1 | Deposition Preparation Researched potential supporting materials for McNally $925.00 $1,017.50
deposition
2/2/2022 Reppert, Wesley 1.5 | Communication with W&C Call re: depositions with Bates, Evans (left early), $700.00 $1,050.00
Counsel Filipi, Wang, Shepherd, Kurtz, and Gorsich
2/2/2022 Reppert, Wesley 0.3 | Analysis Meeting with Bates; Murray; Evans on analysis next steps $700.00 $210.00
2/2/2022 Reppert, Wesley 3.7 | Deposition Preparation Preparing Claro valuation calculations for McNally $700.00 $2,590.00
deposition
2/2/2022 Reppert, Wesley 1.5 | Analysis Analysis of BSA historical settlements data for Claro depo $700.00 $1,050.00
support
2/2/2022 Murray, Makeda 1.0 | Deposition Preparation Deposition prep with BW counsel and Farrell $635.00 $635.00
2/2/2022 Murray, Makeda 1.5 | Deposition Preparation Depo prep: materials review $635.00 $952.50
2/2/2022 Murray, Makeda 0.2 | Project Management BSA weekly update- Dhuri, Evans, Farrell, Shipp $635.00 $127.00
2/2/2022 Murray, Makeda 1.8 | Deposition Preparation Deposition prep with W&C- Green and Farrell $635.00 $1,143.00
2/2/2022 Murray, Makeda 2.2 | Deposition Preparation Deposition prep- review of report materials $635.00 $1,397.00
2/2/2022 Murray, Makeda 0.3 | Analysis BSA meeting with Bates, Evans and Reppert on analysis $635.00 $190.50
next steps
2/2/2022 Farrell, Emma 1.0 | Deposition Preparation Murray deposition skills preparation with BW counsel $390.00 $390.00
2/2/2022 Farrell, Emma 1.1 | Deposition Preparation Draft list of practice questions for deposition preparation $390.00 $429.00
2/2/2022 Farrell, Emma 0.5 | Deposition Preparation Materials review for deposition preparation $390.00 $195.00
2/2/2022 Farrell, Emma 0.4 | Deposition Preparation Review notes from deposition preparation sessions $390.00 $156.00
2/2/2022 Farrell, Emma 0.2 | Project Management BSA weekly meeting - Dhuri, Evans, Murray, Shipp $390.00 $78.00
2/2/2022 Farrell, Emma 1.8 | Deposition Preparation Deposition preparation session w/ Green and Murray $390.00 $702.00
2/2/2022 Farrell, Emma 1.3 | Deposition Preparation QC statistics for McNally deposition prep memo $390.00 $507.00
2/2/2022 Dhuri, Yash 0.2 | Project Management BSA weekly team meeting- Shipp, Evans, Farrell, Murray $390.00 $78.00
2/2/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.5 | Communication with Meeting with W&C re: expert depositions. Attended by $390.00 $585.00
Counsel Shepherd, Kurtz, Gorsich, Bates, Reppert, Evans (left
early), Filipi (left early)
2/2/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.5 | Analysis Analyzing allegation updates to BSA historical settlements $390.00 $195.00
data
2/2/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.1 | Analysis Analyzing literature on fair value hierarchy and $390.00 $429.00
measurement
2/2/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.9 | Analysis Preparing summary statistics of POC data and historical $390.00 $351.00
settlements for depo prep
2/2/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.4 | Analysis QC summary statistics of POC data and historical $390.00 $156.00
settlements for depo prep
2/2/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.5 | Analysis Reviewing FASB standards on fair value reporting and $390.00 $585.00
adjustments
2/2/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.3 | Analysis Drafting emails to counsel re: FASB guidelines and fair $390.00 $117.00
value for depo prep
2/2/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.2 | Analysis Drafting emails to counsel on summary statistics of POC $390.00 $78.00
data and historical settlements
2/2/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.0 | Analysis Summarizing analysis of FASB guidelines and opposing $390.00 $390.00
expert citations re: fair value
2/2/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.7 | Analysis Working on summary of analysis of opposing expert report $390.00 $273.00
for depo prep
2/3/2022 Bates, Charles 4.0 | Analysis Attend McNally deposition $1,300.00 $5,200.00
2/3/2022 Bates, Charles 3.5 | Analysis Continue attendance of McNally deposition $1,300.00 $4,550.00
2/3/2022 Bates, Charles 2.5 | Analysis Continue attendance of McNally deposition $1,300.00 $3,250.00
2/3/2022 Bates, Charles 1.5 | Analysis Review and analysis of McNally deposition $1,300.00 $1,950.00
2/3/2022 Brown, Jeffrey 1.5 | Analysis Analyze research on wealth by age x education $825.00 $1,237.50
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2/3/2022 Brown, Jeffrey 1.0 | Analysis Analyze SCF survey data on income and net worth $825.00 $825.00
2/3/2022 Brown, Jeffrey 1.0 | Analysis Analyze research on educational impact on life expectancy $825.00 $825.00
2/3/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.1 | Deposition Preparation Help with Murray dep prep $825.00 $82.50
2/3/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.8 | Analysis Work on W&C request re TCJC and Methodist data $825.00 $660.00
2/3/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.6 | Analysis Work on analysis related to questions from McNally dep $825.00 $495.00
2/3/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.3 | Analysis Additional work on TCJC and Methodist analysis $825.00 $247.50
2/3/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Project Management Outline plan for confirmation hearing support $825.00 $165.00
2/3/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.4 | Analysis Review and respond to emails and questions related to $825.00 $330.00
McNally dep

2/3/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.6 | Analysis Work on plaintiff law firm deposition strategy with Filipi $825.00 $495.00
and Reppert

2/3/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.4 | Analysis Additional work on TCJC and Methodist evaluation $825.00 $330.00

2/3/2022 Filipi, Ales 0.8 | Deposition Preparation Provided McNally deposition support $925.00 $740.00

2/3/2022 Filipi, Ales 0.6 | Analysis Meeting to discuss plaintiff law firm deposition strategy $925.00 $555.00
(Evans, Reppert)

2/3/2022 Reppert, Wesley 0.6 | Analysis Meeting to discuss plaintiff law firm deposition strategy $700.00 $420.00
(Evans, Filipi)

2/3/2022 Reppert, Wesley 2.8 | Analysis Responding to questions re McNally depo $700.00 $1,960.00

2/3/2022 Reppert, Wesley 0.5 | Analysis Analysis of BSA historical settlement data $700.00 $350.00

2/3/2022 Murray, Makeda 2.0 | Deposition Preparation Review report materials in preparation for deposition $635.00 $1,270.00

2/3/2022 Murray, Makeda 1.8 | Deposition Preparation Deposition prep and materials review $635.00 $1,143.00

2/3/2022 | Murray, Makeda 1.1 | Testimony Deposition of Makeda Murray $635.00 $698.50

2/3/2022 Murray, Makeda 1.7 | Analysis Work on requested TCJC claims analysis $635.00 $1,079.50

2/3/2022 Murray, Makeda 1.8 | Analysis Review and update TCJC/Methodist memo for White & $635.00 $1,143.00
Case

2/3/2022 Farrell, Emma 4.0 | Analysis Prepare tabulations for CO-specific summary memo per $390.00 $1,560.00
counsel request

2/3/2022 Farrell, Emma 1.5 | Analysis Continue preparing CO-specific tabulations for summary $390.00 $585.00
memo per counsel request

2/3/2022 Farrell, Emma 1.0 | Deposition Preparation Compile notes & provide statistics for final deposition $390.00 $390.00
review

2/3/2022 Farrell, Emma 0.5 | Deposition Preparation QC statistics for McNally deposition prep memo, contd. $390.00 $195.00

2/3/2022 Farrell, Emma 1.1 | Deposition Preparation Murray deposition $390.00 $429.00

2/3/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.9 | Analysis Review and QC BSA historical claims key statistics for $390.00 $351.00
opposing expert depo

2/3/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.1 | Analysis Working on tabulations of BSA historical claims for $390.00 $429.00
deposition

2/3/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.3 | Analysis Analyze historical BSA verdicts and institutional $390.00 $117.00
responsibility share

2/3/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.5 | Analysis Updating source documents for BSA historical settlements $390.00 $585.00
data

2/3/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.2 | Analysis Reviewing Murray deposition rough transcript $390.00 $468.00

2/3/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.0 | Analysis Working on follow-up analyses for BSA historical $390.00 $390.00
settlement averages

2/4/2022 Bates, Charles 0.5 | Analysis Working session with Evans; Filipi; Farrell; Wang; $1,300.00 $650.00
Reppert; Murray on next steps for analysis coming out of
McNally dep

2/4/2022 Bates, Charles 4.0 | Analysis Work on analysis of POC data $1,300.00 $5,200.00

2/4/2022 Bates, Charles 3.6 | Analysis Continue POC data review $1,300.00 $4,680.00

2/4/2022 Brown, Jeffrey 0.5 | Analysis Analyze SIPP wealth data from Census $825.00 $412.50

2/4/2022 Brown, Jeffrey 0.5 | Analysis Analyze SCF wealth data from FRB $825.00 $412.50

2/4/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Analysis QC of data and inputs used for TCJC and Methodist $825.00 $165.00
figures
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2/4/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.5 | Analysis Outline next steps for hearing support, other pending dep $825.00 $412.50

support and filing support analysis
2/4/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Analysis Additional work on TCJC and Methodist figures and $825.00 $165.00
support
2/4/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.5 | Analysis Team meeting with Bates; Filipi; Farrell; Wang; Reppert; $825.00 $412.50
Murray on McNally next steps
2/4/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.9 | Communication with Call with Shepherd; Filipi; Reppert $825.00 $742.50
Counsel
2/4/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.5 | Analysis Plan next steps for evaluation of claimant education and $825.00 $412.50
wealth analytics- Filipi & Reppert
2/4/2022 Filipi, Ales 0.9 | Communication with Call with Shepherd; Evans; Reppert $925.00 $832.50
Counsel
2/4/2022 Filipi, Ales 0.5 | Analysis Discuss plan for evaluation of claimant education and $925.00 $462.50
wealth analyses with Evans and Reppert
2/4/2022 Filipi, Ales 0.5 | Analysis BSA meeting with Bates; Evans; Farrell; Wang; Reppert; $925.00 $462.50
Murray on next steps for McNally analysis
2/4/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.3 | Analysis Responded to W&C analysis requests $925.00 $277.50
2/4/2022 Filipi, Ales 0.5 | Analysis Developed alternative methodology for AC wealth $925.00 $462.50
assessment
2/4/2022 Reppert, Wesley 0.5 | Analysis Working session with Farrell; Wang; Bates; Filipi; Evans; $700.00 $350.00
Murray on next steps for post-McNally dep analysis
2/4/2022 Reppert, Wesley 0.5 | Analysis Review analysis next steps for evaluation of claimant $700.00 $350.00
education and wealth - Evans, Filipi
2/4/2022 Reppert, Wesley 0.9 | Communication with Call with Shepherd; Filipi; Evans $700.00 $630.00
Counsel
2/4/2022 Reppert, Wesley 1.4 | Analysis Analysis of claimant demographics in POC data $700.00 $980.00
2/4/2022 Reppert, Wesley 2.4 | Analysis Preparing data tabulations for plaintiff attorney depo at $700.00 $1,680.00
request of counsel
2/4/2022 Reppert, Wesley 2.5 | Analysis Preparing updated voting report and CO tabulations at $700.00 $1,750.00
request of counsel
2/4/2022 Murray, Makeda 0.3 | Analysis Review updates to TCJC/Methodist memo $635.00 $190.50
2/4/2022 Murray, Makeda 0.5 | Analysis Review BSA historical settlements email and updates from $635.00 $317.50
team
2/4/2022 Murray, Makeda 0.3 | Analysis Send email to W&C re: BSA historical settlements $635.00 $190.50
supporting documentation
2/4/2022 Murray, Makeda 0.5 | Project Management Review updates on outstanding analyses and provide $635.00 $317.50
direction to team via email
2/4/2022 Murray, Makeda 1.0 | Fee Request Preparation Continue working on Nov 2021 fee application $635.00 $635.00
2/4/2022 Farrell, Emma 1.2 | Analysis Review demographic field processing and outline next $390.00 $468.00
steps for employment and education field processing
2/4/2022 Farrell, Emma 4.0 | Data Gathering & Processing | Manual review of Tranche 6 occupation fields in $390.00 $1,560.00
preparation for incorporation into wealth analysis
2/4/2022 Farrell, Emma 0.8 | Analysis Review and work on next steps for CO, wealth analysis & $390.00 $312.00
historical settlements analyses
2/4/2022 Farrell, Emma 0.9 | Analysis QC CO-specific tabulations and summary memo $390.00 $351.00
2/4/2022 Farrell, Emma 0.5 | Analysis Working session with Bates; Filipi; Wang; Reppert; $390.00 $195.00
Murray re: next steps for analysis coming out of McNally
deposition
2/4/2022 Farrell, Emma 1.4 | Analysis Review McNally deposition transcript $390.00 $546.00
2/4/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.5 | Analysis Meeting to review next steps after depositions with Bates, $390.00 $195.00
Evans, Filipi; Farrell, Reppert; Murray
2/4/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.4 | Analysis Review and QC memo summarizing TCJC and Methodist $390.00 $156.00
claim valuations
2/4/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.9 | Analysis QC analysis of top Chartered Organization claim counts $390.00 $351.00
and valuation
2/4/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.4 | Analysis Reviewing case timeline and next steps for analyses $390.00 $156.00
2/4/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.5 | Analysis QC analysis of claimant demographic fields in POC data $390.00 $585.00
2/4/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.3 | Analysis Update claimant name fields for unique and timely POC $390.00 $117.00
data
2/4/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.6 | Analysis Update list of settlement documents for historical $390.00 $624.00
settlements data
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2/4/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.0 | Data Gathering & Processing | Reviewing BSA court hearing transcripts for confirmation $390.00 $390.00
hearing prep

2/4/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.7 | Data Gathering & Processing | Continuing to review BSA hearing transcripts for $390.00 $273.00
confirmation prep

2/4/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.8 | Data Gathering & Processing | Analyzing TCC opposing expert deposition rough $390.00 $312.00
transcript

2/4/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.4 | Analysis Analyze summary of abuse disclosure academic literature $390.00 $156.00

2/5/2022 Reppert, Wesley 0.4 | Analysis Responding to vote tabulation requests from counsel for $700.00 $280.00
Hurley depo support

2/6/2022 Reppert, Wesley 0.8 | Analysis Preparing summary of Paul Mones claims at request of $700.00 $560.00
counsel

2/7/2022 Bates, Charles 0.5 | Project Management Review email updates on progress of analysis projects $1,300.00 $650.00

2/7/2022 Bates, Charles 0.5 | Project Management Work on planning for hearing - outline data and analysis $1,300.00 $650.00
files that need to be compiled

2/7/2022 Bates, Charles 1.5 | Analysis Work on POC data analysis $1,300.00 $1,950.00

2/7/2022 Bates, Charles 1.0 | Analysis Call with counsel to discuss TDP (Baccash, Azer, Warner, $1,300.00 $1,300.00
Shepherd, Gorsich, Filipi, Evans, Reppert, Murray)

2/7/2022 Bates, Charles 3.3 | Analysis Work on supplemental report data analysis $1,300.00 $4,290.00

2/7/2022 Brown, Jeffrey 0.5 | Analysis Review Census wealth analysis and outline next steps $825.00 $412.50

2/7/2022 Brown, Jeffrey 1.0 | Analysis Review availability of SIPP datasets for wealth analysis $825.00 $825.00

2/7/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.5 | Analysis Outline proposed next steps in analysis lines for hearing $825.00 $412.50
prep

2/7/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Project Management Send email to team re: various work stream execution tasks $825.00 $165.00
and hearing plan

2/7/2022 Evans, Andrew 1.0 | Analysis Call with counsel to discuss confirmation brief questions -- $825.00 $825.00
Baccash, Azer, Warner, Shepherd, Gorsich, Filipi, Reppert,
Murray, Bates

2/7/2022 Filipi, Ales 1.0 | Analysis Call with counsel to discuss TDP (Baccash, Azer, Warner, $925.00 $925.00
Shepherd, Gorsich, Evans, Reppert, Murray, Bates)

2/7/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.7 | Analysis Analyzed Verdicts data $925.00 $647.50

2/7/2022 Filipi, Ales 0.5 | Analysis Drafted and sent email update on status of confirmation $925.00 $462.50
hearing analyses

2/7/2022 Reppert, Wesley 1.0 | Analysis Call with W&C to discuss TDP (Baccash, Azer, Warner, $700.00 $700.00
Shepherd, Gorsich, Filipi, Evans, Murray, Bates)

2/7/2022 Reppert, Wesley 2.8 | Analysis Analysis of education and occupation information in POC $700.00 $1,960.00
data

2/7/2022 Reppert, Wesley 1.5 | Analysis Analysis of historical settlement averages based on abuser $700.00 $1,050.00
profile

2/7/2022 Reppert, Wesley 1.2 | Analysis Analysis of Aloha Council voting claims at request of $700.00 $840.00
counsel

2/7/2022 Murray, Makeda 0.5 | Project Management Review updates on data processing requests, claimant $635.00 $317.50
economic analysis and in-process analyses

2/7/2022 Murray, Makeda 0.5 | Analysis Provide email direction to the team re: data processing $635.00 $317.50
updates requested by Bates

2/7/2022 Murray, Makeda 0.9 | Analysis Call with W&C - Azer, Baccash, Warner, Shepherd, $635.00 $571.50
Gorsich, Filipi, Evans, Reppert and Bates. I arrived late.

2/7/2022 Murray, Makeda 0.3 | Fee Request Preparation Nov 2021 fee application preparation $635.00 $190.50

2/7/2022 Farrell, Emma 0.5 | Analysis Outline next steps for wealth analysis $390.00 $195.00

2/7/2022 Farrell, Emma 3.0 | Data Gathering & Processing | Continue reviewing Tranche 6 occupation fields for wealth $390.00 $1,170.00
analysis

2/7/2022 Farrell, Emma 1.5 | Data Gathering & Processing | Process and apply occupation translation table to Tranche 6 $390.00 $585.00
data (wealth analysis)

2/7/2022 Dhuri, Yash 1.7 | Analysis Processing de-aggregated census data for wealth analysis $390.00 $663.00

2/7/2022 Dhuri, Yash 0.5 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review of wealth analysis next steps and updates $390.00 $195.00

2/7/2022 Dhuri, Yash 1.5 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review of data guide and dictionary for census data $390.00 $585.00

2/7/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.0 | Analysis QC data-related excerpts of draft confirmation brief $390.00 $390.00

2/7/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.8 | Analysis Continue to review and QC draft confirmation brief $390.00 $312.00
excerpts
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2/7/2022 Wang, Derrick 2.0 | Data Gathering & Processing | Reviewing and summarizing bankruptcy hearing $390.00 $780.00

transcripts for confirmation prep
2/7/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.6 | Analysis Updating abuse location fields for Tranche VI POC data $390.00 $624.00
2/7/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.1 | Analysis Analyzing abuse location and connection to scouting in $390.00 $429.00
POC data
2/7/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.5 | Analysis QC deduplication of Scouting location connection fields in $390.00 $585.00
POC data
2/7/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.5 | Analysis QC analysis of Tranche VI demographic fields in POC data $390.00 $195.00
2/8/2022 Bates, Charles 0.5 | Communication with Call with Shepherd, Evans, Murray and Reppert re: $1,300.00 $650.00
Counsel confirmation brief (I dropped early)
2/8/2022 Bates, Charles 0.5 | Project Management Review project status updates on outstanding analyses; $1,300.00 $650.00
provide direction via email
2/8/2022 Bates, Charles 4.0 | Analysis Review data analysis updates, provide direction re: $1,300.00 $5,200.00
refinements and work on incorporating them into
supplemental report
2/8/2022 Bates, Charles 2.2 | Analysis Continue working on incorporation of data analyses into $1,300.00 $2,860.00
supplemental report
2/8/2022 Bates, Charles 0.8 | Communication with Work on email summarizing data analysis $1,300.00 $1,040.00
Counsel
2/8/2022 Brown, Jeffrey 1.0 | Analysis Review and analyze wealth data files from SCF $825.00 $825.00
2/8/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.8 | Communication with Call with Bates; Shepherd; Reppert; Murray on $825.00 $660.00
Counsel confirmation brief questions (Shepherd and Bates dropped
carly)
2/8/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.5 | Analysis Work on collecting relevant documents for trial prep $825.00 $412.50
2/8/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.4 | Analysis Review of POC information related to abuse locations $825.00 $330.00
2/8/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.3 | Analysis Review of information related to TDP values and sent $825.00 $247.50
information to Gorsich and Shepherd re: same
2/8/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.3 | Analysis Continue gathering documents/files in support of McNally $825.00 $247.50
Cross
2/8/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Analysis Review most recent voting tabulations $825.00 $165.00
2/8/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.7 | Analysis Evaluation of institutional responsibility shares from past $825.00 $577.50
cases; provide information to Kurtz and Gorsich on same
2/8/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.3 | Analysis Review of information related to TCC claims $825.00 $247.50
2/8/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Project Management Outline and send email re: case tasks that require the team's $825.00 $165.00
attention
2/8/2022 Filipi, Ales 1.0 | Data Gathering & Processing | Reviewed McNally transcript and provided direction to $925.00 $925.00
team
2/8/2022 Filipi, Ales 1.1 | Analysis Reviewed McNally's prior expert work $925.00 $1,017.50
2/8/2022 Filipi, Ales 0.6 | Analysis Summarized POCs for TCC representative $925.00 $555.00
2/8/2022 Filipi, Ales 0.9 | Analysis Reviewed existing and newly-identified confirmation $925.00 $832.50
hearing work streams
2/8/2022 Reppert, Wesley 2.7 | Analysis Analysis of claimant wealth statistics $700.00 $1,890.00
2/8/2022 Reppert, Wesley 0.5 | Communication with Call with Shepherd, Evans, Murray and Bates (left early). I $700.00 $350.00
Counsel left early as well.
2/8/2022 Reppert, Wesley 1.5 | Analysis Responding to requests from counsel re plaintiff attorney $700.00 $1,050.00
depos
2/8/2022 Reppert, Wesley 1.1 | Analysis Analysis of census data $700.00 $770.00
2/8/2022 Murray, Makeda 0.4 | Data Gathering & Processing | Send email to W&C re: BSA historical settlements, $635.00 $254.00
provide additional direction to team via email and review
document list from W&C re: same
2/8/2022 Murray, Makeda 0.2 | Project Management Review current case timeline re: confirmation, and team $635.00 $127.00
resource allocation
2/8/2022 Murray, Makeda 0.5 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review and edit claims list for submission to W&C $635.00 $317.50
2/8/2022 Murray, Makeda 0.8 | Analysis Review updates to outstanding analyses re: historical $635.00 $508.00
settlements and Tranche VI
2/8/2022 Murray, Makeda 0.3 | Data Gathering & Processing | Update and send a list of historical settlements and $635.00 $190.50
associated documents to W&C
2/8/2022 Murray, Makeda 0.4 | Analysis Review TCC member list provided by W&C and provide $635.00 $254.00
guidance to team re: analysis
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2/8/2022 Murray, Makeda 0.8 | Communication with Call with W&C re: confirmation with Shepherd, Evans, $635.00 $508.00

Counsel Reppert (left early) and Bates (left early)
2/8/2022 Farrell, Emma 1.8 | Analysis Refine educational and occupation flags for demographic $390.00 $702.00
analysis work stream
2/8/2022 Farrell, Emma 0.5 | Analysis Outline next steps for demographic field refinements and $390.00 $195.00
send to team
2/8/2022 Farrell, Emma 4.0 | Analysis Continue updating educational and occupation flags for $390.00 $1,560.00
demographic analysis
2/8/2022 Saleeby, George 0.3 | Data Gathering & Processing | Complete additional ShareFile requests for counsel $410.00 $123.00
2/8/2022 Dhuri, Yash 1.7 | Data Gathering & Processing | Testing various versions of census data for the wealth $390.00 $663.00
analysis
2/8/2022 Dhuri, Yash 0.8 | Data Gathering & Processing | Reviewing replicate weights and weighting documentation $390.00 $312.00
2/8/2022 Dhuri, Yash 0.5 | Data Gathering & Processing | Editing script to add replicate weights and produce $390.00 $195.00
weighted means for wealth analysis
2/8/2022 Dhuri, Yash 0.2 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review of census data processing and next steps $390.00 $78.00
2/8/2022 Dhuri, Yash 0.9 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review census data summaries and testing results $390.00 $351.00
2/8/2022 Dhuri, Yash 0.8 | Data Gathering & Processing | Work on testing alternate versions of census data $390.00 $312.00
weighting
2/8/2022 Dhuri, Yash 0.9 | Data Gathering & Processing | Reviewing notes and footnotes on census data and testing $390.00 $351.00
additional cuts
2/8/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.5 | Analysis Organizing and analyzing TCC opposing expert back-up $390.00 $195.00
materials
2/8/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.9 | Analysis Analyzing prior sexual abuse cases referenced in opposing $390.00 $351.00
expert testimony
2/8/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.0 | Data Gathering & Processing | Analyzing TCC opposing expert deposition transcripts and $390.00 $390.00
testimony
2/8/2022 Wang, Derrick 2.3 | Analysis Reviewing sexual abuse verdict documents for institutional $390.00 $897.00
liability share analysis
2/8/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.8 | Analysis Analyzing claimant POCs for abuse location and $390.00 $312.00
connection to Scouting
2/8/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.1 | Analysis Updating list of BSA settlement documents previously $390.00 $429.00
produced and Bates-stamped
2/8/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.0 | Analysis Continuing to analyze institutional liability shares in sexual $390.00 $390.00
abuse verdict data
2/8/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.4 | Analysis Analyzing comparable sexual abuse bankruptcy $390.00 $156.00
characteristics
2/9/2022 Bates, Charles 3.2 | Analysis Work on analysis of POCs $1,300.00 $4,160.00
2/9/2022 Bates, Charles 3.8 | Analysis Continue work on analysis of POCs $1,300.00 $4,940.00
2/9/2022 Bates, Charles 2.0 | Analysis Work on analysis of TDP extraordinary claim proposal $1,300.00 $2,600.00
2/9/2022 Bates, Charles 0.5 | Project Management Draft and send project status email re: outstanding analysis $1,300.00 $650.00
refinements
2/9/2022 Brown, Jeffrey 0.5 | Analysis Review updates to the Census wealth data analysis $825.00 $412.50
2/9/2022 Brown, Jeffrey 1.5 | Analysis Analyze SCF wealth data and online interface $825.00 $1,237.50
2/9/2022 Brown, Jeffrey 0.5 | Analysis QC SCF analysis and provide direction to team via email $825.00 $412.50
2/9/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.4 | Communication with Call with Gorsich; Azer; Shepherd; Kim on plan for Bates $825.00 $330.00
Counsel White hearing support
2/9/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.8 | Analysis Review testimony prep materials and send email to team $825.00 $660.00
re: related analysis lines
2/9/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.7 | Analysis Planning around testimony prep and additional materials $825.00 $577.50
collection
2/9/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.1 | Communication with Call with Gorsich $825.00 $82.50
Counsel
2/9/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.3 | Analysis Consideration of most recent request from W&C re $825.00 $247.50
potential findings
2/9/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.1 | Data Gathering & Processing | Email to Jenn Thomas on data question $825.00 $82.50
2/9/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.3 | Analysis Review and rebut TCJC valuation points $825.00 $247.50
2/9/2022 Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Analysis Send email to team re: Bates and Murray dep transcripts $825.00 $165.00
and errata
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2/9/2022 Filipi, Ales 0.3 | Analysis Reviewed supplemental analysis work stream status $925.00 $277.50
2/9/2022 Filipi, Ales 0.2 | Deposition Preparation Provided feedback on POC analysis for McNally $925.00 $185.00
deposition

2/9/2022 Filipi, Ales 1.4 | Deposition Preparation Reviewed McNally deposition and exhibits for potential $925.00 $1,295.00
follow-up

2/9/2022 Filipi, Ales 0.3 | Analysis Provided feedback on analysis of historical settlements $925.00 $277.50

2/9/2022 Filipi, Ales 0.9 | Analysis Outlined further analysis of wealth by educational $925.00 $832.50
attainment

2/9/2022 Reppert, Wesley 2.4 | Analysis Work on analysis of claimant wealth statistics $700.00 $1,680.00

2/9/2022 Reppert, Wesley 0.8 | Analysis Preparing voting summary for Morelli Law at request of $700.00 $560.00
counsel

2/9/2022 Murray, Makeda 0.2 | Analysis Review results of TCC member analysis $635.00 $127.00

2/9/2022 Murray, Makeda 0.8 | Analysis Review historical data updates, Tranche 6 analysis of abuse $635.00 $508.00
location

2/9/2022 Murray, Makeda 1.9 | Fee Request Preparation Work on Nov 2021 fee application $635.00 $1,206.50

2/9/2022 Murray, Makeda 0.6 | Analysis Respond to W&C email re: abuse state and follow-up SOL $635.00 $381.00
questions

2/9/2022 Murray, Makeda 2.8 | Fee Request Preparation Continue working on fee application- November 2021 $635.00 $1,778.00

2/9/2022 Farrell, Emma 3.8 | Analysis QC educational and occupation flags for demographic $390.00 $1,482.00
analysis work stream; summarize results of same

2/9/2022 Farrell, Emma 1.4 | Analysis Perform search for TCC related claims in T6 data $390.00 $546.00

2/9/2022 Farrell, Emma 0.9 | Analysis Outline next steps for lawfirm-specific and demographic $390.00 $351.00
data analyses

2/9/2022 Dhuri, Yash 0.5 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review of census data merge and work on next steps $390.00 $195.00

2/9/2022 Dhuri, Yash 0.2 | Data Gathering & Processing | Reviewing census data table updates $390.00 $78.00

2/9/2022 Dhuri, Yash 1.2 | Data Gathering & Processing | Testing census merge with percentile reductions and $390.00 $468.00
updating script

2/9/2022 Dhuri, Yash 1.5 | Data Gathering & Processing | Creating updated census data output and scripting loop for $390.00 $585.00
age buckets

2/9/2022 Dhuri, Yash 0.3 | Data Gathering & Processing | QC of single-person household comparison and totals by $390.00 $117.00
age

2/9/2022 Dhuri, Yash 0.5 | Analysis Drafting census recreation summary and plans for next $390.00 $195.00
steps

2/9/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.9 | Analysis Analyzing next steps for valuation arguments at $390.00 $351.00
confirmation hearing

2/9/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.2 | Project Management Reviewing case timeline, confirmation hearing schedule $390.00 $78.00
and analysis work plan

2/9/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.5 | Analysis Drafting email to counsel on comparable verdicts and $390.00 $195.00
claims analysis

2/9/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.1 | Analysis Analyzing connection to Scouting fields in POC data $390.00 $429.00

2/9/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.8 | Analysis Updating list of BSA settlement documents for analysis $390.00 $312.00

2/9/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.8 | Analysis Working on analysis of previous sexual abuse cases and $390.00 $702.00
abuser profiles

2/9/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.5 | Analysis Reviewing and analyzing comparable sexual abuse $390.00 $585.00
bankruptcies and settlements

2/9/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.2 | Analysis Continuing to analyze connection to Scouting locations in $390.00 $468.00
claims data

2/9/2022 Wang, Derrick 0.2 | Analysis QC analysis of TCJC and Methodist claims valuation $390.00 $78.00

2/9/2022 Wang, Derrick 1.1 | Analysis QC and review comparable sexual abuse verdicts for $390.00 $429.00
analysis

2/10/2022 | Bates, Charles 2.0 | Analysis Begin review of depo transcript $1,300.00 $2,600.00

2/10/2022 | Bates, Charles 2.5 | Analysis Analyze TCC motion to exclude parts of Bates testimony $1,300.00 $3,250.00

2/10/2022 | Bates, Charles 2.4 | Analysis Analyze motion of Certain Insurers $1,300.00 $3,120.00

2/10/2022 | Bates, Charles 0.9 | Project Management BSA team meeting to review case updates and outstanding $1,300.00 $1,170.00
analyses- Reppert, Brown, Dhuri, Evans, Farrell, Filipi,
Murray, Wang, Xu

2/10/2022 | Brown, Jeffrey 1.0 | Analysis Analyze SCF wealth data using online tool $825.00 $825.00
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2/10/2022 | Brown, Jeffrey 0.9 | Project Management BSA team meeting - Bates, Dhuri, Reppert, Evans, Farrell, $825.00 $742.50
Filipi, Murray, Wang, Xu

2/10/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Project Management Review work stream updates and send email re: next steps $825.00 $165.00
related to confirmation hearing

2/10/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.6 | Communication with Call with Shepherd and Gorsich (dropped early) $825.00 $495.00

Counsel

2/10/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.9 | Project Management BSA working session, case updates and next steps with $825.00 $742.50
Bates, Brown, Dhuri, Farrell, Filipi, Murray, Wang, Xu,
Reppert

2/10/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.4 | Analysis Additional work preparing trial materials $825.00 $330.00

2/10/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.3 | Analysis Organizing analyses for trial support $825.00 $247.50

2/10/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.9 | Project Management Meeting to review case updates and outstanding analyses- $925.00 $832.50
Bates, Brown, Dhuri, Evans, Farrell, Reppert, Murray,
Wang, Xu

2/10/2022 | Filipi, Ales 1.9 | Analysis Completed and QCed summary of McNally's prior cases $925.00 $1,757.50

2/10/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 0.9 | Project Management BSA case update- Bates, Brown, Dhuri, Evans, Farrell, $700.00 $630.00
Filipi, Murray, Wang, Xu

2/10/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 2.4 | Analysis Updating claimant wealth data analysis $700.00 $1,680.00

2/10/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.9 | Project Management BSA weekly meeting - Bates, Brown, Dhuri, Evans, $635.00 $571.50
Farrell, Filipi, Reppert, Wang, Xu

2/10/2022 | Murray, Makeda 2.0 | Fee Request Preparation Prepare the Nov 2021 fee application $635.00 $1,270.00

2/10/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.9 | Fee Request Preparation Continue preparing the Nov 2021 fee application $635.00 $571.50

2/10/2022 | Murray, Makeda 2.9 | Fee Request Preparation Nov 2021 fee application prep (cont'd) $635.00 $1,841.50

2/10/2022 | Farrell, Emma 0.4 | Analysis Outline next steps for merging income data with T6 $390.00 $156.00
demographic fields

2/10/2022 | Farrell, Emma 3.7 | Analysis QC education & occupation flag processing for $390.00 $1,443.00
demographic analysis, contd.

2/10/2022 | Farrell, Emma 1.3 | Analysis Prepare tranche 6 demographic data for merging with $390.00 $507.00
wealth analysis data

2/10/2022 | Farrell, Emma 0.9 | Project Management BSA team meeting - review case developments: Bates, $390.00 $351.00
Brown, Dhuri, Evans, Filipi, Murray, Reppert, Wang, Xu

2/10/2022 | Xu, Alicia 0.9 | Project Management BSA case review of updates and outstanding analyses- $545.00 $490.50
Bates, Brown, Evans, Filipi, Murray, Reppert, Dhuri,
Farrell, and Wang

2/10/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.9 | Project Management BSA team meeting to review case updates and outstanding $390.00 $351.00
analyses- Wang, Bates, Reppert, Evans, Farrell, Filipi,
Murray, Xu, Brown

2/10/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.5 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review of SCF data merge $390.00 $195.00

2/10/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 1.3 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review of SCF data tabulations as well as mean and $390.00 $507.00
median cross tabs

2/10/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.5 | Data Gathering & Processing | QC of different education and age cuts of SCF net worth $390.00 $195.00
data

2/10/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 1.2 | Data Gathering & Processing | Processing SCF data for merge and reshaping mean and $390.00 $468.00
median net worth

2/10/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.0 | Analysis Summarizing previous comparable sexual abuse $390.00 $390.00
settlements and bankruptcies

2/10/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.9 | Project Management Review analyses and prep for confirmation - Bates, Brown, $390.00 $351.00
Dhuri, Evans, Farrell, Filipi, Murray, Reppert, Xu

2/10/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.4 | Analysis Analyzing potential comparable sexual abuse settlements $390.00 $546.00
and bankruptcies for confirmation prep

2/10/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.6 | Analysis Continuing to analyze comparable abuse settlements and $390.00 $624.00
bankruptcies for confirmation prep

2/10/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.6 | Analysis Update summary memo of previous sexual abuse valuation $390.00 $234.00
cases

2/11/2022 | Bates, Charles 0.5 | Analysis Working session with Murray; Filipi; Reppert; Evans $1,300.00 $650.00

2/11/2022 | Bates, Charles 0.7 | Communication with Call with Shepherd; Evans; Filipi; Murray; Reppert re: $1,300.00 $910.00

Counsel plan for potential testimony

2/11/2022 | Bates, Charles 3.8 | Analysis Continue working on POC analysis for supplemental $1,300.00 $4,940.00
reports

2/11/2022 | Brown, Jeffrey 1.0 | Analysis Analyze spreadsheet with SCF wealth and claim data $825.00 $825.00
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2/11/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Project Management Provide email updates to team on implications of $825.00 $165.00

settlement, hearing, and case timing
2/11/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.6 | Analysis Working session with Bates; Murray; Reppert; Filipi $825.00 $495.00
2/11/2022 | Evans, Andrew 1.6 | Analysis Review of materials related to new proposed settlement / $825.00 $1,320.00
plan and consideration of potential impact on valuation
work
2/11/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.7 | Communication with Call on updates to plan for potential testimony with $825.00 $577.50
Counsel Shepherd; Bates; Filipi; Murray; Reppert
2/11/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Analysis Make updates to testimony prep plan $825.00 $165.00
2/11/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.6 | Analysis Team meeting with Bates; Murray; Reppert; Evans $925.00 $555.00
2/11/2022 Filipi, Ales 0.7 | Communication with W&C call re: trial testimony plan- Bates; Evans; Murray; $925.00 $647.50
Counsel Shepherd
2/11/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 0.3 | Analysis BSA team meeting with Murray, Bates, Evans and Filipi $700.00 $210.00
2/11/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 2.1 | Analysis Updating claimant wealth analysis $700.00 $1,470.00
2/11/2022 | Murray, Makeda 1.9 | Fee Request Preparation Continue working on November 2021 fee application $635.00 $1,206.50
2/11/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.7 | Project Management Review case developments, outstanding tasks and $635.00 $444.50
deliverables
2/11/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.7 | Communication with Call with W&C- Shepherd, Bates, Evans, Filipi and $635.00 $444.50
Counsel Reppert
2/11/2022 | Murray, Makeda 1.9 | Fee Request Preparation Nov 2021 fee application prep $635.00 $1,206.50
2/11/2022 | Farrell, Emma 0.4 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review recent docket filings $390.00 $156.00
2/11/2022 | Farrell, Emma 0.4 | Analysis Outline next steps for wealth analysis work stream $390.00 $156.00
2/11/2022 | Farrell, Emma 2.2 | Analysis Merge wealth categorization data and Claro valuation data $390.00 $858.00
to tranche data; summarize results of same
2/11/2022 | Farrell, Emma 1.7 | Deposition Preparation Review Murray deposition transcript $390.00 $663.00
2/11/2022 | Saleeby, George 0.7 | Data Gathering & Processing | Communications and tasks with/from counsel involving $410.00 $287.00
ShareFile administration
2/11/2022 | Xu, Alicia 0.2 | Analysis Review news related to the case $545.00 $109.00
2/11/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.4 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review of SCF POC wealth data merge and next steps $390.00 $156.00
2/11/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 1.4 | Data Gathering & Processing | Updating processing and reshaping of SCF net worth $390.00 $546.00
values by buckets
2/11/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.8 | Data Gathering & Processing | Updating processing of T6 variables and creating merged $390.00 $312.00
dataset
2/11/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.3 | Data Gathering & Processing | QC of updated wealth data reshape and review of figures $390.00 $117.00
2/11/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.6 | Data Gathering & Processing | Merging T6 data and valuation with census data by buckets $390.00 $234.00
2/11/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.8 | Data Gathering & Processing | Reviewing non-matching buckets and adjusting flags for $390.00 $312.00
wealth data merge
2/11/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.0 | Analysis Reviewing BSA docket filings and confirmation prep $390.00 $390.00
2/11/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.9 | Analysis Analyzing comparable bankruptcies and settlements for $390.00 $741.00
institutional share
2/11/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.9 | Analysis Analyzing opposing objections and motions re: expert $390.00 $351.00
reports
2/11/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.2 | Analysis Continuing to analyze objections to BW rebuttal and $390.00 $468.00
supplemental reports
2/11/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.6 | Analysis Continuing to update institutional liability share in $390.00 $624.00
potential comparable settlements
2/11/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.9 | Analysis QC summary memo of comparable abuse settlements for $390.00 $351.00
confirmation prep
2/12/2022 | Bates, Charles 2.5 | Analysis Analyze hearing transcript $1,300.00 $3,250.00
2/12/2022 | Bates, Charles 1.4 | Analysis Review term sheet $1,300.00 $1,820.00
2/12/2022 | Murray, Makeda 2.6 | Fee Request Preparation Finalize Nov 2021 fee application $635.00 $1,651.00
2/13/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.9 | Fee Request Preparation Prepare and send Nov 2021 fee application to MNAT $635.00 $571.50
2/13/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.5 | Fee Request Preparation Prepare fee detail workbook for Examiner Rucki $635.00 $317.50
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2/14/2022 | Bates, Charles 0.5 | Project Management BSA team meeting- Evans, Farrell, Murray, Reppert, $1,300.00 $650.00
Shipp, Wang, Xu

2/14/2022 | Bates, Charles 1.5 | Analysis Work on wealth analysis $1,300.00 $1,950.00

2/14/2022 | Bates, Charles 3.5 | Analysis Work on analysis of education data $1,300.00 $4,550.00

2/14/2022 | Brown, Jeffrey 0.5 | Analysis Analyze wealth data in summary spreadsheets $825.00 $412.50

2/14/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.5 | Project Management BSA weekly case update- Bates, Farrell, Shipp, Wang, $825.00 $412.50
Murray, Reppert, Xu

2/14/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Analysis Follow-up on new valuation request $825.00 $165.00

2/14/2022 | Evans, Andrew 1.7 | Analysis Reading hearing transcript and related materials as part of $825.00 $1,402.50
testimony prep

2/14/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.2 | Analysis Provided email guidance to the team on updating $925.00 $185.00
settlement data

2/14/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 0.5 | Project Management BSA meeting- Bates, Evans, Farrell, Murray, Shipp, Wang, $700.00 $350.00
Xu

2/14/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 1.2 | Analysis Updating claimant wealth analysis $700.00 $840.00

2/14/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 2.1 | Analysis Preparing potential CO voting summary tables at request of $700.00 $1,470.00
counsel

2/14/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.5 | Project Management BSA weekly meeting- Bates, Reppert, Evans, Farrell, $635.00 $317.50
Shipp, Wang, Xu

2/14/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.4 | Fee Request Preparation Review Rucki report (Fifth Quarterly) $635.00 $254.00

2/14/2022 | Murray, Makeda 1.3 | Fee Request Preparation Prepare Sixth quarterly interim fee application $635.00 $825.50

2/14/2022 | Farrell, Emma 1.2 | Analysis QC wealth & demographic analysis output $390.00 $468.00

2/14/2022 | Farrell, Emma 1.5 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review hearing transcript & recent docket filings $390.00 $585.00

2/14/2022 | Farrell, Emma 0.5 | Project Management BSA team meeting - review case deadlines and ongoing $390.00 $195.00
workstreams. Attended by Bates, Evans, Murray, Reppert,
Shipp, Wang, Xu

2/14/2022 | Farrell, Emma 2.5 | Analysis Generate CO voting tabulations per counsel request $390.00 $975.00

2/14/2022 | Xu, Alicia 0.5 | Project Management BSA team meeting- Bates, Evans, Murray, Reppert, Shipp, $545.00 $272.50
Farrell, and Wang

2/14/2022 | Xu, Alicia 0.3 | Analysis Read Terms of Settlement (case document) $545.00 $163.50

2/14/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.8 | Analysis Updating abuser count in potential comparable abuse case $390.00 $312.00
spreadsheet

2/14/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.6 | Analysis Updating institutional liability info in comparable abuse $390.00 $234.00
settlement analysis

2/14/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.5 | Project Management BSA case update meeting - Bates, Evans, Farrell, Murray, $390.00 $195.00
Reppert, Shipp, Xu

2/14/2022 | Wang, Derrick 2.5 | Data Gathering & Processing | Updating settlement documents for allegations and abuser $390.00 $975.00
names in BSA historical data

2/14/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.7 | Data Gathering & Processing | Reviewing BSA settlement documents to update historical $390.00 $663.00
settlements data

2/14/2022 | Wang, Derrick 2.4 | Data Gathering & Processing | Continuing to review BSA historical settlement documents $390.00 $936.00
for data updates

2/14/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.0 | Data Gathering & Processing | Continuing to update BSA settlements data with document $390.00 $390.00
links

2/15/2022 | Bates, Charles 3.0 | Analysis Analyze updated Trust Distribution Plan $1,300.00 $3,900.00

2/15/2022 | Bates, Charles 3.5 | Analysis Continue working on POC analysis $1,300.00 $4,550.00

2/15/2022 | Bates, Charles 0.5 | Project Management Review proposed case scheduling and analysis updates- $1,300.00 $650.00
Evans, Filipi, Murray, Reppert, Wang

2/15/2022 | Bates, Charles 1.3 | Communication with Working session on plan for trial testimony and related $1,300.00 $1,690.00

Counsel support including declaration with Reppert; Evans;

Gorsich; Murray; Shepherd

2/15/2022 | Bates, Charles 1.2 | Analysis Work on education analysis $1,300.00 $1,560.00
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2/15/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Project Management Organize list of outstanding tasks in prep for new trial $825.00 $165.00

timeline
2/15/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.6 | Analysis Call with Azer; Hammond; Hanke; Gorsich; Taylor; Kim; $825.00 $495.00
Baccash; Klauck on identification of subsets of Catholic
claims (joined the group late)
2/15/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.3 | Analysis Follow-up on continued data review $825.00 $247.50
2/15/2022 | Evans, Andrew 1.3 | Communication with Meeting with W&C re: trial testimony and support - $825.00 $1,072.50
Counsel Reppert; Bates; Gorsich; Murray; Shepherd
2/15/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.5 | Project Management Review analysis updates with team - Bates, Filipi, Murray, $825.00 $412.50
Reppert, Wang
2/15/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.4 | Analysis Additional organization of analysis and prep related to $825.00 $330.00
confirmation hearing declaration
2/15/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.7 | Analysis Review analysis of Catholic claims and provide input to $825.00 $577.50
Lauria, Azer, and W&C team on same for use in
confirmation hearing
2/15/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.5 | Project Management BSA meeting to review analysis updates- Bates, Evans, $925.00 $462.50
Murray, Reppert, Wang
2/15/2022 | Filipi, Ales 1.2 | Analysis Reviewed updates to comparables and settlements $925.00 $1,110.00
2/15/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.5 | Analysis Outlined additional Abuse Claims data analysis $925.00 $462.50
2/15/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 0.5 | Project Management Team review of proposed case scheduling and other $700.00 $350.00
updates- Bates, Evans, Filipi, Murray, Wang
2/15/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 1.3 | Communication with W&C call re: trial testimony plan and anticipated support $700.00 $910.00
Counsel work- Attended by Bates; Evans; Gorsich; Murray;
Shepherd
2/15/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 1.4 | Analysis Updating claimant education status for wealth analysis $700.00 $980.00
2/15/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 2.3 | Analysis Preparing CO voting tabulations per request from counsel $700.00 $1,610.00
2/15/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 1.2 | Analysis Searching POC data for exemplar Catholic claims $700.00 $840.00
2/15/2022 | Murray, Makeda 2.0 | Fee Request Preparation Continue preparing the Sixth interim fee application $635.00 $1,270.00
2/15/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.5 | Project Management Team update to review case scheduling and analysis status- $635.00 $317.50
Bates, Evans, Filipi, Reppert, Wang
2/15/2022 | Murray, Makeda 1.3 | Communication with Call with W&C- Gorsich, Shepherd, Bates, Evans, Reppert $635.00 $825.50
Counsel
2/15/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.4 | Fee Request Preparation Continue working on interim fee application (May-July $635.00 $254.00
2021)
2/15/2022 | Farrell, Emma 2.9 | Analysis QC CO voting tabulations $390.00 $1,131.00
2/15/2022 | Farrell, Emma 2.5 | Analysis Generate CO voting tabulations per counsel request $390.00 $975.00
2/15/2022 | Farrell, Emma 0.4 | Analysis Prepare claim-level education field translation table $390.00 $156.00
2/15/2022 | Farrell, Emma 1.5 | Analysis Review preliminary results of wealth / demographic $390.00 $585.00
analysis and outline next steps for same
2/15/2022 | Xu, Alicia 0.3 | Analysis Review new data analysis request $545.00 $163.50
2/15/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 1.2 | Analysis Review of wealth analysis merge and doctoral updates $390.00 $468.00
2/15/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 1.6 | Data Gathering & Processing | Creating and updating translation table for selected $390.00 $624.00
education fields
2/15/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 1.4 | Data Gathering & Processing | Research and review of potential comparables settlement $390.00 $546.00
dates and updates
2/15/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.5 | Project Management Review updates to case timeline and analyses - Bates, $390.00 $195.00
Evans, Filipi, Murray, Reppert
2/15/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.9 | Analysis Updating comparable abuse settlement and bankruptcy $390.00 $351.00
summary table
2/15/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.4 | Analysis Organizing and analyzing settlement and complaint $390.00 $546.00
documents for BSA historical data
2/15/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.8 | Analysis QC analysis of updated allegation and abuser names in $390.00 $702.00
historical settlements data
2/15/2022 | Wang, Derrick 2.0 | Analysis Updating scripts to update abuser frequencies based on $390.00 $780.00
settlement document info
2/15/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.2 | Analysis Summarizing settlement averages by allegation and abuser $390.00 $78.00
category in historical settlements
2/15/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.6 | Analysis Continuing to update abuser claim frequencies in historical $390.00 $624.00
settlement data
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2/15/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.9 | Analysis QC updated abuser claim counts based on settlement $390.00 $351.00
document manual review

2/16/2022 | Bates, Charles 0.7 | Analysis Meeting to discuss hearing testimony and work stream $1,300.00 $910.00
updates (Filipi, Reppert, Murray, Evans)

2/16/2022 | Bates, Charles 3.3 | Analysis Continue reviewing the education analysis $1,300.00 $4,290.00

2/16/2022 | Bates, Charles 1.0 | Analysis Work on testimony prep $1,300.00 $1,300.00

2/16/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.3 | Analysis Send follow-up email re: Catholic claims analysis $825.00 $247.50

2/16/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Project Management Review trial logistics and plan for BW participation $825.00 $165.00

2/16/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.3 | Data Gathering & Processing | Provide input on proposal for potential data use in abuse $825.00 $247.50
research

2/16/2022 | Evans, Andrew 1.4 | Analysis Review supporting analysis of 9 claims; checking methods $825.00 $1,155.00
for attempting to identify Charter Org group for said claims

2/16/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.4 | Analysis Review of filings and materials related to BW work as part $825.00 $330.00
of trial prep

2/16/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.5 | Analysis Meeting to discuss hearing testimony and work stream $825.00 $412.50
updates with Filipi, Bates, Reppert, and Murray --
dropped early

2/16/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.1 | Project Management BSA team meeting (joined late) - Dhuri, Farrell, Murray, $925.00 $92.50
Reppert, Shipp, Wang, Xu

2/16/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.7 | Analysis Meeting to review work stream updates (Bates, Reppert, $925.00 $647.50
Murray, Evans)
2/16/2022 | Filipi, Ales 1.5 | Analysis Prepared argument for using Abuse Claims data in research $925.00 $1,387.50
2/16/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.7 | Analysis Reviewed TDP modifications for confirmation hearing $925.00 $647.50
preparation
2/16/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 0.7 | Analysis Update meeting to discuss hearing testimony and case $700.00 $490.00
updates (Filipi, Bates, Murray, Evans)

2/16/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 0.3 | Project Management BSA team meeting- Filipi, Murray, Dhuri, Farrell, Shipp, $700.00 $210.00
Wang, Xu

2/16/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 1.1 | Analysis Updating POC data for wealth analysis $700.00 $770.00

2/16/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 2.9 | Analysis Responding to requests from counsel re Class 9 voting data $700.00 $2,030.00

2/16/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.3 | Project Management Weekly team meeting- Dhuri, Farrell, Reppert, Shipp, $635.00 $190.50
Wang, Xu, Filipi (joined late)

2/16/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.9 | Fee Request Preparation Finalize and submit Sixth interim fee application; review $635.00 $571.50
MNAT edits and confirm via email

2/16/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.9 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review Murray deposition transcript $635.00 $571.50

2/16/2022 | Murray, Makeda 1.0 | Analysis Review Catholic request from counsel, provide direction to $635.00 $635.00
team and follow up with counsel re: response via email

2/16/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.6 | Analysis Review case updates and outstanding analysis $635.00 $381.00
updates/questions from team - Reppert, Filipi, Bates. Evans
and Murray left early

2/16/2022 | Farrell, Emma 1.0 | Analysis QC education field translation table & implement wealth $390.00 $390.00
demographic field refinements

2/16/2022 | Farrell, Emma 0.3 | Project Management BSA team meeting - updates on case timeline and ongoing $390.00 $117.00
work streams- Dhuri, Filipi (joined late), Murray, Reppert,
Shipp, Wang, Xu

2/16/2022 | Farrell, Emma 0.9 | Analysis QC Chartering organization counts in tabulation provided $390.00 $351.00
by counsel

2/16/2022 | Farrell, Emma 1.1 | Analysis QC abuser frequency confirmation fields in historical $390.00 $429.00
settlements data

2/16/2022 | Farrell, Emma 0.9 | Analysis Merge translated education fields to T6 $390.00 $351.00
wealth/demographic analysis dataset

2/16/2022 | Saleeby, George 0.4 | Data Gathering & Processing | Complete ShareFile requests for counsel $410.00 $164.00

2/16/2022 | Xu, Alicia 0.3 | Project Management BSA meeting- Filipi (joined late), Murray, Reppert, Shipp, $545.00 $163.50
Dhuri, Farrell, and Wang

2/16/2022 | Xu, Alicia 2.2 | Analysis Write memo about research benefits for the claims data $545.00 $1,199.00

2/16/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.3 | Project Management BSA team meeting- Reppert, Farrell, Filipi (joined late), $390.00 $117.00
Wang, Xu, Murray, Shipp

2/16/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.5 | Analysis Review of wealth data education updates and next steps $390.00 $195.00

2/16/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.5 | Data Gathering & Processing | Continue refining the wealth analysis $390.00 $195.00
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2/16/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 1.3 | Data Gathering & Processing | Updating wealth analysis translation table and summary $390.00 $507.00
output

2/16/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.8 | Data Gathering & Processing | Merge updated wealth analysis to POC data $390.00 $312.00

2/16/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.6 | Analysis Updating wealth data processing for additional $390.00 $234.00
categorizations and updating output

2/16/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.7 | Analysis QC of wealth data merge and updated translation merge $390.00 $273.00

2/16/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.3 | Project Management BSA case update- Dhuri, Farrell, Filipi (joined late), $390.00 $117.00
Murray, Reppert, Shipp, Xu

2/16/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.4 | Analysis Reviewing updated BSA historical settlement averages and $390.00 $156.00
statistics

2/16/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.3 | Analysis Continuing to review updated BSA historical settlement $390.00 $117.00
averages

2/16/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.8 | Analysis Updating BSA historical settlements abuser frequency $390.00 $702.00
fields

2/16/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.6 | Analysis Review and QC scripts for updating BSA historical $390.00 $624.00
settlements data

2/16/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.0 | Data Gathering & Processing | Reviewing BSA hearing transcripts and court filings $390.00 $390.00

2/16/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.4 | Analysis Analyzing BSA historical settlement documents and $390.00 $546.00
available data

2/16/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.1 | Analysis QC manual review of BSA historical settlement documents $390.00 $429.00

2/17/2022 | Bates, Charles 0.7 | Project Management Review status updates on analyses for supplemental report $1,300.00 $910.00

2/17/2022 | Bates, Charles 1.3 | Analysis Work on testimony prep $1,300.00 $1,690.00

2/17/2022 | Bates, Charles 3.5 | Analysis Review testimony prep materials compiled by the team $1,300.00 $4,550.00

2/17/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.1 | Project Management Make updates to confirmation hearing support work plan $825.00 $82.50

2/17/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.3 | Communication with Call with David Kim; Gigante; Doah Kim; Baccash; $825.00 $247.50

Counsel Warner (dropped early)

2/17/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.3 | Analysis QC of identification of Catholic claim in Class 9 data $825.00 $247.50

2/17/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.5 | Analysis Review Bates affirmative testimony support $825.00 $412.50

2/17/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.5 | Analysis Developed potential confirmation hearing arguments $925.00 $462.50

2/17/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 0.9 | Analysis Analysis of potential Catholic voting claims for Class 9 $700.00 $630.00

2/17/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 1.2 | Analysis Review Murray depo transcript errata $700.00 $840.00

2/17/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 0.5 | Analysis Responding to requests from counsel re updated LC/CO $700.00 $350.00
voting report

2/17/2022 | Murray, Makeda 2.4 | Data Gathering & Processing | Continue reviewing Murray depo transcript and making $635.00 $1,524.00
notes re: same

2/17/2022 | Murray, Makeda 2.2 | Data Gathering & Processing | Fill out errata for Murray deposition $635.00 $1,397.00

2/17/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.5 | Fee Request Preparation Dec 2021 fee application preparation $635.00 $317.50

2/17/2022 | Murray, Makeda 1.0 | Data Gathering & Processing | Finalize and send errata for Murray deposition transcript $635.00 $635.00

2/17/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.6 | Analysis Review education/wealth analysis $635.00 $381.00

2/17/2022 | Farrell, Emma 0.8 | Analysis QC items on Murray transcript errata list $390.00 $312.00

2/17/2022 | Saleeby, George 0.3 | Data Gathering & Processing | Work on ShareFile requests from W&C $410.00 $123.00

2/17/2022 | Xu, Alicia 0.5 | Analysis Review updated memo re: academic benefits of claims data $545.00 $272.50

2/17/2022 | Xu, Alicia 0.2 | Analysis Check claims data about the information mentioned in the $545.00 $109.00
memo on academic benefits

2/17/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.5 | Data Gathering & Processing | Reviewing dates and sources for potential abuse $390.00 $195.00
comparables

2/17/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.5 | Analysis Review deduplication process for Tranche VI POC data $390.00 $195.00

2/17/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.4 | Analysis QC errata sheet for data expert deposition $390.00 $156.00

2/17/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.1 | Analysis Analyzing amended BSA Chapter 11 bankruptcy plan and $390.00 $429.00
related filings

2/17/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.9 | Analysis Analyzing insurer motions and objections re: expert reports $390.00 $351.00
and testimony

2/17/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.0 | Analysis Analyzing updated settlement agreements and terms sheets $390.00 $390.00
for confirmation
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2/17/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.8 | Data Gathering & Processing | Reviewing BSA hearing transcripts and related court $390.00 $312.00
docket filings

2/17/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.4 | Analysis Reviewing additional BSA historical settlement documents $390.00 $156.00

2/18/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Project Management Revise work plan and email team based on new $825.00 $165.00
confirmation hearing timing

2/18/2022 | Saleeby, George 0.6 | Data Gathering & Processing | Complete data checks of the local council data for White & $410.00 $246.00
Case

2/18/2022 | Xu, Alicia 0.3 | Analysis Read the updated document for academic benefits of the $545.00 $163.50
Abuse Claims dataset

2/18/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.3 | Data Gathering & Processing | Reviewing and saving additional claimant letters $390.00 $117.00

2/20/2022 | Evans, Andrew 1.3 | Analysis Call with Azer; Martin; DuBose; Shepherd; Hanke; Green; $825.00 $1,072.50
Hammond; Hershey

2/21/2022 | Bates, Charles 1.4 | Analysis Supplemental report analysis discussion with Evans, Filipi $1,300.00 $1,820.00
and Murray

2/21/2022 | Bates, Charles 2.5 | Analysis Review hearing transcripts $1,300.00 $3,250.00

2/21/2022 | Bates, Charles 2.7 | Analysis Review and annotate most recent proposed TDP $1,300.00 $3,510.00

2/21/2022 | Bates, Charles 0.5 | Analysis Consider need for potential second Bates supplemental $1,300.00 $650.00
report and economic incentives of claimants - Evans,
Murray & Filipi

2/21/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.5 | Analysis Meeting with Bates, Murray and Filipi to evaluate need for $825.00 $412.50
second supplemental report

2/21/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.4 | Analysis Development of outline for potential Bates second $825.00 $330.00
supplemental

2/21/2022 | Evans, Andrew 1.6 | Analysis Evaluation of potential Individual Review claim scenarios $825.00 $1,320.00

2/21/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.5 | Analysis Considering potential scope of opinions for supplemental $825.00 $412.50
report

2/21/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.8 | Analysis Re-evaluation of TDP documents related to Individual $825.00 $660.00
Review payment scenarios

2/21/2022 | Evans, Andrew 1.1 | Analysis Consideration of modified plan, TDP, and related $825.00 $907.50
documents

2/21/2022 | Evans, Andrew 1.4 | Analysis Working session with Bates, Filipi, and Murray on $825.00 $1,155.00
potential supplemental opinions in light of Individual
Review updates to TDP

2/21/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.5 | Analysis Meeting to discuss the need for a second supplemental $925.00 $462.50
report- Bates, Evans, Murray

2/21/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.9 | Analysis Reviewed TDP independent review option $925.00 $832.50

2/21/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.2 | Analysis Analyzed TDP and Claro valuations $925.00 $185.00

2/21/2022 | Filipi, Ales 1.4 | Analysis Meeting to develop potential arguments for second $925.00 $1,295.00
supplemental report- Bates, Evans, Murray

2/21/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.5 | Project Management Review updates to case timelines, new requests and $635.00 $317.50
outstanding deliverables

2/21/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.4 | Fee Request Preparation Preparation of Dec 2021 fee application $635.00 $254.00

2/21/2022 | Murray, Makeda 1.4 | Analysis Meeting with Bates, Evans and Filipi to discuss $635.00 $889.00
supplemental report and review exemplars for Trust
distributions

2/21/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.5 | Analysis Meeting to discuss plan for potential second supplemental $635.00 $317.50
report from Bates and claimant economic incentives-
Bates, Evans and Filipi

2/21/2022 | Xu, Alicia 2.7 | Data Gathering & Processing | Read Bates deposition transcript $545.00 $1,471.50

2/21/2022 | Xu, Alicia 1.3 | Data Gathering & Processing | Continue to read Bates deposition transcript $545.00 $708.50

2/21/2022 | Xu, Alicia 0.5 | Analysis Review the analysis that compares the Claro valuation and $545.00 $272.50
Bates valuation

2/21/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 1.3 | Data Gathering & Processing | Reviewing Bates deposition transcript $390.00 $507.00

2/21/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.4 | Data Gathering & Processing | Reviewing BSA hearing transcript and updated $390.00 $546.00
confirmation schedule

2/21/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.2 | Analysis Analyzing key objections and motions in BSA docket $390.00 $468.00
filings

2/21/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.5 | Analysis Reviewing Bates deposition transcript for errata $390.00 $585.00

2/21/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.8 | Analysis Continuing to review Bates deposition for errata sheet $390.00 $702.00
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2/21/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.0 | Analysis Summarizing errata in Bates deposition transcript $390.00 $390.00
2/21/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.7 | Analysis Reviewing modified BSA reorganization plan and redline $390.00 $273.00
edits

2/22/2022 | Bates, Charles 1.6 | Communication with Call with W&C re: TDP modifications- Gorsich; Shepherd; $1,300.00 $2,080.00

Counsel Evans

2/22/2022 | Bates, Charles 3.4 | Analysis Review and analyze potential TDP and reorganization $1,300.00 $4,420.00
plan, and its implications

2/22/2022 | Bates, Charles 3.5 | Report Preparation Work on Supplemental report $1,300.00 $4,550.00

2/22/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.4 | Analysis Additional consideration of potential implications of IR $825.00 $330.00
process

2/22/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Analysis Provide information via email to Hammond on scope of $825.00 $165.00
BW work related to indirect abuse claims

2/22/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.7 | Analysis Additional analysis of potential Individual Review $825.00 $577.50
payment scenarios

2/22/2022 | Evans, Andrew 1.6 | Communication with Call with Gorsich; Shepherd; Bates on implications of TDP $825.00 $1,320.00

Counsel modifications

2/22/2022 | Evans, Andrew 2.4 | Analysis Continue outlining the implications of Individual Review $825.00 $1,980.00
process on TDPs

2/22/2022 | Evans, Andrew 1.0 | Analysis Continued work on potential TDP IR scenario modeling $825.00 $825.00

2/22/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.8 | Analysis Work on drafting supplemental report $825.00 $660.00

2/22/2022 | Filipi, Ales 1.0 | Analysis Developed potential arguments for second supplemental $925.00 $925.00
report

2/22/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 1.0 | Analysis Analysis of TDP updates re independent review provision $700.00 $700.00

2/22/2022 | Murray, Makeda 2.0 | Fee Request Preparation Work on December 2021 fee application $635.00 $1,270.00

2/22/2022 | Murray, Makeda 1.2 | Analysis Review the supplemental TDP analysis and IR $635.00 $762.00
process/modifications

2/22/2022 | Farrell, Emma 1.6 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review hearing transcript $390.00 $624.00

2/22/2022 | Xu, Alicia 3.6 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review and QC the deposition transcript for Dr. Bates $545.00 $1,962.00

2/22/2022 | Xu, Alicia 3.1 | Data Gathering & Processing | Continue to review the deposition transcript for Dr. Bates $545.00 $1,689.50

2/22/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.5 | Data Gathering & Processing | Reviewing deposition transcript $390.00 $195.00

2/22/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.7 | Analysis Preparing errata sheet for Bates deposition $390.00 $663.00

2/22/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.7 | Analysis Review analyses from Bates estimation reports $390.00 $273.00

2/22/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.6 | Analysis QC and update errata for Bates deposition transcript $390.00 $624.00

2/22/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.2 | Analysis Continue to update errata sheet for Bates deposition $390.00 $468.00
transcript

2/22/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.9 | Data Gathering & Processing | Reviewing BSA updated court docket filings and related $390.00 $741.00
articles

2/23/2022 | Bates, Charles 3.0 | Analysis Work on Extraordinary Plan claim analysis $1,300.00 $3,900.00

2/23/2022 | Bates, Charles 3.7 | Report Preparation Continue drafting supplemental report $1,300.00 $4,810.00

2/23/2022 | Bates, Charles 1.3 | Analysis Discussion of supplemental report re: Extraordinary $1,300.00 $1,690.00
Claims - Evans, Filipi, Murray, Reppert. (I left early)

2/23/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.1 | Project Management Send email to White & Case on plan for trial support $825.00 $82.50

2/23/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Analysis Updates to supplemental report draft $825.00 $165.00

2/23/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.3 | Analysis Additional work on draft supplemental report $825.00 $247.50

2/23/2022 | Evans, Andrew 1.4 | Analysis Meeting to discuss the supplemental report & $825.00 $1,155.00
Extraordinary Claims - Bates (left early), Filipi, Murray,
Reppert

2/23/2022 | Evans, Andrew 1.8 | Analysis Refine potential TDP payment scenarios and comparisons $825.00 $1,485.00
to prior TDP

2/23/2022 Evans, Andrew 1.7 | Analysis Continued work on TDP scenarios and updates to $825.00 $1,402.50
supplemental report write-up related to same

2/23/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.5 | Deposition Preparation Reviewed Bates deposition errata $925.00 $462.50

2/23/2022 | Filipi, Ales 2.2 | Analysis Analyzed effects of independent review $925.00 $2,035.00

2/23/2022 | Filipi, Ales 1.4 | Analysis Discussion of Extraordinary Claims supplemental report- $925.00 $1,295.00
Evans, Murray, Reppert, Bates (left early)
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2/23/2022 | Filipi, Ales 2.0 | Analysis Worked on supplemental report regarding extraordinary $925.00 $1,850.00
claims

2/23/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 2.0 | Analysis Analysis of extraordinary review claim process $700.00 $1,400.00

2/23/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 1.4 | Analysis Meeting to discuss supplemental report & Extraordinary $700.00 $980.00
Claims - Bates (left early), Evans, Filipi, Murray

2/23/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 2.5 | Analysis Analysis of historical settlement claims data $700.00 $1,750.00

2/23/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 0.7 | Report Preparation Continue working on supplemental report exposition $700.00 $490.00

2/23/2022 | Murray, Makeda 1.4 | Analysis Meeting to review Extraordinary Claims supplemental $635.00 $889.00
report - Bates (left early), Evans, Filipi, Reppert

2/23/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.5 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review team questions re: SOL-related documents $635.00 $317.50
produced in our report submissions

2/23/2022 | Murray, Makeda 2.6 | Fee Request Preparation Preparation of Dec 2021 fee application $635.00 $1,651.00

2/23/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.2 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review errata for Bates deposition $635.00 $127.00

2/23/2022 | Murray, Makeda 1.8 | Analysis Review model for TDP Extraordinary Review $635.00 $1,143.00

2/23/2022 | Murray, Makeda 1.3 | Analysis Additional QC of Extraordinary review model $635.00 $825.50

2/23/2022 | Murray, Makeda 1.3 | Fee Request Preparation Work on Dec 2021 fee application $635.00 $825.50

2/23/2022 | Farrell, Emma 0.8 | Analysis Review TDP SOL assignment documentation $390.00 $312.00

2/23/2022 | Xu, Alicia 1.9 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review Bates deposition transcript $545.00 $1,035.50

2/23/2022 | Xu, Alicia 1.8 | Analysis Summarize notes for Bates deposition transcript $545.00 $981.00

2/23/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.2 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review of additional claimant letters $390.00 $78.00

2/24/2022 | Bates, Charles 0.2 | Project Management Team meeting re: case updates and next steps: Dhuri, $1,300.00 $260.00
Evans, Farrell, Filipi, Murray, Reppert, Wang and Xu. I
left early.

2/24/2022 | Bates, Charles 3.5 | Report Preparation Revise supplemental report $1,300.00 $4,550.00

2/24/2022 | Bates, Charles 3.7 | Report Preparation Continue work on supplemental report drafting $1,300.00 $4,810.00

2/24/2022 | Bates, Charles 2.6 | Report Preparation Continue editing supplemental report $1,300.00 $3,380.00

2/24/2022 Bates, Charles 1.5 | Analysis Work on TDP analysis $1,300.00 $1,950.00

2/24/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.3 | Project Management BSA team meeting: Bates (left early), Dhuri, Farrell, Filipi, $825.00 $247.50
Murray, Reppert, Wang and Xu

2/24/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.4 | Analysis Work on analysis comparing abuse claims to indirect $825.00 $330.00
claims

2/24/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.5 | Analysis Additional work on supplemental report exposition $825.00 $412.50

2/24/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.6 | Analysis Refine supplemental simulation and related exposition $825.00 $495.00

2/24/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.3 | Analysis Further development of outline for hearing analysis $825.00 $247.50

2/24/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Project Management Provide budgeting and spend review information to client $825.00 $165.00

2/24/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.5 | Analysis Additional work on draft supplemental report $825.00 $412.50

2/24/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.9 | Analysis Call with Azer; Kurtz; Martin; Ruggieri; Shepherd; $825.00 $742.50
Gorsich

2/24/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.3 | Analysis Reviewed supplemental draft report $925.00 $277.50

2/24/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.3 | Project Management Weekly case update: Dhuri, Evans, Farrell, Murray, $925.00 $277.50
Reppert, Wang and Xu. Bates left early.

2/24/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 0.3 | Project Management BSA weekly case update: Bates (left early), Farrell, Filipi, $700.00 $210.00
Dhuri, Evans, Murray, Wang and Xu

2/24/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 1.4 | Analysis Working on excess insurance simulation for supplemental $700.00 $980.00
report

2/24/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 1.2 | Analysis Preparing LC voting report tabulation at request of counsel $700.00 $840.00

2/24/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.3 | Project Management Team meeting re: case updates: Dhuri, Evans, Farrell, $635.00 $190.50
Filipi, Murray, Reppert, Wang and Xu. Bates (left early)

2/24/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.6 | Fee Request Preparation Review and update Bates White professional fee forecast $635.00 $381.00
from A&M; send email response re: same

2/24/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.2 | Project Management Review outstanding task updates and team resource $635.00 $127.00
allocation

2/24/2022 | Murray, Makeda 1.2 | Analysis Review chartered org claims identification request from $635.00 $762.00
W&C, provide direction to team re: execution and send
email response to W&C
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2/24/2022 | Murray, Makeda 1.6 | Fee Request Preparation Continue preparing the December 2021 fee application $635.00 $1,016.00
2/24/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.4 | Communication with Call with J. Green (W&C) $635.00 $254.00

Counsel

2/24/2022 | Murray, Makeda 1.5 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review Murray errata sheet questions from W&C and $635.00 $952.50
make updates

2/24/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.6 | Analysis Review email update from team re: CO claims $635.00 $381.00
identification request

2/24/2022 | Farrell, Emma 0.3 | Project Management Team meeting re: deliverable timing updates and next $390.00 $117.00
steps. Attended by Bates (left early), Dhuri, Evans, Filipi,
Murray, Reppert, Wang and Xu

2/24/2022 | Farrell, Emma 3.1 | Analysis Analyze list of chartered organizations in preparation for $390.00 $1,209.00
Tranche data search

2/24/2022 | Saleeby, George 0.5 | Data Gathering & Processing | Complete ShareFile requests for counsel $410.00 $205.00

2/24/2022 | Xu, Alicia 0.3 | Project Management Team meeting re: case updates and next steps: Bates (left $545.00 $163.50
early), Evans, Filipi, Murray, Reppert, Dhuri, Farrell, and
Wang

2/24/2022 | Xu, Alicia 0.5 | Analysis Update memo on Bates deposition transcript $545.00 $272.50

2/24/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 1.3 | Data Gathering & Processing | Update chartering org data processing and review merge $390.00 $507.00
with POC

2/24/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.2 | Data Gathering & Processing | Downloading and reviewing additional claimant letters $390.00 $78.00

2/24/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.6 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review of chartering org claimant counts $390.00 $234.00

2/24/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.3 | Project Management Team meeting -Bates (left early), Evans, Farrell, Filipi, $390.00 $117.00
Murray, Reppert, Wang and Xu

2/24/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.5 | Data Gathering & Processing | Reviewing historical settlements figures updates $390.00 $195.00

2/24/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.6 | Analysis QC updated errata sheet for Bates deposition transcript $390.00 $234.00

2/24/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.3 | Project Management Review next steps and trial prep: Bates (left early), Dhuri, $390.00 $117.00
Evans, Farrell, Filipi, Murray, Reppert and Xu

2/24/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.5 | Analysis Analyzing and standardizing list of opt-out Chartered $390.00 $585.00
Organizations

2/24/2022 | Wang, Derrick 0.8 | Analysis Identifying and analyzing claims associated with opt-out $390.00 $312.00
Chartered Organizations

2/25/2022 | Bates, Charles 1.3 | Analysis Team meeting to discuss trial prep and demonstratives- $1,300.00 $1,690.00
Murray, Dhuri, Evans, Farrell, Filipi, Reppert, Wang, Xu

2/25/2022 | Bates, Charles 1.2 | Analysis Call with Kurtz; Gorsich; Shepherd; Martin; Azer; Evans $1,300.00 $1,560.00

2/25/2022 | Bates, Charles 3.5 | Analysis Work on Supplemental report exposition and updates $1,300.00 $4,550.00

2/25/2022 | Bates, Charles 4.0 | Analysis Work on POC analysis $1,300.00 $5,200.00

2/25/2022 | Evans, Andrew 1.2 | Analysis W&C call with Bates; Martin; Azer; Kurtz; Gorsich; $825.00 $990.00
Shepherd

2/25/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.1 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review of recent hearing transcripts $825.00 $82.50

2/25/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.1 | Project Management Follow-up with W&C to coordinate work plan on $825.00 $82.50
supplemental and hearing support

2/25/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.5 | Analysis Continue making refinements to supplemental analysis $825.00 $412.50

2/25/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.1 | Analysis Call with Hanke and Azer (I joined late) $825.00 $82.50

2/25/2022 | Evans, Andrew 1.1 | Analysis Additional review of modeling around supplemental report $825.00 $907.50
analysis; review of related materials

2/25/2022 | Evans, Andrew 1.3 | Analysis Team working session on trial affirmative testimony $825.00 $1,072.50
outline and demonstratives with Bates, Dhuri, Farrell,
Filipi, Murray, Reppert, Wang, Xu

2/25/2022 | Evans, Andrew 1.0 | Analysis Call with Azer; Hanke; Gorsich; Martin; Shepherd on $825.00 $825.00
potential insurance considerations

2/25/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.3 | Analysis Review analysis related to objecting claimants $825.00 $247.50

2/25/2022 | Filipi, Ales 1.3 | Analysis Trial prep and demonstratives discussion- Bates, Dhuri, $925.00 $1,202.50
Evans, Farrell, Murray, Reppert, Wang, Xu

2/25/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.5 | Analysis Worked on supplemental draft report $925.00 $462.50

2/25/2022 | Filipi, Ales 1.7 | Report Preparation Worked on second supplemental report $925.00 $1,572.50

2/25/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 1.3 | Analysis BSA team meeting to discuss trial preparation and support $700.00 $910.00
- Bates, Dhuri, Evans, Farrell, Filipi, Murray, Wang, Xu
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2/25/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 1.1 | Analysis Updating LC/CO voting report summary tables at request $700.00 $770.00
of counsel

2/25/2022 | Murray, Makeda 1.3 | Analysis Team meeting to review preparation and materials for trial- $635.00 $825.50
Bates, Dhuri, Evans, Farrell, Filipi, Reppert, Wang, Xu

2/25/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.1 | Analysis Review response to question re: SOL analysis $635.00 $63.50

2/25/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.3 | Analysis Review updates on the CO analysis request from W&C $635.00 $190.50

2/25/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.4 | Data Gathering & Processing | Prepare and send updated deposition errata sheet to W&C $635.00 $254.00

2/25/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.5 | Project Management Review case updates and outstanding/in-process analyses $635.00 $317.50

2/25/2022 | Murray, Makeda 2.2 | Fee Request Preparation Dec 2021 fee application prep $635.00 $1,397.00

2/25/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.2 | Analysis Review preliminary results of CO analysis $635.00 $127.00

2/25/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.5 | Fee Request Preparation Dec 2021 fee application preparation (continued) $635.00 $317.50

2/25/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.8 | Analysis Review and send preliminary claim counts by CO to W&C $635.00 $508.00

2/25/2022 | Farrell, Emma 0.4 | Analysis QC CO search results $390.00 $156.00

2/25/2022 | Farrell, Emma 0.8 | Analysis Pull & analyze records for claims with presumptively not- $390.00 $312.00
barred SOL statuses in deduplicated tranche data

2/25/2022 | Farrell, Emma 1.3 | Analysis BSA team meeting to discuss next steps for trial prep and $390.00 $507.00
demonstratives. Attended by Bates, Dhuri, Evans, Filipi,
Murray, Reppert, Wang, Xu

2/25/2022 | Farrell, Emma 4.0 | Analysis Perform search of T6 data for chartered organizations $390.00 $1,560.00
based on list provided by counsel

2/25/2022 | Farrell, Emma 0.4 | Analysis Confirm SOL characterizations in errata sheet $390.00 $156.00

2/25/2022 | Xu, Alicia 1.3 | Analysis Team meeting to discuss trial prep and demonstratives- $545.00 $708.50
Bates, Evans, Filipi, Murray, Reppert, Dhuri, Farrell, and
Wang

2/25/2022 | Xu, Alicia 2.7 | Analysis Summarize the figures for confirmation hearing $545.00 $1,471.50

2/25/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 1.3 | Analysis Discussion of prep and demonstratives for BSA trial - $390.00 $507.00
Farrell, Wang, Xu, Bates, Evans, Reppert, Filipi, Murray

2/25/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.5 | Analysis Review of historical and comparables figures and $390.00 $195.00
demonstratives output

2/25/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 1.1 | Data Gathering & Processing | QC of chartering org translation and merge script $390.00 $429.00

2/25/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.7 | Data Gathering & Processing | Review of chartering org translation updates and associated $390.00 $273.00
output

2/25/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.4 | Data Gathering & Processing | Continue to QC chartering org merge updates $390.00 $156.00

2/25/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.3 | Analysis Confirmation hearing prep meeting - Bates, Dhuri, Evans, $390.00 $507.00
Farrell, Filipi, Murray, Reppert, and Xu

2/25/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.6 | Analysis QC analysis of SOL barred claims in deduplication of POC $390.00 $624.00
data

2/25/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.5 | Analysis Analyze and tabulate opt-out Chartered Organization $390.00 $585.00
claims

2/25/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.1 | Analysis QC scripts for identifying opt-out Chartered Organizations $390.00 $429.00
in POC data

2/25/2022 | Wang, Derrick 1.5 | Analysis QC tabulations and counts of claims associated with opt- $390.00 $585.00
out Chartered Organizations

2/26/2022 | Bates, Charles 1.5 | Report Preparation Update sections of the supplemental report $1,300.00 $1,950.00

2/26/2022 | Bates, Charles 2.5 | Analysis Review Abuse Claim analysis for supplemental report $1,300.00 $3,250.00

2/26/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.3 | Analysis Provide information to W&C team on potential voting and $825.00 $247.50
claim characteristic analysis

2/27/2022 | Bates, Charles 0.7 | Communication with Call with Evans; Shepherd; Gorsich on supplemental report $1,300.00 $910.00

Counsel
2/27/2022 | Bates, Charles 2.9 | Report Preparation Continue revising the supplemental report $1,300.00 $3,770.00
2/27/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.7 | Communication with Call with Bates; Shepherd; Gorsich on supplemental report $825.00 $577.50
Counsel

2/27/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.4 | Analysis Continue working on supplemental report $825.00 $330.00

2/27/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.3 | Analysis Outline considerations of analysis related to identifying $825.00 $247.50
specific claims with potential access to additional assets

2/27/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.1 | Project Management Organizing and prioritizing upcoming tasks for team $825.00 $82.50
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2/27/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.3 | Analysis Review of draft supplemental and proposed edits $825.00 $247.50
2/28/2022 | Bates, Charles 0.5 | Project Management Review project status emails and outline analysis $1,300.00 $650.00
refinements

2/28/2022 | Bates, Charles 0.5 | Analysis Work on deposition transcript review $1,300.00 $650.00

2/28/2022 | Bates, Charles 3.7 | Analysis Work on testimony preparation $1,300.00 $4,810.00

2/28/2022 | Bates, Charles 2.3 | Report Preparation Work on updating the supplemental report text $1,300.00 $2,990.00

2/28/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.5 | Analysis Additional evaluation of potential offset from unsettled $825.00 $412.50
sources

2/28/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.3 | Analysis Provide input on interaction of CO and insurance valuation $825.00 $247.50

2/28/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Analysis Additional work on simulations in support of supplemental $825.00 $165.00
report

2/28/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.2 | Analysis Call with Azer; Shepherd; Gorsich; Hanke $825.00 $165.00

2/28/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.9 | Analysis Call with Azer; Gorsich; Shepherd; Hanke and TCC on $825.00 $742.50
plan support

2/28/2022 | Evans, Andrew 1.2 | Analysis Updates to draft supplemental; related analysis $825.00 $990.00

2/28/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.5 | Analysis Development of outline for plan support $825.00 $412.50

2/28/2022 | Evans, Andrew 1.0 | Analysis Additional working session on outstanding analysis tasks $825.00 $825.00
for plan/hearing support

2/28/2022 | Evans, Andrew 1.2 | Analysis Review of documents and transcripts $825.00 $990.00

2/28/2022 | Evans, Andrew 0.5 | Analysis Work on supplemental report and declaration support $825.00 $412.50

2/28/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.3 | Report Preparation Revised draft supplemental report $925.00 $277.50

2/28/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.5 | Report Preparation Outlined report figure QC $925.00 $462.50

2/28/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.7 | Deposition Preparation Reviewed deposition errata $925.00 $647.50

2/28/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.3 | Analysis Reviewed supplemental report figures $925.00 $277.50

2/28/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.5 | Project Management Review case and work stream updates $925.00 $462.50

2/28/2022 | Filipi, Ales 0.5 | Analysis Analyzed independent review option scenarios $925.00 $462.50

2/28/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 1.1 | Analysis Analyzing claim characteristics for voting claims $700.00 $770.00

2/28/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 1.0 | Report Preparation Proofreading supplemental estimation report $700.00 $700.00

2/28/2022 | Reppert, Wesley 0.4 | Analysis Responding to request from counsel re Confirmation Brief $700.00 $280.00

2/28/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.2 | Fee Request Preparation Dec 2021 fee app preparation $635.00 $127.00

2/28/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.6 | Project Management Review case updates and status of outstanding analysis $635.00 $381.00
work streams

2/28/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.2 | Analysis Confirm Methodist unique claim count and citation for $635.00 $127.00
BSA brief

2/28/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.3 | Analysis Review CO coding updates and provide guidance to the $635.00 $190.50
team re: modifications

2/28/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.5 | Analysis Review supplemental report updates and other analysis $635.00 $317.50
status updates

2/28/2022 | Murray, Makeda 2.3 | Fee Request Preparation Work on preparing Dec 2021 fee application $635.00 $1,460.50

2/28/2022 | Murray, Makeda 0.1 | Analysis Send email to W&C re: chartered org analysis $635.00 $63.50

2/28/2022 | Murray, Makeda 2.7 | Fee Request Preparation Dec 2021 fee application preparation $635.00 $1,714.50

2/28/2022 | Farrell, Emma 0.5 | Analysis Review ongoing work streams & outline next steps for CO $390.00 $195.00
and voting analyses

2/28/2022 | Farrell, Emma 2.6 | Analysis Prepare data for additional voting tabulations $390.00 $1,014.00

2/28/2022 | Farrell, Emma 0.6 | Analysis QC historical settlements data figure for supplemental $390.00 $234.00
report

2/28/2022 | Farrell, Emma 3.3 | Analysis Draft code to expand CO search based on name variants $390.00 $1,287.00

2/28/2022 | Xu, Alicia 0.5 | Analysis Review update on case analyses and task status $545.00 $272.50

2/28/2022 | Xu, Alicia 0.8 | Analysis Update errata sheet for the deposition transcript $545.00 $436.00

2/28/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.5 | Data Gathering & Processing | Work on updates to the chartering org analysis work $390.00 $195.00
streams

2/28/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 1.4 | Analysis Updating supplemental report historical settlement figures $390.00 $546.00
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2/28/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 1.2 | Analysis QC of supplemental report historical settlement figures $390.00 $468.00
2/28/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 1.1 | Data Gathering & Processing | Processing chartering org abuse state search updates $390.00 $429.00
2/28/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.9 | Data Gathering & Processing | Searching for non-matched chartering orgs in POC data $390.00 $351.00
2/28/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.7 | Data Gathering & Processing | QC of chartering org abuse state script updates $390.00 $273.00
2/28/2022 | Dhuri, Yash 0.4 | Analysis Review of supplemental report and TDP updates $390.00 $156.00
TOTAL 762.0 $554,602.50
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Copying $0.00
Court Fees $0.00
Delivery Services/Messenger $0.00
Legal Support Services $0.00
Meals (in office work meetings with client, counsel, advisors and Bates White, $0.00
LLC team)

Out of Town Travel (includes lodging, air, ground transportation and meals) $0.00
On-line Research (Westlaw, Lexis, Pacer and related services) $0.00
Telephone (includes non-local calls) $0.00
Transcripts (includes trial and deposition transcripts) $0.00
Secure data hosting site fees (ShareFile) $549.88

TOTAL:

$549.88




