

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE**

In re:

BOY SCOUTS OF AMERICA AND  
DELAWARE BSA, LLC,<sup>1</sup>

Debtors.

Chapter 11

Case No. 20-10343 (LSS)

(Jointly Administered)

**Objection Deadline: November 6, 2020 at 4:00 p.m.  
(ET)**

**SUMMARY COVER SHEET OF SEVENTH MONTHLY  
APPLICATION OF BATES WHITE, LLC FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION  
AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD FROM  
SEPTEMBER 1, 2020 TO AND INCLUDING SEPTEMBER 30, 2020**

Name of Applicant: Bates White, LLC

Authorized to Provide Professional Services to: Debtors and Debtors in Possession

Date of Retention: February 18, 2020 (order entered April 7, 2020)

Period for Which Compensation and Reimbursement Are Requested: September 1, 2020 – September 30, 2020

Amount of Compensation Requested: \$103,722.80 (80% of \$129,653.50)

Amount of Expense Reimbursement Requested: \$0

This is a(n): monthly  interim  final application

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, together with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification number, are as follows: Boy Scouts of America (6300) and Delaware BSA, LLC (4311). The Debtors' mailing address is 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving, Texas 75038.

**PRIOR MONTHLY APPLICATIONS FILED**

		Requested		Approved		Outstanding	
Date Filed; Docket No.	Period Covered	Fees	Expenses	Fees	Expenses	Fees	Expenses
4/24/20; D.I. 488	2/18/20 – 3/31/20	\$188,841.50	\$0	\$151,073.20	\$0	\$37,768.30	\$0
5/15/20; D.I. 662	4/1/20 – 4/30/20	\$61,177.50	\$0	\$48,942.00	\$0	\$12,235.50	\$0
6/19/20; D.I. 873	5/1/20 – 5/31/20	\$18,693.00	\$0	\$14,954.40	\$0	\$3,738.60	\$0
7/30/20; D.I. 1057	6/1/20 – 6/30/20	\$5,607.00	\$0	\$4,485.60	\$0	\$5,607.00	\$0
8/24/20; D.I. 1141	7/1/20 – 7/31/20	\$20,488.00	\$0	\$16,390.40	\$0	\$20,488.00	\$0
9/18/20; D.I. 1345	8/1/20 – 8/31/20	\$29,180.50	\$0	\$23,344.40	\$0	\$29,180.50	\$0

**COMPENSATION AND HOURS BY PROFESSIONAL**

Name	Position Area of Expertise	Year of Admission / Years of Experience	Hourly Rate	Total Hours <sup>2</sup>	Total Compensation
Evans, Andrew	Partner		\$725	27.8	\$20,155.00
Johnson, Samantha	Manager		\$475	21.4	\$10,165.00
Murray, Makeda	Manager		\$475	116.3	\$55,242.50
Ameri, Armin	Consultant II		\$345	104.6	\$36,087.00
Farrell, Emma	Consultant I		\$345	23.2	\$8,004.00
<b>Total</b>				<b>293.3</b>	<b>\$129,653.50</b>

<sup>2</sup> Bates White would have charged the Debtors for 50% of non-working travel time in compliance with Local Rule 2016-2(d)(viii), but no such charges were incurred in this time period. Such reductions are reflected in the figures in this column.

**COMPENSATION AND EXPENSES BY PROJECT CATEGORY**

<b>Task Description</b>	<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>Total Compensation</b>
Analysis	25.1	\$14,249.50
Communication with Counsel	3.5	\$2,337.50
Data Gathering & Processing	254	\$107,534.00
Fee Request Preparation	5.2	\$2,470.00
Project Management	5.5	\$3,062.50
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>293.3</b>	<b>\$129,653.50</b>

**EXPENSES BY CATEGORY**

<b>Category</b>	<b>Amount</b>
Copying	\$0.00
Court Fees	\$0.00
Delivery Services/Messenger	\$0.00
Legal Support Services	\$0.00
Meals (in office work meetings with client, counsel, advisors and Bates White, LLC team)	\$0.00
Out of Town Travel (includes lodging, air, ground transportation and meals)	\$0.00
On-line Research (Westlaw, Lexis, Pacer and related services)	\$0.00
Telephone (includes non-local calls)	\$0.00
Transcripts (includes trial and deposition transcripts)	\$0.00
<b>TOTAL:</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE**

In re:

BOY SCOUTS OF AMERICA AND  
DELAWARE BSA, LLC,<sup>1</sup>

Debtors.

Chapter 11

Case No. 20-10343 (LSS)

(Jointly Administered)

**Objection Deadline: November 6, 2020 at 4:00 p.m.  
(ET)**

**SEVENTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF BATES WHITE, LLC FOR ALLOWANCE OF  
COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR  
THE PERIOD FROM SEPTEMBER 1, 2020 TO AND INCLUDING SEPTEMBER 30, 2020**

Bates White, LLC (“Bates White”), abuse claims consultant and advisor for the Boy Scouts of America and Delaware BSA, LLC, the non-profit corporations that are debtors and debtors in possession (together, the “Debtors”) in the above-captioned chapter 11 cases, hereby submits this seventh monthly application (this “Application”) requesting payment in the aggregate amount of \$103,722.80, which is equal to (a) 80% (\$103,722.80) of the \$129,653.50 of total compensation earned by Bates White for its services to the Debtors during the period from September 1, 2020 to and including September 30, 2020 (the “Fee Period”) and (b) 100% of the \$0 of necessary expenses incurred by Bates White during the Fee Period in connection with its services to the Debtors. In support of this Application, Bates White respectfully represents as follows:

**JURISDICTION AND VENUE**

1. The United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware (the “Court”) has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1334 and the *Amended Standing Order of Reference* from the United States District Court for the District of Delaware, dated February 29,

---

<sup>1</sup>The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, together with the last four digits of each Debtor’s federal tax identification number, are as follows: Boy Scouts of America (6300) and Delaware BSA, LLC (4311). The Debtors’ mailing address is 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving, Texas 75038.

2012. This matter is a core proceeding within the meaning of 28 U.S.C. § 157(b)(2). Venue is proper in this district pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.

2. The statutory and other bases for the relief requested herein are sections 330 and 331 of chapter 11 of title 11 of the United States Code, 11 U.S.C. §§ 101–1532 (the “Bankruptcy Code”), rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the “Bankruptcy Rules”), rule 2016-2 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware (the “Local Rules”), and the *Order (I) Approving Procedures for (A) Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals and (B) Expense Reimbursement for Official Committee Members and (II) Granting Related Relief* [Docket No. 341] (the “Compensation Procedures Order”).

### **BACKGROUND**

3. The Debtors commenced these cases on February 18, 2020 (the “Petition Date”), and they continue to operate their non-profit organization and manage their properties as debtors in possession pursuant to sections 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code. These chapter 11 cases are being jointly administered for procedural purposes only pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 1015(b) and Local Rule 1015-1.

4. On March 5, 2020, the United States Trustee for the District of Delaware appointed an official committee of tort claimants and an official committee of unsecured creditors pursuant to section 1102 of the Bankruptcy Code.

5. On April 24, 2020, the Court appointed James L. Patton, Jr. as the representative of future abuse claimants pursuant to sections 105(a) and 1109(b) of the Bankruptcy Code.

6. The Court has authorized the Debtors to retain and employ Bates White as their abuse claims consultant and advisor, *nunc pro tunc* to the Petition Date, pursuant to the *Order*

*Authorizing the Retention and Employment of Bates White, LLC Abuse Claims Consultant for the Debtors and Debtors in Possession, Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date* [Docket No. 207] (the “Retention Order”). The Retention Order authorizes the Debtors to compensate and reimburse Bates White in accordance with the terms and conditions set forth in the Debtors’ application to retain Bates White, subject to Bates White’s application to the Court.

7. On April 6, 2020, the Court entered the Compensation Procedures Order. The Compensation Procedures Order provides, among other things, that each professional shall be entitled, on or as soon as practicable after the fifteenth (15th) day of each month following the month for which compensation and/or expense reimbursement is sought, to file and serve an application for interim allowance of compensation earned and reimbursement of expenses incurred during the preceding month (each a “Monthly Fee Application”). Parties shall have fourteen (14) days after service of a Monthly Fee Application to file an objection to the compensation or expenses that are the subject thereof (the “Objection Deadline”). Upon the expiration of the Objection Deadline, the applicant may file a certificate of no objection (a “CNO”) with the Court with respect to the unopposed portion of the fees and/or expenses requested in the applicable Monthly Fee Application. After the filing of a CNO, the Debtors are authorized and directed to pay the applicant an amount equal to 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses requested in the applicable Monthly Fee Application not subject to an objection.

**RELIEF REQUESTED**

8. By this Application, in accordance with the Compensation Procedures Order, Bates White requests payment in the aggregate amount of \$103,722.80, which is equal to (a) 80% (*i.e.*, \$103,722.80) of the \$129,653.50 of total compensation earned by Bates White during the Fee Period for its services to the Debtors and (b) 100% of the \$0 of necessary

expenses incurred by Bates White during the Fee Period in connection with its services to the Debtors.

### **SUMMARY OF SERVICES RENDERED**

9. Attached hereto as **Exhibit A** is a detailed statement of the time expended and compensation earned by Bates White during the Fee Period. Bates White's professionals expended a total of 293.3 hours in connection with these chapter 11 cases during the Fee Period. All services for which Bates White is requesting compensation were performed for or on behalf of the Debtors. The services rendered by Bates White during the Fee Period are categorized as set forth in **Exhibit A** and in the summary cover sheets prefixed to this Application. The professionals who provided services to the Debtors during the Fee Period are also identified in **Exhibit A** and in the summary cover sheets.

### **ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES**

10. Bates White did not incur expenses during the Fee Period. Bates White does not charge for photocopying, printing, or outgoing domestic facsimiles or incoming facsimiles.

### **VALUATION OF SERVICES**

11. The hourly rates reflected on **Exhibit A** are Bates White's customary hourly rates for work of this character. The reasonable value of the services rendered by Bates White for the Fee Period as abuse claims consultant and advisor to the Debtors in these chapter 11 cases is \$129,653.50.

12. In accordance with section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, the fees requested are reasonable in light of factors including, among other things, (a) the complexity of these chapter 11 cases, (b) the time expended, (c) the nature and extent of the services rendered, (d) the value of such services, and (e) the costs of comparable services other than in a case under this title.



13. Although Bates White has made every effort to include all fees and expenses incurred during the Fee Period in this Application, some fees and expenses might have been omitted from this Application due to delays caused by accounting and processing during the Fee Period. Bates White reserves the right to submit further applications to the Court for allowance of such fees and expenses not included herein. Subsequent fee applications will be filed in accordance with the requirements of the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Rules, and the Compensation Procedures Order.

**CERTIFICATION OF COMPLIANCE**

14. The undersigned has reviewed the requirements of Local Rule 2016-2 and certifies that, to the best of his knowledge, information and belief, this Application complies with that rule.

*[Remainder of Page Intentionally Left Blank]*

WHEREFORE, Bates White requests payment in the aggregate amount of \$103,722.80, which is equal to (a) 80% (*i.e.*, \$103,722.80) of the \$129,653.50 of total compensation earned by Bates White during the Fee Period for its services to the Debtors and (b) 100% of the \$0 of necessary expenses incurred by Bates White during the Fee Period in connection with its services to the Debtors, for a total interim award of \$103,722.80.

Dated: October 23, 2020  
Wilmington, Delaware

**BATES WHITE, LLC**

*/s/ Andrew R. Evans*

Andrew R. Evans

Partner

2001 K Street NW,

North Building, Suite 500

Washington, DC 20006

Telephone: 202-354-1187

Email: [andrew.evans@bateswhite.com](mailto:andrew.evans@bateswhite.com)

ABUSE CLAIMS CONSULTANT AND  
ADVISOR TO THE DEBTORS AND  
DEBTORS IN POSSESSION

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

In re

BOY SCOUTS OF AMERICA, *et al.*,

Debtors.<sup>1</sup>

Chapter 11

Case No. 20-10343 (LSS)

Jointly Administered

**Objection Deadline:**  
**November 6, 2020 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)**

**NOTICE OF THE SEVENTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF BATES  
WHITE, LLC FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION AND  
REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD FROM  
SEPTEMBER 1, 2020 TO AND INCLUDING SEPTEMBER 30, 2020**

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that today, Bates White, LLC (“Bates White”) as attorneys to the Debtors in the above-captioned cases, filed the attached **Seventh Monthly Application of Bates White, LLC for Allowance of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period from September 1, 2020 to and Including September 30, 2020** (the “Application”).

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that objections, if any, to the Application, must: (a) filed with the Clerk of the Bankruptcy Court, 824 North Market Street, 3<sup>rd</sup> Floor, Wilmington, Delaware 19801, by **November 6, 2020 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)** (the “Objection Deadline”); and (b) be served so as to be received on or before the Objection Deadline by:

- i. the Debtors: Boy Scouts of America, 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving, Texas 75038, Attn: Steven P. McGowan;
- ii. proposed counsel to the Debtors: White & Case LLP, 111 South Wacker Drive, Chicago, Illinois 60606, Attn: Matthew E. Linder;
- iii. co-counsel to the Debtors: Morris, Nichols, Arsht & Tunnell LLP, 1201 N. Market Street, 16<sup>th</sup> Floor, Wilmington, DE 19801, Attn: Derek C. Abbott;
- iv. the Office of the United States Trustee: J. Caleb Boggs Federal Building, Room 2207, 844 N. King Street, Wilmington, DE 19801, Attn: David Buchbinder and Hannah M. McCollum;

---

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor’s federal EIN, are as follows: Boy Scouts of America (6300) and Delaware BSA, LLC (4311). The Debtors’ mailing address is 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving, Texas 75038.

- v. counsel to the UCC: Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP, 1177 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10036, Attn: Rachael Ringer and Megan M. Wasson;
- vi. counsel to the Tort Claimants' Committee: Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones LLP, 10100 Santa Monica Boulevard, 13th Floor, Los Angeles, California 90067, Attn: James I. Stang;
- vii. counsel to the Future Claimants' Representative: Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP, Rodney Square, 1000 North King Street, Wilmington, Delaware 19801, Attn: Robert S. Brady and Edwin J. Harron;
- viii. counsel to the Ad Hoc Committee of Local Councils: Wachtell, Lipton, Rosen & Katz, 51 West 52nd Street, New York, New York 10019, Attn: Richard G. Mason and Joseph C. Celentino;
- ix. counsel to JPMorgan Chase Bank, National Association: Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP, 2200 Ross Avenue, Dallas, Texas 75201-7932, Attn: Louis R. Strubeck and Kristian W. Gluck; and
- x. counsel to the County Commission of Fayette County (West Virginia): Steptoe & Johnson PLLC, Chase Tower – 8th Floor, 707 Virginia Street East, Charleston, West Virginia 25301, Attn: John Stump.
- xi. Rucki Fee Review, LLC: 1111 Windon Drive, Wilmington, DE 19803, Attn: Justin Rucki.

A HEARING ON THE APPLICATION, IF NECESSARY, WILL BE HELD AT THE CONVENIENCE OF THE COURT AND NOTICE OF ANY SUCH HEARING WILL BE GIVEN ONLY TO THE OBJECTING PARTY OR PARTIES.

IF YOU FAIL TO RESPOND IN ACCORDANCE WITH THIS NOTICE, THE COURT MAY GRANT THE RELIEF REQUESTED BY THE APPLICATION WITHOUT FURTHER NOTICE OR HEARING.

*[Remainder of Page Intentionally Left Blank]*

Dated: October 23, 2020  
Wilmington, Delaware

MORRIS, NICHOLS, ARSHT & TUNNELL LLP

/s/ Eric W. Moats

Derek C. Abbott (No. 3376)  
Andrew R. Remming (No. 5120)  
Eric W. Moats (No. 6441)  
Paige N. Topper (No. 6470)  
1201 North Market Street, 16th Floor  
P.O. Box 1347  
Wilmington, Delaware 19899-1347  
Telephone: (302) 658-9200  
Facsimile: (302) 425-4664  
Email: dabbott@mnat.com  
aremming@mnat.com  
emoats@mnat.com  
ptopper@mnat.com

– and –

WHITE & CASE LLP

Jessica C. K. Boelter (admitted *pro hac vice*)  
1221 Avenue of the Americas  
New York, New York 10020  
Telephone: (212) 819-8200  
Email: jessica.boelter@whitecase.com

– and –

WHITE & CASE LLP

Michael C. Andolina (admitted *pro hac vice*)  
Matthew E. Linder (admitted *pro hac vice*)  
111 South Wacker Drive  
Chicago, Illinois 60606  
Telephone: (212) 881-5400  
Email: mandolina@whitecase.com  
mlinder@whitecase.com

*Counsel and Proposed Co-Counsel for the Debtors and  
Debtors in Possession*

**Exhibit A****Summary of Services**

<b>Date incurred</b>	<b>Employee</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Category</b>	<b>Notes</b>	<b>Bill rate</b>	<b>Professional fees</b>
9/1/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.1	Communication with Counsel	Call with Andolina	\$725.00	\$72.50
9/1/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.1	Data Gathering & Processing	Outreach to Sidley and Omni re Share Vault access	\$725.00	\$72.50
9/1/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.3	Data Gathering & Processing	Review of initial data re current POCs	\$725.00	\$217.50
9/1/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.3	Data Gathering & Processing	Settlement data and POC processing update	\$725.00	\$217.50
9/1/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.3	Data Gathering & Processing	BSA Omni POC data extract review	\$475.00	\$142.50
9/1/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.2	Project Management	BSA PM: work plan review, document filing	\$475.00	\$95.00
9/1/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.1	Data Gathering & Processing	BSA- historical resolutions review	\$475.00	\$997.50
9/1/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.4	Project Management	BSA work plan update	\$475.00	\$190.00
9/1/2020	Murray, Makeda	1.9	Data Gathering & Processing	BSA- SOL translation table	\$475.00	\$902.50
9/1/2020	Ameri, Armin	0.6	Data Gathering & Processing	Reviewing data updates and next steps	\$345.00	\$207.00
9/1/2020	Ameri, Armin	1.4	Data Gathering & Processing	Reviewing court transcripts and SOL translation table	\$345.00	\$483.00
9/2/2020	Johnson, Samantha	0.3	Data Gathering & Processing	Reviewing POC data work plan	\$475.00	\$142.50
9/2/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.5	Project Management	Share Vault access and download	\$475.00	\$237.50
9/2/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.1	Data Gathering & Processing	Omni POC data files	\$475.00	\$997.50
9/2/2020	Murray, Makeda	1.2	Data Gathering & Processing	SOL translation table	\$475.00	\$570.00
9/3/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.4	Data Gathering & Processing	Planning around POC processing and analysis	\$725.00	\$290.00
9/3/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.1	Data Gathering & Processing	Follow-up related to POC questions	\$725.00	\$72.50
9/3/2020	Johnson, Samantha	0.4	Data Gathering & Processing	Review of incoming POCs and strategy for data extraction	\$475.00	\$190.00
9/3/2020	Murray, Makeda	1.3	Data Gathering & Processing	BSA SOL translation table	\$475.00	\$617.50
9/3/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.5	Analysis	POC review	\$475.00	\$237.50
9/3/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.4	Analysis	POC review: identification of potential issues	\$475.00	\$190.00
9/3/2020	Ameri, Armin	0.8	Data Gathering & Processing	Reviewing new POC pdfs	\$345.00	\$276.00
9/3/2020	Ameri, Armin	0.6	Data Gathering & Processing	Review next steps in POC work plan	\$345.00	\$207.00
9/4/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.2	Data Gathering & Processing	Follow-up related to possible settlement data from coalition	\$725.00	\$145.00
9/4/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.6	Data Gathering & Processing	Preliminary triage review of new settlement data from coalition	\$725.00	\$435.00
9/7/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.4	Communication with Counsel	Call with Andolina on next steps re data processing and analysis	\$725.00	\$290.00
9/7/2020	Murray, Makeda	1.5	Data Gathering & Processing	Coalition data review	\$475.00	\$712.50
9/8/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.6	Analysis	Developing plan for preliminary analysis of CASJ data; related organization	\$725.00	\$435.00
9/8/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.1	Communication with Counsel	Follow-up with counsel on calls and timeline	\$725.00	\$72.50
9/8/2020	Johnson, Samantha	2.5	Data Gathering & Processing	Review of POC forms for data extraction planning	\$475.00	\$1,187.50
9/8/2020	Johnson, Samantha	2.7	Data Gathering & Processing	Continue planning data extraction for POC submissions	\$475.00	\$1,282.50
9/8/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.5	Data Gathering & Processing	BSA data review/reorganization	\$475.00	\$237.50
9/8/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.5	Data Gathering & Processing	BSA CASJ data review	\$475.00	\$237.50
9/8/2020	Murray, Makeda	1.4	Data Gathering & Processing	BSA CASJ data processing	\$475.00	\$665.00
9/8/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.0	Data Gathering & Processing	BSA CASJ data processing- cont'd	\$475.00	\$950.00
9/8/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.8	Data Gathering & Processing	Processing of BSA CASJ data	\$475.00	\$1,330.00

Date incurred	Employee	Hours	Category	Notes	Bill rate	Professional fees
9/8/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.5	Data Gathering & Processing	Coalition data processing	\$475.00	\$1,187.50
9/8/2020	Ameri, Armin	1.4	Data Gathering & Processing	Loading new claims data files into STATA for preliminary processing	\$345.00	\$483.00
9/8/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.7	Data Gathering & Processing	Initial processing of important claims data fields; evaluating additional processing necessary for those fields	\$345.00	\$931.50
9/8/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.3	Data Gathering & Processing	Continued review and cleaning of claims data, reviewing for important information	\$345.00	\$793.50
9/8/2020	Ameri, Armin	0.6	Data Gathering & Processing	Initial review of new claims data	\$345.00	\$207.00
9/9/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.2	Analysis	Organizing preliminary work related to coalition settlement data	\$725.00	\$145.00
9/9/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.8	Data Gathering & Processing	Review of preliminary work by team processing coalition settlement data and input on same	\$725.00	\$580.00
9/9/2020	Evans, Andrew	1.0	Data Gathering & Processing	Discuss data needs with Murray; Azer; Green; Sochurek; Hanke	\$725.00	\$725.00
9/9/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.8	Analysis	Additional work analyzing and processing coalition settlement data; follow-up with counsel re near-term goals for same	\$725.00	\$580.00
9/9/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.3	Data Gathering & Processing	Additional work related to preliminary coalition settlement data processing	\$725.00	\$217.50
9/9/2020	Johnson, Samantha	2.5	Data Gathering & Processing	Developing data collection process for POCs	\$475.00	\$1,187.50
9/9/2020	Johnson, Samantha	1.0	Data Gathering & Processing	Review of POCs for data extraction planning	\$475.00	\$475.00
9/9/2020	Murray, Makeda	3.3	Data Gathering & Processing	CASJ AIS data processing - abuse range and duration cleaning, preliminary summary stats	\$475.00	\$1,567.50
9/9/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.3	Fee Request Preparation	July CNO review	\$475.00	\$142.50
9/9/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.5	Data Gathering & Processing	Coalition data review	\$475.00	\$237.50
9/9/2020	Murray, Makeda	1.0	Data Gathering & Processing	KCIC call with E. Hanke, N. Sochurek, A. Azer, C. Green, and A. Evans	\$475.00	\$475.00
9/9/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.5	Data Gathering & Processing	AIS data processing- local council standardization	\$475.00	\$1,187.50
9/9/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.5	Data Gathering & Processing	CASJ SSS/AIS data review	\$475.00	\$237.50
9/9/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.1	Data Gathering & Processing	AIS data processing- data tabulations, output updates	\$475.00	\$997.50
9/9/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.6	Data Gathering & Processing	AIS data processing- LC and troop information	\$475.00	\$1,235.00
9/9/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.8	Data Gathering & Processing	Cleaning troop identification information in claims data	\$345.00	\$966.00
9/9/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.6	Data Gathering & Processing	Standardizing state-level information in the claims data	\$345.00	\$897.00
9/9/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.2	Data Gathering & Processing	Processing local council information in the claims data	\$345.00	\$759.00
9/9/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.1	Data Gathering & Processing	Continued work processing relevant fields in the claims data	\$345.00	\$724.50
9/10/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.8	Communication with Counsel	Call with Andolina; Boelter; Linder; Murray	\$725.00	\$580.00
9/10/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.8	Analysis	Review of preliminary data tabulations on key fields from coalition settlement data; work to develop preliminary summary statistics based on the same	\$725.00	\$580.00
9/10/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.2	Data Gathering & Processing	Improvements to settlement data processing	\$725.00	\$145.00
9/10/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.4	Analysis	Follow-up with counsel re additional points on settlement data; drafting and sending email re same	\$725.00	\$290.00
9/10/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.9	Analysis	Additional refinements to preliminary settlement data analysis	\$725.00	\$652.50
9/10/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.6	Data Gathering & Processing	Review CASJ data updates	\$475.00	\$285.00
9/10/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.5	Data Gathering & Processing	SOL translation and implementation in data processing	\$475.00	\$1,187.50
9/10/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.8	Communication with Counsel	Call with J. Boelter, M. Andolina, M. Linder, and A. Evans re: CASJ data	\$475.00	\$380.00

Date incurred	Employee	Hours	Category	Notes	Bill rate	Professional fees
9/10/2020	Murray, Makeda	3.1	Analysis	Data tabulations for presentation slides, data processing updates	\$475.00	\$1,472.50
9/10/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.6	Analysis	Presentation slides for counsel, data tabulations	\$475.00	\$1,235.00
9/10/2020	Ameri, Armin	1.6	Data Gathering & Processing	Processing prioritized claims data fields, creating summaries of each field	\$345.00	\$552.00
9/10/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.2	Data Gathering & Processing	Processing combined claims data, formatting values for Excel tables	\$345.00	\$759.00
9/10/2020	Ameri, Armin	1.5	Analysis	Creating Excel tabulations and charts summarizing claims data for PowerPoint deliverable	\$345.00	\$517.50
9/10/2020	Ameri, Armin	1.8	Data Gathering & Processing	Continued work cleaning the claims data	\$345.00	\$621.00
9/11/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.8	Data Gathering & Processing	Review of POCs and refinements to work plan for POC processing	\$725.00	\$580.00
9/11/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.4	Communication with Counsel	Call with Andolina; plan for next steps re settlement data analysis	\$725.00	\$290.00
9/11/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.4	Analysis	Continued analysis of CASJ data	\$725.00	\$290.00
9/11/2020	Evans, Andrew	1.1	Analysis	Additional work with CASJ settlement data	\$725.00	\$797.50
9/11/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.9	Data Gathering & Processing	Call with Murray; Johnson; Warner; Linder; Blacker; Boelter; and Omni re POC process improvement questions	\$725.00	\$652.50
9/11/2020	Evans, Andrew	1.0	Analysis	Refinements to long-term analysis plan	\$725.00	\$725.00
9/11/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.5	Project Management	Consideration of next steps for POC processing work plan	\$725.00	\$362.50
9/11/2020	Johnson, Samantha	0.8	Data Gathering & Processing	Overview of POC extraction plan and next steps	\$475.00	\$380.00
9/11/2020	Johnson, Samantha	1.0	Data Gathering & Processing	Reviewing data collection options for POC processing	\$475.00	\$475.00
9/11/2020	Johnson, Samantha	0.9	Data Gathering & Processing	Call with Warner, Linder, Evans, Murray and Omni regarding BSA claims collection	\$475.00	\$427.50
9/11/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.5	Data Gathering & Processing	POC extract review	\$475.00	\$237.50
9/11/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.8	Data Gathering & Processing	Review of POC forms from Omni	\$475.00	\$380.00
9/11/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.2	Analysis	Revisions to CASJ tabulations	\$475.00	\$1,045.00
9/11/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.9	Data Gathering & Processing	Call with counsel and Omni re: POC forms-attended by B. Warner, M. Linder, D. Evans, S. Johnson, A. Miller, K. Nownes, C. Cashman, J. Boelter	\$475.00	\$427.50
9/13/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.3	Data Gathering & Processing	Calls with Blacker on POC data	\$725.00	\$217.50
9/13/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.3	Analysis	Follow-ups on preliminary CASJ settlement data analysis	\$725.00	\$217.50
9/13/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.5	Data Gathering & Processing	CASJ data question from counsel	\$475.00	\$237.50
9/14/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.5	Project Management	Updates with team and planning around next steps; email to client counsel re next steps	\$725.00	\$362.50
9/14/2020	Johnson, Samantha	0.4	Data Gathering & Processing	Review of POC data collection plan	\$475.00	\$190.00
9/14/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.5	Data Gathering & Processing	BSA CASJ data update, next steps	\$475.00	\$237.50
9/14/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.7	Data Gathering & Processing	POC download, review	\$475.00	\$332.50
9/14/2020	Murray, Makeda	1.8	Data Gathering & Processing	ShareVault and ShareFile downloads, document review	\$475.00	\$855.00
9/14/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.8	Data Gathering & Processing	Omni POC summary document review	\$475.00	\$380.00
9/14/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.2	Fee Request Preparation	BSA August fee application	\$475.00	\$1,045.00
9/14/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.9	Fee Request Preparation	BSA fee application- August 2020	\$475.00	\$427.50
9/14/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.4	Data Gathering & Processing	Processing state information in the claims data	\$345.00	\$828.00
9/14/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.2	Data Gathering & Processing	Continued standardization and review of state information in the coalition claims data	\$345.00	\$759.00
9/14/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.5	Data Gathering & Processing	Reviewing and processing new claims data	\$345.00	\$862.50
9/14/2020	Ameri, Armin	1.9	Data Gathering & Processing	Continued processing and analysis of new claims data	\$345.00	\$655.50



Date incurred	Employee	Hours	Category	Notes	Bill rate	Professional fees
9/15/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.3	Data Gathering & Processing	Update re CASJ settlement data processing and next steps for processing same	\$725.00	\$217.50
9/15/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.4	Analysis	Strategic considerations to analysis	\$725.00	\$290.00
9/15/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.2	Data Gathering & Processing	CASJ data processing update	\$475.00	\$95.00
9/15/2020	Murray, Makeda	3.0	Data Gathering & Processing	CASJ data processing- translation tables, local council & name cleaning	\$475.00	\$1,425.00
9/15/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.8	Data Gathering & Processing	Coalition data processing- local council name and state standardizing	\$475.00	\$1,330.00
9/15/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.4	Data Gathering & Processing	Cleaning perpetrator names in claims data	\$345.00	\$828.00
9/15/2020	Ameri, Armin	3.0	Data Gathering & Processing	Applying translation tables to claims data	\$345.00	\$1,035.00
9/15/2020	Ameri, Armin	1.8	Data Gathering & Processing	Processing troop ID information in claims data	\$345.00	\$621.00
9/16/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.8	Data Gathering & Processing	Call with Blacker; Warner; Nownes; Osborne	\$725.00	\$580.00
9/16/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.5	Data Gathering & Processing	Call with Blacker and Warner	\$725.00	\$362.50
9/16/2020	Murray, Makeda	1.6	Data Gathering & Processing	Coalition claims data- local council cleaning and standardization	\$475.00	\$760.00
9/16/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.3	Fee Request Preparation	August fee application	\$475.00	\$142.50
9/16/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.2	Project Management	PM: Document filing, ShareFile request to counsel	\$475.00	\$95.00
9/16/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.6	Fee Request Preparation	BSA fee application- August	\$475.00	\$285.00
9/16/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.3	Data Gathering & Processing	Standardization of local council variables	\$475.00	\$1,092.50
9/16/2020	Murray, Makeda	1.8	Data Gathering & Processing	Standardization of LC variables- cont'd	\$475.00	\$855.00
9/16/2020	Ameri, Armin	3.0	Data Gathering & Processing	Processing council names in claims data	\$345.00	\$1,035.00
9/16/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.7	Data Gathering & Processing	Continued processing of council names in claims data	\$345.00	\$931.50
9/17/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.5	Data Gathering & Processing	Additional planning around POC processing	\$725.00	\$362.50
9/17/2020	Johnson, Samantha	0.5	Data Gathering & Processing	Update on POC processing and next steps for data collection	\$475.00	\$237.50
9/17/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.1	Fee Request Preparation	BSA Second Interim App CNO review	\$475.00	\$47.50
9/17/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.3	Data Gathering & Processing	CASJ claims data processing	\$475.00	\$142.50
9/17/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.5	Data Gathering & Processing	POC data update	\$475.00	\$237.50
9/17/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.5	Data Gathering & Processing	Standardizing perpetrator information in claims data	\$345.00	\$862.50
9/18/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.5	Project Management	Refinements to analysis work plan; follow-up with team re next steps	\$725.00	\$362.50
9/18/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.3	Communication with Counsel	Call with Andolina	\$725.00	\$217.50
9/18/2020	Johnson, Samantha	0.5	Data Gathering & Processing	Call with Andolina, Warner, Linder, Blacker, Nownes, Miller, Cashman and Murray regarding Omni's POC processing	\$475.00	\$237.50
9/18/2020	Murray, Makeda	3.0	Data Gathering & Processing	BSA CASJ claims processing cont'd	\$475.00	\$1,425.00
9/18/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.5	Data Gathering & Processing	BSA claims discussion call with B. Warner, M. Linder, M. Blacker, M. Andolina, K. Nownes, C. Cashman, A. Miller, S. Johnson	\$475.00	\$237.50
9/18/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.8	Data Gathering & Processing	BSA CASJ claims processing- local council updates	\$475.00	\$1,330.00
9/18/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.9	Data Gathering & Processing	Processing high priority fields in the CASJ claims data	\$345.00	\$1,000.50
9/18/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.4	Data Gathering & Processing	Cont'd processing of high priority fields in the CASJ claims data	\$345.00	\$828.00
9/18/2020	Ameri, Armin	1.1	Data Gathering & Processing	Reviewing perpetrator information in claims data, scripting code to extract information	\$345.00	\$379.50
9/19/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.7	Data Gathering & Processing	CASJ claims data processing- Troop and LC standardization, name cleaning	\$475.00	\$1,282.50
9/19/2020	Murray, Makeda	1.3	Data Gathering & Processing	Coalition claims data processing- standardizing survivor name	\$475.00	\$617.50
9/20/2020	Murray, Makeda	3.1	Data Gathering & Processing	CASJ data- survivor and abuser name standardization	\$475.00	\$1,472.50

Date incurred	Employee	Hours	Category	Notes	Bill rate	Professional fees
9/20/2020	Ameri, Armin	3.5	Data Gathering & Processing	Continued cleaning of the claims data, creating pivots to explore data trends	\$345.00	\$1,207.50
9/21/2020	Evans, Andrew	1.0	Analysis	Continued analysis of settlement data	\$725.00	\$725.00
9/21/2020	Johnson, Samantha	3.0	Data Gathering & Processing	Review of POC samples for developing data collection plan	\$475.00	\$1,425.00
9/21/2020	Johnson, Samantha	1.8	Data Gathering & Processing	Planning data collection of POC information for analysis	\$475.00	\$855.00
9/21/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.8	Data Gathering & Processing	CASJ abuser name processing	\$475.00	\$1,330.00
9/21/2020	Murray, Makeda	1.0	Data Gathering & Processing	CASJ data update	\$475.00	\$475.00
9/21/2020	Murray, Makeda	1.5	Data Gathering & Processing	CASJ data processing- continued standardization of abuser name	\$475.00	\$712.50
9/21/2020	Murray, Makeda	1.9	Data Gathering & Processing	CASJ data processing- abuser name standardization	\$475.00	\$902.50
9/21/2020	Ameri, Armin	1.4	Data Gathering & Processing	Reviewing claims data, laying out next steps	\$345.00	\$483.00
9/21/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.9	Data Gathering & Processing	Creating a perpetrator name translation table	\$345.00	\$1,000.50
9/21/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.7	Data Gathering & Processing	Continued work on perpetrator name translation table	\$345.00	\$931.50
9/22/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.5	Data Gathering & Processing	Planning around POC processing	\$725.00	\$362.50
9/22/2020	Johnson, Samantha	0.5	Data Gathering & Processing	Update on POC data collection plan and review budget	\$475.00	\$237.50
9/22/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.5	Fee Request Preparation	Excel document for fee examiner	\$475.00	\$237.50
9/22/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.3	Fee Request Preparation	Fee examiner Excel request, email communication	\$475.00	\$142.50
9/22/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.5	Project Management	POC claims review budget	\$475.00	\$237.50
9/22/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.1	Data Gathering & Processing	CASJ claims data- cont'd name standardization	\$475.00	\$997.50
9/22/2020	Murray, Makeda	1.8	Data Gathering & Processing	CASJ data- name standardization	\$475.00	\$855.00
9/22/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.3	Data Gathering & Processing	Updating claim processing code for allegation severity and settlement information	\$345.00	\$793.50
9/22/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.7	Data Gathering & Processing	Updating claim date fields, creating year ranges	\$345.00	\$931.50
9/22/2020	Ameri, Armin	1.3	Data Gathering & Processing	Continued work on abuse date ranges in claims data	\$345.00	\$448.50
9/23/2020	Johnson, Samantha	0.7	Project Management	Considering staffing for POC processing	\$475.00	\$332.50
9/23/2020	Murray, Makeda	1.5	Data Gathering & Processing	Coalition data processing	\$475.00	\$712.50
9/23/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.7	Data Gathering & Processing	Coalition data- standardization of allegations	\$475.00	\$1,282.50
9/23/2020	Murray, Makeda	1.3	Data Gathering & Processing	Coalition data: allegation processing and standardization	\$475.00	\$617.50
9/23/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.2	Data Gathering & Processing	Updating abuse year values in claims data	\$345.00	\$759.00
9/23/2020	Ameri, Armin	1.1	Data Gathering & Processing	Appending claims data and reviewing severity tiers	\$345.00	\$379.50
9/24/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.2	Data Gathering & Processing	Settlement data processing update	\$725.00	\$145.00
9/24/2020	Johnson, Samantha	1.2	Project Management	Reviewing staffing needs for case	\$475.00	\$570.00
9/24/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.6	Data Gathering & Processing	CASJ data processing- consolidation of claim files	\$475.00	\$285.00
9/24/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.6	Data Gathering & Processing	BSA case review	\$475.00	\$285.00
9/24/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.3	Data Gathering & Processing	Review BSA workplan	\$475.00	\$142.50
9/24/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.7	Data Gathering & Processing	Standardizing the three claims datasets and creating a combined dataset	\$345.00	\$931.50
9/24/2020	Ameri, Armin	0.9	Data Gathering & Processing	Reviewing case background and next steps in data processing	\$345.00	\$310.50
9/24/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.2	Data Gathering & Processing	Creating initial settlement estimates using combined claims dataset	\$345.00	\$759.00
9/24/2020	Farrell, Emma	0.7	Data Gathering & Processing	Case background; determine next steps for data processing	\$345.00	\$241.50
9/24/2020	Farrell, Emma	0.4	Data Gathering & Processing	Prioritize data processing steps	\$345.00	\$138.00
9/24/2020	Farrell, Emma	0.8	Data Gathering & Processing	Document data processing methods	\$345.00	\$276.00

Date incurred	Employee	Hours	Category	Notes	Bill rate	Professional fees
9/25/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.5	Analysis	Analysis of current settlement data and evaluation of potential preliminary figures on the basis of the same	\$725.00	\$362.50
9/25/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.2	Data Gathering & Processing	Review and consideration of detailed draft Omni report	\$725.00	\$145.00
9/25/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.3	Analysis	Consideration of additional information related to potential settlement offer	\$725.00	\$217.50
9/25/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.4	Data Gathering & Processing	Standardizing abuse year field in claims data	\$345.00	\$828.00
9/25/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.7	Data Gathering & Processing	Generating claim estimates based on the CASJ data	\$345.00	\$931.50
9/25/2020	Farrell, Emma	1.2	Data Gathering & Processing	Document data variable processing steps	\$345.00	\$414.00
9/25/2020	Farrell, Emma	0.5	Data Gathering & Processing	Determine next steps for claim consolidation	\$345.00	\$172.50
9/25/2020	Farrell, Emma	2.2	Data Gathering & Processing	Document variable cleaning methods, contd.	\$345.00	\$759.00
9/25/2020	Farrell, Emma	0.8	Data Gathering & Processing	Continue documenting data variable processing methods	\$345.00	\$276.00
9/28/2020	Evans, Andrew	1.3	Analysis	Additional analysis of settlement data	\$725.00	\$942.50
9/28/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.6	Analysis	Consideration and analysis of comp figures	\$725.00	\$435.00
9/28/2020	Ameri, Armin	3.0	Data Gathering & Processing	Cleaning year values in claims data	\$345.00	\$1,035.00
9/28/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.1	Data Gathering & Processing	Continued processing of claims data	\$345.00	\$724.50
9/28/2020	Ameri, Armin	0.7	Data Gathering & Processing	Reviewing claims data estimates, next steps	\$345.00	\$241.50
9/28/2020	Ameri, Armin	1.1	Data Gathering & Processing	Creating claims data estimates	\$345.00	\$379.50
9/28/2020	Farrell, Emma	0.9	Data Gathering & Processing	Document local council information processing methods	\$345.00	\$310.50
9/28/2020	Farrell, Emma	1.4	Data Gathering & Processing	Document name processing methods	\$345.00	\$483.00
9/28/2020	Farrell, Emma	1.2	Data Gathering & Processing	Document name processing methods, contd.	\$345.00	\$414.00
9/28/2020	Farrell, Emma	0.8	Data Gathering & Processing	Determine next steps for initial data processing	\$345.00	\$276.00
9/28/2020	Farrell, Emma	1.3	Data Gathering & Processing	Document abuse date processing methodology	\$345.00	\$448.50
9/29/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.7	Data Gathering & Processing	Call with legal team and Omni on POC processing and interface development status- attended by Andolina, Warner, Linder, Blacker, Nownes, Osborne, Johnson and Murray	\$725.00	\$507.50
9/29/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.8	Analysis	Input to team on updates to processing and analysis of coalition settlement data	\$725.00	\$580.00
9/29/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.6	Communication with Counsel	Call with Andolina and Rosenberg re current settlement analysis and plan for next steps	\$725.00	\$435.00
9/29/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.3	Analysis	Additional planning around settlement analysis	\$725.00	\$217.50
9/29/2020	Johnson, Samantha	0.7	Data Gathering & Processing	Call to review Omni interface with B. Warner, M. Linder, M. Andolina, M. Blacker, K. Nownes, B. Osborne, D. Evans, and M. Murray	\$475.00	\$332.50
9/29/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.4	Data Gathering & Processing	BSA CASJ data processing methodology review	\$475.00	\$190.00
9/29/2020	Murray, Makeda	1.3	Data Gathering & Processing	Data assumptions review, next steps	\$475.00	\$617.50
9/29/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.9	Data Gathering & Processing	Review and annotate BSA data documentation	\$475.00	\$427.50
9/29/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.7	Data Gathering & Processing	BSA data review- CASJ	\$475.00	\$332.50
9/29/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.8	Data Gathering & Processing	Omni file download	\$475.00	\$380.00
9/29/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.7	Data Gathering & Processing	Call to review Omni interface- attended by B. Warner, M. Linder, M. Andolina, M. Blacker, K. Nownes, B. Osborne, D. Evans, and S. Johnson	\$475.00	\$332.50
9/29/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.8	Data Gathering & Processing	Standardizing claims datasets, generating new data fields	\$345.00	\$966.00
9/29/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.1	Data Gathering & Processing	Creating new claim value estimates, reviewing next steps in data processing	\$345.00	\$724.50

Date incurred	Employee	Hours	Category	Notes	Bill rate	Professional fees
9/29/2020	Farrell, Emma	0.8	Data Gathering & Processing	Document data processing methods	\$345.00	\$276.00
9/29/2020	Farrell, Emma	0.3	Data Gathering & Processing	Consolidate data variable processing documentation	\$345.00	\$103.50
9/29/2020	Farrell, Emma	1.2	Data Gathering & Processing	Analyze/compare variable processing methods; determine processing next steps	\$345.00	\$414.00
9/29/2020	Farrell, Emma	0.8	Data Gathering & Processing	Review data processing ; determine next steps	\$345.00	\$276.00
9/29/2020	Farrell, Emma	0.6	Data Gathering & Processing	Standardize country abbreviations	\$345.00	\$207.00
9/29/2020	Farrell, Emma	1.0	Data Gathering & Processing	Add further state cleaning / processing steps to code	\$345.00	\$345.00
9/29/2020	Farrell, Emma	1.0	Data Gathering & Processing	Additional date processing of CASJ data	\$345.00	\$345.00
9/30/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.3	Project Management	Updates to work plan	\$725.00	\$217.50
9/30/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.4	Data Gathering & Processing	Review next steps for settlement data processing and analysis	\$725.00	\$290.00
9/30/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.3	Data Gathering & Processing	Consideration of next steps re processing of POC data from Omni	\$725.00	\$217.50
9/30/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.7	Data Gathering & Processing	Call with Blacker and Warner on plan for POC data	\$725.00	\$507.50
9/30/2020	Evans, Andrew	0.2	Data Gathering & Processing	Review of select POC information	\$725.00	\$145.00
9/30/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.2	Data Gathering & Processing	BSA data processing review, script updates	\$475.00	\$1,045.00
9/30/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.5	Data Gathering & Processing	BSA work plan update	\$475.00	\$237.50
9/30/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.2	Data Gathering & Processing	Omni POC review	\$475.00	\$95.00
9/30/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.3	Data Gathering & Processing	CASJ data QC- standardizing assumptions for abuse state processing across files, SOL updates	\$475.00	\$1,092.50
9/30/2020	Murray, Makeda	2.9	Data Gathering & Processing	CASJ claims data review- statute of limitations translation and application to data	\$475.00	\$1,377.50
9/30/2020	Murray, Makeda	0.6	Data Gathering & Processing	BSA CASJ data updates	\$475.00	\$285.00
9/30/2020	Ameri, Armin	2.4	Analysis	Creating tables for powerpoint presentation on claims data	\$345.00	\$828.00
9/30/2020	Ameri, Armin	1.4	Data Gathering & Processing	Continued standardization of the claims data	\$345.00	\$483.00
9/30/2020	Farrell, Emma	0.9	Data Gathering & Processing	Update troop / council processing steps in the code	\$345.00	\$310.50
9/30/2020	Farrell, Emma	0.9	Data Gathering & Processing	Add additional name cleaning steps to code	\$345.00	\$310.50
9/30/2020	Farrell, Emma	0.5	Data Gathering & Processing	Update and determine next steps for data processing	\$345.00	\$172.50
9/30/2020	Farrell, Emma	1.0	Data Gathering & Processing	Add additional name standardization steps to code, contd.	\$345.00	\$345.00
9/30/2020	Farrell, Emma	0.4	Data Gathering & Processing	CASJ data processing updates	\$345.00	\$138.00
9/30/2020	Farrell, Emma	0.3	Data Gathering & Processing	Review python script for documenting file names	\$345.00	\$103.50
9/30/2020	Farrell, Emma	0.3	Data Gathering & Processing	Update CASJ data processing code	\$345.00	\$103.50
9/30/2020	Farrell, Emma	0.3	Data Gathering & Processing	Update birth date processing steps in code	\$345.00	\$103.50
9/30/2020	Farrell, Emma	0.7	Analysis	Create summary table Excel document	\$345.00	\$241.50
<b>TOTAL</b>		<b>293.3</b>				<b>\$129,653.50</b>