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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

Chapter 11
In re:

Case No. 20-10343 (LSS)
BOY SCOUTS OF AMERICA AND
DELAWARE BSA, LLC,' (Jointly Administered)

Debtors. Objection Deadline:
May 11, 2022 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

SUMMARY COVER SHEET OF EIGHTEENTH APPLICATION OF
HAYNES AND BOONE, LLP FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION
AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD
FROM FEBRUARY 1. 2022 TO AND INCLUDING FEBRUARY 28, 2022

Name of Applicant: Haynes and Boone, LLP (“H&B”)

Authorized to Provide Professional Services to: Debtors and Debtors in Possession

Date of Retention: April 20, 2020 (nunc pro tunc to February
18, 2020)

Period for Which Compensation and

Reimbursement Are Requested: February 1, 2022 — February 28, 2022

Amount of Compensation Requested: $599.046.80 (80% of $748.808.50)

Amount of Expense Reimbursement Requested: ~ $2,327.60

This is a(n): monthly X interim final application

' The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, together with the last four digits of each Debtor’s federal tax identification

number, are as follows: Boy Scouts of America (6300) and Delaware BSA, LLC (4311). The Debtors’ mailing
address is 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving, Texas 75038.
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PRIOR MONTHLY APPLICATIONS FILED

Requested Approved QOutstanding
Date
]f (ilcel?e;t CI:SZ:S d Fees Expenses Fees Expenses Fees Expenses
No.
(]))Sk/t156/§8 igggg N $310,541.00 | $1,185.14 | $310,541.00 | $1,185.14 $0 $0.00
OD7k/t1%2209 gzﬁ(g)(l)gg | $314,174.50 $814.00 $314,174.50 $814.00 $0 $0.00
123/1214480]) g;?gigg | $162,883.50 $282.00 $162,883.50 $282.00 $0 $0.00
12?./1138450]) 82;?1%8 | $165,050.50 $0.00 $132,040.40 $0.00 $33,010.10 $0.00
ll<tl./11636/§0D ?g;gigg | $417,805.00 $561.28 $334,244.00 $561.28 $116,571.10 $0.00
Il)2k/t2%27(i H;gégg | $320,210.00 $0.00 $256,168.00 $0.00 $180,613.10 $0.00
gi/z(?z/ng }/23/};5(1) - $729,392.00 $442.20 $583,513.60 $442.20 $326,491.50 $0.00
g?./22627/§1D gggzéf $514,232.50 $361.50 $411,386.00 $361.50 $429,338.00 $0.00
gs/'51376/§1D iggz/;f $724,726.50 | $3,776.41 | $579,781.20 | $3,776.41 $574,283.30 $0.00
ODfi(/tlgg%;O éggz/él $732,565.50 | $10,028.37 | $586,052.40 | $10,028.37 | $720,796.40 $0.00
193/13%23106 Zg/lz/él $314,255.00 | $1,096.09 | $251,404.00 | $1,096.09 $783,647.40 $0.00
]1)11!5%;16 gg/lz/él $396,211.00 | $3,347.71 | $316,969.80 | $3,347.71 $862,888.60 $0.00
Il)lk/t197/§;7 gggz/él $384,306.00 | $6,409.88 | $307,444.80 $6,409 $939,749.80 $0.00
]1)21!5/%51 }gg/lz/éf $573,934.00 $615.46 $459,147.20 $615.46 $1,054,536.60 $0.00
]1)21(/367/%1 } }ggz/;f $789,125.50 | $6,289.76 | $631,300.40 | $6,289.76 | $1,212,361.70 $0.00
2D/l§t1€525 gg/lz/;f $522,870.00 | $9,096.54 | $418,296.00 | $9,096.54 | $1,316,935.70 $0.00
]33/12(;:'25170 }g/lz/; $601,328.00 | $25,899.10 | $481,062.40 | $25,899.10 | $1,437,201.30 $0.00

il
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COMPENSATION AND HOURS BY PROFESSIONAL
FEBRUARY 1 - FEBRUARY 28, 2022

Year of
Name Position Admission Hourly Total Total
Area of Expertise / Years of Rate Hours? Compensation
Experience

Ernest Martin, Jr. Partner/Insurance 1987 /35 $1,075 109.1 $117,282.50
Litigation

Adrian Azer Partner/Insurance 2003 /19 $850 237.8 $202,130.00
Litigation

Mike Stoner Associate/Insurance 2010/12 $720 198.1 $142,632.00
Litigation

Natalie Dubose Counsel/Insurance 2012/10 $740 103.1 $76,294.00
Litigation

Carla Green Associate/Insurance 2015/7 $750 110.7 $83,025.00
Litigation

Wesley Dutton Associate/Insurance 2018 /4 $650 65.5 $42,575.00
Litigation

Rae Guyse Associate/Insurance 2020/2 $550 58.7 $32,285.00
Litigation

Benjamin Schindler Associate/Insurance 2020/2 $550 92.2 $50,710.00
Litigation

DiAnna Gaeta Consultant 41 $395 0.6 $237.00

Casey McGovern Paralegal/Business 21 $420 3.9 $1,638.00
Litigation

Total 979.7 $748,808.50

2

H&B charged the Debtors for 50% of non-working travel time in compliance with Local Rule 2016-2(d)(viii).
Such reductions are reflected in the figures in this column.

il
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COMPENSATION AND EXPENSES BY PROJECT CATEGORY

FEBRUARY 1 - FEBRUARY 28, 2022

Task Description Total Hours Total Compensation
Global Insurance Strategy (20234.5) 0.0 $0.00
Illinois-DJ (20234.15) 0.0 $0.00
Hartford Litigation (20234.18) 0.0 $0.00
Kentucky (20234.20) 0.0 $0.00
National Surety Litigation (20234.21) 0.0 $0.00
General Insurance Matters (20234.24) 971.9 $744,245.50
REDACTED (Claimant Name) (20234.26) 0.0 $0.00
D&O Insurance Consulting (20234.28) 0.0 $0.00
GSUSA Insurance Matters (20234.29) 0.0 $0.00
Plan & Disclosure Statement Insurance Issues (20234.30) 0.0 $0.00
Bankruptcy Case Administration (20234.33) 0.0 $0.00
Professional Retention Issues (20234.34) 0.0 $0.00
Fee Applications (20234.35) 7.8 $4,563.00
Non-Working Travel (20234.36) 0.0 $0.00
Hearings and Court Matters (20234.37) 0.0 $0.00
Business Loss / COVID (20234.39) 0.0 $0.00
TOTAL 979.7 $748,808.50

v
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EXPENSES BY CATEGORY
FEBRUARY 1 - FEBRUARY 28, 2022
Category Amount

Federal Express $229.34
Depositions $1,624.95
Other Expense: Lighthouse (Document vendor); Automated Legal Services $473.31
(internal document processing)

TOTAL: $2,327.60
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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

Chapter 11
In re:
Case No. 20-10343 (LSS)
BOY SCOUTS OF AMERICA AND
DELAWARE BSA, LLC,' (Jointly Administered)

Debtors. Objection Deadline:
May 11, 2022 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

EIGHTEENTH APPLICATION OF HAYNES AND BOONE, LLP
FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT
OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD FROM FEBRUARY 1, 2022 TO
AND INCLUDING FEBRUARY 28, 2022

Haynes and Boone, LLP (“H&B”), special insurance counsel for the Boy Scouts of
America and Delaware BSA, LLC, the non-profit corporations that are debtors and debtors in
possession (together, the “Debtors™) in the above-captioned chapter 11 cases, hereby submits this
eighteenth monthly application (this “Application”) requesting payment in the aggregate amount
of $601,374.40, which is equal to (a) 80% (i.e., $599,046.80) of the $748,808.50 of total
compensation earned by H&B for its services to the Debtors during the period from February 1,
2022 to and including February 28, 2022 (the “Fee Period”) and (b) 100% of the $2,327.60 of
necessary expenses incurred by H&B during the Fee Period in connection with its services to the
Debtors. In support of this Application, H&B respectfully represents as follows:

JURISDICTION AND VENUE

1. The United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware (the “Court™) has
jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1334 and the Amended Standing Order of

Reference from the United States District Court for the District of Delaware, dated February 29,

' The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, together with the last four digits of each Debtor’s federal tax identification
number, are as follows: Boy Scouts of America (6300) and Delaware BSA, LLC (4311). The Debtors’ mailing
address is 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving, Texas 75038.
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2012. This matter is a core proceeding within the meaning of 28 U.S.C. § 157(b)(2). Venue is
proper in this district pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.

2. The statutory and other bases for the relief requested herein are sections 330 and
331 of chapter 11 of'title 11 of the United States Code, 11 U.S.C. §§ 101-1532 (the “Bankruptcy

Code”), rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the “Bankruptcy Rules™), rule

2016-2 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure of the United States Bankruptcy
Court for the District of Delaware (the “Local Rules”), and the Order (I) Approving Procedures
for (A) Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals and (B)
Expense Reimbursement for Olfficial Committee Members and (Il) Granting Related Relief

[Docket No. 341] (the “Compensation Procedures Order”).

BACKGROUND

3. On February 18, 2020 (the “Petition Date”), each of the Debtors filed a voluntary
petition with the Court for relief under chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code. The Debtors continue
to operate and maintain their non-profit organization and manage their properties as debtors in
possession pursuant to sections 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code. On February 19, 2020,
the Court entered an order [Docket No. 61] authorizing the joint administration and procedural
consolidation of the chapter 11 cases pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 1015(b).

4. The Debtors retained H&B as their special insurance counsel, nunc pro tunc to the
Petition Date, pursuant to the Order Authorizing the Retention and Employment of Haynes and
Boone, LLP as Special Insurance Counsel for the Debtors and Debtors in Possession, Nunc Pro

Tunc to the Petition Date [Docket No. 463] (the “Retention Order”). The Retention Order

authorizes the Debtors to compensate and reimburse H&B in accordance with the terms and
conditions set forth in the Debtors’ application to retain H&B, subject to H&B’s application to the

Court.
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5. On April 6, 2020, the Court entered the Compensation Procedures Order. The
Compensation Procedures Order provides, among other things, that each professional shall be
entitled, on or as soon as practicable after the fifteenth (15th) day of each month following the
month for which compensation and/or expense reimbursement is sought, to file and serve an
application for interim allowance of compensation earned and reimbursement of expenses incurred

during the preceding month (each a “Monthly Fee Application”). Parties shall have fourteen (14)

days after service of a Monthly Fee Application to file an objection to the compensation or

expenses that are the subject thereof (the “Objection Deadline™). Upon the expiration of the

Objection Deadline, the applicant may file a certificate of no objection (a “CNQO”) with the Court
with respect to the unopposed portion of the fees and/or expenses requested in the applicable
Monthly Fee Application. After the filing of a CNO, the Debtors are authorized and directed to
pay the applicant an amount equal to 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses requested in the
applicable Monthly Fee Application not subject to an objection.

RELIEF REQUESTED

6. By this Application, in accordance with the Compensation Procedures Order, H&B
requests payment in the aggregate amount of $601,374.40, which is equal to
(a) 80% (i.e., $599,046.80) of the $748,808.50 of total compensation earned by H&B during the
Fee Period for its services to the Debtors and (b) 100% of the $2,327.60 of necessary expenses
incurred by H&B during the Fee Period for its services to the Debtors.

SUMMARY OF SERVICES RENDERED

7. Attached hereto as Exhibit A is a detailed statement of the time expended and
compensation earned by H&B during the Fee Period. H&B’s professionals expended a total of
979.7 hours in connection with these chapter 11 cases during the Fee Period. All services for

which H&B is requesting compensation were performed for or on behalf of the Debtors. The
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services rendered by H&B during this portion of the Fee Period are categorized as set forth in
Exhibit A and in the summary cover sheets prefixed to this Application. The professionals who
provided services to the Debtors during the Fee Period are also identified in Exhibit A and in the
summary cover sheets.

ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES

8. H&B incurred also certain necessary expenses during the Fee Period for which it is
entitled to reimbursement under the terms of its retention. As set forth in greater detail in the
summary attached hereto as Exhibit B, H&B’s total expenses incurred during the February 2022
Fee Period are $2,327.60.

VALUATION OF SERVICES

0. The hourly rates reflected on Exhibit A are H&B’s customary hourly rates for work
of this character. The reasonable value of the services rendered by H&B for the Fee Period as
special insurance counsel to the Debtors in these chapter 11 cases is $748,808.50.

10. In accordance with section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, the fees requested are
reasonable in light of factors including, among other things, (a) the complexity of these chapter 11
cases, (b) the time expended, (c) the nature and extent of the services rendered, (d) the value of
such services, and (e) the costs of comparable services other than in a case under this title.

11. Although H&B has made every effort to include all fees and expenses incurred
during the Fee Period in this Application, some fees and expenses might have been omitted from
this Application due to delays caused by accounting and processing during the Fee Period. H&B
reserves the right to submit further applications to the Court for allowance of such fees and
expenses not included herein. Subsequent fee applications will be filed in accordance with the
requirements of the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Rules, and the

Compensation Procedures Order.
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CERTIFICATION OF COMPLIANCE

12.  The undersigned has reviewed the requirements of Local Rule 2016-2 and certifies

that, to the best of his knowledge, information and belief, this Application complies with that rule.

[Remainder of Page Intentionally Left Blank]
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WHEREFORE, H&B requests payment in the aggregate amount of $601,374.40, which is
equal to (a) 80% (i.e., $599,046.80) of the $748,808.50 of total compensation earned by H&B
during the Fee Period for its services to the Debtors, and (b) 100% of the $2,327.60 of necessary
expenses incurred by H&B during the Fee Period in connection with its services to the Debtors,

for a total interim award of $601,374.40.

Dated: April 27,2022 HAYNES AND BOONE, LLP

Dallas, Texas
/s/ Ernest Martin, Jr.

Ernest Martin, Jr.

Partner

2323 Victory Avenue, Suite 700

Dallas, Texas 75219

Telephone: 214.651.5000

Email: Ernest.Martin@haynesboone.com

SPECIAL INSURANCE COUNSEL TO
THE DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN
POSSESSION
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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

Inre Chapter 11
BOY SCOUTS OF AMERICA, et al., Case No. 20-10343 (LSS)
Debtors.! Jointly Administered
Objection Deadline:
May 11, 2022, at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

NOTICE OF EIGHTEENTH APPLICATION OF HAYNES AND BOONE, LLP FOR
ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR
THE PERIOD FROM FEBRUARY 1, 2022 TO AND INCLUDING FEBRUARY 28, 2022

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that today, Haynes and Boone, LLP (“Haynes and
Boone”) as special insurance counsel to the Debtors in the above-captioned cases, filed the
attached Eighteenth Application of Haynes and Boone, LLP for Allowance of Compensation
and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period from February 1, 2022 to and Including
February 28, 2022 (the “Application”).

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that objections, if any, to the Application,
must be: (a) filed with the Clerk of the Bankruptcy Court, 824 North Market Street, 3™ Floor,
Wilmington, Delaware 19801, by May 11, 2022, at 4:00 p.m. (ET) (the “Objection Deadline”);
and (b) served so as to be received on or before the Objection Deadline by:

1. the Debtors: Boy Scouts of America, 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving,
Texas 75038, Attn: Steven P. McGowan, steve.mcgowan@scouting.org;

1. counsel to the Debtors: White & Case LLP, 111 South Wacker Drive,
Chicago, Ilinois 60606, Attn: Matthew E. Linder,
mlinder@whitecase.com;

1ii. co-counsel to the Debtors: Morris, Nichols, Arsht & Tunnell LLP, 1201 N.
Market Street, 16th Floor, Wilmington, Delaware 19801, Attn: Derek C.
Abbott, dabbott@morrisnichols.com;

iv. the Office of the United States Trustee: J. Caleb Boggs Federal Building,
Room 2207, 844 N. King Street, Wilmington, Delaware 19801, Attn:
David Buchbinder, david.l.buchbinder@usdoj.gov; and Hannah M.
McCollum, hannah.mccollum@usdoj.gov;

V. counsel to the Creditors’ Committee: Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel

' The Debtors in these cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor’s federal EIN, are as follows:
Boy Scouts of America (6300) and Delaware BSA, LLC (4311). The Debtors’ mailing address is 1325
West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving, Texas 75038.
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LLP, 1177 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10036, Attn:
Rachael Ringer, rringer@kramerlevin.com and Megan M. Wasson,
mwasson@kramerlevin.com;

Vi. counsel to the Tort Claimants’” Committee: Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones
LLP, 10100 Santa Monica Boulevard, 13th Floor, Los Angeles, California
90067, Attn: Richard M. Pachulski, rpachulski@pszjlaw.com;

Vil. counsel to the Future Claimants’ Representative: Young Conaway Stargatt
& Taylor, LLP, Rodney Square, 1000 North King Street, Wilmington,
Delaware 19801, Attn: Robert S. Brady, rbrady@ycst.com and Edwin J.
Harron, eharron@ycst.com;

Viii. counsel to the Ad Hoc Committee of Local Councils: Wachtell, Lipton,
Rosen & Katz, 51 West 52nd Street, New York, New York 10019, Attn:
Richard G. Mason, rgmason@wlrk.com and Joseph C. Celentino,
jecenlentino@wlrk.com;

1X. counsel to JPMorgan Chase Bank, National Association: Norton Rose
Fulbright US LLP, 2200 Ross Avenue, Dallas, Texas 75201-7932, Attn:
Louis R. Strubeck, louis.strubeck@nortonrosefullbright.com and Kristian
W. Gluck, kristian.gluck@nortonrosefullbright.com;

X. counsel to the County Commission of Fayette County (West Virginia):
Steptoe & Johnson PLLC, Chase Tower — 8th Floor, 707 Virginia Street
East, Charleston, West Virginia 25301, Attn: John Stump; and

XI. Rucki Fee Review, LLC: 1111 Windon Drive, Wilmington, Delaware
19803, Attn: Justin Rucki, justinrucki@ruckifeereview.com.

A HEARING ON THE APPLICATION, IF NECESSARY, WILL BE HELD AT
THE CONVENIENCE OF THE COURT AND NOTICE OF ANY SUCH HEARING WILL BE
GIVEN ONLY TO THE OBJECTING PARTY OR PARTIES.

IF YOU FAIL TO RESPOND IN ACCORDANCE WITH THIS NOTICE, THE

COURT MAY GRANT THE RELIEF REQUESTED BY THE APPLICATION WITHOUT
FURTHER NOTICE OR HEARING.

[Remainder of Page Intentionally Left Blank]
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Dated: April 27,2022 MORRIS, NICHOLS, ARSHT & TUNNELL LLP
Wilmington, Delaware

/s/ Tori L. Remington

Derek C. Abbott (No. 3376)

Andrew R. Remming (No. 5120)

Paige N. Topper (No. 6470)

Tori L. Remington (No. 6901)

1201 North Market Street, 16th Floor

Wilmington, Delaware 19899-1347

Telephone: (302) 658-9200

Email: dabbott@morrisnichols.com
aremming@morrisnichols.com
ptopper@morrisnichols.com
tremington@morrisnichols.com

—and —

WHITE & CASE LLP

Jessica C. Lauria (admitted pro hac vice)
1221 Avenue of the Americas

New York, New York 10020

Telephone: (212) 819-8200

Email: jessica.lauria@whitecase.com

—and —

WHITE & CASE LLP

Michael C. Andolina (admitted pro hac vice)

Matthew E. Linder (admitted pro hac vice)

Laura E. Baccash (admitted pro hac vice)

Blair M. Warner (admitted pro hac vice)

111 South Wacker Drive

Chicago, Illinois 60606

Telephone: (312) 881-5400

Email: mandolina@whitecase.com
mlinder@whitecase.com
laura.baccash@whitecase.com
blair.warner@whitecase.com

ATTORNEYS FOR THE DEBTORS AND DEBTORS
IN POSSESSION


mailto:ptopper@morrisnichols.com
mailto:blair.warner@whitecase.com
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Exhibit A

Summary of Services, February 1 — February 28, 2022
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HAYNES BOONE

Invoice Number: 21524508

Invoice Date: March 17, 2022

Matter Name: General Insurance Matters
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00024
Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Boy Scouts of America

Attn: Steven P. McGown, General Counsel
1325 West Walnut Hill Lane

Irving, TX 75015

REMITTANCE PAGE
For Professional Services Through February 28, 2022

Total Fees $744,245.50
Total Expenses $0.00
Total Fees, Expenses and Charges $744,245.50
Total Invoice Balance Due USD $744,245.50

Haynes and Boone, LLP Tax Identification No: 75-1312888

CHECK PAYMENT INSTRUCTIONS
Haynes and Boone, LLP
P.O. Box 841399
Dallas, TX 75284-1399

ACH PAYMENT INSTRUCTIONS
For Credit to the Account of HAYNES AND BOONE, LLP
ABA No.: 111-000-025 Operating Account No.: 018-08-3729-4

WIRE PAYMENT INSTRUCTIONS
BANK OF AMERICA 100 West 33rd Street New York, NY 10001
For Credit to the Account of HAYNES AND BOONE, LLP
ABA No.: 0260-0959-3 Operating Account No.: 018-08-3729-4
SWIFT Code - USD: BOFAUS3N ® SWIFT Code - Foreign Currency: BOFAUS6S
Bank wire fees are the responsibility of the sender.

NOTE: For ACH / Wire payments, remittance details should be sent to: PaymentDetail@haynesboone.com
Please Reference: Invoice Number 21524508 ® Client Number 0020234.00024 ® Attorney Ernest Martin

PAYMENT IS DUE UPON RECEIPT, UNLESS OTHERWISE AGREED.
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Invoice Number: 21524508
Matter Name: General Insurance Matters
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00024

Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

For Professional Services Through February 28, 2022

Date

Timekeeper

02/01/22

02/01/22

02/01/22

02/01/22

02/01/22

02/01/22

02/01/22

Adrian Azer

Natalie Dubose

Wesley Dutton

Carla Green

Ernest Martin

Benjamin Schindler

Mike Stoner

Professional Fees

Description

Pre- and post-conference with Ms. Gutlzer regarding (.6); attend
deposition of Ms. Gutzler (6.0); email Mr. Stoner regarding
_ (-2); conference with Mr. Martin (.2); attend hearing on
various discovery motions (1.3 -- in part); attend mediation session related
t (1.6).

Review correspondence from Mr. Martin regarding
(.1); email Mr. Azer regarding

(.1); review
and prepare

deposition outline

Email Mr. Azer regarding discussion _

Review and analyze transcript in preparation for cross
outline (.6); review and analyze to determine-

and for cross examination (.5).

Attend deposition of Nancy Gutzler (1.4); discussion with Mr. Azer
regarding (.3); participate in call with TCC,
Coalition, FCR and mediator to discus (.6); review proposed
language _ related to (:2);
attend bankruptcy hearing (2.4); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding same
(.2); review revised deposition calendar (.1).

Correspondence with Mr. Stoner and Mr. Azer regarding direct deposition
outlines.

Edit and revise- brief section regarding - (1.7); edit and revise
-brief section regarding- (1.2); edit and revise
section regarding- (.5); edit and revise -brief section regarding

ﬂanalysis regarding issues relating to
(3).

Filed 04/27/22 Page 3 of 45

March 17, 2022

Page 2 of 42
Hours Amount
9.90 $8,415.00
2.90 $2,146.00
0.10 $65.00
1.10 $825.00
5.20 $5,590.00
0.10 $55.00
4.00 $2,880.00
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Invoice Number: 21524508 March 17, 2022

Matter Name: General Insurance Matters
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00024
Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Date Timekeeper Description Hours

Page 3 of 42

Amount

02/02/22 Adrian Azer Conference with Mr. McGowan, Mr. Andolina, Mr. Whittman, and Mr. 8.40
Martin (.5); post-conference with Mr. Martin (.5); email related to various
confirmation tasks (.3); conference with Mr. Gorsich and White and Case
team, and Mr. Martin and Haynes and Boone team in preparation for

confirmation (1.0); post-conference with Mr. Martin and team (.6); post-

conference with Mr. Martin (.4); prepare for deposition of Ms. McNally

(I ) (1 7); review draft

(.5); conference with Mr. Dutton regarding same

(.5); conference with Mr. Stoner and Mr. Schindler regarding

(.4); attend mediation session

(.5); conference with Mr. Winstead and FCR team, and Ms. Dubose

regarding_ (.5); conference with Mr. Kurtz and White

and Case team, and Ms. Dubose regarding (.3); attend

mediation session (7).

02/02/22 Natalie Dubose Correspondence with Mr. Azer regarding (.1); review 4.80
checklist of items for confirmation hearing from Mr. Azer (.1); review
correspondence from Mr. Azer regarding coordination
(.1); review correspondence from Mr. Winstead
regarding same (.1); review latest draft of
(.5); correspondence with Ms. Shepherd regarding
(.1); telephone conference with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, Mr.
Hershey, Mr. Gorsich, Mr. Hammond, Ms. Hong, and Ms. Baccash
regarding_ (1.0); telephone conference with Mr.
Stoner, Mr. Martin, and Mr. Azer to discuss s (.3); discussion
with Mr. Stoner regarding - (.1); draft, edit and revise task list with
Mr. Stoner (.8); telephone conference with Ms. Shepherd regarding
(.2); telephone conference with Mr. Burnett regarding
(-3); telephone conference with Mr. Kochenash, Mr. Azer, Ms.
Huddleston, Ms. Jennings, and Ms. Neely regarding
(.6); telephone conference with Ms. Shepherd, Mr. Azer, Mr. Gorsich, and
Mr. Kurtz regarding (.3); review correspondence from
Mr. Hershey regardin (.1); review updated deposition
calendar from Mr. Hershey (.1).

02/02/22 Wesley Dutton Review_ deposition testimony and direct examination 3.40
outline in anticipation of meeting with Mr. Azer (2.6); attend call with Mr.
Azer to discuss revisions t
(.5); email Mr. Azer regarding
task list and send to Mr. Stoner for review (.2).

(-1); update

02/02/22 Carla Green Review and analyze and related documents in preparation 3.00
for cross exam outline (1.1); continue cross examine outline (.6); review
and analyze and related documents for cross outline (.8);
continue same (.5).

$7,140.00

$3,552.00

$2,210.00

$2,250.00
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Matter Name: General Insurance Matters
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00024
Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Date Timekeeper Description Hours

Page 4 of 42

Amount

02/02/22 Ernest Martin Participate in update call with Mr. McGowan, Mr. Andolina, Mr. 3.10
Whittman, and Mr. Azer (.5); discussions with Mr. Azer regarding
(1.0); conference call with White and Case and
Haynes and Boone teams to discuss (1.0);
conference call with Mr. Azer, Ms. Dubose, and Mr. Stoner regarding-
-(.5); communication with Mr. Azer regarding case developments

).

Correspondence with Mr. Stoner and Mr. Azer regarding _ 0.90
(0.1); correspondence with Mr. Azer and team regarding
(0.1); review correspondence from Mr. Azer and co-

02/02/22 Benjamin Schindler

counsel regarding
correspondence with Mr. Stoner regarding
(0.1); review of assignment regarding preparation of|
prior to conference on same (0.1); conference with Mr. Stoner and
Mr. Azer regarding same (0.4).

02/02/22 Mike Stoner Conference call with White and Case team regarding_ation 6.00
and (1.0); conference call with Mr. Martin, Mr. Azer, Ms.
Dubose, and Ms. Dubose regarding (.3); prepare
email to Mr. Azer regarding (.2); conference call with Mr.
Azer and Mr. Schindler regarding (.3); work on preparing

(.9); finalize deposition outline (2.1); work
on preparing

02/03/22 Adrian Azer Continue to prepare for deposition (1.1); review and revise  10.90
sections (.6); correspondence with Mr.
Stoner regarding same (.2); attend deposition of Ms. McNally (8.6); attend
Court hearing regarding discovery issues (.4).

(1.2).

02/03/22 Natalie Dubose Review correspondence from Ms. Shepherd regarding 1.60

- (.1); locate relevant documents (.3);
correspondence with Mr. Azer regarding same (.1); review correspondence
from Mr. Azer regarding_ (.1); review correspondence from
Mr. Stoner regarding same (.1); review correspondence from Mr. Jaoude
regarding same (.1); correspondence with Ms. Shepherd regarding
(.1); correspondence with Ms. Hanke regarding
(.1); telephone conference with Mr. Barnett
correspondence with Ms. Shepherd regarding (-1); correspondence
with Mr. Azer regarding (.2); review correspondence
from Mr. Hershey regarding action item list (.1).

02/03/22 Carla Green Correspondence with Mr. Stoner regarding task list (.1); continue cross 1.10
examination- (1.0).

$3,332.50

$495.00

$4,320.00

$9,265.00

$1,184.00

$825.00
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Invoice Number: 21524508

Matter Name: General Insurance Matters
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00024

Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Date Timekeeper

02/03/22 Ernest Martin

02/03/22 Benjamin Schindler

02/03/22 Mike Stoner

02/04/22 Adrian Azer

02/04/22 Natalie Dubose

02/04/22 Wesley Dutton

Description

Review claimants' proposal (.1); review e-
mails from Mr. Gorsich, Mr. Andolina, Ms. Baccash, Mr. Whittman and
Ms. Lauria regarding same (.3); review outline (.4); discussion with
Mr. Stoner to discuss preparation fo (.9); attend
bankruptcy court hearing concerning court's ruling on pending discovery

motions (.5); review revisions to _ (.1).

Correspondence with Mr. Stoner regarding task list (0.1); summary of
notes from call for Mr. Stoner and
Mr. Azer (0.4).

deposition outline (1.0); conference with Mr. Martin
(1.0): analysis regarding
(1.1); analysis regarding
(.8); analysis regarding
(.9); work on revisions to
brief (1.4); prepare emails to Mr. Jaoude regarding
(.1); edit and revise task list (.2).

Attend mediation session related to - (1.0); review
related to (.2); conference with Mr. Gorsich and Mr.
Linder regarding same (.3); conferences with counsel regarding
same (.3); conference with Mr. Hammond regarding
(.4); review and revise task list and email to White and Case regarding
same (.3); attend mediation session (1.7); review revised
Document Agreement (.5); review
summary of claims related to provided by Bates
White (.3); review Ms. Gutzler declaration
(.4); conference with KCIC regarding same and revisions to declaration
(.5); conference with White and Case team and Ms. DuBose regarding
(.5); conference with Mr. Martin regarding various

(.5).

issues, including

Review updated task list (.1); review comments from Mr. Dutton regarding
same (.1); correspondence with Mr. Dutton regarding (.1);
review correspondence from Mr. Hammond regarding
testimony (.1); review correspondence from Mr. Azer regarding
(-1); review latest draft of order of proof (.3);

review correspondence from Mr. Gorsich regarding document agreement

(-1); telephone conference with Mr. Azer, Mr. Hammond, Mr. Stoner, Ms.
Rivero, Ms. Tuffey, Ms. Kim, Ms. Thomas, Mr. Warner, Ms. Tuffey, Ms.
Telemi, Mr. Gorsich, Ms. Grace, Ms. Baccash regarding

(.5); review plan objection (.3); review plan objection
(.3); review plan objection (.4).

Email Mr. Martin, Mr. Azer, and Mr. Stoner regarding updated task list
(.1); review- briefing (.3); email Ms. Dubose
regarding assistance with the (.1); email Ms.
Dubose regarding assistance with (.1);
review second supplemental report of Nancy Gutzler (.2).

March 17, 2022

Page 5 of 42
Hours Amount
2.30 $2,472.50
0.50 $275.00
6.50 $4,680.00
6.90 $5,865.00
2.40 $1,776.00
0.80 $520.00



Case 20-10343-LSS Doc 9743-2 Filed 04/27/22 Page 7 of 45

Invoice Number: 21524508 March 17, 2022
Matter Name: General Insurance Matters Page 6 of 42
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00024
Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin
Date Timekeeper Description Hours Amount
02/04/22 Carla Green Review order of proof (.4); begin draft of summary of [Jj deposition  3.80 $2,850.00
(3.1); review correspondence from Allied World (.3).
02/04/22 Rae Guyse Send communication to Mr. Dutton regarding_. 0.10 $55.00
02/04/22 Ernest Martin Review changes to proposal and e-mails from Ms. 2.50 $2,687.50
Lauria and Ms. Baccash regarding same (.1); review e-mails from Ms.
Lauria, Mr. Andolina and Mr. Azer regarding (.
review changes (.2); attend deposition of
Ms. Bitar (.3); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding
(.6); review Insurers' Plan Objections
(1.2).
02/04/22 Benjamin Schindler Conference with Mr. Stoner regarding 0.2); 0.40 $220.00
correspondence with HB team and co-counsel regarding task list (0.2).
02/04/22 Mike Stoner Prepare for Bitar deposition (2.0); take and monitor Bitar deposition (5.7); 8.60 $6,192.00
review (.7); call with Mr.
Schindler regarding (:2).
02/05/22 Adrian Azer Conference with Mr. Martin and team regarding 7.30 $6,205.00
(.9); conference with Ms. Lauria and White and Case team
(.6); review and revise
(1.1); conference with Mr. Celentino and Mr.
Stoner regarding same (.3); conference with Mr. Hershey regarding
confirmation hearing (.1); conference with Ms. Hanke and Ms. Gutlzer,
and Mr. Gorsich and White and Case team regarding
- (.9); multiple conferences with Mr. Martin regarding various issues
(.7); conference with Mr. Gallagher (.2); attend mediation sessio
(1.6); post-conference with Mr. Gorsich (.1);
review objection to the proposed plan (.8).
02/05/22 Natalie Dubose Telephone conference with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, Mr. Stoner, Mr. Dutton, 4.30 $3,182.00

Ms. Green, Mr. Schindler, and Ms. Guyse regarding plan confirmation
tasks (.9); correspondence with team regarding (.1); review
and analyze objection to plan confirmation (1.0); review
updated confirmation plan task list (.1); correspondence with Mr. Hershey
regarding_ (-1); review correspondence from Mr. Plevin
regarding deposition testimony (.1); review correspondence from Mr. Azer
regarding same (.1); review plan objectio_ (.3); review

objection (.4); review plan objection
- (.2); review objectio (.5); review

summary (.5).
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Invoice Number: 21524508 March 17, 2022

Matter Name: General Insurance Matters
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00024
Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Date Timekeeper Description Hours

Page 7 of 42

Amount

02/05/22 Wesley Dutton Attend team meeting with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, Ms. Dubose, Ms. Green, 6.60
Ms. Guyse, Mr. Schindler, and Mr. Stoner (.9); draft-depo
summary (.5); review Gutzler second supplemental report and Bates
rebuttal and supplemental reports (1.5); revise outline to
incorporate additional information regarding (1.7); email
revised draft of] _ outline to Mr. Azer (.1); draft-
deposition summary (1.9).

02/05/22 Carla Green Conference call with Mr. Martin, Mr. Azer, Mr. Stoner, Ms. Dubose, Mr. 0.90
Schindler, Mr. Dutton and Ms. Guyse to discuss confirmation trial tasks.

02/05/22 Rae Guyse Status call with case team (.9); review deposition and draft deposition 4.60
summary (3.7).

02/05/22 Ernest Martin Review Insurers' Plan Objections Brief (1.0); conference call with Haynes 2.80
and Boone team to discuss task list for preparation for confirmation
hearing (.9); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding (.5);
discussion with Mr. Azer regarding (4).

02/05/22 Benjamin Schindler Review task list (0.1); HB Team meeting regarding confirmation tasks 1.10
(0.9); correspondence with HB team and co-counsel regarding plan
objections (0.1).

02/05/22 Mike Stoner Conference call with Mr. Martin, Mr. Azer, Ms. Dubose, Ms. Green, Mr. 4.10
Dutton, Mr. Schindler, and Ms. Guyse regarding tasks for confirmation
hearing (.9); review revisions to in advance of call
(.4); conference call with Mr. Azer and
regarding revisions (.3); review numerous Plan
objections (2.5).

02/06/22 Adrian Azer Review comments from 6.80
(.3); continue to review
objection to the proposed plan, along with the objections
(.6); conference with_ regarding revisions to

(.3); attend mediation sessions (.2);
prepare for call with TCC, Coalition, and FCR regarding the
(.5); attend mediation session

(2.7); conference with Ms. Baccash regarding
responses to plan objections (.8); conference with Ms. Lauria and
White and Case team, counsel to the FCR, and Mr. Martin regarding

_ (1.1); post-conference with Mr. Martin regarding same
(:3).

02/06/22 Wesley Dutton Continue drafting summary of deposition (4.2); revise 4.70
outline (.4); email Mr. Azer regarding status of

outline (.1).

02/06/22 Rae Guyse Draft deposition summaries. 6.60

$4,290.00

$675.00

$2,530.00

$3,010.00

$605.00

$2,952.00

$5,780.00

$3,055.00

$3,630.00
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Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Filed 04/27/22 Page 9 of 45

Date Timekeeper Description
02/06/22 Ernest Martin Attend BTF Zoom meeting (1.9); participate in mediation call with FCR,

White and Case, Mr. Azer and Mr. Gallagher to discuss

(1.0); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding same (.3); review.
h (D).

outline (0.2); review and analyze
to further prepare

02/06/22 Benjamin Schindler

(1.8); review and analysis of

deposition summary for same, including

deposition transcript and

(3.0); correspondence with Mr. Stoner regarding outline

(0.1).

02/06/22 Mike Stoner Work on organizing documents in connection with

examination (3.5); work on organizing documents in connection with-

email to Ms. Topper regarding
Guyse regarding
regarding

examination (2.4); analysis regarding issues relating to

(.4); prepare
(-1); prepare email to Ms.

deposition (.1); attend to emails with Mr. Kim

).

02/07/22 Adrian Azer Conference with Mr. McGowan, Ms. Lauria, Mr. Andolina, Mr. Whittman,

continue to review

and Mr. Stoner regarding

and Mr. Martin (.5); continue to review objections to the Plan

(.6); emails related to revisions

(:3);

objections to the Plan, including

(2.1); conference with client

(.6);

conference with Mr. Celentino and Mr. Stoner regarding Document
Agreement (.3); conference with Mr. Gorsich and White and Case team
regarding responses to insurer objections to the Plan (1.0); conference with

Mr. Gorsich and Mr. Bates and Bates White team regardin

(.9); conference with Ms. Lauria and White and Case team, and Mr. Martin

Hanke regarding

1B

t (.8); conference with Ms. Gutzler and Ms.

(.5); attend mediation session

(2.0); post-conference with Mr. Martin and Mr.
Celentino (.4); post-conference with Mr. Martin (.5); emails related to

(.3); conference with counsem

Gorsich regarding same (.2); review revisions to

March 17, 2022

Page 8 of 42
Hours Amount
3.30 $3,547.50
5.10 $2,805.00
6.60 $4,752.00
11.30 $9,605.00
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Invoice Number: 21524508 March 17, 2022

Matter Name: General Insurance Matters
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00024
Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Date Timekeeper Description Hours

Page 9 of 42

Amount

02/07/22 Natalie Dubose Review Joinder to Plan Objection (.1); correspondence 1.50
with Mr. Stoner regarding - summaries (.1); review revised
deposition calendar from Mr. Hershey (.1); review correspondence from
Mr. Azer regarding (.1); review
correspondence from Mr. Azer regarding
(-1); review updated task list from Mr. Stoner (.1); review C. Green
comments thereto (.1); correspondence with Ms. Green and Mr. Stoner
regarding (.1); review correspondence from Mr. Listwak
regarding (.1); review response
from Mr. Azer regarding same (.1); review updated task list from Ms.
Thomas (.2); correspondence with Mr. Dutton regarding
(.1); review objection (.1); review
objection (.1); review objection (.1).

02/07/22 Wesley Dutton Email to Mr. Stoner regarding summary (.1); review 8.10
summary (.2); email to Mr. Stoner to forward to White

and Case (.1); prepare outline (5.2);

email draft to Mr. Azer for review (.1); email Ms. Dubose regarding
(.1); review
deposition (1.9).

(.4); draft summary of]

(.8); correspondence with Mr. 6.50
(4.4);

02/07/22 Carla Green Finalize deposition summary
Stoner regarding same (.2); draft deposition summary
review and analyze t
(.7); draft summary of same for Mr. Azer

(.4).

02/07/22 Rae Guyse Draft deposition summaries and send to Mr. Stoner for review (1.6); send 2.20
communications to Mr. Stoner (.2); review witness lists to determine

(4).

02/07/22 Ernest Martin Participate in update call with McGowan, Ms. Lauria, Mr. Andolina, Mr. 4.60
Whittman, and Mr. Azer (.6); discussion with Mr. Stoner regarding
preparation for (.2); participate in
conference call with White and Case lawyers and Mr. Whittman, and Mr.
Azer to discuss [ EGGNGNzG (.9); attend mediation session
to discuss
(2.0); conference call with Mr. Azer and Mr. Celentino regarding

(.5); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding-

(4).

$1,110.00

$5,265.00

$4,875.00

$1,210.00

$4,945.00
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Date Timekeeper Description

Hours

March 17, 2022

Page 10 of 42

Amount

02/07/22 Benjamin Schindler Correspondence with Mr. Stoner regarding outline (0.1); 6.50
correspondence with HB Team regarding summaries (0.1);
correspondence and conferences with Ms. Maddran regarding Plan

Objection binders for Mr.'s Azer and Martin (0.4); further revisions to-

outline based on further review of

(3.6); review of] index (0.1);

further correspondence with Ms. Maddran regarding same (0.1);
correspondence with Mr. Stoner regarding
, including review and slight revisions and follow up
for transmittal to co-counsel (0.3); correspondence with Ms. Dubose and
WC team regarding , and review of same (0.1); review of
(0.1); further revisions to
outline, including further review of and
(1.5); correspondence with Mr. Stoner regarding same (0.1).

02/07/22 Mike Stoner Analyze and review Plan objections (2.8); call with Mr. Azer and Mr. 7.70

Zirkman regarding (.6); call with Mr. Azer and Mr.

Celentino regarding (.4); conference call with Mr.

Kim, Ms. Smith, Ms. Rivero, regarding responses to Insurer Plan
Objections (1.0); analysis regarding
(.2); work on coordinating deposition
summaries (.3); analysis regarding (.1); analysis regarding
(.4); analysis regarding issues relating
(.3); prepare email to Mr. Kim, Ms.
(.1); work

Smith, and Ms. Rivero relating to
on reviewing expert reports to address

S

$3,575.00

$5,544.00
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Invoice Number: 21524508

Matter Name: General Insurance Matters
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00024

Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Date Timekeeper

02/08/22 Adrian Azer

02/08/22 Natalie Dubose

02/08/22 Wesley Dutton

02/08/22 Carla Green

Description

(.6); emails related to
objections to the Plan

Review and revise
same (.2); continue to review and address
(1.3); review objection
(.4); conference with Mr. Celentino regarding comments to
(.2); conference with Ms. Hanke and Mr.
Gorsich and White and Case team (.5); conference with Mr. Celentino in
preparation for mediation session
(.2); attend mediation session regarding

(.7); conference with Ms. Lauria, Mr. Kurtz and White and
Case team, and Mr. Martin regarding confirmation hearing (1.0); attend
mediation session with claimants regarding
(1.9); attend mediation session
Mr. Martin, Mr. Stoner and Mr. Schindler regarding
(.5); review revisions to
and emails related to same (.4); conference with Ms. Jennings (FCR)
regarding_ and emails related to same (.3);
conference with Mr. Gorsich and White and Case team regarding
(.5); review revise
(.6); conference with Mr. Gorsich, and
Local Council committee regarding (.5); review
sections of response (.7); conference with White and
Case regarding same (.2); conferences with Mr. Martin regarding

(.3); attend mediation

(.2); conference with

session regarding same (.7).

Review new Plan obj ection- (.3); review Plan objection.
(.3); review Plan objection (.3); review updated
task list (.1); review updated deposition calendar (.1).

Summarize- deposition (5.2); review

deposition notes in anticipation of drafting
(3.2).

and

Continue draft of] cross examination (.9); review and analyze report
and exhibits for same (.7); continue draft of] cross examination
(1.4); review and analyze reports for same (.8); review and analyze
confirmation brief (.6);
review and analyze

Filed 04/27/22 Page 12 of 45

March 17, 2022

Page 11 of 42

objection to the Plan for response (.9).

Hours Amount
11.90 $10,115.00
1.10 $814.00
8.40 $5,460.00
5.30 $3,975.00
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Date Timekeeper

02/08/22 Ernest Martin

02/08/22 Benjamin Schindler

02/08/22 Mike Stoner

02/09/22 Adrian Azer

Description Hours

Page 12 of 42

Amount

Review revisions to (.5); discussion with Mr. 5.50
Azer regarding (.5); participate in conference call with

White and Case to discuss Confirmation Hearing plan (1.0); discussion

with Mr. Azer, Mr. Stoner, and Mr. Schindler to discuss preparation for

(.6); attend mediation session with Coalition,

FCR, White and Case and mediator to discuss (1.2);

discussion with Mr. Azer regarding (.2); discussion with

Mr. Azer regarding (.3); review latest version of

(.3); participate in conference call with Mr. Mason,

Mr. Celentino, Mr. Azer and Mr. Gallagher to discuss
(.4); review proposed responses to
review proposed changes
with Mr. Azer regarding same (.3).

(-2);

and communication

Further draft of and revisions to outline (2.9); 3.70

correspondence with Mr. Stoner regarding same (0.1); conference with Mr.

Stoner, Mr. Azer (in part), Mr. Martin regarding
outline/strategy (0.7).

Further analysis regarding Plan objections relating to
- (2.3); review
prepare email to Mr. Martin regarding
Outline (.1); prepare email to Mr. Martin regarding deposition summaries
(.2); prepare email to Mr. Schindler regarding summary of
depositions (.1); work on updating declaration
in support of Plan Confirmation (.9); call with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, and
Mr. Schindler regarding (.7); continue
working on outline (1.0).

5.40

Outline (.1);

Review revised version of] (.8); emails with Mr. 12.20
Gorsich related to same (.2); attend various mediation sessions (6.2);

conference with Mr. McGowan, Ms. Lauria, and Mr. Andolina, Mr.

Whittman, and Mr. Martin (.4); conference with team regarding various

tasks (.5); conference with Mr. Gorsich and Mr. Bates regardin
(.6); conference with Mr. Kurtz and White and Case team, and
Ms. Hanke regarding (.8); conference with
regarding (.8); emails with Ms. Lauria and team
regarding (.2); review
and revise the (.5); conferences with Mr.
Martin regarding status and (.3); emails with
counsel regarding (.3); emails related to
(.3); conference with Mr. Martin and Ms. Dubose

regarding same (.3).

$5,912.50

$2,035.00

$3,888.00

$10,370.00
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Page 13 of 42

Amount

02/09/22 Natalie Dubose Telephone conference with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, Mr. Stoner, Mr. Dutton, 5.80
Ms. Green, Mr. Schindler, and Ms. Guyse regarding plan confirmation

tasks (.5); telephone conference with Ms. Green regarding

(.1); review and update task list (.1); review multiple

drafts of] and edit and revise same (1.6);

correspondence with Mr. Dutton regarding same (.1); telephone conference

with Mr. Martin and Mr. Azer regarding same (.8); review and redact

sections of brief for public filing (1.0); review appendix

of exhibits for same (.3); correspondence with Mr. Azer and Ms. Guyse

regarding same (.1); correspondence with Mr. Stoner regarding

(.1); correspondence with Ms. Guyse regarding
objection (.1); review correspondence from Ms. Guyse
brief (.1); correspondence with
Mr. Azer regarding same (.1); correspondence with Ms. Guyse regarding
appendix (.1); review latest
draft (.4); review correspondence from Mr. Hershey regarding
meet and confer on confirmation issues (.1); review draft motion

(2).

02/09/22 Wesley Dutton Attend call with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, Ms. Green, Ms. Dubose, Ms. 8.30
Guyse, Mr. Schindler, and Mr. Stoner to discuss outstanding tasks in
preparation for the confirmation hearing (.4); draft
(3.2); email Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, and Ms.
Dubose regarding status of draft (.2); continue drafting
4.5).

02/09/22 Carla Green Conference call with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, Mr. Stoner, Ms. Dubose, Ms. 5.90
Dutton, Mr. Schindler and Ms. Guyse to discuss (.4);
review and analyze to determine discussion on
(1.8); provide summary of same to Ms.
Thomas (.5); review confirmation brief to provide comment
(.6); review and analyze
(.8); correspondence with Mr. Johnston
(.2); continue outline of cross examination- (1.6).

02/09/22 Rae Guyse Check in call with case team (.4); correspondence with Ms. Dubose 5.40
regarding briefs (.1); review briefs and
appendix and (4.5); update

task list (.4).

$4,292.00

$5,395.00

$4,425.00

$2,970.00
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Amount

02/09/22 Ernest Martin Participate in update call with Mr. McGowan, Mr. Zirkman, Mr. Andolina, 5.80

Mr. Whittman, and Mr. Azer (.4); internal team call to discuss outstanding

task list (.4); review e-mail from Ms. Lauria regarding
and reply to same (.1); participate in call with Ms. Hanke Mr. Gorsich, Mr.
Kurz, and Mr. Azer to discuss
(1.2); discussion with Mr. Stoner regardin
declaration (.2); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding
(.1); review comments t
meeting (1.1); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding
(.1); review final version of]

(.2); attend NEC

version (.3); conference call
with Mr. Azer and Ms. Dubose regarding discussion of
(.8); review Coalition and FCR's Motion to Exclude

Bates report (.2).

02/09/22 Benjamin Schindler HB Team strategy call in response to White and Case insurance requests 0.60
and outstanding confirmation tasks (0.4); correspondence with Mr. Stoner
and HB team regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Ms. Guyse and
Ms. Dubose regarding insurer exhibits (0.1).

02/09/22 Mike Stoner Review emails related to (.1); 10.60
review email from Ms. Lauria relating to (.1);
conference call with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, Ms. Dubose, Ms. Green, Mr.

Dutton, Mr. Schindler, and Ms. Guyse regarding
briefing and (.4); conference call with White
and Case team regarding

(1.2); call with Mr. Hammond regarding

(.2); work on preparing

declaration in support of Plan (4.0); meet with Mr. Martin regarding status

of deposition and update on matters involving

(-1); continue working on preparation of

declaration and witness testimony outline (4.5).

02/10/22 Adrian Azer Conference with Mr. Martin and team (.5); conference with Mr. Griggs 11.60
and Mr. Manning regarding status (.4); conference with Ms. Dubose and
Ms. Guyse regarding
(.4); emails with counsel regarding same (.3); conference
with Mr. Hershey and team regarding n (.4); conference
with White and Case team regarding strategy (.3 -- in part); begin to

review motion to strike , and review motion
(.5); emails related to preparation for testimony (.2);
attend multiple mediation sessions related t

ﬂous other documents related to the Plan, including
(8.6).

$6,235.00

$330.00

$7,632.00

$9,860.00
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Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Date Timekeeper Description Hours

Page 15 of 42

Amount

02/10/22 Natalie Dubose Telephone conference with Mr. Azer, Mr. Stoner, Mr. Dutton, Mr. Martin, 9.60

Mr. Schindler, and Ms. Green regarding strategy (.6); review and redact

sections of brief for public filing (.5); correspondence with Mr.

Azer regarding same (.1); correspondence with Mr. Martorana regarding

same (.1); review (.5); review correspondence

from Mr. Azer regarding (-1); review

correspondence from Ms. Lauria on (.1); review

correspondence from Mr. Hershey regarding same (.1); review update from

Mr. Azer on tasks and trial plan (.1); review correspondence from Mr.

Sochurek regarding (.1); review correspondence from Ms.

Hanke regarding same (.1); telephone conference with Mr. Azer and Ms.
Guyse regarding (.4); telephone conference with Mr. Azer
(-1); edit and revise to incorporate changes
(1.7); telephone conference with litigation team,
bankruptcy team, and Mr. Martin and Mr. Azer regarding
(1.2); correspondence with Mr. Martorana regarding
Brief (.1); correspondence with Mr. Listwak
brief (.1); telephone conference with all
parties on meet and confer with respect to confirmation strategy (.4);
telephone conference with Mr. Martorana, Mr. Azer and others regarding
(.2); edit and revise edits to exhibits and brief ;
discussion with Mr. Azer regarding same (.2); additional edits to
(.3); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding same (.2); review current task list
from Mr. Dutton (.1); review update from Mr. Azer on
(.1); review correspondence from Mr. Azer regarding
(.1); review correspondence from Mr.
(.1); review Motion to Exclude
t (.5); incorporate redline of draft TDPs (.2);
correspondence with Ms. Baccash regarding same (.1); correspondence
with Mr. Gallagher regarding (-1); review
status report (.2); review correspondence from Mr. Azer regarding
(.1); review correspondence from Mr. Andolina
regarding extension of trial (.1); review correspondence from Mr. Hershey
regarding same (.1); review FCR/Coalition Motion to Strike
(.4); review proposed hearing schedule from Mr. Hershey (.1).

02/10/22 Wesley Dutton Attend call with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, Ms. Dubose, Ms. Green, Mr. 2.90
Schindler, and Mr. Stoner to discuss and the status of
tasks in preparation for the confirmation hearing (.6); email Mr. Azer

email Ms. Remington to request

(.1); review FCA motion to strike
(.6); draft summary of-estimony (1.4); email motion,

exhibits, and summary to Mr. Azer and Mr. Martin for review (.1).

$7,104.00

$1,885.00
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Invoice Number: 21524508

Matter Name: General Insurance Matters
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00024

Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Date Timekeeper

02/10/22 Carla Green

02/10/22 Rae Guyse

02/10/22 Ernest Martin

02/10/22 Benjamin Schindler

Description

March 17, 2022

Page 16 of 42

Conference call with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, Mr. Stoner, Ms. Dubose, Mr.
Schindler, and Mr. Dutton to discuss and next steps (.6);
attend strategy call with White and Case (1.2); conference call with Mr.

Martin and Mr. Stoner to discuss (.2);
correspondence with Mr. Sochurek regarding
(.2); conference with Mr. Stoner
regarding insurance chart needed (.2); draft insurance chart_

(1.2); review and analyze_
(1.0); revise insurance chart per Mr. Stoner's comments (.3);

complete revisions to insurance chart per Mr. Martin's suggestions (.4).

Call with Mr. Azer and Ms. Dubose regarding
(.4); perform review of brief and appendix document

(.9); send communications regarding same (.2).

Review various e-mails from White and Case regarding task lists (.3);
internal meeting to discuss trial task lists (.6); discussion with Mr. Azer
regarding_ (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Griggs,
Mr. Manning Mr. Azer, and Mr. Stoner regarding (-8);
participate in White and Case and Haynes and Boone team call to discuss
(1.2); review (.2);
discussion with Mr. Stoner and Ms. Green regarding same (.2); participate
in call with various parties to discuss
- (.6); prepare e-mail to Ms. Lauria regarding
prepare e-mail to Mr. Griggs regarding (.2); review
revisions (.3); participate in call with TCC, Coalition, and FCR to
discuss (.8); review Insurers' Statement in Advance of
Status Conference (.2); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding same (.1);
review deposition summary and exhibits (.7).

(:2);

Correspondence with Mr. Azer and HB team regarding
and next steps, including preparation for direct and addressing insurer
objections to the plan (0.2); review of deposition
transcripts for (.2); HB

Team conference regarding
(0.6); correspondence with Mr. Stoner regardin,
Declaration and Declaration (0.2); draft
declaration (1.1); correspondence with HB Team regarding

B 4.

Hours Amount
5.30 $3,975.00
1.50 $825.00
6.60 $7,095.00
2.70 $1,485.00
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Invoice Number: 21524508 March 17, 2022

Matter Name: General Insurance Matters
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00024
Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Date Timekeeper Description Hours

Page 17 of 42

Amount

02/10/22 Mike Stoner Participate in conference call with Mr. Martin, Mr. Azer, Ms. Dubose, Mr. 7.50
Dutton, Ms Guyse, Ms. Green, and Mr. Schindler regarding
(.6): participate in conference call with
Mr. Griggs, Mr. Manning, and Mr. Azer regarding
(.6); conference call with White and Case team regarding
_ (1.2); work on
per request of Ms. Lauria (.6); work on
per request of Ms. Lauria (.4); analysis regarding
(.6); call with Mr. Martin and Ms.
(.2); edit and

(.2); analysis regarding draft confirmation brief

(1.3); work on organizing notes on confirmation brief section relating to
(1.3); work on organizing notes for

Green regarding

preparation session (.5).

02/11/22 Adrian Azer Conference with Mr. McGowan, Ms. Lauria, Mr. Andolina, Mr. Whittman, 10.80
and Mr. Martin (.5); review and revise Third Modified, Second Amended
Plan (1.8); email to team regarding tasks (.2); attend
Court hearing (3.3); review and revisions

(.2); continue to review motion

emails related to motions (.5); post-hearing
call with Ms. Lauria and White and Case team (.6); conference with Mr.
Gorsich and White and Case team regarding various filings for Monday
(1.2); conference with KCIC and Mr. Martin (.4); attend mediation session
regarding (.5); conferences with Mr. Martin
regarding hearing and filings (.4); review and revise
(.9); emails with Mr. Stoner and Ad Hoc Committee of Local Councils
regarding same (.3).

02/11/22 Natalie Dubose Correspondence with Mr. Burnett regarding- (.1); compare 2.50

proposed revisions with mediator's filing (.2); correspondence with Mr.

Azer regarding same (.1); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding same (.1);

discussion with Mr. Stoner regarding hearing (.3); update task list (.3);

correspondence with Ms. Thomas regarding same (.1); review

correspondence from Ms. Lauria on outline (.1); review

Mr. Andolina comments to same (.1); review correspondence from Mr.

Azer to Mr. Martorana regarding brief and

exhibits (.1); review correspondence from Mr. Martorana regarding same

(.1); review_ comments to plan draft (.2); review

correspondence from Mr. Azer (-1); review correspondence

from Mr. Linder regarding (-1); review Mr. Azer

correspondence on same (.1); review summary from Mr. Azer
(.1); correspondence with Ms. Green regarding response to
(.1); review correspondence from Ms.

motion to
Kim regarding

02/11/22 Wesley Dutton Email Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, Ms. Dubose, Ms. Green, Ms. Guyse, Mr. 0.30
Schindler, and Mr. Stoner regarding team meeting (.1);
revise outline (.2).

$5,400.00

$9,180.00

$1,850.00

$195.00
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Matter Name: General Insurance Matters Page 18 of 42
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00024

Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Date Timekeeper Description Hours Amount
02/11/22 Carla Green Conference call with Ms. Dubose to discuss response to motion- 7.80 $5,850.00

(.2); review and analyze
outline_ (1.0); begin draft of motio
and analyze case law relating to

(.8); draft
(1.3); research
(.8); research and
(.7); research and analyze case law
(.8); review and analyze pleadings,
depositions, and reports in preparation for response (.9); review and

comment on confirmation brief (1.0); review and
analyze (:3).

02/11/22 Rae Guyse Send and review communications with case team regarding next steps in 0.20 $110.00
preparation of confirmation hearing.

02/11/22 Ernest Martin Conference call with White & Case team to discuss_ 8.00 $8,600.00
(.4); participate in update call with Mr. McGowan, Mr.

Andolina, Ms. Lauria, Mr. Whittman, and Mr. Azer (.5); discussion with

Mr. Azer regarding (.2); discussion with Mr. Stoner

regarding preparation (.6); prepare for and meet with.

to prepare for deposition (2.5); attend bankruptcy

status conference (3.0); conference call with KCIC regarding insurer's

motion (:4); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding-

(4).

02/11/22 Benjamin Schindler Correspondence with HB team regarding updated task list, and revisions to 7.20 $3,960.00
same (0.2); draft of declaration and revisions

to outline (6.8); correspondence with Mr. Stoner
regarding same (0.2).
02/11/22 Mike Stoner Work on preparing for witness preparation session (3.5); attend  13.40 $9,648.00

Court status conference (2.0); work with Mr. Martin on preparation
for trial (2.3); work on finalizing new draft
(5.6).

02/12/22 Adrian Azer Attend team meeting regarding various tasks (.5); conference with Ms. 5.40 $4,590.00
Green and Ms. Dubose regarding response to motiOI- (.3); follow-
up discussion with Ms. Green regarding same (.3); conference with Mr.
Martin and Mr. Dutton regarding_ outline for Ms.
Gutzler (.4); attend multiple mediation sessions related to
, including conferences with Mr. Gorsich, Ms.
Baccash, and Ms. Kim regarding revisions to same (3.9).
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Invoice Number: 21524508
Matter Name: General Insurance Matters
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00024

Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Date

Timekeeper

02/12/22 Natalie Dubose

02/12/22

02/12/22

02/12/22

02/12/22

02/12/22

02/12/22

Wesley Dutton

Carla Green

Rae Guyse

Ernest Martin

Benjamin Schindler

Mike Stoner

March 17, 2022

Description Hours

Page 19 of 42

Amount

Review chart from Mr. Azer (.1); review updated draft 4.30
(.5); telephone conference

with Mr. Azer, Mr. Stoner, Mr. Dutton, Mr. Martin, Mr. Schindler,

regarding confirmation tasks (.5); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding

response to motion (-1); discussion with Ms. Green regarding

same (.1); telephone conference with Mr. Azer and Ms. Green regarding

outline of response to motion (.2); prepare for and participate in

telephone conference with Mr. Burnette and Mr. Martin regarding

(1.9); review correspondence

from Ms. Green on response to motion (.1); review

response from Mr. Azer regarding same (.1); review correspondence from

Mr. Azer regarding (.1); review correspondence from

Mr. Martin regarding same (.1); review correspondence from Mr. Stoner

regarding same (.1); correspondence with Mr. Hershey regarding
(.1); review response from Mr.

Martin regarding same (.1); review

(2).

Attend BSA team meeting with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, Ms. Dubose, Ms. 1.80
Guyse, Mr. Schindler, and Mr. Stoner (.5); review outline

(.1); review outline in anticipation of call
(.3); attend call with Mr. Azer and Mr. Martin to discuss
and issues (.7); draft email to White and
Case team regarding the need to discuss
regarding_, and forward to Mr. Azer for review (.2).

Conference call with Mr. Azer and Ms. Dubose to discuss response to 2.20
(.2); continue draft of| per discussion

with Mr. Azer (1.5); review and analyze pleadings, depositions, exhibits

and reports for same (.5).

Check in call with case team. 0.60

Conference call with internal team to discuss trial task lists (.5); conference 3.90
call with Mr. Azer and Mr. Dutton to discuss
(.7); review document and document
(1.0); conference call with Mr. Burnette and Ms. Dubose to discuss

(1.5); discussion with Mr. Azer regardin_

(2).

HB Team conference regarding updated confirmation tasks and next steps 2.40
(0.6); correspondence with Ms. Green regardin
(0.1); legal research regarding

Participate in team call regarding Confirmation Plan tasks and strategy 1.70
(.5); attend mediation session (1.0); analysis regarding issues
relating to (:2).

$3,182.00

$1,170.00

$1,650.00

$330.00

$4,192.50

$1,320.00

$1,224.00
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Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00024

Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Date

Timekeeper

02/13/22 Adrian Azer

02/13/22 Natalie Dubose

02/13/22

02/13/22

02/13/22

02/13/22

02/13/22

Carla Green

Rae Guyse

Ernest Martin

Benjamin Schindler

Mike Stoner

Description

March 17, 2022

Attend multiple mediation sessions
and multiple conference calls with Mr.
Gorsich, Ms. Baccash, and Ms. Kim regarding revisions to the Plan,

for filing (9.3); conferences
with Mr. Stoner regarding (:3);
conference with Mr. Martin regarding status of various filings (.3); review

versons of [

Review correspondence from Mr. Stoner regarding
(.1); review correspondence from Mr. Azer regarding same (.1); discussion
with Ms. Green regarding response to Burnett motion (.2); review
correspondence from Ms. Green regarding same (.1); review
correspondence from Mr. Abbott regarding same (.1); review revised
comments to (.3); telephone conference with Mr.
Azer, Ms. Kim, Ms. Baccash, Mr. Stoner, and Mr. Gorsich regarding
(1.4); telephone conference with Mr. Stoner, Mr.
Hammond, and Mr. Hershey regarding (:2); review updates to
task list (.1); review memo regarding

1.

Conference with Ms. Dubose regarding
(.2); correspondence with Mr. Abbott regarding

and summary
review and analyze memo addressing same sent by Mr. Abbott (.4);
continue draft of motio (2.3).

Review rules related to (.6); send
communications to Mr. Stoner (.2); draft
B

Communication with Mr. Stoner and Ms. Dubose regarding
(.2); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding
(.2); review objections to plan

résponse

(1.0).

Correspondence with Mr. Stoner regarding draft of

_ (0.2); review of materials related to same (0.1).

Attend mediation session (.5); review revisions
(:3); attend to emails with Ms. Guyse regarding

1

conference call with Mr. Gorsich, Ms. Baccash, Ms. Kim, and Mr. Azer

regarding revisions , and supporting

documents (2.7); call with Mr. Hammond, Mr. Hershey, and Ms. Dubose
(.2); conference call with Mr. Azer
(.2); review and edit

7;

(.8); review and edit
review and edit

Page 20 of 42

Hours Amount
10.50 $8,925.00
2.70 $1,998.00
3.20 $2,400.00
3.90 $2,145.00
1.40 $1,505.00
0.30 $165.00
7.20 $5,184.00
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Matter Name: General Insurance Matters
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00024

Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Date Timekeeper

02/14/22 Adrian Azer

02/14/22 Natalie Dubose

02/14/22 Wesley Dutton

02/14/22 Carla Green

02/14/22 Rae Guyse

02/14/22 Ernest Martin

Description

March 17, 2022

Hours

Page 21 of 42

Amount

Conference with Mr. McGowan, Mr. Andolina, Mr. Whittman, and Mr.
Martin (.5); conference with Mr. Gorsich and White and Case team, and
Mr. Stoner regarding (1.0); attend all-day
mediation session to finalize documents for filing (12.4).

Correspondence with Mr. Azer regarding
(.2); telephone conference with Ms. Guyse regarding
(.1); draft, edit and revise response to motion to
(3.4); edit and revise response to motion .
(1.8); correspondence with Ms. Green regarding same (.1);
correspondence with Ms. Hanke regarding same (.1); review
correspondence from Ms. Hanke regarding
- (.1); correspondence with Ms. Guyse regarding
(.1); review correspondence (-1); review
from Ms. Guyse (.3); review research from Ms.

(1)

Green regarding

Email Ms. Guyse regarding (.1); draft

(1.6); email Mr. Stoner draft

Finalize draft of response_ (1.8); review and analyze

exhibits, pleadings, communications, depositions and reports for same (.6);
correspondence with Ms. Dubose regarding same (.2); research and
analyze case law relating to (1.0); revise
response with citations to same (.3).

Draft (7.4); highlight
deposition transcript (3.0); send to Mr.

Stoner and Ms. Dubois for review (.2).

Participate in update call with Mr. McGowan, Mr. Zirkman, Mr. Andolina,
Mr. Whittman, and Mr. Azer (.5); review e-mails from Mr. Buchbinder
regarding Revised Confirmation Scheduling Order (.1); review AIG's
revisions to Notice and CO and Class 9

Notice (.3); review letter regarding_ (-1);

review e-mail from Ms. Hanke regarding status of response to motion to

(.1); review revisions t_
(.2); review recent changes to Document Agreement (.1);

review e-mail from counsel and Mr. Azer, Mr. Gorsich, and Ms.

Lauria regarding (:2); review -
objection to plan (.4); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding case

developments (.2).

13.90

6.40

1.80

3.90

10.60

2.20

$11,815.00

$4,736.00

$1,170.00

$2,925.00

$5,830.00

$2,365.00
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Date Timekeeper Description Hours

Page 22 of 42

Amount

02/14/22 Benjamin Schindler Follow up legal research regarding

(0.9); correspondence with Ms.
Green regarding same (0.1); correspondence with HB team and co-counsel
regarding and strategy regarding same (0.1);
correspondence with Mr. Stoner regarding draft of]
(0.1); review and analysis of] and draft of
(4.1); conference with Ms. Guyse
regarding same (0.1); further correspondence with Mr. Stoner regarding
same (0.1); revisions to same based on correspondence with Mr. Stoner
(0.3); further revisions to based on other drafts and based on
final review

(1.4).

02/14/22 Mike Stoner Conference call with Mr. Gorsich, Ms. Baccash, Ms. Kim, and Mr. Azer 9.50
(1.1); call with Mr. Azer regarding discovery
(.1); work on revisions to
(-3); prepare email to Ms. Guyse regarding
(.1); review revisions to (.3); organize
documents relating to (-1); prepare email
to Ms. Thomas regarding (.1); work on issues relating
to document production (.1); work on
production emails (4.4); edit and revise
(1.0); edit and revise
ignations (.3); review
(.3); call with Mr. Azer regarding

(.1); edit and revise (.5).

issues involving

02/15/22 Adrian Azer Attend mediation session to finalize relevant documents for filing (carry- 11.00
over from Monday mediation) (2.2); conference with Mr. Hershey related
to letter (.3); conference with Mr. Martin and team (.4);
conference with Mr. Stoner, Mr. Hammond, and Mr. Hershey regarding
(.3); conference with Ms. Gutzler and Ms. Hanke
regarding motion (.4); email to White and Case team regarding
(.2); emails with
insurers regarding (:2);
conference with White and Case team and KCIC regarding same (.9);
conference with Mr. Martin regarding
(.5); conference with Coalition and FCR, and White and Case team
regarding responses to Plan objections (.8); post-conferences with Mr.
Martin (.4); post-conference with Mr. Gorsich (.3); conference with Ms.
Green regarding (.2); multiple emails with White and Case
and KCIC related to , and review

prior materials related to same (2.7); draft, review and revise response l
motion to

(.3); review and revise response to
(.7); review
and confer with Mr. Stoner (.2).

$3,960.00

$6,840.00

$9,350.00
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Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Date Timekeeper Description Hours

Page 23 of 42

Amount

02/15/22 Natalie Dubose Telephone conference with Mr. Azer, Ms. Green, Ms. Guyse, Mr. Stoner, 6.70
Mr. Schindler, Mr. Dutton, and Mr. Martin regarding strategy and

confirmation tasks (.5); discussion with Mr. Stoner regarding

(.3); review and prepare

to same (2.0); review

and prepare
to same (.6); multiple emails with Ms.
Thomas regarding same (.2); review correspondence from Ms. Hanke
regarding_ (.1); review motion
(.4); review correspondence from Ms. Guyse regarding same (.1); review
correspondence from Mr. Azer regarding
(.1); correspondence with Mr. Hershey regarding research for
(.1); review research from Ms.
Thomas regarding same (.1); review correspondence from Mr. Listwak
regarding

(.1); correspondence with Mr. Martin regarding same (.1); review Motion
(.2); correspondence with Mr. Azer
regarding same (.1); review correspondence from Mr. Azer regarding

(.1); review correspondence
from Mr. Gorsich regarding same (.1); review correspondence regarding
(.1); correspondence with
Ms. Green regarding draft motion (.1); review updated
research from Ms. Green (.1); review correspondence from Mr.
Azer regarding same (.1); correspondence with Mr. Stoner regarding

(.1); review Mr.
motion (.3); review comments

same (.5); review

Martin’s comments to
from Ms. Hanke to motion (.2).

02/15/22 Wesley Dutton Attend BSA team call with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, Ms. Dubose, Ms. Green, 0.70
Mr. Stoner (.5); email Mr. Azer regarding availability for call to discuss
(.1); email Mr. Azer regarding

availability to draft (.1).

02/15/22 DiAnna Gaeta Submit request for export of - emails for attorney review. 0.60

02/15/22 Carla Green Conference call with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, Mr. Stoner, Ms. Dubose, Mr. 6.00
Schindler, Mr. Dutton and Ms. Guyse to discuss (.5);
conference call with Ms. Guyse and Mr. Azer to discus
(:2); begin draft (1.7); research and analyze case law
relating to same (.4); continue revisions to motio (1.0); review
motion- to determine (.3); summary
of same to Ms. Dubose (.3); review and analyze case

for response (1.3); multiple correspondence with Ms. Hanke and
Mr. Azer regarding same (.3).

$4,958.00

$455.00

$237.00

$4,500.00
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Date Timekeeper Description Hours

Page 24 of 42

Amount

02/15/22 Rae Guyse Team check-in call (.5); call with Mr. Azer and Ms. Green regarding. 3.90
(-2); send communication to White and Case for materials;

perform edits and revisions (1.8); review and
summarize motion and circulate to case team

(1.2).

02/15/22 Ernest Martin Conference call with internal team to discuss task list items (.5); discussion 4.90
with Mr. Azer regarding same (.1); review e-mail from Mr. Listwak
regarding motion and communication with Ms. Dubose regarding
same (.1); communication with Mr. Azer regarding response to
counsel regarding response (.1
review various e-mails from White and Case regarding same (.1); review
and revise BSA's response to Insurers' motion with respect to
(2.2); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding
(.9); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding
(.5); review KCIC's analysis (.1); review KCIC's
revisions to response to insurers' motion (.3).

02/15/22 Benjamin Schindler Correspondence with HB team regarding confirmation filings and next 1.50
steps (0.1); status meeting regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Mr.

Stoner regarding revisions to

and- deposition transcript (0.1); revisions and highlights

corresponding to same (0.7); further correspondence with HB team

rezordin: [ )

02/15/22 Mike Stoner Conference call with Mr. Martin, Mr. Azer, Ms. Dubose, Ms. Green, Mr. 7.60
Schindler, Mr. Dutton, and Ms. Guyse regarding status updates and

confirmation plan strategy (.6); work on task list for team (.4); conference

call with Mr. Azer, Mr. Hammond, and Mr. Hershey regarding discovery

(.3); prepare email to Mr. Schindler regarding
(.1); further review and analysis regarding

(1.5); revie
(1.1); edit and revise
(.8); work on edits

declaration (1.5); call with Mr. Azer regarding
(.3); call with Ms. Dubose regarding

and revisions to

$2,145.00

$5,267.50

$825.00

$5,472.00
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Date Timekeeper

02/16/22 Adrian Azer

02/16/22 Natalie Dubose

02/16/22 Wesley Dutton

02/16/22 Carla Green

02/16/22 Rae Guyse

Description

Attend NEC meeting (.2); conferences with White and Case team
regarding the response to Plan objections (.6); conference with Bates
White and KCIC, and White and Case regarding (.8);
multiple conferences with White and Case regarding
s (.4); multiple emails with Ms. Lauria and KCIC
regarding (.6); review draft response letter to
Amass (.2); emails with White and Case team regarding response to the
plan objections (.2); review and revise response to
motion (1.2); conference with Local
Council committee regarding (.4); emails related to same (.3);
review portion of response to Plan objections related to
(1.4); email with regarding
with White and Case regarding

(.2); emails

(.2).

Review correspondence from Mr. Azer regardin,
(.1); review comments from Mr. Kurtz regarding same (.1);
review comments from Ms. Lauria regarding same (.1); correspondence
with Mr. Martin and Mr. Azer regarding
(.1); review and edit multiple drafts of response to
motion (1.5); review comments from Mr.
Abbott regarding same (.1); review comments from Mr. Martin regarding
same (.2); review comments from Ms. Shepherd regarding same (.3);
review comments from Mr. Azer regarding same (.3); telephone
conference with Mr. Burnett regarding same (.3); correspondence with Mr.
Abbott regarding same (.1); telephone conference with Mr. Dutton, Mr.
Martin, Ms. Baccash, Mr. Gorsich, Mr. Hammond, Ms. Shepherd, Mr.
Stoner, and Ms. Baccash regarding (1.0);
telephone conference with Mr. Abbott regarding
(.2); review comments from Ms. Hanke to response to motion to

(4).

Review_ in anticipation of call with Mr. Gorsich regarding
(.3); attend call with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin,
Ms. Dubose, Mr. Stoner, Mr. Gorsich, Ms. Baccash, Ms. Shepherd, and
Mr. Hammond regarding

(1.0); email Mr. Azer regarding the need for additional research
onh (.1).

Continue draft (1.7); review and analyze case law
relating to same (.7); complete final draft of response to motio

(.8); correspondence with Mr. Azer regarding same (.2); correspondence
with Mr. Abbott regarding review of response (.2); conference call with
Mr. Azer to discuss revisions to response to motio:_ (:2);
complete revisions to response per Mr. Azer's comments (1.8);
correspondence with Mr. Azer regarding same (.2); revise response per Mr.
Abbott's suggestions (.3); revise response per Mr. Martin's comments (.8);
correspondence with team regarding final draft of response (.2); review
and comment on confirmation brief (1.6).

Draft cross examination outline _

Filed 04/27/22 Page 26 of 45

March 17, 2022

Page 25 of 42

Hours Amount
6.70 $5,695.00
4.80 $3,552.00

1.40 $910.00
8.70 $6,525.00
2.20 $1,210.00
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Date Timekeeper Description Hours Amount
02/16/22 Ernest Martin Review comments to draft response 4.10 $4,407.50

- (.2); attend NEB meeting (.7); review and revise latest version of

response to insurers' motion (1.1); conference call with White

and Case and internal team to discuss coordination between KCIC and

Bates White on (1.0);

review KCIC's recent changes to response to insurers' motion

(.3); conference call with White and Case regarding

(.6); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding same (.2).
02/16/22 Mike Stoner Prepare email to Ms. Gaeta regarding status of email collection for 5.30 $3,816.00

discovery (.1): review revisions to Plan and consider

(.3); conference call with Ms. Smith, Ms. Kim, Mr.
Green, Ms. Baccash, Ms. Warner, Mr. Gorsich, and Mr. Azer concerning
(.4); conference call with Mr. Dutton, Mr. Azer, Mr.
Gorsich, Ms. Shepherd, Ms. Baccash, Mr. Hershey, Mr. Hammond, Mr.
Azer, Mr. Martin, and Ms. Dubose regarding coordination on
(1.0); conference call

with White and Case team regarding confirmation strategy (.6); analysis

regarine [ 5 ok

on updating global task list (.4).
02/17/22 Adrian Azer Finalize response to_ motion , 7.00 $5,950.00

including incorporating revisions from White and Case and reviewing
comments from KCIC (2.9); conference with team regarding response to
Plan objections (.3); conference with Mr. Gorsich and White and Case
team (.4); conferences with White and Case and Ms. Dubose regarding
response (.7); attend mediation
sessions (1.6); follow-up conferences with White and Case
(:4); emails with team regarding (.3); conference
with counsel (.4).
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Page 27 of 42

Amount

02/17/22 Natalie Dubose Telephone conference with Mr. Burnett regarding_ 8.30
(.6); draft, edit and revise declaration in support of

response to motion (1.0); discussion with Mr. Martin regarding

same (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Azer, Ms. Baccash, Ms. Green,

and Ms. Shephard regarding response to motion (.5);

discussion with Ms. Green regarding same (.2); telephone conference with

Mr. Burnett regarding declaration draft (.4); edit and revise multiple

versions of response to motion q);
review correspondence from Ms. Spacht regarding (.1);

review correspondence from Mr. Azer regarding
(.1); review multiple rounds of comments from Mr.
motion (.3); review comments from Ms.
motion (.3); review correspondence from
Mr. Smethurst regarding (-1); review
correspondence from Mr. Hershey regarding same (.1); review draft from
Mr. Hammond regarding brief (.4); review
correspondence from Mr. Lloyds regarding (-1); review
correspondence from Mr. Hershey regarding same (.1); update pretrial task
list (.2); correspondence with Ms. Thomas regarding same (.1); review
correspondence from Mr. Kurtz regarding pretrial filing deadlines (.1);
review correspondence from Mr. Hershey regarding same (.1).

021722 Wesley Duton Research N 00

02/17/22 Carla Green Conference call with Mr. Azer, Ms. Dubose and Ms. Shepherd to discuss 6.80
response (.5); conference call with Mr. Azer regarding
same (.2); conference call with Ms. Dubose to discuss same (.1); attend
mediation session (.9); correspondence with
Ms. Kutz regarding (.1); finalize response to motionl
- (1.8); multiple emails with Ms. Dubose and Mr. Azer regarding
same (.4); incorporate revisions to response per White & Cases's comments
(1.1); correspondence with Mr. McGovern regarding (.2);
correspondence with Ms. Remington regarding (:2); final
review and complete final revisions to response, appendix and exhibits
(1.0); coordinate filing of same (.3).

02/17/22 Rae Guyse Draft cross examination outlines for witnesses in preparation of 6.10
confirmation hearing.

02/17/22 Ernest Martin Discussion with Ms. Dubose regarding Declaration 1.90
e (.6); communication with

Mr. Azer regarding tasks related to trial (.2); review Ms. Sheperd's

revisions to response to motion- (.1); review and revise latest

version of BSA's response to insurers' motio (.5); discussion

with Mr. Azer regarding (:4); review e-mails from Mr.

Hershey, Mr. Kurz, and Mr. Andolina regarding
(.1).

$6,142.00

$260.00

$5,100.00

$3,355.00

$2,042.50
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Date Timekeeper Description
02/17/22 Benjamin Schindler Correspondence with Mr. Stoner and Mr. Azer regarding revised responses

to insurer and other objections (0.1); conference with Mr. Azer and Mr.
Stoner regarding same (0.5); follow up conference with Mr. Stoner
regarding same (0.2); review, analyze, and create chart

(1.0);
correspondence regarding revised task list (0.1).

02/17/22 Mike Stoner Review document collection involving

- (2.5); work on editing

reviewing and preparing comments to
confirmation brief (1.5).

declaration (1.5); work on
in Plan

02/18/22 Adrian Azer Prepare for deposition of Ms. McNally (1.8); attend deposition of Ms.
McNally (2.0); review notice of deposition (:3);
attend Court hearing (2.2); conference with Mr. Stoner regarding
supplemental document production (.5); review task list in preparation for
team meeting (.3); conference with team (.8); conference with KCIC
regarding (.4); emails with
counsel to the UCC regarding (:2).

02/18/22 Natalie Dubose Telephone conference with Mr. Azer, Mr. Schindler, Ms. Guyse, Mr.
Stoner, Ms. Green, Mr. Dutton, and Mr. Martin regarding trial strategy
(.6); review correspondence from Mr. Stoner regarding declarations .
(.1); review correspondence from Ms. Thomas regarding same (.1);
review correspondence from Mr. Lloyd regarding exhibit list (.1); review
correspondence from Mr. Burnett on response to motion (.1);
review correspondence from Mr. Stoner regarding task list (.1);
correspondence with Mr. Burnett regarding
(-1); review objections to
(.3); review latest task list from W&C (.2).

02/18/22 Wesley Dutton Research
(.4); attend call with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, Ms. Green, Mr. Stoner, Ms.
Dubose, Ms. Guyse, and Mr. Schindler (.7).

02/18/22 Carla Green Conference call with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, Mr. Stoner, Ms. Dubose, Ms.
Guyse, Mr. Dutton, and Mr. Schindler to discuss trial strategy (.7);
continue draft of (2.3); review and analyze
hearing transcript for same (.6); review and analyze - transcript in
preparation for cross examination (.6); continue draft of cross examination

outline ||| ®-

02/18/22 Rae Guyse Team meeting to discuss confirmation hearing.

02/18/22 Ernest Martin Attend McNally deposition (.7); review insurers' 30(b)(6) deposition notice
to BSA (.1); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding_ (:2);
attend BSA bankruptcy hearing (2.8); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding
court hearing and case issues (.2); conference call with internal team to
discuss trial task lists (.5).

March 17, 2022

Page 28 of 42

Hours Amount
1.90 $1,045.00
5.50 $3,960.00
8.50 $7,225.00
1.70 $1,258.00
1.10 $715.00
5.00 $3,750.00
0.80 $440.00
4.50 $4,837.50
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02/18/22 Benjamin Schindler Review and updates to current task list, including correspondence

regarding same (0.2); review and analyze objections
and review draft of confirmation brief for revisions to same and further
responses to objections (5.9); conference with team in anticipation and
preparation of trial tasks (0.7); correspondence with Mr. Stoner regarding

respors [N ©>)

02/18/22 Mike Stoner Finalize document tagging for production (.9); call with Mr. Azer
regarding document production (.3); call with internal team regarding BSA
task list and upcoming deadlines (1.0); review Mr. Schindler cha

(.3); continue working on revisions and comments to

Brief (2.2).
02/19/22 Adrian Azer Conference with Mr. Hammond and White and Case team, Mr. Martin and
Ms. Dubose regarding next steps (.6); emails related
to revisions to charts t
(.2).
02/19/22 Natalie Dubose Telephone conference with Mr. Hershey, Ms. Shepherd, Mr. Azer, Mr.

Martin, Mr. Stoner, and Mr. Hammond regarding- (.6); review
correspondence from Mr. Azer regarding supplemental expert reports (.1);
review correspondence from Mr. Hammond regarding same (.1);
correspondence with Mr. Martin regarding deposition transcripts (.1).

02/19/22 Ernest Martin Conference call with Mr. Hammond, Mr. Hershey, Ms. Shepherd, Ms.
Dubose and Mr. Azer to discuss strategy related to supplemental reports .
(.6); review_ deposition
transcript (2.5); review BSA update confirmation task list (.1); review
deposition transcript of Mr. Bates (.3).

02/19/22 Benjamin Schindler Revise task list and circulate to HB team (0.5); review, summarize and
revise responses to insurer objections and review of- objections
(1.3).

02/19/22 Mike Stoner Analysis regarding issues relating to supplementation of expert reports.
(.6).

02/20/22 Adrian Azer Conference with Mr. Hammond and White and Case team, Mr. Martin,

Ms. Dubose, and Ms. Green regarding supplementing expert report and
next steps (1.3); review and comment on draft objections and responses to
insurers' 30(b)(6) notice (.3); conference with Mr. Hershey regarding same
and objections to insurers' 30(b)(6) notice (.3); conferences with Mr.
Martin regarding same (.2); email to T. Gallagher regarding plan revisions
(.2); respond to various
emails from insurers (.2); emails with client regarding
and collection of documents
and email to counsel (.2); review
(.3); review and revise coverage charts

(3).

(.3); review

March 17, 2022

Page 29 of 42
Hours Amount
7.00 $3,850.00
4.70 $3,384.00
0.80 $680.00
0.90 $666.00
3.50 $3,762.50
1.80 $990.00
0.60 $432.00
3.60 $3,060.00
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02/20/22 Natalie Dubose Telephone conference with Mr. Hershey, Ms. Shepherd, Mr. Azer, Mr. 2.00 $1,480.00

Martin, Mr. Hammond, Ms. Hanke, and Ms. Green regarding expert
supplements (1.3); review correspondence from Mr. Azer regarding
McNally deposition (.1); review correspondence from Mr. Azer to
mediator regarding (.1); review
correspondence from Mr. Azer regarding production of documents (.1);
review draft (.1); review comments
from Mr. Azer regarding same (.1); correspondence with Ms. Hanke
regarding insurer’s objection (.1); correspondence with Mr. Burnett
regardin (.1).

Research 4.10
(3.5); email summary of research findings to Mr. Azer and

Ms. Green (.6).

02/20/22 Wesley Dutton

02/20/22 Carla Green Conference call with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, Ms. Dubose, KCIC, White and 2.30
Case, and Bates White to discuss (1.2); begin review

of _ outline in preparation fo declaration (.6);
correspondence with Mr. Dutton regarding same (.2); correspondence with

Ms. Kutz regarding (.1); correspondence with Mr. Azer

regarding (:2).

02/20/22 Rae Guyse Draft cross examination outlines_ (1.6); send draft 1.80
outline to Mr. Stoner for review (.2).

02/20/22 Ernest Martin Conference call with KCIC, Bates White, and White and Case to discuss 3.30
possible supplementation of KCIC and Bates White reports (1.2);
discussion with Mr. Azer regarding same (.1); review
(.2); review
Bates deposition transcript (1.8).

02/20/22 Mike Stoner Work on issues relating to 4.50
(1.9); work on preparing comments
and revisions to TDP section on Confirmation Brief (2.6).

02/21/22 Adrian Azer Review and comment on_ response to the 5.90
Plan objections (1.6); correspondence with Mr. Stoner regarding same (.2);
conference with Ms. Baccash and team regarding revisions to same (2.0);
conference with Ms. Green and Mr. Dutton regarding declaration
(.3); review research related to (.3);
conference with Ms. Baccash and White and Case team regarding
confirmation (.3); review and revise draft memorandum related to
(.3); conference with Mr. Hammond regarding
same (.1); conference with Mr. Martin regarding same (.3); review and
revise and emails related to same (.3); emails
related to (.2).

$2,665.00

$1,725.00

$990.00

$3,547.50

$3,240.00

$5,015.00
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Timekeeper

02/21/22 Natalie Dubose

02/21/22

02/21/22

02/21/22

02/21/22

02/21/22

02/21/22

Wesley Dutton

Carla Green

Rae Guyse

Ernest Martin

Benjamin Schindler

Mike Stoner

March 17, 2022

Description Hours

Page 31 of 42

Amount

Communication with Mr. Burnett regarding (.1); prepare 3.90
for and participate in conference with Mr. Burnett on new report (.8); draft,
edit and revise summary

(1.0); correspondence with Mr. Burnett
(.1); telephone conference with Mr. Burnett
(.5); review comments from Ms. Bacash regarding
confirmation brief (.3); review comments from Mr. Azer regarding same
(.2); correspondence with Mr. Hershey regarding motion to seal

(.1); review updated task list (.1); review
comments from Mr. Thomas on declaration (.1); review
correspondence from Mr. Hershey on supplemental discovery (.1); edit and
revise legal notes (:3); review
comments from Mr. Gorsich regarding same (.1); review correspondence
from Ms. Hanke regarding (.1).

Review outline in anticipation of call with Mr. Azer and Ms. 0.70
Green regardin, declaration and supplemental report (.4); attend
call with Mr. Azer and Ms. Green to discuss changes (.3).

Conference call with Mr. Azer and Mr. Dutton to discuss- 1.90
declaration and (.3); conference call with Ms.

Kutz to discuss (.5); finaliz

letter to insurers (.4); correspondence with Mr. Azer regarding same (.2);

review and analyze several correspondence with Ms. Kutz in preparation

for conference, including_ (.5).

Draft cross examination outliine. 2.00

Conference call with Mr. Burnette and Ms. Dubose regarding supplemental 1.60
report (.5); conference call with White and Case and internal team

regarding plan brief (.1); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding case
developments (.2); review notes on
s (.2); review notes on

deposition transcript (.3).

Continued review, summary and revisions to proposed responses to 4.00
- objections (2.0); correspondence with Mr. Stoner regarding same
(0.1); review, summarize and revise proposed responses to
Plan objections, including review of] objections (1.5); further
correspondence with Mr. Stoner regarding same (0.2); correspondence
with co-counsel regarding updated BSA confirmation task list (0.2).

Work on organizing documents to prepare for Mr. Azer deposition 9.10
(1.9); work on preparing comments

Confirmation Brief (3.3); review
section in Confirmation Brief (1.2); conference call
with Mr. Azer, Mr. Hammond, Mr. Gorsich, Ms. Baccash, Ms. Smith, Ms.
Shepherd, and Mr. Green regarding
section of Confirmation Brief (2.7).

$2,886.00

$455.00

$1,425.00

$1,100.00

$1,720.00

$2,200.00

$6,552.00
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Page 32 of 42

Amount

02/22/22  Adrian Azer Review and revise section of response to Plan objections related to - 8.90
-(.4); review White and Case task list and email to Haynes and Boone

team regarding same (.2); emails with Ms. Baccash regarding revisions to

(-2); multiple emails from

client (.2); conference with Mr. Stoner regarding response to

Plan objection (.3); review draft section of response to Plan

(.5); consider amendments to Plan to

address objections (1.2); prepare for conference

with client regarding (:3); conference with client,

, White and Case, and Mr. Stoner regarding same (1.1);
conference with White and Case and Mr. Martin regardin
(1.1); conference with Mr. Gorsich, Ms. Baccash, and Mr. Stoner
regarding objections to the Plan (.8); conference with
Ms. Hanke (KCIC) regarding (.1); conference with Mr.
Stoner and Mr. Schindler regarding the draft response to
objection (.6); conference with Mr. Martin regarding various
issues (.2); begin to review draft response to Plan
objection and provide comments to same (1.2); review draft of]
supplemental report and email to team regarding proposed revisions (.5).

02/22/22 Natalie Dubose Edit and revise- draft report (1.4); correspondence with Mr. 1.90
Winstead regarding confirmation hearing (.1); review updated task list (.1);
review correspondence from Ms. Henke regarding (.1);
review comments from Mr. Stoner to report (.1); review comments

from Mr. Azer to draft-report (.1).

02/22/22 Wesley Dutton Draft declaration_.

02/22/22 Carla Green Review and analyze several correspondence sent by Ms. Kutz regarding 1.80
information requested from insurers (.3); draft summary for Ms. Kutz
regarding same (.3); review correspondence from Ms. Kutz regarding

and corresponding documents sent (.4); correspondence
with Mr. Azer regarding same (.1); conference with Mr. Azer regarding
same (.1); review and analyze

(.4); correspondence with Ms. Kutz regarding same

3.20

(2)

02/22/22 Ernest Martin Complete review of] deposition transcript (.5); review e-mail from 3.40
Mr. Hallowell regarding objection to BSA's proposed revised confirmation
scheduling order (.1); review e-mail from Mr. Kurz regarding

and reply to same (.4); conference call with

White and Case to discuss (1.1); discussion with Mr.

Azer regarding same (.1); review e-mail from Mr. Gorsich regarding

(.4); review draft supplemental report

(.3); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding (.2); review

Mr. Stoner's and Mr. Azer's comments to supplemental report

(3).

$7,565.00

$1,406.00

$2,080.00

$1,350.00

$3,655.00
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02/22/22 Benjamin Schindler Reconcile W&C and HB task list to create revised task list, including 5.90
correspondence with groups regarding same (0.6); conference with Mr.

Stoner regarding comments to brief (0.1); review, revise

and comment on draft brief, with particular attention to

(4.3); correspondence with Mr.

Azer and Mr. Stoner regarding same (0.2); conference with Mr. Azer and

Mr. Stoner discussing revisions to and strategy for same (0.6); updates to

brief stemming from same (0.1).

02/22/22 Mike Stoner Finalize first draft of revisions to Confirmation Brief (2.3); 9.90
call with Mr. Azer regarding comments to Confirmation
Brief (.3); conference call with Mr. Azer, Ms. Baccash, Ms. Shepherd, Mr.

Griggs, Mr. Manning, and BSA regarding document production under

(1.1); analysis regarding

(4.2); conference call with Mr. Azer, Mr.
Gorsich, and Ms. Baccash regardin Objections (.7);
conference call with Mr. Azer, Mr. Gorsich, and Ms. Hanke regarding
supplemental expert report (.3); prepare email to Mr. Jaoude regarding
production relating to
(.1); conference call with Mr. Schindler and Mr. Azer
regarding revisions to (.6); review and
prepare comments to supplemental report (3).

02/23/22 Adrian Azer Conference with Mr. McGowan, Mr. Andolina, Mr. Martin and Mr. 9.10
Whittman (.7); review revised section of response to Plan objections

related to (1.9); review and revise Confirmation Order

(1.6); attend mediation session with the White and Case team and

claimants regarding reports (1.0); post-

conference with Mr. Martin (.4); conference with counsel to the FCR (Mr.
Winstead) and Mr. Hammond and the White and Case team (.4);

conference with counsel to the FCR (Ms. Grim) and Mr. Gorsich and the

White and Case team regarding (.4); conference

with Mr. Gorsich and the White and Case team regarding revisions to the

draft response to Plan objections related to (.5);

conference with Ms. Hanke regarding presentation
_ (.3); conference with counsel regarding same (.2);
review emails from KCIC related to (:3); review
(.3); review additional sections of response
(.6); review revised

to Plan objections, including
Confirmation Order (.5).

$3,245.00

$7,128.00

$7,735.00
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02/23/22 Natalie Dubose Telephone conference with Mr. Abbott, Mr. Warner, Ms. Thomas, Ms. 3.50
Shepherd, Mr. Kim, Mr. Andolina, Ms. Kim, Mr. Kurtz, Mr. Hammond,
Ms. Baccash, Mr. Jaoude, Mr. Gorsich, Mr. Hershey; Mr. Stoner and Ms.
Green (.6); edit and revise Supplemental Report (1.2);
correspondence with regarding same (.1); review updated draft
0 report from (.2); telephone conference with Ms.
Shepherd, Mr. Hammond, Ms. Baccash, Ms. Neely, Mr. Hershey, Mr.
Gorsich, Mr. Azer and Mr. Winstead regarding confirmation hearing (.4);
telephone conference with to discuss report draft (.5);
correspondence with Ms. Green regarding
(.1); review Certain Insurers Status Update to court (.1); review
correspondence from Mr. Andolina regarding same (.1); review draft
response to _ motion to compel production (.2).

outline

02/23/22 Wesley Dutton Draft declaration of
declaration to Mr. Azer and Ms. Green with summary

declaration (5.6); email draft of 5.80
(:2).

02/23/22 Carla Green Attend conference call with White & Case and Haynes and Boone to 6.60
discuss revised scheduling order (.6); continue draft of outline on motion
(1.4); review and analyze pleadings, depositions and reports for
same (1.2); correspondence with Mr. Azer regarding same (.2); review and
comment on confirmation brie- (.9); begin review and revisions

to - declaration (2.3).

02/23/22 Ernest Martin Participate in update call with Mr. McGowan, Ms. Lauria, Mr. Andolina, 5.70
Mr. Whittman, and Mr. Azer (.8); participate in call with all parties to

discuss Revised Confirmation Scheduling Order (.7); participate in

mediation call with TCC, FCR, Coalition and White and Case to discuss

(1.0); discussion with Mr. Azer

regarding same (.4); discussion with Ms. Green regarding insurers' motion

(.1); review e-mail from KCIC regarding analysis
(.1); review revisions to draft supplemental report (.1);
review revisions to BSA Confirmation
brief (2.3); review

02/23/22 Benjamin Schindler Correspondence with Mr. Azer, Mr. Stoner and White and Case team 0.10
regarding review of confirmation brief (0.1).

02/23/22 Mike Stoner Prepare emails to White and Case concerning Confirmation 6.60
brief (.1); call with Mr. Azer regarding_ (.1); review and
prepare comments on Confirmation Brief section regarding

(1.2); work on revisions to
Declaration (1.3); review and prepare additional comments on
(1.6); review and prepare comments on Confirmation Order (.7); attend
conference call with White and Case concerning Confirmation Schedule
(.6); call with Ms. Smith regarding revisions _ (.2); conference
call with Mr. Azer, Ms. Neely, Ms. Grim, Mr. Gorsich, and Ms. Baccash
regarding arguments on—s (.6); review and analyze
most recent version of] - Report (.2).

$2,590.00

$3,770.00

$4,950.00

$6,127.50

$55.00

$4,752.00
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02/24/22 Adrian Azer Conference with Mr. Stoner and Mr. Schindler regarding response to Plan 9.90
objections (.2); conference with Ms. Baccash and White and Case team

regarding same (.3); conference with counsel regarding

(.2); attend information
(.8); attend status conference (1.5);

conferences with
(1.1); conference with Mr. Kurtz and White and Case team, Mr. Evans, and
insurers (.8); review letter response to the motion to
compel (.2); emails related to (.4); review
draft response to Plan objections, specifically sections related to
(3.6); conference with Mr. Stoner and Mr. Schindler regarding same (.5);
emails related to mediation (.3).

02/24/22 Natalie Dubose Attend
comments from Mr. Kurtz regarding response to
to compel (.1); correspondence with Mr. Martin regarding updated
draft (.1); correspondence with Mr. Martin regarding supplementing expert
reports (.1); review sections of confirmation brief addressing

(.8); review correspondence from Mr. Azer regarding supplementing

report (.1); correspondence with team regarding

declaration (.1); review correspondence from Ms. Green regarding-
declaration (.1); review correspondence from Mr. Martin to team regarding
supplementing reports (.1); correspondence with

Ms. Baccash regarding (.1); review final draft of

response to Motion to Compel (.1); review comments

from Mr. Kurtz regarding same (.1); review hearing outline on motion.

(2).

(.8); review

motion

02/24/22 Carla Green Continue review and revisions to - declaration provided by Mr. 4.80
Dutton (1.3); correspondence with Ms. Dubose regarding

(.2); finalize outline for hearing on motion

(1.6); review and analyze pleadings, exhibits, depositions and case

law for same (1.5); correspondence with Ms. Dubose and Mr. Azer

regarding same (.2).

020422 Rae Guyse Avenc 060

$8,415.00

$2,072.00

$3,600.00

$330.00
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Review (.1); communication 6.10
with Ms. Dubose regarding supplemental report (.1); prepare e-

mail to Mr. Kurz regarding next steps with respect to expert
supplementation (.4); conference call with Ms. Baccash, Mr. Gorsich, and
Mr. Stoner to discuss plan brief (.5); conference call with
(.5); discussion with Mr. Azer
regarding case developments (.2); review letter

(.1); review latest version of Confirmation Brief related to
(2 review N () o

court status conference (1.0); conference call with White and Case team to
discuss same and (.2); conference call with Mr.
Kurz, Mr. Gorsich, Mr. Ruggeri, Mr. Evans, and Mr. Azer to discuss

(.9); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding same (.2);
conference call with Mr. Gorsich and Mr. Azer regarding same (.2); review
letter briefs in response to insurers' motion to
compel (.3); review deposition (1.0).

Correspondence with Mr. Azer and Mr. Stoner regarding review and 10.60
revisions to confirmation brief (0.1); review of Mr. Azer comments and
revisions (0.1); conference with Mr. Azer and Mr. Stoner regarding same
(0.3); further review of Mr. Azer comments to confirmation brief (0.7);
correspondence with Mr. Stoner and Ms. Green regarding additions to
brief and review for same (0.5); conference with Mr.
Stoner and Mr. Azer regarding same (0.3); conference with HB and W&C
team regarding revisions of brief (0.5);
conference with Mr. Stoner regarding revised draft of brief section

(0.2); begin draft of same (2.7); correspondence
with Mr. Stoner regarding outline for same (0.3); continued draft of| -
brief (4.9).

Work on revisions to (2.5); call 13.20
with Mr. Azer regarding revisions to Confirmation

Brief (.3); call with Ms. Baccash, Ms. Warner Ms. Kim, Mr. Gorsich, Mr.

Azer, and Mr. Martin regarding Confirmation Brief (.3);

analysis regarding Confirmation Brief (4.9); further call

with Mr. Azer, Ms. Baccash, Ms. Kim, Mr. Gorsich, and Ms. Warner

regarding revisions of Confirmation Brief (.6); work on

revising Confirmation Brief] 4.1);
additional calls with Mr. Azer regarding Confirmation Brief

(5).

$6,557.50

$5,830.00

$9,504.00
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Invoice Number: 21524508 March 17, 2022

Matter Name: General Insurance Matters
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00024
Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Date Timekeeper Description Hours

Page 37 of 42

Amount

02/25/22 Adrian Azer Conference with claimants regarding confirmation and plan objections (.1); 8.30
conference with Ms. Baccash and team regarding
(.7); conferences with Mr. Martin regarding
various issues (.7); conference with Mr. Evans, Ms. Hanke, and White and
Case team regarding supplemental reports (1.0); conference with Mr.
Martin and counsel (.6); follow-up conference with Mr. Evans
and White and Case team, and Mr. Martin (1.2); conference with Ms.
Hanke regarding supplemental report (.2); emails related to
mediation session (.4); emails with client related to
(.2); review and revise response to Plan
objections (.8); emails with KCIC regarding (.3);
review supplemental expert report (.6); emails with team
regarding confirmation hearing (.4); review prior drafts
for confirmation hearing (.5); emails related to confirmation hearing (.3);
emails with White and Case team regarding questions

(3).

02/25/22 Natalie Dubose Correspondence with Mr. Azer regarding hearing coordination (.1); 3.80
Outline declaration for confirmation hearing (.6); prepare
notes for hearing on motio t (.8); telephone
conference with Mr. Azer, Mr. Hammond, and Mr. Telemi on confirmation
issues (.7); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding same (.2); discussion with
Ms. Green regarding documents needed for hearing
(.2); edit and revise hearing outline- (.6); review latest order of
proof (.2); correspondence with Mr. Azer regarding same (.1); review
correspondence from Ms. Lauria regarding same (.1); review and update
latest task list (.2).

02/25/22 Wesley Dutton Review draft of declaration_ (.3); review current draft of 0.40
task list (.1).

02/25/22 Carla Green Complete revisions of outline for hearing on motion in limine per Ms. 3.00
Dubose's comments (.6); prepare hearing binder with exhibits and
pleadings for Mr. Martin in preparation for same (1.4); review and analyze
supplemental objections in preparation for response (1.0).

02/25/22 Rae Guyse Draft, revise, and ﬁnalize_ cross-examination outline. 5.10

02/25/22 Ernest Martin Review e-mails from Mr. Hershey, Mr. Gorsich, and Mr. Hammond 2.80
regarding Confirmation brief (.1); review deposition (.4);
discussion with Mr. Azer regarding (.2); conference call
with Mr. Evans, Ms. Hanke, Ms. Shepherd, Mr. Gorsich, and Mr. Azer
regarding (.5); conference call with Mr. Rugerri to discuss
(.5); discussion with Mr. Azer regarding same (.2);
discussion with Mr. Azer regardin- (.2); conference call with
Mr. Bates, Mr. Evans, Mr. Kurz, Mr. Gorsich, and Mr. Azer to discuss

7).

$7,055.00

$2,812.00

$260.00

$2,250.00

$2,805.00

$3,010.00
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Invoice Number: 21524508

Matter Name: General Insurance Matters
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00024

Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Date Timekeeper

02/25/22 Benjamin Schindler

02/25/22 Mike Stoner

02/26/22 Adrian Azer

02/26/22 Natalie Dubose

02/26/22 Carla Green

02/26/22 Ernest Martin

02/26/22 Benjamin Schindler

Description

March 17, 2022
Page 38 of 42

brief (3.0);

Continued draft of
correspondence with Mr. Stoner regarding same and
(0.1); review and analyze insurer brief and
case law for legal memorandum to Mr. Stoner
(1.4); further correspondence and analysis with and to Mr. Stoner
regarding same (0.9).

Edit and revise Confirmation Brief regardin (3.5); edit and
revise Confirmation brief regarding

(4.0).

Begin to review numerous supplemental plan objections,
upplemental objection and objections by other parties
(1.5); prepare for conference with White and Case related to
(.3); conference with Ms. Lauria, Mr. Kurtz and White and
Case team, and Mr. Martin and Ms. Dubose regarding (.9);
review responses and objections to
in preparation for call with White and Case (.3);
conference with Mr. Hershey and Mr. Hammond regarding same (.8);
conference with Ms. Baccash and White and Case team, and Mr. Stoner
regarding response to plan objections (.6); conference with Ms. Grim
regarding— (.2); review and revise supplemental report of
(.7); conference with Ms. Hanke regarding same (.2).

Telephone conference with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, Mr. Hammond, Mr.
Abbott, Mr. Hershey, Ms. Thomas, Mr. Gorsich, Ms. Baccash, Ms. Smith,
Ms. Warner, Mr. Stoner, Ms. Shepherd, Mr. Kurtz regarding
(.9); draft, edit and revise declaration of]
confirmation hearing (3.0); review and analyze
Supplemental Objection (1.3); correspondence with team regarding
supplemental reports (.1); review correspondence from Mr. Azer regarding
same (.1); review correspondence from Mr. Gorsich regarding
(.1); review correspondence from Mr. Gorsich regarding
(.1); review final hearing outline (.2); review
supplemental report of Ms. Gutzler (.3); review updates to summary
objection chart (.1).

(.3);

Complete final revisions to outline for hearing
multiple correspondence with Mr. Martin regarding same (.3).

Conference call with White and Case and internal team to discuss
(.9); review emails from Mr. Gorsich, Mr. Kurz, and
Mr. Azer regarding (.1); revie
change (.1); review Insurers' Supplemental Objections
to Plan (1.7); review draft second supplemental report
and proposed revisions to same (.3); review outline for BSA response

(3).

Correspondence with HB and White and Case teams regarding insurer
supplemental objections (0.1); review of same (0.3).

Hours Amount
5.40 $2,970.00
7.50 $5,400.00
5.50 $4,675.00
6.20 $4,588.00
0.60 $450.00
3.40 $3,655.00

0.40 $220.00
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Invoice Number: 21524508
Matter Name: General Insurance Matters
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00024

Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Date

Timekeeper

02/26/22

02/27/22

02/27/22

02/27/22

02/27/22

02/27/22

02/27/22

Mike Stoner

Adrian Azer

Natalie Dubose

Carla Green

Ernest Martin

Benjamin Schindler

Mike Stoner

Description

March 17, 2022

Hours

Page 39 of 42

Amount

Conference call with White and Case, Morris Nichols, and Haynes and
Boone teams regarding trial preparation and order of proof (.9); call with
Mr. Azer regarding supplemental objections (.1); work on on revising

Confirmation Brief (3.5); call with White and Case team
and Mr. Azer regarding briefing strategy (.6).

Attend mediation session_ regarding Plan objection (.8); post-
conference with Ms. Baccash and Mr. Gorsich (.1); conference with Ms.
Grim regarding discussion (.1); conference with Ms. Baccash
and team regarding response to plan objections (.6); conference with Mr.
Martin regarding various issues (.8); review and revise
response to Plan objections (1.4); continue to review supplemental plan
objections filed by insurers and various other parties
(1.2); emails related to supplementing expert reports (.2).

Continue to draft, edit and revise declaration in support of

confirmation hearing (2.0); correspondence with Mr. Azer regarding
supplemental report (.1); review correspondence from Mr. Azer on

revised draft (.1); correspondence with Mr. Martin regarding-

(1.

Begin draft of case and law summaries for_ hearing (1.2);
review and analyze case law for same (.8).

Prepare for hearing on Insurers' Motion in Limine (1.3); discussion with
Mr. Azer regarding same and regarding_ (.8).

Correspondence with Mr. Stoner and Mr. Azer regarding revisions to brief,
including review of comments to same.

Review supplemental objections filed by Insurers (.6); finalize first draft of
revisions to brief (2.4); finalize first draft of

declaration (1.2); conference call with Mr. Azer, Ms.
Bacchash, Mr. Gorsich, Ms. Shepherd, Ms. Rivero, Ms. Kim, and Ms.
Smith regarding revisions to briefing matters (.6); work on preparing edits
and revisions to - declaration (1.1); conference with Mr. Martin
regarding briefing (.2); review Mr. Azer revisions to brief regarding-
-(.2); call with Mr. Azer regarding revisions to brief (.8); work on
preparing additional revisions to Confirmation Brief based on revisions
proposed by Mr. Azer (1.2).

5.10

5.20

2.30

2.00

2.10

0.50

8.30

$3,672.00

$4,420.00

$1,702.00

$1,500.00

$2,257.50

$275.00

$5,976.00
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Invoice Number: 21524508 March 17, 2022

Matter Name: General Insurance Matters
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00024
Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Date Timekeeper Description Hours

Page 40 of 42

Amount

02/28/22 Adrian Azer Review and revise response to Plan objections, specifically focusing on 9.60

(3.8); multiple conferences with Mr. Stoner and Mr. Schindler regarding
revisions to same (.8); conferences with Mr. Martin regarding various
issues (.4); conference with Mr. Hershey regarding 30(b)(6) meet and
confer (.2); conference with Ms. Grim regarding plan objections (.1);
attend team meeting (.8); conference with Mr. Gorsich, Ms. Shepherd, and
claimants regarding confirmation hearing (.9); conference call regarding
(.4); attend mediation session
related to objection (.3); follow-up emails related to same (.3);
multiple calls with White and Case regarding response to Plan objections
(.5); emails related to objection and claims (.3); review and
comment on proposed declarations (.4); emails with team regarding same
(.2); review proposed Plan revisions by FCR related to

objection (.2).

02/28/22 Natalie Dubose Continue to draft, edit and revise declaration ||| (-6 4.40

telephone conference with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, Mr. Schindler, Ms.

Green, Ms. Guyse, Mr. Stoner, Mr. Dutton on confirmation tasks (.2);

telephone conference with Mr. Azer and Mr. Marti_(.6);

edit and revise- supplemental report per comments from Mr. Azer

and Mr. Martin (.4); review and edit- citations in brief]

(.8); correspondence with Mr. Azer regarding same (.1); review

comments by Mr. Azer to citations (.3); correspondence with

Mr. Hammond regarding (.1); update task list (.2); review
correspondence from Mr. Azer regarding proposed plan edits

a

02/28/22 Wesley Dutton Attend call (in part) with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, Ms. Green, Ms. Dubose, 0.50
Mr. Stoner, Mr. Schindler, and Ms. Guyse (.2); review research memos for
analysis (.2); email Ms. Green draft of memo

).

02/28/22 Carla Green Conference call with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, Ms. Dubose, Mr. Stoner, Mr. 7.30
Dutton, Mr. Schindler, and Ms. Guyse to discuss response to objections

and other issues (.2); conference with Mr. Stoner regarding

confirmation brief insert (.2); review and analyze

supplemental objections for response (.8); review and analyze response for

additional insert (.5); draft insert on objection (2.7);

review and analyze case law regarding same (1.8); finalize draft of case

summaries for hearing (-8); update Mr. Martin's

hearing binder with exhibits and case summaries (.3).

02/28/22 Rae Guyse Update task list and circulate to team (.1); perform final review of draft 0.50
cross examination outline and send to Mr. Stoner for review (.1); send
communication to Mr. Azer (.1); join team status call (.2).

$8,160.00

$3,256.00

$325.00

$5,475.00

$275.00
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Invoice Number: 21524508

March 17, 2022

Matter Name: General Insurance Matters
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00024

Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Date Timekeeper

02/28/22 Ernest Martin

02/28/22 Benjamin Schindler

02/28/22 Mike Stoner

Total Fees

Description Hours

Page 41 of 42

Amount

Discussion with Mr. Azer regarding (.2); conference 4.60
call with internal team to discuss action items on task list (.2); review

revisions to- Supplemental Report (.5); review
citations for Confirmation Brief (.6); review revisions to
citations (.3); discussion with Ms. Buchanan regarding
work on hearing outline (2.5).

(.3);

Review and analysis of revised Plan, Trust Distribution documents, and 14.40
Certain Insurers' supplemental objections
(2.3); draft section in brief regarding
(1.9); correspondence with HB Team regarding task list and review
and updates to same (0.2); bi-weekly status conference with team
regarding confirmation (0.2); further draft of section
(1.5); correspondence with Mr. Stoner and Mr. Azer
regarding revisions to brief section (0.3); conference
with Mr. Azer and Mr. Stoner (in part) regarding same (0.3);
correspondence with Mr. Azer, Mr. Stoner, HB team and co-counsel
regarding revisions to brief, (0.2);
further revisions to confirmation brief section stemming from
discussion with Mr. Azer (3.0); further correspondence with Mr. Azer and
Mr. Stoner regarding same, and revisions to section, generally (0.3);
conference with Mr. Azer regarding revisions to same (1.2); further
revisions to same (3.0).

Continue working on revisions based on Mr. Azer comments 11.40
(4.5); prepare email to Ms. Green regarding confirmation brief insert for
(.1); call with White and Case team and Mr. Azer
regarding Confirmation Brief; call with Mr. Azer, Mr. Martin, Ms.
Dubose, Ms. Green, Mr. Schindler, Ms. Guyse, and Mr. Dutton concerning
internal tasks (.2); work on drafting responses to Supplemental Objections
(6.4); prepare email to White and Case team regarding revisions to brief

(2).

$4,945.00

$7,920.00

$8,208.00

$744,245.50

Timekeeper Summary

Timekeeper Title Hours Rate Amount
Adrian Azer Partner 237.80 $850.00 $202,130.00
Ernest Martin Partner 109.10 $1,075.00 $117,282.50
Benjamin Schindler Associate 92.20 $550.00 $50,710.00
Carla Green Associate 106.80 $750.00 $80,100.00
Mike Stoner Associate 198.10 $720.00 $142,632.00
Rae Guyse Associate 58.70 $550.00 $32,285.00
Wesley Dutton Associate 65.50 $650.00 $42,575.00
Natalie Dubose Counsel 103.10 $740.00 $76,294.00
DiAnna Gaeta Consultant 0.60 $395.00 $237.00

Total Professional Summary $744,245.50
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Invoice Number: 21524508 March 17, 2022
Matter Name: General Insurance Matters Page 42 of 42
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00024

Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Total Fees, Expenses and Charges $744,245.50

Total Amount Due USD $744,245.50
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HAYNES BOONE

Invoice Number: 21524509

Invoice Date: March 17, 2022

Matter Name: Fee Applications
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00035
Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

Boy Scouts of America

Attn: Steven P. McGowan, General Counsel
1325 West Walnut Hill Lane

Irving, TX 75015

REMITTANCE PAGE
For Professional Services Through February 28, 2022

Total Fees $4,563.00
Total Expenses $0.00
Total Fees, Expenses and Charges $4,563.00
Total Invoice Balance Due USD $4,563.00

Haynes and Boone, LLP Tax Identification No: 75-1312888

CHECK PAYMENT INSTRUCTIONS
Haynes and Boone, LLP
P.O. Box 841399
Dallas, TX 75284-1399

ACH PAYMENT INSTRUCTIONS
For Credit to the Account of HAYNES AND BOONE, LLP
ABA No.: 111-000-025 Operating Account No.: 018-08-3729-4

WIRE PAYMENT INSTRUCTIONS
BANK OF AMERICA 100 West 33rd Street New York, NY 10001
For Credit to the Account of HAYNES AND BOONE, LLP
ABA No.: 0260-0959-3 Operating Account No.: 018-08-3729-4
SWIFT Code - USD: BOFAUS3N ® SWIFT Code - Foreign Currency: BOFAUS6S
Bank wire fees are the responsibility of the sender.

NOTE: For ACH / Wire payments, remittance details should be sent to: PaymentDetail@haynesboone.com
Please Reference: Invoice Number 21524509 @ Client Number 0020234.00035 @ Attorney Ernest Martin

PAYMENT IS DUE UPON RECEIPT, UNLESS OTHERWISE AGREED.
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Invoice Number: 21524509

March 17, 2022

Matter Name: Fee Applications Page 2 of 2
Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00035
Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin
For Professional Services Through February 28, 2022
Professional Fees
Date Timekeeper Description Hours Amount
02/14/22 Carla Green Correspondence with Mr. McGovern regarding_ (.1); 0.20 $150.00
correspondence with Mr. Martin regarding same (.1).
02/14/22 Casey B McGovern Edit January invoices in preparation for fee application. 3.30 $1,386.00
02/15/22 Carla Green Review final edits to invoices (.5); correspondence with Mr. McGovern 1.70 $1,275.00
regarding same (.2); final review of 16th Fee Application (.8);
correspondence to coordinate filing of same with Ms. Remington (.2).
02/15/22 Casey B McGovern Review revised invoices in preparation for fee application (.5); emails to 0.60 $252.00
Ms. Maddran and Ms. Green regarding same (.1).
02/17/22 Carla Green Correspondence with Mr. Remington regarding 16th Fee Application (.2); 0.70 $525.00
correspondence with Mr. McGovern regarding revisions to Fee
Application (.2); review summary_ (.3).
02/21/22 Carla Green Multiple correspondence with Ms. Remington regarding 16th Fee 1.30 $975.00
Application (.3); multiple correspondence with Ms. Duncan regarding
(.3); review and analyze
spreadsheets (.3); revise Fee Application
accordingly (.4).
Total Fees $4,563.00
Timekeeper Summary
Timekeeper Title Hours Rate Amount
Carla Green Associate 3.90 $750.00 $2,925.00
Casey B McGovern Paralegal 3.90 $420.00 $1,638.00
Total Professional Summary $4,563.00
Total Fees, Expenses and Charges $4,563.00

Total Amount Due

USD $4,563.00
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Exhibit B

Expense Detail, February 1 — February 28, 2022
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HAYNES BOONE

Invoice Number: 21524510
Invoice Date: March 17, 2022

Matter Name: Expenses

Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00038

Billing

Boy Scouts of America

Attn: Steven P. McGowan, General Counsel
1325 West Walnut Hill Lane

Irving, TX 75015

Attorney: Ernest Martin

REMITTANCE PAGE
For Professional Services Through February 28, 2022

Total Fees
Total Expenses

Total Fees, Expenses and Charges

Total Invoice Balance Due

Haynes and Boone, LLP Tax Identification No: 75-1312888

CHECK PAYMENT INSTRUCTIONS
Haynes and Boone, LLP
P.O. Box 841399
Dallas, TX 75284-1399

ACH PAYMENT INSTRUCTIONS
For Credit to the Account of HAYNES AND BOONE, LLP
ABA No.: 111-000-025 Operating Account No.: 018-08-3729-4

WIRE PAYMENT INSTRUCTIONS
BANK OF AMERICA 100 West 33rd Street New York, NY 10001
For Credit to the Account of HAYNES AND BOONE, LLP
ABA No.: 0260-0959-3 Operating Account No.: 018-08-3729-4
SWIFT Code - USD: BOFAUS3N ® SWIFT Code - Foreign Currency: BOFAUS6S
Bank wire fees are the responsibility of the sender.

NOTE: For ACH / Wire payments, remittance details should be sent to: PaymentDetail@haynesboone.com
Please Reference: Invoice Number 21524510 ® Client Number 0020234.00038 ® Attorney Ernest Martin

PAYMENT IS DUE UPON RECEIPT, UNLESS OTHERWISE AGREED.

$0.00
$2,327.60
$2,327.60

USD $2,327.60
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Invoice Number: 21524510

Matter Name: Expenses

Client/Matter Number: 0020234.00038
Billing Attorney: Ernest Martin

For Professional Services Through February 28, 2022

Date
02/01/22

02/07/22

02/08/22

02/08/22

02/17/22
02/24/22

02/28/22

Expenses

Code Description

DEP Reliable Court Reporting - Deposition Expense

FedEx Federal Express Corporation - To: INFORMATION NOT SUPPLIED Attn: ADRIAN AZER
Airbillnumber: 289575140248 Sender: S. Benjamin Schindler

FedEx Federal Express Corporation - To: INFORMATION NOT SUPPLIED Attn: MR GLENN
KURTZ Airbillnumber: 289599756446 Sender: Mike Stoner

FedEx Federal Express Corporation - To: INFORMATION NOT SUPPLIED Attn: MR GLENN
KURTZ Airbillnumber: 289599708889 Sender: Mike Stoner

ALS- ESI Data Processing and Database Load - Process and tiff| _

130

ALS- Technical time - Prepare emails for production (BSA 20220222)
170

OTH Lighthouse Document Technologies, Inc. - Other Expense

Total Expenses

Expenses Summary

Description Amount
Process and load native data for

review $225.00
Trial prep/Tech time $98.00
Other Expense $150.31
Deposition Expense $1,624.95
Federal Express $229.34
Total Expenses $2,327.60

Total Fees, Expenses and Charges

Total Amount Due

March 17, 2022
Page 2 of 2

Amount
$1,624.95

$47.32
$96.04
$85.98

$225.00
$98.00

$150.31

$2,327.60

$2,327.60

USD $2,327.60
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