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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

In re: Chapter 11

BOY SCOUTS OF AMERICA and Case No. 20-10343 (LSS)
DELAWARE BSA, LLC,!
(Jointly Administered)

Debtors.
Obj. Deadline: March 28, 2022 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

SUMMARY COVER SHEET OF FOURTEENTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF
WHITE & CASE LLP FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION AND
REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD FROM
NOVEMBER 1, 2021 TO AND INCLUDING NOVEMBER 30, 2021

Name of Applicant: White & Case LLP

Authorized to Provide Professional Services to: Debtors and Debtors in Possession

Date of Retention: Effective September 23, 2020

Period for Which Compensation and November 1, 2021 — November 30, 2021
Reimbursement Are Requested:

Amount of Compensation Requested: $3,778,422.80 (80% of $4,723,028.50)

Amount of Expense Reimbursement Requested:  $104,397.84

This is a monthly fee application.

1 The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, together with the last four digits of each Debtor’s federal tax identification
number, are as follows: Boy Scouts of America (6300) and Delaware BSA, LLC (4311). The Debtors’ mailing
address is 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving, Texas 75038.
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PRIOR MONTHLY FEE APPLICATIONS FILED

Requested Approved Outstanding

Date Filed; Period Fees Expenses Fees Expenses Fees Expenses

D.I. Covered
11/23/2020 | 9/23/2020 - | $568,536.80 $0.00 | $426,402.60 $0.00 | $142,134.20 $0.00
D.l. 1729 10/31/2020
12/30/2020 | 11/1/2020 — | $1,332,752.50 $256.11 | $1,066,202.00 $256.11 | $266,550.50 $0.00
D.l. 1885 11/30/2020
2/9/2021 12/1/2020 — | $1,604,473.50 | $2,544.74 | $1,283,578.80 | $2,544.74 | $320,894.70 $0.00
D.l. 2130 12/31/2020
3/10/2021 | 1/1/2021 - | $1,619,976.50 $479.28 | $1,295,981.20 $479.28 | $323,995.30 $0.00
D.l. 2350 1/31/2021
4/16/2021 | 2/1/2021 - | $2,116,633.50 | $1,357.66 | $1,693,306.80 | $1,357.66 | $423,326.70 $0.00
D.l. 2627 2/28/2021
5/17/2021 | 3/1/2021 - | $2,828,345.00 | $1,970.13 | $2,262,676.00 | $1,970.13 | $565,669.00 $0.00
D.l. 4137 3/31/2021
7/1/2021 4/1/2021 - | $2,704,853.50 | $3,922.93 | $2,163,882.80 | $3,922.93 | $540,970.70 $0.00
D.l. 5471 4/30/2021
9/10/2021 | 5/1/2021 - | $2,973,925.50 | $23,051.59 | $2,379,140.40 | $23,051.59 | $594,785.10 $0.00
D.l. 6194 5/31/2021
9/30/2021 | 6/1/2021 - | $2,467,681.00 | $36,219.30" | $1,974,144.80 | $36,219.30 | $493,536.20 $0.00
D.l. 6434 6/30/2021
10/22/2021 | 7/1/2021 — | $3,382,840.00 | $14,684.91 | $2,706,272.00 | $14,684.91 | $676,568.00 $0.00
D.l. 6787 7/31/2021
10/29/2021 | 8/1/2021 - | $3,563,731.50 | $68,392.50 | $2,850,985.20 | $68,392.50 | $712,746.30 $0.00
D.l. 6868 8/31/2021
12/7/2021 | 9/1/2021 - | $2,860,638.50 | $22,304.74 | $2,288,510.80 | $22,304.74 | $572,127.70 $0.00
D.l. 7609 9/30/2021
01/04/2022 | 10/1/2021 - | $3,179,978.50 | $83,335.02 | $2,543,982.80 | $83,335.02 | $635,995.70 $0.00
D.l. 8132 10/31/2021

1

This amount reflects a reduction of $341.15 in requested expenses as a result of an inadvertent error in the application as filed.
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SUMMARY OF TOTAL FEES AND HOURS
BY ATTORNEYS AND PARAPROFESSIONALS

Name Title Year of Areas of Expertise Total | Hourly Total
Admission Hours | Billing | Compensation
Billed® | Rate?
Adler, Christoffer Associate 2015 Debt Finance Practice 31.5 | 1,045.00 32,917.50
Andolina, Michael Partner 1999 Commercial Litigation Practice 219.4 | 1,300.00 285,220.00
Baccash, Laura Counsel 2003 Financial Restructuring & Insolvency (FRI) Practice 197.4 | 1,050.00 207,270.00
Bowron, Ashley Law Clerk 2019 Financial Restructuring & Insolvency (FRI) Practice 82.9 730.00 60,517.00
Brock-Smith, Morgan Law Clerk N/A Pool Associates - Litigation 49.8 635.00 31,623.00
Calaycay - De la Cruz, Project Manager - | N/A Timekeeper Pool 10.7 295.00 3,156.50
Rodelyn Litigation Support
Chemborisov, Gleb Litigation Support | N/A Timekeeper Pool 16.0 330.00 5,280.00
Chen, Tony Project Manager - | N/A Timekeeper Pool 118.4 330.00 39,072.00
Litigation Support
Costello, Andrew Law Clerk N/A Pool Associates - Litigation 34.6 635.00 21,971.00
Cull, Thomas Associate 2015 Commercial Litigation Practice 66.9 990.00 66,231.00
Curtis, Lucas Associate 2020 Commercial Litigation Practice 72.0 635.00 45,720.00
Davis, Arianna Law Clerk N/A Pool Associates - Litigation 19.7 635.00 12,509.50
Davis, Courtney Associate 2021 Pool Associates - Litigation 33.7 635.00 21,399.50
Demoulin, Renza Associate 2019 Commercial Litigation Practice 65.7 835.00 54,859.50
D’Oria, Charlie Associate 2020 Commercial Litigation Practice 1151 730.00 84,023.00

White & Case charged the Debtors for only 50% of non-working travel time, if any, in compliance with Local Rule 2016-2(d)(viii). Such reductions are
reflected in the figures in this column.

As noted in the Debtors’ application to retain White & Case [D.l. 1571], White & Case has agreed that former Sidley professionals who have transitioned to
White & Case will charge the Debtors’ estates for their services at the hourly rate that is the lower of their most recent hourly rate at Sidley and their then-
current hourly rate at White & Case, subject to periodic adjustments in the normal course of White & Case’s operations. Effective January 1, 2021, the hourly
rate for these former Sidley professionals has been adjusted to the lower of the applicable hourly rate for professionals of comparable seniority at Sidley
effective January 1, 2021, on the one hand, and their respective current hourly rate at White & Case, on the other hand. For the other professionals, this
application reflects White & Case’s customary annual rate increases effective January 1, 2021.
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Edmonds, Chloe Law Clerk N/A Pool Associates - Litigation 52.6 635.00 33,401.00
Fuhr, Mark Litigation Support | N/A Financial Restructuring & Insolvency (FRI) Practice 64.4 385.00 24,794.00
Ghafarian, Anissa Associate 2021 Pool Associates - Litigation 27.1 635.00 17,208.50
Gorsich, Ronald Partner 2001 Financial Restructuring & Insolvency (FRI) Practice 182.1 | 1,200.00 218,520.00
Green, Jesse Counsel 2012 Commercial Litigation Practice 57.2 | 1,120.00 64,064.00
Hammond, Andrew Partner 1998 Commercial Litigation Practice 205.2 | 1,285.00 263,682.00
Hershey, Samuel Associate 2013 Commercial Litigation Practice 207.7 | 1,065.00 221,200.50
Hirshorn, Deanna Legal Assistant N/A Financial Restructuring & Insolvency (FRI) Practice 23.4 330.00 7,722.00
Ho, Jason Associate 2022 Pool Associates - Litigation 41.5 635.00 26,352.50
Hong, Alice Associate 2020 Commercial Litigation Practice 98.4 730.00 71,832.00
Huang, Keith Project Manager - | N/A Practice Technology - Disputes 35.5 330.00 11,715.00
Litigation Support
Jaoude, Michael Associate 2018 Commercial Litigation Practice 198.7 940.00 186,778.00
Karchmer, Leah Law Clerk 2021 Commercial Litigation Practice 26.0 635.00 16,510.00
Kim, David Associate 2021 Financial Restructuring & Insolvency (FRI) Practice 102.5 635.00 65,087.50
Kim, Doah Associate 2012 Financial Restructuring & Insolvency (FRI) Practice 115.8 | 1,045.00 121,011.00
Kozakevich, Esther Law Clerk N/A Pool Associates - Litigation 36.3 635.00 23,050.50
Kurtz, Glenn Partner 1990 Commercial Litigation Practice 191.1 | 1,725.00 329,647.50
Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | Partner 2002 Financial Restructuring & Insolvency (FRI) Practice 125.6 | 1,350.00 169,560.00
Lay-at, Eddiemar Project Manager - | N/A Practice Technology - Disputes 19.2 295.00 5,664.00
Litigation Support
Leung, Kenneth Project Manager - | N/A Timekeeper Pool 20.1 330.00 6,633.00
Litigation Support
Levy, Steven Associate 2017 Commercial Litigation Practice 74.4 940.00 69,936.00
Linder, Matthew Counsel 2012 Financial Restructuring & Insolvency (FRI) Practice 114.5 | 1,050.00 120,225.00
Lu, Zhengping Associate 2021 Trade Practice 20.2 645.00 13,029.00
Ludovici, Stephen Law Clerk 2014 Financial Restructuring & Insolvency (FRI) Practice 39.4 | 1,015.00 39,991.00
McDonald, Krista Associate 2015 Commercial Litigation Practice 51.6 990.00 51,084.00
McGuire, Nicholas Associate 2020 Antitrust Practice 1133 | 835.00 94,605.50
Mederos, Rudy Project Manager - | N/A Timekeeper Pool 31.7 565.00 17,910.50
Litigation Support
Mezei, Livy Associate 2017 Financial Restructuring & Insolvency (FRI) Practice 24.3 730.00 17,739.00
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Murray, Sean Associate 2018 Antitrust Practice 34.6 920.00 31,832.00
Obiozor, Chikaodi Associate 2021 Pool Associates - Litigation 15.0 635.00 9,525.00
Phadtare, Rucha Associate 2021 Pool Associates - Litigation 19.8 635.00 12,573.00
Popa, Iva Associate 2020 Commercial Litigation Practice 53.7 730.00 39,201.00
Precht, Sylvia Law Clerk N/A Pool Associates - Litigation 24.6 635.00 15,621.00
Quinn, Logan Associate 2021 Commercial Litigation Practice 97.3 730.00 71,029.00
Radek, Mariel Law Clerk N/A Pool Associates - Litigation 52.2 635.00 33,147.00
Rifkin, David Associate 2018 Commercial Litigation Practice 66.5 835.00 55,527.50
Rivero, Devin Associate 2020 Financial Restructuring & Insolvency (FRI) Practice 105.3 635.00 66,865.50
Rogers de Castilho, Associate 2021 Pool Associates - Litigation 32.1 635.00 20,383.50
Renata

Rogers, Austin Law Clerk 2020 Commercial Litigation Practice 102.7 730.00 74,971.00
Rubashkin, Hannah Associate 2020 Commercial Litigation Practice 37.0 730.00 27,010.00
Saber, Leili Law Clerk N/A Pool Associates - Litigation 69.7 635.00 44,259.50
Saboungi, Sameer Law Clerk N/A Pool Associates - Litigation 27.9 635.00 17,716.50
Schroeder, Katherine Law Clerk 2020 Pool Associates - Litigation 13.4 635.00 8,509.00
Shepherd, Camille Associate 2017 Commercial Litigation Practice 60.5 990.00 59,895.00
Smith, Trudy Associate 2016 Financial Restructuring & Insolvency (FRI) Practice 36.8 940.00 34,592.00
Spencer, Paige Project Manager - | N/A Practice Technology - Disputes 23.1 565.00 13,051.50

Litigation Support
Sporn, Zachary Law Clerk N/A Pool Associates - Litigation 64.3 635.00 40,830.50
Swire, Nathan Associate 2019 Pool Associates - Litigation 21.5 635.00 13,652.50
Telemi, Romer Associate 2021 Commercial Litigation Practice 36.5 730.00 26,645.00
Thomas, Jennifer Associate 2019 Commercial Litigation Practice 198.8 920.00 182,896.00
Thompson, Navy Associate 2019 Commercial Litigation Practice 38.2 730.00 27,886.00
Tiedemann, Robert Counsel 1994 Commercial Litigation Practice 64.4 | 1,120.00 72,128.00
Tuffey, Claire Associate 2020 Financial Restructuring & Insolvency (FRI) Practice 84.3 635.00 53,530.50
Warner, Blair Associate 2015 Financial Restructuring & Insolvency (FRI) Practice 205.3 970.00 199,141.00
Waterfield, Amy Project Manager - | N/A Practice Technology - Transactional 28.7 565.00 16,215.50
Litigation Support
Wiheba, Taha Associate N/A Commercial Litigation Practice 205.2 645.00 132,354.00
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Zegger, Alexandra

Associate

2020

Commercial Litigation Practice

56.6

730.00

41,318.00

Grand Total

5,309.6

$4,723,028.50

Vi
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STATEMENT OF FEES BY PROJECT CATEGORY

Cat. Project Category Description Total Total
No. Hours Fees
001 | Administrative Expense Claims 0.0 $0.00
002 | Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy Litigation 1,515.9 | $1,385,910.50
003 | Asset Dispositions 0.1 $105.00
004 | Automatic Stay 96.6 $74,796.50
005 | Bar Date, Noticing and Claims Reconciliation Issues 51.6 $37,972.50
006 | Case Administration (e.g., WIP, case calendar, general tasks) 33.6 $11,736.00
007 | Chapter 11 Plan Matters 2,376.5 | $1,949,231.00
008 | Communication with Client 18.2 $22,253.00
009 | Corporate Governance and Board Matters 394 $46,838.50
010 | Customer and Vendor Issues 0.0 $0.00
011 | Disclosure Statement 43.4 $41,867.00
012 | Donor Issues 0.0 $0.00
013 | Employee and Labor Issues 0.0 $0.00
014 | Exclusivity 0.0 $0.00
015 | Executory Contracts and Leases 1.1 $1,083.00
016 | FCR Issues and Communications 0.0 $0.00
017 | Fee Applications 55.6 $46,748.00
018 | Financing Matters and Cash Collateral 38.1 $39,823.50
019 | First and Second Day Motions 0.0 $0.00
020 | General Case Strategy 4.9 $5,145.00
021 | Hearing and Court Matters 29.4 $32,687.00
022 | Insurance Issues 16.1 $17,648.00
023 | Non-Bankruptcy Litigation 20.0 $20,808.50
024 | Non-Working Travel 0.0 $0.00
025 | Professional Retention 25.2 $25,102.00
026 | Public Relations Issues 14 $1,470.00
027 | Schedules and Statements 0.0 $0.00
028 | Tax Issues 0.7 $784.00
029 | Unsecured Creditors and Issues and Communications 5.5 $5,335.00
030 | U.S. Trustee Issues and Reporting 2.5 $2,854.00
031 | Utility Issues and Adequate and Assurance 0.0 $0.00
032 | Local Council Issues and Communications 7.8 $7,925.00
033 | Property of the Estate Issues 0.0 $0.00
034 | Bankruptcy Appeals 30.1 $25,827.00
035 | Mediation 200.4 | $241,422.50
036 | Fee Examiner Issues and Communications 5.9 $5,975.00
037 | District Court Litigation 0.0 $0.00
038 | Solicitation Procedures Enforcement Matters 688.8 $670,905.00
039 | Omni Matters 0.8 $776.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,309.6 | $4,723,028.50

vii
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EXPENSE SUMMARY

Description Bill Amount
Airfare 948.80
Business Meals 250.00
Conference Room Dining 4,398.58
Courier Service 26.25
Document Research 59.87
E-Discovery Data Hosting / Storage 29,160.58
E-Discovery Data Processing 14,165.60
E-Discovery Production 41,805.40
E-Discovery User Fees 12,750.00
Overtime Meals 260.00
Photocopying 0.10
Printing 326.50
Taxi - Business 246.16
Grand Total $104,397.84

viii
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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

In re: Chapter 11

BOY SCOUTS OF AMERICA AND Case No. 20-10343 (LSS)
DELAWARE BSA, LLC,!
(Jointly Administered)

Debtors.
Obj. Deadline: March 28, 2022 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

FOURTEENTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF WHITE & CASE LLP FOR
ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR
THE PERIOD FROM NOVEMBER 1, 2021 TO AND INCLUDING NOVEMBER 30, 2021

White & Case LLP (“White & Case”), attorneys for the Boy Scouts of America and
Delaware BSA, LLC, the non-profit corporations that are debtors and debtors in possession in the
above-captioned chapter 11 cases (together, the “Debtors™), hereby files this fourteenth monthly
application (this “Application”) for (a) interim allowance and payment of compensation for
professional services to the Debtors during the period from November 1, 2021 to and including
November 30, 2021 (the “Fee Period”) in the amount of $3,778,422.80, representing 80% of the
$4,723,028.50° of fees earned by White & Case for professional services to the Debtors during the
Fee Period, and (b) reimbursement of 100% of the actual and necessary expenses incurred by
White & Case during the Fee Period in connection with such services in the amount of

$104,397.84.3 In support of this Application, White & Case respectfully represents as follows:

1 The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, together with the last four digits of each Debtor’s federal tax identification
number, are as follows: Boy Scouts of America (6300) and Delaware BSA, LLC (4311). The Debtors’ mailing
address is 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving, Texas 75038.

2 This amount reflects a voluntary reduction of $1,513,942.00 for the Fee Period in recognition of the Debtors’
status as nonprofit corporations. Cumulatively, from its First through Fourteenth Monthly Fee Applications,
White & Case has made voluntary reductions of fees in the aggregate amount of $5,453,830.00.

3 This amount reflects a voluntary reduction of $9,544.09 for the Fee Period. Cumulatively from its First through
Fourteenth Monthly Fee Applications, White & Case has made voluntary reductions of expenses in the aggregate
amount of $94,550.02.
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JURISDICTION AND VENUE

1. The United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware (the “Court”) has
jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1334 and the Amended Standing Order of
Reference from the United States District Court for the District of Delaware, dated February 29,
2012. This matter is a core proceeding within the meaning of 28 U.S.C. 8 157(b)(2). Venue is
proper in this district pursuant to 28 U.S.C. 88 1408 and 14009.

2. The statutory and other bases for the relief requested herein are sections 330 and

331 of title 11 of the United States Code, 11 U.S.C. 8§ 101-1532 (the “Bankruptcy Code”), rule

2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the “Bankruptcy Rules”), rule 2016-2 of the

Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the
District of Delaware (the “Local Rules”), the Order (I) Approving Procedures for (A) Interim
Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals and (B) Expense
Reimbursement for Official Committee Members and (11) Granting Related Relief [D.I. 341], as
amended by the Order Amending the Order (1) Approving Procedures for (A) Interim
Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals and (B) Expense
Reimbursement for Official Committee Members and (II) Granting Related Relief [D.l. 5899]

(together, the “Compensation Procedures Order”), and the Order Appointing Fee Examiner and

Establishing Related Procedures [D.l. 1342] (the “Fee Examiner Order”).

BACKGROUND

3. The Debtors commenced these cases on February 18, 2020 (the “Petition Date”),
and they continue to operate their non-profit organization and manage their properties as debtors
in possession pursuant to sections 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code. These chapter 11
cases are being jointly administered for procedural purposes only pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule

1015(b) and Local Rule 1015-1.
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4. On March 5, 2020, the Office of the United States Trustee for the District of
Delaware appointed an official committee of tort claimants and an official committee of unsecured
creditors pursuant to section 1102 of the Bankruptcy Code.

5. On April 24, 2020, the Court appointed James L. Patton, Jr. as the legal
representative of future abuse claimants pursuant to sections 105(a) and 1109(b) of the Bankruptcy
Code.

6. The Court has authorized the Debtors to retain and employ White & Case as their
lead bankruptcy counsel, nunc pro tunc to September 23, 2020, pursuant to the Order Authorizing
the Retention and Employment of White & Case LLP as Attorneys to the Debtors and Debtors in

Possession, Effective as of September 23, 2020 [D.1. 1698] (the “Retention Order”). The Retention

Order authorizes the Debtors to compensate and reimburse White & Case in accordance with the
terms and conditions set forth in the Debtors’ application to retain White & Case, subject to White
& Case’s application to the Court.

7. On April 6, 2020, the Court entered the Compensation Procedures Order, which
was subsequently amended by the Court. The Compensation Procedures Order provides, among
other things, that each professional shall be entitled, on or as soon as practicable after the fifteenth
(15th) day of each month following the month for which compensation and/or expense
reimbursement is sought, to file and serve an application for interim allowance of compensation
earned and reimbursement of expenses incurred during the preceding month (each a “Monthly Fee
Application”). Parties shall have fourteen (14) days after service of a Monthly Fee Application to

object thereto (as applicable, the “Objection Deadline”). Upon the expiration of the Objection

Deadline, the applicant may file a certificate of no objection (a “CNQO”) with the Court with respect

to the unopposed portion of the fees and/or expenses requested in the applicable Monthly Fee
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Application. After the filing of a CNO, the Debtors are authorized and directed to pay the applicant
an amount equal to 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses requested in the applicable Monthly
Fee Application not subject to an objection.

8. On September 18, 2020, the Court entered the Order Appointing Fee Examiner and
Establishing Related Procedures for the Review of Applications of Retained Professionals

[D.1. 1342] (the “Fee Examiner Order”). A copy of this Application will be served on the fee

examiner.

RELIEF REQUESTED

9. By this Application, in accordance with the Compensation Procedures Order and
the Fee Examiner Order, White & Case requests payment in the aggregate amount of
$3,882,820.64, which is equal to (a) 80% of the $4,723,028.50* of fees earned by White & Case
for professional services to the Debtors during the Fee Period; and (b) 100% of the $104,397.84°
of actual and necessary expenses incurred by White & Case during the Fee Period in connection
with its services to the Debtors.

SUMMARY OF SERVICES RENDERED

10.  Attached hereto as Exhibit A is a detailed statement of White & Case’s hours
expended and fees earned during the Fee Period. White & Case attorneys and paraprofessionals
expended a total of 5,309.6 hours in connection with these chapter 11 cases during the Fee Period.
All services rendered by White & Case for which compensation is sought pursuant to this

Application were rendered solely to or on behalf of the Debtors. No payments were received by

4 As noted above, this amount reflects a voluntary reduction of $1,513,942.00 for the Fee Period in recognition of
the Debtors’ status as nonprofit corporations. Cumulatively, from its First through Fourteenth Monthly Fee
Applications, White & Case has made voluntary reductions of fees in the aggregate amount of $5,453,830.00.

> As noted above, this amount reflects a voluntary reduction of $9,544.09 for the Fee Period. Cumulatively from
its First through Fourteenth Monthly Fee Applications, White & Case has made voluntary reductions of expenses
in the aggregate amount of $94,550.02.
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White & Case from any other source for services rendered or to be rendered in connection with
these chapter 11 cases. The services rendered by White & Case during the Fee Period are grouped
into the categories set forth in Exhibit A and in the summary cover sheets prefixed to this
Application. The attorneys and paraprofessionals who provided services to the Debtors during the
Fee Period are also identified in Exhibit A and in the summary cover sheets.

ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES

11.  Attached as Exhibit B is a detailed statement of White & Case’s out-of-pocket
expenses incurred during the Fee Period, totaling $104,397.84. These expenses include, but are
not limited to, airfare, hotel and other travel expenses, catering services for mediation sessions,
and printing expenses.

VALUATION OF SERVICES

12.  As noted above, the amount of time spent by each White & Case attorney and
paraprofessional providing services to the Debtors during the Fee Period is set forth in the
summary attached hereto as Exhibit A. The rates reflected on Exhibit A are White & Case’s
customary hourly rates for work of this character. Effective January 1, 2021, the hourly rates
charged for each professional may have increased as described above. The reasonable value of
the services rendered by White & Case for the Fee Period as attorneys to the Debtors in these
chapter 11 cases is $4,723,028.50.

13. In accordance with the factors enumerated in section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code,
the fees requested are fair and reasonable given (a) the complexity of these chapter 11 cases, (b) the
time expended, (c) the nature and extent of the services rendered, (d) the value of such services,
and (e) the costs of comparable services other than in a case under this title.

14.  Although White & Case has made every effort to include all fees earned and

expenses incurred during the Fee Period, some fees and expenses might not be included in this
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Application due to delays caused by accounting and processing during the Fee Period. White &
Case reserves the right to make further applications to this Court for allowance of such fees and
expenses not included herein. Subsequent fee applications will be filed in accordance with the
Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Rules, the Compensation Procedures Order,
and the Fee Examiner Order.

CERTIFICATION OF COMPLIANCE

15.  The undersigned has reviewed the requirements of Local Rule 2016-2 and certifies
that, to the best of her knowledge, information, and belief, this Application complies with the

requirements of that Local Rule.

[Remainder of Page Intentionally Left Blank]
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WHEREFORE, White & Case requests allowance and payment of compensation for
professional services to the Debtors during the Fee Period in the amount of $3,778,422.80,
representing 80% of the $4,723,028.50 of fees earned by White & Case for professional services
to the Debtors during the Fee Period, and reimbursement of 100% of the actual and necessary
expenses incurred by White & Case during the Fee Period in connection with such services in the

amount of $104,397.84, for a total interim award of $3,882,820.64.

Dated: March 11, 2022 WHITE & CASE LLP
New York, New York

/sl Jessica C. Lauria
Jessica C. Lauria (admitted pro hac vice)
1221 Avenue of the Americas
New York, New York 10020
Telephone: (212) 819-8200
Email: jessica.lauria@whitecase.com

—and -

WHITE & CASE LLP

Michael C. Andolina (admitted pro hac vice)

Matthew E. Linder (admitted pro hac vice)

Laura E. Baccash (admitted pro hac vice)

Blair M. Warner (admitted pro hac vice)

111 South Wacker Drive

Chicago, Illinois 60606

Telephone: (312) 881-5400

Email: mandolina@whitecase.com
mlinder@whitecase.com
laura.baccash@whitecase.com
blair.warner@whitecase.com

ATTORNEYS FOR THE DEBTORS AND
DEBTORS IN POSSESSION
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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

Chapter 11
In re:

BOY SCOUTS OF AMERICA and Case No. 20-10343 (LSS)
DELAWARE BSA, LLC !

(Jointly Administered)

Debtors. Objection Deadline: March 28, 2022 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

NOTICE OF FOURTEENTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF WHITE & CASE
LLP FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF
EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD FROM NOVEMEBER 1, 2021 TO AND
INCLUDING NOVEMEBER 30, 2021

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that today, White & Case LLP, as attorneys to the
Debtors in the above-captioned cases, filed the attached Fourteenth Monthly Application of
White & Case LLP for Allowance of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the
Period from November 1, 2021 to and Including November 30, 2021 (the “Application™).

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that objections, if any, to the Application,
must: (a) be filed with the Clerk of the Bankruptcy Court, 824 North Market Street, 3" Floor,
Wilmington, Delaware 19801, by March 28, 2022 at 4:00 p.m. (Eastern Time) (the “Objection
Deadline”); and (b) be served so as to be received on or before the Objection Deadline by:

I. the Applicant: White & Case LLP, 111 South Wacker Drive, Chicago,
Illinois 60606, Attn: Matthew E. Linder; mlinder@whitecase.com;

ii.  the Debtors: Boy Scouts of America, 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving,
Texas 75038, Attn: Steven P. McGowan, steve.mcgowan@scouting.org;

iii.  co-counsel to the Debtors: Morris, Nichols, Arsht & Tunnell LLP, 1201 N.
Market Street, 16" Floor, Wilmington, Delaware 19801, Attn: Derek C.
Abbott, dabbott@morrisnichols.com;

iv.  the Office of the United States Trustee: J. Caleb Boggs Federal Building,
Room 2207, 844 N. King Street, Wilmington, Delaware 19801, Attn: David
Buchbinder, david.l.buchbinder@usdoj.gov and Hannah M. McCollum,
hannah.mccollum@usdoj.gov;

v. counsel to the UCC: Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP, 1177 Avenue

The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, together with the last four digits of each Debtors’ federal tax identification
number, are as follows: Boy Scouts of America (6300) and Delaware BSA, LLC (4311). The Debtors” mailing
address is 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving, Texas 75038.
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Vi.

Vii.

viii.

Xi.

of the Americas, New York, New York 10036, Attn: Rachael Ringer,
rringer@kramerlevin.com and Megan M. Wasson, mwasson@
kramerlevin.com;

counsel to the Tort Claimants” Committee: Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones
LLP, 10100 Santa Monica Boulevard, 13th Floor, Los Angeles, California
90067, Attn: Richard M. Pachulski, rpachulski@pszjlaw.com;

counsel to the Future Claimants’ Representative: Young Conaway Stargatt
& Taylor, LLP, Rodney Square, 1000 North King Street, Wilmington,
Delaware 19801, Attn: Robert S. Brady, rbrady@ycst.com and Edwin J.
Harron, eharron@ycst.com;

counsel to the Ad Hoc Committee of Local Councils: Wachtell, Lipton,
Rosen & Katz, 51 West 52nd Street, New York, New York 10019, Attn:
Richard G. Mason, rgmason@wlrk.com and Joseph C. Celentino,
jecenlentino@wlrk.com;

counsel to JPMorgan Chase Bank, National Association: Norton Rose
Fulbright US LLP, 2200 Ross Avenue, Dallas, Texas 75201-7932, Attn:
Louis R. Strubeck, louis.strubeck@nortonrosefullbright.com and Kristian
W. Gluck, kristian.gluck@nortonrosefullbright.com;

counsel to the County Commission of Fayette County (West Virginia):
Steptoe & Johnson PLLC, Chase Tower — 8th Floor, 707 Virginia Street
East, Charleston, West Virginia 25301, Attn: John Stump; and

Rucki Fee Review, LLC: 1111 Windon Drive, Wilmington, Delaware
19803, Attn: Justin Rucki, justinrucki@ruckifeereview.com.

A HEARING ON THE APPLICATION, IF NECESSARY, WILL BE HELD AT
THE CONVENIENCE OF THE COURT AND NOTICE OF ANY SUCH HEARING WILL BE
GIVEN ONLY TO THE OBJECTING PARTY OR PARTIES.

IF YOU FAIL TO RESPOND IN ACCORDANCE WITH THIS NOTICE, THE
COURT MAY GRANT THE RELIEF REQUESTED BY THE APPLICATION WITHOUT
FURTHER NOTICE OR HEARING.

[Remainder of Page Intentionally Left Blank]
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Dated: March 12, 2022 MORRIS, NICHOLS, ARSHT & TUNNELL LLP
Wilmington, Delaware

/s/ Paige N. Topper

Derek C. Abbott (No. 3376)

Andrew R. Remming (No. 5120)

Paige N. Topper (No. 6470)

Tori L. Remington (No. 6901)

1201 North Market Street, 16th Floor

Wilmington, Delaware 19801

Telephone: (302) 658-9200

Facsimile: (302) 425-4664

Email: dabbott@morrisnichols.com
aremming@morrisnichols.com
ptopper@morrisnichols.com
tremington@morrisnichols.com

—and -

WHITE & CASE LLP

Jessica C. Lauria (admitted pro hac vice)
1221 Avenue of the Americas

New York, New York 10020

Telephone: (212) 819-8200

Email: jessica.lauria@whitecase.com

—and -

WHITE & CASE LLP

Michael C. Andolina (admitted pro hac vice)

Matthew E. Linder (admitted pro hac vice)

Laura E. Baccash (admitted pro hac vice)

Blair M. Warner (admitted pro hac vice)

111 South Wacker Drive

Chicago, Illinois 60606

Telephone: (312) 881-5400

Email: mandolina@whitecase.com
mlinder@whitecase.com
laura.baccash@whitecase.com
blair.warner@whitecase.com

Attorneys for the Debtors and Debtors in Possession
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Fees Statement
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Boy Scouts of America
RE: Project Restructuring

WHITE & CASE

OUR REF: 1786703-0002

For professional services for the period ending 30 November 2021

DATE

DESCRIPTION

Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy Litigation

1 November 2021

Analyze materials for meet and confer (0.4); participate
in meet and confer with M. Plevin and others
concerning discovery issues (0.4); continued reviewing
experts qualifications (0.3); conference with potential
expert and A. Hammond concerning security related
issues (0.5); conference with A. Hammond re: same
(0.4); continued outlining expert subjects and report
(2.9); review and revise deposition protocols (0.4);
conference with J. Lauria concerning the issues
surrounding the CMP production (0.3); participate in
meet and confer with Zalkin and others concerning
discovery objections by the propounding insurers (1.0);
conference with potential expert, M. Andolina, A.
Hammond and others concerning potential expert
engagement (0.8); conference with A. Hammond, M.
Andolina and others concerning expert candidates and
recommendations (0.4).

1 November 2021

Interview potential experts (1.5); follow-up emails (0.2)
and phone conferences (0.4) with client re: same.

1 November 2021

Review emails re: abuse prevention expert (0.2); call
with potential abuse prevention expert (0.4); review
and research re: identified cases (1.0); prepare for call
with potential expert (0.5); attend call with potential
expert re: potential expert engagement (0.5); call with
A&M re: document collection and production (0.3);
email re: same (0.2); call with KCIC/Haynes Boone re:
potential experts and preparation for same (1.1); meet
and confer re: KTBS (0.7); follow up call with G. Kurtz
and M. Andolina re: potential experts (0.5); review
discovery responses (1.3); correspondence with Bates
White re: production (0.3); review deposition protocol
(2.0).

1 November 2021

Telephone calls with N. Pennington re: A&M discovery
(0.7); review A&M documents and electronic search
terms (3.1).

1 November 2021

Review emails in response to propounding insurer
request (0.3); emails with S. Hershey re: same (0.2);
telephone call with S. Hershey re: review of certain
files for responsive documents (0.2); review files re:
same (0.6); review deposition protocol and TCC
comments to same (0.3).

1 November 2021

Phone conference with S. Manning, E. Rosenberg,
and A. Bowron (0.2); review and analyze new claims
for amended schedules (1.7); review and analyze
Archdiocese of New York cases and revise chart
analyzing the same (1.0).

1 November 2021

Draft settlement approval motion (1.0); research re:
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S Murray

TIMEKEEPER HOURS usb
G Kurtz 7.80 13,455.00
M Andolina 2.10 2,730.00
A Hammond 9.00 11,565.00
R Tiedemann 3.80 4,256.00
M Linder 1.60 1,680.00
K McDonald 2.90 2,871.00

1.30 1,196.00
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WHITE & CASE

Boy Scouts of America

RE: Project Restructuring OUR REF: 1786703-0002

DATE

DESCRIPTION

TIMEKEEPER

HOURS

usb

same (0.3).

1 November 2021

Perform document review of Boy Scouts of America
productions.

D Rifkin

8.50

7,097.50

1 November 2021

Review documents for privilege and responsiveness.

C D'Oria

11.90

8,687.00

1 November 2021

Conduct second level review of BSA emails.

| Popa

4.60

3,358.00

1 November 2021

Document review for responsiveness and privilege
with respect to plan challenges.

L Quinn

7.80

5,694.00

1 November 2021

Review and complete batches of documents for
production re: privilege (1.0); identify several
exchanges and declassify several non-privileged
documents (1.0).

A Costello

2.00

1,270.00

1 November 2021

Review documents for privilege and responsiveness
re: Chapter 11 hearing.

C Davis

1.00

635.00

1 November 2021

Review and categorize relativity documents re: BSA.

C Edmonds

1.70

1,079.50

1 November 2021

Conduct document review.

C Obiozor

0.90

571.50

1 November 2021

Review White & Case emails re: privilege logs.

N Swire

1.00

635.00

1 November 2021

Review BSA emails for responsiveness and privilege
(2.0); first level review of W&C emails for privilege and
responsiveness (0.7).

A Waterfield

2.70

1,5625.50

1 November 2021

Generate document review batches (0.7); generate
document review layouts (0.1); generate documents
review summary and metrics (0.6); generate document
images for production (1.6).

K Huang

3.00

990.00

1 November 2021

Email communications with T. Kelly re: Relativity user
account (0.3); perform relativity user account
management (0.3); data processing, monitor
processing, run deduplications, and export deduped
documents (0.2); import data into review platform and
review re: Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy
Litigation review (1.0); draft Internal email with M Fuhr
re: data processing (0.3).

K Leung

2.10

693.00

1 November 2021

Phone call with M. Murray re: Bates White documents
(0.4); work with Ogletree on production specifications
and file export issues (0.9); finalize documents for
processing (1.2); quality check uploaded documents
(0.3).

M Fuhr

2.80

1,078.00

1 November 2021

Review e-mail from Insurer re: data room access (0.1);
update Datasite permissions (0.1); revise pleadings file
(0.1).

D Hirshorn

0.30

99.00

2 November 2021

Conference with Haynes & Boone and team
concerning privilege issues related to CMP (0.5);
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G Kurtz

6.80

11,730.00
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Boy Scouts of America
RE: Project Restructuring

WHITE & CASE

OUR REF: 1786703-0002

DATE

DESCRIPTION

TIMEKEEPER

HOURS

usb

review and revise letter to the Court seeking to compel
discovery related claims, manuals and reinsurance
(1.0); conference with A. Hammond concerning
experts (0.7); conference with potential expert
concerning potential retention concerning abuse
prevention protocols (0.5); conference with Client
concerning expert retention for abuse prevention
protocols (0.4); review suggestions to depositions
protocols and make further revisions (0.5); continued
drafting on expert abuse prevention analysis (1.7);
begin reviewing prevention protocols (1.3); conference
with C. Shepherd concerning abuse prevention
protocol work (0.2).

2 November 2021

Follow-up re: expert interviews and strategy with BSA
team and client (1.7); confer with insurer re: Sidley
subpoena issues (0.6); follow-up with BSA team re:
same (0.4).

M Andolina

2.70

3,510.00

2 November 2021

Review emails and letter briefs with Haynes Boone re:
production of CMPs (0.9); calls re: same (0.2); calls re:
expert selection with G. Kurtz, M. Andolina, and Client
(0.7); call with C. Shepherd, G. Kurtz, and potential
expert re: expert selection (0.8); analyze information to
provide to Potential Expert re: abuse prevention
policies (1.0); correspondence re: same (0.1); edit and
revise engagement letter (0.9); edit and revise
deposition protocol (0.5); review and comment on
letter brief (0.5); review document collection efforts
from A&M and appraisers (0.8).

A Hammond

6.40

8,224.00

2 November 2021

Review restricted asset claims and proof (3.1); review
deposition scheduling (0.2); review deposition protocol
(0.2); review A&M electronic documents (0.3).

R Tiedemann

3.80

4,256.00

2 November 2021

Telephone call with S. Hershey re: withdrawal of
certain discovery (0.1); emails with K. Gluck re: same
(0.1); emails with D. Abbott re: adversary proceedings
(0.2); review and propose privilege redactions to board
minutes (1.2); telephone call with S. Hershey re: same
(0.2).

M Linder

1.80

1,890.00

2 November 2021

Review and analyze Ponil Ranch objection to claim
research (0.3); review and analyze proofs of claim re:
preliminary injunction matters (1.4); review and
analyze state courts complaints re: relation to Scouting
(2.0).

K McDonald

3.70

3,663.00

2 November 2021

Call with S. Hershey re: expert documents (0.1); call
with M. Murray re: BSA materials (0.1).

B Warner

0.20

194.00

2 November 2021

Finalize settlement approval motion.

S Murray

1,012.00

2 November 2021

Perform document review of Boy Scouts of America
productions.

D Rifkin

3.40

2,839.00

2 November 2021

Review documents for privilege and responsiveness.

C D'Oria

6.20

4,526.00

2 November 2021

Conduct second level review of BSA emails.
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| Popa

6.90

5,037.00
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WHITE & CASE

Boy Scouts of America

RE: Project Restructuring OUR REF: 1786703-0002

DATE

DESCRIPTION

TIMEKEEPER

HOURS

usb

2 November 2021

Document review for responsiveness and privilege.

L Quinn

8.90

6,497.00

2 November 2021

Conduct document review.

A Rogers

0.30

219.00

2 November 2021

Review document production batches (1.0); identify
several documents (1.0); draft coding and proper
designations of same (1.6).

A Costello

3.60

2,286.00

2 November 2021

Review documents for privilege and responsiveness
re: Chapter 11 hearing.

C Davis

3.20

2,032.00

2 November 2021

Review and categorize relativity documents re: BSA.

C Edmonds

1.30

825.50

2 November 2021

Review documents and tag for issue and
responsiveness to discovery requests.

C Obiozor

1.70

1,079.50

2 November 2021

Review White & Case emails for privilege in
preparation for drafting privilege log in document
production.

N Swire

2.20

1,397.00

2 November 2021

Review BSA emails for responsiveness and privilege.

A Waterfield

2.30

1,299.50

2 November 2021

Generate document review layout (0.6); generate
documents review summary and metrics (0.2);
generate document images for production (0.7).

K Huang

1.50

495.00

2 November 2021

Email communication with S. Hershey re: FTP user
account management (0.5); perform FTP user account
management (0.6).

K Leung

363.00

2 November 2021

Organize documents in Relativity (0.2); quality check
A&M documents loaded in Relativity (0.5); check
status of Bates White emails (0.3); download BSA
documents and finalize for processing (1.4).

M Fuhr

2.40

924.00

2 November 2021

Update pleadings file (0.1); update protective order
acknowledgments file (0.1).

D Hirshorn

0.20

66.00

3 November 2021

Participate in call with Client, J. Mosley, A. Hammond,
and M. Andolina concerning the child prevention
protocols and documentation (1.5); conference with A.
Hammond re: same (0.3); review analysis about abuse
survivor redactions (0.4); participate in call concerning
abuse survivor name redactions (0.5); participate in
meet and confer with other parties concerning
deposition protocols (0.8); revisions to deposition
protocols (0.4); emails with T. Schiavoni concerning
deposition protocols (0.4); conference with potential
expert concerning abuse prevention protocol retention
(0.2); continued reviewing abuse prevention materials
(1.4); participate in meet and concerning production of
CMPs (0.6); review numerous emails concerning
subpoenas  (0.4); communications with team
concerning survivor name confidentiality insurer (0.3).

G Kurtz

7.20

12,420.00

3 November 2021

Confer G. Kurtz, S. Hershey and others re: document
collection and production issues and meet-and-confers
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M Andolina

3.60

4,680.00
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WHITE & CASE

Boy Scouts of America

RE: Project Restructuring OUR REF: 1786703-0002

DATE

DESCRIPTION

TIMEKEEPER

HOURS

usb

re: same (2.4); communications re: witnesses and
subpoenas with BSA team and client (1.2).

3 November 2021

Prepare for call with Potential Expert (1.0); attend call
with Potential Expert re: expert report (1.0); calls with
S. Hershey and Haynes Boone re: discovery and
confidentiality issues including production (1.4);
analyze and review re: materials for Potential Expert
(1.2).

A Hammond

4.60

5,911.00

3 November 2021

Outlining depositions (1.9); draft Debtors' deposition
notices (2.3); discussions with A. Hammond re:
depositions (0.2); review revised deposition protocol
and deposition schedule (0.9); review Rule 30(b)(6)
deposition notices to Debtors (0.5); review discovery
dispute correspondence (0.8).

R Tiedemann

6.60

7,392.00

3 November 2021

Emails with K. Gluck re: withdrawal of certain
discovery (0.1); telephone call with A. Azer, L.
Baccash, S. Hershey, and FCR counsel re: discovery
issues (0.5); telephone call with A. Azer, L. Baccash,
and Coalition, FCR and TCC counsel re: same (0.7);
review files for responsive emails (0.5); email to S.
Hershey re: same (0.1).

M Linder

1.90

1,995.00

3 November 2021

Revise Archdiocese of New York chart analyzing
cases and claims (0.9); analyze Archdiocese of New
York proofs of claim re: preliminary injunction matters
(0.5); correspondence with A. Bowron re: the same
(0.3); review and analyze Archdiocese of New York
cases and correspondence in preparation for phone
conference (0.4); phone conference with A. Rosenblatt
re: Archdiocese of New York (0.3); correspondence
with E. Rosenberg re: phone conference updates (0.2).

K McDonald

2.60

2,5674.00

3 November 2021

Correspond with W&C and Haynes & Boone teams re:
insurer discovery request (0.2); attend meet and confer
call with participating parties re: confirmation discovery
(0.5); review document from Omni and correspond
with W&C team re: production of same (0.2); review
email communications and draft log of communications
re: confirmation discovery (2.7).

B Warner

3.60

3,492.00

3 November 2021

Perform document review of Boy Scouts of America
productions.

D Rifkin

4.60

3,841.00

3 November 2021

Review documents for privilege and responsiveness.

C D'Oria

4.60

3,358.00

3 November 2021

Conduct second level review of BSA emails.

| Popa

6.40

4,672.00

3 November 2021

Document review for responsiveness and privilege.

L Quinn

8.40

6,132.00

3 November 2021

Review and complete batches of documents for
production re: privilege (1.0); identify several
exchanges and declassify several non-privileged
documents (1.0).

A Costello

2.00

1,270.00

3 November 2021

Review documents for privilege and responsiveness
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2.00

1,270.00
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WHITE & CASE

Boy Scouts of America
RE: Project Restructuring OUR REF: 1786703-0002

DATE DESCRIPTION TIMEKEEPER HOURS usb

re: Chapter 11 hearing.

3 November 2021 Review and categorize relativity documents re: BSA. C Edmonds 2.10 1,333.50

3 November 2021 Review documents and tag for issue and C Obiozor 2.30 1,460.50
responsiveness to discovery requests.

3 November 2021 Review White & Case emails for privilege in N Swire 210 1,333.50
preparation for drafting privilege log in document
production.
3 November 2021 Review BSA emails for responsiveness and privilege. A Waterfield 2.90 1,638.50
3 November 2021 Generate documents review summary and metrics K Huang 1.50 495.00

(0.8); generate document images for production (0.4);
build search index (0.3).

3 November 2021 Email communications with T. Trevino from Insurer re: K Leung 1.80 594.00

FTP user access (0.3); conduct FTP user account
management (0.3); data processing, monitor
processing, run deduplications, and export deduped
documents (0.3); import data into review platform and
review re: Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy
Litigation review (0.6); internal emails with M. Fuhr re:
data processing (0.3).

3 November 2021 Download and finalize additional documents for M Fuhr 1.80 693.00
processing and review (1.1); identify responsive
documents for production and create inventory chart
(0.7).

3 November 2021 Update protective order acknowledgments file (0.1); D Hirshorn 0.20 66.00
update Datasite permissions (0.1).

4 November 2021 Standing call with Client and potential expert (0.5); G Kurtz 6.30 10,867.50
participate in standing call with plan proponents
concerning confirmation hearing (0.1); review CMPs
and analyze the evidentiary and privilege issues (3.1);
conference with S. Hershey concerning discovery
leads and responses to objections to 30(b) witnesses
by insurers (0.3); review objections to 30(b) notices
and formulary response (0.5); conference with A. Azer
concerning CMPs and privilege issues (0.7);
conference with D. Abbott concerning document
review protocols (0.1); conference with S. Hershey re:
same (0.1); outline thoughts for preparation of
Ogletree for deposition (0.9).

4 November 2021 Confer G. Kurtz, S. Hershey, and others re: document M Andolina 3.80 4,940.00
collection and production issues (2.0); review witness
list and correspondence re: same and communications
re: trial issues (1.0); review state court litigation issues
(0.8).

4 November 2021 Calls with R. Tiedemann and S. Hershey re: offensive A Hammond 5.30 6,810.50
discovery (0.8); call Potential Expert to provide
information re: abuse prevention issues (0.5); emails
with Potential Expert re: same (0.4); prepare for call re:
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WHITE & CASE

Boy Scouts of America

RE: Project Restructuring OUR REF: 1786703-0002

DATE DESCRIPTION TIMEKEEPER HOURS usb
BSA depositions with Haynes Boone & W&C (0.5);
attend same (0.7); review Warren Report (0.9); review
incoming deposition notices (0.7); evaluate discovery
necessary in connection with affirmative depositions
(0.5); analyze collection re: Insurer subpoena (0.3).
4 November 2021 Telephone calls with A&M re: document production R Tiedemann 5.10 5,712.00
search (0.1); emails with A&M re: same (0.2); draft
document requests to TCC (3.0); review 30(b)(6)
notice to debtors and insurers (0.5); analyze discovery
to be sought by debtors (1.1); review draft discovery
protocol (0.2).
4 November 2021 Attend multiple discovery meet and confer calls. M Linder 1.30 1,365.00
4 November 2021 Review email communications and draft log of B Warner 3.00 2,910.00
communications re: confirmation discovery.
4 November 2021 Perform document review of Boy Scouts of America D Rifkin 4.60 3,841.00
productions.
4 November 2021 Review documents for privilege and responsiveness. C D'Oria 10.20 7,446.00
4 November 2021 Conduct second level review of BSA emails. | Popa 5.50 4,015.00
4 November 2021 Document review for responsiveness and privilege. L Quinn 8.80 6,424.00
4 November 2021 Document review. A Rogers 0.40 292.00
4 November 2021 Review and analyze re: document production. A Costello 2.30 1,460.50
4 November 2021 Review documents for privilege and responsiveness C Davis 1.50 952.50
re: Chapter 11 hearing.
4 November 2021 Conduct document review. A Davis 3.50 2,222.50
4 November 2021 Review and categorize relativity documents re: BSA. C Edmonds 1.00 635.00
4 November 2021 Review documents for secondary review (1.0); review A Ghafarian 2.00 1,270.00
emails discussing document review (1.0).
4 November 2021 Review documents and tag for issue and C Obiozor 1.20 762.00
responsiveness to discovery requests.
4 November 2021 Review White & Case emails for privilege in N Swire 1.10 698.50
preparation for drafting privilege log in document
production.
4 November 2021 Review W&C emails for privilege and responsiveness. A Waterfield 1.20 678.00
4 November 2021 Generate documents review summary and metrics K Huang 1.50 495.00
(0.6); generate document images for production (0.6);
generate document review layout (0.3).
4 November 2021 Email communications with Y. Thompson from 1.30 429.00
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Boy Scouts of America
RE: Project Restructuring

WHITE & CASE

OUR REF: 1786703-0002

DATE

DESCRIPTION

WilmerHale re: FTP access (0.2); conduct FTP user
account management (0.1); email communications
with J. Thomas re: Morris Nichols Relativity access
(0.1); perform Relativity user account management
(0.1); data processing, monitor processing, run
deduplications, and export deduped documents (0.2);
import data into review platform and review re:
Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy Litigation
review (0.4); internal emails with M. Fuhr re: data
processing (0.1); email communications with S.
Rudman from Choate re: FTP access (0.1).

4 November 2021

Phone call with M. Jaoude, J. Thomas, and T. Chen
re: identifying loose documents prior to production
(0.3); download and finalize Bates White, Alvarez &
Marsal and BSA documents for processing (2.5);
review all board minutes and presentations to locate
unique copies for production, create identification chart
and isolate documents in Relativity (0.8); resolve
corrupt  presentation document and request
replacement file (0.3).

4 November 2021

Update protective order acknowledgments file (0.1);
update pleadings file (0.1).

5 November 2021

Review CMPs and develop strategy for privilege (3.1);
participate in deposition preparation of B. Griggs for
deposition and also with respect to CMP issues (2.0);
conference with Haynes & Boone and team
concerning privilege issues and productions (0.7);
outline EDP issues and evidentiary issues (1.9);
conference with J. Green concerning research
concerning CMP related issues, including privilege and
work arounds (0.4); conference with A. Hammond re:
same (0.4); review discovery responses (0.8).

5 November 2021

Confer with G. Kurtz, S. Hershey and others re:
document production issues, discovery issues and
discovery strategy.

5 November 2021

Attend conference call with G. Kurtz and S. Hershey
re: TDPs and insurer discovery (1.1); call with G. Kurtz
re: same (0.5); analyze confirmation discovery re:
redactions (2.1).

5 November 2021

Review re: A&M document pull and production (0.5);
draft Debtors' discovery notices to TCC and plaintiff
firms (2.4); analyze Rule 30(b)(6) notice to debtors
(0.9); review dispute with TCC re: TCC document
requests to debtors (1.1).

5 November 2021

Review and analyze voluminous discovery-related
correspondence and draft correspondence (1.3);
emails with W&C litigation team, Bates White, and
Omni re: same (0.3).

5 November 2021

Call with O'Melveny counsel and W&C team re: claims
discovery matters.
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M Fuhr 3.90 1,501.50
D Hirshorn 0.20 66.00
G Kurtz 9.30 16,042.50
M Andolina 2.50 3,250.00
A Hammond 3.70 4,754.50
R Tiedemann 4.90 5,488.00
M Linder 1.60 1,680.00
B Warner 0.20 194.00
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5 November 2021

Perform document review of Boy Scouts of America
productions.

D Rifkin

6.30

5,260.50

5 November 2021

Conduct document review.

C D'Oria

5.10

3,723.00

5 November 2021

Conduct second level review of BSA emails.

| Popa

2.30

1,679.00

5 November 2021

Document review for responsiveness and privilege.

L Quinn

5.30

3,869.00

5 November 2021

Conduct document review (0.5); analyze and review
re: document review protocol, relevant email chains,
and other relevant documents (0.2).

A Rogers

0.70

511.00

5 November 2021

Second Level Review of email production.

R Telemi

4.20

3,066.00

5 November 2021

Review and analyze re: document production.

A Costello

2.00

1,270.00

5 November 2021

Review documents for privilege and responsiveness
re: Chapter 11 hearing.

C Davis

2.10

1,333.50

5 November 2021

Conduct document review.

A Davis

2.20

1,397.00

5 November 2021

Review documents re: BSA confirmation discovery
(4.9); analyze documents on relativity re: BSA (1.3).

C Edmonds

6.20

3,937.00

5 November 2021

Review documents for secondary review (1.0); review
internal emails discussing review documents (1.0).

A Ghafarian

2.00

1,270.00

5 November 2021

Review documents and tag for issue and
responsiveness to discovery requests.

C Obiozor

0.50

317.50

5 November 2021

Confer with Bates White re: TCC request for roster
search (0.1); review and respond to same (0.2); confer
with Local Council re: outstanding submissions re:
roster search (0.1); emails re: participating parties’
protective order tracker and document production
(0.3).

C Tuffey

0.70

444.50

5 November 2021

Relativity Group permission request (0.9); generate
documents review summary and metrics (0.4);
generate document images for production (0.6);
generate production (0.1).

K Huang

2.00

660.00

5 November 2021

Email communications with D. Lujan Wolff re: FTP
access (0.1); perform FTP user account management
(0.1); email communications with J. Thomas re: Morris
Nichols Relativity access (0.1); update Morris Nichols
Relativity Access (0.1); data processing, monitor
processing, run deduplications, and export deduped
documents (0.2); import data into review platform and
review re: Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy
Litigation review (0.2); internal emails with M. Fuhr re:
data processing (0.2).

K Leung

1.00

330.00

5 November 2021

Quality check Bates White and A&M documents and
finalize for production (1.6); phone call with J. Thomas
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and M. Jaoude re: production of certain documents
(0.3); finalize BSA documents for processing (1.1);
identify and organize documents to be redacted (1.8);
resolve issues with OCR of charter documents to be
produced (0.7); download and stage received
document productions to load in Relativity (1.3).

5 November 2021

Update protective order acknowledgments file (0.1);
update pleadings file (0.1).

D Hirshorn

0.20

66.00

6 November 2021

Further strategize re: CMP issues (1.1); conference
with team re: same (0.4).

G Kurtz

1.50

2,587.50

6 November 2021

Call with G. Kurtz and Haynes Boone re: CMPs (0.7);
prepare for call with Ms. Gunzler and Haynes Boone
(0.8); attend same (0.5); review incoming deposition
notices (1.2).

A Hammond

3.20

4,112.00

6 November 2021

Telephone call with A. Azer and M. Stone re:
insurance and other discovery (0.5); draft and circulate
30(b)(6) notice to TCC (1.1).

R Tiedemann

1.60

1,792.00

6 November 2021

Conduct privilege review.

C D'Oria

0.70

511.00

6 November 2021

Review documents for discovery (3.1); review emails
re: document review methods (0.2).

A Rogers

3.30

2,409.00

6 November 2021

Internal correspondence with L. Saber, L. Curtis, Z.
Sporn, and others re: internal W&C email review (1.0);
review and categorize relativity documents re: W&C
email review (1.1).

C Edmonds

2.10

1,333.50

6 November 2021

Review emails for document review for privilege.

A Ghafarian

1.00

635.00

6 November 2021

Review documents for discovery (0.6); review
selection of emails re: document review (0.1).

A Waterfield

0.70

395.50

6 November 2021

Generate documents review summary and metrics
(1.4); generate production (0.1).

K Huang

1.50

495.00

6 November 2021

Email communications with J. Thomas re: new data for
processing (0.2); data processing, monitor processing,
run deduplications, and export deduped documents
(0.4); import data into review platform and review re:
Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy Litigation
review (0.7); internal emails with M. Fuhr re: data
processing (0.6).

K Leung

1.90

627.00

6 November 2021

Resolve problem with Haynes & Boone document
transfer (0.3); set-up protocol for organization of
received document productions (0.8); follow-up on
processing of charter documents (0.5); quality check
processed BSA documents (0.9); download received
productions and finalize for Relativity (1.7).

M Fuhr

4.20

1,617.00

7 November 2021

Conference with Haynes & Boone and team
concerning position on CMPs.
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7 November 2021

Draft discovery requests for TCC and Plaintiffs (1.5);
review email re: discovery requests (0.4); review TCC
30(b)(6) deposition notice (1.2).

A Hammond

3.10

3,983.50

7 November 2021

Research and review research re: strategic discovery
matters (0.3); review and comment on discovery
requests (0.2); review and comment on draft email
from S. Hershey re: same (0.2).

B Warner

0.70

679.00

7 November 2021

Perform document review for batch of internal emails
(1.0); email correspondence with M. Brock-Smith, L.
Saber, C. Edmonds, and discovery W&C team re:
discovery questions through email (0.8).

A Costello

1.80

1,143.00

7 November 2021

Reviewing emails for document review for privilege.

A Ghafarian

1.00

635.00

7 November 2021

Review updated directives and guidance for email
privilege review (0.2); review White & Case emails in
preparation for creation of privilege log (1.0).

N Swire

1.20

762.00

7 November 2021

Generate documents review summary and metrics
(1.2); generate document images for production (0.3).

K Huang

1.50

495.00

7 November 2021

Download, inventory, and finalize received productions
for Relativity.

M Fuhr

2.10

808.50

8 November 2021

Conference with Haynes & Boone and White & Case
concerning CMPs and strategy (0.3); conference with
Bates White concerning expert analysis (0.8);
conference with M. Andolina and A. Hammond
concerning Bates White analysis (0.3).

G Kurtz

1.40

2,415.00

8 November 2021

Confer with R. Gorsich, S. Hershey, and G. Kurtz re:
document production, responses, witness and expert
issues (1.9); emails with W&C team re: witness list
(0.2); follow-up phone conferences re: same with W&C
team (0.3).

M Andolina

2.40

3,120.00

8 November 2021

Prepare for meet and confer with Insurer (0.4); attend
same (0.4); call re: response to TCC (0.5); call re:
30(b)(6) topics and depositions (1.2); prepare for call
with Bates White (1.0); attend same (0.5); follow-up
call with M. Andolina and G. Kurtz (0.7); edit and
revise discovery (1.0); call with R. Tiedemann re: same
(0.3); outline expert issues re: liquidation analysis
(0.9).

A Hammond

6.90

8,866.50

8 November 2021

Draft deposition notices to TCC, Catholic and
Methodists (6.6); draft discovery demands to Zalkin
law firm and Pfau Cochran (1.5); draft witness list
disclosures (2.0); discussions with P. Topper re:
service of discovery (0.6).

R Tiedemann

10.70

11,984.00

8 November 2021

Review as-entered sixth stipulated order extending
preliminary injunction (0.2); emails with K. McDonald
and S. Manning re: same (0.2).

M Linder

0.40

420.00

8 November 2021

Review and analyze order approving sixth stipulation
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(0.4); review and analyze draft notice re: the same
(0.3).
8 November 2021 Perform document review of Boy Scouts of America D Rifkin 9.50 7,932.50
productions.
8 November 2021 Conduct diligence review. C D'Oria 10.80 7,884.00
8 November 2021 Review internal W&C emails for privilege. A Hong 2.20 1,606.00
8 November 2021 Conduct first level review of W&C emails. | Popa 7.20 5,256.00
8 November 2021 Document review for responsiveness and privilege. L Quinn 9.30 6,789.00
8 November 2021 Review documents in connection with discovery A Rogers 6.00 4,380.00
request re: W&C privilege emails.
8 November 2021 Second Level Review of email production. R Telemi 2.80 2,044.00
8 November 2021 Perform review of White & Case emails for privilege A Costello 3.00 1,905.00
and ID tagging (2.0); emails with A. Ghafarian, J. Ho,
J. Thomas, and discovery team re: document review
process (1.0).
8 November 2021 Conduct document review. A Davis 2.50 1,587.50
8 November 2021 Review documents for privilege log re: Chapter 11 C Davis 3.10 1,968.50
hearing.
8 November 2021 Review and categorize relativity documents re: W&C C Edmonds 2.70 1,714.50
internal emails.
8 November 2021 Review documents for privilege. A Ghafarian 3.60 2,286.00
8 November 2021 Review White & Case emails re: privilege log. N Swire 1.30 825.50
8 November 2021 Review W&C emails for privilege and responsiveness A Waterfield 5.10 2,881.50
(1.4); perform review of documents for discovery (1.6);
review subset of potentially privileged documents (1.9);
attend calls with J. Thomas and R. Mederos to discuss
review of certain documents in discovery (0.2).
8 November 2021 Generate documents review summary and metrics K Huang 2.00 660.00
(0.6); generate document images for production (0.2);
generate document production (0.6); perform quality
control on received productions (0.6).
8 November 2021 Email communications with A. Hong re: Relativity user K Leung 1.00 330.00

account (0.1); email communications with A. Zegger
re: Relativity user account (0.1); relativity user account
management (0.1); data processing, monitor
processing, run deduplications, and export deduped
documents (0.2); import data into review platform and
review re: Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy
Litigation review (0.2); internal emails with M. Fuhr re:
data processing (0.1); internal emails with R.
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Mlynarczyk re: data processing (0.1); call with R.
Mlynarczyk re: data processing (0.1).

8 November 2021 Finalize new client documents for processing (1.7); M Fuhr 3.60 1,386.00
download, inventory, and finalize received productions
for Relativity (1.9).

9 November 2021 Meeting with BSA and potential expert (2.2); call with G Kurtz 6.00 10,350.00
Client and M. Andolina concerning deposition requests
of Boys Scouts and the response (0.3); call with
propounding insurers and TCC concerning deposition
protocols (0.3); conference with S. Hershey re: same
(0.1); review and revise deposition protocols (0.1);
conference with Haynes & Boone and team
concerning response to deposition requests (0.7);
review new discovery requests and objections to
discovery requests (1.1); review settlement proposal
with Insurer (0.4); draft email re: related evidentiary
issues (0.3); outline further research issues concerning
TDPs (0.3); conference with J. Green concerning
outstanding research issues concerning CMPs and
TDPs and new research issues re: same (0.2).

9 November 2021 Attend meet and confer with Insurer. J Lauria (Boelter) 0.50 675.00

9 November 2021 Attend call with C. Binggeli re: expert report (1.2); call A Hammond 7.70 9,894.50
with Client (0.5) correspondence re: order of proof
discussion (1.5); call with S. Hershey and Haynes
Boone re: outstanding discovery (0.8); review
discovery requests and gather information to respond
(2.3); review re: gathering information re: membership
results and projections (1.4).

9 November 2021 Discussion with AH re: liquidation analysis and R Tiedemann 7.40 8,288.00
pension liabilities (0.3); draft and analyze disputes with
TCC for meet and confer (2.1); legal research re:
PBGC claims (2.6); review pension liability documents
(2.4).

9 November 2021 Emails with K. McDonald re: notice of sixth stipulation M Linder 0.20 210.00
extending termination date of preliminary injunction.

9 November 2021 Revise notice of sixth stipulation (0.3); review and K McDonald 4.10 4,059.00
analyze Archdiocese of New York amended proof of
claim and cases within the claim (2.6); revise chart
analyzing Archdiocese of New York cases (1.2).

9 November 2021 Correspond with C. Tuffey and J. Thomas re: B Warner 0.80 776.00
document review scope and privilege (0.2); analyze
and respond to email from J. Thomas on same (0.1);
call with Omni team, counsel to Omni, and S. Hershey
re: claim discovery matters (0.5).

9 November 2021 Perform document review of Boy Scouts of America D Rifkin 10.50 8,767.50
productions.

9 November 2021 Conduct privilege review. C D'Oria 11.60 8,468.00
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9 November 2021 Review internal W&C emails for privilege (4.6); call A Hong 6.00 4,380.00
with S. Hershey and S. Levy re: responses and
objections to Rule 30(b)(6) notices (0.2); draft
responses and objections to Zalkin's Rule 30(b)(6)
notice to Debtors (1.2).
9 November 2021 Conduct first level review of W&C emails. | Popa 5.70 4,161.00
9 November 2021 Document review for responsiveness and privilege. L Quinn 11.30 8,249.00
9 November 2021 Conduct thorough document review. A Rogers 9.00 6,570.00
9 November 2021 Second Level Review of email production. R Telemi 4.70 3,431.00
9 November 2021 Review document review protocols (0.2); conduct first A Zegger 2.20 1,606.00
level document review (2.0).
9 November 2021 Review document production. A Costello 2.00 1,270.00
9 November 2021 Conduct document review. A Davis 2.20 1,397.00
9 November 2021 Review documents for privilege log re: Chapter 11 C Davis 2.80 1,778.00
hearing.
9 November 2021 Review and categorize relativity documents re: W&C C Edmonds 4.90 3,111.50
internal emails.
9 November 2021 Review documents for secondary review. A Ghafarian 2.00 1,270.00
9 November 2021 Review documents and tag for issue, privilege, and C Obiozor 2.10 1,333.50
responsiveness to discovery requests.
9 November 2021 Review White & Case emails re: privilege log. N Swire 1.80 1,143.00
9 November 2021 Review and respond to J. Thomas's questions re: C Tuffey 1.90 1,206.50
mediation and party identification (1.7); revise
participating parties' protective order tracker and grant
access to document production (0.2).
9 November 2021 Review certain documents for discovery (1.2); review A Waterfield 2.30 1,299.50
subset of potentially privileged documents (1.1).
9 November 2021 Generate documents review summary and metrics K Huang 2.00 660.00
(0.6); generate document images for production (0.2);
generate document production (0.6); perform quality
control on received productions (0.4); secure user
groups permissions (0.2).
9 November 2021 Internal email communications re: duplicative K Leung 1.50 495.00

documents (0.1); create Relativity search to identify
duplicative documents (0.1); email communications
with C. Saunders re: Relativity user account (0.1);
relativity user account management (0.1); data
processing, monitor processing, run deduplications,
and export deduped documents (0.4); import data into
review platform and review re: Adversary Proceedings
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and Bankruptcy Litigation review (0.5); internal emails
with M. Fuhr re: data processing (0.1); call with J.
McNamara from Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP
re: BSA Plan productions (0.1).

9 November 2021 Finalize client documents for processing (1.4); M Fuhr 3.00 1,155.00
download, inventory, and finalize received productions
for Relativity (1.6).

9 November 2021 Update protective order acknowledgments file (0.1); D Hirshorn 0.20 66.00
update pleadings file (0.1).

10 November 2021 Review and comment on potential expert contract G Kurtz 7.10 12,247.50

(0.3); participate in meet and confer with the TCC
concerning discovery issues (1.0); participate in meet
and confer with insurers concerning discovery issues
(0.4); conference with M. Andolina, A. Hammond and
S. Hershey concerning depositions, objections to
depositions and taking the depositions (0.6); review
objections to deposition notices (1.9); outline response
to objections to depositions (0.5); continued
strategizing to proving the TDPs (2.4).

10 November 2021 Confer with S. Hershey, R. Gorsich, and G. Kurtz re: M Andolina 1.80 2,340.00
discovery issues, deposition scheduling and document
production issues.

10 November 2021 Attend meet and confer with Pachulski & Stang (0.8); A Hammond 9.40 12,079.00
attend meeting with Ad Hoc Committee re:
confirmation hearing and presentation of liquidation
analysis (1.2); call with B. Whittman re: expert report
and prepare for same (1.5); correspond with Potential
Expert re: engagement letter (1.0); review same (1.1);
review re: responding to outstanding discovery and
Rule 30(b)(6) notices (1.5); call with client re:
responding to list of witnesses proposed by
propounding insurers and call with propounding
insurers (2.3).

10 November 2021 Legal research re: control group claims (4.1); analyze R Tiedemann 8.10 9,072.00

TCC discovery disputes (1.4); meet and confer with
Propounding Insurers' counsel re: discovery disputes
(0.4); meet and confer with TCC counsel re: discovery
disputes (0.5); telephone calls with S. Hershey and J.
Thomas re: discovery issues (0.6); discussions with A.
Hammond re: expert discovery (0.3); review
documents for discovery as exhibits (0.8).

10 November 2021 Review and analyze new complaints in Archdiocese of K McDonald 4.70 4,653.00
New York's amended proof of claim (2.0); revise
Archdiocese of New York chart analyzing cases (1.4);
draft and revise correspondence to M. Andolina and M.
Linder re: Archdiocese of New York analysis (1.3).

10 November 2021 Review documents re: youth protection in preparation C Shepherd 1.60 1,584.00
for deposition.

10 November 2021 Meet and confer call with TCC, W&C team and B Warner 1.40 1,358.00
Haynes & Boone (0.5); research re: discovery and
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document question from J. Thomas (0.8); and
correspond with J. Thomas on same (0.1).

10 November 2021

Perform document review of Boy Scouts of America
productions.

D Rifkin

2.00

1,670.00

10 November 2021

Conduct privilege review.

C D'Oria

2.40

1,752.00

10 November 2021

Draft responses and objections to Zalkin's Rule
30(b)(6) notice to Debtors.

A Hong

5.50

4,015.00

10 November 2021

Conduct first level review of W&C emails.

| Popa

4.20

3,066.00

10 November 2021

Document review ahead for responsiveness and
privilege.

L Quinn

1.30

949.00

10 November 2021

Review documents in connection with privileged email
correspondence (3.9); review documents and emails
for discovery (6.5).

A Rogers

10.40

7,592.00

10 November 2021

Second Level Review of email production.

R Telemi

2.10

1,633.00

10 November 2021

Conduct first level document review.

A Zegger

1.40

1,022.00

10 November 2021

Correspond with J. Thomas and associates including
Z. Sporn, M. Radek, and E. Kozakevich re: next steps
re: document review for BSA (0.6); review and
categorize relativity documents re: H. Steppe Emails
(1.0).

C Edmonds

1.60

1,016.00

10 November 2021

Review White & Case emails for creation of privilege
log.

N Swire

1.20

762.00

10 November 2021

Review W&C emails for privilege and responsiveness
(2.1); perform privilege review legal department
documents (1.5).

A Waterfield

3.60

2,034.00

10 November 2021

Generate documents review summary and metrics
(0.6); generate document images for production (0.2);
perform quality control on document production (0.6);
generate productions (0.6).

K Huang

2.00

660.00

10 November 2021

Internal email communications re: Relativity document
list view (0.2); email communications with Z. Sporn re:
Relativity document list view (0.3); update and revise
Relativity = document list view (0.3); email
communications with W&C team re: FTP user account
management (0.3); FTP user account management
(0.3); data processing, monitor processing, run
deduplications, and export deduped documents (0.5);
import data into review platform and review re:
Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy Litigation
review (0.4); internal emails with M. Fuhr re: data
processing (0.3).

K Leung

2.60

858.00

10 November 2021

Assemble documents for production (1.3); finalize
client documents for processing and received
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productions for Relativity (1.9).

10 November 2021

Update Protective Order acknowledgments file (0.1);
update Datasite permissions (0.1); update pleadings
file (0.1).

11 November 2021

Review and respond to emails concerning claimant's
allegations re: voting propriety and the delivery of
documents (0.5); participate in call with M. Andolina,
C. Shepherd, A. Hammond, and potential expert (0.5);
review and revise letter to claimant 39 (0.2); review
and revise potential expert contract (0.1); conference
with Bates White and Haynes & Boone concerning
data (0.2); conference with Bates White and Ogletree
concerning data (0.6); participate in standing call with
plan proponents talking about confirmation hearing
and related issues (0.6); conference with S. Hershey
re: same (0.4); review and revise response to requests
for the debtors' position concerning TDP materials
(0.3); call with team concerning discovery responses
and positions, including 30(b)(6) witnesses, timing of
issues and identity of issues (1.0); outline TDP
evidence (2.1).

11 November 2021

Prepare for call with M. Linder, B. Whittman and team
re: substantial contribution (0.3); attend same (0.7);
call with client re: engagement letter (0.2); edit and
revise same (0.5); prepare for call with Willis Towers
(0.3); attend same (0.3); call with Potential Expert and
M. Andolina and G. Kurtz (0.8); attend call with KCIC
re: expert issues (1.1); attend standing call with
coalition (0.5); draft responses and objections to Rule
30(b)(6) requests (1.8); call with J. Hunt re:
membership (1.3); call with Haynes Boone and White
and Case re: depositions and discovery (1.1).

11 November 2021

Review and organize documents for production (0.7);
discussions with J. Thomas re: same (0.2); draft expert
disclosures; analyze order of proof issues for
confirmation (2.0).

11 November 2021

Review and analyze Archdiocese of New York
amended claims and complaints (1.3); analyze E.
Rosenberg's inquiries re: the same (0.4); review and
analyze M. Kenny's BSA New York Supreme Court
CVA Case List (0.9).

11 November 2021

Correspond with S. Hershey and D. Hirshorn re:
confirmation discovery parties’ request (0.1); call with
Omni, counsel to Omni and W&C team re: discovery
requests (0.3); call with S. Hershey and L. Baccash re:
Omni discovery request (0.3); review and manage data
room access issues (0.1); respond to W&C team on
same (0.1).

11 November 2021

Perform document review of Boy Scouts of America
productions.

TIMEKEEPER HOURS uUsD
D Hirshorn 0.30 99.00
G Kurtz 6.50 11,212.50
A Hammond 8.90 11,436.50
R Tiedemann 2.90 3,248.00
K McDonald 2.60 2,574.00
B Warner 0.90 873.00
D Rifkin 6.70 5,594.50

11 November 2021

Conduct document review.
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11 November 2021

Call with S. Levy re: responses and objections to Rule
30(b)(6) notices (0.1); emails with W&C discovery
team re: responses and objections (0.2).

A Hong

0.30

219.00

11 November 2021

Document review for responsiveness and privilege
with respect to plan challenges.

L Quinn

7.20

5,256.00

11 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: Client email review (3.2); further review
documents re: discovery requests (8.0).

A Rogers

11.20

8,176.00

11 November 2021

Conduct quality control document review for privilege
issues.

A Zegger

1.20

876.00

11 November 2021

Conduct document review.

A Davis

3.20

2,032.00

11 November 2021

Review documents for privilege and responsiveness
re: Chapter 11 hearing.

C Davis

1.60

1,016.00

11 November 2021

Review and categorize relativity documents re: client
emails.

C Edmonds

2.30

1,460.50

11 November 2021

Conduct document review.

C Obiozor

1.00

635.00

11 November 2021

Review of certain documents for privilege and
responsiveness.

A Waterfield

1.40

791.00

11 November 2021

Generate documents review summary and metrics
(0.6); generate document images for production (0.2);
perform quality control on document production (0.6);
generate productions (0.6).

K Huang

2.00

660.00

11 November 2021

Email communications with S. Hershey re: FTP user
accounts (0.1); FTP user account management (0.1);
data processing, monitor processing, run
deduplications, and export deduped documents (0.2);
import data into review platform and review re:
Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy Litigation
review (0.2); internal emails with M. Fuhr re: data
processing (0.2); internal emails with G. Pados re: data
import into review platform and process for review
(0.1).

K Leung

0.90

297.00

11 November 2021

Identify and isolate documents for production (0.7);
finalize client documents for processing (1.4);
download, inventory, and finalize received productions
for inclusion in Relativity (1.0).

M Fuhr

3.10

1,193.50

11 November 2021

Update Datasite permission settings (0.1); update
protective order acknowledgment file (0.1).

D Hirshorn

0.20

66.00

12 November 2021

Participate in meet and confer with Certain Insurers
counsel concerning their request for TDPs, claim
matrix and "plan-related" documents (0.2); conference
with S. Hershey concerning discovery schedule letter
at issue (0.2); conference with A. Hammond
concerning proofs for trial (0.1); review and revise
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letter to Certain Insurers concerning settlement trust
agreement discovery (0.2).

12 November 2021

Call with C. Shepherd re: TDPs (1.8); call with R.
Tiedemann re: engagement letter (0.8); review outline
of expert disclosure (1.1); attend meet and confer with
Insurers (0.5); review emails re: TCC hearing (0.3);
review of documents produced in connection with TCC
hearing (1.0); edit and revise 30(b)(6) responses and
objections (1.2).

A Hammond

6.70

8,609.50

12 November 2021

Multiple calls with M. Linder re: litigation issues (1.5);
call with S. Hershey re: same (0.1).

L Baccash

1.60

1,680.00

12 November 2021

Correspondence with A. Rosenblatt re: Fuentes
actions (0.3); phone conference with M. Kenny re: BSA
New York actions excel spreadsheet (0.2); review and
analyze M. Kenny BSA New York actions excel
spreadsheet (1.5); review and revise Archdiocese of
New York analysis to M. Andolina and M. Linder (1.2);
correspondence with E. Rosenberg re: the same (0.5).

K McDonald

3.70

3,663.00

12 November 2021

Prepare for depositions in advance of confirmation.

C Shepherd

2.20

2,178.00

12 November 2021

Correspond with chartered organization counsel and
W&C team re: data room.

B Warner

0.10

97.00

12 November 2021

Perform document review of Boy Scouts of America
productions.

D Rifkin

2.40

2,004.00

12 November 2021

Confer with W&C team re: redactions, privilege, and
protocol in connection with document review of client
emails (3.0); review documents tagged partially
privileged to determine and implement necessary
redactions (1.0).

A Rogers

4.00

2,920.00

12 November 2021

Review and produce document description re: charter
agreement folders for J. Thomas (0.6); review and tag
for privileged documents on relativity re: emails (1.1).

C Edmonds

1.70

1,079.50

12 November 2021

Analyze and review of documents for privilege and
responsiveness (1.4); review emails of client to check
for privilege (1.0).

A Waterfield

2.40

1,356.00

12 November 2021

Generate documents review summary and metrics
(0.3); perform quality control on document production
(1.0); generate productions (1.0).

K Huang

2.30

759.00

12 November 2021

Internal emails with G. Pados re: data import into
review platform and process for review (0.2); process
data for optical character recognition (0.2); email
communications with A. Rolain from Shipman &
Goodwin LLP re: BSA Plan Production (0.3); data
processing, monitor processing, run deduplications,
and export deduped documents (0.5); import data into
review platform and process for review re: Adversary
Proceedings and Bankruptcy Litigation review (0.5);
internal emails with M. Fuhr re: data processing (0.2).
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12 November 2021

Identify and isolate documents for production (0.9);
finalize client documents for processing (0.4);
download, inventory and finalize received productions
for inclusion in Relativity (1.8).

M Fuhr

3.10

1,193.50

12 November 2021

Update protective order acknowledgments file (0.1);
update Datasite permissions (0.1); update pleadings
file (0.1).

D Hirshorn

0.30

99.00

13 November 2021

Phone conferences (1.0) and emails (0.7) with BSA
team re: discovery schedule and offensive and
defensive preparation.

M Andolina

1.70

2,210.00

13 November 2021

Review Certain Insurers’ Motion to Compel against the
Debtors and related correspondence (0.3); call with S.
Hershey re: response to motion to compel (0.4); draft
letter opposition to motion to compel (5.9).

A Hong

6.60

4,818.00

13 November 2021

Generate document production (0.6); user account
request (0.2).

K Huang

0.80

264.00

13 November 2021

Investigate time zone question from TCC production
for S. Hershey (0.8); quality check TCC production and
finalize for Relativity (1.1).

M Fuhr

1.90

731.50

14 November 2021

Phone conferences (0.8) and emails (0.3) with BSA
team re: discovery schedule and offensive and
defensive preparation; emails (0.2) and phone
conferences (0.3) re: deposition scheduling and status.

M Andolina

1.60

2,080.00

14 November 2021

Call with S. Hershey (0.5); review B. Whittman expert
report (3.1); edit and revise 30(b)(6) responses (1.2).

A Hammond

4.80

6,168.00

14 November 2021

Review various correspondence from S. Hershey, G.
Kurtz re: discovery issues.

L Baccash

0.10

105.00

14 November 2021

Review TDP related documents in preparation for
deposition.

C Shepherd

1.20

1,188.00

14 November 2021

Draft privilege log entries.

C D'Oria

6.10

4,453.00

14 November 2021

Draft letter opposition to Certain Insurers' motion to
compel (1.4); correspond with S. Hershey re: same
(0.2); call with J. Thomas and R. Demoulin re: review
of TDP documents (0.2); review and redact re:
privileged information from documents re: TDPs and
settlement trust agreement (6.3).

A Hong

8.10

5,913.00

14 November 2021

Attend BSA Privilege log call (0.5); draft W&C email
privilege log entries (4.2); draft mediation privilege log
entries (1.6).

R Telemi

6.30

4,599.00

14 November 2021

Draft privilege log, including identification of internal
correspondence.

A Zegger

2.90

2,117.00

14 November 2021

Generate privilege logs (1.5); generate document
production (0.6).

Page 20 of 151

K Huang

2.10

693.00




Case 20-10343-LSS Doc 9308-2 Filed 03/12/22 Page 22 of 152
WHITE & CASE

Boy Scouts of America

RE: Project Restructuring OUR REF: 1786703-0002
DATE DESCRIPTION TIMEKEEPER HOURS usD
14 November 2021 Internal emails with G. Pados re: data import into K Leung 0.20 66.00

review platform and process for review.

14 November 2021 Download new productions and stage for upload (0.7); M Fuhr 1.80 693.00
quality check received document productions (1.1).

15 November 2021 Conference with A. Hammond concerning discovery G Kurtz 3.30 5,692.50
disputes and evidentiary issues (0.4); conference with
D. Abbott concerning discovery schedule (0.1); review
and revise opposition to motion by certain insurers to
compel the production of documents (1.3); conference
with A. Hahn and S. Hershey providing further
comments on the opposition (0.5); participate in meet
and confer with J. Hallowell and other insurers
concerning their request for the depositions of former
employees in claims handling (0.5); conference with
Client, M. Andolina, A. Hammond, and S. Hershey
concerning the Boys Scout 30(b)(6) witness
designations (0.5).

15 November 2021 Edit and revise expert report (3.9); call with A&M re: A Hammond 10.40 13,364.00
expert report (1.4); call with R. Tiedemann re: next
steps re: same (1.0); draft responses and objections to
30(b)(6) notices (3.1); call with S. Levy and S. Hershey
re: same (1.0).

15 November 2021 Review and analyze correspondence and documents K McDonald 4.30 4,257.00

from E. Rosenberg and S. Manning re: motion to
dismiss (0.5); review complaints provided by K. Murray
for next round of amended schedules and chart re: the
same (1.5); review and analyze correspondence from
S. Manning and local defense counsel in preparation
for next amended schedule filing (0.5); review and
analyze cases in M. Kenny's chart re: BSA CVA
lawsuits pending in New York courts for the judge's
clerk (1.8).

15 November 2021 Prepare for depositions of debtor witnesses (2.5); call C Shepherd 3.50 3,465.00
with KCIC, Bates White, and W&C teams re: expert
disclosures and topics of testimony (1.0).

15 November 2021 Call with S. Hershey re: discovery matters (0.1); B Warner 0.30 291.00
correspond with M. Murray and S. Hershey re: abuse
claims discovery and letter correspondence matters

(0.2).
15 November 2021 Perform document review of Boy Scouts of America D Rifkin 5.20 4,342.00
productions.
15 November 2021 Draft privilege log. C D'Oria 2.60 1,898.00
15 November 2021 Call with G. Kurtz and S. Hershey re: opposition to A Hong 5.80 4,234.00

Certain Insurers' motion to compel discovery (0.5); call
with S. Hershey re: same (0.1); review record re:
mediation privilege (2.7); review documents relating to
TDP and settlement trust agreement for production
(1.5); call with M. Jaoude re: document review (0.1);
review documents relating to settlement trust
agreement (0.9).
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15 November 2021 Conduct first level review of W&C emails. | Popa 2.90 2,117.00
15 November 2021 Correspondence with J. Thomas and S. Saboungi re: A Rogers 0.30 219.00
future work streams, privilege logs, and scheduling
conference.
15 November 2021 Draft mediation privilege log entries. R Telemi 4.70 3,431.00
15 November 2021 Draft, review and revise privilege log. A Zegger 1.60 1,168.00
15 November 2021 Review documents re: privilege. C Davis 1.20 762.00
15 November 2021 Conduct document review. C Obiozor 0.70 444.50
15 November 2021 Review privilege log re: mediation parties for J. C Tuffey 0.40 254.00
Thomas.
15 November 2021 Review privilege log material (0.5); attend call with A. A Waterfield 0.90 508.50

Hong to discuss same (0.4).

15 November 2021

Generate document production. K Huang 1.50 495.00

15 November 2021

Internal email with M. Fuhr re: data import into review K Leung 0.90 297.00
platform and process for review (0.3); data import into
review platform and process for review (0.6).

15 November 2021

Download, stage and quality check received M Fuhr 5.80 2,233.00
productions and update production log.

15 November 2021 Update protective order acknowledgments file (0.1); D Hirshorn 0.30 99.00
update Datasite permissions (0.1); update pleadings
file (0.1).

16 November 2021 Call with Haynes & Boone concerning Bruce Griggs G Kurtz 5.00 8,625.00

deposition preparation (0.5); participate in meet and
confer with the TCC concerning the TCC's 30(b)(6)
notice to debtors (1.6); review status reports (0.4);
review and revise response to Ed Rice (0.4); emails
concerning request for an adjournment and a potential
new schedule (0.4); review discovery issues
concerning liquidation analysis (0.3); conference with
S. Hershey concerning discovery disputes (0.3);
strategize for status conference concerning discovery
issues (1.1).

16 November 2021

Attend meet and confer with TCC (1.5), meet and A Hammond 9.50 12,207.50
confer with Zalkin and S. Hershey (0.6); call with Mr.

Starrett (0.6); call with J. Hunt (1.2), review materials

for meet and confer calls (2.1); call with C. Shepherd

and Haynes Boone re: deposition preparation (1.2);

identify potential witnesses to respond to Rule 30(b)(6)

notices (0.8); review and edit order of proof and

deposition outline (1.5).

16 November 2021

Analyze cases on M. Kenny BSA spreadsheet for new K McDonald 5.00 4,950.00
cases to be added to the amended schedules (2.5);
review and analyze new complaints for scouting
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related allegations (1.0); revise M. Kenny chart (1.2);
correspondence with M. Kenny re: the same (0.3).

16 November 2021 Prepare for depositions of debtor witnesses (1.6); call C Shepherd 3.60 3,564.00
with N. Dubose and G. Kurtz re: deposition preparation
(0.5); call with A. Hammond re: deposition preparation
(0.9); call with A. Hammond and A. Azer re: discovery
and deposition preparation (0.6).

16 November 2021 Call with S. Hershey re: KTBS and Zalkin discovery = B Warner 0.20 194.00
call updates.

16 November 2021 Meeting re: deposition preparation. C D'Oria 0.50 365.00

16 November 2021 Attend call re: deposition preparation. R Telemi 0.50 365.00

16 November 2021 Download and finalize Ad Hoc Committee's production M Fuhr 1.90 731.50

(0.9); download, stage, and quality check Ad Hoc
Committee's productions VOL001 and VOL002 (1.0).

16 November 2021 Update Datasite permissions (0.1); update pleadings D Hirshorn 0.20 66.00
file (0.1).
17 November 2021 Conference with A. Hammond concerning expert G Kurtz 9.00 15,525.00

issues (0.3); review and revise opposition to motion to
compel by Certain Insurers concerning plan-related
materials and TDPs (3.8); review and revise opposition
to motion for protective order concerning Insurers'
depositions (1.4); conference with S. Hershey
concerning two motions to compel (0.5); conference
with A. Azer concerning comments to opposition to
motion for protective order concerning Insurers'
deposition (0.2); participate in call with Bates White
and Ogletree concerning claims practices industry
(1.0); participate in call with team concerning witness
and proof issues (1.1); participate in call with A. Azer
concerning claw back of privileged information (0.1);
participate in call with R. Gorsich and C. Shepherd
concerning expert issues, objections to 30(b)(6) topics
and required work to present expert issues at trial
(0.6).

17 November 2021 Emails with client re: deposition schedules and M Andolina 2.60 3,380.00
strategy, status of production and witness preparation
issues (2.0); emails with litigation team re: discovery
disputes and meet-and-confers (0.3); calls re: same
(0.3).

17 November 2021 Attend call with G. Kurtz, J. Lauria, and team re: A Hammond 9.00 11,565.00

deposition outline (1.1); calls with C. Binggeli and B.
Whittman re: A&M expert report (2.3); call with Steptoe
and Johnson re: analysis of Local Council restrictions
(0.5); calls with R. Tiedemann re: Potential Expert
engagement (0.2); review deposition outline (1.1);
prepare deposition talking points (3.2); attend meet
and confer call with Catholic and Methodists (0.6).

17 November 2021 Call with D. Kim re: litigation issues (0.1); call with R. L Baccash 2.20 2,310.00
Gorsich re: same (0.4); call with R. Gorsich and D. Kim
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re: same (0.5); prepare and participate in call with A.
Azer, J. Lauria and others re: witness preparation
(0.7); draft letter to TCC re: hearing (0.5).
17 November 2021 Draft confirmation issues for deposition preparation. D Kim 1.00 1,045.00
17 November 2021 Analyze complaints for cases in M. Kenny's BSA CVA K McDonald 3.90 3,861.00
excel spreadsheet (1.4); draft and revise
correspondence to M. Kenny re: excel (0.5); phone
conference with E. Rosenberg re: the same (0.1);
review amended schedules and new cases re: the
same (1.6); correspondence with A. Bowron, E.
Rosenberg, and S. Manning re: the same (0.3).
17 November 2021 Call with G. Kurtz and R. Gorsich re: deposition and C Shepherd 3.10 3,069.00
witness preparation (0.7); call with R. Gorsich re: same
(0.6); prepare for depositions of Debtor witnesses
(1.8).
17 November 2021 Call with A. Hammond and L. Baccash re: expert B Warner 0.80 776.00
witness and 30(b)(6) testimony (0.5); research and
manage case document request re: witness testimony
preparation (0.3).
17 November 2021 Document review of B. Whittman emails and A Rogers 7.70 5,621.00
documents re: financial projections, valuations.
17 November 2021 Attend BSA Whittman deposition preparation meeting R Telemi 6.70 4,891.00
(0.5); conduct Whitman review (6.2).
17 November 2021 Analyze and review documents in preparation of B. A Zegger 0.30 219.00
Whittman deposition.
17 November 2021 Review emails for B. Whittman Deposition (1.0); A Ghafarian 3.50 2,222.50
review documents (2.5).
17 November 2021 Emails with R. Gorsich re: discovery and notices of D Rivero 0.40 254.00
depositions filed (0.3); email correspondence with J.
Thomas re: same (0.1).
17 November 2021 Perform native export. K Huang 0.40 132.00
17 November 2021 Update protective order agreements file (0.1); update D Hirshorn 0.20 66.00
Datasite permissions (0.1).
18 November 2021 Draft deposition outlines (1.5); review materials for G Kurtz 9.50 16,387.50
hearing on motion to compel (3.9); conference with
Bates White concerning expert analysis (0.9);
conference with M. Andolina concerning Bates White
work and other proof related issues (0.6); conference
with A. Hammond concerning proof issues (0.4);
continued outline and expert proofs (2.2).
18 November 2021 Draft deposition preparation outline (3.1); draft A Hammond 6.10 7,838.50

response to Zalkin and Pfau plaintiffs (0.5); telephone
call with A. O'Neill, A. Azer, and D. Evans re:
Zalkin/Pfau meet and confer (1.1); call with C.
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Shepherd re: TDPs (0.4); email with A. O'Neill re:
same (0.2); draft talking points re: same and
confirmation discovery for insurers (0.8).
18 November 2021 Review and analyze amended schedules and revisions K McDonald 2.50 2,475.00
re: the same (2.3); correspondence with A. Bowron re:
the same (0.2).
18 November 2021 Review draft order of proof and discovery responses C Shepherd 1.70 1,683.00
(1.0); e-mails re: deposition preparation and document
production (0.7).
18 November 2021 Review, revise, and update settlement approval motion S Murray 1.80 1,656.00
and corresponding Hanke declaration (1.4); circulate
same to L. Baccash (0.1); drafted and circulated email
with same to E. Hanke and N. Sochurek (KCIC) (0.3).
18 November 2021 Conduct document review in preparation for the C D'Oria 5.60 4,088.00
deposition of J. Hunt.
18 November 2021 Document review re: B. Whittman emails for deposition A Rogers 9.30 6,789.00
preparation (0.3); review documents re: B. Whittman
emails for deposition preparation (9.0).
18 November 2021 Conduct Whittman deposition review. R Telemi 4.50 3,285.00
18 November 2021 Review numerous relevant documents for depositions. A Zegger 4.00 2,920.00
18 November 2021 Meet with J. Thomas re: J. Hunt review. A Costello 0.30 190.50
18 November 2021 Conduct document review. A Davis 3.60 2,286.00
18 November 2021 Review documents related to J. Hunt in preparation for ~ C Davis 1.30 825.50
deposition re: Chapter 11 hearings.
18 November 2021 Discuss deposition document collection re: B. C Edmonds 0.90 571.50
Whittman deposition with Renza Demoulin.
18 November 2021 Review emails for B. Whittman Deposition (1.0); A Ghafarian 4.00 2,540.00
review documents for deposition (3.0).
18 November 2021 Review documents for relevance to J. Hunt deposition. A Waterfield 2.00 1,130.00
18 November 2021 Generate documents for review. K Huang 0.20 66.00
18 November 2021 Download TCC production and load in Relativity (1.4); M Fuhr 1.80 693.00
process Munich Reinsurance production and load in
Relativity (0.4).
19 November 2021 Strategize for hearing on motions to compel (1.0); G Kurtz 8.00 13,800.00
participate in hearing on motions to compel for
protective order (6.5); draft argument language for A.
Azer concerning motion for protective order (0.4);
conference with A. Azer re: same (0.1).
19 November 2021 Deposition preparation for B. Whittman and J. Hunt A Hammond 5.10
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(2.1), call with client (0.4); review 30(b)(6) issues and
designating deponents (0.6); correspondence with
Zalkin Plaintiffs (0.2); draft correspondence with
Catholics and Methodists (1.2); call with C. Binggeli
(0.6).

19 November 2021

Review and analyze schedules and correspondence
from E. Rosenberg and local defense counsels for
incorporation into amended schedules.

K McDonald

0.90

891.00

19 November 2021

Revise responses and objections to Rule 30(b)(6)
notice (1.2); call with R. Gorsich re: same (0.5); review
discovery responses in preparation for depositions
(1.5).

C Shepherd

3.20

3,168.00

19 November 2021

Correspond with Haynes Boone team and S. Hershey
re: case data requests.

B Warner

0.20

194.00

19 November 2021

Conduct document review in preparation for the
deposition of J. Hunt.

C D'Oria

5.90

4,307.00

19 November 2021

Review documents re: B. Whittman emails for
deposition preparation.

A Rogers

5.00

3,650.00

19 November 2021

Analyze and direct review of TCC documents.

A Zegger

4.00

2,920.00

19 November 2021

Conduct document review.

A Davis

2.50

1,687.50

19 November 2021

Conduct relativity document review re: B. Whittman
deposition.

C Edmonds

2.80

1,778.00

19 November 2021

Review emails for B. Whittman Deposition (1.0);
review documents for deposition (3.0).

A Ghafarian

4.00

2,540.00

19 November 2021

Confer re: document review with A. Zegger (0.2);
conduct document review of specific custodian's
emails (1.9).

C Obiozor

2.10

1,333.50

19 November 2021

Review and identify documents relevant to witness in
preparation for deposition.

N Swire

1.50

952.50

19 November 2021

Review and analyze documents re: J. Hunt deposition
preparation.

A Waterfield

1.20

678.00

19 November 2021

Generate document productions (1.0); respond to user
and group requests (0.4); import received production
(0.3); perform quality control on received productions
(0.4).

K Huang

2.10

693.00

19 November 2021

Internal emails with M. Fuhr re: data processing (0.1);
email communications with A. Zegger re: Relativity
search (0.1); create Relativity search for A. Zegger
(0.1); email communications with M. Jaoude re:
Relativity search and new coding fields and layout
(0.1); create Relativity search for M. Jaoude (0.1);
create new Relativity review fields and layout for M.
Jaoude (0.1); internal emails with K. Huang re:
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production quality assurance (0.1); perform production
quality assurance (0.1); internal calls with E. Lay-at re:
new data processing task (0.1).

19 November 2021 Download and process Insurer production (1.1); review M Fuhr 5.20 2,002.00

materials for and attend phone call with A&M re:
documents cited in report and anticipated production
(0.6); check on status of expected new Ogletree
documents (0.2); generate indexes of Datasite and
Boxsite documents in Relativity (0.6); download and
finalize received productions and files for processing
for Relativity (1.8); update production log (0.9).

20 November 2021 Review new hot documents from TCC production G Kurtz 4.00 6,900.00

(1.1); participate in call with the coalition concerning
the TCC depositions (0.7); telephone call with M.
Andolina concerning deposition topics and questions
(0.4); participate in call with Haynes & Boone and B.
Griggs concerning deposition (0.7); conference with A.
Hammond concerning evidentiary proof issues (0.6);
participate in call with A. Hammond, and L. Baccash
concerning liquidation analysis and best interests
concerning local counsel (0.5).

20 November 2021 Attend conference call re: insurer discovery following A Hammond 5.20 6,682.00
hearing (1.2); attend conference call with G. Kurtz and
L. Baccash re: restricted assets and vote (1.6); review
issues re: A&M expert report (2.4).

20 November 2021 Call with J. Lauria (part), A. Azer, S. Hershey, E. L Baccash 1.30 1,365.00
Martin and others re: litigation issues.

20 November 2021 Call with G. Kurtz, A. Azer (Haynes Boone), E. Martin ~ C Shepherd 4.00 3,960.00
(Haynes Boone), R. Gorsich, M. Stoner (Haynes
Boone) re: deposition preparation (1.0); review
disclosure statement (1.5); review materials and
prepare for Rule 30(b)(6) depositions (1.5).

20 November 2021 Email W&C team re: discovery preparation requests. B Warner 0.10 97.00
20 November 2021 Review documents produced by the TCC. C D'Oria 1.40 1,022.00
20 November 2021 Review documents re: B. Whittman emails for A Rogers 4.10 2,993.00

deposition preparation (4.0); research same (0.1).

20 November 2021 Analyze documents pertaining to J. Hunt deposition A Zegger 2.00 1,460.00
(1.0); analyze and review documents produced by
TCC (1.0).

20 November 2021 Review and collect relativity documents re: B. C Edmonds 2.60 1,651.00

Whittman deposition.

20 November 2021 Perform Relativity user account management re: K Leung 1.00 330.00
Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy Litigation
(0.2); email communications with A. Hong re: printing
colored PDF from Relativity (0.2); call with L. Karchmer
re: Relativity user credentials (0.2); document analysis
re: printing colored PDF from Relativity (0.4).

Page 27 of 151



Case 20-10343-LSS Doc 9308-2 Filed 03/12/22 Page 29 of 152
WHITE & CASE

Boy Scouts of America

RE: Project Restructuring OUR REF: 1786703-0002

DATE

DESCRIPTION

TIMEKEEPER

HOURS

usb

20 November 2021

Quality check received productions and processing
(1.1); revise inventory of documents for A&M expert
report (0.5).

M Fuhr

1.60

616.00

21 November 2021

Participate in call with A. Hammond, R. Tiedemann
and S. Hershey, at times, concerning liquidation
analysis, real estate appraisals and other evidentiary
issues (1.4); draft expert outline (1.6).

G Kurtz

3.00

5,175.00

21 November 2021

Call with S. Hershey re: deposition schedule and
outstanding discovery emails (1.2); review re:
discovery correspondence re: 30(b)(6) topics (1.5);
draft list of deponents and topics and issues to raise
(1.2).

A Hammond

3.90

5,011.50

21 November 2021

Confer with R. Gorsich re: discovery for confirmation
(0.3); review correspondence re: Rule 30(b)(6)
depositions  (0.2); review revised confirmation
scheduling (0.2).

D Kim

0.70

731.50

21 November 2021

Review Plan and TDPs in advance of deposition (1.5);
review materials and prepare for deposition
preparation of B. Griggs (1.2).

C Shepherd

2.70

2,673.00

21 November 2021

Review produced documents.

C D'Oria

2.30

1,679.00

21 November 2021

Review documents re: B. Whittman emails for
deposition preparation (1.0); document review re: TCC
deposition preparation (0.5); correspondence re: same
(0.2); document review and correspondence re: TCC
deposition preparation (0.1).

A Rogers

1.80

1,314.00

21 November 2021

Review J. Hunt document production re: deposition.

A Costello

1.80

1,143.00

21 November 2021

Generate document production sets.

K Huang

1.00

330.00

21 November 2021

Run quality check of the clawback productions (0.3);
upload to the secure fileshare platform (0.3).

Gleb Chemborisov

0.60

198.00

22 November 2021

Conference with J. Lauria concerning depositions of
Boys Scouts and evidentiary issues (0.5); conference
with A. Hammond concerning liquidation analysis (0.5);
participate in preparation of B. Griggs for deposition
(5.6); review Form CMP and analyze privilege related
issues (0.5); begin analyzing content of proofs (1.4);
review interrogatory objections and responses in
preparation for meet and confer (0.6); review and
respond to the letter of Certain Insurers re: the court's
ruling (0.4); conference with C. Shepherd and A.
Hammond re: 30(b)(6) topics for specific witnesses
(0.7).

G Kurtz

10.20

17,595.00

22 November 2021

Edit and revise expert report (3.1); multiple calls with
S. Hershey, C. Shepherd, G. Kurtz re: deposition
topics, and outlines (3.1); review documents to prepare
witnesses for 30(b)(6) deposition topics (2.4); call with
R. Tiedemann and E Green re: settlement trust
transfer agreement (1.1); call with S. Levy re: 30(b)(6)
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topics and outlines (0.5).

22 November 2021

Analyze case law for inclusion in schedules.

K McDonald

0.40

396.00

22 November 2021

Call with A. O'Neill and R. Gorsich re: TDP negotiation
(0.5); videoconference (partial) with G. Kurtz, R.
Gorsich, A. Azer, E. Martin, M. Stoner, B. Griggs re:
deposition preparation (1.0); call with A. Azer re: Rule
30(b)(6) topics (0.5); call with A. Hammond, S.
Hershey, S. Rudman re: propounding insurers' Rule
30(b)(6) notice (0.8); review materials and prepare for
debtors' Rule 30(b)(6) depositions (1.8).

C Shepherd

4.60

4,554.00

22 November 2021

Correspond with Ogletree team re: preliminary
injunction schedules.

B Warner

0.10

97.00

22 November 2021

Review and analyze production documents from the
TCC.

C D'Oria

6.50

4,745.00

22 November 2021

Conducted document review re: Desai and Schuer
depositions.

| Popa

4.20

3,066.00

22 November 2021

Conduct document review re: TCC deposition
preparation (3.0); correspond with discovery team re:
same (0.1); review re: protocol emails and notes for
reference (0.2); document review and correspondence
re: TCC deposition preparation (0.1).

A Rogers

3.40

2,482.00

22 November 2021

Review of J. Hunt production documents re:
membership projections.

A Costello

2.10

1,333.50

22 November 2021

Review documents in preparation for TCC depositions
re: chapter 11 hearing.

C Davis

1.40

889.00

22 November 2021

Review and collect relativity documents re: B.
Whittman deposition.

C Edmonds

1.60

1,016.00

22 November 2021

Reviewed emails re: Desai and Schuler deposition
(0.5); review and analyze documents for deposition
(2.0).

A Ghafarian

2.50

1,5687.50

22 November 2021

Review produced documents re: preparation for TCC
depositions.

N Swire

2.10

1,333.50

22 November 2021

Error handling of problematic files (0.4);
staging/normalization data for importing (0.2);
staging/normalization = data for exporting into
hosting/analytics application (0.3); status update
reports for case team (0.3); run requested searches
(0.7); respond to conflicts and search terms requests
(0.4).

Gleb Chemborisov

2.30

759.00

23 November 2021

Conference with J. Green concerning research for
trustee TDPs and related privilege issues (0.2);
conference with A. Hammond concerning proof issues
(0.5); outline reactions and responses (0.9); review
research concerning privilege issues and TDP issues
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(1.3); begin outlining expert report issues (2.3);
conference with A. Hammond and C. Shepherd
concerning 30(b)(6) topics and potential witnesses
(0.5); review Kosnoff transcript (1.4).

23 November 2021 Coordination calls with expert. M Andolina 0.70 910.00

23 November 2021 Attend meet and confer with propounding insurers A Hammond 10.10 12,978.50
(2.1); review re: identifying 30(b)(6) topics and gather
information re: same (3.2); edit and revise expert
reports (2.4); call with KCIC and others re: discovery
(0.8); call with R. Tiedemann re: Steptoe and Johnson
chart for expert report (0.7); review pension
information (0.9).

23 November 2021 Confer with R. Gorsich re: Rule 30(b)(6) withness D Kim 0.70 731.50
preparation (0.2); review relevant documents re: same
(0.5).

23 November 2021 Review and analyze revised amended schedules (2.5); K McDonald 3.70 3,663.00

review and analyze Archdiocese of New York and M.
Kenny charts for inclusion in amended schedules (1.0);
correspondence with E. Rosenberg and A. Bowron re:
the same (0.2).

23 November 2021 Videoconference (partial) with A. Azer, E. Martin, C. C Shepherd 3.00 2,970.00
Green, R. Gorsich, T. Allen re: deposition preparation
(1.0); revise proposed deposition designations (0.5);
review materials and prepare for Rule 30(b)(6)
depositions (1.5).

23 November 2021 Correspond with D. Hirshorn re: Datasite matters (0.1); B Warner 0.30 291.00
correspond with S. Hershey re: document and claims
inquiries re: confirmation discovery (0.2).

23 November 2021 Revise settlement motion and Hanke Declaration re: S Murray 2.80 2,576.00
C. Green’s (Haynes & Boone) feedback and circulate
to team (0.5); correspond with C. Green (Haynes &
Boone) re: updated language for same (0.1);
coordinate with M. Linder re: obtaining final settlement
agreement (0.1); coordinate with G. Wight (Kipp &
Christian) re: same and criteria for filing settlement
approval motion (0.2); follow up with M. Linder re:
same (0.1); circulate motion and declaration to C.
Green (Haynes & Boone) for review (0.1); coordinate
with N. Sochurek (KCIC) re: data in motion and
declaration and finalizing declaration for filing (0.1);
draft email to P. Topper (MNAT) with motion and
declaration for review (0.2); coordinate with M. Linder
re: review of near-final motion and declaration (0.1);
coordinate with G. Wight re: plaintiffs’ approval of
settlement (0.1); review comments from N. Sochurek
(KCIC) and revise motion and declaration re: same
(0.3); revise motion and declaration re: M. Linder
comments (0.4); finalize motion and circulate same to
P. Topper (MNAT) for filing (0.5).

23 November 2021 Review documents produced by the TCC. C D'Oria 9.90 7,227.00
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23 November 2021

Document review for responsiveness and privilege.

L Quinn

4.20

3,066.00

23 November 2021

Conduct document review re: TCC deposition
preparation (5.0); correspondence re: same (0.5);
review protocol, email chain, and notes for reference
(0.4).

A Rogers

5.90

4,307.00

23 November 2021

Review documents in preparation for TCC depositions
re: chapter 11 hearing.

C Davis

2.50

1,687.50

23 November 2021

Conduct search and document relativity documents re:
Steptoe Johnson deed and restriction search (1.9);
meet with A. Zegger re: TCC relativity search (0.3);
review and collect relativity documents re: TCC
Review (1.5).

C Edmonds

3.70

2,349.50

23 November 2021

Conduct document review.

C Obiozor

1.00

635.00

23 November 2021

Emails with R. Demoulin re: discovery and document
review (0.3); emails with R. Telemi re: same (0.2).

D Rivero

0.50

317.50

23 November 2021

Review of documents related to TCC review.

K Schroeder

1.60

1,016.00

23 November 2021

Review and identify documents received from outside
parties responsive to upcoming depositions.

N Swire

2.70

1,714.50

23 November 2021

Review emails re: insurer access to data room and
proofs of claim data and facilitate same (0.3); review
questions re: discovery from litigation team (0.2).

C Tuffey

0.50

317.50

23 November 2021

Generate documents for review.

K Huang

0.40

132.00

23 November 2021

Error  handling of problematic files (0.8);
staging/normalization data for importing (0.2);
staging/normalization data for exporting into
hosting/analytics application (0.2); status update
reports for case team (0.3); run requested searches
(0.3); deal with conflicts and search terms requests
(0.8); execute document populations and dealing with
protected views (0.3).

Gleb Chemborisov

2.90

957.00

23 November 2021

Update pleading file (0.1); update case calendar (0.1);
update Datasite permissions (0.1).

D Hirshorn

0.30

99.00

24 November 2021

Review and comment on emails concerning TCC
30(b)(6) designations (0.2); participate in call with A.
Hammond, R. Gorsich, C. Shepherd, and Haynes &
Boone concerning 30(b)(6) witness designations (1.7);
conference with A. Hammond concerning 30(b)(6)
witness designations (0.4); conference with A.
Hammond, M. Andolina, and S. Hershey concerning
charter organization issues, and proof of claim values
(1.0).

G Kurtz

3.30

5,692.50

24 November 2021

Review D. Desai and A. Schuler deposition materials
(2.5); draft outline re: same (0.5) and send outline and
link to client team (0.2).
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24 November 2021

Edit and revise discovery correspondence (2.8); call
with G. Kurtz, C. Shepherd, and S. Hershey re: same
(1.2); call with M. Andolina, G. Kurtz, and S. Hershey
re: same (0.6); call with B. Whittman and C. Binggeli
re: expert report (2.1); review and edit expert report
(2.4); draft outline for deposition (3.1).

A Hammond

12.20

15,677.00

24 November 2021

Call (in part) with G. Kurtz, R. Gorsich, A. Hammond
and others re: Rule 30(b)(6) witness preparation.

L Baccash

1.00

1,050.00

24 November 2021

Call with D. Evans and R. Gorsich re: Bates White
work product (1.0); Revise summary of Rule 30(b)(6)
designations (0.8); fact research re: TDP negotiations
(1.0); e-mails re: deposition designations (1.0); review
materials and prepare for Griggs deposition (1.0).

C Shepherd

4.80

4,752.00

24 November 2021

Review produced documents.

C D'Oria

6.10

4,453.00

24 November 2021

Conducted document review re: A&M Expert
documents.

| Popa

3.80

2,774.00

24 November 2021

Document review for responsiveness and privilege.

L Quinn

3.20

2,336.00

24 November 2021

Confer with A. Zegger and Z. Sporn re: TCC document
review (0.2); document review re: TCC deposition
preparation (3.5); correspondence re: same (0.3);
review protocol, email chain, and notes for reference
(0.2).

A Rogers

4.20

3,066.00

24 November 2021

Review documents flagged for J. Hunt deposition.

A Zegger

1.70

1,241.00

24 November 2021

Review documents in preparation for TCC depositions
re: chapter 11 hearing.

C Davis

1.20

762.00

24 November 2021

Conduct search and document relativity documents re:
Steptoe Johnson deed and restriction search (4.4);
discuss relativity training with M. Jaoude, J. Thomas,
Z. Sporn, and others re: relativity search techniques
(0.6).

C Edmonds

5.00

3,175.00

24 November 2021

Conduct document review.

C Obiozor

1.50

952.50

24 November 2021

Review and identify documents received from outside
parties responsive to upcoming depositions.

N Swire

698.50

24 November 2021

Perform quality control for document production (0.2);
generate production transfer and release (0.2).

K Huang

0.40

132.00

24 November 2021

Error handling of problematic files (0.8);
staging/normalization data for importing (0.2);
staging/normalization data for exporting into
hosting/analytics application (0.3); run production (0.4);
run requested searches (0.3).

Gleb Chemborisov

2.00

660.00

25 November 2021

Analyze 30(b)(6) topics, objections and designations
(0.5); review and response to emails concerning
privilege issues associated with board minutes
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provided to bank (0.4).

25 November 2021 Review discovery in preparation for depositions (2.1); A Hammond 4.50 5,782.50

edit and revise discovery correspondence (2.0); calls
with S. Hershey re: same (0.4).

25 November 2021 Draft email response to S. Hershey re: deposition B Warner 0.20 194.00
materials preparation request.

26 November 2021 Review research concerning trust issues and coverage G Kurtz 3.20 5,520.00

defenses (0.8); participate in call with A. Azer, E.
Martin, M. Andolina, S. Hershey, and A. Hammond
concerning 30(b)(6) witness designations (1.1);
conferences with M. Andolina re: same (0.2);
conference with A. Azer, E. Martin, M. Andolina, S.
Hershey, A. Hammond, and L. Baccash concerning
open evidentiary issues for confirmation (1.1).

26 November 2021 Calls with L. Baccash and B. Whittman re: expert M Andolina 2.70 3,510.00
status, production and deposition timing and schedule,
and 30(b)(6) assignments and category issues (0.4);
follow up re: same (2.3).

26 November 2021 Call with B. Whittman and C Binggeli re: deposition A Hammond 6.80 8,738.00
preparation and expert report (1.8); call with S.
Hershey, M. Andolina et al. re: next steps and
outstanding litigation issues (1.9); draft responses to
Rule 30(b)(6) topics (1.4); calls with S. Hershey re:
outstanding discovery issues and meet and confer
issues (1.0); emails with S. Hershey re: same (0.7).

26 November 2021 Revise draft letter to Propounding Insurers re: Rule C Shepherd 2.80 2,772.00
30(b)(6) notice (0.8); call with R. Gorsich re: same
(0.4); e-mail correspondence re: Rule 30(b)(6)
designations (0.5); review discovery responses and
correspondence re: depositions (1.1).

26 November 2021 Draft and create preliminary J. Hunt deposition binder A Zegger 2.90 2,117.00
(0.4); draft claw back log (0.5); identify and review re:
documents in need of redaction (0.5); draft letter in
anticipation of supplemental production re: TDPs (1.0);
conduct document review re: the same (0.5).

26 November 2021 Review TCC files in preparation for J. Hunt deposition. A Costello 2.60 1,651.00

26 November 2021 Staging/normalization data for importing (0.4); run Gleb Chemborisov 1.80 594.00
requested searches (0.4); import documents, map, run
quality check (0.3); run Productions (0.4); run
production exports and secure fileshare platform
upload (0.3).

27 November 2021 Review 30(b)(6) designations (0.5); review and revise G Kurtz 1.60 2,760.00
response concerning the further production of
documents requested by insurers (0.2); conference
with M. Andolina, A. Hammond, and S. Hershey
concerning the need to designate a witness for certain
TDP subjects (0.9).
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27 November 2021

Review D. Desai and A. Schuler deposition materials
(1.5); follow-up emails re: same with W&C team (0.5);
review 30(b)(6) designations (0.5); phone conferences
(0.5) and emails (0.2) with BSA team re: same.

M Andolina

3.20

4,160.00

27 November 2021

Review re: deposition preparation (0.5); editing and
revising expert report (2.0); review materials to prepare
for deposition of B. Whittman (3.0); discovery
correspondence re: same (0.1); conference call re:
TCC Rule 30(b)(6) requests (0.7); call with M.
Andolina, G. Kurtz and S. Hershey re: designations of
Rule 30(b)(6) topics (0.7).

A Hammond

7.00

8,995.00

27 November 2021

Review draft communication re: Rule 30(b)(6)
designations.

C Shepherd

0.30

297.00

27 November 2021

Document review for TCC and Hunt depositions.

L Quinn

4.60

3,358.00

27 November 2021

Confer with A. Zegger, L. Quinn, and R. Demoulin re:
TCC and S. Hunt deposition (0.5); conduct document
review re: TCC plans and S. Hunt deposition (3.0).

A Rogers

3.50

2,555.00

27 November 2021

Revise and review claw back log (0.5); review and
analyze documents in preparation of production (2.5).

A Zegger

3.00

2,190.00

27 November 2021

Conduct search and document relativity documents re:
Steptoe Johnson deed and restriction search.

C Edmonds

2.00

1,270.00

27 November 2021

Run requested searches (0.4); import documents,
map, run quality check (0.3).

Gleb Chemborisov

0.70

231.00

28 November 2021

Conference with Client, M. Andolina, A. Hammond, S.
Hershey, A. Azer, and E. Martin concerning 30(b)(6)
designations for TDP negotiations.

G Kurtz

0.90

1,652.50

28 November 2021

Conference call re: Rule 30(b)(6) topics with client et
al. (1.1); review and draft deposition outline for Rule
30(b)(6) topics (1.8).

A Hammond

2.90

3,726.50

28 November 2021

Review deposition preparation outline re: debtor
witnesses.

D Kim

0.40

418.00

28 November 2021

Document review for TCC, Hunt and other depositions.

L Quinn

7.40

5,402.00

28 November 2021

Review and redact re: privileged documents (1.0);
conduct document review in preparation of finalizing
claw back log and in preparation of J. Hunt deposition
(2.0).

A Zegger

3.00

2,190.00

28 November 2021

Staging/normalization data for importing (0.4); run
requested searches (0.4); import documents, map, run
quality check (0.3); run Productions (0.4); run
production exports and secure fileshare platform
upload (0.3).

Gleb Chemborisov

1.80

594.00

29 November 2021

Review expert reports (1.2); conference with A.
Hammond concerning 30(b)(6) designations (0.5);
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review emails from the FCR and S. Rudman
concerning meet and confer issues, and responses
(0.3); conference with M. Andolina concerning Devane
preparation for deposition (0.1); participate in standing
call with plan proponents concerning confirmation
hearing (0.5); review documents concerning TDPs
(1.4); outline issues for preparation of B. Griggs (1.3);
begin drafting response to the TCC's content with the
motion requiring a joint submission to AIS clients and
limitations on public comments (1.9).

29 November 2021

Deposition preparation for D. Desai and A. Schuler.

M Andolina

5.00

6,500.00

29 November 2021

Attend meeting with B. Whittman re: preparation for
deposition (3.1); editing and revising expert report of B.
Whittman (4.3); analysis re: discovery disputes (0.5);
calls with S. Hershey and TCC re: meet and confer on
scheduling (0.5); and emails re: same (0.5);
correspondence with  propounding insurers re:
extension (0.4); correspondence with Catholics and
Methodists re: discovery scheduling (0.3); calls with S.
Hershey re: same (0.3).

A Hammond

9.90

12,721.50

29 November 2021

Revise and analyze amended schedules.

K McDonald

3.50

3,465.00

29 November 2021

Prepare for B. Griggs deposition (1.3); call with Bates
White, KCIC, A&M, A. Hammond, B. Gorsich, N.
Dubose re: expert reports (1.0); review draft Bates
White report (1.1); call with R. Gorsich re: deposition
preparation (0.3); call with R. Gorsich and M. Jaoude
re: TCJC deposition (0.2).

C Shepherd

3.90

3,861.00

29 November 2021

Correspond with insurer counsel re: filing of settlement
motions.

B Warner

0.10

97.00

29 November 2021

Call with A. Costello re: Local Council asset review
documents (0.2); call with R. Demoulin re: depositions
(0.2); calls with courier re: A. Schuler documents (0.4);
emails with M. Jaoude, S. Hershey, and W&C team re:
same (0.5); emails with M. Jaoude, S. Hershey, and
team re: J. Hunt deposition documents (1.0); review of
same (2.8); emails with M. Jaoude, S. Hershey, and
W&C team re: Local Council assets review (1.0);
review of documents re: same (1.5); emails with M.
Jaoude, S. Hershey, and W&C team re: B. Whittman
deposition (1.5); review of documents re: same (4.0).

J Thomas

13.10

12,052.00

29 November 2021

Document review for depositions.

L Quinn

3.10

2,263.00

29 November 2021

Document review for discovery (3.0); correspondence
re: Hunt workstreams and membership projections
(0.2).

A Rogers

3.20

2,336.00

29 November 2021

Review privileged documents (0.5); draft claw-back log
(0.3); conduct document review and analysis in
preparation of J. Hunt deposition (2.0); create and
review deposition binder (1.0).

A Zegger

3.80

2,774.00

29 November 2021

Correspond with A. Zegger and W&C team re:
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discovery and Steptoe review assignment (1.3); review
documents produced re: Local Council assets (2.1);
draft memoranda re: restricted Steptoe documents
(1.0).

29 November 2021 Reviewed documents related to J. Hunt in preparation C Davis 1.60 1,016.00
for deposition re: Chapter 11 hearings.

29 November 2021 Conduct search and document relativity documents re: C Edmonds 4.50 2,857.50
Steptoe Johnson deed and restriction search.

29 November 2021 Review and pull documents to consolidated binder for A Ghafarian 1.50 952.50
Hunt deposition.

29 November 2021 Review and respond to email following up on abuse N Swire 0.10 63.50
claim in document production.

29 November 2021 Perform document searches (0.4); process documents K Huang 2.80 924.00
for review (1.0); perform document production (1.0);
review re: quality control and transfer productions
(0.4).

29 November 2021 Review and mitigate error handling of problematic files Gleb Chemborisov 2.30 759.00
(0.8); Staging and normalization data for importing
(0.2); export data into hosting and analytics application
(0.3); status update reports for case team (0.4); run
requested searches (0.2); run productions (0.4).

29 November 2021 Download Ogletree documents and finalize for M Fuhr 0.60 231.00
processing and production.

30 November 2021 Conference with R. Gorsich re: preparation of B. G Kurtz 10.60 18,285.00
Griggs for deposition (0.9); draft outline for preparation
of B. Griggs for deposition (1.4); conference with M.
Andolina re: witness testimony relating to insurance
findings (0.3); conference with J. Lauria re: same (0.3);
conference with A. Azer and E. Martin re: insurance
findings (0.2); conference with R. Gorsich again
concerning Griggs deposition (0.1); conference with S.
Hershey concerning meet and confer with J. Ryan
(0.1); review emails from same re: same (0.1); emails
with S. Hershey re: the TCC's request for meet and
confer (0.2); participate in preparation of B. Griggs for
deposition (5.1); revisions to opposition to expected
motion to require a submission of joint advice to AIS
clients (1.9).

30 November 2021 Preparation for deposition of D. Desai, B. Griggs and M Andolina 5.80 7,540.00
A. Schuler (3.5); follow-up emails with litigation team
re: same (0.7); phone conferences re: same (0.8);
review expert material (0.3); calls (0.3) and emails
(0.2) with expert re: same.

30 November 2021 Review and analyze expert report of B. Whittman (4.0); A Hammond 8.70 11,179.50
calls with Mr. Levy and R. Tiedemann re: same (0.3);
attend meeting with B. Whittman and C. Binggeli re:
same (2.8); review and consider discovery issues
(0.3); emails with S. Hershey re: same (0.3); calls with
S. Hershey re: same (0.3); calls with Potter Anderson

Page 36 of 151



Case 20-10343-LSS Doc 9308-2 Filed 03/12/22 Page 38 of 152
WHITE & CASE

Boy Scouts of America

RE: Project Restructuring OUR REF: 1786703-0002

DATE

DESCRIPTION

TIMEKEEPER

HOURS

usb

re: Rule 30(b)(6) requests (0.7).

30 November 2021

Analyze and cross check new complaints with new
actions in amended schedules.

K McDonald

2.40

2,376.00

30 November 2021

Videoconference (partial) with A. Azer, M. Stoner, T.
Allen for deposition preparation (1.5); videoconference
with E. Martin, A. Azer, R. Gorsich, G. Kurtz, B. Griggs
re: deposition preparation (0.7); e-mails re: document
production with same (0.3); fact research in connection
with B. Griggs deposition (1.0); review TCJC testimony
and exhibits in preparation for B. Griggs deposition
(1.5); review draft Bates White report (1.3).

C Shepherd

6.30

6,237.00

30 November 2021

Attend FCR deposition (6.5); calls with A. Zegger re:
expert documents and deposition binders (0.7); call
with C. Edmonds re: Steptoe asset review (0.1); call
with R. Tiedemann re: Steptoe asset review (0.5); calls
with A&M re: B. Whittman expert report documents
(0.4); emails with M. Brock-Smith and discovery team
re: membership trend documents (0.5); review
documents re: same (0.5); emails with C. Edmonds, A.
Costello and W&C discovery team re: A. Schuler email
searches (0.3); review of documents re: same (0.4);
emails with C. Edmonds, A. Costello, M. Brock-Smith
and W&C discovery team re: Steptoe asset review
(0.5).

J Thomas

10.40

9,568.00

30 November 2021

Analyze and review Steptoe documents re:
confirmation discovery.

A Rogers

7.10

5,183.00

30 November 2021

Call with A. Zegger re: deposition preparation.

H Rubashkin

1.30

949.00

30 November 2021

Conduct document review and analysis in preparation
of J. Hunt deposition (3.0); review and finalize J. Hunt
deposition binder (0.4).

A Zegger

3.40

2,482.00

30 November 2021

Meet with A&M re: next steps in the restricted
document search (1.6); review A&M requested
production (2.2); correspond with team re: same (0.3);
draft memoranda re: A&M research (0.6).

A Costello

4.70

2,984.50

30 November 2021

Meeting with A&M, J. Thomas, and A. Costello re:
Steptoe document search (0.9); conduct search and
document relativity documents re: Steptoe search
(1.0).

C Edmonds

1.90

1,206.50

30 November 2021

Review and update protective order and participating
parties’ tracker.

C Tuffey

0.30

190.50

30 November 2021

Quality control and transfer production (0.4); process
documents for review (0.6).

K Huang

1.00

330.00

30 November 2021

Run requested searches (0.4); set up searches and
review batch sets (0.4); run productions (0.4); review
re: conflicts and search terms requests (0.4).

Gleb Chemborisov

1.60

528.00

30 November 2021

Download, stage, and load JPMorgan's productions
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VOL005 and VOLO0O06 (1.1); finalize set of S. Sorrels
emails to be returned to Evershed and generate
metadata chart (0.6).

SUBTOTAL: Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy Litigation 1,515.90 1,385,910.50

Asset Dispositions

2 November 2021 Telephone call with C. Binggeli re: warehouse and M Linder 0.10 105.00
distribution center sale.

SUBTOTAL: Asset Dispositions 0.10 105.00

Automatic Stay

1 November 2021 Confer with E. Rosenberg re: status of Archdiocese of A Bowron 1.40 1,022.00

New York cases (0.2); review of previous filed
schedules re: federal cases for E. Rosenberg (0.3);
review of status of Archdiocese of New York cases for
E. Rosenberg (0.7); email re: latest schedules to K.
McDonald (0.2).

2 November 2021 Research for motion to lift stay re: Insurer settlement. D Kim 0.50 522.50

2 November 2021 Update Archdiocese of New York complaints chart for A Bowron 0.80 584.00
K. McDonald (0.5); confer with S. Manning re: updating
Schedules to Consent Order (0.1); confer with K.
McDonald re: Archdiocese of New York complaints
(0.2).

3 November 2021 Review pro se objection to motion to modify automatic M Linder 0.30 315.00
stay (0.2); review precedent reply re: same (0.1).

3 November 2021 Review pro se objection to debtors' limited lift stay D Kim 1.60 1,672.00
motion (0.4); draft reply in support of motion (0.3);
confer with L. Baccash re: same (0.2); draft motion to
lift stay re: Insurer sale (0.7).

3 November 2021 Call with K. McDonald re: Archdiocese of New York A Bowron 4.00 2,920.00
complaints (0.4); revise Archdiocese of New York
complaints chart (3.1); confer with K. McDonald re:
Archdiocese of New York complaints (0.5).

4 November 2021 Finalize reply in support of motion to modify stay for D Kim 2.00 2,090.00
local council contributions (0.4); draft declaration in
support of same (0.4); confer with L. Baccash and M.
Linder re: same (0.2); confer with local counsel re:
filing of same (0.1); revise and draft motion to modify
stay re: Insurer settlement (0.7); confer with L.
Baccash re: same (0.2).

4 November 2021 Review research material re: insurance interests and S Ludovici 0.50 507.50
forward to R. Boone.

5 November 2021 Review research and documents re: Insurer settlement D Kim 1.20 1,254.00
(0.6); review status of chartered organization
bankruptcy cases (0.2); revise draft motion for stay
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relief re: Insurer settlement (0.4).

8 November 2021 Confer with K. McDonald and S. Manning re: updating A Bowron 0.50 365.00
Schedules to Consent Order.

9 November 2021 Confer with K. McDonald and E. Rosenberg re: A Bowron 2.50 1,825.00
updating Schedules to Consent Order (0.4); review
and revise Archdiocese of New York charts for K.
McDonald (2.1).

10 November 2021 Review and revise Archdiocese of New York chart with A Bowron 5.40 3,942.00
additional research re: cases (3.2); confer with K.
McDonald, J. Utkus, and D. Hirshorn re: updating
Archdiocese of New York charts (0.5); research cases
for Archdiocese of New York chart (1.5); confer with
Research Services re: same (0.2).

11 November 2021 Confer with R. Gorsich re: automatic stay motion for D Kim 0.40 418.00
Insurer settlement.

11 November 2021 Confer with K. McDonald and research services re: A Bowron 4.40 3,212.00
cases for stayed cases charts (0.7); review and revise
charts of stayed cases for K. McDonald (3.7).

12 November 2021 Call with M. Linder, R. Gorsich, D. Kim re: lift stay L Baccash 0.70 735.00
motions related to settlements.

12 November 2021 Confer with R. Gorsich re: motion to modify stay re: D Kim 2.80 2,926.00
Insurer settlement (0.4); review coverage charts and
related documents (0.9); further research on same
(0.9); further revise motion based on same (0.6).

12 November 2021 Confer with S. Manning and K. McDonald re: amended A Bowron 2.70 1,971.00
schedules (0.3); review and revise chart of
Archdiocese of New York cases (2.4).

15 November 2021 Confer with J. Anderson re: chartered organization D Kim 1.10 1,149.50
bankruptcies (0.2); review research re: same (0.4);
review and analyze impact of same on Insurer
settlement (0.3); confer with R. Gorsich re: same (0.2).

15 November 2021 Confer with E. Rosenberg and K. McDonald re: A Bowron 3.90 2,847.00
inclusion of cases in Amended Schedules (0.5); review
and revise chart of stayed cases for K. McDonald
(3.4).

16 November 2021 Confer with R. Gorsich re: releases re: chartered D Kim 1.00 1,045.00
organization debtors (0.4); telephone call with A. Azer
re: certain insurance-related issues for same (0.2);
revise motion for limited stay relief re: same (0.4).

16 November 2021 Confer with K. McDonald re: updating Schedules to A Bowron 10.40 7,592.00
Consent Order (1.2); review and revise Archdiocese of
New York charts re: new cases received (4.4); revise
amended schedules to reflect Archdiocese of New
York charts (3.6); review charts from opposing counsel
re: new cases (1.2).
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17 November 2021

Confer with K. McDonald re: updating Schedules to
Consent Order (1.2); revise amended schedules to
reflect Archdiocese of New York charts (1.6); review
and revise Amended Schedules (9.3).

A Bowron

12.10

8,833.00

18 November 2021

Review research on chartered organization debtors
and insurance issues for same (0.5); confer with R.
Gorsich re: same (0.2).

D Kim

0.70

731.50

18 November 2021

Review and revise Amended Schedules and include
new cases from relevant charts (7.1); confer with K.
McDonald re: updating Schedules to Consent Order
(1.8); draft notices for the Amended Schedules (2.6).

A Bowron

11.50

8,395.00

19 November 2021

Confer with K. McDonald re: updating Schedules to
Consent Order (0.4); review and revise amended
schedules (6.6).

A Bowron

7.00

5,110.00

20 November 2021

Review and revise amended schedules (6.6); confer
with K. McDonald re: updating Schedules to Consent
Order (0.4).

A Bowron

7.00

5,110.00

22 November 2021

Review status of AOA case included Plan/Disclosure
Statement (0.2); emails to E. Rosenberg and to K.
Ferrier re: same (0.1).

S Ludovici

0.30

304.50

22 November 2021

Confer with E. Rosenberg and K. McDonald re:
updating Schedules to Consent Order (0.7); review
and revise amended schedules (3.2).

A Bowron

3.90

2,847.00

23 November 2021

Confer with K. McDonald re: updating Schedules to
Consent Order (0.4); draft summary of changes to
amended schedules for K. McDonald (1.6).

A Bowron

2.00

1,460.00

24 November 2021

Review email from L. Baccash re: AOA plan (0.1);
email K. Ferrier re: same (0.1).

S Ludovici

0.20

203.00

29 November 2021

Review docket for AOA case (0.1); emails with L.
Baccash, M. Linder and others and with K. Ferrier re:
AOA plan/Disclosure Statement (0.2); read materials
re: AOA issues (0.1).

S Ludovici

0.40

406.00

29 November 2021

Review and revise amended schedules for K.
McDonald (2.6); confer with K. McDonald re: updating
Schedules to Consent Order (0.8).

A Bowron

3.40

2,482.00

SUBTOTAL: Automatic Stay

96.60

74,796.50

Bar Date, Noticing and Claims Reconciliation Issues

1 November 2021

Correspondence with D. Draigh and C. Tuffey re: bar
date appeal issues (0.2); review pleadings related to
bar date appeal (0.5).

L Baccash

0.70

735.00

1 November 2021

Review emails from litigation team re: bar date order
appeal.
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1 November 2021 Review claim objection responses (0.3); email claimant  C Tuffey 0.40 254.00

re: same (0.1).

2 November 2021 Review notice related to claims issue (0.1); call with D. L Baccash 0.60 630.00
Draigh, T. Smith and C. Tuffey re: bar date appeal
(0.3); review and correspond re: bar date appeal
issues (0.2).

2 November 2021 Review and comment on notice re: notice of partial M Linder 0.40 420.00
satisfaction of claim (0.3); email to C. Tuffey re: same
(0.1).

2 November 2021 Call with P. Topper re: various case inquiries (0.1); B Warner 0.30 291.00
correspond with D. Irgi (TCJC) re: case inquiry (0.2).

2 November 2021 Conduct calls with pro se claimants re: ballot questions D Kim 2.30 1,460.50
(1.0); draft and create spreadsheet re: questions
related to the plan and voting (1.3).

2 November 2021 Call with C. Tuffey and D. Kim re: pro se claimant's D Rivero 3.20 2,032.00

factual and solicitation questions (0.2); email
correspondence with Omni re: same (0.3); review plan
documents re: same (0.8); call with numerous pro se
claimants re: factual information (0.9); draft analysis for
L. Baccash, R. Boone, and B. Warner re: same (0.6);
correspond with D. Kim and C. Tuffey re: same (0.2);
draft email to Omni re: same (0.2).

2 November 2021 Review claimant letters filed on docket (0.2); C Tuffey 3.00 1,905.00

summarize same (0.3); confer with Omni re: same
(0.2); emails with D. Kim re: questions re: ballots (0.2);
return claimant calls and Omni inquiries re: same (0.8);
review and revise notice of agreement to reclassify
claim and summarize same (0.2); summarize claimant
response re: claims objection (0.1); summarize
claimant calls received prior to call log (0.4); revise
Omni letter re: return payments (0.1); return claimant
calls re: claim objection responses (0.5).

3 November 2021 Correspondence re: claims issues with C. Tuffey and L Baccash 0.40 420.00
C. Heitzenrater (0.1); review claims tracker and
correspondence with C. Tuffey re: same (0.1); multiple
correspondence with T. Smith re: bar date appeal
appendix (0.2).

3 November 2021 Call with C. Tuffey re: resolution of claim objection B Warner 1.70 1,649.00
responses (0.2); analyze omnibus claim objection
responses and inquiries re: next steps (0.3); review
and comment on omnibus claim objection tracker (0.3);
review search results from Bates White (0.1);
correspond with M. Salzberg (Episcopal Church
counsel) re: chartered organization inquiry (0.2); draft
and revise response to claimant re: resolution of
omnibus claim objection and claim transfer matter
(0.3); review claim objection review spreadsheet (0.1);
draft email to L. Baccash and C. Tuffey re: next steps
on same (0.2).

3 November 2021 Collate and summarize claim objection responses C Tuffey 2.20 1,397.00
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(1.8); correspond re: same (0.2); revise tracker re:
same (0.1); review redacted letter filed on docket and
confer re: same (0.1).

3 November 2021

Emails with W&C team re: agreement to reclassify
claim (0.2); emails with D. Kim and D. Rivero re:
returning pro se claimant calls (0.1); review letter to
plaintiff firm (0.2); diligence re: new claims objections
(2.0); summarize same for B. Warner and L. Baccash
(0.2).

C Tuffey

2.70

1,714.50

4 November 2021

Correspondence with B. Warner and C. Tuffey re:
claims objection (0.2); review of same (0.1); call with
B. Warner re: claims objections (0.1).

L Baccash

0.40

420.00

4 November 2021

Emails with C. Tuffey re: certain claim objections (0.1);
review D&O claim summary (0.2); draft email to Client
re: same (0.2); revise and send same (0.2); emails
with Client re: noticing of state AGs (0.1); emails with
B. Warner re: same (0.1).

M Linder

0.90

945.00

4 November 2021

Review factual background and proposed response re:
claim objection responses (0.1); correspond with L.
Baccash and C. Tuffey re: omnibus claim objection
informal response (0.1); correspond with B. Schindler
re: addition of permitted party for claims review (0.2).

B Warner

0.40

388.00

4 November 2021

Conduct calls with pro se claimants to answer factual
questions.

D Kim

0.30

190.50

4 November 2021

Emails with W&C team and claimant re: claim
objection response (0.5); confer with MNAT re: claim
objections for next omnibus (0.2).

C Tuffey

0.70

444.50

5 November 2021

Call with C. Heitzenrater re: claims objections.

L Baccash

0.10

105.00

5 November 2021

Telephone call with B. Warner re: claim issues (0.1);
emails with Client re: same (0.2); telephone call with
M. Andolina, L. Baccash, B. Warner, Bates White,
Brown Rudnick and M. Atkinson re: abuse claims data
(0.3).

M Linder

0.60

630.00

5 November 2021

Call with M. Atkinson, Brown Rudnick, D. Evans, M.
Murray and W&C team re: abuse claims data requests
(0.4); correspond with L. Baccash and C. Tuffey re:
claim objection stipulation (0.2); review analysis from
Bates White and client re: Episcopal chartered
organizations (0.5); revise document on same (0.5);
call with L. Baccash re: various case matters and claim
objection next steps (0.1).

B Warner

1.70

1,649.00

5 November 2021

Review revised pleading re: agreement to reclassify
claim.

C Tuffey

0.20

127.00

8 November 2021

Correspondence with C. Tuffey re: claims issues.

L Baccash

0.10

105.00

8 November 2021

Incorporate changes to notice re: agreement re: notice
of satisfaction.
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10 November 2021

Call with L. Baccash, D. Rivero, C. Tuffey and D. Kim
re: claimant inquiries.

B Warner

0.20

194.00

10 November 2021

Review claimant letters filed on docket and confer with
Omni re: response to same (0.4); draft certification of
counsel re: claims objections (0.5); diligence re: claim
objections (0.5).

C Tuffey

1.40

889.00

11 November 2021

Correspond with R. Gorsich re: abuse claims matters
(0.2); correspond with C. Tuffey re: third, fourth and
fifth omnibus claim objection proposed orders (0.1).

B Warner

0.30

291.00

12 November 2021

Review and revise certifications of counsel and
certifications of no objection re: claims objections.

C Tuffey

0.60

381.00

15 November 2021

Call with M. Murray, W. Reppert, and B. Warner re:
abuse claims issues.

L Baccash

0.30

315.00

15 November 2021

Analyze late-filed claim motion re: next steps.

B Warner

0.20

194.00

16 November 2021

Draft client response re: voting and claim matters (0.2);
research re: abuse claims data (0.2); draft response
letter to KTBS law re: abuse claims data (1.0); review
chartered organization search results (0.1); draft email
to Episcopal Church counsel on same (0.1).

B Warner

1.60

1,5652.00

17 November 2021

Respond to Episcopal Church counsel emails re:
claims matters (0.2); correspond with L. Baccash re:
Episcopal Church claims inquiries (0.2).

B Warner

0.40

388.00

18 November 2021

Review settlement motion for non-abuse claim (0.3);
correspondence with C. Tuffey and B. Warner re:
same (0.2).

L Baccash

0.50

525.00

18 November 2021

Review and comment on claim objection certification of
counsel and certificate of no objection (0.3); analyze
claim objection precedent re: revisions to same (0.2);
correspond with L. Baccash and C. Tuffey re: open
matters on same (0.2).

B Warner

0.70

679.00

18 November 2021

Review claimant call log re: pro se status (0.3); return
pro se claimant calls (1.4); call with L. Baccash re:
same (0.1); draft email to Omni re: same (0.3); legal
research re: claims objections (1.3); factual research
re: claims objections (1.0).

C Tuffey

4.40

2,794.00

19 November 2021

Diligence re: claims objections (0.5); factual research
on same (1.0); legal research re: claims for claims
objections (0.7).

C Tuffey

2.20

1,397.00

22 November 2021

Call with P. Topper re: docket filings.

B Warner

0.10

97.00

22 November 2021

Diligence re: claims for claims objections (0.3); emails
with A&M re: same (0.2); legal research re: same (1.9);
revise certifications of counsel and certifications of no
objection re: filed claims objections (1.3); call pro se
claimant re: letter response (0.1); research re: motion
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to allow late-filed claim (1.0).
23 November 2021 Call with ASK firm re: late-filed claim matters (0.4); B Warner 0.50 485.00
correspond with C. Tuffey re: claim objection COCs
(0.1).
23 November 2021 Review abuse survivor letter and proof of claim docket  C Tuffey 5.10 3,238.50
(0.3); follow up call with local council re: ballot inquiry
(0.2); return pro se claimants' calls re: same (0.3);
research and summarize findings re: late filed claim
motion (2.3); call with opposing counsel re: same (0.1);
summarize claimant call re: claim objection response
(0.5); revise certification of counsel re: claim objection
(0.2); emails with BSA and Omni re: ballots (0.4); call
with Omni re: same (0.2); summarize same for L.
Baccash and B. Warner (0.2); draft response to BSA
(0.2); emails with W&C team and Omni re: letter filed
on docket (0.2).
24 November 2021 Correspond with C. Tuffey and L. Baccash re: claim B Warner 0.40 388.00
objection and motion issues (0.2); further review and
comment on claim objection certificate of counsel and
certificate of no objection revisions from C. Tuffey
(0.2).
24 November 2021 Legal research re: claims objections. C Tuffey 1.70 1,079.50
30 November 2021 Call with C. Tuffey re: late-filed claim motion and claim B Warner 0.60 582.00
objections.
30 November 2021 Diligence and research re: claims objections (1.3); call C Tuffey 1.80 1,143.00
with B. Warner re: same (0.5).
SUBTOTAL: Bar Date, Noticing and Claims Reconciliation Issues 51.60 37,972.50
Case Administration
2 November 2021 Multiple calls with M. Linder re: case status. L Baccash 0.90 945.00
2 November 2021 Update case calendar. D Hirshorn 0.10 33.00
3 November 2021 Multiple calls with M. Linder re: case status and issues. L Baccash 0.50 525.00
3 November 2021 Organize review database. R Calaycay - De la Cruz 0.40 118.00
5 November 2021 Organize and finalize data for document review. R Calaycay - De la Cruz 1.70 501.50
5 November 2021 Update weekly case calendar. D Hirshorn 0.10 33.00
7 November 2021 Organize and finalize data for document review. R Calaycay - De la Cruz 1.50 442.50
7 November 2021 Create a tracker (1.0); download production volumes E Lay-at 4.10 1,209.50

from the providing party's secure fileshare
platform/shared site and upload to the W&C
processing environment (1.0); escalate issues such as
no login credentials provided, missing password and
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secure fileshare platform name or site (1.5); kick off
data upload to Relativity and provide status to the
project managers (0.6).
8 November 2021 Continue work data upload to Relativity (1.2); fix load E Lay-at 2.70 796.50
files and image produced PDFs (1.4); provide status to
the project managers (0.1).
9 November 2021 Organize and finalize data for document review. R Calaycay - De la Cruz 1.70 501.50
9 November 2021 Attend discussions with the project manager on the E Lay-at 4.00 1,180.00
project (0.6); update a tracker (0.3); continue work
data upload to Relativity (1.6); fix of load files, image
produced PDFs (1.3); provide status to the project
managers (0.2).
10 November 2021 Organize and finalize data for document review. R Calaycay - De la Cruz 1.30 383.50
10 November 2021 Extracting data for a Production data sets (1.1); upload E Lay-at 3.40 1,003.00
productions to Relativity of Project Restructuring (0.6);
modify DATs and create OPT (0.6); provide task status
(0.7); update trackers (0.4).
11 November 2021 Call with R. Gorsich and M. Linder re: status of case L Baccash 0.90 945.00
(0.6); multiple calls with M. Linder re: same (0.3).
11 November 2021 Organize and finalize data for document review. R Calaycay - De la Cruz 1.30 383.50
11 November 2021 Convert produced PDFs to images (0.3); modify load E Lay-at 1.20 354.00
files (0.2); upload productions data to Relativity (0.4);
consistently provide task status to the project
managers/team (0.3).
12 November 2021 Finalize documents for discovery re: confirmation E Lay-at 0.50 147.50
document review.
13 November 2021 Organize and finalize data for document review. R Calaycay - De la Cruz 1.10 324.50
15 November 2021 Finalize documents for discovery re: BSA confirmation. E Lay-at 0.50 147.50
15 November 2021 Update case calendar. D Hirshorn 0.10 33.00
16 November 2021 Finalize documents for BSA confirmation discovery. E Lay-at 0.50 147.50
17 November 2021 Update data tracking and production logs. M Fuhr 0.70 269.50
19 November 2021 Finalize documents for discovery re: Project E Lay-at 2.30 678.50
Restructuring.
20 November 2021 Organize and finalize data for document review. R Calaycay - De la Cruz 1.70 501.50
24 November 2021 Update pleadings file. D Hirshorn 0.10 33.00
29 November 2021 Update pleadings file (0.1); update Datasite D Hirshorn 0.30 99.00

permissions (0.1); review and respond to C. Tuffey re:
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same (0.1).

SUBTOTAL: Case Administration

33.60

11,736.00

Chapter 11 Plan Matters

1 November 2021

Review deposition protocols (0.7); correspondence
with S. Hershey, P. Malhar, and others re: meet and
confer on deposition issues (0.6).

R Gorsich

1.30

1,560.00

1 November 2021

Emails with C. Tuffey re: voting results and
distributions of same (0.2); review and comment on
draft trust agreement and note for DST in collaboration
with L. Baccash (1.7); emails with Client re: chartered
organization issues (0.3).

M Linder

2.20

2,310.00

1 November 2021

Call with A. Hammond re: open discovery issues (0.6);
draft email to M. Andolina re: document production
(0.3); call with M. Jaoude and reviewers re: Quality
control check re: review (0.4); call with B. Whittman
and A. Hammond re: A&M emails (0.6); attend meet
and confer with A. Azer and Insurer (0.5); call with A.
Evans re: Bates White analysis (0.5); call with A. Azer,
A. Hammond and KCIC re: evidence questions (0.6);
call with M. Murray and M. Fuhr re: document
production (0.3); call with M. Jaoude and contract
attorney reviewers re: upcoming review (0.5); call with
W. Clareman and K. Nownes re: Omni data questions
(0.4); prepare for and attend meet and confer with S.
Gurvitz and G. Kurtz re: Zalkin and Pfau (1.1);
correspond with B. Warner and C. Tuffey re: protective
order questions (0.4).

S Hershey

6.20

6,603.00

1 November 2021

Further review and revise portions of confirmation
order (0.2); review research on same (0.5).

D Kim

0.70

731.50

1 November 2021

Review and code documents for responsiveness and
privilege in response to discovery requests served on
Debtors.

T Cull

3.20

3,168.00

1 November 2021

Calls with team re: discovery and document review
(3.3); establish quality check procedures for VOL002
(2.1); quality check review and conflicts check for
VOLO002 (3.7); manage document review and answer
questions from second level reviewers (1.2).

M Jaoude

10.30

9,682.00

1 November 2021

Telephone conference with L. Baccash and R. Boone
re: confirmation brief work stream (0.3); read and
analyze amended disclosure statement reply re:
confirmation related objections (0.4).

T Smith

0.70

658.00

1 November 2021

Prepare materials for production re: Propounding
Insurers' request for production.

S Murray

0.40

368.00

1 November 2021

Calls with R. Tiedemann re: A&M documents (0.2);
calls with M. Jaoude re: document production (0.3);
emails with review team re: document review (0.5);
analysis of documents re: same (2.5); call with M. Fuhr

Page 46 of 151

J Thomas

3.60

3,312.00




Boy Scouts of America
RE: Project Restructuring

Case 20-10343-LSS Doc 9308-2 Filed 03/12/22

Page 48 of 152

WHITE & CASE

OUR REF: 1786703-0002

DATE

DESCRIPTION

TIMEKEEPER

HOURS

usb

re: documents status (0.1).

1 November 2021

Conduct document review re: BSA emails (7.1); review
potentially relevant documents in preparation for
further document review (0.9).

N McGuire

8.00

6,680.00

1 November 2021

Second level review of BSA emails and documents for
privilege and responsiveness.

H Rubashkin

4.60

3,358.00

1 November 2021

Conduct second level issue-coding and privilege
review of BSA emails and discovery documents (3.7);
review BSA Discovery Review Protocol (0.3); conduct
second level issue-coding and privilege review of
further BSA emails and discovery documents (3.8).

N Thompson

7.80

5,694.00

1 November 2021

Review BSA emails re: privileged and hot documents.

ZLu

1.60

1,032.00

1 November 2021

Review documents re: outgoing production as part of
second-level review for responsiveness and privilege.

T Wiheba

9.80

6,321.00

1 November 2021

Review documents for discovery production re: BSA
emails.

M Brock-Smith

3.60

2,286.00

1 November 2021

Conduct second level review document review of BSA
emails for responsiveness to discovery requests (7.6);
internal conference with N. Ash re: responsiveness of
BSA emails under second level review document
review (0.3).

L Curtis

7.90

5,016.50

1 November 2021

Review documents for discovery production re: second
level review BSA emails.

J Ho

1.60

1,016.00

1 November 2021

Review emails of other second level reviewers and
analysis of hot documents (0.6); review Relativity
documents for second level review (1.7).

E Kozakevich

2.30

1,460.50

1 November 2021

Review White & Case LLP email documents for
priviege and responsiveness re: confirmation
discovery requests.

R Phadtare

1.40

889.00

1 November 2021

Review documents re: confirmation discovery
requests.

S Precht

2.50

1,687.50

1 November 2021

Conduct second level review in connection with
discovery request re: BSA emails.

M Radek

2.60

1,651.00

1 November 2021

Review precedent confirmation briefs re: good faith
under the Bankruptcy Code.

D Rivero

0.80

508.00

1 November 2021

Conduct second-level document review of BSA e-mails
re: issue tagging and privilege.

R Rogers de Castilho 2.90

1,841.50

1 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: same.

L Saber

2.10

1,333.50

1 November 2021

Review documents related to pending bankruptcy.
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1 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: internal BSA emails.

1 November 2021

Draft letter re: claimant ballots (1.4); emails with W&C
team re: same (0.2); draft email to client re: voting
results (0.2).

1 November 2021

Conduct first level review of W&C emails for issues of
responsiveness and privilege (2.0); conduct quality
control review of BSA documents for issues of
responsiveness and privilege (2.1).

1 November 2021

E-mail correspondence with S. Hershey, J. Thomas, R.
Mederos, A. Waterfield, M. Jaoude, and P. Topper re:
same (0.2); e-mail correspondence with P. Topper re:
quality control review tasks (0.2); review updated BSA
document review protocol and attached background
materials (0.1); review of e-mail correspondence by
W&C and MNAT review teams for BSA e-mails re:
responsiveness and privilege of particular document
types (1.2); perform quality control review of BSA e-
mails for production (1.6).

1 November 2021

Run multiple sets of searches, prepare document
batches, and provide case team batch summary (0.6);
prepare document images and perform quality control
assurance (0.4); format search term syntaxes, run and
create search term reports, and provide search hit
reports (0.8); create and revise production set
searches and, assist case team conducting quality
control review coding conflict checks and run
production bates stamping (0.8); export produced data,
and post-export cleanup (0.4); manage FTP user
administration (0.3); provide document review support
to attorneys (0.3); confer with W&C team and vendor
re: document review and productions (0.8).

2 November 2021

Review and analyze Plan, Disclosure Statement and
related materials re: pending issues (3.2); correspond
from S. Hershey, G. Kurtz, and others re: deposition
issues (0.3).

2 November 2021

Emails with former chartered organization, R. Boone
and T. Axelrod re: plan issues (0.2); emails with D. Kim
re: rule 2019 statement inquiry from plaintiffs’ firm
(0.1); review and analyze solicitation issue detailed in
Omni and plaintiff's counsel emails (0.2); discuss same
with L. Baccash (0.2); review and analyze reports of
interim voting results (0.3); emails with L. Baccash and
Omni team re: same (0.2); emails with B. Warner re:
solicitation procedures inquiries (0.2); review B.
Whittman comments on DST trust agreement (0.3);
emails with B. Whittman re: same (0.1).

2 November 2021

Call with reviewers re: discovery questions (0.5); call
with A. Azer and A. Hammond re: production privilege
questions (0.5); review letter to insurers (0.3); call with
L. Baccash and K. Nownes re: Omni data (0.5); follow-
up call with B. Warner and L. Baccash re: same (0.3);
call with A. Hammond re: discovery issues (0.4);
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correspond with A. Hong and A. Hammond re:
workflow (0.2).

2 November 2021

Revise and further draft portions of confirmation order
(0.8); revise confirmation tracker for same (0.1); confer
with L. Baccash re: same (0.2).

D Kim

1,149.50

2 November 2021

Review and code documents for responsiveness and
privilege.

T Cull

5.40

5,346.00

2 November 2021

Call with M. Linder re: case strategy and next steps.

B Warner

0.20

194.00

2 November 2021

Quality check and review SLR documents for
production (3.1); calls with team re: discovery and
document production (2.8); review TDP documents for
VOLOO03 production (2.3).

M Jaoude

8.20

7,708.00

2 November 2021

Read and analyze amended reply re: confirmation
objection issues (0.4); draft internal notes re:
confirmation objection issues (0.7); telephone
conference with R. Boone and L. Baccash re: research
on confirmation (0.3).

T Smith

1.40

1,316.00

2 November 2021

Confer with A. Hammond re: progress of collecting
appraisers' materials for Propounding Insurers' request
for production (0.1); draft and circulate emails to
appraisers re: same (0.4).

S Murray

0.50

460.00

2 November 2021

Call with ID team re: document review (0.7); call with
S. Hershey and M. Jaoude re: production next steps
(0.2); emails with review team re: document review
(0.5); analyze documents re: same (1.0); review of
documents for production (1.2).

J Thomas

3.60

3,312.00

2 November 2021

Review correspondence re: document review (0.4);
review and tag documents in view of production (2.4).

R Demoulin

2.80

2,338.00

2 November 2021

Conduct document review re: BSA emails (7.3); review
potentially relevant documents in preparation for
further document review (0.7).

N McGuire

8.00

6,680.00

2 November 2021

Second level review of BSA emails and documents for
responsiveness and privilege.

H Rubashkin

5.70

4,161.00

2 November 2021

Conduct second level issue-coding and privilege
review of BSA emails and discovery documents.

N Thompson

2.80

2,044.00

2 November 2021

Review BSA emails to check for privileged and hot
documents.

ZLu

1.30

838.50

2 November 2021

Review documents re: outgoing production as part of
second-level review for responsiveness and privilege.

T Wiheba

13.80

8,901.00

2 November 2021

Review documents for discovery production re: BSA
emails.
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2 November 2021

Conduct second level review document review of BSA
emails for responsiveness to discovery requests.

L Curtis

5.50

3,492.50

2 November 2021

Review documents for discovery production re: second
level review BSA emails.

J Ho

2.10

1,333.50

2 November 2021

Review emails of other second level reviewers and
analysis of hot documents (0.6); review Relativity
documents for second level review (1.1).

E Kozakevich

1.70

1,079.50

2 November 2021

Review and code documents in support of producing a
privilege log and responding to discovery requests.

R Phadtare

1.20

762.00

2 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request.

S Precht

1.50

952.50

2 November 2021

Conduct second level review in connection with
discovery request re: BSA employee emails.

M Radek

2.30

1,460.50

2 November 2021

Conduct second-level document review of BSA e-mails
re: checking issue tag and privilege.

R Rogers de Castilho

1.40

889.00

2 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: same.

L Saber

2.20

1,397.00

2 November 2021

Review of documents produced.

K Schroeder

698.50

2 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: internal BSA emails.

Z Sporn

2.30

1,460.50

2 November 2021

Emails with S. Hershey and D. Hirshorn re:
participating party status and access.

C Tuffey

0.20

127.00

2 November 2021

Conduct quality control review of BSA documents for
issues of responsiveness and privilege.

R Mederos

2.30

1,299.50

2 November 2021

Conduct quality-control review of BSA e-mails for
production (1.5); e-mail correspondence with P.
Topper re: progress of quality-control review (0.1); e-
mail correspondence with S. Hershey, J. Thomas, R.
Mederos, A. Waterfield, M. Jaoude, and P. Topper re:
same (0.3); e-mail correspondence with W&C and
MNAT review teams for BSA e-mails (1.0).

P Spencer

2.90

1,638.50

2 November 2021

Case team batch summary (0.6); prepare document
images and perform quality control assurance (0.4);
format search term syntaxes, run and create search
term reports, and provide search hit reports (0.8);
create/revise production set searches, assist with case
team conducting quality control check and coding
conflict checks (0.8); manage FTP user administration
(0.3); provide document review support to attorneys
(0.3); calls (partial) with case team and vendor re:
document review and productions (0.4).

T Chen

3.60

1,188.00

3 November 2021

Revise letter to claimant’s attorney re: solicitation.
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3 November 2021 Prepare for and participate in conference call with S. R Gorsich 1.90 2,280.00

Hershey, D. Christian, and many others re: discovery
disputes (0.9); review background materials re:
confirmation issues (1.0).

3 November 2021 Telephone call with L. Baccash (in part); J. Russell, B. M Linder 4.00 4,200.00
Whittman and C. Binggeli re: DST draft (0.9); follow-up
call with B. Whittman re: same (0.4); emails with B.
Warner re: board member ballots (0.2); emails with R.
Boone re: chartered organization plan inquiries (0.2);
review and comment on draft letter to law firm re:
solicitation error (0.1); review pro se correspondence
re: solicitation issues (0.1); plan supplement call with
L. Baccash and B. Warner (0.7); follow-up call with L.
Baccash re: same (0.2); draft certain provisions for
statutory trust agreement (1.0); review plan in
connection with same (0.2).

3 November 2021 Call with G. Kurtz and A. Azer re: discovery issues S Hershey 8.10 8,626.50
(0.6); call with A. Azer and E. Martin re: document
production questions (0.4); correspond with J. Thomas
and M. Jaoude re: production items (0.4); correspond
with A. Hammond re: potential legal issues (0.1); call
with A. Azer and B. Griggs re: production of case
documents (0.4); call with A. Azer and M. Neely re:
discovery issues (0.5); call with A. Azer and E.
Goodman re: evidentiary questions (1.0); call with S.
Stamoulis re: Omni questions (0.4); call with S.
Manning and client re: discovery questions (0.4); call
with G. Kurtz re: deposition protocol (0.2); meet and
confer re: deposition protocol (0.8); call with K. Gluck
re: discovery items (0.2); calls with K. Davis, T. Chen
and D. Marek re: document production files (0.8);
review and revise deposition protocol (0.6); review
documents for production (1.3).

3 November 2021 Review certain legal research on confirmation issues. D Kim 0.50 522.50

3 November 2021 Review and code documents for responsiveness and T Cull 6.80 6,732.00
privilege.

3 November 2021 Call with potential expert to discuss youth safety expert ~ C Shepherd 2.60 2,574.00

work (0.7); review youth safety policies and materials
provided (1.9).

3 November 2021 Call with M. Linder and L. Baccash re: plan B Warner 0.80 776.00
supplement.
3 November 2021 Calls with team re: discovery and document review M Jaoude 10.50 9,870.00

(2.1); call with ID re: document review updates and
new guidance (0.7); create search terms and quality
check batching for ID review (3.3); review quality
check documents and elevate documents for
production (4.4).

3 November 2021 Read and analyze issues and arguments raised in T Smith 1.10 1,034.00
amended disclosure statement reply re: confirmation
(0.6); draft internal notes re: confirmation issues (0.4);
correspond with R. Boone and D. Rivero re:
confirmation research issue (0.1).
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3 November 2021

Confer with appraiser N. Farrar re: materials requested
by Propounding Insurers request for production (0.1);
draft and circulate email to appraiser D. Powell re:
same (0.1); prepare materials for production re: same
(0.2); coordinate with J. Thomas & M. Jaoude re: same
(0.3).

S Murray

0.70

644.00

3 November 2021

Call with M. Jaoude and S. Hershey re: document
production (0.2); calls with M. Jaoude re: document
production (0.3); emails with review team re: document
review (0.5); analyze documents re: same (1.0); review
of documents for production (1.0).

J Thomas

3.00

2,760.00

3 November 2021

Review documents re: upcoming production.

R Demoulin

1.30

1,085.50

3 November 2021

Conduct document review re: BSA emails (5.2); review
potentially relevant documents in preparation for
further document review (1.5).

N McGuire

6.70

5,594.50

3 November 2021

Correspond with N. Swire and J. Thomas re: level of
review availability for relativity batches (0.2); conduct
thorough document review and check batches in and
out in relativity (1.7).

A Rogers

1.90

1,387.00

3 November 2021

Conduct second level issue-coding and privilege
review of BSA emails and discovery documents.

N Thompson

1.50

1,095.00

3 November 2021

Review documents re: outgoing production as part of
second-level review for responsiveness and privilege.

T Wiheba

14.10

9,094.50

3 November 2021

Review documents for discovery production re: BSA
emails.

M Brock-Smith

2.90

1,841.50

3 November 2021

Conduct second level review document review of BSA
emails for responsiveness to discovery requests.

L Curtis

0.40

254.00

3 November 2021

Review documents for discovery production re: second
level review BSA emails.

J Ho

2.40

1,5624.00

3 November 2021

Review plan provisions re: executory contracts and
unexpired leases and compare to analogous
provisions in Hertz (0.8); conduct calls with pro se
claimants to answer factual questions (0.8).

D Kim

1.60

1,016.00

3 November 2021

Review emails of other second level reviewers and
analyze hot documents sent in thread.

E Kozakevich

1.00

635.00

3 November 2021

Review and code documents in support of producing a
privilege log and responding to discovery requests
(2.4); review and code documents on Relativity in
support of producing a privilege log and responding to
discovery requests (0.6).

R Phadtare

3.00

1,905.00

3 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request.

S Precht

1.00

635.00

3 November 2021

Conduct second level review in connection with
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discovery request re: BSA emails.

3 November 2021 Emails with Omni re: pro se claimants' factual D Rivero 3.60 2,286.00

questions re: the plan (0.2); calls with numerous pro se
claimants re: solicitation and factual plan questions
(1.4); draft analysis for L. Baccash, R. Boone, and B.
Warner re: same (0.3); correspond with D. Kim and C.
Tuffey re: same (0.2); call with R. Boone re:
exculpation provisions (0.4); review recently filed
objection to plan (0.3); draft analysis and summary for
L. Baccash and W&C team re: same (0.8).

3 November 2021 Conduct second-level document review of BSA e-mails R Rogers de Castilho 2.40 1,524.00
(checking for correct issue tagging and privilege).

3 November 2021 Review documents in connection with discovery L Saber 1.00 635.00
request re: same.

3 November 2021 Review documents related to bankruptcy proceedings. K Schroeder 1.80 1,143.00

3 November 2021 Review documents in connection with discovery Z Sporn 4.00 2,540.00
request re: internal BSA emails.

3 November 2021 Emails with D. Hirshorn and participating parties re: C Tuffey 0.70 444.50
confirmation document production (0.2); emails with M.
Linder and Coalition re: preliminary plan voting results
(0.2); emails with D. Hirshorn re: data site documents
and review results of search (0.2); confer with
participating party re: same (0.1).

3 November 2021 Conduct quality control review of BSA documents for R Mederos 2.60 1,469.00
issues of responsiveness and privilege (1.5); conduct
first level review of W&C emails re: privilege (1.1).

3 November 2021 Conduct quality-control review of BSA e-mails for P Spencer 2.20 1,243.00

production (1.2); e-mail correspondence with P.
Topper re: quality-control review of BSA e-mails (0.1);
e-mail correspondence with M. Jaoude, A. Waterfield,
R. Mederos, P. Topper, and J. Thomas re: completion
of BSA e-mail quality-control review tasks (0.3); e-mail
correspondence with W&C and MNAT review teams
for BSA e-mails (0.6).

3 November 2021 Run multiple sets of searches, prepare document T Chen 3.10 1,023.00
batches, and provide case team batch summary (0.6);
prepare document images and perform quality control
assurance (0.4); format search term syntaxes, run and
create and run search term reports, and provide
search hit reports (0.8); create and revise production
set searches, a team conducting quality control review
and coding conflict checks (0.6); provide document
review support to attorneys (0.3); confer (partial) with
W&C team and calls with team and vendor re:
document review and productions (0.4).

4 November 2021 Correspondence with M. Andolina, A. Azer, and S. R Gorsich 3.20 3,840.00
Hershey re: production issues (0.4); review revised
deposition protocol and background materials (2.8).
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4 November 2021

Review and comment on plan supplement tracking
document (0.3); email to Client re: same (0.1); email to
Coalition and FCR re: plan supplement documents
(0.2); emails with P. Anker re: settlement agreement
and related issues (0.2).

M Linder

0.80

840.00

4 November 2021

Call with R. Tiedemann re: deposition notices (0.2);
review depositions notices (0.3); call with A. Hammond
re: discovery questions (0.3); review A&M
presentations for redactions (1.4); correspond with A.
Hammond re: same (0.2); correspond with M. Jaoude
and J. Thomas re: discovery questions (0.5); review
documents for production (1.4); call with A. Azer and
E. Martin re: discovery issues (0.5); call with G. Kurtz
and A. Azer re: discovery open issues (0.2); call with
A. Azer and A. Hammond re: deposition questions
(1.0); review and revise deposition protocols (0.5);
draft insert re: redaction issues (1.1); calls with D.
Evans and M. Murray re: document collection (0.3).

S Hershey

7.90

8,413.50

4 November 2021

Review and code documents for responsiveness and
privilege.

T Cull

4.80

4,752.00

4 November 2021

Call with C. Binggeli re: JLL fee application and
reporting matters and plan supplement (0.4); revise
plan supplement tracker re: comments and updates
from M. Linder and L. Baccash (1.7); correspond with
M. Wasson re: plan supplement (0.1); revise and
distribute plan supplement tracker to various parties in
interest (0.7).

B Warner

2.90

2,813.00

4 November 2021

Quality control check re: production (4.1); draw up
production schedule and assignments (2.3); revise
quality control check re: searches (0.7); quality control
check re: documents for privilege (3.0).

M Jaoude

10.10

9,494.00

4 November 2021

Review and analyze confirmation issues and draft
internal notes.

T Smith

0.50

470.00

4 November 2021

Prepare restricted asset documents for production,
including redactions (0.5); coordinate with S. Hershey
re: motion to quash (0.2); draft motion to quash to
quash Bates White 30(b)(6) (1.7).

S Murray

2.40

2,208.00

4 November 2021

Call with T. Chen, M. Fuhr, and M. Jaoude re:
document production (0.3); call with ID Team re:
review questions (0.2); call with M. Fuhr re: bates
whites documents (0.2); calls with P. Topper re:
document review and production (0.4); calls with M.
Jaoude re: document review and production (0.8);
emails with review team re: document review (0.5);
analyze documents re: same (2.0); review of
documents for production (2.0); emails with lit support
re: document production (1.0); emails with ID team re:
document review (0.6).

J Thomas

8.00

7,360.00

4 November 2021

Review documents re: Trust Distribution Procedures.

R Demoulin

3.90

3,256.50

4 November 2021

Conduct first level review of emails re: privilege (5.5);
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review potentially relevant documents in preparation
for further document review (1.5).

4 November 2021

Second level review of BSA emails and documents for
responsiveness and privilege.

H Rubashkin

0.30

219.00

4 November 2021

Review BSA emails to check for privileged and hot
documents.

ZLu

1.40

903.00

4 November 2021

Review documents re: outgoing production as part of
second-level review for responsiveness and privilege.

T Wiheba

14.40

9,288.00

4 November 2021

Review documents for discovery production re: second
level review BSA emails.

J Ho

2.00

1,270.00

4 November 2021

Confirmation research re: claim classification (2.3);
attend and consolidate notes on TCC town hall (3.8).

D Kim

6.10

3,873.50

4 November 2021

Conduct First Level Privilege Review (0.9); review
emails of other second level reviewers and analyze hot
documents sent in thread (1.0).

E Kozakevich

1.90

1,206.50

4 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request.

S Precht

2.00

1,270.00

4 November 2021

Conduct 1LR privilege review in connection with
discovery request re: W&C emails.

M Radek

2.60

1,651.00

4 November 2021

Legal research for R. Boone re: exculpation in chapter
11 cases (2.9); draft analysis in part for R. Boone re:
same (1.1); emails with L. Baccash, D. Kim, C. Tuffey,
and L. Mezei re: TDPs in precedent cases (0.2); legal
research re: same (2.3); draft analysis for L. Baccash
re: same (2.8).

D Rivero

9.30

5,905.50

4 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: same.

L Saber

3.10

1,968.50

4 November 2021

Conduct first-level review of W&C emails re: privilege
(1.1); conduct second-level review of BSA documents
(1.3).

S Saboungi

2.40

1,5624.00

4 November 2021

Review coding for documents produced.

K Schroeder

0.90

571.50

4 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: internal BSA emails.

Z Sporn

3.40

2,159.00

4 November 2021

Revise participating parties' protective  order
acknowledgment tracker (0.5); confer with B. Warner
re: party status (0.1); summarize same (0.4); draft
email to participating party re: same (0.3).

C Tuffey

1.30

825.50

4 November 2021

Conduct quality control review of BSA documents for
issues of responsiveness and privilege (1.0); conduct
first level review of W&C emails re: privilege (1.5).
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4 November 2021

Review e-mail correspondence with W& C & MNAT
review teams for BSA e-mails (0.9); correspondence
with M. Jaoude, P. Topper, A. Waterfield, and R.
Mederos re: quality-control review (0.2); review
background materials in preparation for quality control
review (0.6).

4 November 2021

Run multiple sets of searches, prepare document
batches, and provide case team batch summary (0.6);
format search term syntaxes, run and create search
term reports, and provide search hit reports (0.8);
create and revise production set searches, assist case
team conducting quality control check re: and coding
conflict checks (0.8); manage FTP user access (0.3);
provide document review support to attorneys (0.3);
calls (partial) with case team and vendor re: document
review and productions (0.4); organize saved search
and data review folders (0.4); coordinate with Ogletree
and provide them production format details (0.3);
modify review coding panel and batch reviews (0.4).

5 November 2021

Conference with S. Hershey, L. Baccash, and others
re: pending discovery issues and action items (0.4);
review materials (1.5); correspondence with S.
Hershey, J. Yan, and others re: depositions (0.3);
review deposition notices and issues (1.0).

5 November 2021

Research re: scope of privilege in connection with
settlement documents.

5 November 2021

Telephone call with L. Baccash re: TDP releases (0.3);
review and comment on same in collaboration with L.
Baccash (2.1); videoconference with M. Andolina, J.
Bjork, and A. Goldberg re: settlement matters (0.5);
review and respond to plan question from Church
Insurance Co. (0.2); emails with W&C team re: same
(0.1).

5 November 2021

Call with G. Kurtz, M. Andolina and A. Azer re:
evidentiary questions (0.9); correspond with G. Kurtz
re: same (0.1); correspond with M. Jaoude and J.
Thomas re: document production (0.7); participate in
witness preparation of B. Griggs (1.4); call with S.
Cocchiaro and W. Clareman re: proofs of claim
request (0.5); call with S. Golden and G. Kurtz re:
deposition questions (0.5); correspond with M. Jaoude
and J. Thomas re: document production (0.6); draft
email to team re: open items for discovery (1.2).

5 November 2021

Further draft portions of confirmation order (0.4); revise
tracker for same (0.2).

5 November 2021

Review and code documents for responsiveness and
privilege.

5 November 2021

Quality control check re: Document Productions (5.5);
organize and produce documents (2.6); quality control
check re: privilege documents (0.4); calls with team re:
document production (2.0); batch out documents for
review by team for production (1.0).
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P Spencer 1.70 960.50
T Chen 4.30 1,419.00
R Gorsich 2.20 2,640.00
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M Linder 3.20 3,360.00
S Hershey 5.90 6,283.50
D Kim 0.60 627.00
T Cull 2.60 2,574.00
M Jaoude 11.50 10,810.00
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5 November 2021

Draft motion to quash.

S Murray

2.60

2,392.00

5 November 2021

Calls with M. Jaoude re: document production (0.7);
call with ID team re: document review next steps (0.2);
call with Bates White re: their email review (0.2); call
with M. Fuhr re: Bates Whites documents (0.1); emails
with review teams re: document review (0.5); analysis
documents re: same (2.0); review of documents for
production (2.0); emails with lit support re: document
production and reviews (0.9); calls with T. Chen re:
document production (0.9); call with P. Topper re:
W&C email review guidelines (0.1).

J Thomas

7.60

6,992.00

5 November 2021

Review documents and edit coding (1.0); apply coding
to Trust Distribution Procedures documents (0.7).

R Demoulin

1.70

1,419.50

5 November 2021

Conduct first level review of emails re: privilege (7.1);
review potentially relevant documents in preparation
for further document review (0.8).

N McGuire

7.90

6,596.50

5 November 2021

Research re: TDP.

L Mezei

2.30

1,679.00

5 November 2021

Review documents re: outgoing production as part of
second-level review for responsiveness and privilege.

T Wiheba

12.20

7,869.00

5 November 2021

Review documents for discovery production re: BSA
emails (1.8); review documents in connection with
discovery request re: agreements with local councils
(0.8).

M Brock-Smith

2.60

1,651.00

5 November 2021

Review documents for discovery production re: second
level review BSA emails.

J Ho

1.90

1,206.50

5 November 2021

Legal research re: releases in precedent mass tort
cases.

D Kim

2.00

1,270.00

5 November 2021

Review emails of other second level reviewers and
looked over hot documents sent in thread (1.2);
conduct First Level Privilege Review (0.9).

E Kozakevich

2.10

1,333.50

5 November 2021

Conduct second level review in connection with
discovery request re: BSA employee emails.

M Radek

3.30

2,095.50

5 November 2021

Legal research re: exculpation clauses based on R.
Boone feedback (1.9); correspond with R. Boone re:
same (0.2); draft analysis (in part) re: same (1.4).

D Rivero

3.50

2,222.50

5 November 2021

Review BSA charter documents in preparation for
production.

R Rogers de Castilho

2.20

1,397.00

5 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: agreements with Local Councils.

L Saber

3.90

2,476.50

5 November 2021

Conduct second-level review of BSA emails.

S Saboungi

1.20

762.00

5 November 2021

Review of documents produced related to pending
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bankruptcy.

5 November 2021 Review documents in connection with discovery  Z Sporn 4.20 2,667.00

request re: internal BSA emails (1.3); review
documents in connection with discovery request re:
agreements with local councils (2.9).

5 November 2021 Legal research re: release provisions in trust C Tuffey 2.80 1,778.00
distribution procedures (2.1); review and distribute
preliminary voting reports (0.5); revise and distribute
same (0.2).

5 November 2021 Review e-mail correspondence with W&C and MNAT P Spencer 3.30 1,864.50
review teams for BSA e-mails (1.1); correspondence
with M. Jaoude, P. Topper, A. Waterfield, and R.
Mederos re: quality control review of BSA e-mails
(0.4); perform quality-control review of BSA e-mails
(1.8).

5 November 2021 Run multiple sets of searches, prepare document T Chen 4.50 1,485.00
batches, and provide case team batch summary (0.6);
format search term syntaxes, run and create search
term reports, and provide search hit reports (0.7);
create and revise multiple sets of production searches,
assist case team conducting quality control check and
coding conflict checks (0.6); manage FTP user access
(0.3); provide document review support to attorneys
(0.3); calls (partial) with case team and vendor re:
document review and productions (0.7); perform
document deduplication checks (0.3); manage user
accounts (0.3); format syntax and create persistent
highlighting set (0.4); prepare and provide case team
production log summary (0.3).

6 November 2021 Research re: scope of privilege in connection with J Green 3.30 3,696.00
settlement documents.

6 November 2021 Call with A. Azer and A. Hammond re: expert report S Hershey 2.30 2,449.50
(1.0); call with A. Azer and G. Kurtz re: work division
(0.3); call with S. Levy re: discovery (0.2); call with M.
Jaoude and J. Thomas re: discovery issues (0.8).

6 November 2021 Review and code documents for responsiveness and T Cull 0.70 693.00
privilege.
6 November 2021 Calls with team re: document review (1.2); create M Jaoude 3.20 3,008.00

Quality control check re: work streams and Quality
control check re: documents (2.0).

6 November 2021 Call with S. Hershey re: next steps re: responses and S Levy 1.50 1,410.00
objections (0.3); email correspondence with S.
Hershey and S. Murray re: same (0.2); review
documents circulated by S. Hershey (1.0).

6 November 2021 Calls with M. Jaoude re: document review and J Thomas 5.40 4,968.00
production (0.6); call with review team re: W&C
internal email review (0.3); call with W&C team re:
document reviews (0.5); review privilege review
guidelines (0.2); emails with review teams re:
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document review (0.5); review of documents for
production (2.0); emails with lit support re: document
production and reviews (1.0); call with H&B and W&C
re: document review (0.3).

6 November 2021

Conduct first level review of emails re: privilege.

N McGuire

2.20

1,837.00

6 November 2021

Review privilege protocol (0.2); review W&C emails for
privileged and hot documents (0.3).

ZLu

0.50

322.50

6 November 2021

Review documents re: outgoing production as part of
second-level review for privilege.

T Wiheba

8.20

5,289.00

6 November 2021

Review documents for discovery production re: White
& Case emails.

M Brock-Smith

1.70

1,079.50

6 November 2021

Review documents for discovery production re: W&C
emails.

J Ho

1.00

635.00

6 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request.

S Precht

1.90

1,206.50

6 November 2021

Conduct 1LR privilege review in connection with
discovery request re: W&C emails.

M Radek

2.70

1,714.50

6 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: second level review BSA emails.

L Saber

0.70

444.50

6 November 2021

Conduct second-level review of BSA emails.

S Saboungi

1.50

952.50

6 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: White & Case privilege review.

Z Sporn

2.10

1,333.50

6 November 2021

Conduct first level review of W&C emails re: privilege.

R Mederos

0.40

226.00

6 November 2021

Perform quality-control review of BSA e-mails (1.0); e-
mail correspondence with M. Jaoude, P. Topper, J.
Thomas, R. Mederos, and A. Waterfield re: quality-
control review of BSA e-mails (0.1); e-mail
correspondence with M. Jaoude, S. Hershey, J.
Thomas, and P. Topper re: W&C e-mail review (0.1);
e-mail correspondence with W&C and MNAT review
team for W&C e-mails (0.4).

P Spencer

1.60

904.00

6 November 2021

Run multiple sets of searches, prepare document
batches, and provide case team batch summary (0.6);
format search term syntaxes, run and create search
term reports, and provide search hit reports (0.8); calls
(partial) with case team and vendor re: document
review and productions (0.4); modify review coding
panel and batch views (0.3); data intake and staging
(0.5); provide document review support to attorneys
(0.3); create production searches, run coding conflict
checks, create production set, run production (0.6);
data transfer and upload to FTP (0.3); conduct quality
control check re: newly loaded documents and release
to case team for review/production (0.5).
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7 November 2021

Research and review of case law re: scope of privilege
in connection with settlement documents.

J Green

3.60

4,032.00

7 November 2021

Call with A. Azer and G. Kurtz re: plan discovery (0.4);
call with P. Topper, D. Abbott and L. Baccash re:
potential discovery issue (0.5); review and revise
redactions to privileged documents (0.8); draft
discovery on TCC (0.9); review TCC responses for
Debtors' responses and objections (0.4).

S Hershey

3.00

3,195.00

7 November 2021

Review and code documents for responsiveness and
privilege.

T Cull

3.80

3,762.00

7 November 2021

Quality control check re: production volumes.

M Jaoude

1.80

1,692.00

7 November 2021

Emails with S. Hershey and S. Murray re: 30(b)(6)
notices and background materials (0.1); review
30(b)(6) notices (0.1).

S Levy

0.20

188.00

7 November 2021

Emails with review team re: document review
questions (0.3); analysis documents re: same (1.0);
review of documents for production (2.0); emails with
lit support re: document production (0.2).

J Thomas

3.50

3,220.00

7 November 2021

Conduct first level review of emails re: privilege.

N McGuire

2.00

1,670.00

7 November 2021

Review documents re: outgoing production as part of
second-level review for privilege.

T Wiheba

7.10

4,579.50

7 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: White & Case emails.

M Brock-Smith

2.20

1,397.00

7 November 2021

Read through and review 1LR document review
protocol for document review of emails for
responsiveness.

L Curtis

0.60

381.00

7 November 2021

Review documents for privilege log re: W&C emails.

J Ho

3.60

2,286.00

7 November 2021

Conduct First Level Privilege Review (1.8); review
emails sent in First Level Privilege Review thread
(1.2); watch recording of Privilege Review call (0.4).

E Kozakevich

3.40

2,159.00

7 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request.

S Precht

2.40

1,524.00

7 November 2021

Conduct 1LR privilege review in connection with
discovery request re: W&C emails.

M Radek

1.80

1,143.00

7 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: second level review BSA emails (1.0);
review documents in connection with discovery
request re: privilege review (2.6).

L Saber

3.60

2,286.00

7 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: White & Case privilege review.
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7 November 2021

Coordinate and provide instructions for team members
to import received productions into review platform
(0.7); conduct quality control check re: newly loaded
received productions and release to case team for
review (0.4); manage reviewer account access (0.5);
manage production data export, technical issue
trouble-shoot, and post-export clean-up (0.4); data
intake and staging (0.5); conduct quality control check
re: newly loaded documents and release to case team
for review/production (0.5); calls (partial) with case
team and vendor re: document review and productions
(0.4); modify review coding panel and batch views
(0.4); provide document review and production
weekend support (0.7).

8 November 2021

Conference call with S. Hershey, G. Kurtz, M.
Andolina, and others re: deposition notices (0.7);
conference call with G. Kurtz, A. Hammond, and Bates
White re: expert report (1.2); review deposition notices,
discovery materials and related plan documents (3.6);
multiple correspondence with M. Jaoude, S. Hershey,
and others re: discovery issues and document review
(1.1); review materials related to expert reports (0.7).

8 November 2021

Research and review of case law re: trust distribution
procedures.

8 November 2021

Correspond with M. Andolina re: discovery (0.3);
correspond with G. Kurtz and J. Lauria re: TCC
discovery (0.4); attend meet and confer with D.
Shamah and A, Azer (0.2); draft interrogatories to TCC
(0.4); correspond with M. Andolina, P. Anker and E.
Goodman re: discovery (0.6); call with M. Andolina and
G. Kurtz re: deposition notices (0.5); call with M.
Andolina and D. Neppl re: Sidley discovery (0.3); calls
with T. Kelly and J. Thomas re: document review (0.9);
correspond with J. Thomas and M. Jaoude re:
document production (0.8); call with S. Golden and A.
Hammond re: scheduling depositions (0.9); call with M.
Murray and D. Evans re: expert report (1.0); call with
A. Hammond and G. Kurtz re: discovery issues (0.5);
call with B. Dozier re: depositions (0.3).

8 November 2021

Review further research re: confirmation order (1.2);
further draft portions of same (0.4).

8 November 2021

Review and code documents for responsiveness and
privilege.

8 November 2021

Quality control check re: production (2.1); calls with
team re: discovery (1.9); produce documents for Plan
volumes (1.2).

8 November 2021

Emails with S. Hershey and S. Murray and other W&C
team members re: document review and production,
30(b)(6) notices, and next steps (0.3); confer with team
re: offensive depositions (0.5); emails with S. Hershey
and S. Murray re: motion to quash (0.2); review drafted
motion to quash circulated by S. Murray (1.0).
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J Green 4.20 4,704.00
S Hershey 7.10 7,561.50
D Kim 1.60 1,672.00
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8 November 2021

Telephone conference with R. Boone, R. Rogan, and
C. Tuffey re: research on channeling injunction and
third-party releases (0.2); telephone conference with
R. Boone re: confirmation brief (0.1); review
channeling injunction and third-party release research
(0.3); correspond with R. Boone and D. Hirshorn re:
confirmation brief (0.2).

T Smith

0.80

752.00

8 November 2021

Confer with practice technology support team re:
uploading appraisers relied upon materials to Relativity
to production with respect to Propounding Insurers
requests for production (0.3); coordinate with J.
Thomas re: production of appraisers relied upon
materials (0.1); coordinate with A. Hammond re: same
(0.1); legal research re: motion to quash Bates White
30(b)(6)  deposition notice  (1.9);  extensive
correspondence with appraiser for Northern Tier
Ontario re: production of materials responsive to
Propounding Insurers RFP (0.9); finalize draft of
motion to quash and circulated to S. Hershey and S.
Levy (1.2).

S Murray

4.50

4,140.00

8 November 2021

Call with A. Waterfield and R. Mederos re: document
review (0.2); calls with T. Chen re: document
production and document reviews (0.6); calls with M.
Jaoude re: document review and production (0.5); calls
with ID team re: privilege review (1.0); call with W&C
team re: review of emails (0.3); emails with team re:
W&C email document review (0.5); analysis of
documents re: same (2.0); emails with team re: BSA
email review (1.0); analysis of documents re: questions
re: same (2.0); emails with litigation support re:
document reviews and production (0.5).

J Thomas

8.60

7,912.00

8 November 2021

Review and tag documents for production.

R Demoulin

0.30

250.50

8 November 2021

Conduct first level review of emails re: privilege (7.5);
review potentially relevant documents in preparation
for further document review (0.7).

N McGuire

8.20

6,847.00

8 November 2021

First level review of White & Case emails for
responsiveness and privilege.

H Rubashkin

5.90

4,307.00

8 November 2021

Review documents re: outgoing production as part of
second-level review for privilege.

T Wiheba

12.80

8,256.00

8 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: White & Case emails.

M Brock-Smith

3.70

2,349.50

8 November 2021

Conduct 1LR document review of emails for
responsiveness to discovery requests (6.4); internal
conference with R. Phadtare re: same (0.5); internal
conference with R. Phadtare re: same (0.2).

L Curtis

7.10

4,508.50

8 November 2021

Review documents for privilege log re: W&C emails.

J Ho

2.50

1,687.50

8 November 2021

Conduct First level privilege review.
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8 November 2021 Phone call with L. Curtis re: document review strategy R Phadtare 1.00 635.00

and questions (0.6); review and analyze documents in
support of producing privilege log and preparing for
upcoming hearing in January 2022 (0.4).

8 November 2021 Conduct 1LR privilege review in connection with M Radek 2.50 1,587.50
discovery request re: W&C emails.

8 November 2021 Conduct first-level document review of W&C e-mails. R Rogers de Castilho 2.70 1,714.50

8 November 2021 Review documents in connection with discovery L Saber 4.90 3,111.50
request re: privilege review.

8 November 2021 Conduct first-level review of W&C emails re: privilege. S Saboungi 3.40 2,159.00

8 November 2021 Review documents in connection with discovery  Z Sporn 4.20 2,667.00
request re: White & Case privilege review.

8 November 2021 Conduct quality control review of BSA documents for R Mederos 4.50 2,542.50
issues of responsiveness and privilege (2.0); conduct
first level review of W&C emails re: privilege (2.5).

8 November 2021 Telephone call with J. Thomas, R. Mederos, and A. P Spencer 2.80 1,582.00
Waterfield re: performing quality-control review of BSA
e-mails (0.3); perform BSA e-mail review (0.4); e-mail
correspondence with J. Thomas, A. Waterfield, and R.
Mederos re: performing quality-control review of BSA
e-mails (0.2); e-mail correspondence with J. Thomas,
I. Popa, A. Waterfield, and R. Mederos re: performing
quality-control review of BSA e-mails (0.2); e-mail
correspondence with J. Thomas, |. Popa, A.
Waterfield, R. Mederos, S. Hershey, and M. Jaoude re:
quality-control review of BSA e-mails (0.4); e-mail
correspondence with P. Topper, J. Thomas, A.
Waterfield, and R. Mederos re: performing quality-
control review of BSA e-mails (0.1); perform quality-
control review of BSA e-mails (1.2).

8 November 2021 Manage data intake and staging (0.5); conduct quality =~ T Chen 10.90 3,597.00
control check re: newly loaded received productions
and release to case team for review (0.4); calls
(partial) with case team and vendor re: document
review and productions (0.4); modify review coding
panel and batch views (0.4); run multiple sets of
searches, prepare document batches, and provide
case team batch summary (0.6); format search term
syntaxes, run and create search term reports, and
provide search hit reports (0.7); provide document
review support to attorneys (0.5); create production
searches, run coding conflict checks, create production
set, run production (5.0); production data export, and
post-export clean-up (0.4); Manage FTP user access
(0.5); provide outside counsel with production
download (0.5); conduct quality control check re: newly
loaded documents and release to case team for
review/production (0.5); reviewer account
management (0.5).

9 November 2021 Attend meet and confer discovery call with multiple R Gorsich 3.30 3,960.00
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parties (0.3); conference call with A. Azer, G. Kurtz,
others re: deposition scheduling and preparation
issues (0.6); review background materials re: same
(1.5); correspond with J. Hallwell, multiple parties re:
discovery disputes (0.3); review document production
materials (0.6).

9 November 2021 Research and review of case law re: trust distribution  J Green 5.10 5,712.00
procedures (2.9); research and review of case law re:
duties to creditors (2.2).

9 November 2021 Call with M. Stoner and A. Azer re: TCC discovery S Hershey 7.40 7,881.00
(0.3); correspond with A. Hammond and R. Tiedemann
re: same (0.2); correspond with M. Linder and L.
Baccash re: potential discovery (0.3); review motion re:
same (0.3); call with M. Jaoude and J. Thomas re:
discovery (0.3); call with A. Hong and S. Levy re:
responses and objections to deposition notices (0.3);
call with G. Kurtz and A. Hammond re: witnesses and
deposition planning (0.6); review list of potential
witnesses by topic (0.3); correspond with M. Jaoude
re: production question (0.3); call with W. Claremon
and L. Baccash re: POC files (0.5); call with M. Pagay
and G. Kurtz re: deposition protocol (0.5); review and
revise list of witnesses for deposition (0.8); review
productions in response to email from Propounding
Insurers (0.7); review and revise deposition protocol
(1.3); review deposition tracker and notices (0.7).

9 November 2021 Further draft and revise confirmation order. D Kim 1.40 1,463.00

9 November 2021 Review and code documents for responsiveness and T Cull 7.70 7,623.00
privilege.

9 November 2021 Quality control check re: production (1.2); review Trust M Jaoude 6.10 5,734.00

Distribution Procedures documents to withhold for
privilege (2.0); draft privilege log categories (0.9);
prepare conflict code production (2.0).

9 November 2021 Call with A. Hammond re: strategy and next steps S Levy 4.30 4,042.00

(0.5); call with A. Hammond, C. Binggeli, and B.
Whittman re: order of proof (0.6); confer with S.
Hershey and A. Hong re: deposition preparation (0.5);
draft, edit, and revise motion to quash (1.0); call with
S. Murray re: same (0.2); review and follow up re:
responses and objections to Rule 30(b)(6) notices
(1.5).

9 November 2021 Confer with S. Levy re: Bates White 30(b)(6) S Murray 1.50 1,380.00
deposition motion to quash revisions (0.2); legal
research re: same (1.3).

9 November 2021 Call with W&C team re: BSA email review (0.3); calls  J Thomas 6.80 6,256.00
with ID team re: document review (0.6); calls with M.
Jaoude re: reviews and productions (0.3); calls with T.
Chen re: productions and review (0.6); call with M.
Fuhr re: relativity document upload (0.2); call with M.
Jaoude and S. Hershey re: productions and reviews
(0.2); review documents for production (2.0); emails
with document review teams re: questions (1.0);
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review of documents re: review team questions (1.0);
emails with litigation support re: document reviews and
production (0.6).

9 November 2021

Review and tag documents for production and
inclusion in the privilege log.

R Demoulin

2.20

1,837.00

9 November 2021

Review emails re: privilege (7.6); review potentially
relevant documents in preparation for further
document review (0.9).

N McGuire

8.50

7,097.50

9 November 2021

Research re: channeling injunction rider (0.9); discuss
with C. Tuffey and R. Rogan re: same (0.2).

L Mezei

803.00

9 November 2021

First level review of White & Case emails for
responsiveness and privilege.

H Rubashkin

9.00

6,570.00

9 November 2021

Conduct first-level privilege and issue-coding review of
White & Case and other counsel emails, and
associated discovery documents (7.5); review and
mark-up privilege protocol, confidentiality agreement
tracker, and mediation attendance lists for use in same
(0.4).

N Thompson

7.90

5,767.00

9 November 2021

Review W&C emails to code for privilege and issue, in
preparation for production.

ZLu

5.00

3,225.00

9 November 2021

Review documents re: outgoing production as part of
second-level review for privilege.

T Wiheba

11.00

7,095.00

9 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: White & Case emails.

M Brock-Smith

3.90

2,476.50

9 November 2021

Conduct 1LR document review of emails for
responsiveness to discovery requests (10.0); internal
conference with R. Phadtare re: same (0.2).

L Curtis

10.20

6,477.00

9 November 2021

Review documents for privilege log re: W&C emails.

J Ho

240

1,5624.00

9 November 2021

Conduct First Level Privilege Review.

E Kozakevich

1.70

1,079.50

9 November 2021

Review White & Case LLP internal email documents
for privilege and responsiveness to issues relevant to
mediation proceedings, in support of producing a
privilege log and responding to discovery requests.

R Phadtare

0.70

444.50

9 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request.

S Precht

2.00

1,270.00

9 November 2021

Conduct 1LR privilege review in connection with
discovery request re: W&C emails.

M Radek

3.10

1,968.50

9 November 2021

Conduct first-level document review of W&C e-mails.

R Rogers de Castilho 2.50

1,687.50

9 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: privilege review.
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9 November 2021 Conduct first-level review of W&C emails re: privilege. S Saboungi 4.50 2,857.50
9 November 2021 Review of produced emails. K Schroeder 2.20 1,397.00
9 November 2021 Review documents in connection with discovery  Z Sporn 2.50 1,587.50

request re: White & Case privilege review.

9 November 2021 Conduct quality control review of BSA documents for R Mederos 2.70 1,525.50
issues of responsiveness and privilege (1.0); conduct
first level review of W&C emails re: privilege (1.7).

9 November 2021 Review e-mail correspondence of W&C and MNAT P Spencer 2.90 1,638.50
review teams for W&C e-mails (0.3); call with T. Chen
re: Relativity use (0.2); e-mail correspondence with T.
Chen and J. Thomas re: Relativity use (0.1); conduct
quality-control review of BSA e-mails for production
(1.2); draft e-mail correspondence to J. Thomas, M.
Jaoude, R. Mederos, and A. Waterfield re: privilege
issues re: production of BSA e-mails for production
(0.5); e-mail correspondence with J. Thomas, M.
Jaoude, R. Mederos, and A. Waterfield re: quality-
control review of BSA emails (0.6).

9 November 2021 Calls with case team and vendor re: document review T Chen 7.00 2,310.00
and productions (0.6); manage reviewer account and
group permission settings (0.5); organize saved search
and data review folders (0.5); run multiple sets of
searches, prepare document batches, and provide
case team batch summary (0.6); perform document
deduplication checks (0.5); create production
searches, run coding conflict checks, create production
set, run production (0.6); production data export, and
post-export clean-up (0.4); provide document review
support to attorneys (0.5); provide outside counsel with
production download (0.5); manage FTP user access
(0.5); Conduct quality control check re: newly loaded
documents and release to case team for
review/production (0.5); run and create search and
provide case team search results (0.4); Conduct
quality control check re: newly loaded received
productions and release to case team for review (0.4);
modify review coding panel and batch views (0.5).

10 November 2021 Attend conference call with B. Levine, K. Brown, others R Gorsich 4.50 5,400.00
re: TCC document issues (0.9); conference call with
insurance parties, A. Azer, G. Kurtz, others re:
discovery/deposition issues (0.4); review materials and
correspondence re: discovery productions and issues
(0.8); analyze materials re: expert report issues (2.4).

10 November 2021 Research and review of case law re: trust distribution J Green 7.20 8,064.00
procedures (2.5); research and review of case law re:
duties to creditors (3.8); draft summary (0.9).

10 November 2021 Review releases for TDP under the Plan (0.2); review L Baccash 0.40 420.00
research re: third party releases (0.2).

10 November 2021 Revise DST drafts in collaboration with L. Baccash M Linder 1.50 1,575.00
(0.8); telephone call with L. Baccash, B. Whittman, C.
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Binggeli, and R. Walsh re: certain plan deliverables
(0.3); email to W&C finance and capital markets teams
re: same (0.4).

10 November 2021 Prepare for and attend TCC meet and confer (1.5); S Hershey 4.70 5,005.50

attend call with J. Hallowell and M. Andolina re:
witnesses (0.6); call with M. Levy and M. Andolina re:
discovery questions (0.6); call with G. Kurtz and M.
Andolina re: witnesses (0.8); follow-up call with A.
Hammond re: same (0.3); review and revise list of
witnesses and responsible attorneys (0.4); correspond
with J. Thomas and M. Jaoude re: document
productions (0.5).

10 November 2021 Confer with L. Baccash re: plan supplement (0.3); D Kim 1.50 1,567.50
review revised tracker for same (0.2); review draft
documents re: same (1.0).

10 November 2021 Correspond with P. Topper and C. Binggeli re: 2015.3 B Warner 0.30 291.00
reporting (0.1); revise plan supplement tracker re:
document updates (0.2).

10 November 2021 Calls with team re: production and review (2.2); Quality =~ M Jaoude 4.50 4,230.00
control check re: production volumes (2.3).

10 November 2021 Draft, revise, and edit responses and objections to the S Levy 4.30 4,042.00

TCC's Rule 30(b)(6) notice (2.5); confer with S. Murray
re: motion to quash (0.1); confer with S. Hershey and
S. Murray re: responses and objections to Rule
30(b)(6) notices (0.2); email correspondence with
client re: scheduling (0.3);confer with team and the
TCC re: discovery requests (0.5); email
correspondence with team re: upcoming depositions
(0.3); review deposition list circulated by S. Hershey
(0.4).

10 November 2021 Correspond with C. Tuffey re: channeling injunction T Smith 0.60 564.00
and third-party release research (0.1); correspond with
D. Hirshorn re: draft confirmation brief (0.1); organize
plan and plan documents re: analyzing confirmation
issues (0.4).

10 November 2021 Research re: in motion to quash (2.5); review and S Murray 3.60 3,312.00

revise same (0.3); circulate revised motion to quash to
S. Levy and S. Hershey (0.1); coordinate with S.
Hershey re: organizing 30(b)(6) topics for witness
determination (0.2); coordinate with S. Levy re:
30(b)(6) responses and objections (0.1); review and
analyze 30(b)(6) deposition notices to BSA and
categorizing topics in chart for witness determination
(0.4).

10 November 2021 Email review (0.9); calls with T. Chen re: productions  J Thomas 8.50 7,820.00
and review (1.3); calls with ID team re: document
review (0.7); call with R. Tiedemann re: production and
documents (0.2); call with |. Popa re: document review
(0.1); calls with M. Jaoude re: production and reviews
(0.1); call with W&C team re: Client email review (0.7);
review documents for production (2.0); emails with
document review teams re: questions (0.5); review of
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documents re: review team questions (1.0); emails
with litigation support re: document reviews and
production (1.0).

10 November 2021

Review and tag documents for production and
inclusion in the privilege log.

R Demoulin

1.30

1,085.50

10 November 2021

Review potentially relevant documents in preparation
for further document review (1.0); conduct first level
review of emails re: privilege (4.2).

N McGuire

5.20

4,342.00

10 November 2021

Draft rider re: channeling injunction.

L Mezei

2.10

1,533.00

10 November 2021

Call with J. Thomas and L. Curtis re: second level
review of BSA employee emails for responsiveness
and privilege (0.4); second level review BSA employee
emails for responsiveness and privilege (2.1).

H Rubashkin

2.50

1,825.00

10 November 2021

Conduct first-level privilege and issue-coding review of
White & Case and counsel emails and attached
documents.

N Thompson

2.00

1,460.00

10 November 2021

Review W&C emails and code for privilege in
preparation for production.

ZLu

3.40

2,193.00

10 November 2021

Review documents re: outgoing production as part of
second-level review for privilege.

T Wiheba

5.70

3,676.50

10 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: White & Case emails (1.9); redact emails
re: legal advice given by W&C (0.7).

M Brock-Smith

2.60

1,651.00

10 November 2021

Conduct document review for responsiveness to
discovery requests.

L Curtis

2.80

1,778.00

10 November 2021

Call about review of client documents re: confirmation
discovery (0.7); conduct review of client documents re:
confirmation discovery (1.2).

E Kozakevich

1.90

1,206.50

10 November 2021

Conduct 1LR privilege review in connection with
discovery request re: W&C emails (1.1); conduct
second level review privilege review in connection with
discovery request re: abuse claims (1.7).

M Radek

2.80

1,778.00

10 November 2021

Legal research re: released and exculpated parties in
precedent chapter 11 plans for R. Boone (2.1); draft
analysis (in part) for R. Boone re: same (0.2); emails
with R. Gorsich re: BSA hearing and deposition notices
documents (0.2).

D Rivero

2.50

1,687.50

10 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: privilege review (1.1); review documents in
connection with discovery request re: Client email
review (2.5).

L Saber

3.60

2,286.00

10 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: client emails.
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10 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: client email review.

2,032.00

10 November 2021

Manage discovery production participating parties' list
(0.3); review preliminary voting reports, comment on
same and distribute to parties in interest (0.7); draft
confirmation brief re: third party releases and
channeling injunction (1.2).

1,397.00

10 November 2021

Conduct quality control review of BSA documents for
issues of responsiveness and privilege (1.0); conduct
first level review of W&C emails re: privilege (1.4).

1,356.00

10 November 2021

Conduct quality-control review of BSA e-mails for
production (0.8); e-mail correspondence with J.
Thomas re: same (0.2).

565.00

10 November 2021

Run and create search and provide case team search
results (0.4); conduct quality control check re: newly
loaded documents and release to case team for
review/production (0.5); conduct quality control check
re: newly loaded received productions and release to
case team for review (0.4); modify review coding panel
and batch views (0.5); calls (partial) with case team
and vendor re: document review and productions (0.6);
manage FTP user access (0.5); prepare document
images and perform quality control assurance (0.4);
format search term syntaxes, run and create search
term reports, and provide search hit reports, and
prepare document review batches (0.7); create/update
production searches, run coding conflict checks, create
production set, run production (2.8); production data
export, and post-export clean-up (0.4); provide
attorneys document review support (0.5).

2,541.00

11 November 2021

Review materials/correspondence re: deposition
scheduling and assignments (0.3); correspondence
/confer with L. Baccash, J. Lauria, others re: pending
discovery and confirmation issues (0.8); conference
call with KCIC, A. Hammond, S. Hershey, and others
re: expert issues (1.1); conference call with S. Hershey
and many others re: depositions and discovery issues
(1.0); review and analyze insurers settlement
agreements (2.5); conference with Bates White re:
materials (0.6); review same (0.8).

8,520.00

11 November 2021

Telephone call with J. Tour re: pension liabilities
analysis (0.7); review plan documents and tax filings
(3.9).

5,152.00

11 November 2021

Videoconference with A. Hammond (in part); L.
Baccash and A&M team re: confirmation issues and
strategy (1.0); videoconference with G. Kurtz, L.
Baccash, C. Bates, D. Evans, M. Murray and S.
Manning re: historical abuse claims in relation to
expert testimony (0.5); telephone with L. Baccash re:
TDP releases and review of same (0.6); telephone call
with L. Baccash and E. Goodman re: TDP releases
and related matters (0.5); call with L. Baccash re:
same (0.1); telephone call with S. Hershey re: TDP
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discovery (0.2).

11 November 2021

Review and revise responses to 30(b)(6) notice (0.8);
correspond with S. Levy, M. Stoner and A. Hammond
re: same (0.4); correspond with D. Evans re: document
production (0.3); call with KCIC and B. Whittman re:
expert report (1.1); call with G. Kurtz and A. Azer re:
insurer depositions (0.5); call with G. Kurtz re: same
(0.2); call with K. Nownes and W. Claremon re: POCs
(0.4); correspond with B. Warner and L. Baccash re:
same (0.3); correspond with G. Kurtz re: insurer email
re: discovery (0.4); draft response email re: same
(0.3); review deposition topic spreadsheet (0.5); call
with A. Hammond re: evidentiary questions (0.6); call
with M. Linder re: discovery issue (0.3); call with G.
Kurtz and A. Azer re: witness and discovery issues
(0.9); draft emails to Propounding Insurers re:
discovery issues (1.5); review document production
(0.5).

S Hershey

9.00

9,585.00

11 November 2021

Review ongoing research re: certain confirmation
issues (1.0); confer with R. Boone re: same (0.1).

D Kim

1,149.50

11 November 2021

Review and code documents for responsiveness and
privilege.

T Cull

4.60

4,554.00

11 November 2021

Review documents re: M. Johnson and abuse
protection.

C Shepherd

1,089.00

11 November 2021

Quality control check re: production volumes.

M Jaoude

3.20

3,008.00

11 November 2021

Draft, revise, and edit responses and objections to the
TCC's Rule 30(b)(6) notice (2.2); call with A.
Hammond and J. Hunt re: membership trends (0.8);
call with S. Hershey re: outstanding discovery issues
(0.5).

S Levy

3.50

3,290.00

11 November 2021

Confer with appraiser re: damaged document (0.1);
confer with J. Thomas re: same (0.1); confer with
practice technology support team re: same (0.1).

S Murray

2.30

2,116.00

11 November 2021

Calls with ID team re: document review (0.3); calls with
T. Chen re: productions and review (0.8); call with A.
Rogers re: Client email review (0.1); call with P.
Topper re: document review (0.2); calls with M. Jaoude
re: production and reviews (0.4); call with team re:
depositions (1.0); review documents for production
(2.0); emails with document review teams re:
questions (0.3); review of documents re: review team
questions (2.0); emails with litigation support re:
document reviews and production (1.0).

J Thomas

8.10

7,452.00

11 November 2021

Review Trust Distribution Procedures documents for
privilege and responsiveness and code accordingly
(2.0); review other documents and code in view of
production (2.3).

R Demoulin

4.30

3,590.50

11 November 2021

Conducted document review re: emails (2.5); review
correspondences among document production team in
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preparation for further document review (0.8).

11 November 2021

Research re: substantial contribution. L Mezei 5.90 4,307.00

11 November 2021

Conduct privilege and responsiveness review of BSA N Thompson 2.30 1,679.00
discovery documents.

11 November 2021

Review documents re: outgoing production as part of T Wiheba 10.70 6,901.50
second-level review for privilege.

11 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery M Brock-Smith 210 1,333.50
request re: BSA emails.

11 November 2021

Conduct document review for responsiveness to L Curtis 6.20 3,937.00
discovery requests.

11 November 2021

Re-review documents for privilege re: second level J Ho 3.40 2,159.00
review BSA emails.

11 November 2021 Attend TCC town hall and consolidate notes. D Kim 3.00 1,905.00

11 November 2021 Conduct client document and email review. E Kozakevich 3.00 1,905.00

11 November 2021 Review documents in connection with discovery S Precht 1.00 635.00
request.

11 November 2021 Conduct second level review privilege review in M Radek 4.20 2,667.00

connection with discovery request re: abuse claims
(0.9); conduct ID Re-review in connection with
discovery request re: BSA employee emails (1.6);
conduct second level review in connection with
discovery request re: abuse claim emails (1.7).

11 November 2021

Conduct limited document review of Bates White e- R Rogers de Castilho 1.80 1,143.00
mails re: privilege.

11 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery L Saber 2.80 1,778.00
request re: Client email review.

11 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery S Saboungi 2.60 1,651.00
request re: client emails.

11 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery  Z Sporn 2.70 1,714.50
request re: client email review.

11 November 2021

Conduct quality control review of BSA documents for R Mederos 2.60 1,469.00
issues of responsiveness and privilege (1.0); conduct
second level review of W&C emails re: privilege (1.6).

11 November 2021

Investigate problematic files (0.5); monitor and follow T Chen 8.00 2,640.00
up with case team regrading document batch review
status (0.5); calls (partial) with case team and vendor
re: document review and productions (0.6); conduct
quality control check re: newly loaded documents and
release to case team for review/production (0.5);
conduct quality control check re: newly loaded
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received productions and release to case team for
review (0.5); create and update production searches,
run coding conflict checks, create production set, run
production (0.8); production data export, and post-
export clean-up (0.4); provide document review
support to attorneys (0.5); prepare and provide case
team production summary (0.5); prepare and provide
use team document batch review summary (0.5); run
and create search and provide case team search
results (0.4); format syntax and create persistent
highlighting set (0.5); modify review coding panel and
batch views (0.5); manage reviewer account and group
permissions (0.5); prepare document images and
perform quality control assurance (0.4); format search
term syntaxes, run and create search term reports,
and provide search hit reports, and prepare document
review batches (0.4).

12 November 2021

Meet and confer call with G. Kurtz, S. Rudman, and
others re: document production (0.2); review and
analyze motion for relief from stay issues and
materials (1.2); confer with D. Kim, L. Baccash, and M.
Linder re: same (0.7); conference call with G. Kurtz, M.
Andolina, and others re: deposition issues (1.6); review
and analyze Disclosure Statement and Plan re:
confirmation issues (3.2).

R Gorsich

6.90

8,280.00

12 November 2021

Telephone call with R. Gorsich, L. Baccash and D. Kim
re: potential lift-stay motions in connection with Insurer
settlement (0.8); review and comment on revised TCC
remedial email (0.2); emails with other parties re: same
(0.2); review and revise TDP releases (0.3); telephone
call with L. Baccash and B. Warner re: voting issues
(0.5); telephone call with L. Baccash re: TDP releases
and Insurer agreement (0.5); review foundation loan
and security agreement and Whittman comments to
same (0.7).

M Linder

3.20

3,360.00

12 November 2021

Correspond with G. Kurtz re: document production
(0.8); draft emails re: redactions to documents (0.9);
review and revise order re: document production (0.4);
draft letter to insurers re: document production (2.1);
review and revise letter per comments from G. Kurtz
(0.9).

S Hershey

5.10

5,431.50

12 November 2021

Review plan supplement tracker (0.2); confer with L.
Baccash re: same (0.1); review certain plan
supplement documents (0.5).

D Kim

0.80

836.00

12 November 2021

Call with A. Hammond re: TDP issues at confirmation.

C Shepherd

1.30

1,287.00

12 November 2021

Correspond with M. Linder and L. Baccash re: plan
supplement.

B Warner

0.10

97.00

12 November 2021

Quality control check re: Production logs.

M Jaoude

1.20

1,128.00

12 November 2021

Draft, revise, and edit responses and objections to the
TCC's Rule 30(b)(6) notice (1.8); review A.
Hammond's comments re: same (0.4); email
correspondence with A. Hammond and S. Hershey re:
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same and next steps (0.2); research re: proof of claim
for A. Hammond and review same (0.5); legal research
re: pension claims and valuation (1.2); email
correspondence with team re: discovery issues and
upcoming meet-and-confers (0.3).

12 November 2021

Revise confirmation brief.

T Smith

0.30

282.00

12 November 2021

Confer with appraiser re: damaged document (0.1);
confer with J. Thomas re: same (0.1); confer with
practice technology support team re: same (0.1).

S Murray

0.30

276.00

12 November 2021

Call with T. Chen re: production and reviews (1.6);
calls with M. Jaoude re: production and reviews (0.2);
calls with S. Hershey re: production and reviews (0.1);
call with C. Edmonds re: document review (0.1); calls
with ID team re: document review (0.2); review
documents for production (2.2); emails with document
review teams re: questions (0.5); review of documents
re: review team questions (1.5); emails with litigation
support re: document reviews and production (1.0);
call with team re: depositions (1.0).

J Thomas

8.40

7,728.00

12 November 2021

Review Trust Distribution Procedures documents and
code for responsiveness and privilege (1.5); discuss
with J. Thomas (0.2).

R Demoulin

1.70

1,419.50

12 November 2021

Review correspondences among document production
team in preparation for further document review.

N McGuire

918.50

12 November 2021

Redact Heidi Steppe email (1.4); call about redactions
(0.2).

E Kozakevich

1.60

1,016.00

12 November 2021

Review and analyze documents for privilege,
responsiveness, and confidentiality.

R Phadtare

1.00

635.00

12 November 2021

Conduct second level review in connection with
discovery request re: abuse claim emails.

M Radek

3.10

1,968.50

12 November 2021

Review and analyze produced BSA charter
documents.

R Rogers de Castilho

0.60

381.00

12 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: same.

L Saber

1.70

1,079.50

12 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: client emails.

S Saboungi

3.50

2,222.50

12 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request re: client email review.

Z Sporn

2.80

1,778.00

12 November 2021

Review drafted voting reports and distribute to parties
in interest.

C Tuffey

0.30

190.50

12 November 2021

Conduct quality control review of BSA documents for
issues of responsiveness and privilege.
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12 November 2021

Calls with case team and vendor re: document review
and productions (0.4); manage reviewer account and
group permission (0.5); run searches and prepare
document review batches (0.4); prepare and provide
case team production summary (0.5); run and create
search and provide case team search results (0.4);
modify review coding panel and batch views (0.5);
provide attorneys document review support (0.5);
create and update multiple sets of production
searches, run coding conflict checks, create production
set, run production (0.4); production data exports and
post-export clean-ups (0.4).

T Chen

4.00

1,320.00

13 November 2021

Review and analyze potential lift stay issues (0.8);
confer with L. Baccash and D. Kim re: same and
ongoing issues (0.5); review background materials
(1.5).

R Gorsich

2.80

3,360.00

13 November 2021

Telephone call with M. Andolina, S. Hershey, and
Latham team re: confirmation evidence and strategy
(0.8); review and analyze draft Whittman report (1.3).

M Linder

2.10

2,205.00

13 November 2021

Calls with B. Dozier and M. Andolina re: discovery
issues (1.0); correspond with M. Jaoude and J.
Thomas re: discovery review (0.6); correspond with A.
Hong re: letter re: discovery (0.3); correspond with A.
Hammond re: deposition issues (0.2).

S Hershey

2.10

2,236.50

13 November 2021

Review research re: confirmation order (0.6); revise
draft of same (1.3).

D Kim

1.90

1,985.50

13 November 2021

Calls with team re: Quality control check re: and
production logs.

M Jaoude

2.20

2,068.00

13 November 2021

Draft, revise, and edit responses and objections to the
TCC's Rule 30(b)(6) notice (1.7); call with A.
Hammond re: same, strategy, and next steps (0.5);
legal research re: pension claims and valuation (1.3).

S Levy

3.50

3,290.00

13 November 2021

Calls with S. Hershey and M. Jaoude re: privilege log
and productions (0.8); calls with M. Jaoude re:
privilege log and productions (0.5); call with T. Chen
re: volume 19 production (0.5); review documents for
production and conflicts check (2.3).

J Thomas

4.10

3,772.00

13 November 2021

Calls with case team re: document review and
productions (0.8); data transfer and upload to FTP
(0.4); create and update multiple sets of production
searches, run coding conflict checks, create production
set, run production (0.6); production data exports, and
post-export clean-ups (0.4); prepare and provide case
team production summary (0.5); provide document
review/production weekend support (0.4).

T Chen

3.10

1,023.00

14 November 2021

Review and revise letter re: insurer motion to compel
(6.9); correspond with M. Jaoude and J. Thomas re:
discovery (1.2); review responses and objections to
30(b)(6) notices (1.1).

Page 74 of 151

S Hershey

9.20

9,798.00




Case 20-10343-LSS Doc 9308-2 Filed 03/12/22 Page 76 of 152

Boy Scouts of America
RE: Project Restructuring

WHITE & CASE

OUR REF: 1786703-0002

DATE

DESCRIPTION

TIMEKEEPER HOURS usb

14 November 2021

Draft categorical privilege log (4.0); confer with J.
Thomas and M. Jaoude on the same (0.5).

T Cull 4.50 4,455.00

14 November 2021

Draft privilege logs for document productions in
response to several requests for production.

M Jaoude 16.00 15,040.00

14 November 2021

Call with T. Chen and M. Jaoude re: W&C email
privilege log (0.5); call with team re: privilege log (0.5);
call with S. Hershey and M. Jaoude re: privilege logs
(0.4); call with M. Jaoude re: privilege logs and
productions (1.4); call with T. Chen re: productions
(1.2); calls with team re: privilege log and TDP review
(1.0); emails with team re: log and TDP review (0.5);
review of documents re: same (2.1).

J Thomas 7.60 6,992.00

14 November 2021

Review documents re: confirmation discovery and
production.

R Demoulin 5.60 4,676.00

14 November 2021

Call with J. Thomas, S. Precht, and M. Radek re:
review of W&C emails re: privilege log (0.2); code
W&C emails for inclusion in privilege log (0.7).

H Rubashkin 0.90 657.00

14 November 2021

Call about client email review.

E Kozakevich 0.30 190.50

14 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request.

S Precht 1.00 635.00

14 November 2021

Conduct second level review in connection with
discovery request re: privilege log.

M Radek 1.60 1,016.00

14 November 2021

Prepare production summary and provide same to
team (0.5); provide document review and production
weekend support (0.4); calls (partial) with case team
re: document review and productions (0.4); run and
create search and provide case team search results
(0.4); run and create searches, export privilege logs,
and manually cleanup email addresses and domains
per issue category (0.6); manage data transfer and
upload to FTP (0.5); create and update multiple sets of
production searches, run coding conflict checks, create
production set, run production (0.4); production data
exports, and post-export clean-ups (0.5).

T Chen 3.70 1,221.00

15 November 2021

Participate in meet and conference call with G. Kurtz
and others re: deposition notices (0.3); conference call
with experts, M. Andolina, and others (1.0); conference
with D. Kim re: settlement and Plan issues (0.6);
review potential  settlement  materials  (1.6);
correspondence re: status report and related issues
with M. Andolina, B. Warner, L. Baccash, and others
(0.5); review documents (0.2) and confer with M.
Andolina, L. Baccash, B. Whittman, and others re:
settlement issues (0.5).

R Gorsich 4.70 5,640.00

15 November 2021

Research and review of case law re: 30(b)(6)
deposition.

J Green 0.70 784.00

15 November 2021

Review and revise term sheet for potential settlement
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(1.5); call with B. Whittman and M. Andolina re: same
(0.1).

15 November 2021 Call with G. Kurtz and A. Hong re: response to motion S Hershey 11.40 12,141.00
to compel (0.6); call with J. Hallowell and G. Kurtz re:
witnesses and discovery (0.6); call with M. Jaoude and
J. Thomas re: privilege log (0.4); call with N. Dubose
and A. Azer re: KCIC deposition prep (1.0); call with A.
Hammond, Client and M. Andolina re: witnesses for
depositions (1.1); call with A. Hammond and S. Golden
re: depositions (0.5); call with A. Hammond and S.
Levy re: responses and objections to 30(b)(6) notices
(3.9); correspond with M. Jaoude and J. Thomas re:
document production and privilege logs (0.9); review
and revise production index (1.1); review and revise
privilege logs (1.3).

15 November 2021 Review plan supplement tracker (0.3); further review D Kim 2.40 2,508.00
preliminary research in support of confirmation (1.0);
confer with L. Baccash re: same (0.2); further review
draft confirmation order (0.9).

15 November 2021 Draft and revise privilege logs for document M Jaoude 15.20 14,288.00
productions in response to several requests for
production (7.2); calls with team re: discovery
productions (2.3); quality control check re: and
produce responsive documents (5.7).

15 November 2021 Confer with W&C team re: A&M expert report, expert S Levy 4.50 4,230.00

discovery, and next steps (0.2); review expert report
on feasibility (0.4); confer with W&C team re:
responses and objections to Rule 30(b)(6) notices
(0.5); revise and edit same (0.5); summarize
information re: proof of claim for A. Hammond (1.2);
attend (partial) meet and confer with Gibson Dunn re:
depositions (0.4); legal research and analysis re:
pension claim and valuation (1.3).

15 November 2021 Calls with M. Jaoude re: privilege logs, document J Thomas 13.20 12,144.00

reviews, and productions (3.3); calls with M. Jaoude
and S. Hershey re: privilege logs, document reviews,
and productions (0.4); calls with team re: privilege log
(1.0); calls with team re: TDP document review (0.5);
emails with team re: same (0.5); review documents re:
same (4.0); draft privilege log (3.0); emails with
litigation support re: document reviews and production
(0.5).

15 November 2021 Two calls with J. Thomas, M. Jaoude, and others to H Rubashkin 210 1,533.00
discuss creating the privilege log for BSA and W&C
emails (0.7); create a portion of the privilege log (1.2);
call with P. Spencer re: privilege log assignment (0.2).

15 November 2021 Conduct first-level review of discovery documents re: N Thompson 4.00 2,920.00
Trust Distribution Procedures, Trust Distribution
Procedures settlement trust agreements (3.6); attend
instructional meeting re: same (0.4).

15 November 2021 Review documents re: outgoing production as part of T Wiheba 6.50 4,192.50
second-level review for privilege.
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15 November 2021

Edit privilege log re: various emails.

M Brock-Smith

2.50

1,5687.50

15 November 2021

Conduct document review under Judge's order re:
privilege.

L Curtis

3.10

1,968.50

15 November 2021

Call about privilege log (0.4); edit privilege log (0.8).

E Kozakevich

1.20

762.00

15 November 2021

Review and analyze documents re: responsiveness
and privilege.

R Phadtare

1.00

635.00

15 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request.

S Precht

1.00

635.00

15 November 2021

Draft BSA privilege log.

M Radek

1.20

762.00

15 November 2021

Emails with Omni re: pro se claimants' factual
questions re: the plan (0.2); calls with pro se claimants
re: same (1.9); draft analysis for L. Baccash to
summarize discussions re: same (0.3); correspond
with D. Kim and C. Tuffey re: same (0.2).

D Rivero

2.60

1,651.00

15 November 2021

Complete privilege log for future claims category.

R Rogers de Castilho

1.00

635.00

15 November 2021

Draft privilege log re: membership projections.

L Saber

1.90

1,206.50

15 November 2021

Review and revise privilege log.

S Saboungi

0.70

444.50

15 November 2021

Review and revise privilege log re: BSA internal email
requests.

Z Sporn

1.90

1,206.50

15 November 2021

Conduct quality control review of BSA documents for
issues of responsiveness and privilege.

R Mederos

1.80

1,017.00

15 November 2021

Review e-mail correspondence from J. Thomas to
W&C privilege log team re: privilege log tasks (0.1);
review W&C and MNAT correspondence re: W&C
document review (0.3); edit and revise categorical
privilege log entry (0.9); draft correspondence to M.
Jaoude, J. Thomas and E. Kozakevich re: same (0.1).

P Spencer

1.40

791.00

15 November 2021

Calls with case team re: document review and
productions (0.6); create and update multiple sets of
production searches, run coding conflict checks, create
production set, run production (0.6); production data
exports, and post-export clean-ups (0.5); run and
create searches, export privilege logs, and manually
cleanup email addresses and domains per issue
categories (0.4); manage FTP user access (0.5); run
searches and prepare and update production summary
and log (0.4); conduct quality control check re: newly
loaded received productions and release to case team
for review (1.2).

T Chen

4.20

1,386.00

16 November 2021

Meet and confer call with S. Hershey, multiple others
(0.9); review 30(b)(6) deposition issues (0.4);
conference with L. Baccash, B. Warner, A. Azer, and
others re: confirmation issues (0.8); review Plan re:
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confirmation issues (2.5); review deposition notices,
relevant materials, and prepare for 30(b)(6)
depositions (3.7).

16 November 2021 Review and revise responses and objections to TCC S Hershey 11.80 12,567.00
30(b)(6) notice (1.7); all with J. Hunt re: membership
questions (0.8); call with A. Hammond re: discovery
issues (0.3); attend meet and confer with TCC (1.6);
follow-up call with A. Hammond re: same (0.3); review
and revise discovery schedule (0.3); review and revise
responses and objections to Zalkin and Pfau 30(b)(6)
notice (1.3); review and revise letter in opposition to
motion to compel (2.7); draft letter response to
propounding insurers re: discovery disputes (1.4);
attend meet and confer with S. Gurvitz and R. Pfister
(1.4).

16 November 2021 Review plan supplement tracker (0.3); teleconference D Kim 2.70 2,821.50
with B. Warner, L. Baccash re: same (0.5); correspond
with A. Simon re: post-effective debt documents (0.1);
revise and draft confirmation order (1.8).

16 November 2021 Call with L. Baccash re: plan supplement documents B Warner 3.50 3,395.00

(0.1); revise plan supplement tracker re: case updates
(0.8); call with R. Gorsich, L. Baccash, and D. Kim re:
plan supplement (0.5); emails to W&C team on expert
witness retentions and stipulated 365(d)(4) deadline
extension (0.7); research same (0.5); research re: TDP
question (0.3); draft response to M. Salzberg re: TDP
question (0.3); call with C. Binggeli re: various case
updates, reporting and retention matters (0.3).

16 November 2021 Conduct review and production re: Trust Distribution M Jaoude 8.10 7,614.00
Procedures and TSA (4.1); draft incoming review
protocols and develop work stream (4.0).

16 November 2021 Draft, revise, and edit responses and objections to the S Levy 4.00 3,760.00
TCC's Rule 30(b)(6) notice (1.0); draft, revise, and edit
responses and objections to Zalkin and Pfau's Rule
30(B)(6) notice (1.4); email correspondence with A.
Hammond and S. Hershey re: same (0.2); phone
correspondence with S. Hershey re: same (0.1); meet
and confer with Zalkin and Pfau re: their Rule 30(b)(6)

notice (1.3).
16 November 2021 Revise confirmation brief. T Smith 0.50 470.00
16 November 2021 Finalize privilege log (0.6); calls with M. Jaoude re: J Thomas 4.70 4,324.00

document reviews and productions (0.6); call with S.
Hershey and M. Jaoude re: document reviews for
deposition preparation (0.2); review productions and
draft production volume index (1.0); emails with team
re: Ogletree production (0.3); call with team re:
document reviews for deposition preparation (0.5); call
with team re: depositions (1.0); emails with team re:
document review (0.5).

16 November 2021 Prepare shell preliminary and final binder folders for all R Demoulin 3.90 3,256.50
deponents (2.9) Research re: Whittman declarations
and deposition notices (1.0).
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16 November 2021 Research re: appeal and review standard. L Mezei 2.40 1,752.00
16 November 2021 Call with BSA doc review team including M. Jaoude H Rubashkin 0.50 365.00

and others for updates on current workstreams before
chapter 11 hearing.

16 November 2021 Call about document review in advance of depositions. E Kozakevich 0.70 444 .50

16 November 2021 Review documents in connection with discovery S Precht 0.50 317.50
request.

16 November 2021 Run searches and update production summary and log T Chen 5.10 1,683.00

(1.2); conduct quality control check re: newly loaded
received productions and release to case team for
review (0.4); prepare document images and perform
quality control assurance (0.4); create and update
multiple sets of production searches, run coding
conflict checks, create production set, run production
(0.4); production data exports, and post-export clean-
ups (0.5); manage FTP user access (0.5); run and
create search and provide case team search results
(0.4); format syntax and create persistent highlighting
set (0.5); communicate with vendor re: document
review status and reviewer account management (0.4);
conduct quality control check re: received document
metadata fields and coordinate with co-counsel for a
missing metadata overlay (0.4).

17 November 2021

Calls with G. Kurtz and C. Shepherd re: R Gorsich 6.40 7,680.00
witness/30(b)(6) issues (1.3); conference call with G.

Kurtz, A. Hammond, others re: deposition preparation

(1.2); review motion to quash (0.5); confer with B.

Warner, others re: ordinary course professional issues

(0.3); review correspondence re: Town Hall issues

(0.4); review documents for witness preparation (1.5);

review discovery responses and objections (1.2).

17 November 2021

Review research re: plan issues. L Baccash 0.70 735.00

17 November 2021

Review and revise draft opposition letter to motion to S Hershey 5.10 5,431.50
compel (2.1); correspond with J. Thomas and M.

Jaoude re: discovery issues (0.7); correspond re:

schedule (0.2) meet and confer with Ad Hoc Group of

Methodists and Catholics re: 30(b)(6) notice (0.8);

correspond with A. Hammond re: same (0.4); review

and revise letter re: insurer motion to quash (0.9).

17 November 2021

Review revised plan supplement documents (1.7); D Kim 2.80 2,926.00
confer with L. Baccash re: same (0.6); revise certain
plan supplement information (0.5).

17 November 2021 Call with L. Baccash re: case tasks and next steps B Warner 0.50 485.00
(0.2); call with M. Wasson re: creditor representative
(0.3).

17 November 2021 Calls with team re: document review (2.7); revise M Jaoude 7.70 7,238.00

incoming review protocols (2.4); quality control check
re: and produce documents (0.7); provide instructions
and answer questions re: review (1.9).
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17 November 2021 Draft, revise, and edit responses and objections to the S Levy 3.10 2,914.00

Committees' Rule 30(b)(6) notices (1.1); email
correspondence with A. Hammond and S. Hershey re:
same and next steps (0.4); phone correspondence
with S. Hershey re: same and next steps (0.5); phone
correspondence with J. Thomas re: 30(b)(6) witnesses
and next steps (0.3); meet and confer with the
Committees re: their Rule 30(b)(6) notice (0.8).

17 November 2021 Calls with M. Jaoude document reviews (1.1); call with J Thomas 6.30 5,796.00
S. Hershey and M. Jaoude re: document reviews for
deposition preparation (0.7); emails with team re:
responses and objections to deposition notices (0.2);
emails with team re: Ogletree production (0.3); emails
with team re: B. Whittman deposition preparation email
review (0.5); review of documents re: same (1.5);
review of trust distribution procedures related
productions (1.0); emails with team re: same (0.2);
review RSA deposition binders re: documents for
confirmation hearing deposition binders (0.5); call with
R. Tiedemann re: deposition preparation (0.3).

17 November 2021 Review and respond to team correspondence (0.2); R Demoulin 3.50 2,922.50
review Whittman document review and lead team
meeting re: the Whittman review in preparation for
deposition (2.0); revise Whittman relativity search
(1.3).

17 November 2021 Continued research re: appeal and review standard. L Mezei 4.70 3,431.00

17 November 2021 Deposition preparation (1.3); review B. Whittman E Kozakevich 4.20 2,667.00
documents in preparation for his deposition (2.0);
isolated possible documents for questioning (0.9).

17 November 2021 Correspond with counsel from Barr Anhut & D Rivero 0.40 254.00
Associates re: confirmation hearing notice (0.3); review
email from B. Warner re: same (0.1).

17 November 2021 Review of documents produced. K Schroeder 1.00 635.00

17 November 2021 Review documents re: B. Whittman deposition Z Sporn 2.90 1,841.50
preparation.

17 November 2021 Manage FTP user access (0.5); conduct quality control T Chen 4.40 1,452.00

check re: newly loaded received productions and
release to case team for review (0.4); create
production searches, run coding conflict checks, create
production set, run production (0.6); production data
exports, and post-export clean-ups (0.5); format syntax
and create persistent highlighting set (0.5); correspond
with co-counsel re: production information (0.5);
manage reviewer permissions (0.5); create PDF export
profiles and run tests (0.5); run searches and export
documents in PDF format (0.4).

18 November 2021 Review materials re: Bates White expert issues (1.2); R Gorsich 7.30 8,760.00
review and revise insurer settlement agreement (1.3);
confer with G. Kurtz, C. Shepherd, and A. Azer re:
deposition and discovery issues (0.6); review and
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analyze materials re: same, including TDP (4.2).

18 November 2021 Call with E. Goodman and B. Warner re: plan L Baccash 2.10 2,205.00
supplement documents (0.3); multiple calls with M.
Linder re: plan and case issues (1.0); call with B.
Warner, C. Adler, D. Kim and A. Simon re: plan
supplement documents (0.6); follow up call with B.
Warner re: same (0.2).

18 November 2021 Draft response to insurer email re: discovery (1.2); S Hershey 7.40 7,881.00

calls with C. Moxley re: schedule (0.4); calls with A.
Hammond re: discovery issues (1.3); review and revise
responses and objections to Propounding Insurers
30(b)(6) notice (1.4); draft email re: claw back e (0.6);
review and revise outline for witness preparation (1.6);
call with FCR and Coalition re: case status (0.3);
review research re: insurer productions in preparation
for hearing (0.6).

18 November 2021 Draft leaseback agreement (0.6); review and revise D Kim 3.00 3,135.00
other plan supplement documents (1.5); confer with L.
Baccash and B. Warner re: same (0.4); review plan
supplement tracker (0.2); revise issues list for
confirmation order (0.3).

18 November 2021 Review and identify documents for deposition T Cull 4.10 4,059.00
preparation of Jeff Hunt.

18 November 2021 Call with M. Salzberg re: chartered organization B Warner 1.30 1,261.00
questions (0.2); call with L. Baccash, D. Kim, C. Adler
and A. Simon and C. Binggeli re: plan supplement
documents (0.6); call with L. Baccash re: same (0.2);
correspond with G. Gigante re: revisions to protected
parties list (0.2); call with K. Gluck re: plan and case
matters (0.1).

18 November 2021 Revise plan supplement tracker (0.3); updates on plan B Warner 1.20 1,164.00
supplement documents (0.3); work with L. Baccash to
revise the same (0.2); call with L. Baccash and E.
Goodman (in part) re: plan supplement documents and
plan (0.3); email to M. Salzberg re: TDP and plan
release question (0.1).

18 November 2021 Review documents for potential claw back and M Jaoude 8.20 7,708.00
produce slip sheets (2.2); create revised log of
incoming productions (1.7); create searches for
incoming productions and depo prep (2.3); review
documents for Whittman depo prep (1).

18 November 2021 Draft, revise, and edit responses and objections to the S Levy 4.10 3,854.00
Propounding Insurers' Rule 30(b)(6) notice (1.9); draft,
revise, and edit witness charts re: Rule 30(b)(6) topics
(1.2); confer with S. Hershey re: the foregoing (0.6);
email correspondence with A. Hammond re: A&M
report (0.4).

18 November 2021 Correspond with K. Doah re: confirmation issues (0.2); T Smith 0.60 564.00
review and analyze confirmation brief inserts (0.4).
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18 November 2021

Call with team re: deposition preparation reviewing
documents for B. Whittman, J. Hunt, and TCC (1.0);
draft guidelines re: same (0.7); call with review team
re: review of B. Whittman emails for deposition
preparation (0.5); call with team re: J. Hunt
email/document review (0.5); calls with M. Jaoude re:
adversary production dates and deposition preparation
(1.2); emails with review team re: B. Whittman
deposition preparation (0.5); review of documents re:
same (1.4); emails with review team re: J. Hunt
deposition preparation (0.5); review of documents re:
same (1.0); review BSA responses and objections to
30(b)(6) deposition notices (0.3); review A&M expert
documents (0.2); emails with team re: claw back of
documents (0.1); review of same (0.2).

J Thomas

8.10

7,452.00

18 November 2021

Assign second level review of B. Whittman documents
(0.5); review documents pulled by the team and follow
up on some documents (1.0); run searches on
relativity re: relevant emails (1.2); run and assign new
Whittman search (1.3); review new Whittman search
and save responsive documents in preparation for
Whittman deposition (1.0); review and respond to team
questions (0.3); call J. Thomas and M. Jaoude re:
various deposition-related items (0.5).

R Demoulin

5.80

4,843.00

18 November 2021

Review documents for relevance in preparation for
Hunt deposition.

N McGuire

5.10

4,258.50

18 November 2021

Draft rider re: best interests test re: confirmation brief.

L Mezei

3.10

2,263.00

18 November 2021

Call with document review team to discuss deposition
preparation (0.5); document review to pull relevant
documents for deposition preparation (1.0).

H Rubashkin

1.50

1,095.00

18 November 2021

Review documents re: preparing for deposition of J.
Hunt.

T Wiheba

3.20

2,064.00

18 November 2021

Review documents re: Hunt deposition.

M Brock-Smith

1.90

1,206.50

18 November 2021

Conduct document review for relevant documents for
deposition preparation.

L Curtis

4.40

2,794.00

18 November 2021

Review documents re: preparation for J. Hunt
deposition.

J Ho

3.10

1,968.50

18 November 2021

Attend TCC Town Hall and draft notes (0.5); draft rider
re: best interests test (4.5).

D Kim

5.00

3,175.00

18 November 2021

Review of Brian Whittman documents for deposition
preparation.

E Kozakevich

1.60

1,016.00

18 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request.

S Precht

1.80

1,143.00

18 November 2021

Review documents in anticipation of deposition of J.
Hunt.
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18 November 2021

Call with R. Reed re: confirmation research
workstream and next steps (0.4); draft rider (in part) for
confirmation brief re: good faith (3.1).

D Rivero

3.50

2,222.50

18 November 2021

Conduct document review of documents relevant to
Hunt's deposition.

R Rogers de Castilho

1.00

635.00

18 November 2021

Review documents re: same.

L Saber

2.00

1,270.00

18 November 2021

Review documents re: B. Whittman deposition
preparation.

Z Sporn

2.50

1,687.50

18 November 2021

Run and create multiple sets of searches and provide
case team search results (0.7); manage reviewer
accounts and group permission management (0.4); run
searches and prepare document review batches (0.4);
create document review coding panel (0.4); create
batch review document view panel (0.4); export PDFs
(0.4); update data tracking log (0.4).

T Chen

3.10

1,023.00

19 November 2021

Review and revise responses and objections to
30(b)(6) notice (0.8); confer with C. Shepherd re: same
(0.5); review materials in preparation for 30(b)(6)
depositions (2.3); review ordinary course professional
materials (0.2).

R Gorsich

3.80

4,560.00

19 November 2021

Review and revise settlement agreement with
chartered organization (1.5); discuss revisions to
settlement agreement and revise from chartered
organization with R. Gorsich and D. Kim (1.3); review
research from C. Tuffey re: confirmation issues (0.4);
review and revise motion for settlement agreement
(0.2); call with D. Kim re: same (0.1).

L Baccash

3.50

3,675.00

19 November 2021

Review and revise responses and objections to
Propounding Insurers (0.6); draft chart re: deposition
topics by witness (2.1).

S Hershey

2.70

2,875.50

19 November 2021

Review certain revised Plan Supplement documents
(1.6); review TCJC settlement agreement and revised
Insurer settlement agreement (1.0); teleconference
with L. Baccash and R. Gorsich re: same (1.4); draft
comments to Insurer settlement agreement (0.7);
review research re: impact of same on certain other
parties (0.5); review revised settlement term sheet
subject to mediation privilege (0.5).

D Kim

5.70

5,956.50

19 November 2021

Review documents and identify materials for
deposition preparation.

T Cull

4.60

4,554.00

19 November 2021

Call with L. Baccash re: various strategic case matters
(0.2); correspond with E. Goodman re: plan
supplement documents (0.1).

B Warner

0.30

291.00

19 November 2021

Deposition prep for J. Hunt and B. Whittman (3.7);
calls with team re: Trust Distribution Procedures and
production (0.7); revise protocols and provide
guidance on review for incoming production (2.3).
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19 November 2021

Research and analysis re: valuation for pension claims
(1.6); draft, revise, and edit responses to discovery
requests from counsel for the Committees (1.2); email
and phone correspondence with A. Hammond re: the
foregoing and next steps (0.3).

S Levy

3.10

2,914.00

19 November 2021

Draft confirmation brief (1.4); review and analyze plan
and disclosure statement provisions (1.2); review and
analyze precedent confirmation briefs (0.4).

T Smith

3.00

2,820.00

19 November 2021

Call with A. Hammond re: deposition preparation (0.3);
call with review team re: TCC production review (0.3);
calls with M. Jaoude re: document reviews, claw back
of documents (0.3); call with M. Fuhr and A&M re:
expert documents (0.2); call with S. Levy re:
depositions (0.1); emails with team re: deposition
preparation document reviews and questions re: same
(1.5); review of documents re: same (2.0).

J Thomas

4.70

4,324.00

19 November 2021

Call with Whittman deposition team (0.5); respond to
reviewers' questions on Hunt document review (0.8);
confer with A. Zegger, J. Thomas, and M. Jaoude re:
work streams progress (0.7); review and respond to
reviewers' questions on Whittman review (1.0);
circulate hot documents to the core team (0.5); run
preliminary searches for Devang Desai and Alison
Schuler documents (1.0); redact clawed back
documents (0.8).

R Demoulin

5.30

4,425.50

19 November 2021

Review documents for relevance re: binder preparation
for Hunt deposition.

N McGuire

4.60

3,841.00

19 November 2021

Draft re: best interest rider.

L Mezei

2.70

1,971.00

19 November 2021

Review Hunt documents in preparation for deposition
(3.3); confer with team re: review of TCC documents
(0.3).

ZLu

3.60

2,322.00

19 November 2021

Review documents re: preparing for deposition of J.
Hunt.

T Wiheba

8.10

5,224.50

19 November 2021

Review documents re: Hunt deposition (1.9); review
documents re: TCC emails (1.2).

M Brock-Smith

3.10

1,968.50

19 November 2021

Conduct document review for relevant documents for
deposition preparation.

L Curtis

3.70

2,349.50

19 November 2021

Review documents re: preparation for J. Hunt
deposition.

J Ho

1.90

1,206.50

19 November 2021

Call about review of TCC documents for deposition
preparation.

E Kozakevich

0.20

127.00

19 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request.

S Precht

1.50

952.50

19 November 2021

Review documents produced by TCC in anticipation of
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depositions of TCC witnesses.

19 November 2021 Draft rider (in part) for confirmation brief re: good faith. D Rivero 1.90 1,206.50

19 November 2021 Conduct document review in preparation for Hunt R Rogers de Castilho 4.10 2,603.50
deposition (2.5); conduct document review in
preparation for TCC deposition (1.6).

19 November 2021 Review documents re: Hunt deposition preparation L Saber 3.80 2,413.00
(3.2); review documents re: TCC document review
(0.6).

19 November 2021 Review  documents produced for upcoming K Schroeder 1.70 1,079.50

proceedings.

19 November 2021 Review documents re: B. Whittman deposition Z Sporn 3.50 2,222.50
preparation (1.7); redact documents for attorney client
privilege (0.7); review documents re: TCC document
production (1.1).

19 November 2021 Draft plan supplement notice (1.1); follow up research C Tuffey 1.60 1,016.00
re: third party releases (0.5).

19 November 2021 Calls (partial) with team re: instructions for searching T Chen 1.80 594.00
and data processing (0.7); calls (partial) with team to
discuss claw back productions and resolve same (0.7);
run search and PDF exports (0.4).

20 November 2021 Conference call with M. Andolina, G. Kurtz, and others R Gorsich 9.30 11,160.00
re: deposition preparation (0.6); review and analyze
insurer settlement agreement (0.8); confer with L.
Baccash and D. Kim re: same (0.5); conference call
with team re: discovery hearing and ongoing witness
and other issues (1.3); confer with A. Azer, G. Kurtz,
and others re: B. Griggs and other witness preparation
(0.7); review and analyze materials and prepare for
same (2.3); review term sheets and settlement
agreements and Plan and analysis re: same (2.0);
confer with S. Hershey re: deposition schedule (0.2);
correspondence with team re: mediation and related
issues (0.3); review discovery responses (0.6).

20 November 2021 Call with A. Hammond re: witness preparation (0.5); S Hershey 4.00 4,260.00
call with A. Azer re: same (0.3); call with R. Gorsich, A.
Azer and A. Hammond re: witness preparation (1.3);
call with G. Kurtz and A. Azer re: Griggs prep (0.7);
draft email re: witness responsibility (1.0); call with J.
Thomas and M. Jaoude re: production (0.2).

20 November 2021 Review revised settlement agreement with Insurer D Kim 3.90 4,075.50
(1.0); review and revise settlement agreement with
TCJC (1.4); review term sheet with certain other
parties (0.9); confer with R. Gorsich and L. Baccash re:
same (0.6).

20 November 2021 Review A&M model re: pension claims (1.4); email S Levy 4.10 3,854.00
correspondence with A. Hammond re: same (0.2);
research re: valuation of pension claims (1.7); draft
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outline re: same and circulate to A. Hammond (0.5);
email correspondence with team re: upcoming
depositions (0.3).

20 November 2021

Call with S. Hershey and M. Jaoude re: deposition
preparation (0.3); calls with M. Jaoude re: same (0.2);
emails with team re: B. Whittman deposition
preparation document review (0.5); emails with A.
Zegger re: Kosnoff review and TCC new productions
review (0.7); review of documents re: Insurer and
TCJC POC (0.3); email correspondence with D.
Hirshorn re: same (0.1); review of produced
documents re: verdicts (0.4); review produced board
minutes and presentations produced for additional
TDP communications (0.5); emails with team re:
deposition preparation (0.4); review of documents re:
same (0.5).

J Thomas

3.90

3,588.00

20 November 2021

Review and respond to correspondence from J.
Thomas re: searches re: deponents.

R Demoulin

0.10

83.50

20 November 2021

Review documents for relevance re: binder preparation
for Hunt deposition.

N McGuire

2.00

1,670.00

20 November 2021

Review documents re: received production from TCC.

T Wiheba

7.10

4,579.50

20 November 2021

Review produced documents re: preparation for TCC
depositions.

J Ho

2.50

1,687.50

20 November 2021

Create, draft, and modify chart re: provisions in certain
settlement term sheets.

D Kim

4.20

2,667.00

20 November 2021

Emails with L. Baccash and D. Kim re: comparison of
plan settlement agreements (0.2); review settlement
agreements (in part) re: same (2.5); draft analysis in
part re: same to L. Baccash and D. Kim (0.9).

D Rivero

3.60

2,286.00

20 November 2021

Review documents re: TCC document production.

Z Sporn

698.50

20 November 2021

Emails re: preliminary voting results.

C Tuffey

0.40

254.00

20 November 2021

Confer with case team re: productions FTP upload and
provide status updates to same (0.5); run and create
multiple sets of searches and provide case team
search results (0.7); run searches and prepare
document review batches (0.4); prepare document
images and perform quality control assurance (0.4);
reviewer accounts and group permission management
(0.4); run search and PDF exports (0.4); calls (partial)
with case team to clarify duplicate analysis (0.4);
provide document review and production weekend
support (0.7).

T Chen

3.90

1,287.00

21 November 2021

Correspondence re: potential settlement term sheet
(0.3); review and analyze and revise term sheets and
issues re: same (3.6); confer with M. Andolina, B.
Whittman, L. Baccash, and others re: same (2.1);
review materials and prepare for 30(b)(6) depositions
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@2.7).

21 November 2021

Call with G. Kurtz and A. Hammond re: discovery
issues (0.4); follow-up call with A. Hammond re: same
(0.5); call with K. Gluck re: document production (0.2);
draft letter re: production (1.1); revise per comments
from G. Kurtz (0.4); draft production and claw back
email (0.4); correspond with J. Thomas re: documents
(0.1).

S Hershey

3.10

3,301.50

21 November 2021

Finalize and review revised drafts of plan settlement
agreements (2.4); review summary chart for same
(0.4); draft and revise same for board call (0.3); confer
with L. Baccash and R. Gorsich re: same (1.6);
teleconference with J. Lauria, A. Azer, M. Andolina re:
same (0.4); review and revise TDP release forms (0.7);
confer with L. Baccash and D. Kim re: same (0.4).

D Kim

6.20

6,479.00

21 November 2021

Research re: Insurer terms (0.4); draft summary of
Insurer terms for J. Lauria (0.4).

B Warner

0.80

776.00

21 November 2021

Review of BSA minutes and presentations for TDP
discussions (0.8); emails with team re: D. Desai and A.
Schuler document reviews for deposition preparation
(0.2).

J Thomas

1.00

920.00

21 November 2021

Collate documents from review re: Hunt and Whittman
depositions (1.0); draft and distribute instructions to the
re: deposition preparation and document review (0.5);
emails with document review team re: same (0.3).

R Demoulin

1.80

1,503.00

21 November 2021

Review documents re: received production from TCC.

T Wiheba

9.80

6,321.00

21 November 2021

Review produced documents re: preparation for TCC
depositions.

J Ho

2.20

1,397.00

21 November 2021

Review and modify chart to compare provisions in the
certain settlement term sheets (2.8); draft and review
the proposed Insurer changes to the draft releases
(2.5).

D Kim

5.30

3,365.50

21 November 2021

Review documents produced by TCC in anticipation of
depositions of TCC witnesses.

M Radek

0.90

571.50

21 November 2021

Analyze and further review re: certain plan settlement
agreement (2.9); further draft and revise analysis re:
same L. Baccash and D. Kim (1.1); emails with L.
Baccash and W&C team re: same (0.2).

D Rivero

4.20

2,667.00

21 November 2021

Review documents re: TCC document review.

L Saber

2.30

1,460.50

22 November 2021

Confer with A. O'Neill, C. Shepherd re: Trust
Distribution Procedures and related documents (1.7);
review materials in advance of witness preparation
(1.2); participate in witness preparation with A. Azer
and team (6.0); correspond with multiple parties
including L. Rizzo, T. Remington, others re: deposition
schedule (0.4); review 30(b)(6) categories (0.4); review
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and revise term sheets and settlement agreements
(2.3).
22 November 2021 Analysis of case law re: trust distribution procedures. J Green 0.40 448.00
22 November 2021 Call with B. Warner re: plan supplement (0.2); call with L Baccash 0.80 840.00

B. Warner and D. Kim re: same (0.6).

22 November 2021 Draft letter to Certain Insurers re: production (0.4); S Hershey 3.40 3,621.00
draft letter to TCC re: 30(b)(6) topics (0.7); attend meet
and confer with Propounding Insurers (0.8); follow-up
call with A. Hammond and A. Azer (0.2); call with A.
Hammond re: TCC deposition topics (0.8); correspond
with J. Celentino re: privilege (0.3); review email from
R. Tiedemann re: TCC deposition (0.2).

22 November 2021 Review revised release languages and provide D Kim 6.50 6,792.50
comments on same (0.6); review revised notice of plan
supplement (0.3); review certain revised plan
supplement documents (1.0); confer with B. Warner
and L. Baccash re: same (0.6); teleconference with
JPM counsel and corporate counsel re: debt
documents (0.3); telephone call with L. Baccash re:
certain settlements and term sheets re: certain plan
parties (0.9); review draft BSA expert reports (1.4);
teleconference with E. Goodman of Brown Rudnick re:
certain chartered organization settlements (0.7); confer
with J. Lauria re: same (0.7).

22 November 2021 Call with C. Binggeli re: plan supplement materials B Warner 5.90 5,723.00
(0.3); call on debt documents with W&C finance team,
JPM counsel and others (0.3); correspond with M.
Wasson re: plan supplement filing (0.1); correspond
with E. Goodman re: plan supplement documents
(0.1); revise plan supplement status tracker re:
updates (0.5); correspond with L. Baccash and D. Kim
re: plan supplement open items (0.2); call with L.
Baccash re: plan supplement and various strategic
matters (0.2); draft and revise plan supplement
documents and disclosures, including D&0O document
(0.9); correspond with C. Binggeli re: plan supplement
matters (0.3); call with L. Baccash and D. Kim re: plan
supplement filings and status of all documents (0.6);
correspond with W&C team re: plan supplement
documents status (0.2); correspond with A&M and
WA&C finance team re: plan supplement updates (0.3);
review and manage various case and plan inquiries
(0.2); correspond with W&C team re: various case and
plan inquiries (0.1); review protected parties list (0.1);
draft email update to Omni team re: protected parties
list revision (0.1); review and revise form of leaseback
requirement agreement for plan supplement (1.5);
revise modified fifth amended plan re: case updates
(0.2).

22 November 2021 Calls with deposition teams re: documents for M Jaoude 4.10 3,854.00
depositions (1.1); review documents for deposition
binders and prep for depositions (2.0); create searches
for deposition work teams and provide support (1.0).
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22 November 2021 Confer with A. Hammond re: upcoming fact and expert S Levy
depositions, and chart re: upcoming 30(b)(6)
depositions circulated by S. Hershey (0.5); update
chart to include notes from meeting with A. Hammond
and open items for other team members (1.7); confer
(partial) with W&C team re: A&M expert report (0.5);
emails BSA re: 30(b)(6) topics (0.6); confer with J.
Thomas re: document for B. Whittman deposition (0.2);
review deposition issues (0.6); attend meet and confer
with  propounding insurers re: responses and
objections to Rule 30(b)(6) deposition notice (0.8).

4.90

4,606.00

22 November 2021 Call with I. Popa re: A&M expert documents (0.1); J Thomas
review of documents re: same (0.3); calls with A.
Zegger re: document reviews for deposition
preparation (0.3); call with S. Levy re: J. Hunt and B.
Whittman depositions (0.2); review of documents re:
same (2.0); calls w. R. Tiedemann re: deposition
preparation (0.2); call with A&M re: expert documents
(0.1); call with W&C team re: deposition preparation
(0.5); emails with team re: A. Schuler and D. Desai
deposition preparation (0.5); review of documents re:
same (1.0); review of productions for documents TCC
requested (0.3); call with A&M re: expert documents
(0.1); emails with team re: B. Whittman deposition
preparation (0.4).

6.00

5,520.00

22 November 2021 Refine document review protocol re: deposition R Demoulin
preparation (0.5); confer with T. Chen and practice
technology team re: Relativity issues (0.5); correspond
with W&C team re: the Whittman preliminary binder
(0.2); review same (1.0).

2.20

1,837.00

22 November 2021 Review TCC  documents for issues and N McGuire
responsiveness.

8.10

6,763.50

22 November 2021 Conduct review and issue-code TCC discovery N Thompson
documents.

3.50

2,555.00

22 November 2021 Review TCC documents re: deposition preparation. ZLu

0.80

516.00

22 November 2021 Review documents re: received production from TCC. T Wiheba

11.10

7,159.50

22 November 2021 Review TCC emails re: preparation for depositions. M Brock-Smith

3.90

2,476.50

22 November 2021 Review produced documents re: preparation for TCC J Ho
depositions.

2.80

1,778.00

22 November 2021 Analyze terms in Term Sheet and Plan re: plan D Kim
discussions.

0.40

254.00

22 November 2021 Document review before Alison Schuler deposition. E Kozakevich

1.80

1,143.00

22 November 2021 Review documents in connection with discovery S Precht
request.

1.50

952.50

22 November 2021 Review documents produced by TCC in anticipation of M Radek
depositions of TCC witnesses.
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22 November 2021

Review and revise re: good faith rider for confirmation
brief (2.4); emails with R. Reed re: same (0.2); review
and revise chart re: TDPs in precedent plans (0.8);
emails with K. Ferrier, R. Reed, and L. Mezei re: same
(0.2); research re: precedent confirmation briefs and
TDPs (0.6); emails with D. Hirshorn re: pulling
precedent confirmation briefs (0.1); emails with W&C
team re: precedent confirmation briefs (0.1).

D Rivero

4.40

2,794.00

22 November 2021

Conduct document review in preparation for TCC
deposition.

R Rogers de Castilho

4.40

2,794.00

22 November 2021

Review documents re: BSA board member deposition
preparation.

L Saber

4.70

2,984.50

22 November 2021

Review documents produced by the TCC re:
deposition preparation.

S Saboungi

1.50

952.50

22 November 2021

Review documents re: D. Desai and A. Schuler
depositions.

Z Sporn

4.20

2,667.00

22 November 2021

Emails to parties in interest re: preliminary plan voting
results.

C Tuffey

0.10

63.50

22 November 2021

Manage reviewer accounts and group permission
settings (0.4); calls (partial) with W&C team re:
received production import workflow (0.4); run
searches and PDF exports (0.4); provide attorneys
document review support and trainings (0.4).

T Chen

1.60

528.00

23 November 2021

Participate in conference call re: plan supplement with
J. Lauria, L. Baccash, others (0.5); prepare for and
participate in Gallagher settlement conference (1.2);
follow up re: same (0.3); attend deposition preparation
meeting with T. Allen, A. Azer, C. Shepherd, others
(3.4); multiple calls with L. Baccash, A. Azer, D. Kim,
C. Shepherd, others re: deposition and plan support
issues (1.6); call with C. Shepherd re: 30(b)(6) issues
(0.5); conference call with P. Anker, L. Baccash, others
re: plan issues (0.3); review and revise insurer
settlement agreement (0.8); review and revise
settlement term sheets (1.5); confer with C. Shepherd,
D. Evens, others re: Bates White report (0.3).

R Gorsich

10.40

12,480.00

23 November 2021

Review of case law re: trust distribution procedures
(1.3); research re: scope of plan discovery and
privilege issues (2.8); review of record and case law
re: draft document agreement (2.4).

J Green

6.50

7,280.00

23 November 2021

Call with J. Lauria, B. Warner and others re: plan
supplement (0.4); call with M. Linder re: same (0.1).

L Baccash

0.50

525.00

23 November 2021

Review and analyze certain plan terms (0.3); email to
L. Baccash, R. Gorsich, and D. Kim re: same (0.5).

M Linder

0.80

840.00

23 November 2021

Attend Todd Allen deposition prep.

S Hershey

0.50

532.50

23 November 2021

Teleconference with L. Baccash and J. Lauria re: plan
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supplement (0.4); review and revise various plan
supplement documents (2.0); confer with L. Baccash
and B. Warner re: same (0.5); review continuing
research re: confirmation (0.5).

23 November 2021

Review and code documents to identify materials for
depositions.

23 November 2021

Revise plan supplement documents (0.5); correspond
with D. Rivero re: tasks on same (0.2); draft response
to client re: bylaws and plan questions (0.3); call with
L. Baccash and D. Kim re: bylaws and plan
supplement document revisions (0.3); call with client,
B. Whittman, C. Binggeli and C. Adler re: plan
supplement document questions and revisions (0.6);
extensive revisions to plan supplement documents
(1.3); and emails with W&C team and various parties
in interest re: follow-up to plan supplement documents
(0.3); analyze plan re: contract rejection/assumption
mechanics (0.2); draft email to C. Binggeli re: strategy
on same (0.2); review and manage document request
from Bates White re: expert report (0.3); call with A.
Hammond re: confirmation matters (0.1); extensive
revisions to plan supplement materials (0.9); emails
with various parties in interest and W&C team on plan
supplement and related matters (0.5).

23 November 2021

Attend deposition (6.8); review and gather documents
for upcoming depositions (2.3).

23 November 2021

Confer with client and W&C team re: fact and expert
depositions (0.6); confer with W&C team re: same
(0.3); legal research and analysis re: settlement
approval, prejudgment interest, and substantial
contribution (1.5); email and phone correspondence
with team re: same, chart re: upcoming 30(b)(6)
depositions, and next steps (0.5); update chart to
include notes from meeting with A. Hammond and
open items for other team members (0.3); confer with
re: A&M expert report (0.1); review deposition issues
outline circulated by R. Tiedemann (0.4); review A&M
expert report (0.4); conduct document review (1.0).

23 November 2021

Call with W&C team re: Local Council asset review
(0.5); emails with team re: same (0.5); call with A.
Hammond and S. levy re: re J. Hunt and B. Whittman
deposition preparation (1.0); calls with S. Hershey re:
deposition preparation (0.2); call with A. Hammond re:
A&M expert documents (0.1); call with S. Levy re: J.
Hunt and B. Whittman depositions (0.8); calls with M.
Jaoude re: deposition preparation (0.5); calls with R.
Demoulin re: deposition binders (0.4); emails with
team re: A. Schuler and D. Desai deposition
preparation (1.0); review of documents re: same (1.0);
emails with team re: B. Whittman deposition
preparation (0.5); review of documents re: same (0.5).

23 November 2021

Confer with practice technology team re: edits to
search re: deposition preparation (0.5); review
additional documents and collect new documents re:
binder preparation (4.0); finalize binder for Schuler
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deposition (0.5).

23 November 2021 Review TCC  documents for issues and N McGuire 8.00 6,680.00
responsiveness.

23 November 2021 Conduct responsiveness and issue-coding review of N Thompson 6.40 4,672.00
documents received from TCC, in preparation for TCC
depositions (6.2); liaise with discovery supervisors re:
questions in support of same (0.2).

23 November 2021 Review TCC documents re: deposition preparation. ZLu 2.60 1,677.00

23 November 2021 Review documents re: received production from TCC. T Wiheba 10.80 6,966.00

23 November 2021 Review TCC emails re: preparation for depositions M Brock-Smith 5.60 3,556.00
(2.6); search Relativity for documents re: review of
assets (3.0).

23 November 2021 Tag relevant documents for deposition. L Curtis 5.30 3,365.50

23 November 2021 Review produced documents re: preparation for TCC J Ho 2.00 1,270.00
depositions.

23 November 2021 Legal research re: matters related to request for an D Kim 2.80 1,778.00
examiner and to designate votes in precedent chapter
11 case.

23 November 2021 Document review of TCC before deposition. E Kozakevich 3.40 2,159.00

23 November 2021 Review documents produced by TCC in anticipation of M Radek 2.60 1,651.00
depositions of TCC witnesses.

23 November 2021 Review and revise good faith rider for the confirmation D Rivero 2.70 1,714.50
brief.

23 November 2021 Review produced documents in preparation for TCC R Rogers de Castilho 2.50 1,587.50
deposition.

23 November 2021 Review documents re: BSA board member deposition L Saber 3.40 2,159.00
preparation (1.5); review documents re: A&M
deposition preparation (1.9).

23 November 2021 Review documents produced by the TCC re: S Saboungi 2.00 1,270.00
deposition preparation.

23 November 2021 Review documents re: A. Schuler depositions (1.0);  Z Sporn 3.80 2,413.00
review documents re: TCC document production (2.8).

23 November 2021 Modify review coding panel and batch views (0.5); T Chen 2.10 693.00
provide document review support and training to
attorneys (0.4); manage production PDF exports and
data transfer (0.7); organize and clean up source data
folders (0.5).

24 November 2021 Work with L. Baccash and D. Kim re: term sheet R Gorsich 11.20 13,440.00

revisions (2.7); review and analyze materials re: same
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including interplay between potential settlement
agreements and Trust Distribution Procedures (2.5);
conference call with A. Azer, B. Whittman, others re:
insurance issues (1.1); review and analyze expert
issues and prepare for call re: same (0.8); conference
call with C. Shepherd and D. Evans re: expert report
(1.0); conference call with M. Stoner, A. Azer, M.
Andolina, others re: deposition issues (1.6); call to D.
Evans re: expert report (0.5); review correspondence
re: TCC discovery dispute (0.3); review materials re:
chartered organization settlement (0.7).

24 November 2021

Research and review of case law re: trust distribution
procedures and related discovery (4.3); research re:
cooperation agreement (1.4).

J Green

5.70

6,384.00

24 November 2021

Call with C. Green and A. Azer re: insurer stipulations
(0.5); review emails for Desai and Schuler deposition
preparation (2.3); call with A. Hammond and S. Levy
re: deposition tracker (0.5); call with G. Kurtz, A.
Hammond and A. Azer re: deposition topics (1.6); call
with G. Kurtz, A. Hammond and M. Andolina re:
deposition topics (1.0); call with M. Jaoude and J.
Thomas (0.3); review and revise outline for deposition
prep (0.7); call with A. Hammond re: next steps with
discovery (0.6).

S Hershey

7.50

7,987.50

24 November 2021

Review revised Insurer settlement agreement (0.9);
review revised TCJC settlement agreement (0.8);
confer with L. Baccash and R. Gorsich re: plan
settlements (0.5); review revised DST agreement (0.4);
teleconference with MNAT and D. Drier re: same (0.4).

D Kim

3.00

3,135.00

24 November 2021

Review and code documents to identify materials for
deposition.

T Cull

5.30

5,247.00

24 November 2021

Correspond with C. Adler and A. Simon re: plan
supplement document summaries (0.2); call with L.
Baccash re: objection to TCC motion and plan
supplement matters (0.5).

B Warner

0.70

679.00

24 November 2021

Prepare for depositions and gather documents for
relevant  witnesses  (5.1); review  discovery
correspondence and draft replies (0.8); search
documents to produce for responses (2.6).

M Jaoude

8.50

7,990.00

24 November 2021

Draft lists of Rule 30(b)(6) deposition topics covered by
A. Hammond's witnesses (1.5); write draft emails to
30(b)(6) witnesses re: deposition topics and next steps
(1.9); Call A&M re: expert report (0.5).

S Levy

3.90

3,666.00

24 November 2021

Draft confirmation brief.

T Smith

0.70

658.00

24 November 2021

Calls with W&C team re: deposition documents for J.
Hunt and B. Whittman (1.0); call with S. Hershey re:
deposition binders A. Schuler and D. Desai (0.5); call
with S. Hershey and M. Jaoude re: TCC deposition
(0.3); call with S. Levy re: J. Hunt and B. Whittman
depositions (0.4); calls with mail room re: binder
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delivery (0.2); calls with M. Jaoude re: J. Hunt
document search (0.8); calls with R. Tiedemann re:
depositions (0.2); emails with team re: Steptoe
Johnson review of Local Council assets (0.5); review
of document support re: same (0.5); emails with team
re: documents for 30(b)(6) topics (1.0); review of
documents re: same (2.0); emails with A&M and W&C
re: A&M expert documents (0.5); review of documents
re: same (0.5); emails with team re: D. Desai and A.
Schuler binders for deposition preparation (1.0); review
of document re: same (0.5); emails with IT team re:
document productions (0.7).

24 November 2021

Finalize deposition binders (1.0); confer with W&C
team re: same (0.3); add documents to claw back list
(0.5).

R Demoulin

1.80

1,503.00

24 November 2021

Review TCC  documents for issues and
responsiveness (3.0); review correspondence re: TCC
document production team in preparation for further
document review (0.8).

N McGuire

3.80

3,173.00

24 November 2021

Review documents re: received production from TCC.

T Wiheba

12.10

7,804.50

24 November 2021

Search relativity for documents re: review of assets.

M Brock-Smith

3.50

2,222.50

24 November 2021

Conduct document review in preparation for offensive
discovery (1.0); conduct document review of relevant
documents to assemble for defensive deposition
preparation (8.1).

L Curtis

9.10

5,778.50

24 November 2021

Review produced documents re: preparation for TCC
depositions.

J Ho

4.10

2,603.50

24 November 2021

Document review of TCC before deposition.

E Kozakevich

698.50

24 November 2021

Review documents produced by TCC in anticipation of
depositions of TCC witnesses.

M Radek

2.20

1,397.00

24 November 2021

Review produced documents in preparation for TCC
deposition (6.1); search for produced documents
discussing scouting census in preparation for Hunt
deposition (2.5).

R Rogers de Castilho

2.60

1,651.00

24 November 2021

Review documents re: A&M deposition preparation.

L Saber

4.40

2,794.00

24 November 2021

Review of documents related to target search terms.

K Schroeder

1.30

825.50

24 November 2021

Review documents re: TCC document production
(1.4); review documents pertaining to specific
document requests re: B. Whittman deposition
preparation (1.8).

Z Sporn

3.20

2,032.00

24 November 2021

Return call re: chartered organization inquiry (0.2); call
re: same (0.2); email re: same (0.1).

C Tuffey

0.50

317.50

24 November 2021

Conduct quality control check re: newly loaded
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received productions, OCR searchable text, and
update keyword index (0.4); received production
download, unzip, validate, confirm with providing party
re: data discrepancy and bates gap, and stage (0.7);
load data into review platform, update review fields,
and prepare documents for review (0.7); update data
tracking log; provide case team status updates and
data summary (0.5); export documents in PDF format
as backup (0.5); modify review coding panel and batch
views (0.5); run search, export documents in PDF
format, and wupload to FTP (0.4); FTP user
management (0.5); multiple new datasets download,
validate, and stage for processing (0.4); multiple
datasets  processing, monitor processing, run
deduplication, and export deduped documents (0.4);
import data into review platform and prepare for review
(0.7); create production searches, run coding conflict
checks, create production set, run production (0.4).

25 November 2021

Correspond with G. Kurtz, S. Hershey, C. Shepherd,
others re: expert report and discovery issues.

R Gorsich

0.70

840.00

25 November 2021

Research and review of case law re: trust distribution
procedures and related discovery (2.2); draft summary
re: research (1.3).

J Green

3.50

3,920.00

25 November 2021

Draft letter to S. Rudman re: depositions (1.4); review
documents  for  deposition  preparation  (0.8);
correspond with G. Kurtz and K. Gluck re: board
minutes (0.4); correspond with A. Hammond re:
discovery issues (0.6); review and revise witness chart

(1.1).

S Hershey

4.30

4,579.50

25 November 2021

Provide support for discovery correspondence dispute
and pull relevant documents.

M Jaoude

2.50

2,350.00

25 November 2021

Review notes from call with A. Hammond re: upcoming
depositions, A&M expert report, and next steps (0.5);
consider re: Rule 30(b)(6) deposition topics, A&M
expert report, and next steps (0.3).

S Levy

0.80

752.00

25 November 2021

Draft confirmation brief.

T Smith

1.50

1,410.00

25 November 2021

Emails with team re: J. Hunt documents (0.2); emails
with team re: documents produced (0.1); review of
same (0.3); emails with team re: TCC deposition (0.1).

J Thomas

0.70

644.00

25 November 2021

Review documents re: received production from TCC.

T Wiheba

5.20

3,354.00

26 November 2021

Comment on plan supplement documents.

J Lauria (Boelter)

1.00

1,350.00

26 November 2021

Work with A. Azer, D. Kim, L. Baccash re: settlement
term sheet revisions and issues (1.5); participate in
conference call re: BSA Term sheet with M. Andolina,
E. Martin (0.4); review and analyze witness and
discovery issues (0.8); participate in conference call
with A. Azer, G. Kurtz, A. Hammond, others re:
discovery issues (1.1); participate in conference call re:
litigation issues with S. Hershey, E. Martin, others
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(1.1).

26 November 2021 Research and review of case law re: trust distribution J Green
procedures and related discovery.

2.70

3,024.00

26 November 2021 Call with G. Kurtz and A. Azer re: deposition prep S Hershey
(0.9); call with J. Lauria and G. Kurtz re: discovery
status (1.1); review and revise letter to TCC re: meet-
and-confer (1.2); review and revise letter to
Propounding Insurers re: meet-and-confer (1.4);
review and revise chart re: witnesses (0.4); call with R.
Gorsich re: discovery status (0.3); calls with A.
Hammond re: discovery issues (0.8); correspond with
M. Jaoude and J. Thomas re: discovery (0.5); draft
letter to K. Marrkand re: document production (0.7);
review productions (0.4); review and revise letter to S.
Rudman (0.8).

8.50

9,052.50

26 November 2021 Strategize for plan amendments (0.6); review revised D Kim
plan supplement documents (0.9).

1.50

1,567.50

26 November 2021 Call with K. Gluck re: case matters (0.1); emails with B Warner
various parties including UCC counsel and A&M re:
plan supplement document matters (0.3).

0.40

388.00

26 November 2021 Review documents for claw back and search for M Jaoude
documents for production (4.1); provide documents for
deposition preparation materials (2.1).

6.20

5,828.00

26 November 2021 Draft confirmation brief (1.1); review and analyze T Smith
chapter 11 plan and disclosure statement (0.8).

1.90

1,786.00

26 November 2021 Call with W&C team re: Insurer/TDP communications, J Thomas
TCC deposition, claw back/redacting documents (0.4);
call with S. Hershey and M. Jaoude re: TCC deposition
and Insurer documents (0.3); call with R. Tiedemann
re: J. Hunt deposition (0.2); call with team re: 30(B)(6)
witness chart (1.0); review of documents for TCC
30(b)(6) deposition (1.5); draft deposition outline for
same (1.0); emails with team re: J. Hunt deposition
documents (0.7); review of documents re: same (0.8);
emails with team re: B. Whittman deposition
documents and financial projections (0.5); review of
documents re: same (0.3); emails with team re: client
emails (0.3); review documents re: same (0.4).

7.40

6,808.00

26 November 2021 Collate documents re: financial projections in N McGuire
preparation for B. Whittman deposition.

6.10

5,093.50

26 November 2021 Search relativity for docs re: review of assets. M Brock-Smith

1.20

762.00

26 November 2021 Compare definitions of defined terms from certain D Kim
settlement agreement and plan.

0.50

317.50

26 November 2021 Review documents re: BSA board member deposition L Saber
preparation (0.6); review documents re: TCC
deposition preparation (0.9); review documents re:
A&M deposition preparation (2.2).
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26 November 2021 Review documents re: TCC document production Z Sporn 2.80 1,778.00

(1.0); review documents re: BSA financial documents
(1.8).

26 November 2021 Download, validate, and stage new datasets for T Chen 3.70 1,221.00

processing (0.4); manage data processing, monitor
processing, run deduplication, and export deduped
documents (0.5); import data into review platform and
prepare for review (0.6); run and create search and
provide case team search results (0.5); confer with
case team re: new production (0.5); perform
production data quality checks (0.5); provide document
review/production holiday support (0.7).

27 November 2021 Work with L. Baccash, D. Kim, A. Azer and others to R Gorsich 10.20 12,240.00

review and revise settlement term sheets and related
materials (4.6); review and analyze documents re:
same (1.2); revise settlement agreements (1.5); confer
with G. Kurtz, S. Hershey, A. Azer others re: 30(b)(6)
witness and discovery issues (1.7); confer with S.
Hershey re: same (0.4); review materials and research
re: same (0.8).

27 November 2021 Review of case law re: trust distribution procedures J Green 2.20 2,464.00
and plan discovery.

27 November 2021 Call with B. Warner and D. Kim re: plan supplement L Baccash 1.80 1,890.00
(0.4); review and revise resolutions re: same (0.2);
review and revise summaries re: same (0.2); review
and revise various plan supplement documents (1.0).

27 November 2021 Correspond with G. Kurtz, A. Hammond and A. Azer S Hershey 3.10 3,301.50
re: deposition topics and witnesses (2.7); correspond
with R. Gorsich and J. Thomas re: documents (0.4).

27 November 2021 Teleconference with B. Warner and L. Baccash re: D Kim 1.40 1,463.00
status of plan supplement documents (0.4); review
revised drafts of certain plan supplement documents
(0.6); review and revise notice for same (0.4).

27 November 2021 Review documents produced by the TCC for T Cull 0.80 792.00
scheduled deposition.

27 November 2021 Call with L. Baccash and D. Kim re: plan supplement B Warner 0.70 679.00
filings and status of all documents (0.3); email Omni
team re: plan supplement link (0.1); correspond with K.
Nownes re: plan supplement procedures and filing
(0.3).

27 November 2021 Review documents re: insurer communications for M Jaoude 4.30 4,042.00
supplemental production (2.1); call with team re:
depositions  (0.7); review documents for TCC
deposition prep (1.5).

27 November 2021 Review, revise, and edit A&M expert report (1.7); S Levy 2.20 2,068.00
confer with A&M and W&C teams re: same (0.5).

27 November 2021 Call with S. Levy re: deposition preparation (0.4); call ~ J Thomas 4.20 3,864.00
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with A. Zegger re: J. Hunt review (0.1); emails with
team re: Steptoe review of Local Council assets (0.5);
emails with team re: TCC document review (0.5);
review of documents re: same (1.0); emails with team
re: financial projections (0.5); review of documents re:
same (1.0); emails with team re: J. Hunt deposition
documents (0.2).

27 November 2021

Collate documents re: financial projections in
preparation for B. Whittman deposition.

N McGuire

6.20

5,177.00

27 November 2021

Search relativity for docs re: review of assets.

M Brock-Smith

1.80

1,143.00

27 November 2021

Review documents for relevancy re: defensive
deposition (4.5); internal conference with J. Thomas
re: document review progress for defensive deposition
(0.2).

L Curtis

4.70

2,984.50

27 November 2021

Review documents in connection with discovery
request.

S Precht

1.50

952.50

27 November 2021

Review documents re: A&M deposition preparation.

L Saber

2.70

1,714.50

27 November 2021

Review documents re: deposition preparation.

Z Sporn

0.70

444.50

27 November 2021

Communicate with team re: received production
document information (0.5); provide document
review/production weekend support (0.7).

T Chen

1.20

396.00

28 November 2021

Review and revise settlement term sheets (2.5); review
and analyze mediation communications and
documents (1.8); confer with M. Andolina, J. Lauria,
others re: same (1.0); prepare for and participate in
conference call with client, G. Kurtz, A. Azer, others re:
deposition issues (1.0); review and revise document
agreement (0.8); confer with L. Baccash, S. Hershey,
others re: same (0.5); review Trust Distribution
Procedures releases and confer with L. Baccash, and
others re: same (1.2).

R Gorsich

8.80

10,560.00

28 November 2021

Review of case law re: trust distribution procedures
and related discovery.

J Green

1.20

1,344.00

28 November 2021

Call with R. Gorsich, A. Azer, R. Tiedemann and
others re: documents agreement.

L Baccash

0.30

315.00

28 November 2021

Call with client and A. Azer re: depositions (0.9); call
with S. Rudman re: propounding insurer deposition
topics and prep for same (0.7); email to G. Kurtz and
R. Gorsich re: same (0.4); review document production
(1.2).

S Hershey

3.20

3,408.00

28 November 2021

Further revise plan supplement (0.6); correspond with
applicable parties re: same (0.4); teleconference with
L. Baccash re: plan supplement exhibit descriptions
(0.8).
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28 November 2021 Correspond with L. Baccash and D. Kim re: plan B Warner 0.60 582.00

supplement documents and summary (0.2); revise
plan supplement document summary (0.2); emails with
W&C team re: open items on same (0.2).

28 November 2021 Calls with team re: discovery issues (1.3); review claw M Jaoude 5.30 4,982.00
back documents and revise redactions (2.0); produce
claw back documents and draft letter and privilege log
(1.2); provide documents for discovery
correspondence disputes (0.8).

28 November 2021 Review, revise, and edit A&M expert report (1.9); email S Levy 3.00 2,820.00
correspondence with team re: same (0.4); Consider
strategy re: upcoming depositions, document
production, and next steps (0.3); Confer with counsel
for Propounding Insurers re: 30(b)(6) deposition topics
(0.4).

28 November 2021 Calls with A. Hammond re: B. Whittman deposition J Thomas 9.80 9,016.00
preparation (0.3); calls with S. Hershey re: deposition
preparation (0.4); calls with R. Tiedemann re:
deposition preparation (0.3); calls with M. Jaoude re:
deposition preparation (0.5); call with R. Demoulin re:
deposition preparation (0.7); draft TCC deposition
outline (2.0); emails with team re: same (0.5); review
documents re: same (1.5); review B. Whittman
documents for deposition preparation (2.8); emails with
team re: same (0.5); emails with team re: Steptoe
Local Council assets review (0.3).

28 November 2021 Collect responsive documents re:  Whittman R Demoulin 5.00 4,175.00
deposition.
28 November 2021 Review, describe and organize iterations of financial N McGuire 1.30 1,085.50

data in preparation for B. Whittman deposition.

28 November 2021 Pull certain documents for use in deposition H Rubashkin 0.70 511.00
preparation.

28 November 2021 Review documents in preparation for Schuler S Saboungi 2.00 1,270.00
deposition.

28 November 2021 Provide production instructions to team and perform T Chen 2.60 858.00

production data quality checks (0.7); provide document
review/production weekend support (0.7); run and
create search and provide case team search results
(0.5); manage multiple claw back productions (0.7).

29 November 2021 Conference with team, L. Baccash, D. Kim, A. Azer, R Gorsich 9.00 10,800.00
and others re: mediation issues and plan supplement
(1.2); correspondence with A. Azer and others re:
confirmation deposition issues (0.2); conference with
L. Baccash, D. Kim, B. Warner re: timeline issues
(0.3); confer with A. Azer, R. Tiedemann, and others
re: Document Agreement and revise same (0.9);
review and revise Plan Supplement materials (3.2);
review and revise term sheets and settlement
agreements (2.8); confer with S. Hershey, A. Azer, and
others re: depositions (0.4).
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29 November 2021

Review of case law re: trust distribution procedures
and plan discovery.

3,584.00

29 November 2021

Review and revise plan supplement materials (3.5);
call with R. Tiedemann, A. Azer, R. Gorsich and others
re: document agreement for plan supplement filing
(0.5); multiple calls with B. Warner re: plan supplement
(0.4); multiple calls with D. Kim re: same (0.3).

4,935.00

29 November 2021

Emails with J. Morton re: local council reserved rights
(0.2); emails with L. Baccash and B. Warner re: same
(0.2): review and comment on revised plan draft from
B. Warner (0.5); review certain plan supplement
documents (0.3); emails with E. England re:
Foundation Loan and confirmation order (0.2); emails
with L. Baccash re: Insurer settlement terms (0.3).

1,785.00

29 November 2021

Prepare for and attend meet and confer with B. Levine
and K. Brown re: discovery (0.9); attend team call re:
discovery timeline (0.4); correspond with M. Jaoude
and J. Thomas re: document production (0.8);
correspond with M. Jaoude re: document production
(0.6); correspond with A. Hammond re: discovery
issues (0.4); draft responses to Catholics and
Methodists (2.3); correspond with A. Hammond re:
same (0.3); review and redact D. Desai notes for
production (1.7).

7,881.00

29 November 2021

Review and finalize plan supplement documents (2.9);
confer with L. Baccash and B. Warner re: same (0.7);
call with Coalition, FCR re: certain plan settlements
(0.5).

4,284.50

29 November 2021

Call with L. Baccash re: plan supplement and case
management matters (0.5); call with Coalition and
W&C team on document agreement and other plan
supplement documents (0.1); call with L. Baccash re:
plan supplement and plan revisions and open items
(0.2); revise plan supplement documents re: client
comments (0.5); revise draft of plan re: comments from
multiple parties (1.6); emails with L. Baccash, D. Kim
and M. Wasson re: plan supplement (0.2); extensive
emails with A&M, W&C team, parties in interest, Omni
and MNAT teams re: plan supplement documents and
filings (2.7).

5,626.00

29 November 2021

Attend Chartered Organization deposition as Debtor
representative (5.1); redact documents for production
relating to deposition and expert materials (4.0).

8,554.00

29 November 2021

Review, revise, edit, and provide comments for
updated expert report circulated by A&M (2.2); email
correspondence with A&M re: updated expert report
(0.5); research re: TCC's Rule 30(b)(6) notice and
witness chart (0.2); confer with for A. Hammond re:
same (0.6).

3,290.00

29 November 2021

Draft confirmation brief (1.0); correspond and
telephone conference with R. Boone re: confirmation
issues (0.7); review plan of reorganization and
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disclosure re: information for confirmation brief (1.1).

29 November 2021

Finalize Schuler and Whittman deposition binders
(2.0); review documents re: Hunt deposition binder
(2.0).

R Demoulin

4.00

3,340.00

29 November 2021

Pull certain documents for use in deposition
preparation for BSA witness.

H Rubashkin

2.00

1,460.00

29 November 2021

Review documents for relevancy for defensive
deposition (0.7); internal correspondence with A.
Zegger, R. Demoulin, J. Thomas, and others re:
preparation for defensive deposition (0.3).

L Curtis

1.00

635.00

29 November 2021

Draft ballot validation notice (2.5); compare revised
TDP releases against current draft of TDP releases
(0.3).

D Kim

2.80

1,778.00

29 November 2021

Review and elevate documents in preparation for
deposition of J. Hunt.

M Radek

3.20

2,032.00

29 November 2021

Emails with R. Boone re: confirmation brief rider (0.2);
analyze and review R. Boone's edits to same (0.8).

D Rivero

1.00

635.00

29 November 2021

Review documents re: A&M deposition preparation.

L Saber

3.60

2,286.00

29 November 2021

Review documents and correspondence with A.
Zegger re: deposition preparation for J. Hunt.

Z Sporn

0.70

444.50

29 November 2021

Research re: proofs of claim for J. Thomas.

C Tuffey

0.30

190.50

29 November 2021

Download, validate, and stage new datasets for
processing (0.4); data processing, monitor processing,
run deduplication, and export deduped documents
(0.4); provide document review support, and PDF
export instructions (0.4); run and create searches and
provide case team search results (0.4); manage
reviewer accounts (0.5); create multiple sets of
productions, run coding conflict checks, -create
production sets, run production bates stamps, and
export production data (0.4).

T Chen

2.50

825.00

30 November 2021

Emails with W&C team re: voting data.

J Lauria (Boelter)

1.00

1,350.00

30 November 2021

Review and revise term sheet, settlement agreements
and related materials (1.7); review and revise materials
for Plan Supplement filings (4.2); prepare for and
participate in T. Allen and B. Griggs witness
preparation (5.3).

R Gorsich

11.20

13,440.00

30 November 2021

Review of case law re: trust distribution procedures
and plan discovery.

J Green

3.90

4,368.00

30 November 2021

Review and revise materials for Plan Supplement
filings, including settlement agreements (3.5); review
and revise materials for Plan Supplement filings,
including document agreement (1.0); review and revise
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materials for Plan Supplement filings, including
settlements and corporate documents (1.0); review
and revise materials for Plan Supplement filings,
including notice and related filings (1.5); call with K.
Quinn and others re: same (0.2); call with E. Goodman
re: same (0.2); multiple calls with B. Warner re: same
(0.5); multiple calls with D. Kim re: same (0.5); multiple
calls with J. Lauria re: same (0.2); call with M. Parrish
and A. Goldberg re: same (0.2).

30 November 2021

Correspond with A. Hammond and J. Ryan re:
discovery issues (1.1); review and revise deposition
topic chart (0.7); call with M. Andolina re: expert report
(0.3); calls with J. Celentino and M. Jaoude re:
privilege (0.3); review documents for redactions for
privilege (1.7); correspond with M. Jaoude re:
documents in production set (0.7).

30 November 2021

Review revisions to Insurer settlement (1.0);
teleconference with R. Gorsich, L. Baccash, and A.
Azer re: same (0.6); confer with C. Adler re: plan
supplement documents (0.2); teleconference with L.
Baccash and B. Warner re: plan supplement status
updates (0.5); review draft debtors' expert report and
certain confirmation-related issues (0.7); review and
revise TCJC settlement agreement (0.6);
teleconference with TCJC counsel re: same (0.4);
finalize other plan supplement documents (4.4);
teleconference with Insurer and Coalition re: Insurer
settlement (0.5).

30 November 2021

Call with L. Baccash and D. Kim re: plan supplement
and various case matters (0.7); correspond with L.
Baccash re: plan supplement documents (0.1);
correspond with Omni team and L. Baccash and D.
Kim re: plan supplement notice (0.1); call with L.
Baccash and D. Kim re: plan supplement filings and
status (0.1); correspond with Morris Nichols and Omni
re: plan supplement noticing (0.2).

30 November 2021

Draft email to Ad Hoc Committee of Local Councils
counsel re: Local Council contribution exhibit revisions
for plan supplement filing (0.3); revise and incorporate
comments and finalize plan supplement exhibits (25)
for filing (5.9); call with M. Levy re: Local Council
contribution exhibit revisions (0.1); review and revise
plan supplement notice re: comments (0.6); call with E.
Goodman, L. Baccash and D. Kim re: plan supplement
documents status (0.2); correspond with W&C team,
Omni and A&M re: plan supplement documents for
filing (0.1).

30 November 2021

Attend deposition as Debtor Representative (5.5);
produce clawback documents and revise redactions
(1.2); redact documents for board member productions
(0.7); conduct deposition preparation for Debtor
deponents (2.3).

30 November 2021

Legal research re: A&M expert report (1.1); revise
A&M report (1.2); provide comments re: same (0.8);
review and input A. Hammond’s comments to same
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(0.6); review Sugden deposition transcript (0.7).

30 November 2021

Review documents re: Schuler deposition matters
(1.0); review pulled documents for privilege and flag
documents for the team (1.2).

R Demoulin

2.20

1,837.00

30 November 2021

Document review and analysis re:
restricted/unrestricted assets.

L Quinn

6.50

4,745.00

30 November 2021

Compare further revised TDP releases version against
current draft (0.5); legal research re: claim
classification (3.4).

D Kim

3.90

2,476.50

30 November 2021

Legal research re: good faith plan objections (2.3);
legal research re: precedent mass tort confirmation
briefs (0.8); legal research re: good faith in chapter 11
cases (1.1); revise confirmation brief rider re: good
faith (1.9).

D Rivero

6.10

3,873.50

30 November 2021

Review documents re: same.

L Saber

2.50

1,687.50

30 November 2021

Review production from BSA to identify documentation
re: BSA assets.

N Swire

2.10

1,333.50

30 November 2021

Run searches and export documents in PDF format
(0.4); upload documents to FTP (0.5); run/create
search and provide case team search results (0.4);
create production searches, run coding conflict checks,
create production set, run production (0.4); provide
attorneys document review support (0.4); coordinate
and provide instructions for team members to process
new data (0.5); export production documents in PDF
format (0.4).

T Chen

3.00

990.00

SUBTOTAL: Chapter 11 Plan Matters

2,376.50

1,949,231.00

Communication with Client

1 November 2021

Attend update call with client.

J Lauria (Boelter)

0.50

675.00

1 November 2021

Attend office conferences at BSA HQ with client re:
youth protection issues and materials for Survivor
Working Group and update re: same (3.7); prepare for
and attend National Executive Board and National
Executive Committee meetings with client (1.5); emails
(0.2) and phone conferences (0.3) with BSA team re:
same.

M Andolina

5.70

7,410.00

1 November 2021

Videoconference with Client, J. Lauria, M. Andolina, B.
Whittman, E. Martin, and A. Azer re: strategic matters.

M Linder

0.20

210.00

2 November 2021

Attend office conferences at BSA HQ with client re:
bankruptcy strategy and youth protection issues (3.0);
provide client update re: same (0.5).

M Andolina

3.50

4,550.00

3 November 2021

Update call with client (0.5); attend call with BSA
government relations team (0.5); attend call with client
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and M. Linder re: governance (0.5).
3 November 2021 Videoconference with Client, J. Lauria, M. Andolina, E. M Linder 1.20 1,260.00
Martin, A. Azer, and B. Whittman re: strategic matters
(0.3); further videoconference with Client and J. Lauria
re: same (0.9).
4 November 2021 Telephone call with Client re: solicitation and discovery M Linder 0.50 525.00
issues (0.3); review and respond to email from Client
re: local council inquiry (0.2).
5 November 2021 Attend client update call (1.0); follow-up phone M Andolina 1.80 2,340.00
conferences with W&C team re: same (0.5); follow up
emails re: same (0.3).
8 November 2021 Videoconference with Client re: strategy (0.4); M Linder 0.50 525.00
telephone call with Client re: solicitation matters (0.1).
8 November 2021 Create PowerPoint Presentation for upcoming meeting L Karchmer 0.80 508.00
with survivors coalition.
10 November 2021 Videoconference with Client, G. Kurtz, M. Andolina, A. M Linder 1.00 1,050.00
Azer, and B. Whittman re: strategic matters.
15 November 2021 Videoconference with Client re: strategy. M Linder 0.50 525.00
29 November 2021 Attend client update call. M Andolina 0.50 650.00
SUBTOTAL: Communication with Client 18.20 22,253.00
Corporate Governance and Board Matters
1 November 2021 Prepare for National Executive Committee/National  J Lauria (Boelter) 3.00 4,050.00
Executive Board meeting (1.0); attend National
Executive Committee meeting (1.0); attend National
Executive Board meeting (1.0).
1 November 2021 Review materials for National Executive Committee M Linder 2.90 3,045.00
and National Executive Board meetings (1.2); attend
and present at National Executive Committee meeting
(1.0); attend and present at National Executive Board
meeting (0.7).
1 November 2021 Research re: board resolutions. C Tuffey 2.20 1,397.00
3 November 2021 Review and analyze outline of prospective bylaw M Linder 0.30 315.00
changes.
11 November 2021 Review bylaw amendments. J Lauria (Boelter) 0.90 1,215.00
12 November 2021 Prepare for National Executive Committee meeting J Lauria (Boelter) 4.00 5,400.00
(2.0); attend National Executive Committee meeting
(2.0).
12 November 2021 Prepare for and attend National Executive Committee M Andolina 1.40 1,820.00
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meeting (1.0); follow-up with BSA team re: same (0.4).
12 November 2021 Attend National Executive Committee meeting by M Linder 0.90 945.00
videoconference.
15 November 2021 Revise National Executive Board and National M Linder 1.60 1,680.00
Executive Committee minutes.
19 November 2021 Review National Executive Committee update. J Lauria (Boelter) 0.20 270.00
21 November 2021 Prepare for National Executive Committee meeting  J Lauria (Boelter) 5.00 6,750.00
(1.0); review and comment on materials for National
Executive Committee (2.0); attend National Executive
Committee pre-call (0.5); attend National Executive
Committee meeting (1.5).
21 November 2021 Call with A. Azer, J. Lauria, E. Martin, B. Whittman re: L Baccash 0.50 525.00
board meeting.
21 November 2021 Correspond with L. Baccash re: board materials. B Warner 0.10 97.00
22 November 2021 Comment on materials for National Executive J Lauria (Boelter) 1.00 1,350.00
Committee.
22 November 2021 Research and draft National Executive Committee B Warner 1.80 1,746.00
resolutions (0.8); draft and revise National Executive
Committee resolutions (0.7); revise National Executive
Committee draft resolutions (0.2); email re: same to
client (0.1).
23 November 2021 Review materials for National Executive Committee. J Lauria (Boelter) 1.00 1,350.00
24 November 2021 Prepare National Executive Committee update. J Lauria (Boelter) 0.50 675.00
27 November 2021 Draft National Executive Board resolutions re: D Kim 1.20 1,254.00
amended plan and plan supplement documents (0.6);
confer with L. Baccash re: same (0.2); review relevant
documents re: same (0.4).
28 November 2021 Draft minutes. J Lauria (Boelter) 1.50 2,025.00
28 November 2021 Review draft update for National Executive Committee. R Gorsich 0.30 360.00
28 November 2021 Review and revise package for board presentation re: L Baccash 1.00 1,050.00
plan issues.
28 November 2021 Revise draft National Executive Board resolutions D Kim 1.90 1,985.50
(0.3); confer with L. Baccash re: same (0.4); assemble
plan supplement packages for board approval (0.8);
discuss with B. Warner re: same (0.4).
28 November 2021 Draft summary of plan supplement documents for B Warner 2.20 2,134.00

board (1.9); revise and distribute draft of plan
supplement documents board summary to J. Lauria
(0.3).
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29 November 2021 Prepare for NEB meeting (3.0); attend NEB meeting J Lauria (Boelter) 4.00 5,400.00
(1.0).

SUBTOTAL: Corporate Governance and Board Matters 39.40 46,838.50

Disclosure Statement

1 November 2021 Review and revise issues related to protected parties L Baccash 2.20 2,310.00

(0.4); correspondence with R. Boone re: same (0.1);
correspondence with M. Meisler, K. Nownes, and
others re: solicitation issues (0.2); call with K. Nownes,
M. Meisler, and J. Paul re: discovery and solicitation
issues (0.7); review and revise correspondence re:
solicitation issues (0.5); call with D. Rivero re:
solicitation issues (0.1); review and revise notice and
declaration re: same (0.2).

1 November 2021 Call with L. Baccash re: notice of solicitation error D Rivero 4.20 2,667.00
(0.1); draft notice of solicitation error (1.9); draft
declaration to same (0.9); draft letter to plaintiff's firm
re: same (1.1); email L. Baccash re: same (0.1);
correspond with C. Tuffey re: same (0.1).

2 November 2021 Multiple calls with B. Warner re: solicitation issues L Baccash 2.90 3,045.00

(0.8); review and comment on voting results (0.5);
multiple, extensive correspondence with Omni team
and B. Warner re: same and related issues (0.6); call
with Zalkin law firm re: solicitation issues (0.3);
correspondence with J. Lauria re: solicitation issues
(0.1); call with M. Meisler and B. Warner re: solicitation
(0.2); call with D. Kim re: solicitation calls (0.1); review
call log re: same (0.1); review letter re: solicitation
issues for Omni (0.2).

2 November 2021 Call with L. Baccash re: solicitation and strategic B Warner 5.10 4,947.00
matters and tasks (0.5); review and approve Spanish
banner ads re: supplemental confirmation noticing
(0.2); review and comment on preliminary voting
results and various solicitation matters (0.4); extensive
correspondence with W&C team re: response to
various solicitation-related inquiries (0.4); call with L.
Baccash re: solicitation matters (0.1); review and
comment on notice of revision to notice of satisfaction
(0.3); further review and comment on revised
preliminary voting results (0.1); correspond with J.
Lauria, M. Andolina, M. Linder, and L. Baccash re:
preliminary voting results reporting (0.3); call with
Omni counsel, S. Hershey and L. Baccash re: proof of
claim discovery matters (0.4); call with L. Baccash re:
solicitation matters (0.3); call with Zalkin counsel and
L. Baccash re: same (0.3); call with L. Baccash and M.
Meisler (in part) re: same (0.3); consider issues re:
master ballot and draft email to M. Linder and L.
Baccash on same (0.3); correspond with Omni team
re: master ballot solicitation matters (0.2); analyze
procedures re: master ballot solicitation matters (0.5);
draft analysis to M. Linder and L. Baccash on same
(0.5).

3 November 2021 Correspondence with J. Lauria re: solicitation issue L Baccash 2.50 2,625.00
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(0.1); draft letter to Zalkin firm re: solicitation (0.5);
review and comment on multiple correspondence from
Omni team and B. Warner (0.5); multiple calls with B.
Warner re: solicitation related issues (0.7); call with M.
Meisler, K. Nownes, and B. Warner re: solicitation
issues (0.7).

3 November 2021 Correspond with M. Andolina, L. Baccash, client and B Warner 4.20 4,074.00
W&C team re: various solicitation and voting matters
(0.3); multiple emails with W&C team and client re:
solicitation package matters (0.3); research and
analyze claims re: solicitation package matters for
client (0.5); review and comment on draft of letter
correspondence to firm re: solicitation matter (0.4);
revise and finalize the same for distribution (0.3);
correspond with W&C team and internal W&C staff re:
chartered organization communications and
distribution email (0.4); further correspondence with
client re: solicitation package matters and voting (0.3);
call with L. Baccash re: various solicitation and voting
issues and matters (0.6); call with L. Baccash, K.
Nownes, and M. Meisler re: solicitation and voting
updates and issues (0.6); research and draft response
to J. Lucas re: solicitation and voting inquiry (0.4);
correspond with TCC re: voting results (0.1).

4 November 2021 Review correspondence from M. Linder re: solicitation L Baccash 0.80 840.00
(0.1); call with B. Warner re: same (0.3); call with M.
Linder re: solicitation, class 6 (0.2); multiple
correspondence with Omni team re: solicitation issues
(0.2).

4 November 2021 Call with L. Baccash re: solicitation matters (0.3); draft B Warner 1.90 1,843.00
and revise various solicitation communications re:
voting claimants and firms (1.6).

5 November 2021 Review voting results and related solicitation issues L Baccash 1.20 1,260.00
(0.5); correspondence with B. Warner and L. Mezei re:
research re: solicitation issues (0.1); call with M.
Meisler and B. Warner re: solicitation issues (0.2); call
with B. Warner re: same (0.3); review correspondence
from M. Meisler, B. Warner, and C. Tuffey re: same
(0.1).

5 November 2021 Review and comment on voting results and B Warner 3.40 3,298.00
correspond with Omni re: other updates (0.8); email
client re: ballot question (0.1); review and comment on
Omni law firm master ballot email update (0.3); call
with L. Baccash and M. Meisler re: voting and
solicitation updates and matters (0.2); call with L.
Baccash re: next steps on same (0.3); review and
comment on preliminary revised voting results from
Omni (0.4); manage sending of solicitation materials to
client and correspond with client on same (0.3); confer
with L. Baccash and C. Tuffey re: preliminary voting
results (0.2); correspond with Omni team re:
solicitation and voting matters (0.3); call with K.
Nownes and M. Meisler re: voting report (0.2);
correspond with Omni team and TCC counsel and
Coalition counsel re: voting results reports (0.1);
review and comment on Excel results from Omni (0.2).
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9 November 2021 Call with S. Hershey and M. Linder re: Disclosure L Baccash 0.20 210.00
Statement.

9 November 2021 Research re: ballot receipt matter (0.1); draft B Warner 0.40 388.00

instructions for client re: ballot matters (0.3).

10 November 2021 Research re: survivor filings re: solicitation matters B Warner 1.40 1,358.00

(0.3); email C. Tuffey re: Coalition voting results inquiry
(0.1); review and comment on email draft from C.
Tuffey re: voting results correction (0.1); review and
respond to client email re: ballot and voting matters
(0.2); correspond with client re: ballot matters (0.1);
review and comment on Omni return payment letter re:
ballots (0.4); analyze emails from Omni re: solicitation
and voting matters (0.2).

11 November 2021 Review Omni inquiry re: solicitation and ballot mailing B Warner 1.50 1,455.00
matters (0.2); draft email to J. Lauria re: same (0.1);
correspond with Omni team re: response to inquiry re:
solicitation/ballot mailing matters (0.1); review AIS
solicitation and voting inquiries from counsel/Omni
(0.3); correspond with M. Linder and L. Baccash re:
response and next steps (0.2); correspond with AIS
staff and Omni team re: next steps on voting matters
inquiry (0.1); call with Omni re: solicitation and voting
matters and updates (0.4); call with L. Baccash re:
next steps on same (0.1).

12 November 2021 Call with M. Linder, B. Warner and others re: L Baccash 0.40 420.00
solicitation issues.

12 November 2021 Correspond with L. Baccash re: voting reports (0.1); B Warner 1.70 1,649.00
strategize and draft notes re: voting matters (0.2); draft
correspondence to Zuckerman law firm re: voting email
correspondence to J. Lauria (0.5); call with M. Linder
and L. Baccash re: solicitation and voting strategic
matters (0.4); draft email to state court counsel re:
voting and solicitation questions (0.2); call with J. Paul
re: solicitation and voting questions (0.1); correspond
with B. Whitaker re: confirmation notice publication
(0.1); correspond with M. Linder and L. Baccash re:
voting and solicitation updates (0.1).

15 November 2021 Multiple calls with B. Warner re: solicitation and related L Baccash 2.50 2,625.00
matters (1.8); call with K. Nownes, B. Warner, M.
Meisler re: solicitation issues (0.2); call with B. Warner
and state court attorney re: solicitation issues (0.5).

15 November 2021 Call with L. Baccash re: next steps on various voting B Warner 1.10 1,067.00
matters (0.1); research re: ballots (0.1); correspond
with M. Linder and L. Baccash re: findings and client
ballot matters (0.2); call with AIS representatives and
L. Baccash re: voting and solicitation matters (0.5); call
with L. Baccash and M. Meisler re: voting and
solicitation matters (0.2).

16 November 2021 Draft follow-up client response re: ballot matters. B Warner 0.40 388.00

17 November 2021 Multiple calls with B. Warner re: solicitation issues L Baccash 0.80 840.00
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(0.3); review and revise letter to Zalkin re: solicitation
(0.5).

18 November 2021 Multiple calls with B. Warner and others re: solicitation L Baccash 0.90 945.00

issues (0.6); call with C. Tuffey re: same (0.1); multiple
correspondence with B. Warner re: solicitation issues
(0.2).

18 November 2021 Correspond with Omni re: voting question (0.1); B Warner 1.10 1,067.00
correspond with AIS re: ballot and voting matters (0.2);
review and analyze voting report (0.3); call with Omni
and L. Baccash re: solicitation and voting matters and
updates (0.2); draft comments to Omni re: preliminary
voting results (0.3).

19 November 2021 Call with B. Warner re: solicitation issues (0.2); L Baccash 0.30 315.00
multiple correspondence with Omni re: same (0.1).

19 November 2021 Correspond with L. Baccash re: claims and voting B Warner 0.40 388.00
matters (0.2); correspond with Omni team and L.
Baccash re: voting and solicitation matters (0.2).

22 November 2021 Review solicitation emails from Omni and correspond B Warner 0.30 291.00
with L. Baccash re: response on same (0.2);
correspond with Omni team re: response on
solicitation questions (0.1).

23 November 2021 Draft email to L. Baccash and client re: ballot matters B Warner 1.00 970.00
(0.2); draft email to K. Nownes re: solicitation and
voting question (0.1); call with Zuckerman firm and L.
Baccash re: voting matters (0.5); correspond with
Omni team and L. Baccash re: voting and solicitation
inquiries (0.2).

29 November 2021 Call with L. Baccash and D. Kim re: revised notice of B Warner 0.60 582.00
tabulation and voting correction (0.1); call with L.
Baccash and Omni team re: voting and solicitation
matters re: hearing developments (0.5).

SUBTOTAL: Disclosure Statement 43.40 41,867.00

Executory Contracts and Leases

10 November 2021 Review correspondence from client re: contract issues. L Baccash 0.20 210.00

12 November 2021 Review materials re: executory contract (0.1); B Warner 0.20 194.00
correspond with M. Linder and L. Baccash re:
executory contract strategy (0.1).

22 November 2021 Draft form of lease stipulation extension (0.2); email B Warner 0.30 291.00
same (0.1).
30 November 2021 Call with C. Binggeli re: rejection and assumption B Warner 0.40 388.00

schedules (0.3); correspond with C. Binggeli re: same
(0.1).

SUBTOTAL: Executory Contracts and Leases 1.10 1,083.00
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Fee Applications

1 November 2021 Email to B. Bravo re: LEDES file (0.1); review status of S Ludovici 0.60 609.00
October fee application (0.2); email to timekeepers re:
October fee application (0.1); email to US Trustee with
fee application and LEDES file (0.2).

2 November 2021 Review email from U.S. Trustee re: fee application M Linder 0.30 315.00
expenses (0.2); emails with S. Ludovici re: same (0.1).

2 November 2021 Review and comment on draft of September fee S Ludovici 0.60 609.00
application (0.2); email to A. Ghafarian re: BSA
October (0.1); review email from J. Lauria re: 11th
Monthly Fee Application (0.1); review pro forma time
entries for monthly fee application for compliance with
US Trustee guidelines and other requirements,
including privilege and confidentiality (0.2).

2 November 2021 Review and analyze expense issues raised by US S Ludovici 1.60 1,624.00
Trustee's office (0.8); emails with B. Warner re: same
(0.2); emails with M. Linder re: same (0.3); emails with
B. Bravo re: expense issues (0.2); email to C. Do, C.
Tuffey and others re: draft September fee application
(0.1).

2 November 2021 Research re: fee application comments from US B Warner 0.20 194.00
Trustee.
2 November 2021 Emails with S. Ludovici re: September fee application D Rivero 1.80 1,143.00

(0.2); review August fee application (0.2); draft
September fee application (1.4).

3 November 2021 Emails with S. Ludovici re: expense details for fee M Linder 0.10 105.00
application.
3 November 2021 Review expense detail and draft email to US Trustee S Ludovici 0.70 710.50

re: same (0.4); review pro forma time entries for
monthly fee application for compliance with US
Trustee guidelines and other requirements, including
privilege and confidentiality (0.1); email to US Trustee
re: 10th fee application expenses (0.1); review email
from S. Nolan-Thompson re: certain expenses (0.1).

4 November 2021 Emails with S. Ludovici re: fee applications, M Linder 0.40 420.00
supplemental declarations and responses to U.S.
Trustee inquiries.

4 November 2021 Continue drafting fourth supplemental declaration S Ludovici 4.50 4,567.50

(0.8); email to M. Linder re: same (0.1); analyze data
re: August expenses (0.5); email to M. Linder re:
responding to US Trustee re: Same (0.1); review pro
forma time entries for monthly fee application for
compliance with US Trustee guidelines and other
requirements, including privilege and confidentiality
(1.8); further analysis re: expense for August (1.0);
email to M. Linder re: same (0.2).
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4 November 2021

Correspond with S. Ludovici re: comments to 11th
monthly fee application.

B Warner

0.10

97.00

4 November 2021

Review pro forma time entries for fee application for
compliance with US Trustee guidelines and other
requirements, including privilege and confidentiality.

D Rivero

2.10

1,333.50

5 November 2021

Review and comment on JLL fee application exhibit
(0.1); draft email re: same to C. Binggeli (0.1); draft
JLL fee application (1.6); draft follow-up email to C.
Binggeli re: open issues on same (0.2).

B Warner

2.00

1,940.00

5 November 2021

Review pro forma time entries for fee application for
compliance with US Trustee guidelines and other
requirements, including privilege and confidentiality.

D Rivero

2.90

1,841.50

6 November 2021

Revise draft response to U.S. Trustee expense inquiry
(0.2); emails with S. Ludovici re: same (0.1).

M Linder

0.30

315.00

6 November 2021

Draft response to US Trustee comments (2.0);
respond to M. Linder re: problems with revised
response to comments to 11th Monthly Fee
Application (0.2); email to US Trustee re: response re:
comments to 11th Monthly Fee Application (0.1).

S Ludovici

2.30

2,334.50

7 November 2021

Review pro forma time entries for fee application for
compliance with US Trustee guidelines and other
requirements, including privilege and confidentiality.

D Rivero

2.20

1,397.00

8 November 2021

Review CNO to Third interim fee application.

S Ludovici

0.40

406.00

9 November 2021

Review CNO and respond to MNAT re: same (0.1);
review pro forma time entries for monthly fee
application for compliance with US Trustee guidelines
and other requirements, including privilege and
confidentiality, particularly for expense issues (1.0).

S Ludovici

1,116.50

9 November 2021

Review pro forma time entries for fee application for
compliance with US Trustee guidelines and other
requirements, including privilege and confidentiality.

D Rivero

1.80

1,143.00

10 November 2021

Review pro forma time entries for monthly fee
application for compliance with US Trustee guidelines
and other requirements, including privilege and
confidentiality (3.3); emails to D. Rivero re: fee
application for October (0.4).

S Ludovici

3.70

3,755.50

10 November 2021

Review pro forma time entries for fee application for
compliance with US Trustee guidelines and other
requirements, including privilege and confidentiality.

D Rivero

3.70

2,349.50

10 November 2021

Review pro forma time entries for fee application for
compliance with US Trustee guidelines and other
requirements.

C Tuffey

0.60

381.00

11 November 2021

Review pro forma time entries for monthly fee
application for compliance with US Trustee guidelines
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and other requirements, including privilege and
confidentiality.

11 November 2021

Review pro forma time entries for fee application for
compliance with US Trustee guidelines and other
requirements.

C Tuffey

4.60

2,921.00

12 November 2021

Review pro forma time entries for monthly fee
application for compliance with US Trustee guidelines
and other requirements, including privilege and
confidentiality.

S Ludovici

4.00

4,060.00

15 November 2021

Review CNOs for August and 4th interim fee
application (0.2); email to D. Rivero, C. Do, C. Tuffey
re: November fee application issues (0.1).

S Ludovici

0.30

304.50

15 November 2021

Review pro forma time entries for fee application for
compliance with US Trustee guidelines and other
requirements, including privilege and confidentiality.

D Rivero

698.50

16 November 2021

Email to B. Warner re: September fee app (0.1); email
to B. Bravo and others re: September (0.1); review
email re: W&C billing for BSA (0.1); review pro forma
time entries for monthly fee application for compliance
with US Trustee guidelines and other requirements,
including privilege and confidentiality (1.3).

S Ludovici

1.60

1,624.00

17 November 2021

Revise fee application.

S Ludovici

0.10

101.50

18 November 2021

Email to K. Barbella re: W&C fee app (0.1); email to J.
Vizconde and to C. Tuffey, D. Rivero, B. Warner and
others re: September fee app (0.1).

S Ludovici

0.20

203.00

18 November 2021

Draft amended fee application for H&LA.

D Kim

2.80

1,778.00

19 November 2021

Review pro forma time entries for fee application for
compliance with US Trustee guidelines and other
requirements.

C Tuffey

1.60

1,016.00

21 November 2021

Several emails to B. Warner L. Baccash re: W&C fees
(0.2); revise document re: W&C fees (0.3); review pro
forma time entries for monthly fee application for
compliance with US Trustee guidelines and other
requirements, including privilege and confidentiality
(0.4); review emails re: W&C fees (0.2); email to J.
Vizconde and B. Bravo re: September W&C fee app
(0.1); email to B. Warner re: same (0.1).

S Ludovici

1.30

1,319.50

22 November 2021

Review pro forma time entries for monthly fee
application for compliance with US Trustee guidelines
and other requirements, including privilege and
confidentiality (0.3); read email from J. Vizconde re:
October (0.1).

S Ludovici

0.40

406.00

22 November 2021

Review and revise H&LA amended fee application
(0.8); draft email to C. Binggeli and team re: open
questions on invoice for same (0.2).
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23 November 2021 Review pro forma time entries for monthly fee S Ludovici 0.80 812.00

application for compliance with US Trustee guidelines
and other requirements, including privilege and
confidentiality (0.7); email to B. Warner re: fee
application (0.1).

28 November 2021 Email to J. Vizconde and B. Bravo re: October fee S Ludovici 0.10 101.50
application.

30 November 2021 Email to B. Warner re: next monthly fee application. S Ludovici 0.10 101.50

SUBTOTAL: Fee Applications 55.60 46,748.00

Financing Matters and Cash Collateral

1 November 2021 Review bond agreements and correspondence related L Baccash 3.00 3,150.00
thereto (0.5); participate in call re: restated debt
documents with A. Simon and others (0.5); review and
revise DST Note and Trust agreement with M. Linder
(2.0).

1 November 2021 Emails with C. Adler, A. Simon and J. Stump re: credit M Linder 0.80 840.00
agreement and bond documents (0.2); review issues
list and report from call re: same (0.3); review and
consider B. Whittman comments on same (0.3).

1 November 2021 Review NRF comments to credit documents (1.3); C Adler 3.80 3,971.00
draft issues list (1.0); mark up credit agreement and
security agreement (1.0); calls with NRF and BSA re:
credit agreement and security agreement (0.3); email
correspondence re: same (0.2).

2 November 2021 Revise draft credit agreement and security agreement ~ C Adler 2.80 2,926.00
(2.2); calls re: same (0.3); email correspondence re:
credit documents (0.3).

3 November 2021 Emails with Client and J. Stump re: county commission M Linder 0.20 210.00
resolutions.
3 November 2021 Review revised drafts of credit agreement and security =~ C Adler 1.20 1,254.00

agreement (1.0); email correspondence re: same (0.2).

10 November 2021 Review and revise DST settlement agreement with M. L Baccash 1.60 1,680.00
Linder and discuss other debt documents (1.3); call
with B. Whittman, C. Binggeli, and M. Linder re: debt
documents (0.3).

10 November 2021 Review Katten comments on foundation loan  C Adler 1.50 1,567.50
agreement (0.5); update draft foundation loan
agreement (0.5); email correspondence re: same (0.5).

10 November 2021 Research re: DIP reporting question from A&M (0.1); B Warner 0.30 291.00
correspond with M. Linder and C. Binggeli re: same
(0.2).

11 November 2021 Continue drafting of foundation loan agreement (1.5); C Adler 3.30 3,448.50

draft second lien security agreement for foundation
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loan (1.5); email correspondence re: same (0.1); calls
re: debt work streams (0.2).

12 November 2021

Telephone call with K. Gluck re: recent developments.

M Linder

0.20

210.00

12 November 2021

Email correspondence re: debt documents.

C Adler

0.30

313.50

15 November 2021

Analyze A&M's comments on foundation loan
documents (1.0); update foundation loan agreement
(1.0); update foundation loan security agreement (0.5);
email correspondence re: debt documents (0.3).

C Adler

2.80

2,926.00

16 November 2021

Update settlement trust note (1.0); draft security
agreement for settlement trust note (1.2); email
correspondence re: debt documents (0.2).

C Adler

2.40

2,508.00

17 November 2021

Review comments on settlement trust note and
security agreement (1.0); revise settlement trust
security agreement (0.2); email correspondence re:
same (0.1).

C Adler

1.30

1,358.50

18 November 2021

Calls re: status of debt documents (0.5); emails re:
same (0.3).

C Adler

0.80

836.00

19 November 2021

Emails re: foundation loan agreement and other debt
documents.

C Adler

0.50

522.50

22 November 2021

Call on debt documents with C. Adler, A. Simon, D.
Kim, B. Warner, K. Ferrier, C. Binggeli, and K. Gluck
(0.3); review leaseback (0.2).

L Baccash

0.50

525.00

22 November 2021

Attend weekly call re: debt documents with A. Simon L.
Baccash, D. Kim, B. Warner, K. Ferrier, C. Binggeli,
and K. Gluck (0.3); review foundation loan agreement
comments (0.9); update settlement trust note and
related security agreement (0.5); email
correspondence re: same (0.1).

C Adler

1.80

1,881.00

23 November 2021

Review comments on foundation loan agreement (0.7);
call with client, B. Whittman, C. Binggeli and B. Warner
re: plan supplement revisions (0.6); and email
correspondence with same re: same (0.2); revise
foundation loan agreement (0.5); review revised JPM
credit documents (0.5).

C Adler

2.50

2,612.50

24 November 2021

Draft summary of debt documents (1.5); update credit
agreement grid (0.5); email correspondence with B.
Warner and A. Simon re. debt documents (0.2); revise
foundation loan agreement (0.5).

C Adler

2.70

2,821.50

29 November 2021

Emails with finance team re: debt documents (0.2);
update foundation loan agreement (1.0); review plan
supplement materials in preparation for filing (0.3).

C Adler

1.50

1,567.50

30 November 2021

Continued negotiation of foundation loan agreement
(0.3); review revised JPM agreements (1.7); review re:
plan supplement documents for filing (0.1); email
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correspondence with D. Kim re: same (0.1); and calls
with D. Kim re: same (0.1).

SUBTOTAL: Financing Matters and Cash Collateral 38.10 39,823.50

General Case Strategy

1 November 2021 Telephone calls with L. Baccash re: pending M Linder 0.50 525.00
deliverables and next steps.

2 November 2021 Telephone call with L. Baccash re: pending M Linder 0.50 525.00
deliverables and work streams.

3 November 2021 Telephone call with L. Baccash re: pending M Linder 0.10 105.00
deliverables.
4 November 2021 Telephone calls with L. Baccash re: pending M Linder 0.70 735.00

deliverables and next steps.

6 November 2021 Emails with K. Rothweiler and C. Binggeli re: M Linder 0.20 210.00
professional fees.

11 November 2021 Review open items and deliverables and discuss M Linder 2.10 2,205.00
status of work streams with L. Baccash, including TDP
releases (1.5); telephone call with R. Gorsich and L.
Baccash re: same (0.6).

12 November 2021 Telephone calls with L. Baccash re: various pending M Linder 0.80 840.00
deliverables.
SUBTOTAL: General Case Strategy 4.90 5,145.00

Hearings and Court Matters

1 November 2021 Call with A. Azer, M. Plevin, S. Hershey and others re: L Baccash 1.70 1,785.00
Insurer discovery issues (0.5); call with S. Hershey, G.
Kurtz, S. Gurvitz and others re: discovery related
issues (1.0); multiple correspondence with S. Hershey
re: discovery related matters (0.2).

2 November 2021 Confer with T. Smith and C. Tuffey re: same (0.2); L Baccash 1.20 1,260.00
review correspondence re: appendix from D. Draigh
(0.2); call with S. Hershey, B. Warner, K. Nownes, M.
Meisler re: discovery issues (0.5); call with S. Hershey
and B. Warner re: same (0.3).

3 November 2021 Call with S. Hershey, G. Kurtz, M. Andolina, A. Azer, L Baccash 3.50 3,675.00
and others re: discovery issues (0.6); review objection
to automatic stay motion (0.3); review reply to
objection from D. Kim (0.2); video call with A. Azer, S.
Hershey, E. Grim, M. Linder, and M. Neely re:
discovery issues (0.5); call with A. Azer, M. Stoner, E.
Grim, E. Goodman, and others re: discovery issues
(0.7); meet and confer call with G. Kurtz, E. Goodman,
insurer counsel, and others (0.8); review
correspondence from insurers and G. Kurtz re:
discovery issues (0.1); call with D. Kim re: objection to
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automatic stay motion (0.3).

4 November 2021

Review and revise reply and declaration to objection to
automatic stay motion (1.3); call with M. Linder re:
same (0.2); review letter from Insurer (0.1); multiple
calls with D. Kim re: motions to lift the automatic stay
(0.2); multiple correspondence with Omni team re:
reply to objection to motion re: automatic stay (0.1);
call with TCC, FCR, Coalition representatives and S.
Hershey, A. Azer re: deposition issues (0.7).

L Baccash

2.60

2,730.00

4 November 2021

Draft email to client re: hearings.

B Warner

0.20

194.00

5 November 2021

Call with T. Axelrod, B. Warner, M. Murray, M. Linder,
D. Evans, M. Atkinson, E. Goodman, and other re:
litigation issues (0.5); call with S. Hershey and Insurer
re: discovery (0.1); review various correspondence re:
discovery issues (0.2).

L Baccash

0.80

840.00

8 November 2021

Call with C. Bates, M. Murray, D. Evans, M. Andolina,
G. Kurtz, and others re: expert reports (1.0); call with
S. Hershey, G. Kurtz, M. Andolina, and other
deposition issues (0.6).

L Baccash

1.60

1,680.00

9 November 2021

Prepare for 11/10 omnibus hearing.

M Andolina

1.80

2,340.00

9 November 2021

Call with A. Azer, M. Linder, E. Grim, and M. Neely re:
Insurer lift stay motion.

L Baccash

0.30

315.00

10 November 2021

Prepare for and attend omnibus hearing (2.0); follow-
up with client re: same (0.3).

M Andolina

2.30

2,990.00

10 November 2021

Call with S. Hershey, M. Stoner, Pachulski, and others
re: discovery (0.5); call with D. Mayer, J. Celentino, M.
Andolina, B. Warner, and others re: litigation issues
(0.6); call with M. Linder re: litigation and case strategy
(0.3).

L Baccash

1.40

1,470.00

10 November 2021

Review materials for omnibus hearing (1.4); emails
with W&C FRI and litigation teams re: same (0.4);
attend and argue at hearing (2.7).

M Linder

4.50

4,725.00

10 November 2021

Correspond with W&C team and MNAT re: omnibus
hearings.

B Warner

0.20

194.00

11 November 2021

Call with M. Linder, B. Whittman, and A. Hammond re:
litigation strategy issues (1.0); call with D. Evans, S.
Manning, G. Kurtz, C. Bates, M. Linder, and others re:
litigation issues related to confirmation (0.5); call with
M. Andolina, E. Goodman, M. Linder, B. Whittman, D.
Molton, and others re: litigation matters (0.7); call with
S. Hershey and B. Warner re: discovery issues (0.3).

L Baccash

2.50

2,625.00

12 November 2021

Prepare for (0.2) and attend (0.5) hearing re: non-
solicitation issues.

M Andolina

0.70

910.00

12 November 2021

Review and revise bullets for J. Lauria for hearing
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(0.2); review letters for hearing (0.2); review notes from
TCC Town Hall and correspondence re: same for
hearing (0.1).
15 November 2021 Draft correspondence to court (0.2); call with D. Abbott L Baccash 0.30 315.00
re: same (0.1).
17 November 2021 Correspondence with C. Binggeli and B. Warner re: L Baccash 0.60 630.00
hearing (0.2); review materials in preparation for
hearing (0.3); correspondence with B. Warner re:
hearing issues (0.1).
19 November 2021 Emails re: hearing adjournment with insurer (0.3); M Andolina 0.50 650.00
follow-up with BSA team re: same (0.2).
19 November 2021 Confer with R. Gorsich re: hearing on discovery D Kim 0.20 209.00
issues.
23 November 2021 Attend in part hearing. J Lauria (Boelter) 0.50 675.00
29 November 2021 Attend status hearing re: various discovery issues. M Andolina 1.50 1,950.00
SUBTOTAL: Hearings and Court Matters 29.40 32,687.00
Insurance Issues
3 November 2021 Email to GSUSA counsel re: limited response to M Linder 0.20 210.00
insurance settlement motion.
4 November 2021 Review multiple correspondence related to insurance L Baccash 0.70 735.00
discovery disputes (0.4); review research re: insurance
proceeds issues (0.3).
4 November 2021 Review and analyze Insurer response to BSA M Linder 0.30 315.00
correspondence.
5 November 2021 Telephone call with P. Anker re: settlement agreement M Linder 0.60 630.00
and related matters (0.2); email to W&C and Haynes &
Boone team re: same (0.1); emails with E. Schnabel
and MNAT team re: certification of RSUl/Beazley
settlement motion (0.2); review draft certification (0.1).
8 November 2021 Meet and confer with Insurer. J Lauria (Boelter) 0.50 675.00
9 November 2021 Telephone call with A. Azer, L. Baccash, and FCR M Linder 0.70 735.00
counsel re: Insurer motion (0.3); follow-up emails with
A. Azer and L. Baccash re: same (0.2); emails with R.
Mason re: chartered organization inquiry re: insurance
(0.1); emails with A. Azer re: same (0.1).
11 November 2021 Emails with insurance counsel concerning requests for G Kurtz 0.30 517.50
the debtors' position with respect to certain TDP
issues.
14 November 2021 Review and analyze relevant materials and prepare to R Gorsich 3.90 4,680.00

depose insurance witnesses (3.5); review draft
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stipulation with insurers (0.4).

16 November 2021 Telephone call with A. Azer and R. Gorsich re: certain D Kim 1.60 1,672.00
insurance issues related to chartered organization
debtors and Insurer settlement (0.4); confer with R.
Gorsich re: same (0.2); review Insurer's motion to
quash 30(b)(6) depositions (0.6); review joinders to
same (0.4).

18 November 2021 Review discovery requests from certain insurers (0.6); D Kim 1.90 1,985.50
review correspondence from various insurer counsel
re: discovery disputes (1.0); confer with R. Gorsich re:

same (0.3).

22 November 2021 Finalize Insurer settlement agreement (0.6); review D Kim 1.50 1,567.50
certain witness preparation issues re: insurer discovery
(0.9).

22 November 2021 Confer with L. Baccash re: BSA insurance coverage S Murray 1.20 1,104.00

(0.2); drafted and circulated email to A. Azer re: same
(0.3); confer with L. Baccash re: following up with A.
Azer (0.1); confer with M. Linder and L. Baccash re:
BSA insurance coverage (0.1); revise settlement
approval motion and Hanke Declaration per A. Azers’
comments re: BSA insurance coverage (0.4); circulate
same to L. Baccash and D. Kim (0.1).

23 November 2021 Review and revise term sheets with certain settling D Kim 2.70 2,821.50
insurance companies (1.5); confer with L. Baccash and
R. Gorsich re: same (1.2).

SUBTOTAL: Insurance Issues 16.10 17,648.00

Non-Bankruptcy Litigation

1 November 2021 Call with M. Linder re: plan issues (0.2); call with T. L Baccash 1.40 1,470.00
Smith and R. Boone and re: plan related research
(0.4); call with R. Boone re: same (0.1); review
research related to plan confirmation (0.7).

2 November 2021 Call with R. Boone and T. Smith re: confirmation brief. L Baccash 0.50 525.00

2 November 2021 Telephone call with P. Anderson and A. Azer re: M Linder 0.90 945.00
Kentucky Explorer settlements and related issues
(0.4); review and comment on form of release (0.4);
emails with A. Azer re: same (0.1).

3 November 2021 Call with M. Linder, B. Whittman, and J. Russell re: L Baccash 1.80 1,890.00
comments to DST note (0.9); call with M. Linder and B.
Warner re: plan supplement documents (0.7); multiple
correspondence with charter organization counsel, B.
Warner, and R. Boone re: plan issues (0.2).

4 November 2021 Correspondence re: chartered org issues with R. L Baccash 1.60 1,680.00
Boone (0.1); correspondence with J. Lauria re:
confirmation research issues (0.1); call with M. Linder
re: same (0.1); call with M. Linder re: plan supplement
documents (0.2); review and revise TDP releases
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(0.6); call with A. Azer, E. Goodman, and TCC
representatives re: discovery issues (0.3); review
multiple correspondence from insurers and litigation
team re: discovery issues (0.2).

4 November 2021

Emails with A. Azer re: Kentucky explorer settlements.

M Linder

0.20

210.00

5 November 2021

Review and revise TDP releases (3.0); review
research re: same (0.2).

L Baccash

3.20

3,360.00

8 November 2021

Review and revise TDP releases.

L Baccash

0.80

840.00

8 November 2021

Telephone call with A. Kutz, A. Azer, and ORIC re:
Kentucky claims.

M Linder

0.50

525.00

11 November 2021

Call with M. Linder re: TDP releases and review of
same (0.6); call with M. Linder and E. Goodman re:
TDP releases and related matters (0.5); call with M.
Linder re: same (0.1).

L Baccash

1.20

1,260.00

12 November 2021

Emails with S. Manning re: state court litigation.

M Linder

0.20

210.00

14 November 2021

Call with M. Linder, A. Azer and E. Martin re: terms
sheet with potential settling party (0.5); call with M.
Linder re: same (0.1); review and revise term sheet
from potential settling party with M. Linder (2.3).

L Baccash

2.90

3,045.00

18 November 2021

Review draft 9019 motion re: pre-petition bankruptcy
(0.4); confer with S. Murray and L. Baccash re: same
0.2).

D Kim

0.60

627.00

19 November 2021

Review 9019 motion to approve non-bankruptcy
litigation (0.3); review related documents re: same
(0.2); confer with L. Baccash re: same (0.1);
correspond with S. Murray re: same (0.1).

D Kim

0.70

731.50

19 November 2021

Coordinate with L. Baccash and K. Doah re: Shumway
settlement approval motion (0.2); reviewed and
incorporated comments from L. Baccash and K. Doah
re: same (1.0).

S Murray

1.20

1,104.00

22 November 2021

Emails with L. Baccash and S. Murray re: Shumway
settlement and related matters.

M Linder

0.20

210.00

22 November 2021

Final review of Shumway 9019 motion (0.3);
correspond with S. Murray re: same (0.1).

D Kim

0.40

418.00

23 November 2021

Review, analyze, and comment on Shumway
settlement motion (0.4); emails with S. Murray re:
same (0.4).

M Linder

0.80

840.00

24 November 2021

Review and comment on Haynes & Boone non-
bankruptcy litigation stay pleading.

B Warner

0.30

291.00

29 November 2021

Review draft settlement agreement re: prepetition
personal injury claim (0.5); confer with L. Baccash re:
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same (0.1).

SUBTOTAL: Non-Bankruptcy Litigation

20.00

20,808.50

Professional Retention

2 November 2021

Telephone call with N. DuBose, M. Burnett, and B.
Warner re: Burnett retention (0.3); emails with A.
Hammond re: retention of abuse prevention expert
(0.2); review and comment on supplemental
declaration in support of W&C retention (0.7).

M Linder

1.20

1,260.00

2 November 2021

Email to M. Linder and B. Warner re: supplemental
declaration.

S Ludovici

0.10

101.50

2 November 2021

Call with G. Kurtz, A. Hammond and potential expert
re: youth protection (0.4); call with G. Kurtz and A.
Hammond re: potential expert engagement (0.3); call
with A. Hammond re: same (0.9).

C Shepherd

1.60

1,584.00

2 November 2021

Call with N. Dubose, M. Burnett and M. Linder re:
retention application and disclosures (0.3); correspond
with W&C team re: retention and fee application
matters and  supplemental disclosures (0.2);
correspond with Burnett and W&C team re: retention
and supplemental disclosures (0.3); correspond with
Burnett re: retention disclosures (0.2); correspond with
W&C team re: supplemental disclosure (0.1).

B Warner

1,067.00

3 November 2021

Review revised draft of supplemental declaration (0.1);
emails with S. Ludovici re: same (0.1); review potential
expert draft engagement letter (0.4); review certain
precedent re: same (0.2); emails with A. Hammond re:
comments to same (0.1); email to A. Remming re:
retention of experts (0.1).

M Linder

1.00

1,050.00

3 November 2021

Review M. Linder's comments to supplemental
declaration  (0.5); further revise supplemental
declaration (0.2); further revise supplemental
declaration  (0.3); review correspondence re:
supplemental declaration (0.1).

S Ludovici

1,116.50

3 November 2021

Call with potential expert, A. Hammond, and G. Kurtz
re: expert engagement (0.5); call with A. Hammond to
discuss expert work (0.4).

C Shepherd

0.90

891.00

4 November 2021

Telephone call with A. Remming re: retention of
experts.

M Linder

0.10

105.00

4 November 2021

Draft fourth supplemental declaration for W&C.

S Ludovici

1.90

1,928.50

4 November 2021

Call with G. Kurtz, A. Hammond, client, potential
expert, C. Schiller re: expert engagement.

C Shepherd

0.50

495.00

9 November 2021

Emails with M. Burnett and S. Ludovici re: expert
retention issues (0.2); emails with B. Warner re: same
(0.1).
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9 November 2021

Review chart from expert witness (0.2); email to M.
Linder re: same (0.1).

S Ludovici

0.30

304.50

10 November 2021

Negotiate and revise potential expert retention
agreement.

R Tiedemann

2.10

2,352.00

10 November 2021

Draft email to M. Burnett re: disclosures (0.4); review
comments to fourth supplemental declaration (0.2).

S Ludovici

0.60

609.00

10 November 2021

Review and comment on fourth supplemental W&C
declaration (0.3); review retention agreement and
revise re: comments (0.2).

B Warner

0.50

485.00

11 November 2021

Revise expert retention agreement (1.8); discussions
re: same with A. Hammond (0.3).

R Tiedemann

2.10

2,352.00

11 November 2021

Review correspondence re: retention issues (0.2);
research same (0.2).

L Baccash

0.40

420.00

11 November 2021

Email to M. Burnett, N. Dubose, M. Linder and others
re: retention (0.1); revise supplemental declaration for
W&C (0.4).

S Ludovici

0.50

507.50

11 November 2021

Review and comment on expert engagement
agreement, correspond with A. Remming and W&C
team re: same.

B Warner

0.60

582.00

12 November 2021

Review and respond to mark-up of expert engagement
letter (0.2); review MNAT analysis re: retention issue
(0.2).

M Linder

0.40

420.00

12 November 2021

Call with proposed expert re: retention application
disclosures (0.2); review email from A. Remming
(MNAT) re: Expert Witnesses (0.1).

S Ludovici

0.30

304.50

12 November 2021

Correspond with M. Linder re: expert witness
agreement (0.1); correspond with D. Kim re: H&LA
amended final fee application (0.2); draft email to A.
Hammond re: expert engagement letter and next steps
on same (0.2).

B Warner

0.50

485.00

14 November 2021

Call with R. Tiedemann re: Potential Expert retention
(0.1); emails with R. Tiedemann and M. Linder on
same (0.1); review Potential Expert retention
agreement re: comments from R. Tiedemann (0.2).

B Warner

0.40

388.00

15 November 2021

Chat with B. Warner re: declarations (0.2); review
email from D. Levy re: disclosure in supplemental
declaration (0.1); email to M. Linder, J. Lauria and
others re: same (0.1); revise supplemental declaration
for W&C (0.3); email to D. Hirshorn and B. Tully re:
renewed connections searches (0.1).

S Ludovici

0.80

812.00

15 November 2021

Correspond with M. Linder re: supplemental W&C
declaration matters (0.1); draft email to M. Linder and
L. Baccash re: proposed approach on expert retention
(0.2).

Page 121 of 151

B Warner

0.30

291.00




Case 20-10343-LSS Doc 9308-2 Filed 03/12/22 Page 123 of 152
WHITE & CASE

Boy Scouts of America

RE: Project Restructuring OUR REF: 1786703-0002
DATE DESCRIPTION TIMEKEEPER HOURS usb
16 November 2021 Review schedule re: revising potential party in interest S Ludovici 0.20 203.00

list in December and email to B. Tully re: coordinating
connections searches.

16 November 2021 Correspond with R. Gorsich re: expert retention (0.1); B Warner 0.40 388.00
draft response to N. Bubose re: expert retention (0.3).

17 November 2021 Draft ordinary course professional declaration re: B Warner 1.30 1,261.00

expert witness (0.8); distribute draft ordinary course
professional declaration to counsel and correspond
with counsel re: questions (0.1); draft Potential Expert
ordinary course professional declaration (0.2); email
same to W&C team (0.1); draft email to C. Tuffey re:
revised ordinary course professional list and notice
filing (0.1).

19 November 2021 Correspond with N. Dubose and R. Tiedemann re: B Warner 1.70 1,649.00
expert retention matters (0.2); further correspondence
with W&C team re: retention matters (0.2); revise
ordinary course professional declaration re: comments
from Haynes Boone team (0.2); correspond with C.
Tuffey re: ordinary course professional list and notice
revisions (0.2); draft email to C. Binggeli re: ordinary
course professional change and client questions on
same (0.2); review pleadings re: ordinary course
professional list and declaration (0.2); correspond with
C. Tuffey re: revisions to ordinary course professional
list and declaration filing (0.1); correspond with R.
Tiedemann re: ordinary course professional
declaration and retention matters (0.1); further
correspondence with C. Tuffey re: finalizing ordinary
course professional notice, list and declarations for
filing (0.2); call with R. Tiedemann re: Potential Expert
retention (0.1).

19 November 2021 Draft and revise notice of revised ordinary course C Tuffey 1.70 1,079.50
professional supplement and ordinary course
professional declarations.

23 November 2021 Draft email to N. Dubose re: expert witness retention B Warner 0.20 194.00
question.
29 November 2021 Email to J. Lauria, M. Andolina, L. Baccash and others S Ludovici 0.10 101.50

re: W&C Fourth Supplemental Declaration.

SUBTOTAL: Professional Retention 25.20 25,102.00

Public Relations Issues

1 November 2021 Review and comment on draft claims calculator. M Linder 1.00 1,050.00

2 November 2021 Review and comment on press release re: survivor M Linder 0.30 315.00
advisory working group (0.2); telephone call with C.
Binggeli re: abuse claims calculator comments (0.1).

24 November 2021 Review and comment on public relations L Baccash 0.10 105.00
correspondence.
SUBTOTAL: Public Relations Issues 1.40 1,470.00
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Tax Issues

10 November 2021 Telephone call with J. Tour re: ERISA and tax issues. R Tiedemann 0.70 784.00
SUBTOTAL: Tax Issues 0.70 784.00

Unsecured Creditor and Issues and Communications

2 November 2021 Review and correspond with C. Tuffey re: abuse B Warner 0.20 194.00
survivor communications.

3 November 2021 Review abuse survivor correspondence and consider B Warner 0.50 485.00
next steps on same (0.3); correspond with W&C team
on same (0.2).

5 November 2021 Review and comment on survivor voting website copy B Warner 0.70 679.00
(0.5); review further emails and correspond with T.
Axelrod, MNAT team and C. Tuffey re: claimant
inquiries (0.2).

10 November 2021 Review docket filings and correspond with Omni re: B Warner 0.60 582.00
handling of same (0.2); review and comment on email
from C. Tuffey re: voting claimant inquiries (0.1);
conduct factual research re: filing of pro se materials
(0.3).

11 November 2021 Review and comment on abuse survivor case inquiry B Warner 1.30 1,261.00

and related issues to L. Baccash, P. Topper, and T.
Remington (0.3); research re: response to abuse
survivor case inquiry (0.2); revise and finalize
response letter to survivor re: BSA case (0.4); email
same (0.1); review letter correspondence from KTBS
Law and correspond with M. Linder and L. Baccash on
same (0.2); correspond with Bates White team re:
KTBS Law letter correspondence (0.1).

12 November 2021 Review chartered organization inquiry  (0.1); B Warner 0.50 485.00
correspond with R. Boone re: resolution of same (0.1);
review email from Bates White (0.1); correspond with
L. Baccash and Bates White re: next steps on Zalkin
correspondence (0.2).

15 November 2021 Bates White call with D. Evans, M. Murray, W. B Warner 0.50 485.00
Reppert, and L. Baccash re: response to Zalkin letter
re: confirmation claims data (0.3); correspond with
Omni re: claimant inquiries (0.1); correspond with M.
Murray re: factual research on response to KTBS letter
(0.1).

17 November 2021 Revise draft of Zalkin letter re: comments (0.4); call B Warner 0.60 582.00
with L. Baccash re: letter and case strategic matters
(0.1); call with P. Topper re: creditor case inquiries
(0.1).

18 November 2021 Finalize, review, and distribute response letter to B Warner 0.10 97.00
Zalkin and Pfau counsel.
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19 November 2021 Correspond with A. Hammond re: response letter to B Warner 0.10 97.00

Zalkin and Pfau counsel.

22 November 2021 Correspond with counsel re: chartered organization B Warner 0.40 388.00
inquiry (0.2); correspond with Omni team re: claim and
ballot inquiry (0.2).

SUBTOTAL: Unsecured Creditor and Issues and Communications 5.50 5,335.00

U.S. Trustee Issues and Reporting

21 November 2021 Review and comment on draft Rule 2015.3 report B Warner 0.50 485.00
(0.4); correspond with J. Davis re: same (0.1).

30 November 2021 Prepare for (0.3) and attend (0.7) call with US Trustee M Andolina 1.30 1,690.00
re: AIS creditors and voting matters; follow-up emails
(0.2) and phone conferences (0.1) re: same with W&C
team.

30 November 2021 Call with US Trustee, J. Lauria, M. Andolina, and D. B Warner 0.70 679.00
Abbott re: AIS creditors and voting matters.

SUBTOTAL: U.S. Trustee Issues and Reporting 2.50 2,854.00

Local Council Issues and Communications

4 November 2021 Review pro se objection to local council stay relief M Linder 3.10 3,255.00

motion (0.4); review and comment on reply in support
of motion (1.2); emails with L. Baccash re: same (0.2);
telephone call with L. Baccash re: same (0.2); review
draft declaration in support of same (0.2); comment on
same (0.2); further revisions to reply (0.4); review
Omni revisions to draft declaration (0.1); emails with D.
Kim re: finalization and filing of same (0.2).

5 November 2021 Review and respond to Client emails re: local council M Linder 0.30 315.00
property transactions.

5 November 2021 Draft local council asset notification to committees. B Warner 0.20 194.00

7 November 2021 Draft Committee notification re: local council asset B Warner 0.20 194.00
disposition.

9 November 2021 Review email from local council re: potential property M Linder 0.40 420.00

disposition (0.2); emails with B. Warner re: same (0.2).

9 November 2021 Correspond with M. Linder re: local council asset B Warner 0.20 194.00
notification.
10 November 2021 Phone conferences with Ad Hoc Committee of Local M Andolina 0.50 650.00

Councils re: local council issues (0.3); follow-up emails
with same re: same (0.2).

10 November 2021 Draft response to local council counsel re: asset B Warner 0.10 97.00
disposition question.
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16 November 2021 Draft local council asset notification to committees B Warner 0.80 776.00

(0.3); correspond with various parties in interest re:
local council asset notification (0.2); draft the same for
committee distribution (0.2); correspond with client on

same (0.1).

18 November 2021 Call with local council and L. Baccash re: sale of B Warner 0.20 194.00
property.

19 November 2021 Review and draft local council asset notification to B Warner 0.30 291.00

committees (0.2); correspond with local council
representative re: same (0.1).

23 November 2021 Call with Local Council counsel re: contribution B Warner 0.20 194.00
question.

24 November 2021 Emails with Bates White re: redaction project. C Tuffey 0.40 254.00

29 November 2021 Emails with C. Nelson re: local council contribution M Linder 0.30 315.00
mechanics.

29 November 2021 Draft emails to L. Baccash, D. Kim and client re: Local B Warner 0.30 291.00

Council asset disposition question.

30 November 2021 Draft Committee updates re: Local Council asset B Warner 0.30 291.00
notifications (0.2); review emails re: same (0.1).

SUBTOTAL: Local Council Issues and Communications 7.80 7,925.00

Bankruptcy Appeals

1 November 2021 Emails with W&C team re: bar date appeal. C Tuffey 0.20 127.00

2 November 2021 Telephone conference with D. Draigh, L. Baccash, and T Smith 2.20 2,068.00

C. Tuffey re: designation and joint appendix for bar
date order appeal (0.3); review and analyze
designations and joint appendices in district court re:
bar date order appeal (1.6); correspond with D. Draigh,
L. Baccash, and C. Tuffey re: additions to joint
appendix (0.3).

2 November 2021 Review lower court docket and summarize same for D. C Tuffey 0.70 444.50
Draigh re: appeal drafting (0.3); gather and email
materials and summary to T. Smith (0.2); confer with
T. Smith re: same (0.2).

3 November 2021 Read and analyze issues and arguments raised in T Smith 3.10 2,914.00
answer brief and reply brief re: bar date order district
court appeal (1.3); review additional designations and
additions to joint appendix in district court re: appeal of
bar date order (0.4); correspond with T. Remington, D.
Abbott, L. Baccash, D. Draigh, and C. Tuffey re:
excerpts of plan for joint appendix in bar date order
appeal (0.3); review and analyze original plan and
prepare excerpts of same re: joint appendix (0.3);
multiple telephone calls with T. Remington re: joint
appendix (0.2); correspond with L. Baccash, D. Draigh,
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and C. Tuffey re: joint appendix (0.4); correspond with
C. Tuffey re: coordination for further appeal of bar date
order (0.2).

4 November 2021

Telephone conference and correspond with C. Tuffey
re: Third Circuit response.

T Smith

0.20

188.00

5 November 2021

Confer with K. Wade re: appellate brief formatting and
shell (0.1); email and distribute materials to K. Wade
re: same (0.1).

C Tuffey

0.20

127.00

9 November 2021

Telephone conference and correspond with C. Tuffey
re: bar date order appeal (0.3); review briefing and
scheduling order re: third circuit bar date order appeal
(0.1); review docket re: joint appendix filing (0.1);
correspond with L. Baccash, D. Draigh, and C. Tuffey
re: status of appellants' brief and timing (0.1).

T Smith

0.60

564.00

10 November 2021

Correspond with L. Baccash, D. Draigh, and C. Tuffey
re: appellants' brief in bar date order Third Circuit
appeal.

T Smith

0.20

188.00

11 November 2021

Correspond with C. Tuffey re: lower court filings and
index of same (0.1); read and analyze issues in
appellant's brief (0.8); draft issues list re: same (0.4);
read and analyze prior filings re: jurisdictional issue
(0.3).

T Smith

1.60

1,504.00

11 November 2021

Review district court docket re: reply on the merits
(0.3); confer with K. Wade re: pleadings (0.1).

C Tuffey

0.40

254.00

12 November 2021

Call with C. Tuffey, T. Smith, D. Draigh re: bar date
appeal.

L Baccash

0.70

735.00

12 November 2021

Call with D. Draigh, T. Smith, L. Baccash, and C.
Tuffey re: bar date order appeal briefing strategy.

B Warner

0.60

582.00

12 November 2021

Analyze issues raised in appellant's Third Circuit
opening brief (0.6); draft outline re: appellee brief
structure (0.9); correspond with D. Draigh, C. Tuffey,
and L. Baccash re: appeal (0.2).

T Smith

1.70

1,598.00

12 November 2021

Review opening brief and summarize initial responses
(1.2); confer with K. Wade re: same (0.1); call with T.
Smith re: next steps (0.1).

C Tuffey

1.40

889.00

14 November 2021

Legal research re: answering brief issues (3.0); draft
re: answering brief (2.5).

C Tuffey

5.50

3,492.50

15 November 2021

Telephone conference with L. Mezei re: Third Circuit
appeal and correspond with same re: research issue
and relevant pleadings.

T Smith

0.30

282.00

27 November 2021

Draft appellate brief and analyze issues re: same.

T Smith

4.30

4,042.00

28 November 2021

Draft appellate brief (1.3); review and analyze trust
distribution procedures and treatment of claims re:
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information for brief (0.6); review arguments raised in
appellant brief (0.4).

30 November 2021 Draft confirmation brief (1.1); review and analyze plan T Smith 3.90 3,666.00
of reorganization for same (0.3); draft appellate brief
re: bar date order (1.2); read and analyze cases re:
final order (0.6); review and analyze appellant's brief
(0.7).

SUBTOTAL: Bankruptcy Appeals 30.10 25,827.00

Mediation

1 November 2021 Attend mediation sessions. J Lauria (Boelter) 2.00 2,700.00

2 November 2021 Review Chartered Organization issues and strategy M Andolina 0.80 1,040.00
and A&M presentation re: same.

2 November 2021 Correspond with mediation parties re: admission of B Warner 0.60 582.00
new party and revise mediation parties distribution list
(0.2); draft mediation party admission email to new
party (0.3); correspond with D. Kim on same (0.1).

3 November 2021 Calls with J. Lauria, L. Baccash, and R. Gorsich re: M Andolina 2.30 2,990.00
Chartered Organization mediation issues (1.5); confer
with same and Coalition re: Survivor Working Group
and follow-up re: same with client (0.8).

4 November 2021 Attend mediation sessions re: claims and follow-up M Andolina 3.70 4,810.00
communications with BSA team re: same (2.0); youth
protection calls (1.0) and emails (0.3) re: Survivor
Working Group; review materials re: same (0.4).

4 November 2021 Call with T. Gallagher and R. Boone re: chartered L Baccash 0.30 315.00
organization issues (0.2); call with R. Boone re: same
(0.1).

5 November 2021 Attend mediation session re: Chartered Organization M Andolina 2.70 3,510.00
proposal and follow-up emails and phone conferences
re: same (1.5); review materials and lead and attend
claims mediation session (1.2).

5 November 2021 Call with M. Andolina, M. Linder, T. Gallagher, and B. L Baccash 1.40 1,470.00
Whittman re: status of case (0.3); video call with D.
Molton, M. Linder, M. Andolina, R. Mason, T,
Gallagher, and others re: negotiations (1.1).

5 November 2021 Videoconference with T. Gallagher, M. Andolina, B. M Linder 1.30 1,365.00
Whittman, and L. Baccash re: mediation issues (0.3);
mediation videoconference with T. Gallagher, M.
Andolina, R. Mason, Coalition, and FCR
representatives re: potential chartered organization
settlements (1.0).

6 November 2021 Phone conferences with mediators, Ad Hoc Committee M Andolina 2.60 3,380.00
of Local Councils, and Coalition re: settlement status
and update.

Page 127 of 151



Boy Scouts of America
RE: Project Restructuring

Case 20-10343-LSS

Doc 9308-2 Filed 03/12/22 Page 129 of 152

WHITE & CASE

OUR REF: 1786703-0002

DATE

DESCRIPTION

TIMEKEEPER

HOURS

usb

6 November 2021

Emails with M. Andolina re: confidential settlement
term sheet (0.2); review and analyze summary of
same (0.3).

M Linder

0.50

525.00

8 November 2021

Emails with Coalition re: Survivor Working Group (1.5);
follow-up communications with client re: meeting
update (1.1).

M Andolina

2.60

3,380.00

8 November 2021

Emails with W&C team re: mediation parties.

J Thomas

0.30

276.00

9 November 2021

Emails with Mediators and mediation parties (1.0) and
update calls with client (2.0) re: mediation updates and
settlements; review settlement materials and emails re:
same (0.6).

M Andolina

3.60

4,680.00

9 November 2021

Review term sheet with settling insurer.

L Baccash

0.30

315.00

9 November 2021

Review and analyze draft term sheet (0.3); emails with
T. Gallagher, J. Lauria, M. Andolina, and W&C
litigation team re: same (0.3).

M Linder

0.60

630.00

10 November 2021

Prepare for and attend Survivor Working Group call
(2.5); follow-up emails with J. Lee and Coalition
counsel and members re: same (0.3); update
mediators re: next sessions and coordinate same
(0.3).

M Andolina

3.10

4,030.00

10 November 2021

Telephone call with K. Gluck re: recent developments
(0.2); telephone call with M. Wasson re: same (0.2);
emails with FTI re: media reports re: mediation matters
(0.1).

M Linder

0.50

525.00

10 November 2021

Draft mediators' notice (1.0); confer re: logistics for
mediation for November (0.2).

D Kim

1.20

762.00

11 November 2021

Follow-up emails (0.2) and phone conferences (0.4)
from Survivor Working Group call; follow-up emails
(0.2) and phone conferences (0.4) with Coalition
counsel re: same; prepare call for Survivor Working
Group (2.5); follow-up emails with BSA team and
Coalition counsel re: youth protection issues (0.5);
review various term sheets (1.0); emails with
mediators, J. Lauria, L. Baccash re: settlement status
(0.8).

M Andolina

6.00

7,800.00

11 November 2021

Review term sheet from possible settling party.

L Baccash

0.60

630.00

12 November 2021

Prepare for (0.8) and attend (1.5) Survivor Working
Group call; follow-up emails (0.3) and phone
conferences (0.7) with client and Coalition counsel;
review re: insurer term sheets and mediation positions
(1.6).

M Andolina

4.90

6,370.00

12 November 2021

Correspond with T. Gallagher and D. Kim re:
mediation.

B Warner

0.20

194.00

12 November 2021

Confer re: mediation logistics with office staff and
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mediators for November mediation.

15 November 2021

Attend call with client re: mediation (0.5); attend
mediation sessions (3.0); review Methodist term sheet
(0.5).

J Lauria (Boelter)

4.00

5,400.00

15 November 2021

Attend virtual mediation sessions.

M Andolina

7.00

9,100.00

15 November 2021

Attend mediation sessions by Zoom.

M Linder

2.70

2,835.00

16 November 2021

Attend mediation sessions.

J Lauria (Boelter)

7.00

9,450.00

16 November 2021

Attend virtual mediation sessions.

M Andolina

7.00

9,100.00

17 November 2021

Attend mediation.

J Lauria (Boelter)

7.00

9,450.00

17 November 2021

Attend ongoing mediation sessions with insurer and
Chartered Organizations (1.7); follow-up emails with
client re: mediation status and developments (0.3);
prepare for and attend Survivor Working Group
session (1.1); emails re: same with W&C team (0.4).

M Andolina

3.50

4,550.00

18 November 2021

Participate in mediation sessions with various parties
(2.5); follow-up with L. Baccash, R. Gorsich, and client
re: same (0.5); coordinate Survivor Working Group
session for 11/19 and 11/22 (1.3).

M Andolina

4.30

5,590.00

18 November 2021

Review and revise term sheet in connection with
potential settling party (1.5); call with A. Azer re: same
(0.4).

L Baccash

1.90

1,995.00

19 November 2021

Participate in mediation sessions with various parties
(3.5); emails with L. Baccash, R. Gorsich, and client re:
same (0.5); emails (0.2) and phone conferences (0.4)
re: Survivor Working Group issues.

M Andolina

4.60

5,980.00

19 November 2021

Call with M. Andolina, K. Carey, T. Gallagher, and B.
Whittman re: status of case.

L Baccash

0.30

315.00

20 November 2021

Attend mediation session.

J Lauria (Boelter)

1.00

1,350.00

20 November 2021

Call with D. Molton, G. Kurtz, M. Andolina, S. Hershey,
and others re: litigation issues (0.7); review and revise
insurer term sheet (2.0); review and revise term sheet
with settling party (0.5); review and revise terms sheet
with settling parties (0.2).

L Baccash

3.40

3,570.00

21 November 2021

Attend mediation session (1.0); review term sheet
(0.5).

J Lauria (Boelter)

1.50

2,025.00

21 November 2021

Review term sheet and send to mediator (0.2); multiple
correspondence with M. Andolina and others re: same
(0.1); review and revise term sheets related to
potential settlements (5.5).

L Baccash

5.80

6,090.00

22 November 2021

Attend mediation session (3.0); review term sheets
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(1.0); review and comment on resolution (1.3); review
and comment on term sheet (0.5).

22 November 2021

Prepare for (0.5) and attend Survivor Working Group
meeting (2.0); confer with mediation parties re: same
(0.5); follow-up with W&C team re: same (0.5).

M Andolina

3.50

4,550.00

22 November 2021

Correspondence re: terms sheets with J. Lauria and M.
Andolina (0.2); review and revise same (1.5); call with
M. Linder re: same (0.3).

L Baccash

2.00

2,100.00

22 November 2021

Mediation with certain Chartered Organization (0.9);
mediation with certain insurers re: term sheet (0.7);
confer with L. Baccash and R. Gorsich re: same (0.4).

D Kim

2.00

2,090.00

23 November 2021

Attend mediation session (1.0); attend call with insurer
(0.5); attend additional mediation session (1.0); review
and comment on term sheet (1.0).

J Lauria (Boelter)

3.50

4,725.00

23 November 2021

Attend mediation sessions (1.0); follow-up with BSA
team re: same (0.3).

M Andolina

1.30

1,690.00

23 November 2021

Review and revise term sheets (6.5); multiple calls with
A. Azer and others re: same (1.5); call with J. Lauria
and others re: same (0.5); call with P. Anker, R.
Gorsich, and others re: settlement agreement (0.3).

L Baccash

8.80

9,240.00

23 November 2021

Review and revise term sheets with United Methodist
and Catholic churches.

D Kim

1.60

1,672.00

24 November 2021

Attend mediation session (1.0); emails with Haynes
Boone and W&C re: comments to term sheet (1.3).

J Lauria (Boelter)

2.30

3,105.00

24 November 2021

Call with R. Gorsich, D. Kim, B. Whittman, and others
re: term sheet (1.1); review and revise term sheets
(0.3); multiple calls with A. Azer, R. Gorsich, and
others re: terms sheet (1.0); call with T. Gallagher re:
same (0.2).

L Baccash

2.60

2,730.00

24 November 2021

Review and revise settling insurers' term sheet (0.8);
confer with L. Baccash and R. Gorsich re: same (0.4).

D Kim

1.20

1,254.00

25 November 2021

Review revised term sheet from settling insurers (0.5);
review revised term sheet for chartered organizations
and comments thereto (0.5).

D Kim

1.00

1,045.00

26 November 2021

Attend multiple mediation sessions.

J Lauria (Boelter)

2.00

2,700.00

26 November 2021

Participate in mediation sessions with various parties
(2.0); follow-up emails (0.2) and phone conferences
(0.3) with BSA team re: same.

M Andolina

2.50

3,250.00

26 November 2021

Call with M. Andolina, T. Gallagher, B. Whittman re:
status of case (0.4); review and revise settlement
agreements (4.8); prepare and participate in call with
A. Azer, R. Gorsich and others re: term sheets (0.4).
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26 November 2021

Teleconference with R. Gorsich, L. Baccash, and A.
Azer re: settling insurers and certain chartered
organizations (1.0); revise settling insurers' term sheet
(0.9); review Chartered Organization term sheet (0.8).

D Kim

2.70

2,821.50

27 November 2021

Attend multiple mediation sessions (2.0); follow-up with
BSA team re: mediation session (0.5).

J Lauria (Boelter)

2.50

3,375.00

27 November 2021

Review and revise term sheets for various possible
settlements and settlement agreements.

L Baccash

3.80

3,990.00

27 November 2021

Review and revise terms sheets for certain settling
insurers and chartered organizations  (1.7);
teleconference with R. Gorsich, L. Baccash, and A.
Azer re: same (0.8).

D Kim

2.50

2,612.50

28 November 2021

Attend mediation session.

J Lauria (Boelter)

1.00

1,350.00

28 November 2021

Review and revise re: term sheets (2.3); emails (0.2)
and phone conferences (0.2) re: Survivor Working
Group; coordinate Local Council connections re: same
(0.2).

M Andolina

2.90

3,770.00

28 November 2021

Review and revise term sheets for various possible
settlements and settlement agreements.

L Baccash

3.20

3,360.00

28 November 2021

Review and revise term sheet with settling insurers
(1.0); confer with R. Gorsich and L. Baccash re: same
(0.8); review and revise term sheet with certain
chartered organizations (1.3); correspond and confer
with debtors team re: same (0.4).

D Kim

3.50

3,657.50

29 November 2021

Attend mediation sessions.

J Lauria (Boelter)

3.00

4,050.00

29 November 2021

Attend mediation sessions with Coalition, insurer and
Methodist and Catholic Ad Hoc Committees (2.0);
follow-up emails (0.3) and phone conferences (0.3) re:
same.

M Andolina

2.60

3,380.00

29 November 2021

Video call with R. Gorsich, D. Kim, A. Azer, and others
re: mediation issues and plan supplement (1.2); call
with R. Gorsich, B. Warner, and D. Kim re: timeline
(0.3); review and revise terms sheets related to
settlements (2.5); review settlement agreements (1.5).

L Baccash

8.00

8,400.00

29 November 2021

Review revised term sheet re: certain chartered
organizations (0.7); review and revise Insurer
settlement agreement (0.3); confer with L. Baccash
and R. Gorsich re: same (0.4); confer with Coalition re:
same (0.1).

D Kim

1.50

1,567.50

30 November 2021

Attend mediation sessions (3.0); call with D. Molton
(0.5).

J Lauria (Boelter)

3.50

4,725.00

30 November 2021

Mediation sessions and Zoom calls with insurer,
Coalition, and Methodist and Catholic Ad Hoc
Committees (2.0); follow-up emails (0.1) and phone
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conferences (0.2) re: same with W&C team; emails
and phone conferences with W&C team re: mediation
session (1.0); emails and phone conferences with
W&C team re: Survivor Working Group (0.8).

30 November 2021 Review and revise term sheet, settlement agreements L Baccash 2.50 2,625.00
and related materials.

30 November 2021 Review revised terms for plan settlement term sheets D Kim 1.80 1,881.00
(0.9); review further revised term sheets (0.5);
correspond with debtor teams re: same (0.4).

30 November 2021 Send out Mediators' Notice to Mediation Parties D Kim 0.50 317.50
upcoming mediation matters.

SUBTOTAL: Mediation 200.40 241,422.50

Fee Examiner Issues and Communications

10 November 2021 Email to J. Rucki (Fee Examiner) re: Third Quarterly S Ludovici 0.10 101.50
Application.
11 November 2021 Call with B. Warner re: response to fee examiner (0.2); S Ludovici 2.60 2,639.00

call with Fee Examiner re: response to earlier queries
(0.5); review documents in follow up to call with fee
examiner (0.3); call with J. Rucki (Fee Examiner) and
B. Warner re: comments re: W&C interim fee app
(0.5); review documents in preparation for call (0.3);
review documents and emails after call in order to
prepare response to Fee Examiner (0.8).

11 November 2021 Call with J. Rucki and S. Ludovici re: third interim fee B Warner 0.30 291.00
application.

15 November 2021 Email to B. Warner re: fee examiner report. S Ludovici 0.10 101.50

16 November 2021 Review and analyze fee examiner report (1.3); emails S Ludovici 1.50 1,522.50

to B. Warner re: Fee Examiner's Initial Report (0.1);
read email from Warner, Blair re: Fee Examiner's Initial
Report (0.1).

17 November 2021 Review information from B. Bravo re: rates re: fee S Ludovici 1.10 1,116.50
examiner (0.2); review fee examiner report and draft
summary of same (0.8); email to J. Rucki re: Fee
Examiner's Initial Report (0.1).

22 November 2021 Email to B Warner re: fee examiner report (0.1); email S Ludovici 0.20 203.00
to J Rucki re: same (0.1).

SUBTOTAL: Fee Examiner Issues and Communications 5.90 5,975.00

Solicitation Procedures Enforcement Matters

6 November 2021 Emails with Coalition and BSA team re: TCC contact M Andolina 0.80 1,040.00
issues.

Page 132 of 151



Case 20-10343-LSS Doc 9308-2 Filed 03/12/22 Page 134 of 152
WHITE & CASE

Boy Scouts of America

RE: Project Restructuring OUR REF: 1786703-0002
DATE DESCRIPTION TIMEKEEPER HOURS usD
7 November 2021 Review materials concerning the TCC's G Kurtz 0.90 1,552.50

communication by T. Kosnoff to abuse victims
represented by other counsel.

7 November 2021 Review communication from Omni (0.3); review emails  J Lauria (Boelter) 9.10 12,285.00
from D. Molton (0.5); emails with W&C team re: same
(0.5); review letter to Stang and comment on same
multiple times (1.5); call with Coalition and FCR re:
unauthorized TCC communication (0.5); call with W&C
team re: same (0.5); communicate with W&C team re:
research concerning bankruptcy crimes, sanctions,
unauthorized communications with counsel,
unauthorized solicitation (3.5); review response from
Stang (0.3); emails with W&C team re: same (1.0);
calls with M. Andolina re: same (0.5).

7 November 2021 Draft and revise communications with TCC re: contact M Andolina 3.10 4,030.00
issues (1.6); phone conferences (1.0) and emails (0.5)
with BSA team and plan proponents re: same.

7 November 2021 Review correspondence re: TCC solicitation issues L Baccash 5.60 5,880.00
(0.2); call with D. Molton, E. Goodman, J. Lauria, M.
Linder, M. Andolina, and others re: solicitation issue
(0.5); call with J. Lauria, M. Andolina, and B. Warner
re: same (0.2); call with D. Kim, D. Rivero, and C.
Tuffey re: research re: same (0.3); draft letter re: same
and review and revise same (0.8); multiple calls with B.
Warner re: same (0.3); multiple communications with
J. Lauria, M. Andolina, and B. Warner re: same (0.2);
call with S. Hershey and B. Warner re: TCC motion
(0.3); call with B. Warner re: same (0.5); call with S.
Hershey re: same (0.1); review research on same
(0.5); correspondence re: same (0.2); research same
(1.5).

7 November 2021 Videoconference with Coaliton and FCR re: M Linder 2.30 2,415.00
TCC/Kosnoff email and letter (0.5); follow-up call with
W&C team re: same (0.4); numerous emails with BSA
advisors and Coalition and FCR teams re: same (0.8);
review and analyze correspondence to and from TCC
re: same (0.6).

7 November 2021 Correspond with B. Warner and L. Baccash re: S Hershey 0.70 745.50
potential discovery issue.

7 November 2021 Call with W&C team and A&M re: communication to B Warner 4.00 3,880.00
survivors (0.3); draft and revise letter to TCC re:
TCC/Kosnoff communications with L. Baccash (1.0);
conduct research on same (0.3); call with L. Baccash,
D. Kim, C. Tuffey and D. Rivero re: research on
committee actions (0.2); further draft and revise letter
to TCC with L. Baccash (0.3); conduct additional
research on same (0.2); review and comment on
follow-up letter (0.5); email same (0.1); strategize with
W&C team on same (0.1); call with S. Hershey re:
TCC voting communications (0.2); analyze research
re: voting communications (0.3); research re: voting
communications (0.2); call with L. Baccash, S.
Hershey, D. Abbott and P. Topper re: potential
strategy on voting communication issues (0.3).
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7 November 2021 Legal research re: precedent motions for sanctions for D Kim 8.70 5,524.50

improper communications (3.0); research re: standards
for sanctions and related relief (5.7).

7 November 2021 Call with L. Baccash, D. Kim, and C. Tuffey re: D Rivero 7.90 5,016.50
committee research issue (0.2); legal research re:
fiduciary duties and committees in bankruptcy (2.2);
review precedent motions re: same (1.2); draft analysis
re: same for L. Baccash (0.8); emails with L. Baccash
re: same (0.2); legal research re: breaches of fiduciary
duties in bankruptcy (2.6); draft analysis re: same for
L. Baccash (0.5); emails with C. Tuffey and D. Kim re:

same (0.2).
7 November 2021 Legal research re: TCC/Kosnoff matters. C Tuffey 4.20 2,667.00
8 November 2021 Conference with team concerning TCC's transmission G Kurtz 9.40 16,215.00

of Kosnoff's letter (0.6); conference with J. Lauria
concerning CMPs, privilege issues, workarounds and
risks (0.4); conference with plan proponents
concerning the TCC's transmittal to Kosnoff letter (0.6);
conference with A. Hammond concerning TDPs (0.5);
then review TDPs (1.9); identify issues for Bates White
(0.9); review and revise letter to the TCC concerning
Kosnoff letter (0.7); draft emails concerning the best
approach to the TCCs transmittal of the Kosnoff letter
(1.8); review and revise Requests for production to the
TCC (0.8); revisions to Requests for production to
Kosnoff (0.4); review and revise interrogatories to TCC
(0.8).

8 November 2021 Update call with client re: TCC/Kosnoff communication  J Lauria (Boelter) 3.80 5,130.00
(0.5); call with W&C team re: same (0.5); call with
Coalition and FCR re: same (0.5); emails with W&C
team re: discovery issues and TCC (1.0); review letter
and comment on same (1.0); review TCC press
release (0.3).

8 November 2021 Draft and revise follow-up communications with TCC M Andolina 3.60 4,680.00
re: contact issues (1.0); revise related discovery
requests (0.5); phone conferences (1.0) and emails
(0.4) with BSA team and plan proponents re: same;
communicate with client re: TCC contact issue update
(0.7).

8 November 2021 Draft and revise letter to TCC re: solicitation issue L Baccash 11.90 12,495.00
(1.5); draft and revise motion related to TCC
solicitation issue (10.0); call with M. Linder, S.
Hershey, and B. Warner re: same (0.4).

8 November 2021 Call with J. Lauria, M. Andolina, G. Kurtz, S. Hershey, L Baccash 1.40 1,470.00

D. Abbott, M. Linder, B. Warner, and others re: TCC
solicitation issues (0.4); call with J. Lauria, M. Linder,
M. Andolina, D. Molton, E. Goodman, E. Herron, J.
Bjork, P. Anker, and others re: same (0.7); call with K.
Nownes and B. Warner re: solicitation issues (0.2); call
with K. Nownes and B. Warner re: solicitation issues
(0.1).

8 November 2021 Emails with L. Baccash and S. Hershey re: discovery M Linder 10.70 11,235.00
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in connection with TCC and Kosnoff (0.2); emails with
P. Anker re: same (0.1); W&C call with MNAT re: same
(0.4); larger group call with Coalition, Insurer, etc. re:
same (0.6); telephone calls with L. Baccash re: same
(1.5); telephone call with L. Baccash, S. Hershey and
B. Warner re: same (0.5); draft motion to enforce
solicitation procedures (7.4).

8 November 2021

Correspond with L. Baccash, B. Warner and M. Linder
re: motion to compel (0.6); review precedents and draft
motion to compel (2.3); draft and revise discovery to
TCC and Kosnoff (1.4).

8 November 2021

Research and draft timeline re: TCC/Kosnoff
communications (1.7); review and comment on draft of
letter correspondence to TCC re: TCC/Kosnoff
communications (0.3); correspond with D. Rivero re:
factual research for motion (0.1); revise and finalize
draft of TCC letter re: TCC/Kosnoff communication
(0.8); call with L. Baccash re: TCC/Kosnoff solicitation
procedures enforcement motion (0.1); call with L.
Baccash re: drafting TCC/Kosnoff solicitation
procedures enforcement motion (0.8).

8 November 2021

Correspond with client re: ballot and voting matters
(0.1); Zoom conference with K. Nownes, J. Paul, M.
Meisler and L. Baccash re: solicitation and voting
matters (0.1); correspond with plan proponents re:
TCC/Kosnoff communications (0.2); call with D. Abbott
and W&C team re: strategy on same (0.4); correspond
with  W&C team and plan supporting parties re:
TCC/Kosnoff communication matters (0.3);
videoconference with Coalition, FCR, TCJC, Ad Hoc
Group of Local Councils, UCC, W&C team re:
TCC/Kosnoff communications (0.6).

8 November 2021

Correspond with A&M and S. Murray re: appraiser
documents (0.2); research re: TCC/Kosnoff solicitation
procedures enforcement motion (1.0); draft section of
same (0.7); follow-up calls with L. Baccash re: same
(0.3); call with Omni team, M. Linder and L. Baccash
re: Kosnoff TCC communications (0.1); draft and
revise TCC/Kosnoff solicitation procedures
enforcement motion (6.6).

8 November 2021

Research docket re: Kosnoff-related matters (0.4);
legal research re: case law re: attorneys’
communications (2.3); legal research re: solicitation
matters (1.1); draft standard re: solicitation motion
(1.3).

8 November 2021

Legal research re: motion to enforce solicitation
procedures order (2.8); revise and review re: same
(1.8); draft rider to motion to enforce solicitation
procedures order (2.4); correspond with B. Warner re:
same (0.2); correspond with C. Tuffey and D. Kim re:
motion to enforce solicitation procedures order (0.2);
draft part of declaration in support of same for B.
Warner (0.9).
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8 November 2021 Legal research re: preliminary injunction procedure C Tuffey 4.00 2,540.00

(3.5); legal research re: precedent motion (0.5).

9 November 2021 Review and revise multiple times the motion to enforce G Kurtz 3.70 6,382.50
the solicitation procedures (3.1); emails concerning
motion to enforce the solicitation order (0.4);
conference with M. Andolina concerning position
issues (0.2).

9 November 2021 Review pleading re: TCC “improper” communication  J Lauria (Boelter) 5.50 7,425.00
and extensive comments on same (1.5); further review
of revised pleading (2.0); numerous emails with G.
Kurtz and W&C team re: same and motion to shorten
(2.0).

9 November 2021 Review and revise motion on TCC solicitation issue, L Baccash 10.00 10,500.00
declaration, research (8.8); multiple calls with B.
Warner on same (0.7); multiple calls with M. Linder on
same (0.5).

9 November 2021 Emails with Client and B. Warner re: voting issues M Linder 8.90 9,345.00
(0.2); motion re: TCC/Kosnoff, motion to shorten,
supporting declaration, including telephone calls with
L. Baccash and B. Warner (8.5); review and analyze
Coalition joinder to same (0.2).

9 November 2021 Draft and revise solicitation procedures enforcement B Warner 13.30 12,901.00
motion (5.5); call with L. Baccash re: revisions to
solicitation procedures enforcement motion (0.1);
research re: revisions to draft of same (1.1);
correspond with D. Rivero re: factual research for
same (0.2); calls with L. Baccash re: revising draft of
emergency solicitation procedures enforcement motion
(1.0); research re: factual section of motion and
exhibits (2.0); analyze support for motion and exhibits
(1.0); correspond with client and local counsel re: draft
of same (0.2); correspond with D. Rivero, D. Kim, C.
Tuffey and D. Hirshorn re: revisions to motion and
declaration draft (0.2); correspond with Coalition
counsel re: declaration exhibits and support for motion
(0.2); review and revise Warner Declaration for filing
(1.0); revise and finalize motion to enforce documents
for filing (0.5); call with E. Goodman re: joinder, motion
and declaration status (0.1); review and manage filing
re: motion to enforce with MNAT (0.2).

9 November 2021 Cite check and review emergency motion (1.0); revise D Kim 5.80 3,683.00
Warner Declaration (3.8); review and collate transcript
excerpts for Emergency Motion Exhibits (1.0).

9 November 2021 Review, revise, and cite check motion to enforce D Rivero 8.50 5,397.50
solicitation procedures order (3.7); correspond with D.
Kim re: same (0.2); revise declaration in support of
same (1.4); revise and review exhibits to declaration
(1.9); correspond with D. Hirshorn re: same (0.2);
revise motion re: exhibits (0.8); email L. Baccash and
team re: cases cited in the motion (0.3).

9 November 2021 Draft exhibit pages re: motion to enforce (0.2); confer  C Tuffey 0.70 444.50
with D. Hirshorn re: same (0.1); legal research re:
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motion to enforce (0.4).

9 November 2021 Pull legal authority cited in Debtors' Motion to Enforce D Hirshorn 3.00 990.00
Solicitations Order (0.1); review and pull exhibits to
Motion to Enforce Solicitations Order (2.9).

10 November 2021 Draft emails concerning motion to enforce solicitation G Kurtz 3.30 5,692.50
procedures and potential resolution of the motion (0.5);
participate in hearing (2.8).

10 November 2021 Prepare for hearing re: TCC issues (2.0); attend J Lauria (Boelter) 6.00 8,100.00
hearing (2.5); attend call with client (0.5); numerous
emails re: corrective communication (1.0).

10 November 2021 Prepare for (0.2) and coordinate (1.5) TCC portion of M Andolina 1.70 2,210.00
omnibus hearing.

10 November 2021 Review and respond to correspondence from C. Tuffey L Baccash 1.00 1,050.00
re: solicitation (0.1); review docket re: solicitation
issues (0.1); call with B. Warner re: solicitation issues
(0.3); call with B. Warner, D. Kim, C. Tuffey, and D.
Rivero re: solicitation issues (0.3); review
correspondence with W&C team re: hearing (0.2).

10 November 2021 Review revised draft proposed letter for TCC M Linder 2.30 2,415.00

distribution (0.3); emails with W&C FRI and litigation
teams re: same (0.1); telephone call with L. Baccash
re: confirmation issues pertaining to TCC/Kosnoff
matter (0.4); research re: same (0.4); review Insurer
letter to Court re: Kosnoff discovery (0.6); review email
from survivor re: TCC/Kosnoff issues (0.2); emails with
J. Lauria and B. Warner re: same (0.2); emails with FTI
re: TCC/Kosnoff communications (0.1).

10 November 2021 Respond to email from J. Lucas re: proposed form of B Warner 2.20 2,134.00
order on motion to enforce solicitation procedures
(0.1); call with L. Baccash re: TCC enforcement
matters and case matters/next steps (0.3).

10 November 2021 Emails with L. Baccash, B. Warner, D. Kim, and C. D Rivero 1.60 1,016.00
Tuffey re: next steps and motion to enforce solicitation
order (0.2); review docket for letters from claimants re:
same (0.2); draft timeline of facts for J. Lauria re: same
(1.2).

11 November 2021 Review and revise proposed order concerning the G Kurtz 0.40 690.00
Kosnoff letter.

11 November 2021 Meet with Coalition re: TCC/Kosnoff situation (1.0);  J Lauria (Boelter) 6.40 8,640.00

meet again with Coalition re: same (1.0); call with
W&C team re: response to TCC/Kosnoff
communication (0.5); follow-up call with Coalition re:
same (0.5); review correspondence from survivor re:
situation (0.3); review order and letter and comment on
same (2.0); review diligence re: TCC situation (1.0);
email L. Baccash, M. Linder and W&C team re: same
(0.1).
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11 November 2021

Call with BSA team re: TCC communications and next
steps (0.5); coordinate re: 11/11 hearing (0.5); review
and revise communications re: TCC issues (1.1).

11 November 2021

Call with J. Stang, J. Lauria, M. Andolina, M. Linder, E.
Goodman, D. Molton, and others re: order related to
TCC solicitation issue (1.2); call with J. Stang, J.
Lauria, M. Andolina, M. Linder, E. Goodman, D.
Molton, and others re: order related to TCC solicitation
issue (0.4); call with M. Linder and D. Abbott re: same
(0.1); call with E. Goodman and M. Linder re: same
(0.1); review TCC letter and correspondence with J.
Lauria, M. Linder, and B. Warner re: letter (0.1); draft
bullets for J. Lauria for hearing (0.9); call with M.
Linder re: same (0.1).

11 November 2021

Draft letter re: solicitation issues from survivor (0.6);
review multiple correspondence from Omni team re:
solicitation questions (0.2); multiple calls with B.
Warner re: same (0.3); call with B. Warner, M. Meisler,
K. Nownes, and J. Paul re: solicitation issues (0.4); call
with J. Stang, J. Lauria, M. Andolina, M. Linder, E.
Goodman, D. Molton, and others re: order related to
TCC solicitation issue (0.5); review order related to
same (0.1); multiple calls with M. Linder and B. Warner
on proposed order on same (0.1).

11 November 2021

Videoconference with TCC, Coalition, FCR, UCC,
Insurer and TCJC teams re: TCC/Kosnoff
communications (0.5); review revised draft corrective
email and edits to form of order (0.4); emails with W&C
team re: same (0.2); telephone call with J. Stang, J.
Lauria, M. Andolina, L. Baccash, E. Goodman, D.
Molton and others re: order related to TCC solicitation
issue (1.2); call with M. Andolina, E. Goodman, L.
Baccash, B. Whittman, D. Molton, and others re:
litigation matters (0.7); further call with J. Stang, L.
Baccash, E. Goodman, D. Molton and others re: order
related to TCC solicitation issue (0.4); follow-up calls
with E. Goodman and L. Baccash re: same (0.2);
telephone calls with L. Baccash and D. Abbott re: TCC
solicitation issue (0.8); revise hearing notes re: same
(0.4); emails with J. Lauria re: same (0.2); review FTI
report re: TCC town hall (0.2); review further revised
versions of TCC and Debtors' draft emails (0.4); emails
with E. Goodman re: same (0.2); review and analyze
TCC discovery responses (0.7); emails with G. Kurtz
and S. Hershey re: same (0.2).

11 November 2021

Review and comment on draft of response letter to
survivor re: TCC enforcement matters (0.5); draft email
to W&C team re: comments to proposed revisions to
email communication to survivors from TCC (0.2); call
with L. Baccash re: TCC/Kosnoff communications
matters (0.2); Zoom conference with Coalition
representatives, TCC (PSZJ), Latham (TCJC), Insurer,
FCR and W&C team re: Kosnoff email communication
matters (0.5); revise and finalize draft of letter to
survivor re: TCC/Kosnoff communications and
enforcement matters (0.1); review and comment on
Coalition draft of Kosnoff communication response
letter (0.3); further Zoom conference with Coalition
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representatives, TCC (PSZJ), Latham (TCJC), Kramer
Levin (UCC), Insurer and W&C team re: Kosnoff email
communication matters (1.2); review and comment on
drafts of TCC/Kosnoff communication matters timeline
(0.7); review and comment on revised draft of
TCC/Kosnoff communications letter (0.3); call with
PSZJ, W&C team, Coalition counsel, MNAT, FCR
counsel, UCC counsel, Insurer counsel and TCJC
counsel re: negotiation of TCC enforcement matter
and revised form of order (1.0); analyze TCC discovery
responses re: Kosnoff/ TCC letter (0.1); correspond
with S. Hershey on same (0.1).

11 November 2021

Correspond with L. Baccash re: motion for sanctions
for TCC (0.1); reviewed documents for motion for
sanctions for TCC (0.9).

S Murray

1.00

920.00

11 November 2021

Summarize key cases in emergency motion in
preparation for hearings.

D Kim

3.70

2,349.50

11 November 2021

Emails with L. Baccash, B. Warner, D. Kim, and C.
Tuffey re: motion to enforce solicitation order (0.1);
draft materials for J. Lauria in preparation for court
hearing re: same (2.8).

D Rivero

2.90

1,841.50

11 November 2021

Create binder for J. Lauria re: motion to enforce
solicitation procedures order (2.0); correspond with C.
Canellas to deliver to J. Lauria (0.1).

D Hirshorn

2.10

693.00

12 November 2021

Conference with J. Lauria concerning the Kosnoff letter
in advance of the hearing (0.2); participate in hearing
concerning Kosnoff letter and confirmation schedule
(2.1); conference with J. Lauria concerning the hearing
and next steps (0.4); review discovery concerning
Kosnoff communications (1.6).

G Kurtz

4.30

7,417.50

12 November 2021

Call with Coalition to discuss voting issues (1.0);
emails with G. Kurtz, B. Warner, and team re: voting
issues (0.5).

J Lauria (Boelter)

1.50

2,025.00

12 November 2021

Review discovery concerning Kosnoff communications
(1.0) and comment to W&C team re: same (0.2);
emails with D. Grassgreen (TCC) re: same (0.3);
numerous emails with W&C team and coalition re:
remedial email (0.6).

J Lauria (Boelter)

2.10

2,835.00

12 November 2021

Prepare for (0.3) and attend (1.0) hearing re: TCC
communications; follow-up emails (0.1) and phone
conferences (0.4) re: same.

M Andolina

1.80

2,340.00

12 November 2021

Call with B. Warner, S. Hershey and others re: TCC
motion (0.3); draft and revise motion re: TCC (3.5).

L Baccash

3.80

3,990.00

12 November 2021

Attend hearing on TCC/Kosnoff remedial
communications (2.2); telephone call with L. Baccash
and S. Hershey re: potential further relief in connection
with TCC/Kosnoff matter (0.2).
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12 November 2021

Draft discovery requests to TCC re: Kosnoff (1.3);
correspond with B. Warner, L. Baccash and M. Linder
re: same (0.6).

S Hershey

1.90

2,023.50

12 November 2021

Email to B. Warner and L. Baccash re: analysis of fee
tracking issues (0.1); email to J. Vizconde re: tracking
of Solicitation Procedures Enforcement matter (0.1);
emails to B. Warner and L. Baccash re: Solicitation
Procedures Enforcement (0.2).

S Ludovici

0.40

406.00

12 November 2021

Research issues arising during hearing re: emergency
relief on TCC/Kosnoff communications (2.0); call with
L. Baccash, S. Murray, and D. Kim re: draft sanctions
motion (0.3); correspond with S. Ludovici re: fees
tracking re: TCC enforcement matters (0.1); call with
A. Remming and P. Topper re: draft sanctions motion
(0.2); review discovery materials re: TCC/Kosnoff
matter (0.4); correspond with S. Hershey re: same
(0.1); draft sanctions motion (2.0).

B Warner

5.10

4,947.00

12 November 2021

Confer with L. Baccash re: motion for sanctions for
TCC (0.1); review documents for motion for sanctions
for TCC (0.9).

S Murray

1.00

920.00

12 November 2021

Perform review of TCC’'s production of documents
responsive to Plan confirmation discovery requests.

D Rifkin

1.20

1,002.00

12 November 2021

Telephone call with S. Hershey and J. Thomas re:
review of TCC documents re: Kosnoff letter (0.3);
review and summarize TCC documents re: Kosnoff
letter (1.6).

C Davis

1.90

1,206.50

12 November 2021

Attend team meeting to discuss Kosnoff document
review protocol (0.3); review documents re:
TCC/Kosnoff solicitation matter (1.6).

R Phadtare

1.90

1,206.50

12 November 2021

Emails with D. Kim and C. Tuffey re: cases cited in the
motion to enforce solicitation order (0.2); analyze and
review re: same (1.9).

D Rivero

2.10

1,333.50

13 November 2021

Analyze letters and reports concerning Kosnoff
communications.

G Kurtz

0.80

1,380.00

13 November 2021

Call with W&C team re: addressing TCC issue (1.0);
revise letter to PSZJ (1.0).

J Lauria (Boelter)

2.00

2,700.00

13 November 2021

Review TCC production and responses (1.2); emails
with BSA team re: same (0.5).

M Andolina

1.70

2,210.00

13 November 2021

Participate in conference call with M. Andolina, S.
Hershey, and J. Lauria re: TCC/Kosnoff issues and
discovery re: same (1.5); review and comment on
discovery re: same (0.6); review and edit responses
(0.8).

A Hammond

2.90

3,726.50

13 November 2021

Review and revise letter to TCC.
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13 November 2021 Call with J. Lauria, M. Linder, D. Molton, P. Anker, J. L Baccash 4.20 4,410.00

Bjork, and others re: TCC litigation matter (0.7); call
with B. Warner re: same (0.1); call with M. Linder re:
same (0.1); review research and motion draft re: TCC
litigation from D. Kim (0.6); review and revise letter re:
TCC litigation matter (2.1); review and revise order re:
same (0.4); review and revise discovery re: same
(0.2).

13 November 2021 Telephone call with W&C team, Coalition, FCR, M Linder 5.80 6,090.00

Insurer and TCJC re: next steps with regard to TCC
solicitation matter (0.7); telephone call with J. Lauria
re: same (0.1); telephone calls with B. Warner re:
same (0.4); telephone call with M. Andolina re: same
(0.1); telephone call with S. Hershey re: same (0.1);
telephone calls with L. Baccash re: same (0.2); review,
revise, and finalize letter to PSZJ, revised form of
order, supplemental discovery and deposition notices
(4.2).

13 November 2021 Call with M. Andolina, J. Lauria and D. Molton re: S Hershey 2.20 2,343.00
solicitation issue (0.7); correspond with M. Linder re:
same (0.2); review and revise letter to TCC (0.7);
review and revise discovery requests to TCC (0.6).

13 November 2021 Draft email to timekeepers re: TCC enforcement B Warner 7.10 6,887.00
matter (0.1); call with W&C team, Coalition counsel,
TCJC counsel, FCR counsel re: next steps on
TCC/Kosnoff communications (1.0); research re:
solicitation enforcement matters (1.0); draft letter to
TCC re: solicitation enforcement matters and discovery
(2.0); revise draft of TCC letter re: TCC solicitation
enforcement matters (1.9); extensive correspondence
with M. Linder, S. Hershey, and L. Baccash re:
finalizing the same (0.7); revise drafts of TCC
supplemental discovery requests (0.3); call with D.
Abbott re: same (0.1).

13 November 2021 Confer with B. Warner re: TCC production for motion S Murray 4.30 3,956.00
for sanctions for TCC (0.1); review and analyze TCC
productions re: same (2.9); draft summary of same
and circulate to B. Warner, L. Baccash and D. Kim
(1.3).

13 November 2021 Perform review of TCC’s production of documents D Rifkin 1.10 918.50
responsive to Plan confirmation discovery requests.

13 November 2021 Draft Basis of Relief section re: draft Motion to D Kim 7.70 4,889.50
Sanction.
13 November 2021 Review documents pertaining to Timothy Kosnoff's R Phadtare 0.10 63.50

involvement in BSA Plan proceedings.

14 November 2021 Review and revise proposed order concerning Kosnoff G Kurtz 0.60 1,035.00
communications (0.3); analyze emails concerning
comments (0.3).

14 November 2021 Call with W&C team re: issues with form of order re:  J Lauria (Boelter) 2.00 2,700.00
PSZJ (0.5); several emails with W&C team re: same
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(1.5).

14 November 2021

Emails with G. Kurtz and S. Hershey re: additional
production and responses (0.5); phone conferences
with TCC re: document request and interrogatory
responses (1.0); follow-up emails with W&C team re:
same (0.3).

M Andolina

1.80

2,340.00

14 November 2021

Correspondence with M. Linder and S. Hershey re:
TCC litigation matter (0.1); call with D. Grassgreen, A.
Kornfeld, J. Lauria, and M. Linder re: TCC litigation
matter (0.7); correspondence re: revised order with G.
Kurtz and J. Lauria (0.1); review same (0.1); call with
D. Abbott and M. Linder re: filing of interim order (0.1).

L Baccash

1,155.00

14 November 2021

Correspond with M. Linder, L. Baccash and M.
Andolina re: discovery re: TCC.

S Hershey

0.90

958.50

15 November 2021

Emails with Coalition counsel re: status of
TCC/Kosnoff review and communications (0.5); call
with W&C team re: same (0.5).

J Lauria (Boelter)

1.00

1,350.00

15 November 2021

Emails with TCC counsel re: document production and
deposition schedule issues (0.8); follow-up emails with
W&C team re: same (0.4); review and revise draft filing
(0.8); emails (0.1) and phone conferences (0.3) with G.
Kurtz, S. Hershey re: same.

M Andolina

2.40

3,120.00

15 November 2021

Multiple correspondence with. J. Lauria, A. Preis, and
others re: TCC/Kosnoff issues.

R Gorsich

1.00

1,200.00

15 November 2021

Draft status report re: TCC issues (3.8); multiple calls
with B. Warner re: same (1.0).

L Baccash

4.80

5,040.00

15 November 2021

Email to J. Vizconde re: pro forma for tracking
Solicitation Procedures Enforcement.

S Ludovici

0.10

101.50

15 November 2021

Call with L. Baccash re: comments from various
parties (0.3); call with L. Baccash re: revisions to
TCC/Kosnoff status report and exhibits (1.3); draft
communication to Coalition, MNAT and W&C team re:
TCC/Kosnoff status report draft (0.2); draft and revise
email to TCC re: confidentiality designation (0.3); call
with L. Baccash re: solicitation and TCC/Kosnoff
solicitation procedures enforcement matters (0.2).

B Warner

2.30

2,231.00

15 November 2021

Call with L. Baccash re: next steps on TCC
enforcement matters (0.1); correspond with Omni re:
TCC/Kosnoff claims list matters (0.1); review and
comment on draft of TCC/Kosnoff status report (0.7);
call with K. Nownes, J. Paul, M. Meisler and L.
Baccash re: review of TCC/Kosnoff claims lists (0.2);
revise status report re: comments from various parties
(0.6).

B Warner

1.70

1,649.00

15 November 2021

Confer L. Baccash re: citations for motions for
sanctions for TCC.
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15 November 2021

Perform review of TCC’'s production of documents
responsive to Plan confirmation discovery requests.

D Rifkin

0.50

417.50

16 November 2021

Review and comment on draft status report.

J Lauria (Boelter)

0.50

675.00

16 November 2021

Revise draft filing (0.8); emails (0.2) and phone
conferences (0.3) with BSA team re: same; prepare for
11/17 hearing (0.8); phone conferences re: same with
W&C team (0.2).

M Andolina

2.30

2,990.00

16 November 2021

Correspond with J. Lauria re: TCC hearing
preparation.

S Hershey

0.30

319.50

16 November 2021

Revise status report re: motion to enforce solicitation
procedures re: comments from various parties (1.4);
revise status report and finalize with all exhibits for
filing (0.8); revise timeline re: status conference
hearing preparation (0.6); analyze and distribute
supplemental TCC statement to W&C team (0.1).

B Warner

2.90

2,813.00

16 November 2021

Review and analyze documents re: Kosnoff/TCC
email.

R Phadtare

0.40

254.00

16 November 2021

Pull hearing excerpts for B. Warner.

D Hirshorn

0.20

66.00

17 November 2021

Strategize for hearing, including review emails
concerning discovery on the TCC Kosnoff
communications (0.9); conference with S. Hershey
concerning discovery issues that might come up at the
hearing (0.1); participate in the status conference
concerning  Kosnoff communications and the
confirmation schedule (1.8); conference with J. Lauria
re: same (0.2); review research concerning TCC ethics
issues (0.3).

G Kurtz

3.30

5,692.50

17 November 2021

Review documents produced in discovery (0.5);
prepare for hearing re: TCC/Kosnoff issues (3.0);
attend hearing (1.0).

J Lauria (Boelter)

4.50

6,075.00

17 November 2021

Attend hearing on Solicitation Procedures motion (1.8);
follow-up with J. Lauria re: same (0.2); review and
revise notice re: J. Lucas communications (0.3); phone
conferences with TCC counsel re: depositions and
document production (1.5).

M Andolina

3.80

4,940.00

17 November 2021

Attend hearing re: TCC matter.

S Hershey

1.80

1,917.00

17 November 2021

Prepare for hearing re: research questions (0.5); revise
hearing preparation materials re: comments from J.
Lauria (1.0); review and comment on TCC letter draft
(1.0); revise letter to TCC (0.4); email re: same to
W&C team (0.2); revise letter to TCC re: comments
from W&C team (0.5).

B Warner

3.60

3,492.00

17 November 2021

Correspond internally re: review of correspondence
with T. Kosnoff (0.5); analyze and review re:
documents produced by TCC (1.1).
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17 November 2021 Extensive legal research re: ethical requirements re: D Kim 8.20 5,207.00
communications with clients.

17 November 2021 Review and analyze documents re: Kosnoff R Phadtare 0.20 127.00
communication.

18 November 2021 Analyze Kosnoff communication issues, including new G Kurtz 0.50 862.50
tweets and emails re: same.

18 November 2021 Review letter to R. Pachulski (0.5); review response to  J Lauria (Boelter) 0.70 945.00
same (0.2).

18 November 2021 Review and revise letter to TCC re: town hall meetings M Andolina 2.30 2,990.00
(0.6); follow-up emails (0.2) and phone conferences
(0.3) with TCC counsel re: same; review production
and responses (0.5); draft outline for depositions (0.5);
follow-up with BSA team re: same (0.2).

18 November 2021 Correspond with A. Hong and L. Karchmer re: TCC S Hershey 0.90 958.50
and Kosnoff issue.

18 November 2021 Revise letter to TCC (0.4); email same (0.1). B Warner 0.50 485.00

18 November 2021 Call with S. Hershey and L. Karchmer re: TCC A Hong 1.50 1,095.00
depositions (0.7); review documents re: S. Golden in
preparation for deposition (0.8).

18 November 2021 Correspond internally re: review of TCC production A Zegger 0.40 292.00
volumes.

18 November 2021 Meet with supervising attorneys (S. Hershey and A. L Karchmer 0.80 508.00
Hong) to discuss document review assignment in
preparation for depositions.

19 November 2021 Review TCC document production (5.0); follow-up M Andolina 5.50 7,150.00
emails with J. Lauria, L. Baccash, and G. Kurtz, S.
Hershey, and R. Gorsich re: same (0.5).

19 November 2021 Review and analyze materials and correspondence re: R Gorsich 1.60 1,920.00
TCC issues (0.6); review correspondence and
materials re: TCC issues (1.0).

19 November 2021 Review TCC discovery re: Kosnoff matter. S Hershey 0.30 319.50

19 November 2021 Correspond with D. Hirshorn and D. Rivero re: B Warner 0.20 194.00
discovery preparation requests.

19 November 2021 Call with M. Andolina and L. Karchmer re: depositions A Hong 11.10 8,103.00
(0.4); review background documents re: Kosnoff letter
(1.1); review TCC productions for documents re: S.
Golden for use in deposition (4.3); call with L.
Karchmer and vendor re: deposition logistics (0.4);
review additional TCC productions for documents re:
S. Golden (4.9).

19 November 2021 Correspond internally with I. Fathy, J. Ho, and J. 0.30 219.00
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Thomas re: targeted review of correspondence with T.
Kosnoff.

19 November 2021

Review documents related to Kosnoff letter sent to
survivors re: Chapter 11 hearing.

C Davis

5.30

3,365.50

19 November 2021

Review documents produced in response to discovery
requests in preparation for discovery (1.4); review
transcripts (1.0).

L Karchmer

2.40

1,624.00

19 November 2021

Review documents re: Kosnoff communication.

R Phadtare

4.30

2,730.50

19 November 2021

Review documents re: Kosnoff and abuse claims.

R Mederos

4.70

2,655.50

19 November 2021

Investigate Kosnoff Law Twitter documents (0.8); work
with D. Hirshorn on collecting Twitter data on Kosnoff
(0.2).

M Fuhr

1.00

385.00

19 November 2021

Telephone call (partial) with M. Fuhr re: extracting
social media information (0.1); attend meeting re:
program to pull social media information (0.1); review,
extract, and organize of Kosnoff Law tweets in
preparation for upcoming deposition (9.3).

D Hirshorn

9.50

3,135.00

20 November 2021

Attend call with BSA team re: TCC issue.

J Lauria (Boelter)

1.00

1,350.00

20 November 2021

Attend conference call re: Kosnoff issues.

A Hammond

1,413.50

20 November 2021

Attend call with M. Andolina and G. Kurtz re: TCC
depositions.

S Hershey

0.70

745.50

20 November 2021

Call with plan supporters, W&C team and Haynes and
Boone re: TCC and Kosnoff communications
discovery.

B Warner

0.70

679.00

20 November 2021

Review additional TCC productions for S. Golden
deposition documents (4.7); draft analysis and
summarize relevant documents for S. Golden
deposition (0.5); standing call re: upcoming TCC
depositions (0.7); call with L. Karchmer re: document
review (0.3); call with M. Andolina re: deposition
exhibits (0.2); emails with M. Andolina, S. Hershey,
and L. Karchmer re: S. Golden deposition (0.5); call
with M. Andolina re: same (0.2); draft and review
exhibits for S. Golden deposition (1.8); review Kosnoff
production (1.6).

A Hong

10.50

7,665.00

20 November 2021

Correspond internally with J. Thomas and A. Hong re:
document review of correspondence with T. Kosnoff
issues.

A Zegger

0.30

219.00

20 November 2021

Review documents produced in response to Discovery
Request in preparation for Deposition (1.0); review
transcripts from prior court hearings for relevant text in
preparation for deposition (1.2); meet with team (A.
Hong and S. Hershey) to discuss exhibits and
production responses in preparation for depositions
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20 November 2021 Review Kosnoff Twitter exports. M Fuhr 0.40 154.00

20 November 2021 Continued review, extraction and organization of D Hirshorn 4.00 1,320.00
Kosnoff Law tweets in preparation for upcoming
deposition.

21 November 2021 Draft emails concerning the evidence being developed G Kurtz 0.60 1,035.00

at the deposition of Golden.

21 November 2021

Review documents for S. Golden deposition (2.2); M Andolina 7.00 9,100.00
prepare for (1.0) and take (3.5) S. Golden deposition;
confer with team re: same (0.3).

21 November 2021 Attend portions of Golden deposition. R Gorsich 3.00 3,600.00
21 November 2021 Attend deposition related to TCC litigation matter. L Baccash 2.00 2,100.00
21 November 2021 Prepare for (0.3) and attend (3.5) Golden deposition. S Hershey 3.80 4,047.00
21 November 2021 Draft bullet points re: TCC/Kosnoff discovery (0.3); B Warner 0.40 388.00

create documents re: deposition preparation (0.1).

21 November 2021

Emails with team re: Kosnoff production review (0.3); J Thomas 0.60 552.00
review of document re: same (0.3).

21 November 2021

Review Kosnoff production (1.7); draft summary re: A Hong 8.90 6,497.00
Kosnoff production (0.5); emails with M. Andolina, S.
Hershey, and L. Karchmer re: Golden deposition (0.9);
emails with J. Thomas and A. Zegger re: TCC
productions (0.3); attend deposition of S. Golden (3.5);
review documents re: Kosnoff for upcoming
depositions (0.9); review and remove inadvertently
produced Kosnoff documents for discovery (0.3); email
re: same (0.1); review S. Golden rough draft transcript

(0.7).
21 November 2021 Review correspondence with T. Kosnoff. A Zegger 3.00 2,190.00
21 November 2021 Prepare for deposition with team (1.7); appear at L Karchmer 3.30 2,095.50

(partial) deposition of S. Golden (1.6).

21 November 2021

Review documents re: TCC/Kosnoff matters. R Phadtare 3.60 2,286.00

22 November 2021

Review S. Golden transcript and other documents in M Andolina 6.80 8,840.00
preparation for J. Stang and J. Lucas depositions (3.2);

review documents and prepare for Lucas and Stang

depositions (3.6).

22 November 2021

Attend Kosnoff deposition. S Hershey 7.60 8,094.00

22 November 2021

Review S. Golden deposition transcript re: objections A Hong 6.90 5,037.00
(2.0); emails with S. Hershey and MNAT re: same
(0.2); review documents re: H. Phan (1.0); draft
exhibits for H. Phan deposition (0.4); draft exhibits for
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Lucas deposition (3.1); emails with M. Andolina re:
exhibits for upcoming TCC depositions (0.2).

22 November 2021

Conduct document review of TCC productions (5.8);
correspond internally with J. Thomas, A. Rogers and
discovery team re: the same (0.2).

A Zegger

6.00

4,380.00

22 November 2021

Work with team to select exhibits for upcoming
deposition.

L Karchmer

0.80

508.00

23 November 2021

Review correspondence and proposed motion
concerning voting ombudsman.

G Kurtz

0.40

690.00

23 November 2021

Numerous emails and calls with Coalition and W&C
team re: TCC motion to appoint an ombudsman to
address TCC issues (1.5); review draft (1.0).

J Lauria (Boelter)

2.50

3,375.00

23 November 2021

Revise deposition outline for Pachulski.

J Lauria (Boelter)

1.00

1,350.00

23 November 2021

Prepare for (0.7) and take (2.5) H. Phan deposition;
prepare for (0.9) and take (6.3) J. Lucas deposition;
prepare for Stang deposition (1.0).

M Andolina

11.40

14,820.00

23 November 2021

Confer with J. Lauria, M. Andolina, L. Baccash and B.
Warner re: TCC motion re: voting ombudsperson (0.5);
review motion re: same (0.6).

R Gorsich

1,320.00

23 November 2021

Call with J. Lauria, B. Warner, J. Ruggeri, J. Bjork, E.
Goodman and others re: TCC voting motion (0.5); call
with B. Warner, A. Goldfarb and others re: solicitation
issues (0.4); multiple calls with B. Warner re: motion
and solicitation issues (0.5).

L Baccash

1.40

1,470.00

23 November 2021

Attend Hung deposition.

S Hershey

1,171.50

23 November 2021

Review TCC motion for voting ombudsperson (0.4);
confer with L. Baccash and J. Lauria re: same (0.2).

D Kim

0.60

627.00

23 November 2021

Review and analyze draft ombudsman motion (0.3);
call with plan supporters and W&C team re: draft TCC
ombudsman motion (0.5); correspond with W&C team
re: draft objection on same (0.2).

B Warner

1.00

970.00

23 November 2021

Call with M. Andolina re: exhibits for Lucas deposition
(0.1); draft additional exhibits for Lucas deposition
(1.9); attend deposition of H. Phan (2.7); emails with
M. Andolina re: exhibits for Lucas deposition (0.4);
attend (partial) deposition of J. Lucas (5.8); draft
exhibits for Stang deposition (1.8).

A Hong

12.70

9,271.00

23 November 2021

Conduct document review of TCC productions (3.9);
correspond internally with C. Edmonds re: the same
(0.2).

A Zegger

4.10

2,993.00

23 November 2021

Consult with team in preparation of depositions (0.1);
appear at and manage exhibits in deposition of H.
Phan (1.0); appear at (partial) and manage exhibits in
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deposition of J. Lucas (2.3).

23 November 2021

Continued research of Kosnoff Law tweets.

D Hirshorn

0.20

66.00

24 November 2021

Participate in call with team concerning ombudsman
voting request (0.6); review ombudsman motion (0.7);
draft inserts for response (2.2).

G Kurtz

3.50

6,037.50

24 November 2021

Meet and confer re: ombudsman (0.5); follow up with
Coalition and plan supporters re: same (0.5).

J Lauria (Boelter)

1.00

1,350.00

24 November 2021

Prepare for (0.9) and take (6.3) Stang deposition.

M Andolina

7.20

9,360.00

24 November 2021

Attend (partial) Stang deposition.

S Hershey

4.20

4,473.00

24 November 2021

Meet and confer call with TCC, W&C team, FCR,
Coalition, and various case representatives re:
emergency motion to shorten and voting ombudsman
motion (0.5); emails with W&C team re: research and
strategy on objection to TCC ombudsman motion (0.3);
respond to email from R. Telemi re: plan confirmation
discovery matters (0.2); correspond with Morris
Nichols team re: TCC voting ombudsman motion and
timing (0.1); draft objection to motion to shorten and
TCC voting ombudsman motion (3.4); correspond with
W&C team, Morris Nichols and Coalition re: various
TCC ombudsman motion developments (0.3).

B Warner

4.80

4,656.00

24 November 2021

Emails with M. Andolina and L. Karchmer re: exhibits
for Stang deposition (0.3); attend (partial) deposition of
J. Stang (4.8).

A Hong

5.10

3,723.00

24 November 2021

Correspond internally with A. Rogers and Z. Sporn re:
TCC document production review.

A Zegger

3.00

2,190.00

24 November 2021

Appear in (partial) and manage exhibits throughout
deposition of J. Stang.

L Karchmer

2.00

1,270.00

24 November 2021

Legal research re: case law and legal basis re: plan
voting ombudsman (3.8); review prior hearing
transcripts for discussion re: the form of contacting
clients (3.9).

D Kim

7.70

4,889.50

24 November 2021

Legal research re: cited provisions in emergency
motion to appoint voting ombudsman (2.1); follow up
research re: same (0.6); draft reply re: same (4.1).

C Tuffey

6.80

4,318.00

26 November 2021

Participate in call with team outlining response to
voting ombudsman motion (1.0); review final voting
ombudsman motion (0.3); begin outlining response
(2.3).

G Kurtz

3.60

6,210.00

26 November 2021

Review Pachulski deposition exhibits and emails with
A. Kornfeld re: re-designation issues (0.7); emails (0.3)
and phone conferences (0.3) re: 11/29 hearing and
filing response.
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26 November 2021

Call with J. Lauria, B. Warner and others re:
ombudsman motion (0.5); review objection to TCC
ombudsman motion (0.5).

L Baccash

1.00

1,050.00

26 November 2021

Call with M. Andolina and G. Kurtz re: ombudsman
motion.

S Hershey

0.90

958.50

26 November 2021

Correspond with W&C team re: objection to TCC
voting ombudsman motion (0.1); call with litigation
team, D. Abbott and MNAT team re: objection to TCC
voting ombudsman motion (1.0); call with D. Abbott re:
same (0.1); call with L. Karchmer and A. Hong re: TCC
voting ombudsman objection (0.2); draft and revise
TCC voting ombudsman objection (5.3).

B Warner

6.70

6,499.00

26 November 2021

Draft facts section for response to ombudsman motion
(5.0); call with B. Warner and L. Karchmer re: same
(0.2).

A Hong

5.20

3,796.00

26 November 2021

Correspond internally re: TCC document review and
documents flagged during the same.

A Zegger

0.30

219.00

26 November 2021

Review documents re: received production from TCC.

T Wiheba

8.80

5,676.00

26 November 2021

Review transcripts from depositions to support fact
section of Objection to Motion to Shorten (3.5); draft
fact section of Objection to Motion to Shorten (1.2).

L Karchmer

4.70

2,984.50

26 November 2021

Draft insert re: ethics rules for reply to emergency
motion.

C Tuffey

1.40

889.00

27 November 2021

Draft response to TCC Ombudsman motion (1.0);
confer with J. Lauria, B. Warner, and L. Baccash re:
same (0.5).

M Andolina

1.50

1,950.00

27 November 2021

Review and revise objection to TCC ombudsman
motion.

L Baccash

1.00

1,050.00

27 November 2021

Correspond with A. Hong and L. Karchmer re:
objection to ombudsman motion (0.9); review and
revise objection to ombudsman motion (3.7).

S Hershey

4.60

4,899.00

27 November 2021

Correspond with C. Tuffey re: TCC voting ombudsman
objection (0.2); revise and incorporate comments to
TCC voting ombudsman objection (3.1); draft email re:
next steps on TCC voting ombudsman objection (0.3).

B Warner

3.60

3,492.00

27 November 2021

Call with S. Hershey and L. Karchmer re: ombudsman
motion (0.3); emails with S. Hershey and L. Karchmer
re: same (0.5).

A Hong

0.80

584.00

27 November 2021

Correspond internally with J. Thomas, A. Rogers, L.
Quinn, and R. Demoulin and others re: TCC
productions.

A Zegger

0.20

146.00

27 November 2021

Review documents re: received production from TCC.
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TIMEKEEPER

HOURS
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27 November 2021

Review transcripts from prior hearings for supporting
language for motion (2.2); revise fact section of
Objection to Motion to Shorten (1.0).

L Karchmer

3.20

2,032.00

28 November 2021

Draft preliminary statement and response to voting
ombudsman motion (3.3); conference with J. Lauria re:
same (0.1); review comments to response to
ombudsman motion (0.5).

G Kurtz

3.90

6,727.50

28 November 2021

Review and revise response to TCC Ombudsman
motion re: Pachulski testimony and emails (2.5); phone
conferences with L. Baccash and B. Warner re: same
(0.8).

M Andolina

3.30

4,290.00

28 November 2021

Review and revise objection related to TCC
ombudsman issue.

L Baccash

1.30

1,365.00

28 November 2021

Review and revise objection to ombudsman motion
(2.1); correspond with B. Warner and L. Baccash re:
same (0.5).

S Hershey

2.60

2,769.00

28 November 2021

Revise draft of objection to TCC voting ombudsman
motion (0.8); research re: comments on same (1.0);
correspond with L. Karchmer re: revisions to same
(0.2); revise draft of objection to TCC voting
ombudsman motion (0.3); email re: the same to W&C
team (0.1); review and respond to email requests from
J. Thomas re: same (0.3); correspond with D. Kim and
C. Tuffey re: revisions to draft of voting ombudsman
objection (0.1); further revise objection to TCC voting
ombudsman motion (4.3).

B Warner

7.10

6,887.00

28 November 2021

Emails with B. Warner, S. Hershey, and L. Karchmer
re: objection to ombudsman motion (0.9); emails with
D. Kim re: exhibits for motion to shorten (0.3).

A Hong

1.20

876.00

28 November 2021

Work with team to finalize draft of Opposition to Motion
to Shorten.

L Karchmer

1.80

1,143.00

28 November 2021

Compare releases in proposed settlement against
current draft of TDP releases (2.5); cite check and
review Objection to TCC's Ombudsman motion (4.5);
draft and fill out outstanding cites to deposition
transcripts (0.8).

D Kim

7.80

4,953.00

28 November 2021

Revise reply to emergency motion re: ethics research.

C Tuffey

0.20

127.00

29 November 2021

Review and further revise to ombudsman motion (1.2);
conference with B. Warner re: same (0.1); attend court
hearing on ombudsman voting motion and certain
discovery issues (2.7).

G Kurtz

4.00

6,900.00

29 November 2021

Review discovery (1.0); review reply to ombudsman
motion (1.0).

J Lauria (Boelter)

2.00

2,700.00

29 November 2021

Prepare for (0.7) and attend (1.2) portions of hearing
related to Solicitation enforcement matters; review and
revise Opposition in response to TCC Ombudsman
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Motion (1.2); follow-up emails (0.3) and phone
conferences (0.2) with BSA team re: same.

29 November 2021 Attend portions of Court status conference re: TCC D Kim 1.50 1,567.50
motion for voting ombudsman and motion to shorten
same (0.9); review opposition to TCC motion for voting
ombudsman (0.6).

29 November 2021 Research during hearing re: response to various TCC B Warner 2.90 2,813.00
ombudsman questions (0.5); revise objection to TCC
voting ombudsman motion (0.5); multiple calls with
W&C team members re: final revisions to objection to
TCC voting ombudsman motion (1.9).

29 November 2021 Review and complete cite checking of Objection to D Kim 1.10 698.50
TCC's Ombudsman motion for filing.

29 November 2021 Review documents in connection with discovery S Precht 1.50 952.50
request.
29 November 2021 Review and organize exhibits to objection to TCC's D Hirshorn 0.60 198.00

Ombudsman motion.

30 November 2021 Prepare for (0.5) and attend (1.0) phone conference M Andolina 1.90 2,470.00
with US Trustee's office; follow up with W&C team re:
same (0.4).

30 November 2021 Review and comment on US Trustee email re: voting B Warner 0.40 388.00

ombudsman and ballot matters (0.2); draft email to J.
Lauria re: US Trustee voting ombudsman email
questions (0.2).

SUBTOTAL.: Solicitation Procedures Enforcement Matters 688.80 670,905.00

Omni Matters

30 November 2021 Draft email to A. Goldfarb re: voting and solicitation B Warner 0.80 776.00
matter (0.1); call with L. Baccash re: voting and
solicitation matters (0.2); call with L. Baccash and
Omni team re: solicitation and voting matters and case
timeline (0.5).

SUBTOTAL: Omni Matters 0.80 776.00

TOTAL 5,309.60 4,723,028.50
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Exhibit B

Expense Detail

Work Timekeeper Name English Narrative Description Bill
Date Amount

11/23/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | One-way trip, First Class (billed at comparable economy rate) airfare with American | Airfare 504.40
Airlines from Miami to New York for Jessica Lauria on 11/16/2021 in order to
attend mediation

11/23/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | One-way trip, First Class (billed at comparable economy rate) airfare with American | Airfare 444.40
Airlines from New York to Miami for Jessica Lauria on 11/18/2021 in order to
attend mediation

11/19/2021 | Hershey, Samuel Group Dinner for Ryan Walsh (Alvarez and Marsal), Brian Whittman (Alvarez and Business Meals 250.00
Whittman), Carl Binggeli (Alvarez and Marsal), Sam Hershey and Jennifer Thomas
(White & Case) at Texas on 10/26/2021 for a meeting

11/30/2021 | Andolina, Michael 10/28/2021- Order#120316882540440 Beefsteak - Sameer Saboungi Overtime Meals 20.00

11/25/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | Catering services for BSA Mediation in New York provided by FLIK on 11/15/2021 | Conference 9.80
for Kevin Carey— All-day beverage (water) Approximate headcount: 1 Room Dining

11/25/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | Catering services for BSA Mediation in New York provided by FLIK on 11/16/2021 | Conference 24.50
for AIG- All-day beverage (water) Approximate headcount: 8 Room Dining

11/25/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | Catering services for BSA Mediation in New York provided by FLIK on 11/16/2021 | Conference 24.50
for TCC- All-day beverage (water) Approximate headcount: 4 Room Dining

11/25/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | Catering services for BSA Mediation in New York provided by FLIK on 11/16/2021 | Conference 24.50
for Coalition/FCR— All-day beverage (water) Approximate headcount: 6 Room Dining

11/25/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | Catering services for BSA Mediation in New York provided by FLIK on 11/15/2021 | Conference 24.50
for TCJC— All-day beverage (water) Approximate headcount: 4 Room Dining

11/25/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | Catering services for BSA Mediation in New York provided by FLIK on 11/15/2021 | Conference 2,074.34
for BSA/Local Council- All-day beverage, continental breakfast, sandwiches for Room Dining
lunch and afternoon snacks Approximate headcount: 45

11/25/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | Catering services for BSA Mediation in New York provided by FLIK on 11/16/2021 | Conference 9.80
for TCIC— All-day beverage (water) Approximate headcount: 2 Room Dining

11/25/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | Catering services for BSA Mediation in New York provided by FLIK on 11/15/2021 | Conference 24.50
for TCC- All-day beverage (water) Approximate headcount: 4 Room Dining

11/25/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | Catering services for BSA Mediation in New York provided by FLIK on 11/15/2021 | Conference 9.80
for Paul Finn— All-day beverage (water) Approximate headcount: 2 Room Dining

11/25/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | Catering services for BSA Mediation in New York provided by FLIK on 11/15/2021 | Conference 24.50
for AIG- All-day beverage (water) Approximate headcount: 8 Room Dining

11/25/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | Catering services for BSA Mediation in New York provided by FLIK on 11/15/2021 | Conference 24.50
for Coalition/FCR- All-day beverage (water) Approximate headcount: 5 Room Dining
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11/25/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | Catering services for BSA Mediation in New York provided by FLIK on 11/16/2021 | Conference 9.80
for Tim Gallagher— All-day beverage (water) Approximate headcount: 1 Room Dining
11/25/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | Catering services for BSA Mediation in New York provided by FLIK on 11/15/2021 | Conference 9.80
for Tim Gallagher— All-day beverage (water) Approximate headcount: 1 Room Dining
11/25/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | Catering services for BSA Mediation in New York provided by FLIK on 11/16/2021 | Conference 9.80
for Century— All-day beverage (water) Approximate headcount: 4 Room Dining
11/25/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | Catering services for BSA Mediation in New York provided by FLIK on 11/16/2021 | Conference 2,074.34
for BSA/Local Council- All-day beverage, continental breakfast, sandwiches for Room Dining
lunch and afternoon snacks Approximate headcount: 45
11/25/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | Catering services for BSA Mediation in New York provided by FLIK on 11/15/2021 | Conference 9.80
for Century— All-day beverage (water) Approximate headcount: 1 Room Dining
11/25/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | Catering services for BSA Mediation in New York provided by FLIK on 11/16/2021 | Conference 9.80
for Kevin Carey— All-day beverage (water) Approximate headcount: 1 Room Dining
11/8/2021 | Andolina, Michael Executive Express Courier Services for BSA documents for Jessica Lauria on Courier Service 26.25
October 25, 2021.
11/24/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna Bloomberg BNA. Invoice Date: 08 November 2021. BNA Dockets (Oct 2021) Document 22.86
Research
11/24/2021 | Thomas, Jennifer Bloomberg BNA. Invoice Date: 08 November 2021. BNA Dockets (Oct 2021) Document 32.66
Research
11/24/2021 | Rosenberg, Erin Bloomberg BNA. Invoice Date: 08 November 2021. BNA Dockets (Oct 2021) Document 3.48
Research
11/24/2021 | Rubashkin, Hannah Bloomberg BNA. Invoice Date: 08 November 2021. BNA Dockets (Oct 2021) Document 0.87
Research
11/1/2021 | Sullivan, Janet E-Discovery Data Hosting / Storage E-Discovery Data | 27,236.32
Hosting / Storage
11/1/2021 | Sullivan, Janet E-Discovery Data Hosting / Storage E-Discovery Data 1,924.26
Hosting / Storage
11/1/2021 | Leung, Kenneth Alvarez & Marsal E-Discovery Data 2,681.60
Processing
11/3/2021 | Leung, Kenneth Jeff Hunt; Boy Scouts of America; Bates White; Ogletree; McGowan; Willis Towers | E-Discovery Data 75.20
Watson Processing
11/4/2021 | Leung, Kenneth Bates White E-Discovery Data 3,006.40
Processing
11/5/2021 | Calaycay - De la Cruz, Bates White; Brian Whittman; McGowan; Alvarez & Marsal E-Discovery Data 3,144.00
Rodelyn Processing
11/5/2021 | Leung, Kenneth Boy Scouts of America; Bates White E-Discovery Data 40.00
Processing
11/6/2021 | Leung, Kenneth Boy Scouts of America; Jeff Hunt E-Discovery Data 4,352.80
Processing
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11/8/2021 | Leung, Kenneth Nic Farrar; Ann Heimbach; Brett Ferguson; David Sangree E-Discovery Data 223.60
Processing

11/9/2021 | Leung, Kenneth Brian Whittman E-Discovery Data 40.00
Processing

11/10/2021 | Calaycay - De la Cruz, Boy Scouts of America E-Discovery Data 40.00
Rodelyn Processing

11/10/2021 | Leung, Kenneth Dawn Powell E-Discovery Data 40.00
Processing

11/11/2021 | Calaycay - De la Cruz, Boy Scouts of America E-Discovery Data 40.00
Rodelyn Processing

11/11/2021 | Leung, Kenneth Bates White E-Discovery Data 40.00
Processing

11/11/2021 | Leung, Kenneth Alvarez & Marsal E-Discovery Data 40.00
Processing

11/12/2021 | Leung, Kenneth Boy Scouts of America E-Discovery Data 40.00
Processing

11/15/2021 | Lay-at, Eddiemar Jeff Hunt E-Discovery Data 40.00
Processing

11/15/2021 | Galvan, Paolo Ogletree E-Discovery Data 40.00
Processing

11/19/2021 | Lay-at, Eddiemar Ogletree E-Discovery Data 82.00
Processing

11/24/2021 | Mlynarczyk, Robert Bates White; Alvarez & Marsal; Boy Scouts of America E-Discovery Data 40.00
Processing

11/26/2021 | Mlynarczyk, Robert Matthew Linder E-Discovery Data 40.00
Processing

11/28/2021 | Chemborisov, Gleb Boy Scouts of America E-Discovery Data 40.00
Processing

11/29/2021 | Mlynarczyk, Robert Ogletree; Boy Scouts of America; Bates White; Devang Desai E-Discovery Data 40.00
Processing

11/30/2021 | Mlynarczyk, Robert Alison Schuler E-Discovery Data 40.00
Processing

11/1/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOLO003 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/3/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOL004 E-Discovery 1,257.10
Production

11/4/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOLO006 E-Discovery 756.60
Production
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11/5/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOL008 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/5/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOL009 E-Discovery 546.00
Production

11/5/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOLO007 E-Discovery 191.10
Production

11/6/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOL010 E-Discovery 22,272.90
Production

11/8/2021 | Chen, Tony SIDLEY-PLAN_VOLO001 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/9/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOLO011 E-Discovery 364.00
Production

11/9/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOL012 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/10/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOL013 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/10/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOL014 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/11/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOLO015 E-Discovery 1,405.30
Production

11/12/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN _VOL018 E-Discovery 1,622.40
Production

11/12/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOLO016 E-Discovery 6,241.30
Production

11/12/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOLO017 E-Discovery 274.30
Production

11/13/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOL019 E-Discovery 408.20
Production

11/14/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOL020 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/14/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOL003 503 20211114 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/15/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOL021 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/16/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOL022 E-Discovery 2,956.20
Production

11/17/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOL003 502 20211117 E-Discovery 130.00
Production
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11/19/2021 | Huang, Keith BSA-PLAN_VOL022_502_20211119 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/19/2021 | Huang, Keith BSA-PLAN_VOL018 502_20211119 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/24/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOL024 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/26/2021 | Chemborisov, Gleb BSA-PLAN_VOL025 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/26/2021 | Chemborisov, Gleb BSA-PLAN_VOL026 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/28/2021 | Chemborisov, Gleb BSA-PLAN_VOL027 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/28/2021 | Chemborisov, Gleb BSA-PLAN_VOL020 502 20211128 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/28/2021 | Chemborisov, Gleb BSA-PLAN_VOL018 502 20211128 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/28/2021 | Chemborisov, Gleb BSA-PLAN_VOL019 503 20211128 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/29/2021 | Chemborisov, Gleb BSA-PLAN_VOL021 502_20211128 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/29/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOL020 502_20211129 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/29/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOL021 502_20211129 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/29/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOL018 502_20211129 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/29/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOL013 502_20211129 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/29/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOL009 502_20211129 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/29/2021 | Huang, Keith BSA-PLAN_VOL028 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/30/2021 | Chen, Tony BSA-PLAN_VOL029 E-Discovery 130.00
Production

11/1/2021 | Sullivan, Janet E-Discovery User Fees E-Discovery User | 12,750.00
Fees

11/9/2021 | Ho, Jason Overtime Meals - Jason Ho - Overtime meal for working more than 5 hours on a Overtime Meals 20.00

Sunday. - 07-Nov-21
11/10/2021 | Saber, Leili Order ID# 149416938093830 | Z161 | Leili Saber [Tony’s Di Napoli| 36.58 Overtime Meals 20.00
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11/10/2021 | Chen, Tony Overtime Meals - Tony Chen - OT meal - 08-Nov-21 Overtime Meals 20.00
11/11/2021 | Edmonds, Chloe Overtime Meals - Chloe Edmonds - Working on client BSA - 09-Nov-21 Overtime Meals 20.00
11/19/2021 | Rogers, Austin Overtime Meals - Austin Rogers - Attorney worked 10+ hours on CM - 29-Oct-21 Overtime Meals 20.00
11/22/2021 | Chen, Tony Overtime Meals - Tony Chen - ot meal - 18-Nov-21 Overtime Meals 20.00
11/23/2021 | Rogers, Austin Overtime Meals - Austin Rogers - Austin worked 10+ hours on CM. - 10-Nov-21 Overtime Meals 20.00
11/23/2021 | Rogers, Austin Overtime Meals - Austin Rogers - Austin worked 10+ hours on CM. - 11-Nov-21 Overtime Meals 20.00
11/23/2021 | Chen, Tony Overtime Meals - Tony Chen - OT meal - 15-Nov-21 Overtime Meals 20.00
11/25/2021 | Shepherd, Camille Order ID# 499517099627550 | T806 | Camille Shepherd |Park Avenue Tavern| 36.58 | Overtime Meals 20.00
11/25/2021 | Shepherd, Camille Order ID# 201617117324590 | T806 | Camille Shepherd |Bourke Street Bakery| 50 Overtime Meals 20.00
11/30/2021 | Saber, Leili Order ID# 808417159714613 | Z161 | Leili Saber |Real Kung Fu Little Steamed Overtime Meals 20.00
Buns Ramen| 36.58
11/11/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File:; Location Dialed: Photocopying 0.10
11/2/2021 | Draigh, David User Name: David Draigh; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 1.40
11/2/2021 | Rivero, Devin User Name: Devin Rivero; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/2/2021 | Rivero, Devin User Name: Devin Rivero; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/2/2021 | Rivero, Devin User Name: Devin Rivero; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/2/2021 | Rivero, Devin User Name: Devin Rivero; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 1.60
11/2/2021 | Rivero, Devin User Name: Devin Rivero; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/2/2021 | Rivero, Devin User Name: Devin Rivero; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 1.60
11/2/2021 | Rivero, Devin User Name: Devin Rivero; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/2/2021 | Rivero, Devin User Name: Devin Rivero; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.50
11/3/2021 | Draigh, David User Name: David Draigh; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 4.20
11/3/2021 | Draigh, David User Name: David Draigh; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.50
11/3/2021 | Waterfield, Amy User Name: Amy Waterfield; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/3/2021 | Waterfield, Amy User Name: Amy Waterfield; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.30
11/3/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.30
11/3/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/3/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.80
11/3/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/4/2021 | Hong, Alice User Name: Alice Hong; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 1.20
11/4/2021 | Hong, Alice User Name: Alice Hong; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/4/2021 | Hong, Alice User Name: Alice Hong; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 1.20
11/4/2021 | Hong, Alice User Name: Alice Hong; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/5/2021 | Hammond, Andrew User Name: Andrew Hammond; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.70
11/5/2021 | Hammond, Andrew User Name: Andrew Hammond; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
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11/5/2021 | Hammond, Andrew User Name: Andrew Hammond; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 1.50
11/5/2021 | Hammond, Andrew User Name: Andrew Hammond; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/5/2021 | Hammond, Andrew User Name: Andrew Hammond; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 1.60
11/5/2021 | Hammond, Andrew User Name: Andrew Hammond; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.50
11/5/2021 | Hammond, Andrew User Name: Andrew Hammond; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/5/2021 | Hammond, Andrew User Name: Andrew Hammond; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/5/2021 | Hammond, Andrew User Name: Andrew Hammond; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/5/2021 | Hammond, Andrew User Name: Andrew Hammond; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/6/2021 | Saber, Leili User Name: Leili Saber; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.50
11/8/2021 | Kraus, Kathleen User Name: Kathleen Kraus; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/9/2021 | Kraus, Kathleen User Name: Kathleen Kraus; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/9/2021 | Rivero, Devin User Name: Devin Rivero; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 2.00
11/9/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.50
11/9/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/9/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/9/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 1.70
11/9/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 3.40
11/10/2021 | Hong, Alice User Name: Alice Hong; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 3.60
11/10/2021 | Hong, Alice User Name: Alice Hong; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 1.20
11/10/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 1.40
11/10/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 2.00
11/10/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.30
11/10/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 3.40
11/10/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.30
11/11/2021 | Draigh, David User Name: David Draigh; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/11/2021 | Draigh, David User Name: David Draigh; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/11/2021 | Draigh, David User Name: David Draigh; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/11/2021 | Draigh, David User Name: David Draigh; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 1.40
11/11/2021 | Draigh, David User Name: David Draigh; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 1.40
11/11/2021 | Draigh, David User Name: David Draigh; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 3.60
11/11/2021 | Draigh, David User Name: David Draigh; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 1.60
11/11/2021 | Rivero, Devin User Name: Devin Rivero; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 2.70
11/11/2021 | Rivero, Devin User Name: Devin Rivero; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.30
11/11/2021 | Tuffey, Claire User Name: Claire Tuffey; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 3.20
11/11/2021 | Tuffey, Claire User Name: Claire Tuffey; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 3.10
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11/11/2021 | Tuffey, Claire User Name: Claire Tuffey; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/15/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/15/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/15/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/15/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.90
11/15/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.90
11/15/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/15/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.30
11/15/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.80
11/16/2021 | Hammond, Andrew User Name: Andrew Hammond; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 44.10
11/16/2021 | Hammond, Andrew User Name: Andrew Hammond; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/16/2021 | Hammond, Andrew User Name: Andrew Hammond; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 41.30
11/16/2021 | Kim, David User Name: David Kim; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 10.20
11/16/2021 | Kim, David User Name: David Kim; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 11.40
11/16/2021 | Kim, David User Name: David Kim; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.80
11/16/2021 | Kim, David User Name: David Kim; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 22.20
11/16/2021 | Kim, David User Name: David Kim; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 7.00
11/16/2021 | Kim, David User Name: David Kim; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 1.50
11/17/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/17/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/17/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/17/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.50
11/17/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.30
11/17/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.30
11/17/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.50
11/17/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.30
11/17/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.30
11/17/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.50
11/17/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.50
11/17/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.50
11/17/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/17/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/17/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.50
11/17/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/17/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
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11/17/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/17/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/17/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/17/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/17/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/17/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.50
11/17/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.70
11/17/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/17/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/17/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/17/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 3.30
11/17/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/17/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/17/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.50
11/17/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/17/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 3.40
11/17/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.30
11/17/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.60
11/17/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/18/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/18/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/18/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/18/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/18/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.30
11/18/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/18/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/18/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/18/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/18/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/18/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.30
11/18/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.30
11/18/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.30
11/18/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.30
11/18/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.30
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
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11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 29.00
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.50
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.60
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 6.50
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 1.00
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 1.70
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 3.90
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.70
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 13.40
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 3.00
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 4.90
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.40
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.60
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.40
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 3.00
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 1.90
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 5.50
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.90
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 9.30
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 8.20
11/18/2021 | Hirshorn, Deanna User Name: Deanna Hirshorn; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/19/2021 | Kurtz, Glenn User Name: Glenn Kurtz; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/19/2021 | Kurtz, Glenn User Name: Glenn Kurtz; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.80
11/19/2021 | Kurtz, Glenn User Name: Glenn Kurtz; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/19/2021 | Kurtz, Glenn User Name: Glenn Kurtz; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.30
11/19/2021 | Kurtz, Glenn User Name: Glenn Kurtz; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.90
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11/19/2021 | Kurtz, Glenn User Name: Glenn Kurtz; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.30
11/19/2021 | Saber, Leili User Name: Leili Saber; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/19/2021 | Brock-Smith, Morgan User Name: Morgan Brock-Sm; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/19/2021 | Brock-Smith, Morgan User Name: Morgan Brock-Sm; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/23/2021 | Saber, Leili User Name: Leili Saber; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/24/2021 | Tuffey, Claire User Name: Claire Tuffey; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/24/2021 | Tuffey, Claire User Name: Claire Tuffey; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/24/2021 | Tuffey, Claire User Name: Claire Tuffey; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/24/2021 | Tuffey, Claire User Name: Claire Tuffey; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/24/2021 | Tuffey, Claire User Name: Claire Tuffey; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/24/2021 | Tuffey, Claire User Name: Claire Tuffey; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/24/2021 | Tuffey, Claire User Name: Claire Tuffey; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/24/2021 | Tuffey, Claire User Name: Claire Tuffey; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.70
11/29/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 1.10
11/29/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/29/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/29/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/29/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 1.70
11/29/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.20
11/29/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | User Name: Jessica Lauria; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.40
11/30/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.70
11/30/2021 | Bachiller, Gladys User Name: Gladys Bachille; Processed File: Location Dialed: Printing 0.10
11/23/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | Car Service - Transportation for Jessica Lauria — Pickup at Miami International Taxi - Business 48.75
Airport Dropoff at Miami home - 18-Nov-21
11/23/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | Car Service - Transportation for Jessica Lauria — Pickup at Miami home — Dropoff at | Taxi - Business 40.00
Fort Lauderdale airport - 08-Nov-21
11/23/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | Car Service - Transportation for Jessica Lauria — Pickup at Miami Home — Dropoff Taxi - Business 48.75
at Miami International Airport - 16-Nov-21
11/30/2021 | Lauria (Boelter), Jessica | 11/11/2021 - VOUCHER NUMBER 581849 - Jessica Lauria (Boelter) - FROM 157 | Taxi - Business 108.66
W. 57 ST MANHATTAN NY - TO FARMINGDALE NY
104,397.84
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