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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

Chapter 11
In re:

Case No. 20-10343 (LSS)
BOY SCOUTS OF AMERICA AND

DELAWARE BSA, LLC,' (Jointly Administered)
Debtors. Objection Deadline:

April 1, 2022 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

SUMMARY COVER SHEET OF SEVENTH
APPLICATION OF OMNI AGENT SOLUTIONS FOR ALLOWANCE OF
COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD
FROM FEBRUARY 1. 2022 TO AND INCLUDING FEBRUARY 28, 2022

Name of Applicant: Omni Agent Solutions

Authorized to Provide Professional Services to: Debtors and Debtors in Possession

Date of Retention: April 8, 2020

Period for Which Compensation and
Reimbursement Are Requested: February 1, 2022 — February 28, 2022

Amount of Compensation Requested:
$299.001.20 (80% of $373.751.50)

Amount of Expense Reimbursement Requested: ~ $0.00

This is a(n): monthly X interim final application

! The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, together with the last four digits of each Debtor’s federal tax identification
number, are as follows: Boy Scouts of America (6300) and Delaware BSA, LLC (4311). The Debtors’ mailing
address is 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving, Texas 75038.
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COMPENSATION AND HOURS BY PROFESSIONAL

Professional Hours Rate Total

Ada Ferrer 149.8 $125.00 $18,725.00
Ada Husten 34.7 $125.00 $4,337.50
Amanda Olson 45.8 $140.00 $6,412.00
Ashley Dionisio 112.0 $125.00 $14,000.00
Ashley Stefanovic 133.9 $60.00 $8,034.00
Brittney Whitaker 99.6 $125.00 $12,450.00
Carey Steinberg 67.8 $125.00 $8,475.00
Carolyn Cashman 61.9 $125.00 $7,737.50
Christian Teufel 58.7 $75.00 $4,402.50
David Green 7.6 $125.00 $950.00
David Neece 9.4 $135.00 $1,269.00
Deborah Carmody 120.1 $60.00 $7,206.00
Eileen Cosgriff 46.1 $100.00 $4,610.00
Emma Guandique 9.8 $75.00 $735.00
Homero Cuberos 14.2 $75.00 $1,065.00
James Proctor 33.6 $60.00 $2,016.00
Javon Couch 153.8 $120.00 $18,456.00
Jennifer Barnes 30.8 $60.00 $1,848.00
Jennifer

Lizakowski 126.5 $155.00 $19,607.50
Jeriad Paul 122.3 $185.00 $22,625.50
John Doherty 106.7 $125.00 $13,337.50
Kaitlyn Wolf 149.5 $125.00 $18,687.50
Katherine Muller 151.6 $125.00 $18,950.00
Katie Nownes 37.3 $155.00 $5,781.50
Kim Steverson 26.2 $155.00 $4,061.00
Kimberly

McDermott 163.7 $60.00 $9,822.00
Kiyama Jones 14.0 $60.00 $840.00
Lakeisha Babers 17.7 $125.00 $2,212.50
Luis Solorzano 139.5 $155.00 $21,622.50
Marjan Neuman 25.9 $75.00 $1,942.50
Mark Bishay 21.8 $135.00 $2,943.00
Mauricio Azucena 71.3 $85.00 $6,060.50
Max Meisler 166.7 $120.00 $20,004.00
Melissa Milo 68.0 $85.00 $5,780.00
Michelle Ignacio 36.8 $135.00 $4,968.00
Mike Spitzer 65.1 $155.00 $10,090.50
Monic Sanchez 83.6 $120.00 $10,032.00
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COMPENSATION AND HOURS BY PROFESSIONAL (CON’T.)

Professional Hours Rate Total
Monique Edington 10.7 $75.00 $802.50
Patricia Aldecoa 2.0 $100.00 $200.00
Paula Girard 2.5 $110.00 $275.00
Paula Gray 9.1 $75.00 $682.50
Reina Zepeda 147.4 $120.00 $17,688.00
Sarah Steinhorn 13.0 $75.00 $975.00
Scanning Operator 1.0 $40.00 $40.00
Sejal Kelly 44.0 $155.00 $6,820.00
Siobhan Davis 32.6 $125.00 $4,075.00
Tara Saldajeno 71.5 $75.00 $5,362.50
Tara Saldajeno Website
Operator 7.1 $75.00 $532.50
Wendy Austin 112.3 $60.00 $6,738.00
William Wright 12.5 $75.00 $937.50
Yelena Bederman 0.9 $145.00 $130.50
Zachary Crismond 98.4 $65.00 $6,396.00

TOTAL | 3,348.8 $373,751.50

COMPENSATION AND EXPENSES BY PROJECT CATEGORY

. Total Total
Task Description Hours Compensation
Plan Solicitation 3,348.8 $373,751.50
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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

Chapter 11
Inre:

Case No. 20-10343 (LSS)
BOY SCOUTS OF AMERICA AND

DELAWARE BSA, LLC,' (Jointly Administered)

Debtors. Objection Deadline:
April 1, 2022 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

SEVENTH APPLICATION OF OMNI AGENT SOLUTIONS FOR ALLOWANCE OF
COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR
THE PERIOD FROM FEBRUARY 1, 2022 TO FEBRUARY 28, 2022

Omni Agent Solutions (“Omni”), Administrative Agent for the Boy Scouts of America and
Delaware BSA, LLC, the non-profit corporations that are debtors and debtors in possession
(together, the “Debtors”) in the above-captioned chapter 11 cases, hereby submits this third
application (this “Application”) requesting payment in the aggregate amount of $299,001.20 which
is equal to (a) 80% of the $373,751.50 of total compensation earned by Omni for its services to
the Debtors during the period from February 1, 2022 to and including February 28, 2022 (the “Fee
Period”) and (b) 100% of the $0.00 of necessary expenses incurred by Omni during the Fee Period
in connection with its services to the Debtors. In support of this Application, Omni respectfully
represents as follows:

JURISDICTION AND VENUE

1. The United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware (the “Court”) has

jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1334 and the Amended Standing Order of

IThe Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, together with the last four digits of each Debtor’s federal tax identification
number, are as follows: Boy Scouts of America (6300) and Delaware BSA, LLC (4311). The Debtors’ mailing
address is 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving, Texas 75038.
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Reference from the United States District Court for the District of Delaware, dated February 29,
2012. This matter is a core proceeding within the meaning of 28 U.S.C. § 157(b)(2). Venue is
proper in this district pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.

2. The statutory and other bases for the relief requested herein are sections 330 and
331 of chapter 11 of'title 11 of the United States Code, 11 U.S.C. §§ 101-1532 (the “Bankruptcy

Code”), rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the “Bankruptcy Rules™), rule

2016-2 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure of the United States Bankruptcy
Court for the District of Delaware (the “Local Rules”), and the Order (I) Approving Procedures
for (A) Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals and (B)
Expense Reimbursement for Olfficial Committee Members and (Il) Granting Related Relief

[Docket No. 341] (the “Compensation Procedures Order”).

BACKGROUND

3. On February 18, 2020 (the “Petition Date”), each of the Debtors filed a voluntary
petition with the Court for relief under chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code. The Debtors continue
to operate and maintain their non-profit organization and manage their properties as debtors in
possession pursuant to sections 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code. On February 19, 2020,
the Court entered an order [Docket No. 61] authorizing the joint administration and procedural
consolidation of the chapter 11 cases pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 1015(b).

4. The Debtors retained Omni as their administrative agent, nunc pro tunc to the
Petition Date, pursuant to the Order Authorizing the Retention and Employment of Omni Agent
Solutions as Administrative Agent for the Debtors and Debtors in Possession, Nunc Pro Tunc to

the Petition Date [Docket No. 372] (the “Retention Order”). The Retention Order authorizes the
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Debtors to compensate and reimburse Omni in accordance with the terms and conditions set forth
in the Debtors’ application to retain Omni, subject to the Debtors’ application to the Court.

5. On April 6, 2020, the Court entered the Compensation Procedures Order. The
Compensation Procedures Order provides, among other things, that each professional shall be
entitled, on or as soon as practicable after the fifteenth (15th) day of each month following the
month for which compensation and/or expense reimbursement is sought, to file and serve an
application for interim allowance of compensation earned and reimbursement of expenses incurred

during the preceding month (each a “Monthly Fee Application). Parties shall have fourteen (14)

days after service of a Monthly Fee Application to file an objection to the compensation or

expenses that are the subject thereof (the “Objection Deadline”). Upon the expiration of the

Objection Deadline, the applicant may file a certificate of no objection (a “CNO”) with the Court
with respect to the unopposed portion of the fees and/or expenses requested in the applicable
Monthly Fee Application. After the filing of a CNO, the Debtors are authorized and directed to
pay the applicant an amount equal to 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses requested in the
applicable Monthly Fee Application not subject to an objection.

RELIEF REQUESTED

6. By this Application, in accordance with the Compensation Procedures Order, Omni
requests payment in the aggregate amount of $299,001.20 which is equal to (a) 80% of the
$373,751.50 of total compensation earned by Omni during the Fee Period for its services to the
Debtors and (b) 100% of the $0.00 of necessary expenses incurred by Omni during the Fee Period
in connection with its services to the Debtors.

SUMMARY OF SERVICES RENDERED

7. Attached hereto as Exhibit A are Omni’s detailed time records denoting the time

expended and compensation earned by Omni during the Fee Period. Omni’s professionals
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expended a total of 3,348.8 hours in connection with these chapter 11 cases during the Fee Period.
All services for which Omni is requesting compensation were performed for or on behalf of the
Debtors. The services rendered by Omni during the Fee Period are categorized as set forth in
Exhibit A and in the summary cover sheets prefixed to this Application. The professionals who
provided services to the Debtors during the Fee Period are also identified in Exhibit A and in the
summary cover sheets.

ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES

8. Omni did not incur any expenses during the Fee Period.
VALUATION OF SERVICES
0. The hourly rates reflected on Exhibit A are similar to the rates Omni charges other

clients for work of this character. The reasonable value of the services rendered by Omni for the
Fee Period as administrative agent to the Debtors in these chapter 11 cases is $373,751.50.

10. In accordance with section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, the fees requested are
reasonable in light of factors including, among other things, (a) the complexity of these chapter 11
cases, (b) the time expended, (c) the nature and extent of the services rendered, (d) the value of
such services, and (e) the costs of comparable services other than in a case under this title.

11. Although Omni has made every effort to include all fees and expenses incurred
during the Fee Period in this Application, some fees and expenses might have been omitted from
this Application due to delays caused by accounting and processing during the Fee Period. Omni
reserves the right to submit further applications to the Court for allowance of such fees and
expenses not included herein. Subsequent fee applications will be filed in accordance with the
requirements of the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Rules, and the

Compensation Procedures Order.
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CERTIFICATION OF COMPLIANCE

12. The undersigned has reviewed the requirements of Local Rule 2016-2 and certifies
that, to the best of his knowledge, information and belief, this Application complies with that rule.
WHEREFORE, Omni requests payment in the aggregate amount of $299,001.20 which is
equal to (a) 80% of the $373,751.50 of total compensation earned by Omni during the Fee Period
for its services to the Debtors, and (b) 100% of the $0.00 of necessary expenses incurred by Omni
during the Fee Period in connection with its services to the Debtors, for a total interim award of

$299,001.20.

Dated: March 18, 2022 OMNI AGENT SOLUTIONS

New York, NY
/s/ Paul H. Deutch

Paul H. Deutch

Executive Vice President

1120 Avenue of the Americas, 4" FI.
New York, NY 10036

Telephone: 212-302-3580

Email: pdeutch@omniagnt.com

Administrative Agent to the Debtors and
Debtors in Possession
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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

Inre Chapter 11
BOY SCOUTS OF AMERICA, et al., Case No. 20-10343 (LSS)
Debtors.! Jointly Administered
Objection Deadline:
April 1, 2022 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

NOTICE OF THE SEVENTH APPLICATION OF OMNI AGENT SOLUTIONS FOR
ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR
THE PERIOD FROM FEBRUARY 1, 2022 TO FEBRUARY 28, 2022

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that today, Omni Agent Solutions (“Omni”),
Administrative Agent for the Debtors in the above-captioned cases, filed the attached Seventh
Application of Omni Agent Solutions for Allowance of Compensation and Reimbursement
of Expenses for the Period from February 1, 2022 to February 28, 2022 (the “Application”).

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that objections, if any, to the Application,
must be: (a) filed with the Clerk of the Bankruptcy Court, 824 North Market Street, 3™ Floor,
Wilmington, Delaware 19801, by April 1, 2022 at 4:00 p.m. (ET) (the “Objection Deadline”);
and (b) served so as to be received on or before the Objection Deadline by:

1. the Applicant: Omni Agent Solutions, 1120 Avenue of the Americas, 4th
Floor, New York, New York 10036, Attn: Paul H. Deutch,
pdeutch@omniagnt.com,;

1. the Debtors: Boy Scouts of America, 1325 West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving,
Texas 75038, Attn: Steven P. McGowan, steve.mcgowen@scouting.org;

1ii. counsel to the Debtors: White & Case LLP, 111 South Wacker, Drive,
Chicago, Illinois 606006, Attn: Matthew E. Linder,
mlinder@whitecase.com;

1v. co-counsel to the Debtors: Morris, Nichols, Arsht & Tunnell LLP, 1201 N.
Market Street, 16" Floor, Wilmington, Delaware 19801, Attn: Derek C.
Abbott, dabbott@morrisnichols.com;

V. the Office of the United States Trustee: J. Caleb Boggs Federal Building,
Room 2207, 844 N. King Street, Wilmington, Delaware 19801, Attn: David
Buchbinder, david.l.buchbinder@usdoj.gov, and Hannah M. McCollum,

The Debtors in these cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor’s federal EIN, are as follows:
Boy Scouts of America (6300) and Delaware BSA, LLC (4311). The Debtors’ mailing address is 1325
West Walnut Hill Lane, Irving, Texas 75038.
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hannah.mccollum@usdoj.gov;

VI. counsel to the UCC: Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP, 1177 Avenue
of the Americas, New York, New York 10036, Attn: Rachael Ringer,
rringer@kramerlevin.com, and Megan M. Wasson,
mwasson@kramerlevin.com;

vii. counsel to the Tort Claimants’ Committee: Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones
LLP, 10100 Santa Monica Boulevard, 13th Floor, Los Angeles, California
90067, Attn: Richard M. Pachulski, rpachulski@pszjlaw.com;

Vviil. counsel to the Future Claimants’ Representative: Young Conaway Stargatt
& Taylor, LLP, Rodney Square, 1000 North King Street, Wilmington,
Delaware 19801, Attn: Robert S. Brady, rbrady@ycst.com, and Edwin J.
Harron, eharron@ycst.com;

IX. counsel to the Ad Hoc Committee of Local Councils: Wachtell, Lipton,
Rosen & Katz, 51 West 52nd Street, New York, New York 10019, Attn:
Richard G. Mason, rgmason@wlrk.com, and Joseph C. Celentino,
jecelentino@wlrk.com;

X. counsel to JPMorgan Chase Bank, National Association: Norton Rose
Fulbright US LLP, 2200 Ross Avenue, Dallas, Texas 75201-7932, Attn:
Louis R. Strubeck, louis.strubeck@nortonrosefullbright.com, and Kristian
W. Gluck, Kristian.gluck@nortonrosefullbright.com;

XI. counsel to the County Commission of Fayette County (West Virginia):
Steptoe & Johnson PLLC, Chase Tower — 8th Floor, 707 Virginia Street
East, Charleston, West Virginia 25301, Attn: John Stump; and

Xil. Rucki Fee Review, LLC: 1111 Windon Drive, Wilmington, Delaware
19803, Attn: Justin Rucki, justinrucki@ruckifeereview.com.

A HEARING ON THE APPLICATION, IF NECESSARY, WILL BE HELD AT
THE CONVENIENCE OF THE COURT AND NOTICE OF ANY SUCH HEARING WILL BE
GIVEN ONLY TO THE OBJECTING PARTY OR PARTIES.

IF YOU FAIL TO RESPOND IN ACCORDANCE WITH THIS NOTICE, THE
COURT MAY GRANT THE RELIEF REQUESTED BY THE APPLICATION WITHOUT
FURTHER NOTICE OR HEARING.

[Remainder of Page Intentionally Left Blank]
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Dated: March 18, 2022 MORRIS, NICHOLS, ARSHT & TUNNELL LLP
Wilmington, Delaware

/s/ Paige N. Topper

Derek C. Abbott (No. 3376)

Andrew R. Remming (No. 5120)

Paige N. Topper (No. 6470)

Tori L. Remington (No. 6901)

1201 North Market Street, 16th Floor

P.O. Box 1347

Wilmington, Delaware 19899-1347

Telephone: (302) 658-9200

Facsimile: (302) 425-4664

Email: dabbott@morrisnichols.com
aremming(@morrisnichols.com
ptopper@morrisnichols.com
tremington@morrisnichols.com

—and —

WHITE & CASE LLP

Jessica C. Lauria (admitted pro hac vice)
1221 Avenue of the Americas

New York, New York 10020

Telephone: (212) 819-8200

Email: jessica.lauria@whitecase.com

—and —

WHITE & CASE LLP

Michael C. Andolina (admitted pro hac vice)

Matthew E. Linder (admitted pro hac vice)

Laura E. Baccash (admitted pro hac vice)

Blair M. Warner (admitted pro hac vice)

111 South Wacker Drive

Chicago, Illinois 60606

Telephone: (312) 881-5400

Email: mandolina@whitecase.com
mlinder@whitecase.com
laura.baccash@whitecase.com
blair.warner@whitecase.com

ATTORNEYS FOR THE DEBTORS AND DEBTORS
IN POSSESSION


mailto:ptopper@morrisnichols.com
mailto:mlinder@whitecase.com
mailto:laura.baccash@whitecase.com
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Exhibit A

Detailed Time Records
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OMNI

MANAGEMENT GROUP

AN AFFILIATE OF BEILINSON
ADVISORY GROUP

Omni Management Group

5955 DeSoto Avenue, Suite #100
Woodland Hills, CA 91367
818-906-8300

Subject to Fee Application
Boy Scouts of America and Delaware BSA, LLC - 327

Payment Terms: Upon Receipt

RE: Solicitation

Solicitation

Time Details

March 15, 2022

Invoice Number: 10497
Invoice Period: 02-01-2022 - 02-28-2022

Date Professional Description Hours Rate Amount
02-01-2022  Ada Husten Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 9.70 125.00 1,212.50
processing and verification
02-01-2022  Carey Steinberg  Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.80 125.00 975.00
Confirmation
02-01-2022  Kimberly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 8.00 60.00 480.00
McDermott confirmation
02-01-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.60 60.00 456.00
confirmation
02-01-2022  Scanning Scan incoming ballots 0.30 40.00 12.00

Operator

Invoice Number: 10497

We appreciate your business

Page 2 of 59
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Date Professional Description Hours Rate Amount
02-01-2022  Christian Teufel  Process incoming ballots 7.30 75.00 547.50
02-01-2022  Ada Ferrer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.40 125.00 1,050.00
processing and verification
02-01-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 2.30 155.00 356.50
Confirmation
02-01-2022  Carolyn Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 3.00 125.00 375.00
Cashman confirmation
02-01-2022  Katherine Muller ~ Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.00 125.00 1,000.00
processing and verification
02-01-2022  Javon Couch Prepare documentation and materials re Confirmation 6.60 120.00 792.00
02-01-2022 Wendy Austin Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.30 60.00 438.00
confirmation
02-01-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 2.60 185.00 481.00
Confirmation
02-01-2022  Brittney Whitaker Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.40 125.00 925.00
processing and verification
02-01-2022  Ashley Dionisio Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 4.40 125.00 550.00
confirmation
02-01-2022  Yelena Prepare class 9 POC addresses for comparison to 0.50 145.00 72.50
Bederman ballots
02-01-2022  David Green Prepare requirements for audit reporting re: voting 0.30 125.00 37.50
report and confirmation
02-01-2022  Tara Saldajeno Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 2.70 75.00 202.50
processing and verification
02-01-2022  Jennifer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.70 155.00 1,038.50
Lizakowski processing and verification
02-01-2022  Deborah Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 8.00 60.00 480.00
Carmody confirmation
02-01-2022  Siobhan Davis Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.60 125.00 950.00

Invoice Number: 10497

processing and verification

We appreciate your business

Page 3 of 59
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Date Professional Description Hours Rate Amount
02-01-2022  Katie Nownes Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 1.50 155.00 232.50
verification of all late filed ballots and updating reports

accordingly

02-01-2022  Katie Nownes Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 3.10 155.00 480.50
verification of all filed ballots pdf images

02-01-2022  Eileen Cosgriff Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 1.60 100.00 160.00
processing and verification

02-01-2022  Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to B. Warner @ 0.20 120.00 24.00
WC re Delaware BSA votes

02-01-2022 Reina Zepeda Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.70 120.00 924.00
processing and verification

02-01-2022  Zachary Process incoming ballots 8.00 65.00 520.00

Crismond

02-01-2022 Max Meisler Review e-mails received and respond to A. Zegger, T. 1.30 120.00 156.00
Romer @ WC re Master Ballot discovery

02-01-2022  Kaitlyn Wolf Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.10 125.00 1,012.50
processing and verification

02-01-2022  Mike Spitzer Review and verify documentation and materials re: 5.30 155.00 821.50
Confirmation

02-01-2022  Sejal Kelly Verify processed ballots 0.90 155.00 139.50

02-01-2022  Sejal Kelly Review and verify ballots in preparation for 0.50 155.00 77.50
confirmation

02-01-2022  Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to C. Tuffey @ 0.40 120.00 48.00
WC re inquiry responses

02-01-2022 Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to D. Rivero @ 0.40 120.00 48.00
WC re docketed letters

02-01-2022 Max Meisler Verify and review documentation and materials re: 6.70 120.00 804.00
Confirmation

02-01-2022  John Doherty Supervise and manage call center, review and assist 7.80 125.00 975.00

Invoice Number: 10497

with ongoing communications, handle all escalation

We appreciate your business

Page 4 of 59
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Date Professional Description Hours Rate Amount
issues including extended voting deadline

02-02-2022  John Doherty Supervise and manage call center, review and assist 6.80 125.00 850.00
with ongoing communications, handle all escalation
issues including extended voting deadline

02-02-2022  Max Meisler Verify and review documentation and materials re: 7.20 120.00 864.00
Confirmation

02-02-2022  Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to C. Tuffey @ 0.60 120.00 72.00
WC re non-debtor release opt out

02-02-2022  Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to M. Pahlke @ 0.40 120.00 48.00
Pahlke re POC

02-02-2022  Sejal Kelly Verify processed ballots 1.40 155.00 217.00

02-02-2022  Mike Spitzer Review and verify documentation and materials re: 7.80 155.00 1,209.00
Confirmation

02-02-2022  Kaitlyn Wolf Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.10 125.00 1,012.50
processing and verification

02-02-2022  Brittney Whitaker Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.00 125.00 875.00
processing and verification

02-02-2022  Kim Steverson Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 1.80 155.00 279.00
processing and verification

02-02-2022 Reina Zepeda Review, organize and file case documents 7.70 120.00 924.00

02-02-2022  Katie Nownes Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 2.90 155.00 449.50
verification of all filed ballots pdf images

02-02-2022 Deborah Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 8.00 60.00 480.00

Carmody confirmation

02-02-2022  Katie Nownes Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 1.80 155.00 279.00
verification of all late filed ballots and updating reports
accordingly

02-02-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 4.70 155.00 728.50
Confirmation

02-02-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 5.40 60.00 324.00

Invoice Number: 10497

We appreciate your business

Page 5 of 59
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Date Professional Description Hours Rate Amount
confirmation
02-02-2022  Christian Teufel  Process incoming ballots 11.60 75.00 870.00
02-02-2022  Siobhan Davis Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.70 125.00 962.50
processing and verification
02-02-2022  Katherine Muller  Process incoming ballots 0.60 125.00 75.00
02-02-2022  Kimberly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 8.00 60.00 480.00
McDermott confirmation
02-02-2022  Jennifer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.90 155.00 914.50
Lizakowski processing and verification
02-02-2022  Zachary Process incoming ballots 4.30 65.00 279.50
Crismond
02-02-2022  Ada Ferrer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.00 125.00 875.00
processing and verification
02-02-2022  Ada Husten Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.00 125.00 1,000.00
processing and verification
02-02-2022  Jeriad Paul Verify and review late filed class 8 & 9 ballots 1.20 185.00 222.00
02-02-2022  Jeriad Paul Verify and review late filed CO Opt Out submissions 1.10 185.00 203.50
02-02-2022  David Green Prepare requirements for audit reporting re: voting 0.30 125.00 37.50
report and confirmation
02-02-2022  Katherine Muller ~ Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.30 125.00 1,037.50
processing and verification
02-02-2022  Javon Couch Prepare documentation and materials re Confirmation 7.60 120.00 912.00
02-02-2022 Wendy Austin Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.20 60.00 432.00
confirmation
02-02-2022  Carolyn Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 2.50 125.00 312.50
Cashman confirmation
02-02-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 2.40 185.00 444.00
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02-02-2022  Jeriad Paul Call with B. Warner and L. Baccash @ W&C re Class 0.20 185.00 37.00
9 late filed ballots

02-02-2022  Tara Saldajeno Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.70 75.00 427.50
processing and verification

02-02-2022  Ashley Dionisio  Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 4.60 125.00 575.00
confirmation

02-02-2022  Jeriad Paul Provide E-ballot submission and account login 0.80 185.00 148.00
instructions to W&C re Class 9 ballot submission for
umMcC

02-02-2022  Carey Steinberg  Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.80 125.00 975.00
processing and verification

02-03-2022  David Green Prepare requirements for audit reporting re: voting 0.30 125.00 37.50
report and confirmation

02-03-2022  Katherine Muller  Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.70 125.00 1,087.50
processing and verification

02-03-2022  Javon Couch Prepare documentation and materials re Confirmation 3.80 120.00 456.00

02-03-2022  Carey Steinberg  Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 1.50 125.00 187.50
processing and verification

02-03-2022  Carey Steinberg  Process incoming ballots 1.00 125.00 125.00

02-03-2022 Yelena Prepare class 9 report 0.10 145.00 14.50

Bederman
02-03-2022 Yelena Update class 9 excel report 0.30 145.00 43.50
Bederman

02-03-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 4.10 185.00 758.50
Confirmation

02-03-2022  Christian Teufel = Process incoming ballots 6.10 75.00 457.50

02-03-2022 Ada Husten Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 9.50 125.00 1,187.50
processing and verification

02-03-2022  Ada Ferrer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 11.10 125.00 1,387.50
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processing and verification
02-03-2022  Sejal Kelly Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 3.70 155.00 573.50
processing and verification
02-03-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 4.50 155.00 697.50
Confirmation
02-03-2022 Deborah Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 8.10 60.00 486.00
Carmody confirmation
02-03-2022  Katie Nownes Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 3.60 155.00 558.00
verification of all filed ballots pdf images
02-03-2022  Ashley Dionisio  Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 3.10 125.00 387.50
confirmation
02-03-2022  Kimberly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 5.50 60.00 330.00
McDermott confirmation
02-03-2022  Jennifer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.90 155.00 1,069.50
Lizakowski processing and verification
02-03-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: late 2.60 185.00 481.00
filed submissions
02-03-2022  Siobhan Davis Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.60 125.00 1,075.00
processing and verification
02-03-2022 Emma Process incoming ballots 1.20 75.00 90.00
Guandique
02-03-2022 Max Meisler Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 5.60 120.00 672.00
confirmation hearing
02-03-2022  Tara Saldajeno Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.90 75.00 442.50
processing and verification
02-03-2022  Brittney Whitaker Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.20 125.00 900.00
processing and verification
02-03-2022  Mike Spitzer Review and verify documentation and materials re: 6.40 155.00 992.00
Confirmation
02-03-2022  Sejal Kelly Review and verify ballots in preparation for 0.50 155.00 77.50
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confirmation

02-03-2022  Kim Steverson Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 1.30 155.00 201.50
processing and verification

02-03-2022 Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to C. Tuffey @ 0.40 120.00 48.00
WC re non-debtor release opt out

02-03-2022 Max Meisler Prepare report per request by C. Tuffey @ WC re non- 1.30 120.00 156.00
debtor release opt out

02-03-2022 Max Meisler Prepare report per request by B. Warner @ WC re 1.10 120.00 132.00
UMC voting

02-03-2022 Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to A. Zegger @ 0.20 120.00 24.00
WC re master ballot documentation

02-03-2022  John Doherty Supervise and manage call center, review and assist 5.20 125.00 650.00
with ongoing communications, handle all escalation
issues including extended voting deadline

02-04-2022  John Doherty Supervise and manage call center, review and assist 5.70 125.00 712.50
with ongoing communications, handle all escalation
issues including extended voting deadline

02-04-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: late filed 0.80 155.00 124.00
submissions

02-04-2022  Max Meisler Review e-mails received and respond to A. Zegger @ 0.80 120.00 96.00
WC re master ballot documentation

02-04-2022 Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to C. Tuffey @ 0.40 120.00 48.00
WC re plan objections

02-04-2022  Kim Steverson Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 1.00 155.00 155.00
confirmation

02-04-2022 Homero Cuberos Process late filed CO Opt Outs 5.30 75.00 397.50

02-04-2022  Sejal Kelly Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 3.20 155.00 496.00
processing and verification

02-04-2022  Sejal Kelly Coordinate and supervise Class 9 ballot audit 0.80 155.00 124.00

02-04-2022  Mike Spitzer Review and verify documentation and materials re: 7.60 155.00 1,178.00
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Confirmation

02-04-2022  Brittney Whitaker Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.00 125.00 1,000.00
processing and verification

02-04-2022  Kaitlyn Wolf Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.90 125.00 987.50
processing and verification

02-04-2022  Tara Saldajeno Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 3.20 75.00 240.00
processing and verification

02-04-2022 Max Meisler Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 6.70 120.00 804.00
confirmation hearing

02-04-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 3.80 185.00 703.00
Confirmation

02-04-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: late 1.90 185.00 351.50
filed submissions

02-04-2022  Jennifer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.40 155.00 1,147.00

Lizakowski processing and verification

02-04-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 2.50 155.00 387.50
Confirmation

02-04-2022  Ashley Dionisio Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 5.00 125.00 625.00
confirmation

02-04-2022  Carey Steinberg  Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 0.50 125.00 62.50
processing and verification

02-04-2022  Ada Ferrer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.60 125.00 1,075.00
processing and verification

02-04-2022  Siobhan Davis Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.70 125.00 1,087.50
processing and verification

02-04-2022  Zachary Process incoming ballots 3.00 65.00 195.00

Crismond

02-04-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.60 60.00 456.00
processing and verification

02-04-2022 Deborah Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.00 60.00 420.00
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Carmody confirmation

02-04-2022  Ada Husten Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.50 125.00 937.50
processing and verification

02-04-2022  Javon Couch Prepare documentation and materials re Confirmation 7.60 120.00 912.00

02-04-2022  Christian Teufel  Process incoming ballots 8.00 75.00 600.00

02-04-2022  Kimberly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 8.00 60.00 480.00

McDermott confirmation

02-04-2022  Katherine Muller  Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.30 125.00 1,037.50
processing and verification

02-04-2022  David Green Prepare requirements for audit reporting re: voting 0.30 125.00 37.50
report and confirmation

02-05-2022  Jeriad Paul Review and respond to email from B. Warner @ W&C 0.10 185.00 18.50
re: CO Opt Outs

02-05-2022  Mike Spitzer Review and verify documentation and materials re: 4.90 155.00 759.50
Confirmation

02-05-2022  Sarah Steinhorn ~ Process incoming ballots 7.00 75.00 525.00

02-05-2022  Paula Girard Process incoming ballots 2.50 110.00 275.00

02-05-2022  Patricia Aldecoa  Process incoming ballots 2.00 100.00 200.00

02-06-2022  Sarah Steinhorn  Verify processed ballots 6.00 75.00 450.00

02-06-2022  Mike Spitzer Review and verify documentation and materials re: 1.00 155.00 155.00
Confirmation

02-06-2022  Ada Ferrer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 3.10 125.00 387.50
processing and verification

02-06-2022  Jeriad Paul Verify and review Late Filed Chartered Organization 7.00 185.00 1,295.00
Opt Out Submissions

02-06-2022  Katherine Muller ~ Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 2.40 125.00 300.00
processing and verification
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02-07-2022  Javon Couch Prepare documentation and materials re Confirmation 7.60 120.00 912.00

02-07-2022  Katherine Muller ~ Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.90 125.00 862.50
processing and verification

02-07-2022  Katherine Muller ~ Process incoming ballots 2.00 125.00 250.00

02-07-2022  Ada Ferrer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.30 125.00 912.50
processing and verification

02-07-2022  Carey Steinberg  Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.40 125.00 550.00
processing and verification

02-07-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.60 60.00 456.00
confirmation

02-07-2022  Zachary Process Incoming Ballots 7.50 65.00 487.50

Crismond

02-07-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 8.50 155.00 1,317.50
Confirmation

02-07-2022  Tara Saldajeno Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.00 75.00 300.00
processing and verification

02-07-2022  Kimberly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 8.00 60.00 480.00

McDermott confirmation

02-07-2022  David Green Prepare requirements for audit reporting re: voting 0.40 125.00 50.00
report and confirmation

02-07-2022  Kaitlyn Wolf Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.10 125.00 1,012.50
processing and verification

02-07-2022  Ada Ferrer Verify processed ballots 0.70 125.00 87.50

02-07-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 3.20 185.00 592.00
Confirmation

02-07-2022  Ashley Dionisio  Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 6.30 125.00 787.50
confirmation

02-07-2022  Monic Sanchez Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.60 120.00 912.00
processing and verification
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02-07-2022  Sejal Kelly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 2.90 155.00 449.50
discovery

02-07-2022  Mike Spitzer Review and verify documentation and materials re: 4.10 155.00 635.50
Confirmation

02-07-2022 Reina Zepeda Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.20 120.00 984.00
processing and verification

02-07-2022  Kim Steverson Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 1.30 155.00 201.50
processing and verification

02-07-2022 Marjan Neuman  Prepare documentation & materials re: Confirmation 3.80 75.00 285.00

02-07-2022  Deborah Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.00 60.00 480.00

Carmody processing and verification
02-07-2022  Jennifer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.80 155.00 899.00
Lizakowski processing and verification

02-07-2022 Max Meisler Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 6.70 120.00 804.00
confirmation hearing

02-07-2022 Max Meisler Prepare report per request by B. Warner @ WC re 1.00 120.00 120.00
UMC votes

02-07-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: late filed 1.10 155.00 170.50
submissions

02-07-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise follow-up and responses on 0.80 185.00 148.00
BSAballots@omniagnt.com emails

02-07-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise voting results re: UMC 1.70 185.00 314.50

02-07-2022  John Doherty Supervise and manage call center, review and assist 6.60 125.00 825.00
with ongoing communications, handle all escalation
issues including extended voting deadline

02-08-2022  John Doherty Supervise and manage call center, review and assist 6.50 125.00 812.50
with ongoing communications, handle all escalation
issues including extended voting deadline

02-08-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise voting results re: UMC 0.40 185.00 74.00

02-08-2022  Jeriad Paul Review and respond to UMC re: E-Ballot submission 2.30 185.00 425.50
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instructions

02-08-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: late filed 1.30 155.00 201.50
submissions

02-08-2022 Max Meisler Prepare report per request by B. Warner @ WC re 1.00 120.00 120.00
UMC votes

02-08-2022 Max Meisler Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 6.20 120.00 744.00
confirmation hearing

02-08-2022 Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to B. Warner @ 0.40 120.00 48.00
WC re e-Balloting Platform

02-08-2022 Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to A. Zegger @ 0.20 120.00 24.00
WC re master ballot documentation

02-08-2022 Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to B. Warner @ 0.20 120.00 24.00
WC re case site updates

02-08-2022  James Proctor Respond to creditor inquiries related to plan solicitation 3.00 60.00 180.00

02-08-2022  Deborah Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.00 60.00 480.00

Carmody processing and verification

02-08-2022  Jennifer Barnes Prepared documentation re: confirmation 8.10 60.00 486.00

02-08-2022  Marjan Neuman Prepare documentation & materials re: Confirmation 4.00 75.00 300.00

02-08-2022  Kim Steverson Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 2.70 155.00 418.50
confirmation

02-08-2022  Melissa Milo Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 6.60 85.00 561.00
confirmation

02-08-2022 Reina Zepeda Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.70 120.00 924.00
processing and verification

02-08-2022  Sejal Kelly Review and update solicitation processing procedures 1.00 155.00 155.00

02-08-2022  Sejal Kelly Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 1.90 155.00 294.50
processing and verification

02-08-2022  Mike Spitzer Review and verify documentation and materials re: 6.10 155.00 945.50

Invoice Number: 10497

We appreciate your business

Page 14 of 59



Case 20-10343-LSS Doc 9393-2 Filed 03/18/22 Page 15 of 58

Date Professional Description Hours Rate Amount
Confirmation
02-08-2022  Monic Sanchez Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.60 120.00 912.00
processing and verification
02-08-2022  Brittney Whitaker Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.50 125.00 812.50
processing and verification
02-08-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.00 60.00 420.00
confirmation
02-08-2022  Tara Saldajeno Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.80 75.00 360.00
processing and verification
02-08-2022  Ashley Dionisio  Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 5.00 125.00 625.00
confirmation
02-08-2022  Carey Steinberg  Process incoming ballots 0.80 125.00 100.00
02-08-2022 Wendy Austin Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.50 60.00 450.00
confirmation
02-08-2022  Zachary Process Incoming Ballots 4.20 65.00 273.00
Crismond
02-08-2022  Kimberly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 8.00 60.00 480.00
McDermott confirmation
02-08-2022  Michelle Ignacio Prepare BSA Balloting Invalid entries report 0.30 135.00 40.50
02-08-2022  Carey Steinberg  Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 1.80 125.00 225.00
processing and verification
02-08-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 2.80 185.00 518.00
Confirmation
02-08-2022 Ada Ferrer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 12.30 125.00 1,537.50
processing and verification
02-08-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 7.20 155.00 1,116.00
Confirmation
02-08-2022  Kaitlyn Wolf Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.40 125.00 1,050.00
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02-08-2022  Jennifer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.90 155.00 1,069.50
Lizakowski processing and verification

02-08-2022  Mauricio Azucena Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 5.00 85.00 425.00
confirmation

02-08-2022  David Green Prepare requirements for audit reporting re: voting 0.40 125.00 50.00
report and confirmation

02-08-2022  Katherine Muller  Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.40 125.00 1,050.00
processing and verification

02-08-2022  Javon Couch Prepare documentation and materials re Confirmation 9.00 120.00 1,080.00

02-09-2022  David Green Prepare requirements for audit reporting re: voting 0.50 125.00 62.50
report and confirmation

02-09-2022  Katherine Muller  Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.90 125.00 987.50
processing and verification

02-09-2022  Javon Couch Prepare documentation and materials re Confirmation 8.50 120.00 1,020.00

02-09-2022  Ada Ferrer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.30 125.00 912.50
processing and verification

02-09-2022  Carey Steinberg  Process incoming ballots 0.50 125.00 62.50

02-09-2022  Carey Steinberg  Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.00 125.00 500.00
processing and verification

02-09-2022  Zachary Process Incoming Ballots 4.50 65.00 292.50

Crismond

02-09-2022  Michelle Ignacio  Import class 8 data to invalidate ballots with "invalid" 0.50 135.00 67.50
comments

02-09-2022  Christian Teufel  Process incoming ballots 6.10 75.00 457.50

02-09-2022  Melissa Milo Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.10 85.00 603.50
processing and verification

02-09-2022  Mauricio Azucena Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.60 85.00 561.00
processing and verification
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02-09-2022  Monic Sanchez Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.60 120.00 912.00
processing and verification
02-09-2022 Wendy Austin Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.10 60.00 426.00
processing and verification
02-09-2022  Mike Spitzer Review and verify documentation and materials re: 4.00 155.00 620.00
Confirmation
02-09-2022  Jennifer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.90 155.00 1,224.50
Lizakowski processing and verification
02-09-2022 Reina Zepeda Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.00 120.00 960.00
processing and verification
02-09-2022  Britthey Whitaker Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.50 125.00 812.50
processing and verification
02-09-2022  Carolyn Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.00 125.00 500.00
Cashman processing and verification
02-09-2022  Ashley Dionisio  Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.00 125.00 875.00
processing and verification
02-09-2022  Kiyama Jones Process incoming ballots 7.40 60.00 444.00
02-09-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.30 60.00 498.00
processing and verification
02-09-2022  Marjan Neuman Prepare documentation & materials re: Confirmation 6.80 75.00 510.00
02-09-2022  Sejal Kelly Review and prepare solicitation processing procedures 2.50 155.00 387.50
02-09-2022  Kaitlyn Wolf Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.40 125.00 1,050.00
processing and verification
02-09-2022  Jennifer Barnes Prepared documentation re: confirmation 8.10 60.00 486.00
02-09-2022  Kimberly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 6.00 60.00 360.00
McDermott confirmation
02-09-2022  Deborah Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.00 60.00 480.00
Carmody processing and verification
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02-09-2022  Tara Saldajeno Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.80 75.00 360.00
processing and verification

02-09-2022  Kim Steverson Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 1.50 155.00 232.50
processing and verification

02-09-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 5.80 155.00 899.00
Confirmation

02-09-2022 Max Meisler Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 6.20 120.00 744.00
confirmation hearing

02-09-2022 Max Meisler Prepare report per request by B. Warner @ WC re 1.00 120.00 120.00
UMC votes

02-09-2022  Eileen Cosgriff Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 2.00 100.00 200.00
confirmation

02-09-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: late filed 1.20 155.00 186.00
submissions

02-09-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise voting results re: UMC 0.20 185.00 37.00

02-09-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 3.20 185.00 592.00
Confirmation

02-09-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise follow-up and responses on 1.20 185.00 222.00
BSAballots@omniagnt.com emails

02-09-2022  John Doherty Supervise and manage call center, review and assist 2.70 125.00 337.50
with ongoing communications, handle all escalation
issues including extended voting deadline

02-10-2022  John Doherty Supervise and manage call center, review and assist 4.40 125.00 550.00
with ongoing communications, handle all escalation
issues including extended voting deadline

02-10-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 2.30 185.00 425.50
Confirmation

02-10-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: late filed 1.10 155.00 170.50
submissions

02-10-2022  Eileen Cosgriff Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.80 100.00 480.00
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02-10-2022  Eileen Cosgriff Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 1.30 100.00 130.00
processing and verification
02-10-2022  Eileen Cosgriff Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 2.10 100.00 210.00
processing and verification
02-10-2022 Max Meisler Prepare report per request by B. Warner @ WC re 1.00 120.00 120.00
UMC votes
02-10-2022  Kim Steverson Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 3.40 155.00 527.00
confirmation
02-10-2022  Max Meisler Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 6.20 120.00 744.00
confirmation hearing
02-10-2022  Monic Sanchez Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.60 120.00 912.00
processing and verification
02-10-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 8.80 155.00 1,364.00
Confirmation
02-10-2022 Deborah Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.00 60.00 480.00
Carmody processing and verification
02-10-2022  Kimberly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 6.10 60.00 366.00
McDermott confirmation
02-10-2022  Kimberly Verify processed ballots 2.00 60.00 120.00
McDermott
02-10-2022  Marjan Neuman Prepare documentation & materials re: Confirmation 1.50 75.00 112.50
02-10-2022  Jennifer Barnes Prepared documentation re: confirmation 6.10 60.00 366.00
02-10-2022 Reina Zepeda Verify processed ballots 3.80 120.00 456.00
02-10-2022  Kaitlyn Wolf Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.10 125.00 1,012.50
processing and verification
02-10-2022  Melissa Milo Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 6.10 85.00 518.50
confirmation
02-10-2022  Michelle Ignacio  Prepare BSA Balloting Invalid entries report 0.80 135.00 108.00
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02-10-2022  Michelle Ignacio  Prepare reports for QC to review & update with 0.40 135.00 54.00
Amended\Amending Ballot Information for Upload

02-10-2022  Ada Ferrer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.20 125.00 900.00
processing and verification

02-10-2022  Jeriad Paul Call with K. Nownes @ Omni and B. Warner @ WC re 0.20 185.00 37.00
ballots received from TCC and UMC

02-10-2022  Katie Nownes Call with J. Paul @ Omni and B. Warner @ WC re 0.20 155.00 31.00
ballots received from TCC and UMC

02-10-2022  Zachary Process Incoming Ballots 8.00 65.00 520.00

Crismond

02-10-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 5.60 60.00 336.00
confirmation

02-10-2022  Christian Teufel  Process incoming ballots 7.60 75.00 570.00

02-10-2022 Wendy Austin Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.00 60.00 420.00
processing and verification

02-10-2022  Carey Steinberg  Process incoming ballots 0.30 125.00 37.50

02-10-2022  Carey Steinberg  Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.30 125.00 912.50
processing and verification

02-10-2022  Kiyama Jones Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 3.60 60.00 216.00
processing and verification

02-10-2022  Ashley Dionisio Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.60 125.00 575.00
processing and verification

02-10-2022  Katherine Muller  Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.80 125.00 975.00
processing and verification

02-10-2022  Javon Couch Prepare documentation and materials re Confirmation 7.80 120.00 936.00

02-10-2022 Wendy Austin Process incoming ballots 0.40 60.00 24.00

02-10-2022  Carolyn Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.00 125.00 500.00

Cashman processing and verification
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02-10-2022  Mauricio Azucena Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.60 85.00 476.00
processing and verification

02-10-2022  Brittney Whitaker Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.50 125.00 812.50
processing and verification

02-10-2022  Mark Bishay Prepare DeDupping report for solicitation 2.40 135.00 324.00

02-10-2022  Reina Zepeda Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.00 120.00 480.00
processing and verification

02-10-2022  Tara Saldajeno Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.50 75.00 412.50
processing and verification

02-10-2022  Jennifer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.90 155.00 914.50

Lizakowski processing and verification

02-10-2022  Mike Spitzer Review and verify documentation and materials re: 4.80 155.00 744.00
Confirmation

02-10-2022  Sejal Kelly Verify and review incoming ballot processing 3.50 155.00 542.50

02-10-2022  Sejal Kelly Review and verify ballots in preparation for 1.80 155.00 279.00
confirmation

02-10-2022  David Green Prepare requirements for audit reporting re: voting 0.40 125.00 50.00
report and confirmation

02-11-2022  David Green Prepare requirements for audit reporting re: voting 0.50 125.00 62.50
report and confirmation

02-11-2022  Mike Spitzer Review and verify documentation and materials re: 4.00 155.00 620.00
Confirmation

02-11-2022  Jennifer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.90 155.00 759.50

Lizakowski processing and verification

02-11-2022  Kim Steverson Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 2.00 155.00 310.00
confirmation

02-11-2022  Tara Saldajeno Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.80 75.00 360.00
processing and verification

02-11-2022  Reina Zepeda Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.00 120.00 480.00
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processing and verification
02-11-2022  Zachary Process Incoming Ballots 3.50 65.00 227.50
Crismond
02-11-2022  Mark Bishay Update of forms to optimize reprinting of amending 4.10 135.00 553.50
ballots
02-11-2022  Brittney Whitaker Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.50 125.00 812.50
processing and verification
02-11-2022  Ashley Dionisio  Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.70 125.00 962.50
processing and verification
02-11-2022  Katherine Muller ~ Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.20 125.00 525.00
processing and verification
02-11-2022  Carolyn Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.20 125.00 650.00
Cashman processing and verification
02-11-2022 Wendy Austin Process incoming ballots 1.20 60.00 72.00
02-11-2022  Javon Couch Prepare documentation and materials re Confirmation 7.60 120.00 912.00
02-11-2022  Katherine Muller  Process incoming ballots 0.70 125.00 87.50
02-11-2022  Katherine Muller  Verify processed ballots 3.70 125.00 462.50
02-11-2022  Carey Steinberg  Process incoming ballots 1.50 125.00 187.50
02-11-2022  Carey Steinberg  Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.30 125.00 787.50
processing and verification
02-11-2022 Wendy Austin Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.40 60.00 384.00
processing and verification
02-11-2022  Christian Teufel  Process incoming ballots 8.00 75.00 600.00
02-11-2022  Kimberly Verify processed ballots 7.60 60.00 456.00
McDermott
02-11-2022  Kimberly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 0.50 60.00 30.00
McDermott confirmation
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02-11-2022  Mauricio Azucena Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.60 85.00 391.00
processing and verification

02-11-2022  Reina Zepeda Verify processed ballots 3.80 120.00 456.00

02-11-2022 Marjan Neuman  Prepare documentation & materials re: Confirmation 1.80 75.00 135.00

02-11-2022  Deborah Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.00 60.00 480.00

Carmody processing and verification
02-11-2022  Tara Saldajeno Provide technical support for electronically filed ballots 0.50 75.00 37.50
Website Operator

02-11-2022  Monic Sanchez Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.60 120.00 912.00
processing and verification

02-11-2022  Ada Ferrer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.10 125.00 637.50
processing and verification

02-11-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 8.10 155.00 1,255.50
Confirmation

02-11-2022  Melissa Milo Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.60 85.00 476.00
processing and verification

02-11-2022  Michelle Ignacio = Write code for ballot application re: all tabulation data, 1.00 135.00 135.00
internal comments; extracted numeric values to pull
ballot IDs for review

02-11-2022  Michelle Ignacio  Deploy SQL Code for new report application re: all 2.00 135.00 270.00
tabulation data, internal comments; extracted numeric
values to pull ballot IDs for review

02-11-2022  Michelle Ignacio  Deploy Class 8 & 9 Amended Ballots functionality for 0.40 135.00 54.00
new ballots created

02-11-2022  Max Meisler Prepare report per request by B. Warner @ WC re 1.00 120.00 120.00
UMC votes

02-11-2022  Kaitlyn Wolf Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.30 125.00 1,037.50
processing and verification

02-11-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.60 60.00 456.00
confirmation
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02-11-2022  Eileen Cosgriff Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 2.80 100.00 280.00
processing and verification
02-11-2022  Eileen Cosgriff Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 2.90 100.00 290.00
processing and verification
02-11-2022  Max Meisler Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 6.20 120.00 744.00
confirmation hearing
02-11-2022  James Proctor Process incoming ballots 5.70 60.00 342.00
02-11-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: late filed 1.40 155.00 217.00
submissions
02-11-2022  John Doherty Supervise and manage call center, review and assist 4.80 125.00 600.00
with ongoing communications, handle all escalation
issues including extended voting deadline
02-12-2022  Kimberly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 1.50 60.00 90.00
McDermott confirmation
02-13-2022  Eileen Cosgriff Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 3.60 100.00 360.00
processing and verification
02-14-2022  Eileen Cosgriff Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 2.50 100.00 250.00
processing and verification
02-14-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise follow-up and responses on 1.80 185.00 333.00
BSAballots@omniagnt.com emails
02-14-2022 Reina Zepeda Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.60 120.00 912.00
processing and verification
02-14-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.60 60.00 456.00
confirmation
02-14-2022 Deborah Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.00 60.00 480.00
Carmody processing and verification
02-14-2022  Kimberly Verify processed ballots 5.50 60.00 330.00
McDermott
02-14-2022  Kimberly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 2.50 60.00 150.00

McDermott
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02-14-2022  Kaitlyn Wolf Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.90 125.00 987.50
processing and verification

02-14-2022  Javon Couch Respond to creditor inquiries related to plan solicitation 0.80 120.00 96.00

02-14-2022 Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to T. Gahler @ 0.20 120.00 24.00
JAA re extended voting deadline

02-14-2022  Max Meisler Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.40 120.00 888.00
confirmation hearing

02-14-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 7.50 155.00 1,162.50
Confirmation

02-14-2022  James Proctor Process incoming ballots 3.50 60.00 210.00

02-14-2022 David Green Prepare requirements for audit reporting re: voting 0.40 125.00 50.00
report and confirmation

02-14-2022  Javon Couch Prepare documentation and materials re Confirmation 6.80 120.00 816.00

02-14-2022  Mauricio Azucena Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.30 85.00 620.50
confirmation

02-14-2022  Ashley Dionisio Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 5.50 125.00 687.50
discovery

02-14-2022  Katherine Muller  Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.00 125.00 875.00
processing and verification

02-14-2022 Wendy Austin Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 6.20 60.00 372.00
confirmation

02-14-2022  Carey Steinberg  Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.30 125.00 662.50
processing and verification

02-14-2022  Zachary Process Incoming Ballots 7.50 65.00 487.50

Crismond
02-14-2022  Carolyn Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.50 125.00 687.50
Cashman processing and verification
02-14-2022  Michelle Ignacio  Create new form and code for Amended Ballot ID load 1.50 135.00 202.50
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02-14-2022  Christian Teufel  Process incoming ballots 4.00 75.00 300.00

02-14-2022  Melissa Milo Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.60 85.00 561.00
processing and verification

02-14-2022  Mark Bishay Update of forms to optimize reprinting of amending 210 135.00 283.50
ballots

02-14-2022  Brittney Whitaker Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.20 125.00 525.00
processing and verification

02-14-2022  Jennifer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.30 155.00 1,131.50

Lizakowski processing and verification

02-14-2022  Ada Ferrer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.00 125.00 875.00
processing and verification

02-14-2022 Wendy Austin Process incoming ballots 1.40 60.00 84.00

02-14-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 3.60 185.00 666.00
Confirmation

02-14-2022  John Doherty Supervise and manage call center, review and assist 4.50 125.00 562.50
with ongoing communications, handle all escalation
issues including extended voting deadline

02-14-2022  Sejal Kelly Perform quality assurance review of incoming ballot 1.10 155.00 170.50
processing

02-14-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: late filed 1.50 155.00 232.50
submissions

02-15-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: late filed 1.50 155.00 232.50
submissions

02-15-2022  Sejal Kelly Review and verify ballots in preparation for 0.60 155.00 93.00
confirmation

02-15-2022  John Doherty Supervise and manage call center, review and assist 3.50 125.00 437.50
with ongoing communications, handle all escalation
issues including extended voting deadline

02-15-2022 Wendy Austin Process incoming ballots 0.60 60.00 36.00

02-15-2022 Wendy Austin Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.00 60.00 420.00
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processing and verification
02-15-2022  Ada Ferrer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.30 125.00 912.50
processing and verification
02-15-2022  Mauricio Azucena Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.60 85.00 646.00
processing and verification
02-15-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: voting 3.80 185.00 703.00
deadline extension
02-15-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 2.80 185.00 518.00
Confirmation
02-15-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise pdf production and upload 1.20 185.00 222.00
to W&C re: Chartered organization Opt Outs
02-15-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise pdf production and upload 0.80 185.00 148.00
to W&C re: late filed ballots received
02-15-2022  Tara Saldajeno Provide technical support for electronically filed ballots 3.30 75.00 247.50
Website Operator
02-15-2022  Kimberly Verify processed ballots 8.00 60.00 480.00
McDermott
02-15-2022  Carolyn Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.40 125.00 800.00
Cashman processing and verification
02-15-2022  Javon Couch Prepare documentation and materials re Confirmation 4.90 120.00 588.00
02-15-2022  David Green Prepare requirements for audit reporting re: voting 0.70 125.00 87.50
report and confirmation
02-15-2022  James Proctor Process incoming ballots 4.90 60.00 294.00
02-15-2022 Reina Zepeda Verify processed ballots 4.70 120.00 564.00
02-15-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 7.50 155.00 1,162.50
Confirmation
02-15-2022  Jennifer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.10 155.00 945.50
Lizakowski processing and verification
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02-15-2022  Mark Bishay Prepare DeDupping report for solicitation 1.20 135.00 162.00

02-15-2022  Mark Bishay Prepare/distribute ballot tabulation reports 0.70 135.00 94.50

02-15-2022 Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to C. Binggeli @ 0.20 120.00 24.00
A&M re Class 9 claimant categories

02-15-2022 Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to T. Chen @ 0.40 120.00 48.00
WC re ballot production

02-15-2022 Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to C. Tuffey @ 0.20 120.00 24.00
WC re stipulation processing

02-15-2022 Max Meisler Prepare/coordinate hardcopy service of document(s) - 1.40 120.00 168.00
Docket No. 8814-8815

02-15-2022  Max Meisler Prepare/coordinate hardcopy service of document(s) - 1.60 120.00 192.00
Notice to Class 8, Chartered Organizations

02-15-2022  Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to L. Baccash @ 0.20 120.00 24.00
WC re class 9 claimant categories

02-15-2022  Melissa Milo Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 2.00 85.00 170.00
processing and verification

02-15-2022 Deborah Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.00 60.00 480.00

Carmody processing and verification

02-15-2022  Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to L. Baccash @ 0.20 120.00 24.00
WC re Chartered Organization opt out

02-15-2022 Max Meisler Prepare report per request by L. Baccash @ WC re 1.40 120.00 168.00
Chartered Organization opt out entities

02-15-2022 Max Meisler Prepare report per request by L. Baccash @ WC re 4.30 120.00 516.00
Class 9 claimant categories

02-15-2022  Max Meisler Review and transfer Chartered Organization Opt Out 0.60 120.00 72.00
documents per request by R. Gorsich @ WC

02-15-2022  Javon Couch Respond to creditor inquiries related to plan solicitation 0.70 120.00 84.00

02-15-2022  Katherine Muller ~ Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.20 125.00 900.00
processing and verification
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02-15-2022  Kaitlyn Wolf Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.90 125.00 987.50
processing and verification

02-15-2022  Michelle Ignacio  Create new form and code for Amended Ballot ID load 2.00 135.00 270.00
for creation of new Ballot Data and Printed PDF ballots

02-15-2022  Michelle Ignacio = Perform development testing re: BSA amended ballot 1.00 135.00 135.00
form and code for creation of new Ballot Data and
Printed PDF ballots

02-15-2022  Katherine Muller  Verify processed ballots 0.20 125.00 25.00

02-15-2022  Zachary Process Incoming Ballots 7.50 65.00 487.50

Crismond

02-15-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.10 60.00 426.00
confirmation

02-15-2022  Ashley Dionisio Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.00 125.00 625.00
processing and verification

02-15-2022  Brittney Whitaker Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.30 125.00 537.50
processing and verification

02-15-2022 Reina Zepeda Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 3.00 120.00 360.00
processing and verification

02-15-2022  Kim Steverson Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 2.50 155.00 387.50
confirmation

02-15-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise Class 9 claimant category 1.20 185.00 222.00
report

02-16-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 6.70 60.00 402.00
confirmation

02-16-2022  Brittney Whitaker Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.30 125.00 787.50
processing and verification

02-16-2022  Ashley Dionisio  Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.70 125.00 587.50
processing and verification

02-16-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: voting 4.60 185.00 851.00
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02-16-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 1.80 185.00 333.00
Confirmation

02-16-2022  Katherine Muller ~ Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 3.20 125.00 400.00
processing and verification

02-16-2022  Eileen Cosgriff Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 1.60 100.00 160.00
confirmation

02-16-2022  Eileen Cosgriff Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 1.60 100.00 160.00
processing and verification

02-16-2022  Reina Zepeda Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 1.00 120.00 120.00
processing and verification

02-16-2022 Max Meisler Coordinate review of class 9 claimant categories 4.30 120.00 516.00

02-16-2022 Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to B. Warner @ 0.20 120.00 24.00
WC re chartered organization opt-out

02-16-2022 Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to S. Stanfield @ 0.20 120.00 24.00
UMC re chartered organization opt-out

02-16-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise follow-up and responses on 1.20 185.00 222.00
BSAballots@omniagnt.com emails

02-16-2022  Tara Saldajeno Provide technical support for electronically filed ballots 2.00 75.00 150.00

Website Operator

02-16-2022  Tara Saldajeno Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 3.30 75.00 247.50
processing and verification

02-16-2022  Kaitlyn Wolf Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.80 125.00 975.00
processing and verification

02-16-2022  Javon Couch Prepare documentation and materials re Confirmation 5.80 120.00 696.00

02-16-2022  Javon Couch Respond to creditor inquiries related to plan solicitation 1.80 120.00 216.00

02-16-2022  Carolyn Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.20 125.00 650.00

Cashman processing and verification
02-16-2022 Wendy Austin Process incoming ballots 0.50 60.00 30.00

Invoice Number: 10497

We appreciate your business

Page 30 of 59



Case 20-10343-LSS Doc 9393-2 Filed 03/18/22 Page 31 of 58

Date Professional Description Hours Rate Amount
02-16-2022 Wendy Austin Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.40 60.00 384.00
processing and verification
02-16-2022  Katherine Muller  Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.30 125.00 662.50
processing and verification
02-16-2022  Carey Steinberg  Process incoming ballots 0.40 125.00 50.00
02-16-2022  Max Meisler Prepare report per request by B. Warner @ WC re 1.00 120.00 120.00
UMC votes
02-16-2022  Ada Ferrer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.00 125.00 1,000.00
processing and verification
02-16-2022  Monique Verify processed ballots 4.90 75.00 367.50
Edington
02-16-2022  Javon Couch Verify and review CO opt-outs re: Organization 1.50 120.00 180.00
affiliation
02-16-2022  Kimberly Verify processed ballots 2.20 60.00 132.00
McDermott
02-16-2022  Kimberly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 5.80 60.00 348.00
McDermott confirmation
02-16-2022  Zachary Process Incoming Ballots 7.50 65.00 487.50
Crismond
02-16-2022  Michelle Ignacio  Create new form and code for Amended Ballot ID load 4.00 135.00 540.00
for creation of new Ballot Data and Printed PDF ballots
02-16-2022  Michelle Ignacio  Perform development testing re: BSA amended ballot 1.00 135.00 135.00
form and code for creation of new Ballot Data and
Printed PDF ballots
02-16-2022  Jennifer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.40 155.00 837.00
Lizakowski processing and verification
02-16-2022 Reina Zepeda Verify processed ballots 6.80 120.00 816.00
02-16-2022  James Proctor Process incoming ballots 6.00 60.00 360.00
02-16-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 7.20 155.00 1,116.00
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02-16-2022  Max Meisler Review docketed letter and discuss response 0.40 120.00 48.00

02-16-2022 Max Meisler Coordinate IT development re: extended voting 0.80 120.00 96.00
deadline

02-16-2022 Max Meisler Prepare report per request by D. Kim @ WC re class 9 1.60 120.00 192.00
claimant categories

02-16-2022  David Green Prepare requirements for audit reporting re: voting 0.50 125.00 62.50
report and confirmation

02-16-2022  John Doherty Supervise and manage call center, review and assist 5.00 125.00 625.00
with ongoing communications, handle all escalation
issues including extended voting deadline

02-16-2022  Sejal Kelly Review and verify ballots in preparation for 1.50 155.00 232.50
confirmation

02-16-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: late filed 1.30 155.00 201.50
submissions

02-17-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: late filed 1.10 155.00 170.50
submissions

02-17-2022  Sejal Kelly Review and verify ballots in preparation for 1.80 155.00 279.00
confirmation

02-17-2022  John Doherty Supervise and manage call center, review and assist 5.90 125.00 737.50
with ongoing communications, handle all escalation
issues including extended voting deadline

02-17-2022  David Green Prepare requirements for audit reporting re: voting 0.40 125.00 50.00
report and confirmation

02-17-2022  Max Meisler Prepare/coordinate hardcopy service of document(s) - 1.60 120.00 192.00
Notice to Class 8, Chartered Organizations

02-17-2022  Max Meisler Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 3.40 120.00 408.00
confirmation hearing

02-17-2022 Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to J. Lauria @ 0.40 120.00 48.00
WC re Class 8, Chartered Organization noticing plan

02-17-2022  Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to plaintiffs' 1.40 120.00 168.00
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counsel re extended voting deadline

02-17-2022  Max Meisler Coordinate preparation of report per request by C. 0.90 120.00 108.00
Tuffey @ WC re noticing

02-17-2022  Max Meisler Review and update website per request by B. Warner 0.80 120.00 96.00
@ WC

02-17-2022  James Proctor Process incoming ballots 2.50 60.00 150.00

02-17-2022  Kim Steverson Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 3.30 155.00 511.50
confirmation

02-17-2022  Jeriad Paul Prepare for and attend Supplemental Notices 0.40 185.00 74.00
Regarding Plan Modifications hearing

02-17-2022 Reina Zepeda Verify processed ballots 3.80 120.00 456.00

02-17-2022  Jennifer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.70 155.00 1,038.50

Lizakowski processing and verification

02-17-2022  Reina Zepeda Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.00 120.00 480.00
processing and verification

02-17-2022  Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to C. Tuffey @ 0.60 120.00 72.00
WC re noticing

02-17-2022 Max Meisler Conference call with R. Gorsich, L. Baccash, B. 0.30 120.00 36.00
Warner, C. Tuffey, D. Kim, D. Kim @ WC; C. Binggeli,
G. Gerard @ A&M; D. Evans, W. Reppert @ BW, J.
Paul, K. Nownes @ Omni re: Class 9 Claimant
Categories

02-17-2022  Katie Nownes Conference call with R. Gorsich, L. Baccash, B. 0.30 155.00 46.50
Warner, C. Tuffey, D. Kim, D. Kim @ WC; C. Binggeli,
G. Gerard @ A&M; D. Evans, W. Reppert @ BW, J.
Paul, M. Meisler @ Omni re: Class 9 Claimant
Categories

02-17-2022  Jeriad Paul Conference call with R. Gorsich, L. Baccash, B. 0.30 185.00 55.50
Warner, C. Tuffey, D. Kim, D. Kim @ WC; C. Binggeli,
G. Gerard @ A&M; D. Evans, W. Reppert @ BW, K.
Nownes, M. Meisler @ Omni re: Class 9 Claimant
Categories

02-17-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 8.50 155.00 1,317.50
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Confirmation
02-17-2022  Carolyn Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 3.70 125.00 462.50
Cashman processing and verification
02-17-2022  Javon Couch Prepare documentation and materials re Confirmation 4.40 120.00 528.00
02-17-2022  Javon Couch Respond to creditor inquiries related to plan solicitation 3.20 120.00 384.00
02-17-2022  Brittney Whitaker Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.30 125.00 912.50
processing and verification
02-17-2022  Kaitlyn Wolf Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.80 125.00 975.00
processing and verification
02-17-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 6.60 60.00 396.00
confirmation
02-17-2022  Zachary Process Incoming Ballots 4.80 65.00 312.00
Crismond
02-17-2022  Tara Saldajeno Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.50 75.00 337.50
processing and verification
02-17-2022  Monique Verify processed ballots 1.30 75.00 97.50
Edington
02-17-2022  David Neece Update Sexual Abuse Ballot Upload page language 0.50 135.00 67.50
first in staging and then in production.
02-17-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise follow-up and responses on 3.40 185.00 629.00
BSAballots@omniagnt.com emails
02-17-2022  Ashley Dionisio Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.70 125.00 587.50
processing and verification
02-17-2022  Mark Bishay Prepare DeDupping report for solicitation 1.00 135.00 135.00
02-17-2022  Mark Bishay Prepare amended ballot claims report 1.00 135.00 135.00
02-17-2022  Scanning Scan incoming ballots 0.50 40.00 20.00
Operator
02-17-2022  Ada Ferrer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.00 125.00 750.00
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processing and verification
02-17-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 1.80 185.00 333.00
Confirmation
02-17-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: voting 2.30 185.00 425.50
deadline extension
02-17-2022  Kimberly Verify processed ballots 1.00 60.00 60.00
McDermott
02-17-2022  Kimberly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.00 60.00 420.00
McDermott confirmation
02-17-2022 Wendy Austin Process incoming ballots 0.20 60.00 12.00
02-17-2022 Wendy Austin Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.40 60.00 444.00
confirmation
02-17-2022  Katherine Muller  Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.10 125.00 762.50
processing and verification
02-18-2022  Kaitlyn Wolf Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.80 125.00 975.00
processing and verification
02-18-2022  Ada Ferrer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 3.00 125.00 375.00
processing and verification
02-18-2022  Katherine Muller ~ Process incoming ballots 1.30 125.00 162.50
02-18-2022  Katherine Muller ~ Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 0.70 125.00 87.50
processing and verification
02-18-2022  Katherine Muller  Verify processed ballots 1.00 125.00 125.00
02-18-2022  Carey Steinberg  Process incoming ballots 2.40 125.00 300.00
02-18-2022  Kimberly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 8.00 60.00 480.00
McDermott confirmation
02-18-2022 Wendy Austin Process incoming ballots 0.30 60.00 18.00
02-18-2022 Wendy Austin Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.30 60.00 438.00
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02-18-2022  Carolyn Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.90 125.00 612.50
Cashman processing and verification
02-18-2022  Mark Bishay Prepare amended ballot claims report 0.40 135.00 54.00
02-18-2022  Mark Bishay Prepare DeDupping report for solicitation 1.00 135.00 135.00
02-18-2022  David Neece Update dates in scripts for balloting voting dateline 0.10 135.00 13.50
change.
02-18-2022  Michelle Ignacio = Write database code to import amended Class 8 5.50 135.00 742.50
ballots for 1(a) Direct Solicit firms
02-18-2022  Michelle Ignacio Update BSA SA Ballot application to create folders 3.50 135.00 472.50
and generate individual PDF ballots, Excel files for
each law firm
02-18-2022  Javon Couch Prepare documentation and materials re Confirmation 3.80 120.00 456.00
02-18-2022  Javon Couch Respond to creditor inquiries related to plan solicitation 3.60 120.00 432.00
02-18-2022  Ashley Dionisio Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.20 125.00 650.00
processing and verification
02-18-2022  Tara Saldajeno Provide technical support for electronically filed ballots 0.50 75.00 37.50
Website Operator
02-18-2022  Jeriad Paul Prepare for and attend Supplemental Notices 7.00 185.00 1,295.00
Regarding Plan Modifications hearing
02-18-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise follow-up and responses on 0.50 185.00 92.50
BSAballots@omniagnt.com emails
02-18-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: voting 0.50 185.00 92.50
deadline extension
02-18-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 0.50 185.00 92.50
Confirmation
02-18-2022  Zachary Process Incoming Ballots 4.00 65.00 260.00
Crismond
02-18-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.60 60.00 456.00
confirmation
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02-18-2022 Reina Zepeda Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.70 120.00 804.00
processing and verification

02-18-2022 Reina Zepeda Verify processed ballots 1.00 120.00 120.00

02-18-2022  Jennifer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.60 155.00 713.00

Lizakowski processing and verification

02-18-2022  Tara Saldajeno Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 2.60 75.00 195.00
processing and verification

02-18-2022  James Proctor Process incoming ballots 0.80 60.00 48.00

02-18-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 7.30 155.00 1,131.50
Confirmation

02-18-2022 Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to plaintiffs' 1.70 120.00 204.00
counsel re extended voting deadline

02-18-2022 Max Meisler Coordinate processing of amended ballots 2.70 120.00 324.00

02-18-2022 Max Meisler Coordinate and perform QC on Chartered 4.20 120.00 504.00
Organization service list re: D.l. 8905

02-18-2022 Max Meisler Prepare/coordinate hardcopy service of document(s) - 0.70 120.00 84.00
D.l. 8905

02-18-2022  David Green Prepare requirements for audit reporting re: voting 0.50 125.00 62.50
report and confirmation

02-18-2022  John Doherty Supervise and manage call center, review and assist 4.30 125.00 537.50
with ongoing communications, handle all escalation
issues including extended voting deadline

02-18-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: class 9 1.20 155.00 186.00
ballot submissions

02-18-2022  Sejal Kelly Review and verify ballots in preparation for 1.20 155.00 186.00
confirmation

02-19-2022  Mark Bishay Prepare amended ballot claims report 0.50 135.00 67.50

02-21-2022  Carolyn Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 1.20 125.00 150.00

Cashman processing and verification
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02-21-2022  Javon Couch Respond to creditor inquiries related to plan solicitation 4.90 120.00 588.00

02-21-2022 Wendy Austin Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 0.20 60.00 12.00
confirmation

02-21-2022  Jennifer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.60 155.00 868.00

Lizakowski processing and verification

02-21-2022  Jeriad Paul Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 1.70 185.00 314.50
confirmation

02-21-2022  Brittney Whitaker Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.30 125.00 787.50
processing and verification

02-21-2022  Monic Sanchez Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.60 120.00 912.00
confirmation

02-21-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 8.90 155.00 1,379.50
Confirmation

02-21-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: voting 1.60 185.00 296.00
deadline extension

02-21-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 1.20 185.00 222.00
Confirmation

02-21-2022  Jeriad Paul Verify and review CO Opt Out submissions and 1.30 185.00 240.50
provide to W&C

02-21-2022  Amanda Olson Process incoming ballots 4.00 140.00 560.00

02-21-2022  Monique Verify processed ballots 2.30 75.00 172.50

Edington

02-21-2022  Ada Ferrer Process incoming ballots 5.10 125.00 637.50

02-21-2022  Katherine Muller ~ Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 1.50 125.00 187.50
processing and verification

02-21-2022  Katherine Muller  Process incoming ballots 3.30 125.00 412.50

02-21-2022  Michelle Ignacio ~ Write SQL code for bulk Amended ballot requests 1.00 135.00 135.00
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02-21-2022  Ashley Dionisio Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 3.70 125.00 462.50
discovery

02-21-2022  Javon Couch Prepare documentation and materials re Confirmation 3.10 120.00 372.00

02-21-2022  James Proctor Process incoming ballots 0.70 60.00 42.00

02-21-2022 Wendy Austin Verify processed ballots 6.40 60.00 384.00

02-21-2022  David Green Prepare requirements for audit reporting re: voting 0.30 125.00 37.50
report and confirmation

02-21-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.60 60.00 456.00
confirmation

02-21-2022 Reina Zepeda Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 2.00 120.00 240.00
processing and verification

02-21-2022 Reina Zepeda Verify processed ballots 2.00 120.00 240.00

02-21-2022  Reina Zepeda Process incoming proofs of claim 1.10 120.00 132.00

02-21-2022  Reina Zepeda Process incoming ballots 2.50 120.00 300.00

02-21-2022  Sejal Kelly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 4.30 155.00 666.50
discovery

02-21-2022  Kim Steverson Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 1.00 155.00 155.00
Confirmation

02-21-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: class 8 0.40 155.00 62.00
ballot submissions

02-21-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: class 9 0.90 155.00 139.50
ballot submissions

02-21-2022  Eileen Cosgriff Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 4.20 100.00 420.00
confirmation

02-21-2022  John Doherty Supervise and manage call center, review and assist 4.30 125.00 537.50
with ongoing communications, handle all escalation
issues including extended voting deadline

02-21-2022  Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to plaintiffs 4.70 120.00 564.00

Invoice Number: 10497

We appreciate your business

Page 39 of 59



Case 20-10343-LSS Doc 9393-2 Filed 03/18/22 Page 40 of 58

Date Professional Description Hours Rate Amount
counsel re extended voting deadline

02-21-2022  Max Meisler Coordinate processes related to extended voting 3.60 120.00 432.00
deadline

02-21-2022  Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to B. Warner @ 0.40 120.00 48.00
WC re updates to case site language

02-21-2022  Max Meisler Coordinate case site updates related to extended 0.50 120.00 60.00
voting deadline

02-21-2022  Kimberly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 4.50 60.00 270.00

McDermott confirmation
02-21-2022  Kimberly Verify processed ballots 1.00 60.00 60.00
McDermott

02-22-2022  Kaitlyn Wolf Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.00 125.00 1,000.00
processing and verification

02-22-2022  Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to plaintiffs 3.40 120.00 408.00
counsel re extended voting deadline

02-22-2022  Max Meisler Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 3.70 120.00 444.00
confirmation hearing

02-22-2022  Max Meisler Verify and review re-created ballot upload to law firms 2.20 120.00 264.00
online storage location re: extended voting deadline

02-22-2022  John Doherty Supervise and manage call center, review and assist 4.10 125.00 512.50
with ongoing communications, handle all escalation
issues including extended voting deadline

02-22-2022  Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to C. Tuffey @ 0.20 120.00 24.00
WC re late filed claim

02-22-2022  Eileen Cosgriff Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 2.10 100.00 210.00
confirmation

02-22-2022  Eileen Cosgriff Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 1.50 100.00 150.00
confirmation

02-22-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: class 9 1.30 155.00 201.50
ballot submissions
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02-22-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: class 8 0.50 155.00 77.50
ballot submissions

02-22-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: voting 1.70 185.00 314.50
deadline extension

02-22-2022  Sejal Kelly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 1.10 155.00 170.50
discovery

02-22-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise response to plaintiffs 1.60 185.00 296.00
counsel re extended voting deadline

02-22-2022  David Green Prepare requirements for audit reporting re: voting 0.40 125.00 50.00
report and confirmation

02-22-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 6.20 60.00 372.00
confirmation

02-22-2022  Ashley Dionisio Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 4.50 125.00 562.50
discovery

02-22-2022  Katherine Muller ~ Process incoming ballots 2.70 125.00 337.50

02-22-2022  Katherine Muller  Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 1.30 125.00 162.50
processing and verification

02-22-2022  Katherine Muller  Verify processed ballots 2.00 125.00 250.00

02-22-2022  Carey Steinberg  Process incoming ballots 0.50 125.00 62.50

02-22-2022  James Proctor Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 1.50 60.00 90.00
confirmation

02-22-2022  Ada Ferrer Process incoming ballots 3.20 125.00 400.00

02-22-2022  Ada Ferrer Verify processed ballots 3.10 125.00 387.50

02-22-2022 Wendy Austin Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 4.00 60.00 240.00
confirmation

02-22-2022  James Proctor Process incoming ballots 2.00 60.00 120.00

02-22-2022  Scanning Scan incoming ballots 0.10 40.00 4.00

Operator
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02-22-2022  Tara Saldajeno Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 3.60 75.00 270.00
processing and verification
02-22-2022  Melissa Milo Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.00 85.00 595.00
confirmation
02-22-2022  Mauricio Azucena Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 6.80 85.00 578.00
confirmation
02-22-2022  David Neece Research confirmation email re SA voting upload page 0.50 135.00 67.50
02-22-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 8.70 155.00 1,348.50
Confirmation
02-22-2022  Carolyn Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 2.80 125.00 350.00
Cashman processing and verification
02-22-2022  Javon Couch Respond to creditor inquiries related to plan solicitation 4.60 120.00 552.00
02-22-2022  Javon Couch Prepare documentation and materials re Confirmation 3.50 120.00 420.00
02-22-2022  Monic Sanchez Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.60 120.00 912.00
confirmation
02-22-2022  Amanda Olson Process incoming ballots 6.40 140.00 896.00
02-22-2022 Reina Zepeda Process incoming ballots 4.20 120.00 504.00
02-22-2022 Reina Zepeda Verify processed ballots 3.70 120.00 444.00
02-22-2022  Kimberly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.00 60.00 420.00
McDermott confirmation
02-22-2022  Kim Steverson Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 1.20 155.00 186.00
confirmation
02-22-2022  Jennifer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.10 155.00 790.50
Lizakowski processing and verification
02-22-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 1.80 185.00 333.00
Confirmation
02-23-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 1.30 185.00 240.50
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Confirmation
02-23-2022  Jennifer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 6.20 155.00 961.00
Lizakowski processing and verification
02-23-2022  Ashley Dionisio  Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 8.30 125.00 1,037.50
discovery
02-23-2022  Lakeisha Babers Verify processed ballots 0.10 125.00 12.50
02-23-2022  Ada Ferrer Process incoming ballots 3.30 125.00 412.50
02-23-2022  Ada Ferrer Verify processed ballots 3.30 125.00 412.50
02-23-2022  Michelle Ignacio  Prepare BSA Duplicate report 0.50 135.00 67.50
02-23-2022  Mauricio Azucena Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 6.90 85.00 586.50
confirmation
02-23-2022  Melissa Milo Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 6.60 85.00 561.00
confirmation
02-23-2022  Michelle Ignacio  Write database code to import amended Class 8 3.00 135.00 405.00
ballots for 1(a) Amended Ballot IDs - Additions
02-23-2022  Michelle Ignacio Update BSA SA Ballot application to create folders 1.00 135.00 135.00
and generate individual PDF ballots and Excel files for
each law firm for 1(a) Amended Ballot IDs - Additions
02-23-2022  Tara Saldajeno Provide technical support for electronically filed ballots 0.30 75.00 22.50
Website Operator
02-23-2022  Lakeisha Babers  Process incoming ballots 3.10 125.00 387.50
02-23-2022  Katherine Muller  Process incoming ballots 2.60 125.00 325.00
02-23-2022  Max Meisler Call with A. Hammond @ WC, J. Paul @ Omni re 0.10 120.00 12.00
Chartered Organization opt outs
02-23-2022  Zachary Process Incoming Ballots 6.00 65.00 390.00
Crismond
02-23-2022 Wendy Austin Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 2.90 60.00 174.00
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02-23-2022  Carey Steinberg  Process incoming ballots 0.80 125.00 100.00
02-23-2022  Kimberly Verify processed ballots 7.00 60.00 420.00
McDermott
02-23-2022  Kimberly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 1.00 60.00 60.00
McDermott confirmation
02-23-2022  Reina Zepeda Verify processed ballots 2.70 120.00 324.00
02-23-2022 Reina Zepeda Process incoming ballots 5.00 120.00 600.00
02-23-2022 Amanda Olson Process incoming ballots 8.00 140.00 1,120.00
02-23-2022  Monic Sanchez Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.60 120.00 912.00
confirmation
02-23-2022  Mark Bishay Prepare DeDupping report for solicitation 4.90 135.00 661.50
02-23-2022  Javon Couch Prepare documentation and materials re Confirmation 3.60 120.00 432.00
02-23-2022  Carolyn Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 2.30 125.00 287.50
Cashman processing and verification
02-23-2022  Javon Couch Respond to creditor inquiries related to plan solicitation 4.00 120.00 480.00
02-23-2022  Katherine Muller ~ Verify processed ballots 2.80 125.00 350.00
02-23-2022  David Green Prepare requirements for audit reporting re: voting 0.20 125.00 25.00
report and confirmation
02-23-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise response to plaintiffs 0.80 185.00 148.00
counsel re extended voting deadline
02-23-2022  Sejal Kelly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 0.50 155.00 77.50
discovery
02-23-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: voting 210 185.00 388.50
deadline extension
02-23-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise follow-up and responses on 1.10 185.00 203.50
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02-23-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: class 8 0.60 155.00 93.00
ballot submissions

02-23-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: class 9 1.40 155.00 217.00
ballot submissions

02-23-2022  Eileen Cosgriff Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 0.70 100.00 70.00
confirmation

02-23-2022  Eileen Cosgriff Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 1.70 100.00 170.00
confirmation

02-23-2022  Max Meisler Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 3.30 120.00 396.00
confirmation hearing

02-23-2022  Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to plaintiffs 3.40 120.00 408.00
counsel re extended voting deadline

02-23-2022 Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to B. Warner @ 0.20 120.00 24.00
WC re case site updates

02-23-2022  Max Meisler Coordinate case site updates related to amended plan 0.60 120.00 72.00
documents

02-23-2022  John Doherty Supervise and manage call center, review and assist 4.60 125.00 575.00
with ongoing communications, handle all escalation
issues including extended voting deadline

02-23-2022  Max Meisler Verify and review re-created ballot upload to law firms 2.70 120.00 324.00
online storage location re: extended voting deadline

02-23-2022  Kim Steverson Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 1.50 155.00 232.50
confirmation

02-23-2022  Kaitlyn Wolf Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.80 125.00 975.00
processing and verification

02-23-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 7.50 155.00 1,162.50
Confirmation

02-23-2022  Tara Saldajeno Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 1.40 75.00 105.00
processing and verification

02-23-2022 Deborah Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 5.00 60.00 300.00

Carmody confirmation
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02-24-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Upload re-created ballots to law firms online storage 4.20 60.00 252.00
location re: extended voting deadline

02-24-2022 Deborah Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.00 60.00 420.00

Carmody confirmation
02-24-2022  Zachary Process Incoming Ballots 4.60 65.00 299.00
Crismond

02-24-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise re-created ballot upload to 4.60 185.00 851.00
law firms online storage location re: extended voting
deadline

02-24-2022  Ashley Dionisio Upload re-created ballots to law firms online storage 1.00 125.00 125.00
location re: extended voting deadline

02-24-2022  Tara Saldajeno Upload re-created ballots to law firms online storage 3.50 75.00 262.50
location re: extended voting deadline

02-24-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 6.50 155.00 1,007.50
Confirmation

02-24-2022  Kaitlyn Wolf Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.60 125.00 700.00
processing and verification

02-24-2022  John Doherty Verify and review re-create ballot upload to law firms 1.00 125.00 125.00
online storage location re: extended voting deadline

02-24-2022  Carey Steinberg  Upload re-created ballots to law firms online storage 4.80 125.00 600.00
location re: extended voting deadline

02-24-2022  Marjan Neuman Upload re-created ballots to law firms on line storage 4.00 75.00 300.00
location re: extended voting deadline

02-24-2022  John Doherty Supervise and manage call center, review and assist 5.00 125.00 625.00
with ongoing communications, handle all escalation
issues including extended voting deadline

02-24-2022 Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to plaintiffs 3.40 120.00 408.00
counsel re extended voting deadline

02-24-2022  Max Meisler Verify and review re-created ballot upload to law firms 5.70 120.00 684.00
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02-24-2022 Max Meisler Work on research request per B. Warner @ WC re: 3.80 120.00 456.00
UMC voting

02-24-2022  Jennifer Barnes Respond to inquiries for new ballot re: extended voting 1.50 60.00 90.00
deadline

02-24-2022  Kaitlyn Wolf Upload re-created ballots to law firms online storage 4.10 125.00 512.50
location re: extended voting deadline

02-24-2022  Jennifer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.70 155.00 728.50

Lizakowski processing and verification
02-24-2022  Jennifer Verify and review re-created ballot upload to law firms 3.10 155.00 480.50
Lizakowski online storage location re: extended voting deadline

02-24-2022  Eileen Cosgriff Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 2.80 100.00 280.00
confirmation

02-24-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: class 8 0.40 155.00 62.00
ballot submissions

02-24-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise follow-up and responses on 0.80 185.00 148.00
BSAballots@omniagnt.com emails

02-24-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: voting 2.30 185.00 425.50
deadline extension

02-24-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: class 9 1.30 155.00 201.50
ballot submissions

02-24-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise response to plaintiffs 0.80 185.00 148.00
counsel re extended voting deadline

02-24-2022  David Green Prepare requirements for audit reporting re: voting 0.50 125.00 62.50
report and confirmation

02-24-2022  Mark Bishay Prepare DeDupping report for solicitation 2.50 135.00 337.50

02-24-2022  Michelle Ignacio  Create amended Ballot IDs re: Extended Voting 2.00 135.00 270.00
Deadline

02-24-2022  Michelle Ignacio  Research eBallot data issues re: changes not 2.00 135.00 270.00

Invoice Number: 10497

transferred to tabulation table; perform manual update
to push data into ballot table and recommend
eBalloting application updates for automation of data
transfer for changed \ updated ballots

We appreciate your business

Page 47 of 59



Case 20-10343-LSS Doc 9393-2 Filed 03/18/22 Page 48 of 58

Date Professional Description Hours Rate Amount

02-24-2022  Monic Sanchez Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.60 120.00 912.00
confirmation

02-24-2022  Javon Couch Prepare documentation and materials re Confirmation 2.10 120.00 252.00

02-24-2022  Brittney Whitaker Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.30 125.00 662.50
processing and verification

02-24-2022  Ada Ferrer Process incoming ballots 3.80 125.00 475.00

02-24-2022  Ada Ferrer Verify processed ballots 2.90 125.00 362.50

02-24-2022 Wendy Austin Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 4.00 60.00 240.00
confirmation

02-24-2022  Ashley Dionisio  Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 4.30 125.00 537.50
discovery

02-24-2022  James Proctor Process incoming ballots 3.00 60.00 180.00

02-24-2022  Melissa Milo Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 5.20 85.00 442.00
confirmation

02-24-2022 Reina Zepeda Process incoming ballots 3.00 120.00 360.00

02-24-2022 Reina Zepeda Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.10 120.00 612.00
processing and verification

02-24-2022  Kimberly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 8.00 60.00 480.00

McDermott confirmation

02-24-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 4.60 60.00 276.00
confirmation

02-24-2022  Lakeisha Babers Verify processed ballots 2.40 125.00 300.00

02-24-2022  Javon Couch Respond to creditor inquiries related to plan solicitation 5.50 120.00 660.00

02-24-2022  Carolyn Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 4.30 125.00 537.50

Cashman processing and verification
02-24-2022  Katherine Muller  Verify processed ballots 2.00 125.00 250.00
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02-24-2022  Katherine Muller  Process incoming ballots 2.80 125.00 350.00

02-24-2022  Lakeisha Babers  Process incoming ballots 2.90 125.00 362.50

02-24-2022  Mauricio Azucena Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 5.60 85.00 476.00
confirmation

02-24-2022  Amanda Olson Process incoming ballots 7.00 140.00 980.00

02-25-2022  Mauricio Azucena Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 6.80 85.00 578.00
confirmation

02-25-2022 Wendy Austin Process incoming ballots 6.00 60.00 360.00

02-25-2022 Wendy Austin Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 1.40 60.00 84.00
confirmation

02-25-2022  Kimberly Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 6.00 60.00 360.00

McDermott confirmation
02-25-2022  Kimberly Verify processed ballots 2.00 60.00 120.00
McDermott

02-25-2022  Brittney Whitaker Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 3.30 125.00 412.50
processing and verification

02-25-2022  Katherine Muller  Verify processed ballots 3.80 125.00 475.00

02-25-2022  Katherine Muller ~ Process incoming ballots 2.90 125.00 362.50

02-25-2022  Lakeisha Babers Verify processed ballots 0.70 125.00 87.50

02-25-2022  Javon Couch Respond to creditor inquiries related to plan solicitation 4.60 120.00 552.00

02-25-2022  Javon Couch Prepare documentation and materials re Confirmation 3.60 120.00 432.00

02-25-2022  David Green Prepare requirements for audit reporting re: voting 0.30 125.00 37.50
report and confirmation

02-25-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise response to plaintiffs 0.20 185.00 37.00
counsel re extended voting deadline

02-25-2022  Kim Steverson Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 0.40 155.00 62.00
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02-25-2022  William Wright Process incoming ballots 2.00 75.00 150.00

02-25-2022  Jennifer Barnes Respond to inquiries for new ballot re: extended voting 7.00 60.00 420.00
deadline

02-25-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise follow-up and responses on 0.40 185.00 74.00
BSAballots@omniagnt.com emails

02-25-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: class 8 0.50 155.00 77.50
ballot submissions

02-25-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: class 9 1.40 155.00 217.00
ballot submissions

02-25-2022  Jennifer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 3.80 155.00 589.00

Lizakowski processing and verification
02-25-2022  Jennifer Verify and review re-created ballot upload to law firms 4.40 155.00 682.00
Lizakowski online storage location re: extended voting deadline

02-25-2022 Homero Cuberos Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 1.80 75.00 135.00
confirmation

02-25-2022 Max Meisler Verify and review re-created ballot upload to law firms 4.20 120.00 504.00
online storage location re: extended voting deadline

02-25-2022  Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to plaintiffs 2.60 120.00 312.00
counsel re extended voting deadline

02-25-2022  Max Meisler Review e-mail received and respond to B. Warner @ 0.20 120.00 24.00
WC re Chartered Organization noticing

02-25-2022 Max Meisler Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 1.30 120.00 156.00
confirmation hearing

02-25-2022  Jeriad Paul Review e-mail received and respond to plaintiffs 3.10 185.00 573.50
counsel re extended voting deadline

02-25-2022  Marjan Neuman Upload re-created ballots to law firms' on line storage 4.00 75.00 300.00
location re: extended voting deadline

02-25-2022  Brittney Whitaker  Verify and review re-created ballot upload to law firms 3.70 125.00 462.50
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02-25-2022  Monic Sanchez Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.60 120.00 912.00
confirmation

02-25-2022  Carey Steinberg  Upload re-created ballots to law firms online storage 4.80 125.00 600.00
location re: extended voting deadline

02-25-2022 Reina Zepeda Verify processed ballots 5.00 120.00 600.00

02-25-2022 Reina Zepeda Process incoming ballots 4.60 120.00 552.00

02-25-2022  John Doherty Verify and review re-create ballot upload to law firms 9.00 125.00 1,125.00
online storage location re: extended voting deadline

02-25-2022  Kiyama Jones Respond to inquires requesting new Ballot re: 3.00 60.00 180.00
extended voting deadline

02-25-2022  Kaitlyn Wolf Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 7.80 125.00 975.00
processing and verification

02-25-2022  Ada Ferrer Process incoming ballots 3.80 125.00 475.00

02-25-2022  Ada Ferrer Verify processed ballots 2.90 125.00 362.50

02-25-2022 Amanda Olson Process incoming ballots 7.40 140.00 1,036.00

02-25-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 6.20 155.00 961.00
Confirmation

02-25-2022  Carolyn Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.00 125.00 625.00

Cashman processing and verification

02-25-2022  Tara Saldajeno Upload re-created ballots to law firms online storage 1.50 75.00 112.50
location re: extended voting deadline

02-25-2022  Melissa Milo Verify processed ballots 1.00 85.00 85.00

02-25-2022  Melissa Milo Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 6.60 85.00 561.00
confirmation

02-25-2022  David Neece Create and deploy e-balloting file transfer requirement 2.80 135.00 378.00
to include reporting of correct latest votes received

02-25-2022  Michelle Ignacio  Deploy changes for eBalloting modifications to allow 3.40 135.00 459.00
resubmission of previously submitted ballots
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02-25-2022  Deborah Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 9.00 60.00 540.00
Carmody confirmation
02-25-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise re-created ballot upload to 3.20 185.00 592.00
law firms online storage location re: extended voting
deadline
02-25-2022  Ashley Dionisio  Upload re-created ballots to law firms online storage 3.00 125.00 375.00
location re: extended voting deadline
02-25-2022  Ashley Dionisio Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 4.50 125.00 562.50
confirmation
02-25-2022  Sejal Kelly Verify and review incoming ballot processing 2.70 155.00 418.50
02-25-2022  Zachary Process Incoming Ballots 5.00 65.00 325.00
Crismond
02-25-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Upload re-created ballots to law firms online storage 2.30 60.00 138.00
location re: extended voting deadline
02-25-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 5.10 60.00 306.00
confirmation
02-25-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Verify processed ballots 0.60 60.00 36.00
02-26-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Verify processed ballots 4.50 60.00 270.00
02-26-2022 Deborah Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 3.00 60.00 180.00
Carmody confirmation
02-26-2022  Tara Saldajeno Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 4.00 75.00 300.00
Confirmation
02-26-2022  Katherine Muller  Process incoming ballots 3.50 125.00 437.50
02-26-2022  Kimberly Verify processed ballots 8.00 60.00 480.00
McDermott
02-26-2022  Ashley Dionisio Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 1.20 125.00 150.00
discovery
02-26-2022  Javon Couch Respond to creditor inquiries related to plan solicitation 1.40 120.00 168.00
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02-26-2022  Javon Couch Prepare documentation and materials re Confirmation 0.90 120.00 108.00
02-26-2022  Ashley Dionisio Process incoming ballots 3.70 125.00 462.50
02-26-2022  Paula Gray Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 4.00 75.00 300.00
confirmation
02-26-2022  Amanda Olson Process incoming ballots 1.00 140.00 140.00
02-26-2022  Reina Zepeda Verify processed ballots 2.80 120.00 336.00
02-26-2022  Carey Steinberg  Process incoming ballots 0.50 125.00 62.50
02-26-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 2.30 155.00 356.50
Confirmation
02-26-2022 Emma Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 5.00 75.00 375.00
Guandique confirmation
02-26-2022  Zachary Process Incoming Ballots 3.00 65.00 195.00
Crismond
02-26-2022 Homero Cuberos Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.10 75.00 532.50
confirmation
02-26-2022  Kaitlyn Wolf Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 2.80 125.00 350.00
processing and verification
02-26-2022  Eileen Cosgriff Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 3.20 100.00 320.00
confirmation
02-26-2022  Eileen Cosgriff Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 3.10 100.00 310.00
confirmation
02-27-2022  Mike Spitzer Review and verify documentation and materials re: 1.30 155.00 201.50
Confirmation
02-27-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 1.50 155.00 232.50
Confirmation
02-27-2022  Amanda Olson Process incoming ballots 3.00 140.00 420.00
02-27-2022  Ada Ferrer Process incoming ballots 2.00 125.00 250.00
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02-27-2022  Katherine Muller  Verify processed ballots 1.00 125.00 125.00
02-27-2022  Lakeisha Babers  Verify processed ballots 2.50 125.00 312.50
02-28-2022  Javon Couch Respond to creditor inquiries related to plan solicitation 4.70 120.00 564.00
02-28-2022  Javon Couch Prepare documentation and materials re Confirmation 3.90 120.00 468.00
02-28-2022  Carolyn Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 1.90 125.00 237.50
Cashman processing and verification
02-28-2022  Katherine Muller  Process incoming ballots 8.20 125.00 1,025.00
02-28-2022  Lakeisha Babers  Process incoming ballots 3.10 125.00 387.50
02-28-2022 Lakeisha Babers Verify processed ballots 2.90 125.00 362.50
02-28-2022  Monic Sanchez Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 7.60 120.00 912.00
confirmation
02-28-2022  Katherine Muller  Verify processed ballots 1.30 125.00 162.50
02-28-2022 Wendy Austin Review and process incoming mail 0.40 60.00 24.00
02-28-2022 Wendy Austin Process incoming ballots 0.60 60.00 36.00
02-28-2022  Jeriad Paul Verify and review CO Opt Out submissions and 0.80 185.00 148.00
provide to W&C
02-28-2022  Paula Gray Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 5.10 75.00 382.50
confirmation
02-28-2022  Mauricio Azucena Verify processed ballots 7.00 85.00 595.00
02-28-2022  Ada Ferrer Process incoming ballots 4.00 125.00 500.00
02-28-2022  Ada Ferrer Verify processed ballots 3.00 125.00 375.00
02-28-2022  Melissa Milo Verify processed ballots 6.60 85.00 561.00
02-28-2022  Melissa Milo Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 1.00 85.00 85.00
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02-28-2022 Amanda Olson Process incoming ballots 9.00 140.00 1,260.00
02-28-2022  David Neece Deploy extended case site application for BSA's 2.30 135.00 310.50
Sexual Abuse Voting page to include Limited
Extended Voting Deadline to Deadlines Tile; added
requirement for all new calendar events within test
environment to sync with production; quality checked
code and tested
02-28-2022  Tara Saldajeno Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 5.70 75.00 427.50
Confirmation
02-28-2022  Tara Saldajeno Provide technical support for electronically filed ballots 0.50 75.00 37.50
Website Operator
02-28-2022  Kaitlyn Wolf Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 8.80 125.00 1,100.00
processing and verification
02-28-2022 Wendy Austin Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 5.00 60.00 300.00
confirmation
02-28-2022  Kimberly Verify processed ballots 10.00 60.00 600.00
McDermott
02-28-2022  David Neece Deploy submission capture application providing 3.20 135.00 432.00
DataEntry Group
02-28-2022  Jennifer Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 5.20 155.00 806.00
Lizakowski processing and verification
02-28-2022 Reina Zepeda Verify processed ballots 4.00 120.00 480.00
02-28-2022  Monique Verify processed ballots 2.20 75.00 165.00
Edington
02-28-2022 Reina Zepeda Process incoming ballots 6.20 120.00 744.00
02-28-2022 Deborah Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 9.00 60.00 540.00
Carmody confirmation
02-28-2022  Mauricio Azucena Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 1.50 85.00 127.50
confirmation
02-28-2022  Carey Steinberg  Process incoming ballots 2.80 125.00 350.00
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02-28-2022 Max Meisler Call with Erica Sattler @ Linder Sattler Rogowsky re 0.20 120.00 24.00
client ballots
02-28-2022 Emma Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 3.60 75.00 270.00
Guandique confirmation
02-28-2022  Scanning Scan incoming ballots 0.10 40.00 4.00
Operator
02-28-2022  Brittney Whitaker Prepare documentation and materials for ballot 3.30 125.00 412.50
processing and verification
02-28-2022  Zachary Process Incoming Ballots 5.50 65.00 357.50
Crismond
02-28-2022  Luis Solorzano Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: 7.50 155.00 1,162.50
Confirmation
02-28-2022  William Wright Process incoming ballots on Microsoft Access 10.50 75.00 787.50
02-28-2022  John Doherty Supervise and manage call center, review and assist 5.00 125.00 625.00
with ongoing communications, handle all escalation
issues including extended voting deadline
02-28-2022  Kim Steverson Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 1.30 155.00 201.50
confirmation
02-28-2022  Sejal Kelly Review and verify ballots in preparation for 4.60 155.00 713.00
confirmation
02-28-2022  Mike Spitzer Review and verify documentation and materials re: 7.80 155.00 1,209.00
Confirmation
02-28-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: class 8 0.40 155.00 62.00
ballot submissions
02-28-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise follow-up and responses on 1.60 185.00 296.00
BSAballots@omniagnt.com emails
02-28-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise follow-up and responses on 0.30 185.00 55.50
BSACOoptout@omniagnt.com emails
02-28-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise team assignments re: voting 1.90 185.00 351.50
deadline extension
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02-28-2022  Katie Nownes Verify and supervise team assignments re: class 9 1.30 155.00 201.50

ballot submissions
02-28-2022  Ashley Stefanovic Verify processed ballots 6.50 60.00 390.00
02-28-2022  Ashley Dionisio Review and verify all ballots in preparation for 5.00 125.00 625.00

confirmation
02-28-2022  Jeriad Paul Coordinate and supervise response to plaintiffs 0.50 185.00 92.50

counsel re extended voting deadline

Total 373,751.50

Time Summary
Professional Hours Rate Amount
Ada Ferrer 149.80 125.00 18,725.00
Ada Husten 34.70 125.00 4,337.50
Amanda Olson 45.80 140.00 6,412.00
Ashley Dionisio 112.00  125.00 14,000.00
Ashley Stefanovic 133.90 60.00 8,034.00
Brittney Whitaker 99.60 125.00 12,450.00
Carey Steinberg 67.80 125.00 8,475.00
Carolyn Cashman 61.90 125.00 7,737.50
Christian Teufel 58.70 75.00 4,402.50
David Green 7.60 125.00 950.00
David Neece 9.40 135.00 1,269.00
Deborah Carmody 120.10 60.00 7,206.00
Eileen Cosgriff 46.10 100.00 4,610.00
Emma Guandique 9.80 75.00 735.00
Homero Cuberos 14.20 75.00 1,065.00
James Proctor 33.60 60.00 2,016.00
Javon Couch 153.80 120.00 18,456.00
Jennifer Barnes 30.80 60.00 1,848.00
Jennifer Lizakowski 126.50 155.00 19,607.50
Jeriad Paul 122.30 185.00 22,625.50
John Doherty 106.70 125.00 13,337.50
Kaitlyn Wolf 149.50 125.00 18,687.50
Katherine Muller 151.60 125.00 18,950.00
Katie Nownes 37.30 155.00 5,781.50
Kim Steverson 26.20 155.00 4,061.00
Kimberly McDermott 163.70 60.00 9,822.00
Kiyama Jones 14.00 60.00 840.00
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Lakeisha Babers 17.70 125.00 2,212.50
Luis Solorzano 139.50 155.00 21,622.50
Marjan Neuman 25.90 75.00 1,942.50
Mark Bishay 21.80 135.00 2,943.00
Mauricio Azucena 71.30 85.00 6,060.50
Max Meisler 166.70 120.00 20,004.00
Melissa Milo 68.00 85.00 5,780.00
Michelle Ignacio 36.80 135.00 4,968.00
Mike Spitzer 65.10 155.00 10,090.50
Monic Sanchez 83.60 120.00 10,032.00
Monique Edington 10.70 75.00 802.50
Patricia Aldecoa 2.00 100.00 200.00
Paula Girard 2.50 110.00 275.00
Paula Gray 9.10 75.00 682.50
Reina Zepeda 147.40 120.00 17,688.00
Sarah Steinhorn 13.00 75.00 975.00
Scanning Operator 1.00 40.00 40.00
Sejal Kelly 44.00 155.00 6,820.00
Siobhan Davis 32.60 125.00 4,075.00
Tara Saldajeno 71.50 75.00 5,362.50
Tara Saldajeno Website Operator 7.10 75.00 532.50
Wendy Austin 112.30 60.00 6,738.00
William Wright 12.50 75.00 937.50
Yelena Bederman 0.90 145.00 130.50
Zachary Crismond 98.40 65.00 6,396.00
Total 373,751.50

Total for this Invoice 373,751.50

Previous Balance 4,028,660.90

Total Amount to Pay 4,402,412.40
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